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Local Candidate Profiles on page 5C this edition

Discover and learn how 
to celebrate Earth Day 
every day at Pace Park’s 
April 23 Earth Day Cel-
ebration.

The event will run from 
10 a.m. – 4 p.m. and will 
feature environmental ex-
perts from all over the cen-
tral Texas region. Hourly 
live demonstrations for 
both adults and children 
will provide information 
on outdoor activities for 
all.

Scheduled demonstra-
tions include; Bats are Ben-

eficial, Kidding Around 
with Goats, The Joys of 
Heirloom Chickens, The 
Beautiful World of Bees, 
and a Salado Creek Walk 
and Talk. In addition to 
the Live Demonstrations 
and Guest Environmental 
Speakers, there will be 
live animals, interactive 
exhibits, hands-on dem-
onstrations, educational 
materials, and food trucks.

Volunteers will also be 
passing out free trash bags 
at the pavilion for those 
who wish to contribute 

to Salado’s, “Don’t Mess 
with Texas - Trash Off” 
event, by picking up litter 
during their hikes and in 
their neighborhoods.

All events are free of 
charge with most of the ac-
tivities taking place in the 
park’s pavilion area.

In the spring of 1970, 
Senator Gaylord Nelson 
created Earth Day as a 
way to bring the environ-
ment into the national 
dialogue. In its first year, 
20 million Americans cel-
ebrated Earth Day. Nearly 

50 years later, Americans 
have conquered many of 
the environmental and 
public health challenges 
we’ve faced: acid rain, 
leaded gasoline, air pollu-
tion, and more. 

 “This Earth Day,” Su-
san Terry said, “Salado 
will celebrate our suc-
cesses while we continue 
to protect our natural re-
sources!”

Keep Salado Beautiful, 
was formed in January of 
2009 and is an active lo-
cal Keep Texas Beautiful 

Affiliate. Keep Salado 
Beautiful is a charitable 
and educational organi-
zation to promote public 
interest in the general im-
provement of the environ-
ment through planning, 
directing and coordinat-
ing programs for improv-
ing the quality of life in 
Salado. KBS’s mission 
is to educate and engage 
Salado to take responsi-
bility for improving their 
community environment. 
The group meets quarterly 
at the Salado Chamber of 

Commerce building. Fam-
ily Membership to KSB 
is only $25 annually and 
donations are accepted 
year around to continue 
the mission to sustain the 
natural beauty of Salado. 

 For more information 
go to our web site at www.
keepsaladobeautiful.com 
and follow them on Face-
book

For more information 
call the KSB at (254) 760-
1150 or e-mail at keep-
saladobeautifuli@yahoo.
com.

by JessIca FlyNN

coNTrIbuTor

 It’s no secret that Sala-
do’s history in the arts is 
rich. Its roots run deep, 
deeper than many of us 
may even realize. A hand-
ful of legendary artists 
still create within and 
leave their mark on our 
Village through their art. 
Their work stands a proud 
representation of this 
community’s history and 
expressive identity. 
 Rising up to continue 
that tradition is a new 
wave of artists. Six gal-
leries, each with its own 
unmistakeable vibe, ex-
ist within a few short 
steps of each other on the 
south end of Salado. Royal 
Street and the immediate 
area are home to Sirril Art 
Gallery, Bentons Jewelry, 
Salado Glassworks, Ro 
Shaw Clay Studio, The 
112 Collective [comprised 
of Davis Art and The Mi-
grant Framer] and Galler-
ie V. Each gallery offers a 
one of a kind presence in 
this art community. 
 “We are eager to share 
our perspective with those 
who find themselves at our 
doorsteps,” Gail Allard of 
Salado Glassworks says. 
“It is from a love, curiosity 
and respect of Salado’s ar-
tistic history that we have 
chosen this small Texas 
town as our home to pro-
duce our creative work.”
 “We believe in the 
power of art to motivate 
collective efforts within 
the community for the 
benefit, survival and pro-
gression of art,” he added. 
“We trust this belief will 
enhance culture and the 
growth of Salado as a 
whole.”
 For this reason, the art-
ists, have come together 
to form RAW - the Royal 
Street Art Walk.
 On the fourth Friday 
of each month beginning 
in April, Royal Street will 
come to life from 6 p.m. 
to 9 p.m. for an engaging 
gallery experience that is 
focused on highlighting 
the quality, edge and di-
versity of artistic talents. 
The intent of this reoc-
curring event is to bring 
awareness and growth to 
Salado’s emerging Royal 
Street Art District. 
 Each month, the galler-
ies will offer a new experi-
ence. 
 For up to date informa-
tion on that experience, 
RAW and its artists, visit 
www.royalstreetartwalk.
com.

 Early voting in local 
elections begins April 25 
at the Salado Civic Center 
and will continue through 
May 3. 
 Three races in Salado 
are contested with write-in 
candidates in each of the 
races.
 This has led to some 
voters in Salado feeling 
more than a bit of angst 
about how to mark the bal-
lots with the write-in can-
didate of their choice.
 The polling location 
in Salado will have a list 
of the write-in candidates 
for each of the three rac-
es: Salado I.S.D. Board 
of Trustees, Mayor of the 
Village of Salado and 
Board of Aldermen.
 A sample ballot and a 
list of the write-in candi-
dates will be on the table 
where voters register to 
cast their ballots.
 Also, each voting booth 
will have a list of write-in 
candidates on display.
 If a voter wants to cast 
their vote for a write-in 
candidate they simply fill 
in the bubble and then 
write in the name of the 
candidate that they want to 
vote for. 
 All of the ballots will 
be looked at physically 
by the election officials to 
determine the intent of the 
voter. 
 As long as the election 
officials can determine the 
intent of whom the voter is 
voting for, the ballot will 
be counted.
 Candidates for two 
three-year terms on the 
Salado I.S.D. Board of 
Trustees are Jeff Kelley, 
Darrell Street and write-in 
candidate Michael Mat-
thews.
 Candidates for the Vil-
lage of Salado Mayor are 
Hans Fields and write-in 
candidate Skip Blancett.
 Candidates for two 
two-year terms are Frank 
Coachman and write-in 
candidates Dr. Amber 
Preston-Dankert and Lin-
da Reynolds.
 In-person early voting 
hours are 7:30 a.m.-4:30 
p.m. weekdays April 25 
through May 2 with ex-
tended early voting hours 
of 7 a.m.-7 p.m. on April 
26 and May 3.
 Election day, polls will 
be open at the Salado 
Civic Center 7 a.m.-7 p.m. 
May 7.
 Counting ballots, elec-
tion officials say, may take 
a couple of hours because 
they will be done by hand.

 Three Waco residents 
remain in Bell County Jail 
under $75,000 bond each 
following their arrests in 
the early morning hours 
of April 15 in connection 
with a violent home inva-
sion of a residence on West 
Amity Rd.
 Bell County Sheriff’s 
office responded to a call 
about 11:45 April 14.
 A resident opened the 
door to his home and was 
met by three people, a man 
and two women, who he 
reported forced their way 
into his home.
 The resident told Sher-
iff’s deputies that a man 
held him down while two 

women went through the 
house taking things.
 After the suspects left, 
the victim went to a neigh-
bor’s house and called 911.
 A description of the 
vehicle was sent out and 
Salado police officers saw 

the vehicle at a local hotel 
and made the arrests.
 Charged with Rob-
bery, a second degree fel-
ony, were Jasmine Reneau, 
Crystal Sanchez and Bran-
don Smith.
 Reneau is a 19-year-old 

white female. She is 5’3” 
and weighs 145 lbs. San-
chez is a 21-year-old white 
female. She is 5’2” and 
weighs 165 lbs. Smith is 
a 22-year-old black male. 
He is 5’8” and weighs 150 
lbs. 

Earth Day event planned in Pace Park April 23

RAW:
Royal St.
Art Walk
April 22

Early voting
starts on
April 25 in
local races

Suspects remain in custody 

for West Amity home invasion

Crystal SanchezJasmine Reneau Brandon Smith

 Candidates for Salado 
ISD Board of Trustees, 
Mayor for Village of Sal-
ado and Village of Salado 
Board of Aldermen ap-
peared before a packed 
room of voters during the 
annual Salado Chamber of 
Commerce Candidate Fo-
rum April 18 at the Salado 
Civic Center.
 The Chamber of Com-
merce has sponsored the 
annual candidate forum 
for more than a two de-
cades to give local voters a 
chance to learn more about 
the candidates for local 
races.
 Candidates for a two-

year term as Mayor of the 
Village of Salado are Hans 
Fields and write-in candi-
date Skip Blancett.
Hans Fields
 Hans Fields is candi-
date for Mayor of Salado.
 He is married to Judy 
Gatlin Fields and the cou-
ple have three children and 
five grandchilren.
 The Fields came to Sal-
ado eight years ago, when 
he retired from Chevron 
Oil Company/Chevron 
Phillips Chemical Com-
pany.
 After graduating from 
Middletown High School 
in Indiana, he attended 

Texas Westeron College 
of the University of Texas 
(now known as University 
of Texas at El Paso) on a 
full basketball scholar-
ship. He was certified in 
all levels of education. He 
earned a Master’s degree 
from Middle Tennesse 
State University in Mur-
freesboro, Tennessee in 
Chemistry, Biology and 
Mathematics. The curricu-
lum there include environ-
mental conservation.
 Hans had two careers. 
The first was as a teach-
er. He taught chemistry 
and biology and was the 
department chairman at 

Ysleta High School. He 
taught pre-med biology at 
El Paso Community Col-
lege. He also coached bas-
ketball, football, track and 
golf at Ysleta School High 
School, where he worked 
for 18 years.
 He was Senior Safety 
Engineer for 28 years for 
Chevron Oil Company/
Chevron Phillips Chemi-
cal Company with as-
signments in El Paso, 
Beaumont, Saudi Arabia 
and Qatar. He was the 
emergency response team 
lead officer, security offi-

Mayor candidate Hans Fields Mayor candidate Skip Blancett

Chamber Forum introduces 

local candidates to voters

see mayor caNdIdaTes, page 5c
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 If the Republican Party 
is to be saved from Donald 
Trump, Ted Cruz’s run-
away victory in Wisconsin 
will have been the inflec-
tion point.
 If you thought this ser-
vice to the GOP would be 
met with plaudits from the 
party’s insiders, you obvi-
ously don’t know anything 
about their relationship to 
the Texas senator.
 St. Augustine famously 
prayed, Dear Lord, make 
me chaste -- but not yet. 
The GOP establishment’s 
prayer is, Dear Lord, deliv-
er us from Donald Trump 
-- but not with Ted Cruz.
 The increasing likeli-
hood of a contested con-
vention in Cleveland has 
led to chatter about turning 
to a white knight who has 
the advantage of being nei-
ther Trump nor Cruz. This 
talk has all the hallmarks 
of a psychological mecha-
nism for GOP insiders to 
avoid acknowledging their 
dependence on Cruz, who 
is all that is standing be-
tween the party and what 
might be an epic Trump-
led meltdown.
 A convention could -- 
and should -- deny Trump 
the nomination, but it 
won’t be easy. There will 
be a perceived legitimacy 
problem in denying the top 
prize to the top vote-getter. 
This would obviously be 
magnified if a convention 
disregards both the first- 
and second-place finish-
ers.

 And for what? Elect-
ability? The only mean-
ingful road test for a 
presidential candidate 
is running for president. 
Cruz has proved adept at 
it. He correctly read the 
mood of the Republican 
electorate and adjusted 
to Trump more skillfully 
than anyone else (not with-
out some cringe-inducing 
moments). 
 If Paul Ryan had run 
this year, in all likelihood 
he would have gotten 
chewed up and spat out 
like anyone else associat-
ed with the establishment. 
Who else? Mitt Romney? 
He had his chance. A gov-
ernor? The plausible ones 
already ran. A senator? 
Ditto.
 While it is true that 
people in Washington tend 
to loathe Cruz, a conven-
tion wouldn’t be a Senate 
Republican policy lunch. 
It would be stocked with 
Republican activists from 
around the country who 
have no firsthand knowl-
edge of what Cruz did to 
so irk his colleagues, and 
probably don’t care.
 All that said, it is pos-
sible to imagine a white-
knight scenario, but only 
in a convention deadlock 

that might descend to 
South Korean-parliament 
levels of ugliness. The 
best, cleanest non-Trump 
scenario is that Cruz has 
the strength to win on an 
early ballot, and his an-
ti-establishment creden-
tials make a revolt by the 
Trump forces less potent.
 In short, the only rea-
sonable alternative to 
Trump is Cruz. This is 
the conclusion that Scott 
Walker and other con-
servative leaders in Wis-
consin came to, and they 
backed Cruz to the hilt. 
Republicans around the 
country who care about 
the integrity of their party 
and its electoral chances 
should do the same.
 Of course, Cruz would 
be an underdog against 
Hillary Clinton, but the 
man with the biggest me-
dia megaphone on the 
planet has been calling 
him a liar and a Canadian 
for months, and he trails 
Clinton by only three 
points in the RealClear-
Politics average.
 Trump and Cruz have 
both won states around 
the country and millions 
of votes, and engendered 
intense followings. There 
is no getting around that 
they are the choice con-
fronting the party. It’s 
time to put away childish 
things, and pick sides.
 Rich Lowry is editor of 
the National Review.(c) 2016 
by King Features Synd., Inc.

Cruz or bust

Rich 
Lowry

 On April 22, 1970, 20 
million Americans hit the 
streets to protest the envi-
ronmental effects of more 
than 100 years of uncon-
trolled fossil-fueled indus-
trial development. It was 
the first Earth Day.
 What was intended 
to be a college campus 
teach-in soon spread to 
every community and city 
across the United States. It 
was and remains the sin-
gle largest secular event 
in history. The sheer size 
of the protest -- along with 
increasing visual evidence 
of dire health threats asso-
ciated with air and toxic 
pollution -- soon forced 
Congress to pass some of 
the world’s toughest envi-
ronmental laws, most of 
which include community 
right-to-know provisions 
and allow citizens to sue 
their government if it fails 
to enforce the law.
 Citizens’ rights have 
been enshrined in every 
major environmental law 
from that point on. These 
laws spawned others 
around the world -- many 
more stringent than those 
in the U.S. -- and most rec-
ognize the role of citizens 
in the enforcement of envi-
ronmental laws.
 Nearly 50 years later, 
Earth Day remains a day 
of reckoning, and now 
more than 1 billion peo-
ple take action each year 
in almost every country 
on Earth. Some protest, 
many clean up their com-
munities and plant trees, 
and millions more have 
their first exposure to en-
vironmentalism through 
educational programs at 
schools and universities. 
Governments large and 
small make commitments 
and meet with their con-
stituents, while corpora-
tions make pledges to be 
more sustainable and re-
sponsible for the pollution 
they create.
 It is fitting then that 
United Nations Secre-
tary-General Ban Ki-
moon chose Earth Day 
(April 22nd) for world 

leaders to sign the histor-
ic Paris climate agreement 
at U.N. headquarters in 
New York. At least 150 
world leaders are expect-
ed to sign, making it the 
largest single signing of 
an international agreement 
in world history (another 
Earth Day first!). And it’s 
happening not a moment 
too soon. On every front, 
global warming is becom-
ing more immediate, more 
threatening and more ir-
reversible, while scientific 
consensus and data on the 
health effects of climate 
change -- particularly on 
the poor -- mount. 
 Critics warn that the 
agreement’s specific emis-
sions targets are too low, 
that the pace of implemen-
tation is too slow, and it 
fails to specify penalties 
for non-compliance. That’s 
where we the people come 
in.
 Included in the climate 
agreement are provisions 
that recognize the critical 
role civil society must play 
to make it work. It calls on 
citizens to “scale up their 
efforts and support actions 
to reduce emissions. It sig-
nals the need for all of us 
to be actively engaged in 
transforming our world 
from one dominated by 
fossil fuels to one driv-
en by renewable energy. 
While these words don’t 
amount to a call for rev-
olution, it’s clear both the 
United Nations and world 
leaders recognize that cit-
izen participation in solv-
ing global warming has 
been missing. The success 
– or failure – of the agree-
ment is on our shoulders. 
 This isn’t a fight in 
which any of us can re-
main on the sidelines and 
hope for the best. Unless 
we take these matters into 
our own hands, the agree-
ment alone won’t save the 

world’s ecosystems from 
collapsing, or our biodi-
versity, which supports 
all living things on earth, 
from disappearing.
 Doing our part doesn’t 
mean merely buying green 
products or inquiring how 
things are going. It means 
action. It means a direct 
challenge to the status 
quo. It means holding our 
elected officials account-
able and voting out of of-
fice national, state and lo-
cal leaders who won’t take 
action on climate change. 
It means not passing the 
buck and hoping others do 
the hard work.
 For many, getting in-
volved means knowing 
how your retirement ac-
counts and pensions are 
invested and demanding 
divestment from fossil fuel 
stocks. It means demand-
ing that your children be 
educated for green jobs 
of the future. It means 
showing up at town hall or 
city council meetings and 
asking about your com-
munity’s survivability in 
a climate crisis. It means 
saying “No” to every new 
coal or fracking project, 
and retooling those com-
munities for safer green 
powered jobs.
 And there are no doubt 
countless other ways to act. 
Undoubtable, the climate 
agreement makes it clear 
that governments don’t 
have the power to solve 
climate change alone. We 
all must do something 
more than we currently 
are. Earth Day 2016 is not 
about crossing the finish 
line. When the agreement 
is signed, the hard work 
begins anew.
 
 ---------------------
Rogers is president of 
Earth Day Network.

Guest Commentary
Kathleen Rogers
President of Earth Day Network

 OK people, we need 
to discuss billboards. Yes, 
we really must.
 At best, these giant 
corporate placards are 
problematic — they loom 
garishly over us, clutter 
our landscapes, and in-
trude into our communi-
ties with no respect for 
local aesthetics or pref-
erences. Now, however, 
billboards are getting a 
high-tech reboot, allowing 
advertisers to invade not 
only our places, but also 
our privacy.
 Having to see bill-
boards everywhere is bad 
enough. Far worse, though, 
is that the modernized, 
digitalized, computerized 
structures can see you — 
and track you.
 Clear Channel Out-
door Americas, having 
already splattered the 
country with tens of thou-
sands of billboards, has re-
vealed that it’s partnering 
with AT&T and other data 

snoops to erect “smart” 
billboards that will know 
and record when you drive 
or walk past one.
 Using your own mo-
bile phone, they can then 
follow your travel patterns 
and consumer behavior. 
Aggregating that informa-
tion with other available 
data, Clear Channel can 
then know the average age 
and gender of passersby 
who see an ad on a partic-
ular billboard and know 
whether they later make 
purchases.
 It’s “a bit creepy,” 
admits Andy Stevens — 
Clear Channel’s own vice 
president for “research and 

insights.”
 Stevens rationaliz-
es the company’s zippy 
new Orwellian billboards 
as just another step into 
the digital future: “We’re 
just tapping into an exist-
ing data ecosystem,” he 
shrugs. The millions of 
profiles collected by Clear 
Channel are “obviously…
very valuable to an adver-
tiser.”
 Yet maybe they’re 
more valuable to those of 
us who treasure our pri-
vacy and have given no 
permission to be targeted 
and tracked by a billboard 
huckster. And we thought 
government spying was 
out of control.
 For information on 
corporate snooping, go to 
www.epic.org.
 OtherWords columnist 
Jim Hightower is a radio 
commentator, writer, and 
public speaker. He’s the edi-
tor of the populist newsletter, 
The Hightower Lowdown. 
OtherWords.org.

These Billboards Have Eyes
Computerized placards are literally watching you — 
and they may even follow you home.

No sidelines in fight 
against climate change
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You Have a Choice™
Home owned and operated since 1876.
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P.O. Box 1029 | 918 N. Main St., Salado, Texas 76571
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Serving Investors Since 1982

®

Alton D. Thiele PC
Alton Thiele CPA, MBA

Certified Public Accountant

254-939-0701      1-800-772-7043
300 E. Avenue C, Belton, Texas 76513
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Certified Public Accountant
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The Mortgage You Need - The Service You Expect
• Competitive Rates
• Fixed and Adjustable Rate Mortgage Loans
• Conventional, FHA, VA & USDA Financing
• Mortgages for Home Owners and Investors
• Home Equity Loans

Lorraine Basham, Sr. Loan Officer
Registered Mortgage Loan Orginator
NMLS #415114

CALL TODAY FOR YOUR 
FREE MORTGAGE CONSULTATION

(254) 760-0534 cell

(254) 947-3454 office

40 North Main, Suite C, Salado, TX

lorraineb@fairwaymc.com

All loans subject to credit approval

Copyright©2016 Fairway Independent Mortgage Corporation. NMLS#2289. 4801 S. Biltmore Lane, Madison, WI 
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Bruce A. Bolick, CPA
Did you file an extension?

Need help?
(254) 718-7299

560 North Main, Suite 4, Office 3
ACROSS FROM THE CIVIC CENTER

SaladoCPA@aol.com

Congratulations to 
Mr. and Mrs. Jon Hack!

First Community Title
 40 N. Main Street 

254-947-8480 
(f)254-947-9480 
www.fcttx.com

 Salado Masonic Lodge 
#296 will offer five $1,000 
scholarships to graduating 
Salado High seniors this 
spring.
 Applications are avail-
able through the Salado 
High School Counselors 
office.
 The Masonic Lodge 
raises money for the schol-
arships through its annual 
Flag Program. The Lodge 
will deliver and set up an 
American flag at your Sal-
ado business or residence 
for $30 per year for six 
federal holidays: Veteran’s 
Day in February, Memori-
al Day in May, Flag Day in 
June, Independence Day 
in July, Labor Day in Sep-
tember and Veterans Day 
in November.
 “Salado Masonic 
Lodge has been a part 
of the Village of Salado 
for 149 years,” Worship-
ful Master Paul Christian 
said. “We have funded and 
supported countless com-
munity projects during 
this time. Over the last 
few years Masons have 
raised funds for the Sala-
do Band, Salado One Act 
Play, Salado Choir, Salado 
Soccer Team, books for 
the Elementary Library, 
Dental Hygiene packets 
for first graders, Take 
Time to Read program for 
the Elementary and Mid-
dle Schools, upgrading 
the Civic Center, building 
paths and cleaning up on 
College Hill, among many 
other ventures.”
 If you would like to sub-
scribe to the Salado Flag 
Program, send $30 check 
or money order to Salado 
Masonic Lodge #296, P.O. 
Box 23, Salado, TX 76571. 
Include your name, mail-
ing address, street address 
for flag placement, email 
address and phone num-
ber. No personal informa-
tion will be shared with 
outside groups. 
 A subscription form can 
be found online at http://
saladovillagevoice.com/
salado-flag-program-tak-
ing-new-subscribers/

 If you have any ques-
tions, call the Salado Ma-
sonic Lodge Flag Program 
Chairman, Tim Fleischer, 
at (254) 458-2643.

 The Salado Flag pro-
gram was started in 1997 
by the Salado Rotary Club. 
It was turned over to the 
Masonic Lodge in 2014.

  The Chisholm Trail 
Chapter of the American 
Business Women’s Asso-
ciation is still looking for 
a few good scholarship ap-
plicants for the 2016-2017 
academic year. The dead-
line for receiving applica-
tions is April 29. 
 Scholarship informa-
tion can be found on the 
Salado High School web-
site. 
 For additional informa-
tion, contact Shirley Ste-
phenson at (254) 338-5717.

Chisholm
Trail ABWA

offers SHS
seniors
scholarships

Masonic Lodge receiving applications
for 5 $1,000 scholarships to seniors

The Salado Flag program funds the Salado Masonic 
Lodge scholarships to Salado seniors. There is still 
time to subscribe for 2016.
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IH-35 at Blacksmith Rd.
947-5241 

Sunday
Bible Classes • 9 a.m.      Worship • 10 a.m.

Spanish Worship - Call Church for times
Wednesday

Bible Classes • 6:30 p.m.

The Salado Church of Christ
‘Shaped by His Cross, Sharing His 

truth, Showing His love.’ 

 “We invite you to worship 
with us at any available 
opportunity. You will find 
a group of sincere, God-
loving and Christ-exalting 
people, who will make you 
feel at home with our church 
family.    
  -Joe Keyes, minister

Dr. Travis Burleson, Senior Pastor
WEDNESDAY

5 p.m.  Fellowship Meal

6 p.m.  Adult Bible Study

6 p.m. ESL

6 p.m.  The Mix (Pre-K - 6)

6 p.m.  Bible Drill (Grade 4 – 6)

6 p.m. MIDWEEK

7 p.m. Worship Choir Rehearsal

www.fbcsalado.org

(254) 947-5465

Main St. at the Creek

SUNDAY

8:30 a.m. Classic Worship Service

9:45 a.m. Bible Study

11 a.m. Contemporary Worship Service

11 a.m. Primera

GraceBCSalado.org

5798 FM 2484   
(254) 947-5917

Sunday
New Time for Worship ... 10 a.m. Sunday morning

Small group Bible studies following worship
Wednesday

6:30 p.m. Adult Bible Study and prayer 
RAs and GAs, Mission Friends, Upstairs youth ministry

 Please come to the 10 a.m. morning worship service
 at Grace Baptist Church

16258 Gooseneck Road,  Salado

Church service starts 10 am

(254) 947-7211

www.3ccowboyfellowship.org

Follow events on our website calendar

Intersection - Piano trio (piano, violin and 
cello) with a mix of styles that appeals to 
many audiences — young and old.  From 
Mendelssohn and Rachmaninoff to movie 
themes, light classics, opera hits, tango, 

jazz and Latin.
 

Saturday, April 23
7:30pm Concert - Auditorium

6pm pre-concert - reception and UpClose 
with the artists in Strasburger Hall

Intermission: Desserts in Strasburger Hall

tickets: www.cacARTS.org

3011 N. Third Street, Temple

Central Texas Orchestral Society presents

Front Row: Cooper Scott*, Ethan Bagley*, Kaitlyn Casper*, Kenzie Hawkins, Logan Dunlap, Kymberleigh 
Deen*2nd Row: Joshua Porterfield*, Jake Reaves*, Caleb Porterfield*, Eli Lehmann*, Ryan Novotny*, Braydon 
ZakBack Row: Katherine Haltom, Brooke McLaurin*, Holly Giesecke*, Emory Allen*, Ellie Mescher*Not Pic-
tured: Triniti Watkins*
* Advanced to State Competition

 Drillers have been 
practicing and memoriz-
ing since early September 
2015.  They must memo-
rize 25 bible verses, 10 key 

passages and all 66 Books 
of the Bible.  During drill 
competition, they have 10 
seconds to locate a Key 
Passage, Book of the Bi-

ble or to recall and recite 
1 of the 25 verses.  There 
are 3 levels of competition: 
church, Association and 

State.  14 of the drillers ad-
vanced to State level com-
petition which was held in 
Houston on April 9.

First Baptist Bible drillers excel at memorizing verses and passages

 The seventh annu-
al Central Texas Master 
Singers concert featuring 
the choir and  orchestra 
will be performed two 
nights at the Memorial 
Baptist Church, 6161 S. 5th 
Street in Temple.
 The concert will be 
performed at 7:30 p.m. 
April 22 and again at 6 
p.m. April 23 featuring the 
music of Mark Hayes and 
commissioned anthems 
by Drs. Gary and Patricia 
Bonner.
  Tickets are $20 per per-
son in advance and $25 at 
the door, if available.
 For ticket reservations, 
call 254-654-2150 or pur-
chase online at www.Cen-
tralTexasMasterSingers.
com
 Concerts will be pro-
fessionally recorded. Tick-
et holders will be able to 
pre-order this CD album 
while attending either 
night of the concert for a 

discount.
 Central Texas Mas-
ter Singers is the premier 
choir under the organi-

zation of Master Singers 
Inc., a 501(c)3 tax exempt 
non-pro t, faith based cho-
ral organization.

 Tax deductible dona-
tions can be made online 
at www.centraltexasmas-
tersingers.com.

Central Texas Master Singers, choir 
and orchestra to perform April 22-23

 Salado Area Republi-
can Women are pleased to 
be able to offer two $1000 
scholarships this year, 
double what was available 
last year.  
 Applicants must be Sal-
ado High School Senior la-
dies in good standing with 
a 2.5 GPA or better.  Ap-
plications can be obtained 
from counselor Anita Mo-
rales’ office. and must be 
postmarked by April 28.
 Information is also 
listed on Salado ISD 
website, http://schools.
saladoisd.org/default.as-
px?name=shs.scholarship.   
If you have any further 
questions, call SARW 
Scholarship Chair, Char-
maine Barker, at 254-290-
3805.

Republican 
Women offer
scholarships 

Terry E. Sanford
Aug.11,1955-April 14, 2016
Terry E. Sanford, 60, lost his hard 
fought battle with ALS while in the 
arms of his wife, Janice Sanford, the 
morning of April 15, 2016. Terry lived 
most of his adult life in Sugar Land, but 
was born on August 11, 1955 in Angle-
ton, Texas to Paul and Patsy Sanford. 

The family soon moved to The Cen-
tral Texas town of Salado, where his 
mother’s family had lived for three 
generations. Growing up and working 
around his father and grandfather’s 
ranch and feed store, taught Terry the 
importance of family, and the value 
of hard work and persistence. Terry 
graduated from nearby Belton High 
in 1973, where he excelled in sports 
and academics. Terry then earned an 
accounting degree from Sam Houston 
State in 1977. While in school, Terry’s 
passion was riding broncs and bulls in the rodeo, where he participated in events all across 
our country. 

Upon graduating from college and getting CPA license, Terry moved to Houston and worked 
for the Big Eight accounting firm of Coopers 	 Lybrand. He was soon heading up bank audit-
ing teams and working with companies trying to go public. After working in management with 
other companies needing his expertise, he took on a position with Carriage Services, where he 
worked for 15 years, ending his service there as Executive Vice President and CFO. He also 
worked to receive his MBA with Honors in Finance from the University of Houston. Lastly, he 
was working to help Arabella Exploration of Midland to go public. During his career, Terry also 
served as a past President of the Houston Chapter of Financial Executives International. 

Terry was an avid sportsman and athlete. From a game of golf to a marathon, Terry enjoyed 
sporting competition with his friends. And sharing his love on hunting and fishing with his friends 
or family always brought a smile to his face. On warm days you could often find him in com-
mand of his barbecue grill by the pool, while his friends and family enjoyed this special time to-
gether. But it is his faith in the Lord which we know will bring him eternal peace and happiness.

Terry was preceded in death by his father, Paul T. Sanford. He is survived by his wife of 22 
years, Janice Sanford; sons, Justin Sanford of Cleveland, Texas and Charles Sanford of Hous-
ton, Texas; daughter, Ashley Sanford of San Antonio, Texas; stepdaughters, Heather Brown 
and husband, Jim, Ashley Bieltz and husband, Mike of Sugar Land, and Jana Forastiere and 
husband, Mat of Over Land Park, Kansas; mother, Patsy Sanford of Salado; brothers, Tracey 
Sanford and wife, Lisa of Fort Worth and James Sanford of Lockhart; nephew, Casey Sanford; 
and grandchildren; Caden, Abigail, Jackson, Matthew, Sloan, and Brooks. 

The visitation will be held from 5:00 pm until 8:00 pm on Friday April 22, 2016 at The Settegast-
Kopf Company Funeral Directors at Sugar Creek, 15015 Southwest Freeway, Sugar Land, Tex-
as 77478. The funeral service will be held at 2:00 pm on Saturday, April23, 2016 in The Morrow 
Chapel at The Settegast-Kopf. The burial will take place at Salado Cemetery in Salado, Texas.

In lieu of Àowers, donations may be made in Terry¶s memory to the Methodist ALS Research 
Foundation at securepayments.houstonmethodist.org/Donate-to-Methodist-Foundation



SALADO Village Voice, April 21, 2016, Page 5A

....serving those who love and remember

(254) 947-0066

949 West Village Road, Salado

BroeckerFuneralHome.com

Dossman 
Funeral Home

2525 N. Main • Belton • 933-2525
“In Service to our fellow man...”

I urge, then, first of all, that requests, prayers, intercession 
and thanksgiving be made for everyone - for kings and all 
those in authority, that we may live peaceful and quiet lives 
in all godliness and holiness.

    1 Timothy 2:1,2

Community BriefsCommunity Briefs

Insured                          
Free Estimates

Glass Replacement
Table Top Glass
Custom Mirrors

Storefront
Storefront Repair

Solar Screens
Frameless Shower Glass

Framed Shower Enclosures

A.J. Lopez

Satisfaction
 Guaranteed

Locally Owned

Douglas B. Willingham, D.D.S.

(254) 947-5242
Main and Thomas Arnold Road

www.saladodentistry.com

Get Straighter, Whiter 
Teeth, Without Removing 

Healthy Tooth Structure

A 
Life-Changing 

Smile 
is in 

Your Future

ObituariesObituaries

Rev. Lara Whitley Franklin, Pastor
 650 Royal Street    
  (254) 947-5482

www.saladoumc.org 

Office hours:  
Mon - Fri 8:30 a.m. - 4 p.m.
Facebook.com/saladoumc

Sunday, April 24
9 am Worship Service in Worship Center Traditional

10 am Sunday School  All Ages

11:15 am Worship Service in Chapel Contemporary

Wednesday, April 27
5:15 pm   Fellowship Meal 
6 - 7 pm   Adult Ramp project
6 - 7:15 pm   M & M Kids
6 - 7:30 pm   “Fourtwelve” Youth in the YAC

           Thursday, April 28
10 am - 4 pm  Hearing Testing in the YAC
     To Schedule call 1-800-392-1041 

PRICE, ThElma RosE GRossE
 The Lord giveth and the 
Lord has taken away unto 
Him our mother, Thelma 
Rose Grosse Price at the 
age of 92.  She was born 
on September 2, 1923 in St 
Louis, Missouri. Thelma 
passed away after a brief 
illness on April 13, 2016 
at Christopher House.  She 
was predeceased by her 
parents Edward William 
Grosse and Teresa Rose 
Grosse, siblings Berniece Stanton, Edward and Arvil 
Grosse and beloved husband Eldon Price.
 Thelma and Eldon married in 1942 and raised their 
three children, Brent, Sandy and Cheryl in Lockhart, 
Texas.  They were privileged to be able to celebrate 
their 50th anniversary before Eldon’s death.  Thelma 
was a wonderful homemaker, mother, wife, grand-
mother and great grandmother.
 In Lockhart, she managed the Lockhart Chamber of 
Commerce and played an active role with the Caldwell 
County Red Cross.  She designed the Lockhart float 
and participated in representing Lockhart in parades 
around the state for many years.  Thelma volunteered 
with the Red Cross aiding military families in time of 
crises helping to bring them home from overseas. 
 In 1962, the family moved to Austin where her work 
continued.  She was business manager of Durham’s 
Business College and helped operate the school.   Re-
tiring after 25 years, she became a substitute in the 
Eanes School District school front offices, as well 
as the administration office.  When Don Rogers re-
tired as Superintendent of EISD, he took Thelma with 
him to the Texas Association of Community Schools 
to work as a key assistant.  She was honored with an 
Honorary Life Member Award when she retired at the 
age of 82!
 After two retirements, Thelma tirelessly devoted her 
time to her favorite charity, The Assistant League of 
Austin, also serving a term as president.   She loved 
volunteering for the Settlement Home where she be-
came an “honorary” member of the Children’s De-
partment.  Thelma was involved in the Austin Ostomy 
Association, serving as president for a couple of years.   
Dr. Jeff Kocurek was responsible for her successful 
surgery and longevity.   He called on her frequently to 
counsel with his patients facing surgery and she called 
on him to speak at the oestomy meetings. She greatly 
enjoyed the many friends she made in volunteering.
 Thelma was a 50 year member of First Presbyte-
rian Church, serving on many committees and as a 
Deacon.   She was very proud of her family, who she 
leaves with special memories.  She was affectionate-
ly called Granda by her grandchildren whose photos 
covered all the walls in her home. Granda dearly loved 
her family particularly her grandchildren and great 
grandchildren.   
 Thelma is survived by her children, the Rev. Dr. 
Brent Price and wife Beverly of Pasadena, California; 
Sandy Perkins and husband John; and Cheryl Pany 
and husband David of Temple, Texas.  Her beloved 
grandchildren are Brittney Price, Kelly Perkins Rigas, 
Michael Perkins and wife, Leslie; Bart Pany and wife, 
Jessica; and Brett Pany and wife, Amy.  She had 10 
great grandchildren: Nicholas, Morgan and Ellison 
Rigas; Everett and Peyton Perkins; Garrett, Meghan 
and Faith Pany; and Cooper and Finley Pany as well as 
many nieces and nephews.  She will be greatly missed.
 A celebration of her life was held at First Presbyte-
rian Church, 8001 Mesa Drive, Austin, TX, on Sat-
urday, April 16 at 11:00 am with Pastors David Meri-
weather and Sarah Allen officiating.  
 In lieu of flowers, remembrances may be made in 
her honor to The Assistance League of Austin – 4901 
Burnet Road, Austin, Texas   78756, The Settlement 
Home – 1600 Payton Gin Road, Austin, Texas 78758, 
Hospice Austin 4107 Spicewood Springs Road, Aus-
tin, Texas 78759 or First Presbyterian Church 8001 
Mesa Drive, Austin, Texas  78731. 
 Obituary and memorial guestbook available online 
at www.wcfish.com
Arrangements by Weed-Corley-Fish Funeral Home – 
(512) 452-8811. Paid obituary.

St. Stephen
Catholic 
Church

Mass Schedule
Tuesday - 6 p.m. 

Wed & Thurs - 8:30 a.m.

Friday - Noon

Saturday - 5:30 p.m.

Confesssions 4:30-5:15 p.m. 

or call for an appointment

Sunday
 (English) 9 a.m.

(Spanish) 10:30 a.m. 

2Ifice�+ours��0onGay���)riGay�
��a.m.���1oon�	����������S.m.

601 FM 2268 

947-8037
www.saintstephenchurch.org

Religious Education
 Classes - Wednesday

 K thru 12th            5:30 - 8 p.m. 

St. Joseph’s 

Episcopal Church

881 North Main Street
947-3160

S t J o s e p h S a l a d o . o rg

Sunday School

Sun. • 9:30 a.m.
Holy Eucharist

Sun. • 11 a.m.

Donald J Creed
 Funeral services for 
Donald J. Creed, 70, of 
Belton, passed away April 
8, 2016 were held at 10 a.m. 
Tuesday, April 12, 2016, at 
3C Cowboy Fellowship 
with Pastor Robert White-
field officiating.  Burial 
will follow at the Live Oak 
Cemetery in Youngsport.  
 The family will receive 
friends for visitation Mon-
day evening from 6 – 8  
p.m. at the Broecker Fu-
neral Home in Salado.
 Don was born in Cai-
ro, Missouri on May 1, 
1945, to Donald and Betty 
Creed.  He was raised on a 
farm and learned the val-
ue of hard work at an early 
age.  
 After graduating 
Moberly High School in 
1963, he started working 
for the Walbash Rail Road.  
In 1967, he was drafted into 
the United States Army 
to serve in the Vietnam 
War.  Creed’s decorations, 
medals, commendations, 
citations, and campaign 
ribbons awarded include 
the Vietnam Service Med-
al with 3 Bronze Service 

Stars, Republic of Viet-
nam Campaign Medal, 
National Defense Service 
Medal, Combat Infantry-
man Badge, Bronze Star 
Medal, Marksman (Rifle), 
Expert (M-60), and Sharp-
shooter (Rifle).  
 After departing service 
with the U.S. Army at Fort 
Hood, Texas in 1969, Don 
started his own framing 
construction business in 
Florence, Texas.  In 1998, 
he married his wife, Karen 
Creed.
 Don was preceded in 
death by his parents, Don-
ald and Betty Creed and 
his brother Ronnie Creed.
 Survivors include 
his wife Karen Creed of 
Belton; five sons, Brack 
Creed of Georgetown, 
Jerald Creed of Manhat-
tan, Kansas, Will Creed 
of Belton, Bubba Drake of 
Salado, and Rooster Drake 
of West; two daughters, 
Penny Creed of Andice 
and Barbie Durham of 
Killeen; two brothers, 
Ralph Creed of George-
town and Dan Creed of 
Brunswick, Missouri; 
three sisters, Joyce Nel-
son of Moberly, Missouri, 
Rita Dunkin of Mober-
ly, Missouri, and Brenda 
Baker of Centralia, Mis-
souri; 24 grandchildren; 
three great-grandchildren; 
and numerous nieces and 
nephews.
 In lieu of flowers me-
morials may be made to 
Wounded Warrior Project.
Services are in the care of 
Broecker Funeral Home, 
Salado.

 Salado Area Republi-
can Women are hosting a 
membership drive at their 
April 28. meeting at the 
Civic Center. The lun-
cheon meeting starts at 
11:30 a.m. and includes a 
meal provided by Ambro-
sia’s Tea Room. 
 Jonathan M. Saenz, 
president of Texas Values, 
will be the speaker. He 
is president of the Texas 
Values, a nonprofit group 
dedicated to preserving 
and advancing a culture of 
family values in the state 

of Texas. 
 Saenz’s work on these 
issues spans two decades.  
Prior to leading Texas Val-
ues (2012), he headed the 
Liberty Institute offices at 
the Texas Capitol in Austin 
where he served as Direc-
tor of Legislative Affairs 
and Attorney for Liberty 
Institute.  
 He frequently presents 
research, analysis, and tes-
timony before the Texas 
Legislature, State Board of 
Education, and other gov-
ernment entities on vari-

ous issues affecting faith, 
family, and freedom.
 Saenz will provide an 
overview of Texas Val-
ues and a summary of the 
work that they do, as well 
as updates on the religious 
liberty issues current-
ly ongoing in Texas and 
the upcoming Supreme 
Court decision on the HB2 
(abortion law) case.  Res-

ervations are necessary by 
the deadline of April 22, 
and can be made by mail-
ing a $12 check to SARW, 
PAC; P.O. Box 373; Sala-
do, TX 76571. Prospective 
members may attend at no 
charge but reservations 
must be made to  Barbara 
Swarthout at bswarthout@
exede.net or 414-491-2341.

Saenz, president of Texas Values 
to address SARW meeting April 28

Salado student 
inducted into 
Phi Theta Kappa
 
 Temple College student 
Jessica Densmore of Sala-
do was inducted in April 
into the Lambda Theta 
Chapter of Phi Theta Kap-
pa (PTK), the international 
honor society for students 
in two-year colleges.
 Temple College is a 
public, two-year college 
with locations in Temple, 
Taylor and Hutto. The 
college offers more than 
60 certificate and degree 
programs, as well as dual 
credit courses for high 
school students.
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IT’S TIME FOR NEW LEADERSHIP IN SALADO 

  

Vote for Hans Fields!!  He will: 
✓ ENCOURAGE ALL PUBLIC INPUT AND IDEAS 
✓ SUPPORT OPEN MEETINGS AND MINIMIZE CLOSED SESSIONS 
✓ HELP SALADO GROW SMART RATHER THAN GROW FAST 
✓ ENSURE RESPECT TOWARD CONSTITUENTS BY LISTENING AND HEARING 

THEM  
✓ PLACE A PRIORITY ON PUBLIC SAFETY AND QUALITY OF LIFE  
✓ SUPPORT FISCAL RESPONSIBILITY & LOW TAXES 
✓ ENSURE VILLAGE FINANCIALS ARE PROVIDED ROUTINELY  
✓ OFFER CITIZENS A FULL-TIME MAYOR 
✓ PROVIDE PUBLIC DISCLOSURE OF ANY CONFLICTS OF INTEREST 
✓ PROMOTE A SMALL DECENTRALIZED GOVERNMENT 
✓ PROVIDE A PLAN AND SCHEDULE FOR TOWN HALL MEETINGS THAT 

ENCOURAGE FULL CITIZEN PARTICIPATION 
✓ SUPPORT ALL CITIZENS RIGHTS TO PUBLIC INFORMATION 

Hans Fields will be available in-person at the Brazos Collection parking area 
(318 N. Main St,) Thursday and Friday April 21st and 22nd from 1:00PM to 

6:30PM to meet you, hear your concerns and answer any questions that you may 
have concerning Salado’s future. 

Make your vote count! 

POLITICAL AD PAID FOR BY HANS FIELDS FOR MAYOR CAMPAIGN, JUDY FIELDS TREASURER, 818 BLAYLOCK CIRCLE SALADO TEXAS,
76571

floral department  947-8922

Mothers Day is May 8

Brookshire Brothers

 My Mother’s Texas 
Irises is the theme of the 
April 23 Belton Iris So-
ciety’s annual iris show. 
The public is cordially 
invited to attend this free 
event. You do not need to 
be a BIS member to submit 
show entries. 
 Public viewing for the 
2016 Iris Show hosted 
by the Belton Iris Soci-
ety (BIS) is from 1-3 p.m. 
Saturday, April 23. This 
year’s event is being held 
in the Fellowship Hall at 
St. Paul United Methodist 
Church, 2407 West Ave P, 
in Temple (corner of 49th 
Street and Avenue R). 
 Last year’s BIS iris 
show was one of the larg-
est American Iris Soci-
ety-approved shows in the 
State of Texas. BIS is one 
of 14 Iris societies in Tex-
as officially affiliated with 
the American Iris Society 
(www.irises.org).  
 Photography entries 
will be accepted for the 
second year in a row. Ar-
tistic design entries will 
reflect the designated 
theme for the 2016 show, 
My Mother’s Texas Irises.
 Entry is free and open 
to the public. 
 It is also free to submit 
entries for judging accord-
ing to American Iris Soci-
ety rules. Iris photography 
entries must be submitted 
between 9 a.m. and 10 
a.m. the day of the event. 
All other entries must be 
submitted between 9 and 
no later than 10:30 on 
April 23 in the following 
divisions: horticulture, 
seedling, artistic design, 
and educational (poster) 
entries.  
 BIS was organized on 
April 18, 1951. The first 
show was held on April 
17, 1952, at the Belton 
Carnegie Library with 
223 entries. The group is 
dedicated to the enjoy-
ment and sharing of irises. 
Membership is extended 
to anyone interested in 
irises. Meetings are held 
September-November and 
January-May. Annual dues 
are $10. 
 For further information 
please visit the BIS home 
page at http://www.ken-
fuchs42.net/belton_index.
html or contact BIS pres-
ident Karen Woods, (254) 
217-1750. 

This year’s iris show hosted by the Belton Iris Society 
will be 1-3 p.m. April 23, at St. Paul Methodist Church 
in Temple. This iris was blooming in a country garden 
west of Bartlett just days ago. 

Belton Iris Society 
host annual show 
at Methodist 
Church in Temple

SHARE 
Your NEWS
Submit club, 
church and 

family events to 
news@

saladovillage 
voice.com

submit online
at www.salado 

villagevoice.
com
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One Call Does It All
(254) 933-7400

www.cars-collision.com

1914 S. IH 35, Belton

Cliff Coleman, owner

Paint & Body • Frame Repair • Hail Repair
FREE ESTIMATES              INSURANCE CLAIMS WELCOME

New Location        Expressions     774-9751

 3126 South 31st Street across from HEB in Temple

Colorist
Hairstylist 

Jenny Wiggin Potter 

Keratin Treatments

Dreamcatchers Extensions

(254) 534-3169

Twisted Metal Diesel & Automotive

Full Service Motor Repair 
   Diesel & Gas

Transmission Rebuilds
Oil Changes
Truck Performance Accessories
Lift Kits
Vehicle Dealer
State and DOT Inspections

(254) 947-7257 Wayne Taylor, Owner
3514 FM2484, Salado

twistedmetaldiesel@aol.com

Monday - Friday 9 a.m. - 6 p.m.

Saturday 9 a.m. - Noon

Linda Rountree Pritchard Egg, R.N., LMT. 
has relocated to 101 N. Main St. Suite B 

nestled in the trees 
next to The Range Restaurant 

254-947-HAND (4263) • handlmt@gmail.com

Visit Linda 
at her

New Location
Therapeutic 

Massage 
by Appt.

by TIm FleIscher

edITor-IN-chIeF

 A  shot that just slipped 
through the hands of se-
nior goalkeeper Sam Is-
bell at 85:25 in the Salado 
Lady Eagles semi-final 
game against the Jasper 
Lady Dawgs April 13 at 
Georgetown’s Birkelbach 
field was enough to give 
the Lady Dawgs the 1-0 
win. 
 Never mind that Is-
bell had just saved a shot 
by Jasper’s forward Julie 
Carter a half minute be-
fore. Or that Isbell had a 
stellar game with six saves 
spread throughout the first 
90 minutes of play.
 The shot came from 
midfielder Kaitlyn Cam-
pos crossing from the 
right into the left of the 
goal, crossing the line by 
about a foot after splitting 
Isbell’s extended hands. 
Alivia Richardson made 
the assist on the play.
 Jasper, which was 
knocked out of the state 
tournament last year in 
the semi-final round, took 
seven shots on the goal, 
three of them by the very 
talented Carter, whose 
sister Yvette served as the 
Lady Dawgs goalkeeper.
 The Lady Eagles had a 
shot in both of the overtime 

periods, but could convert 
either one. The first came 
when Salado controlled 
the ball at the beginning of 
the second period. At 3:28 
left to play in overtime, 
Reagan Morreale took the 
last of her three shots in 
the game on a free kick af-
ter Campos fouled senior 
midfielder Katey Ewton. 
The shot went over the top 
of the goal.
 Morreale had two shots 
on goal in the game, both 
on free kicks. With nine 
minutes left in regulation, 
Morale saw her free kick 
defended by Jasper’s Cart-
er.
 Two minutes later, Is-
bell was the one making 
the save as she cut back to 
her left to stop a shot on 
goal by midfielder Alivia 
Richardson. Richardson 
took two shots on goal in 
the match.
 Jasper kept the ball on 
the Lady Eagles’ side of 
the field for the majority 
of the closing minutes of 
regulation and Isbell made 
another save at the 78 min-
ute mark on a shot from 
the wide left by Richard-
son.
 The only other shot on 
goal for Salado was one 
taken by forward Annie 
Ewton.
 The Lady Eagles took 

nine shots during the 
match. Jasper took 11 
shots.
 Salado had three corner 
kicks, but the Jasper de-
fenders were able to kick 
the ball out of the clus-
ter of players before any 
threat was made.
 Carter had three saves 
in the match, two in the 
first period and one in the 
second.
 The Lady Eagles fin-
ish the season with a 26-2 
record. Jasper lost to Ken-
nedale 6-0 in the final 
on April 14. Kennedale 
cruised past Kilgore 6-0 
and Jasper 6-0 to win its 
second straight state title.
 Salado senior forward 
Taylor Schoenrock and se-
nior midfielder China Sax-
ton were named to the UIL 
4A State All-Tournament 
Girls Soccer Team.
 They joined four play-
ers from Kennedale, three 
from Jasper and two from 
Kilgore: Abigail Olmos, 
MVP, Kennedale, Alon-
dra Olmos, Kennedale, 
Eryka McIntyre, Ken-
nedale, Alexis Thornton, 
Kennedale, Julie Carter, 
Jasper, Kaitlin Campos, 
Jasper, Macy Kendrick, 
Jasper, Kaitlin Word, 
Kilgore and Leslie Ben-
nett, Kilgore.

China Saxton, in her final game as a Salado Lady Eagle, was named to the UIL 4A 
Girls Soccer All-Tournament Team. She was joined by senior Taylor Schoenrock. 
Salado lost in the semi-final match to Jasper 1-0 in overtime. (Photo by tim Fleischer)

Overtime loss ends Salado’s 
soccer season at state semis
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on the Boardwalk at #6 Old Town 
facebook.com/Creeksideusedfurniture

Creekside Used Furniture
Salado’s Leather Specialist

Vintage Vinyl 
LP Records

for Sale right here!

Vintage 
Vinyl

at
Creekside

WE BUY SCRAP GOLD & SILVER

Texas Coin Connection
108 E FM2410, Suite G  -  Harker Heights

Buy       Sell      Trade
Gold, Silver, Coins, Currency & Jewelry

(254) 699-2646
Locally Owned - Salado Resident

Massage Therapy
The Remedy

113 N. Stagecoach Rd. Suite 5

Call (254) 624-7912
to schedule your therapeutic massage

Do you suffer from 
Headaches? Migranes? 
We’ve Got The Remedy!

Libby Nichols
MT044934

TheRemedySalado.com

Lobby

 Mon - Fri  9 a.m. - 3 p.m.

Drive-in

 Mon - Thur 
7:30 a.m. - 4 p.m. 

 Fri 
7:30 a.m. - 5:30 p.m.

Sat  
9 a.m.- noon

Member FDIC

Main Street at 
Thomas Arnold Road, Salado

(254) 947-5852 fsbcentex.com 

24 HOUR HEALTH CLUB

(254) 947-1063        213 Mill Creek Drive #155

Silver & Fit 
Participating Facility   Call to inquire

Fitness Classes Included
Personal Training Available

24 Hour Access
Activity & Diet Tracking Apps

Starbucks Coffee Company
Brooke May, Mngr. 

(254) 933-2179

Coffee, Pastries 
and more

200 N IH35               Belton

Digital Rewards

LASTOVICA
Fine Jewelers, Inc.

“Known for Service” 
Prompt In-Store Jewelry Repairs 

Diamond Sales • Custom Casting • Diamond 

Appraisal • Watch Repair • Diamond Setting 

Jewelry Repair

1202 S 31st St. & Ave. L • Temple
773-5772

by TIm FleIscher

edITor-IN-chIeF

 The Salado varsity Ea-
gles baseball team qual-
ified for the playoffs and 
continued their perfect 
march through District 25-
4A opponents last week 
with wins over Lampasas 
and Liberty Hill.
Salado  3
Liberty Hill 0
 Salado Eagles shut 
out the Liberty Hill Pan-
thers on their home field 
April 15, winning 3-0. 
Pitcher Cody Wolf threw 
a two-hitter striking out 
nine batters in the winning 
mound appearance.
 Preston Payne score led 
off the game when he was 
hit by the pitcher. He ad-
vanced to third on a dou-
ble by Chase Basham and 
scored on a single by Jacob 

Wilk to give Salado a 1-0 
lead.
 The Eagles added two 
more runs in the fifth in-
ning. Basham was hit by 
the pitcher and went to 
second on a passed ball. 
Wilk earned a walk to put 
runners at the corners with 
one out. Grant Taylor hit 
a booming double to left 
field fence scoring Bash-
am and Wilk.
 Drew Dobbinsm Gar-
rett Lightfoot and Phillip 
Ellis all had singles in the 
second but Salado could 
not convert the hits into 
runs.
 Basham hit a triple 
in the seventh, but was 
thrown out at home try-
ing to stretch it into a run.  
Lampasas 2
Salado  12
 Salado Eagles crushed 
Lampasas in another Mer-

cy Rule-shortened game 
April 12, winning 12-2 in 
five innings at home.
 The Eagles scored four 
runs in the first. Preston 
Payne led off the bottom 
of the first with a walk. 
He stole second and third, 
scoring on a passed ball.  
Cody Wolf walked, Jacob 
Wilk reached on an er-
ror and Ryan Dunnahoo 
walked to load the bases. 
Grant Taylor doubled to 
deep right, scoring two 
runners. Dunnahoo scored 
on a walk.
 Salado added a run in 
the second. Wolf singled, 
followed by a single by 
Wilk to put runners at the 
corners. Dunnahoo flied 
out to deep center to score 
Wolf.
 Three more Eagles 
crossed the plate in the 
third inning. Payne singled 

and scored on a homer by 
Chase Basham. Wolf dou-
bled, went to third on a 
passed ball and scored on 
an error.
 The Eagles made the 
score 12-2 in the fourth. 
Drew Dobbins singled and 
stole second. A single to 
deep left by Lightfoot al-
lowed Dobbins to score on 
the throw. Lightfoot stole 
second and third, Payne 
walked and Basham’s 
smashing triple to right put 
him across the plate. 
 Dobbins got the win on 
the mound for Salado. He 
struck out eight batters and 
gave up three hits in four 
innings.
 Basham closed the 
game, pitching in the fifth 
and striking out one.
 Games scheduled for 
April 19 were postponed 
due to inclement weather. 

by TIm FleIscher

edITor-IN-chIeF

 Jenna Calder’s walk-off 
single to right lifted the 
Salado Lady Eagles over 
the Lampasas Lady Bad-
gers 9-8 in the bottom of 
the 11th inning April 12.
 Calder’s shot to right 
brought home Madeline 
Murray, who hit a one-out 
double to center. Murray 
got to third due to an error 
by the centerfielder before 
scoring the winning run. 
Salado took an early lead 
in the game with a run in 
the bottom of the first and 
two in the fourth.
 Meagan Hill led off the 
bottom of the first with a 
single and advanced on a 

sacrifice bunt by Payton 
Dreitz. A passed ball let 
her go to third and she 
scored on a sacrifice fly to 
center by Malory Schattle.
 Murray scored in the 
fourth after hitting a sin-
gle She got to third on a 
double by Bailey Tindell 
and scored on a single by 
Stephanie Mancilla. Dre-
itz singled, scoring Tin-
dell.
 Lampasas took the 
lead in the sixth, scoring 
five runs by taking ad-
vantage of three errors  
and two batters being hit 
by the pitcher and anoth-
er walked. They only had 
one hit in the frame, a sin-
gle by Blake Brooresan to 
score a runner.

 Salado answered with 
five runs in the sixth. Tin-
dell hit a double to center 
and Mancilla bunted to 
put runners at the corner.  
Dreitz singled to plate Tin-
dell and a defensive inter-
ference call against Lam-
pasas pushed Mancilla 
across homeplate. Malory 
Schattle homered over the 
centerfield fence to score 
Dreitz.  Rebecca Dock-
ray singled, advancing on 
a single by Lindy Martin 
and a fly-out to right by 
Murray. She scored on an 
error by the second base-
man before the third out 
was recorded.
 The Lady Badgers 
scored three runs with 
two outs in the seventh 

to send the game into ex-
tra innings. Kyndal Moy-
er reached on a fielder’s 
choice that put Moni-
ca Garcia out at second 
for the second out of the 
frame. Brookresan walked 
and an error to Sloan John-
son loaded the bases. Kloe 
Corbin hit a double to deep 
right to bring all three run-
ners home tying the game 
at 8-8.
 The Lady Eagles were 
able to get out of a jam 
in the 10th inning when 
Lampasas loaded the bas-
es with two outs. In the 
11th, the Lady Bagers had 
a runner in scoring posi-
tion but she was called out 
for leaving base before the 
pitch to end the threat.
 
 

 Salado FC U11 Boys 
soccer team qualified 
for the South Texas Cup 
State Finals in San Anto-
nio April 30- May 1 after 
competing in the West-
ern District Round in San 
Marcos April 16-17. The 
boys were set to play Le-
ander to decide first and 
second place in the finals 
of the Western District but 
inclement weather post-
poned the match. The two 
teams will face each at the 
Finals in San Antonio to 
determine placement.
 On the first day of the 

Salado FC U11 Boys Soccer team are these: (front 
row, from left) Logan White, Cody Coker, Daniel Chtay, 
Jackson Husung, Jett Luedeke; (middle row, from left)
Ryan Novotny, Jack Finch, Jackson Bragg, Cooper 
Thomas, John Colvin, Luke Drigalla, Morgan Adams 
and (back row from left) coaches Dorian Drigalla, 
Ayham Chtay, Riad Chtay.

Salado FC U11 boys
qualify for South Texas

Western District tourna-
ment, Salado won its first 
game against Liberty Hill 
8-0. The boys tied Bastrop 
in the second game by a 
score of 2-2 and tied Le-
ander 3-3 to qualify for the 
semi-final game. 
 The boys won a 
shootout in a rematch 
against Bastrop to qualify 
for the finals. John Colvin, 
Cody Coker, and Morgan 
Adams each scored during 
the shootout that decided 
game 4. Every player ei-
ther scored or gave an as-
sist during the tourney. 

 Local adults 27 and 
older can sign up for the 
Adult Recreational Soccer 
League. The adult league 
will be 7v7 co-ed teams.
 The games will begin 
the first week of May. 
Games will primarily be 
played on Sunday after-
noons at the Salado Youth 
Soccer fields on Salado 
Park Rd. behind the Holi-
day Inn Express and Days 

Inn hotels.
 The cost to play is $30 
per player. You may reg-
ister as an individual who 
will be placed on a team. 
You can create your own 
team of family, friends 
and sign up as a group.
 Rules are set up to fa-
cilitate all levers of play-
ers and promote a fun at-
mosphere for the players 
and fans. Licensed adult 

officials will officiate the 
games. There will be a 
minimum of eight games 
played during the season.
 Rules, registration and 
more information can be 
found at www.saladoadul-
tathletics.org. You can reg-
ister on the website or in 
person at the Salado Youth 
Soccer Association Stand 
4:30-6:30 p.m. April 24. 

 

Adult soccer league signing up players

Eagles on march through District

Ladies take extra-inning win from Lampasas

Salado is signing up play-
ers for an adult recre-
ational soccer league.
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Stop by. We’d love to meet you.
815 North Stagecoach Road

Salado, Texas 76571

Phone: 254-947-8636

HorizonBankTexas.com

B A N K I N G  T H A T  
G O E S  A B O V E  A N D  
B E Y O N D ,  W I T H O U T  
L E A V I N G  T E X A S

At Horizon Bank, we understand local 

businesses—because we are one.

  JD's Grill
OPEN Daily for Breakfast & Lunch        6 a.m. - 2 p.m.

inside 
JD's Travel Center

15881 South IH 35 
in Salado 

Breakfast Special
2 Eggs, Hashbrowns,

Bacon or Sausage,

and Toast or Biscuit

$
3

99

Lunch Special
Burger, Fries

and a 16 oz Drink

Hamburger 
$
5

19

Cheeseburger 
$
5

69

Friday Catfish 
Catfish, Cole Slaw and 

French Fries

$
7

99

Take I35 Exit South 283 or North 282

(254) 947-5228

Mill Creek Cleaners

Quality Dry Cleaning, Laundry, 
Alterations & Custom Tailoring

213 Mill Creek Drive, Suite 200

Salado Plaza next to Brookshire Brothers

Mon-Fri 8-6 • Sat 9-2 • Closed Sunday
 (254) 947-0100

www.devereauxjewelers.com

April is 
Heartworm 
Awarenesss

Month

Animal Medical Salado
Full Service Vet Hospital        

saladovet.com

Tips from Animal Medical Salado
1. Pets should be tested annually for heartworm

 infection. 

2. Year round heartworm prevention is the most

  effective method. 

3. Heartworm infections are spread by mosquitoes.

(254) 947-8800
Dr. Lindsay Quirk-Fultz                    Dr. Linda Quirk

 Eight varsity boys 
tracksters and  10 varsity 
girls tracksters have qual-
ified for the Area meet 
April 21 at Liberty Hill 
High School by placing in 
the top four at the District 
25-4A meet April 12-13 in 
Burnet.
VarsITy gIrls
 Sugar Hill and Sarah 
Kate Kelarek both earned 
gold medals as part of the 
4 X 100 Relay team and 
silver medals in individu-
al races to lead the Salado 
girls at the District 25-4A 
track meet.
 The 4 X 100 Meter 
Relay team of Hill, Katie 
Robinson, Abby Quick 
and Sarah Kelarek a ran 
a time of 50.35 to win the 
gold medal.
 Kelarek also medaled 
in the 300 Meter hurdles, 
placing second with a time 
of 48.01. 
 Hill ran a time of 15.90 
in the 100 Meter Hurdles 
for the silver.
 Brittany Vrooman took 
second in the discus with a 
throw of 103-02.
 Mariah VaillanCourt 
took the silver medal in 
the Triple Jump with a dis-
tance of 34-08.50.
 Regina Dean medaled 
in the 100 Meters with a 
time of 12.89 for bronze.
 Katie Robinson earned 
the bronze medal in the 
400 meters with a time of 
1:01.66.
 Placing in the top six 
to earn points for Salado 
were these:
 Quick, fourth, 200 
Meters, 26.56; Macy 
Thrasher, fourth, 300 
Meter Hurdles, 49.38; Ki-
erstan Osborn, fifth, 800 
Meters, 2:38.54; Vaillan-
Court, sixth, Long Jump, 
15:04.50; Brianna Wash-
ington, sixth, 400 Meters, 
1:04.30 and Mikaela Hein-
er, sixth, 100 Meter Hur-
dles, 17.33. 
 The 4X400 relay team 
of Hayslip, Dean, Danielle 
McDaniel and Osborn, 
placed fourth with a time 
of 4:14.06.
VarsITy boys
 Four Salado boys run-
ners and two relay teams 
advanced out of the Dis-
trict 25-4A track meet, 
held in Burnet April 12-13.
 Burnet won the meet 
with 179 points and Lla-
no was second with 121 
points. Salado was last 
with 45 points.
 The following Salado 
boys tracksters will com-
pete at the Area meet this 
week:
 Preston Kimbrough 
was third place in the 
3200 Meter with a time of 
10:32.59.

 Coby Chambliss was 
fourth in the 300 Meter 
Hurdles with a time of 
43.85.
 Holden Ford was third 
in the 110 Meter Hurdles 
with a time of 15.83. Just 
behind him was Cutter 
Hudgens with a time of 
15.85 for fourth.
 The 4 X 100 Meter Re-
lay team of Jake Harvey, 
Jake Elliott, Hudgens and 
Ford was fourth with a 
time of 44.01.
 The 4 X 200 meter Re-
lay team of Harvey, El-
liott, Justin Learn and Ty-
ler Stairs was fourth with a 
time of 1:34.70.
 Placing in the top six 
to score points for the Ea-
gles were Wade Woods, 
sixth, 800 Meters, 2:09; 
Kimbrough, fifth, 1600 
Meters, 4:46.0; Chambliss, 
sixth, 300 Meter Hurdles, 
45.07; Tyler Armstrong, 
sixth, discus, 126-10 and 
Stairs, sixth, Triple Jump, 
38-11.50.
 The 4 X 400 Meter Re-
lay team of Stairs, Wade 
Woods, Chambliss and 
Justin Learn placed fifth 
with a time of 3:41.21.
JV boys
 Salado JV Boys Track 
team competed in the Dis-
trict Meet in Burnet April 
13.
 Hunter Haas placed 
sixth in the 400 Meter with 
a time of 57.49.

 Jim Reeder placed 
sixth in the 800 Meters 
with a time of 2:27.
 Bradley Poteet placed 
fifth in the 110 Meter Hur-
dles with a time of 18.10.
 Poteet placed third in 
the 300 Meter Hurdles 
with a time of 46.27.
 400 Meter Relay team 
of Bradley Poteet, Willie 
Whigham, Kirk Pruitt and 
Hunter Haas placed fifth 
with a time of 48.37.
 800 Meter Relay team 
of Caleb Chambliss, Chan-
dler Willhem, Kirk Pruitt 
and Jake Walrath placed 
fifth with a time of 1:43.25.
 1600 Meter Relay team 
of Jim Reeder, Zack Gar-
mong, Jake Walrath and 
Hunter Haas placed sixth 
with a time of 3:55.78.
 Zach Adams placed 
first in the Shot Put with a 
distance of 38-04.
 Adams placed fifth in 
the Discus with a throw of 
102-08.
JV gIrls
 Jordan Stockton placed 
fourth in the 100 Meter 
Dash with a time of 14.11. 
 Stockton placed first in 
the 200 Meter Dash with a 
time of 28.54.
 Ellie Phelps placed 
fourth in the 800 Meter 
Run with a time of 2:51.59.
Erin McBride placed fifth 
with a time of 2:53.35.
 Phelps placed fourth in 
the 1600 Meter Run with a 

Tracksters qualify for area

time of 6:33.75. McBride 
placed sixth with a time of 
6:35.33.
 

Salado varsity 
girls Area quali-
fiers are shown 
at right: (front 
row, from left: 
Kierstan Osborn, 
Sugar Hill, Regi-
na Deen, Macy 
Thrasher, Sarah 
Kate Kelarek; 
(back row, from 
left) Brianna 
Washington, Ka-
tie Robinson, Ma-
riah VaillanCourt, 
Abigail Quick. 
(not pictured Brit-
tany Vrooman)
Salado High 
School varsity 
Boys Area Qual-
ifiers are shown 
at right: (front 
row, from left) Bo 
Whitson, Coby 
Chambliss, Jake 
Elliott, Cutter 
Hudgens; (back 
row, from left) 
Wade Woods, Ty-
ler Stairs, Holden 
Ford. Not shown 
is Preston Kim-
brough.

(Photos by royce Wiggin)
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Come learn & grow with us 

947-1153
6 weeks to 12 years

Christian Environment
TSR Certified Preschool

Age appropriate Curriculum
All ages Drop off & Pick up@Salado ISD

The

 Play Yard

Two Salado Locations

15299 S IH 35 | Thomas Arnold Road

Preschool Infant Center

Please call for an appointment (254) 947-3309
1325 N. Stagecoach Road

Your time is valuable! Save a trip and time. 

Al Clawson Disposal, Inc. 
(512) 930-5490    •    www.ClawsonDisposal.com

ASK US ABOUT OUR SERVICES
Waste Pickup    •    Recycling    •    Roll-Off Containers

727 S. Main Street, Belton

Sh el l e ysau tosal es . n et

T e x a s  F r i e n d lY
E a g l e  P r o u d

Tues - Fri  8 a.m. - 6 p.m.
Walk-Ins Accepted    Appointments Honored

The Haire Shop
Barber - Beauty - Body

213 Mill Creek Dr., Suite 160

Tammy  (254) 760-1990

Ace
Pest and Lawn

Locally Owned and Operated 
Licensed by the Structural Pest Control Board TPCL #12512

Customer 
Satisfaction 
Guaranteed

Free Estimates 947-4222

860 N. Main 
254-947-5050

c21bb.com

Good Luck from your ‘Home’ Team

SALADO Member 
FDICGo !  Eagles  Go!

PHYSICAL THERAPY • SPEECH THERAPY • PELVIC HEALTH 
OCCUPATIONAL THERAPY  •  IN-HOME SKILLED NURSING 

Multiple Locations  |  www.IntegrityRehab.net  | 254.699.3933    

WT

C
om

puter Services

Walt’s PC Repair
    & Gaming Zone

walt@walttollefson.com

Walt Tollefson, 
Owner     

Mark Peterson, 
Manager

Let us sell your 
stuff on

(254) 291-6354

SALADO PLAZA suite #135a
Mon - Fri 9 - 5 | Sat noon - 3

 Salado varsity boys golf 
team compete in the State 
Meet April 25-26  after 
qualifying as the third 
place team at the Region-
al  Meet April 11-12 at the 
Lozano Golf Course in 
Corpus Christi.
 The girls placed fourth 

Salado varsity Eagle golfers are returning to State. Shown above, from left 
are Coach Scott Ringo, Caleb Scwertner, Bryan Lightfoot, Josh Peschel, Aaron 
Torczynski, Trey Schaub.

in the Region IV Tour-
nament at the Oso Golf 
Course in Corpus Christi, 
missing a trip to the State 
Meet by 10 strokes.
 Aaron Torczynski led 
the Salado Eagles, shoot-
ing a 79 in the first round 
and a 75 in the second 
round for a 154 total.
 Josh Peschel followed 
with rounds of 80 and 75 
for a 155 total.
 Caleb Schwertner  shot 
a two-round total of 165 
with rounds of 84 and 81.
 Bryan Lightfoot 
matched Schwertner with 
rounds of 84 and 81 to give 
Salado its team scoring of 
639.
 Trey Schaub also shot 
for the Eagles and had 
a two-day total of 172, 
shooting 88 and 84.
 Kristin Crouch led the 
Lady Eagles with a two-
day total of 175 on rounds 
of 84 and 91.
 Molly Rodeffer fol-
lowed with a total of 179 
on rounds of 89 and 90.
 Jamie Rich shot an 86 
and 98 for a two-day total 
of 184.
 Avery Hyer had rounds 
of 91 and 105 for a two-
day total of 197 to bring 
the girls’ total team score 
to 728.
 Addie Ashe shot 197 on 
rounds of 98 and 99.

 Five Salado FFA teams 
have advanced to State 
competition after com-
peting at district and area 
contests recently. 
 Those teams advancing 
include these that compet-
ed at Stephenville:
 Nursery/Landscape: 
first in District and first in 
Area, advancing to State 
at Sam Houston State 
University. Ty Sebesta, 
first place individual, Lin-
dy Martin, third, Kylee 
Hubbs, fourth.
 Wool: second in district 
and Area, advancing to 
State at Texas Tech. Scout 
Pucket, first, Bailee Bar-
rett, ninth.
   Farm Business Man-
agement: first in District, 
second in Area, advancing 
to State at SHSU. Clayton 
Kunz, sixth, Courtney Ev-
ans, eighth, Chase Kunz, 
ninth, Connor Hill, 11th.
 Milk Quality Prod-
ucts, first in District, fifth 
in Area and advancing 
to State meet at Tarleton 
State University. John 
Dawson, eighth.
 Meats: second in Dis-
trict, fifth in Area advanc-
ing to State.
 Also competing in dis-
trict and area were these: 
Ag mechanics: second dis-

Meats, second in District, fifth in Area. From left. 
Owen Dabney, Sydney Hill, Seth Hill, Trey Schaub,

trict, 10th area,  Jeremiah 
Combs, 10th, Lane Renfro 
and Belton Farr
  Dairy cattle: third dis-
trict, Chase Alexander, 
Tyler Oglesby and Melissa 
McCulloch
  Vet tech: fourth in dis-
trict, Chase Harwell, Kylar 
Combs and Ansley Flow-
ers.
  Entomology: fourth in 
district, Owen Dabney, 
Kayla Hudgens and Chloe 
Schwertner
  Livestock: Kaydee 
Free, Avery Hyer and Mat-
thew Maldonado.

Nursery/Landscape: first in District and first in Area.
From left, Paige Aydell, Lindy Martin, third, Ty Sebes-
ta, first, Kylee Hubbs, fourth and Kayla Hudgens.

Wool: second in District, second in Area. From left, 
Aspen Robert, Chloe Schwertner, Scout Puckett, first, 
Baillee Barrett, ninth, Kinzi Pardon, Tyler Coufal.

Farm Business Management: first in District, second 
in Area. From left: Chase Kunz, ninth, Clayton Kunz, 
sixth, Courtney Evans, eighth, Connor Hill, 11th.

Milk Quality Products: first in District, fifth in Area. 
From left, Tris Sebesta, John Dawson, eighth, and 
Ashley Ruiz. 

Five SHS FFA teams advance to State

SHS boys golf team
earns state bid
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209 South Main Street
at the creek 947-1000

Swanky fashions for little ones
Breakfast

Served daily 7 - 11 a.m.
Daily Specials

BBQ

Chicken Fried Steak

Mesquite Grilled Steak

Burgers

301 Thomas Arnold Rd.
254-947-GOOD

38 Dealers

Dee’s Antique Mall

NOW OPEN

(254) 947-3775 702 N Main Street 
FURNITURE

GLASSWARE     KEEPSAKES
SUN Noon - 5 | MON 10 - 5

CLOSED TUES & WED
THURS - FRI 10 - 5 | SAT 10 - 6 

THERANGERESTAURANT.COM

a fresh 
TAKE ON LUNCH

FRIDAYS        SATURDAYS

11:30 a.m.- 2:30 p.m.

at the range
101 MAIN salado

 254.947.3828

G

''

602 Center Circle       (254) 947-5554

Alexander’s Distillery

Made from Scratch entrees
great atmosphere & specialty drinks

Tex-Mex Tuesday

Springhouse
120 Royal Street              

Mon-Sat  10:30 - 5     

(254)947-0747

Cowboys Bar-B-Q
Exit 285 • 1300 Robertson RD

Catering, Take Out or Dine In

254-947-5700  Miguel Perez, owner

Slow Cooking Fast Service  “I’d rather be an old 
fencepost in Texas than the 
king of Tennessee,” Aaron 
Watson sings on “Fence-
post,” echoing the words 
of one of his favorite fel-
low Texans, Sam Houston. 
 Watson will be bring-
ing the song Fencepost, 
and many others, to the 
outdoor stage at Johnny’s 
Outback on April 23. 
Tickets are available at 
the the door for $20 per 
person. The gates open 
at 6 p.m. Advance tickets 
can be purchase online for 
$15 at http://www.johnnys 
outback.com/upcoming 
shows.php.
 Fencepost is a song 
about a rising Texas coun-
try songwriter who gets 
the door slammed in his 
face by big-time Nash-
ville record executives 
who underestimate him. 
Instead of giving up on his 
dreams, though, he rolls 
up his sleeves, proves them 
all wrong through sheer 
determination, and soon 
finds them knocking on 
his own door. If it sounds 
familiar, that’s because, as 
Watson sings, it’s “a true 
story,” and the reason he’s 
titled his 12th record ‘The 
Underdog.’
 “I’ve always liked the 
idea of the underdog,” 
says Watson. “I’ve always 
liked the idea that the guy 
who’s not supposed to 
win could still beat all the 
odds through hard work 
and perseverance. A lot of 
people are always telling 
us that what we’re achiev-
ing in the music business 
is just next to impossible. I 
don’t really consider it that 
way. We’re just out there 
working hard.”
 Working hard is a se-
rious understatement for 
Watson, who performs 
hundreds of shows every 
year, has collaborated 
with special guests like 
Willie Nelson, Dale Wat-
son, Jack Ingram, and Bill 
Joe Shaver, cracked the 
Top 10 on the Billboard 
200, and sold hundreds of 
thousands of tickets, all 
as a totally independent 
artist with his own label. 
The lead single from ‘The 

Underdog, “That Look,” 
which Watson wrote for 
his wife Kimberly, turned 
heads by debuting in the 
Top 10 of the Billboard 
Country Digital Songs 
Chart and closing out the 
year as one of the most 
successful-selling inde-
pendent singles of 2014.
 “If your dreams aren’t 
handed to you on a sliver 
platter, that’s ok,” says 
Watson. “You go out there 
and you chase them. You 
may have to work hard for 
them, but don’t let anyone 
discourage you.”
 ‘The Underdog,’ then, 
is more than just an album 
title for Watson. It’s a mis-
sion statement.
 “The idea of the un-
derdog really describes 
where I’m at right now in 
my career and what we’re 
trying to achieve with 
this record,” he explains. 
“I’m not one of these guys 
that can put on a pair of 
skinny jeans or turn my 
hat around backwards 
and sing those pop coun-
try radio songs. Nothing 
against the guys who do 
that because it’s their thing 
and true to who they are, 
but if I played that role, it 
wouldn’t be me. When I’m 
singing these songs hun-
dreds of times a year, they 
need to be things I person-
ally believe in.”

 For Watson, there are 
three things he believes 
in above all else: family, 
faith, and fans.
 “There is no Aaron 
Watson without those 
three things,” he says. “My 
faith is what guides me. It 
keeps me focused on my 
music. God has blessed 
me with an amazing wife 
and beautiful kids, and at 
the end of the day, success 
to me is working hard and 
making a living for my 
family. That’s all any dad 
wants. My fans like the 
fact that I’m really a nor-
mal guy,” he continues. 
“If I can’t get on stage and 
talk to my fans about my 
faith and my family, I’ve 
got nothing.”
 It’s little surprise, then, 
that the album opens with 
“The Prayer,” a song in-
spired by a copy of Johnny 
Cash’s book ‘The Man 
In White,’ which Watson 
found in the Faith section 
of a used bookstore on 
tour.
 “I started reading this 
book on the bus, and be-
fore you get started with 
the story, Johnny just talks 
about his struggles with 
different addictions and 
how his faith saved his 
life,” says Watson. “He 
talks about how he tried to 
kill himself and that was 
the turning point where he 

knew Jesus wasn’t through 
with his life. When we 
think of Johnny Cash, 
he’s The Man in Black, 
he stands tall, and he’s a 
very intimidating figure. 
He was ‘Folsom Prison 
Blues,’ ‘Ring of Fire’ 
Johnny Cash! And he was 
going into a cave to kill 
himself! I tried to put my-
self in that cave with this 
song.”
 Rather than dwell on 
the darkness of that mo-
ment though, “The Prayer” 
is a song about finding the 
light and letting it shine 
through. The same goes 
for “Bluebonnets,” a song 
written in memory of Wat-
son’s late daughter Julia 
Grace, who passed away 
shortly after birth of Tri-
somy 18 and was laid to 
rest on a beautiful hillside 
overlooking where the 
Texas state flower blos-
soms for a brief, gorgeous 
window every spring.
 “Like bluebonnets in 
the spring we’re only here 
for a little while,” he sings. 
“It’s beautiful and bitter-
sweet so make the most of 
every mile.”
 Like the great country 
songwriters who inspired 
him—Hank, Waylon, Wil-
lie—Watson has a lighter 
side, too. “Blame It On 
Those Baby Blues” is a 
sweet love song, “Freight 
Train” is a rollicking 
road anthem, and “One 
Of Your Nights” is what 
Watson describes as one 
of his “lovemaking songs.” 
Meanwhile, “That’s Why 
God Loves Cowboys” and 
“That’s Gonna Leave A 
Mark” are pure country 
through and through.
 The disparate sounds 
and feelings on the record 
are all masterfully tied to-
gether through the produc-
tion work of Keith Stegall 
(Alan Jackson, George 
Jones, Zac Brown Band).
 “I needed someone who 
was going to push me to 
better myself melodically 
and lyrically,” says Wat-
son. “Keith understood 
all that and he really dove 
in and found a way to get 
the best out of me. I was 
able to get right in there 
with this legendary pro-
ducer and work alongside 
him and soak up every 
moment, and I’m forever 
grateful.”
 Working with such an 
acclaimed producer as a 
completely independent 
artist was a real coup for 
Watson, and just one more 
reason he painted his face 
up like a rodeo clown on 
the album cover.
 “The rodeo clown is a 
huge underdog,” explains 
Watson, who sings from 
the perspective of one on 
“Rodeo Queen.” “He’s up 
against a huge bull try-
ing to protect these rid-
ers, putting his life on the 
line. Talk about an unsung 
hero.”
 It’s an appropriate 
metaphor for a man who’s 
defied the odds and con-
ventional wisdom, chasing 
down his dream through 
hard work and determina-
tion even when the door 
was slammed in his face. 
“When you fear when you 
fail when you feel you’re 
gonna fall,” he sings on the 
title track, “follow your 
heart and always believe 
in the underdog.” 
 oFFIcIal bIo aNd phoTo From 
aaroN WaTsoN WebsITe. 

Aaron Watson: ‘I’d rather be a fencepost
in Texas than the King of Tennessee’

Aaron Watson will perform at Johnny’s Outback on 
April 23. 
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Village of Salado Calendar of Events
aprIl 21
 Support Salado 
Schools at Freddy’s 
in Harker Heights, 5 
- 8 p.m. Freddy’s will 
donate a percent of your 
purchase to the Salado 
Robotics Club
aprIl 21
 Bell County Dinner 
Tonight! Healthy Cook-
ing School, 6 - 8 p.m. at 
the Bell County Expo. 
register at agriliferegis-
ter.tamu.edu/DinnerTo-
night
aprIl 22 – 24 aNd 
aprIl 29 – may 1
 Temple Belton Area 
Builders Association Pa-
rade of Homes. Homes 
located in Temple, Bel-
ton and Salado. Friday 
6 - 8 p.m., Sat. and Sun. 
noon  - 5 p.m. Tickets: 
$5 info: www.tahb.org
aprIl 22 - 24
 2016 Hog Champion-
ship at Solana Ranch. 
info: solanaranch.com or 
(254) 947-8331.
aprIl 23
 Earth Day Celebra-
tion, 10 a.m. - 4 p.m. at 
Pace Park. info: keepsal-
adobeautiful.com

aprIl 23
 Bluebonnet Pop-Up 
Book Class, 10:30 a.m. at 
Stamp Salado. $35 info: 
(254) 947-8848
aprIl 23
 Paint the Ranch Red 
Gala, 6 p.m. at Tenroc 
Ranch.  Tickets and info: 
bellcountyheartball.
heart.org
aprIl 23
 Aaron Watson, 7 p.m. 
at Johnny’s Outback 
info: johnnysoutback.
com
aprIl 25 aNd 26
 Salado ISD Pre K and 
Kindergarten Roundup, 
8:30 a.m. - 2:30 p.m. at 
Thomas Arnold El-
ementary Media Room. 
Pre K 3 and 4 year old, 
Kindergarten 5 year old 
as of Sept. 1, 2016 info: 
saladoisd.com
aprIl 25
 Salado Public Library 
Board of Trustee meet-
ing, 5 p.m. at the library 
info: saladolibrary.org
aprIl 25
 Salado FFA and Jr. 
FFA Banquet, 6 p.m. 
at Salado High School 
Cafeteria.

aprIl 26
 Building Smiles An-
nual Banquet to benefit 
The Body of Christ Com-
munity Clinic info: (254) 
939-9500
aprIl 28
 Small Acreage - New 
Landowner Program 
Series, 5:30 p.m. at the 
Special Events Room of 
the Bell County Expo. 
AgriLife Extension ser-
vice will present topics of 
interest. $20 per person.
aprIl 14
 Crop Night, 5 - 9 p.m. 
at Stamp Salado,  $5 res-
ervation required: (254) 
947-8848
aprIl 28
 Support Salado 
Schools at Freddy’s in 
Harker Heights, 5 - 8 
p.m. Freddy’s will donate 
a percent of your pur-
chase to Salado Junior 
High Soccer

aprIl 28
 Coffee with the Direc-
tor, 10 a.m. at Salado 
Public Library. info: 
saladolibrary.org
aprIl 29 - may 1
 Ultra520K Texas 
training camp and clinic. 
info: ultra520ktexas.com
aprIl 30
 We’re on a Roll!!! 
Class, 10:30 a.m. at 
Stamp Salado. $26 info: 
(254) 947-8848
aprIl 30
 Tea Cup Treasure 
Class, 1:30 p.m. at 
Stamp Salado. $30 info: 
(254) 947-8848
aprIl 30
 Bell County Star 
Party, 8 - 11 p.m. at 
Overlook Park, Stillhouse 
Hollow Lake on FM1670. 
Central Texas Astronomi-
cal Society. info: centex-
astronomy.org.
aprIl 30
 Open House at Salado 
Village Artists, 10 a.m. 
- 2 p.m. info: saladovil-
lageartists.com
may 2
 Salado ISD Student 
Health and Safety Night, 
6 - 7:30 p.m. at Salado 
Intermediate School. 
All parents and students 
grade 6 to 12 welcome 
to attend. Childcare 
provided for younger 
children. 
may 6 - 7
 Tablerock Gospel Fes-
tival, Friday 6 - 9 p.m. , 
Saturday 10 a.m. - 9 p.m. 
info: (254) 947-9205
may 6 - 8
 Mother’s Day Get 
Away Weekend. info: 
salado.com

may 12
 Salado: Jewel in the 
Crown of Texas adver-
tising deadline. Edition 
on stands July thru Sep-
tember. info: (254)947-
5321 
may 14 - 15 
 Salado Market Days, 
9 a.m.-5 p.m. at Salado 
Antique Mall, 721 Stage-
coach Road, behind 
Dee’s Antiques on Main. 
info: (254) 947-3355
may 14
 Cody Canada and 
the Departed, 7 p.m. at 
Johnny’s Outback info: 
johnnysoutback.com
may 17
 Salado High School 
Athletic Banquet, 6 p.m. 
at Salado High School
may 23 - 26
 Softball Camp, 3:45 - 
5:30 p.m. at SHS softball 
field. Grades 1 - 9, $50 
info: 947-6900 x1202
may 24
 Salado ISD Band 
Concert at Tablerock
may 28
 Academic UIL Recep-
tion, 5 p.m.
may 28
 Bell County Star 
Party, 8 - 10 p.m. at 
Overlook Park, Stillhouse 
Hollow Lake on FM1670. 
Central Texas Astronomi-
cal Society. info: centex-
astronomy.org.
may 31
 Salado High School 
Art Show, 5 - 6 p.m. 
at Salado High School 
Cafeteria
may 31
 Senior Awards Night, 
6 p.m. at Salado High 
School
JuNe 3 & 4
 Shakespeare On The 
Rock at Tablerock. Kelly 
Parker directs The Com-
edy of Errors info: (254) 
947-9205
JuNe 4
 Salado ISD Class of 
2016 Graduation, 10 
a.m. at Mayborn Center 
- UMHB
JuNe 6 - July 14
 Eagle Performance 
Camp, 7:30 - 8:45 a.m. 
at SHS weight room. 
grades 9 - 12, $75 info: 
947-6900 x1072

JuNe 6 - July 14
 Lady Eagle Perfor-
mance Camp, 9 - 10:30 
a.m. at SHS weight 
room. grades 7 - 12, $75 
info: 947-6900 x1118
JuNe 6 - July 14
 Junior High Boys 
Eagle Performance 
Camp, 10:30 - 11:30 a.m. 
at SHS weight room. 
grades 7 - 8, $75 info: 
947-6900 x1072
JuNe 7 - 10
 Soccer Camps at Soc-
cer practice field. Grades 
7 - 9: 8 - 9:30 a.m., grades 
10 - 11:30 a.m. $50 info: 
947-6900 x1072
JuNe 7 - 10
 Volleyball Camps at 
SHS gym. Grades 4 - 6: 
8 - 9:30 a.m., grades 7 - 9: 
10 - 11:30 a.m. $50 info: 
947-6900 x1118
JuNe 10
 The Public Arts League 
of Salado free concert, 6 
p.m. at Pace Park. Kupira 
Marimba will bring their 
high-energy traditional 
African marimba music to 
the park for an evening of 
family oriented fun. 
JuNe 11
 Annual Salado Re-
union, 9:30 a.m. - 3:30 
p.m. at Salado Interme-
diate School. Catered 
lunch will be served, 
register for lunch at 
(254) 760-0663 or (254) 
721-3095
JuNe 11 - 12 
 Salado Market Days, 
9 a.m.-5 p.m. at Salado 
Antique Mall, 721 Stage-
coach Road, behind 
Dee’s Antiques on Main. 
info: (254) 947-3355
JuNe 13 - 16
 Baseball Camp, 9 a.m. 
- noon, SHS baseball 
field. Grades 3 - 9, $50 
info: 947-6900 x1123
JuNe 13 - 17
 First Baptist Church 
of Salado Vacation Bible 
School, 9 a.m. - noon. 
info: 947-5465
JuNe 16
 Chisholm Trail 
Chapter of American 
Business Women Annual 
Style Show and Benefit 
Luncheon, 11 a.m. at the 
Venue. info: Barclaymc-
cort@gmail.com or 947-
3617.
JuNe 18
 Dog Daze of Summer, 
info: salado.com
JuNe 20 - 21
 SSAA Imagineer Ar-
ray of Arts Camp. Info: 
intothewildblue.co
JuNe 20 - 23
 Girls Basketball 
Camp, SHS gym. Grades 
1 - 5: 1-3 p.m., grades 6 - 
9: 3:30 - 5:30 p.m. price: 
$50 info: 947-6900x1075
JuNe 25
 Bell County Star 
Party, 8:30 - 11:30 p.m. at 
Overlook Park, Stillhouse 
Hollow Lake on FM1670. 
Central Texas Astronomi-
cal Society. info: centex-
astronomy.org.

OLD FASHIONED BURGERS
                    and ICE-CREAM

882 North Main Street

 facebook.com/burgersICEcream

plus.google.com/+OldFashionedBurgersandicecreamSalado

(254) 947-5271

$1 off any burger or 
sandwich combo 

with this ad

TRY OUR NEW MENU

rain
Chiropractic 
& Wellness

Allyn Crain, DC
Wellness Consultant & Chiropractor

947-2225

Keeping Salado Healthy

Joining our team: 
Massage Therapists

418 N Main St #5 
next to Salado Creek Winery

Your home for 
chiropractic care, 
massage therapy, 

acupuncture 
and holistic care

Jennifer Hulme and Sandy Hankins

Keep Salado Beautiful will host an Earth Day Celebration in Pace Park on April 23. Speakers will present a 
variety of topics, including Heirloom Chickens. 

Salado Fitness   254.338.9564
Heather Foster - Sparks, LMT

Deep Tissue | Relaxation | Sports Massage

8 a.m. - 8 p.m. DAILY
same day appointments available

605 Thomas Arnold Road

Massage Therapy

$50 Senior Pass 
for Unlimited 
Chair Yoga

Tues & Thurs noon - 1 p.m.

Full schedule saladoyoga.com
560 North Main #8  |  (254) 791-9440 Like us on FaceBook

MUD PIES 
POTTERY

HAND THROWN POTTERY 
ONE PIECE AT A TIME 

Handmade 
Pottery,

Homemade 
Fudge 

OVER 50 FLAVORS
including Sucrose free 

Gluten Free

Closed Mondays

18 N. Main Salado 

947-0281 

Shop at Salado’s Boutique Marketplace
Women’s Apparel, Shoes ~ Flip Flops to Boots,

Jewelry, Baby Gifts & Apparel, Gourmet Food,

 Home Decor & Furniture, Home Fragrance, 

Junk Gypsy™ Paint,  Gifts & More

22 North Main Street

Timeless
Upscale Consignment

#3 North Main
Corner of Main and Pace Park Road

Women’s Clothing, Jewelry, Local Art and Home Décor
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Tues - saT
 Central Texas Area 
Museum open, 10 am. - 4 
p.m., Free admission
moNdays
 Yoga for Women’s 
Health, 9 a.m. at The 
Yoga Room  Info: (254) 
681-7623.
 Children’s Story and 
Craft Time, 11 a.m. at 
Salado Public Library. 
info: (254) 947-9191
 Salado Village Artists 
Stitchers & Knitters, 
2 p.m. at Salado Village 
Artists Building.
 Yoga Basics & Be-
yond, 6 p.m. at The Yoga 
Room. Info: (254) 681-
7623.
 IN.FORM course, 
5:30 p.m. at Angelic 
Herbs. Info: (2540 947-
1909
 Salado Masonic 
Lodge, Floor practice is  
6:30 p.m. at the Lodge ev-
ery Monday except Stated 
Meeting. Stated meeting 
is 7:30 p.m. Monday on or 
before Full Moon.
FIrsT moNday
 Salado First Monday 
Gardeners, 8 a.m. at the 
Visitor Center.
 Salado Historical 
Society board meeting, 
6 p.m. at Salado Public 
Library. 
secoNd moNday
 Second Monday Book 
Club at Salado Winery, 7 - 
9 p.m.
 Public Arts League of 
Salado open board meet-
ing, 5 p.m. at the Visitor’s 
Center on Main Street.
 Salado FFA Meeting, 
6 p.m. at Salado High 
School AG building Sept. 
- May.
 Salado Youth Fair 
Booster Club meeting, 
after the FFA meeting at 
Salado High School AG 
building. Info: SYFB-
Club@gmail.com
 Salado Athletic 
Boosters Club meeting, 
7 p.m. at the High School 
Library. Info: saladoathlet-
icbooster.org.
ThIrd moNday
 Salado ISD Board of 
Trustees meeting, 6 p.m. 
at the Salado Civic Center.
Tuesdays
 YogaStrong, 9-10 a.m. 
at The Yoga Room. Info: 
(254) 681-7623.
 Salado Village Art-
ists, Village Art Building, 
9 a.m., Bring your artwork 
fourth Tuesday will be 
set up for still life. 
 Adult game day at 
Presbyterian Church of 
Salado, 10 a.m.
 Sit & Knit, 10 a.m 
- noon at Salado Public Li-
brary. info: (254) 947-9191
 Salado Rotary Club, 
11:30 a.m. at Johnny’s 
Steaks & Barbecue first 
three Tuesdays of month; 
Roving Social after hours  
on fourth Tuesday of 
month.
 Chair Yoga, noon - 1 
p.m. at The Yoga Room  
Info: (254) 681-7623.
 Tex Mex Tuesday at 
Alexander’s Distillery 
(254) 947-5554
 Prix Fixe at The 
Range, 5 p.m.- close. 
$14.95 for entree, dessert, 
drink.

 Salado Community 
Chorus practice, 6 p.m., 
Salado Civic Center, un-
less otherwise noted. info: 
254-947-1833
FIrsT Tuesday
 Salado Village Artists 
Board Meeting, 9 a.m. 
at the Village Art Build-
ing. Followed by General 
Meeting at 10:30 a.m.
 Salado 4-H Club 
meeting, 6 p.m. at Salado 
Intermediate Cafeteria, 
Sept. - May.
ThIrd Tuesday
 Bell County Genea-
logical Society Meeting, 
6:30 p.m. at Temple Public 
Library.
WedNesdays
 Yoga for Core, 8 - 
8:50 a.m. at The Yoga 
Room. Info: (254) 681-
7623.
 Power Flow Yoga 
level 1&2, 6:10-7:10 p.m. 
at The Yoga Room. Info: 
(254) 681-7623.
 Belly Dance Class, 
7:30 - 8:30 p.m. at The 
Yoga Room. Info: (254) 
681-7623.
 Wine Wednesday at 
Alexander’s Distillery 
(254) 947-5554
 Wine Down Wednes-
day at The Range. Half 
price glasses of wine, 
staff’s choice.
FIrsT WedNesday
 Adult craft group 
meets at Salado Public 
Library, 2 - 4 p.m.
secoNd WedNesday
 Salado Lions Club, 
11:30 a.m., Salado Civic 
Center.
ThIrd WedNesday
 Mah Jongg at Salado 
Public Library, 10 a.m.-2 
p.m. 
FourTh WedNesday
 Salado Lions Club, 
11:30 a.m., Salado Civic 
Center.
Thursdays
 Yoga for Healing, 9 
a.m. at The Yoga Room  
Info: (254) 681-7623.
 Chair Yoga, noon - 1 
p.m. at The Yoga Room  
Info: (254) 681-7623.
 Hatha Flow levels 
1&2, 6:15 - 7:15 p.m. at 
The Yoga Room  Info: 
(254) 681-7623.

Regular Events in Village of Salado

 Martinis and Mani-
cures at The Lounge at 
The Range, 5 p.m.-close. 
$25 for 2 ladies night 
adult beverages, a mani-
cure and a selection of ap-
petizers, space is limited. 
appointments: 254-947-
3828.
 Salado Aldermen 
meeting, 6:30 p.m., Mu-
nicipal building, 301 N. 
Stagecoach Rd. Meeting 
is open to the public. First 
and third Thursday are 
regular meetings and sec-
ond and fourth Thursday 
are workshop meetings.
FIrsT Thursday
 Chisholm Trail 
American Business 
Woman’s Association 
meeting, 6 p.m. at First 
Presbyterian Church of 
Salado.
secoNd Thursday
 Salado Ladies Aux-
iliary Meeting, 9:30 
a.m. at the Salado United 
Methodist Church Youth 
Activities Center.
 Crop Night, 5 - 9 p.m. 
at Stamp Salado,  $5 res-
ervation required: (254) 
947-8848
ThIrd Thursday
 Salado Chamber 
of Commerce Board 
Meeting, 8:30 a.m. at the 
Visitors Center.
 Yoga on the Lively 
Courtyard, 9 - 9:45 a.m., 
info: 791-9440 
 Third Thursday 
Music Club, 5 - 8 p.m. at 
JD’s Travel Center. Old 
time music, acoustic only. 
Everyone welcome to 
come play or listen.
FourTh Thursday
 Crop Night, 5 - 9 p.m. 
at Stamp Salado,  $5 res-
ervation required: (254) 
947-8848
FrIdays
 Pop in for a pastry, 
8:15 - 9:30 a.m. at First 
Community Title. 
 Friday Night Special 
at Mill Creek Country 
Club Bar and Grill. Menu 
changes every week. Call 
947-5698.
FourTh FrIday
 Fourth Friday Gospel 
Singing, 7 p.m. at First 
Cedar Valley Baptist 
Church on FM 2843. Pot 

Salado ISD will hold a Pre K and Kindergarten Roundup April 25 and 26 in the Thomas Arnold Elementary 
Media Room. Pre K 3 and 4 year old, Kindergarten 5 year old as of Sept. 1.

LIVELY
• COFFEEHOUSE & BISTRO •

EST. 2015

21 North Main Street        Salado Square       (254) 947-3688

GET LIVELY WED - SAT 9 - 4 
SUN 10 - 4 | MON 9 - 4 closed Tues

Coffee | Espresso
Breakfast | Lunch

Bagel | Croissant | Pastry
Toast Selections

Salad | Soup | Sandwich

luck to follow, bring a 
favorite dish or dessert.
saTurdays
 Hatha Flow Levels 1 
& 2, 8:30-9:30 a.m. at The 
Yoga Room. Info: (254) 
681-7623
 Studio Time for 
Salado Village Artists 
members, 10 a.m. info: 
saladovillageartists.com
 Restorative yoga and 
Meditation, 3 - 4 p.m. 
The Yoga Room. Info: 
(254) 681-7623.
 Live music in The 
Lounge, upstairs at The 
Range Restaurant on 
Main St., 7 p.m. Artists 
change weekly. Check 
website for details. 
FIrsT & ThIrd saTurday
 Trudy’s Closet, 8 a.m. 
at Grace Baptist Church

SALADO CLEANERS
Laundry • Dry Cleaning • Alterations

1209 N. Stagecoach
(Next to the Library)

254-947-7299

Wash & Fold
7 a.m. - 7 p.m. Mon - Fri • 7 a.m. - 3 p.m. Sat

 1109 W. Village Rd, Salado (behind Sonic)                            

Monday thru Saturday         10 a.m. to 9 p.m.

Liquor Store

(254) 947-7117

A Refreshing Splash of Flavor
We carry a fine selection of infused and flavored spirits

suNdays
 Open discussion Al-
Anon Meeting, 6 p.m. 
Salado United Methodist 
Church Youth Activities 
Center.
 Hatha Therapy, 3 - 4 
p.m. at The Yoga Room. 
Info: (254) 681-7623
secoNd WeekeNds
 Salado Market Days, 
9 a.m.-5 p.m. at Salado 
Antique Mall, 721 Stage-
coach Road. Salado’s 
original Market Days 
event. info: (254) 947-
3355.

Submit your calendar
 listing online at 

saladovillagevoice.com

THURS - SAT 10 - 5 SUN 12 - 5 MON 10 - 5
CLOSED TUES & WED       947-3355

751 Stagecoach Road  I-35 frontage road North

Clean Restrooms

SALADO ANTIQUE MALL
and Bee’s Antiques

Thousands of Antiques, Collectibles and Primitives

 in a unique and inviting atmosphere

The Original Salado Market Days
9-5 on the 2nd weekend - Don’t miss May 14 - 15

Open Daily 
(254) 947-1909

 560 N. Main, Suite 10  

Join us for improved wellness 
IN.FORM course 

Mondays at 5:30 p.m. 

Print & Online magazine at SaladoVillageVoice.com

Interactive Digital Quarterly publication promoting Salado:  
History    |    Community    |    Commerce

Deadline for advertising in the 3rd Quarter magazine is 

May 12
RESERVE YOUR SPACE TODAY for July, August & Sept

Second Quarter 2016

Published by Salado Village Voice

saladovillagevoice.com

SALADO 
A JEWEL  IN THE CROWN OF TEXAS

Get your hands on 

the arts in Salado

Page 6

Salado: A Jewel in the Crown of Texas 

advertising@SaladoVillageVoice.com

saladovillagevoice @saladovoice
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1.  Animal Medical Salado 254-947-8800 S
2. JD’s Travel Center 254-947-5228 D
3. The Play Yard Preschool 254-947-1153 $
5. Wildfire Ranch Arena 877-947-9988 E
6. St. Stephen Catholic Church 254-947-8037 C
8. SALADO COLLEGE HILL PARK  
10. Stagecoach Inn Restaurant under renovation

13. PUBLIC RESTROOMS
14. Central Texas Area Museum 254-947-5232 E
17.  SHADY VILLA CENTER
19.  Salado Glassworks 254-947-0339 S
24. Springhouse 254-947-0747 S
27. The Shed 254-947-1960 D
29.  Inn on the Creek B&B 254-947-5554 L
 Alexander’s Distillery 254-947-5554 D
32. Tablerock Amphitheater 254-947-9205 E
34. HISTORIC SALADO CEMETERY  
36. Salado United Methodist Church 254-947-5482 C
37. First Baptist Church of Salado 254-947-5465 C
38. Sadie Junes 254-947-1000 S
43. CREEKSIDE CENTER
48. W.A. Pace Memorial Park 254-947-5060
50. THE VERANDA
  A. First Texas Brokerage 254-947-5577 R
51. First State Bank 254-947-5852 $
52. FIRST CENTRE
  A. First Community Title 254-947-8480 R
  B. Farmers Insurance 
       Zbranek Agency 254-947-0995 $
53. Timeless 254-947-4779 S
54. Inn at Salado B&B 254-947-0027 L

Shopping Map of Salado

55. SALADO SQUARE
  A. Magnolia’s 254-947-0323 S
  B. Lively Coffeehouse & Bistro 254-947-3688 D
56. The Range at the Barton House 254-947-3828 D
 Linda Rountree Pritchard Egg 
       Massage Therapist 254-947-4263 $
58. Salado Family Dentistry 254-947-5242 S
61.  Salado Creek Jewelers by Kiki 254-855-5538 S
62. Passport to Paradise 254-935-3580 $
63. Mud Pies Pottery 254-947-0281 S
  Sir Wigglesworth Fudge
64. The Shoppes on Main in Salado 254-947-0888 S
70. OLD CHURCH PLACE
  The Pizza Place 254-947-0222 D
72. ERA Colonial Real Estate 254-947-3400 $
75. SALADO CIVIC SQUARE
79. CORNETT CORNER
  Salado Creek Winery 254-947-0237 S
  Crain Chiropractic & Wellness 254-947-2225  $
80. Historic Log Cabins & Aiken Cemetery
81. Salado Art Center and Village Artists
82. Salado Civic Center
  Salado ISD Administration 254-947-5479 E
85. Salado Visitors Center 254-947-8634
 Salado Chamber of Commerce 254-947-5040
86. Salado Wine Seller 254-947-8011 S
87. St. Joseph’s Episcopal Church 254-947-3160 C
89.  Presbyterian Church of Salado 254-947-8106 C
90. Troy Smith Financial Services 254-947-0376 $
91. Salado Sculpture Garden 
92. SALADO ARTS COMPLEX

96. THE STAGESTOP CENTER
  Bruce Bolick, CPA 254-718-7299 $
  The Yoga Room 254-681-7623 $
  Angelic Herbs 254-947-1909 S
97. Creekside Used Furniture 254-947-9471 S
99. Dee’s Antiques 254-947-3775 S
98. Stamp Salado 254-947-8848 S
100. Salado Post Office 254-947-5322 
101. Century 21 Bill Bartlett 
  Real Estate 254-947-5050 R
102. Subway 254-947-5593 D
 Old-Fashioned Burgers 254-947-5271 D
103. The Personal Wealth Coach 254-947-1111 $
105. SALADO PLAZA SHOPPING CENTER
  B. Salado Village Voice 254-947-5321 $
  B. Ace Pest Control 254-947-4222 $
  B. Walt Tollefson Computer 254-291-6354 $
  B. Finney Insurance 254-947-3599 $
  B. Monteith Abstract & Title 254-947-3922 $
  B. Anytime Fitness 254-947-1063 $
  B. The Haire Shop 
      Tammy Haire, stylist 254-760-1990 $
  B. Mill Creek Cleaners 254-947-0100 $
  C. Brookshire Brothers 254-947-8922 S
108. Mill Creek Country Club 254-947-5698 E
109.  Salado Public Library 254-947-9191 E
110. Salado Cleaners 254-947-7299 $
111. Hairitage Barber Shop 254-947-3309 $
116.  Salado High School 254-947-5429 E
119. Salado Fire Department Station #2
121. Grace Baptist Church 254-947-5917 C
124. Cowboy’s Barbecue 254-947-5700 D

125.  Fairway Sports Vehicles 254-947-4065 S
131.  Johnny’s Steaks & Bar-Be-Que 254-947-4663 D
136. Salado Fitness Massage Therapy
  Heather Foster-Sparks, LMT 254-338.9564 S
138. Salado Lady Eagles Softball Field  
139. Thomas Arnold Elementary 254-947-5191 E
140. Salado Intermediate School 254-947-1700 E
141.  Salado Junior High School 254-947-6985 E
142. Salado Eagle Stadium  
143. Eagle Baseball Field  
144. Village Spirits 254-947-7117 S
145. Broecker Funeral Home 254-947-0066 S
147. Salado Masonic Lodge #296 254-458-2643 CV
148. Salado Baptist Church Youth Activities Center
151. Salado Fire Department Station #1
152. Salado Church of Christ 254-947-5241 C
153.  Village of Salado 254-947-5060 
156. Salado Antique Mall 254-947-3355 S
157. Horizon Bank Salado 254-947-8636 $
159. Cedar Valley Baptist Church 254-947-0148 C

NOT SHOWN ON MAP 
3C Cowboy Fellowship  254-947-7211 C
Coleman Auto Restoration 254-933-7400 $
Don Ringler 254-774-6500 S
Garlyn Shelton Cadillac 254-771-0128 S

To advertise your  business in the Salado 
Village Voice newspaper, 

call Marilyn at 254.947.5321 
advertising@saladovillagevoice.com

642 N. Main St.     (254) 947-8848 

sta mpsal adotex as.com

Rubber Stamps
Scrapbooking

ribbons
Great Classes

7

Therapeutic Massage
Stress Management & 
Healthy Lifestyle

Linda Pritchard-Egg, RN, LMT

254.947.HAND (4263)
101 N. Main St. Salado
(next door to The Range)
handlmt@gmail.com
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 Three candidates are 
vying for two three-year 
terms on the Salado ISD 
Board of Trustees: Jeff 
Kelley, Darrell Street 
and write-in candidate 
Michael Matthews. 
 Below are the introduc-
tions the candidates gave 
of themselves at the Can-
didate Forum on April 18. 
Next week, we will have 
questions and answers 
with the candidates.

Darrell Street
 My wife Maudie and I 
have lived in Salado a total 
of 25 years, six years the 
first time and almost 20 
years so far this time. I 
served one three-year term 
on the school board start-
ing in 2000 but did not run 
for re-election due to con-
flicts with my job. I retired 
and soon ran again. I have 

served three consecu-
tive terms since running 
the second time Both of 
my sons attended Salado 
schools before transferring 
with us to live in Boerne, 
Texas. This is home -- 
what a wonderful word -- 
home.

Jeff Kelley
 I moved to Salado with 
my family in 1972 and 
graduated from Salado 
High School. Since 1987, 
I have owned and oper-
ated Salado Plumbing. 
My wife Charla, the Band 
Director and cheeleader 
sponsor at Salado High 
School, and I have three 
children: Madison, Chase 
and Heidi, who is an 
eighth grader at Salado 
Junior High. Through the 
years, I have been greatly 
involved in the community 

and its events. I was a 15 
year veteran of the Salado 
Fire Department and am 
an active member of the 
Salado United Method-
ist Church. Servicing the 
need for school clothing 
and supplies in the Salado 
community, I have worked 
closely with the Salado 
Family Relief Fund, pro-
viding those necessities to 
needy Salado ISD fami-
lies. I have served for a 
total of nine years on the 
Salado School Board. I 
believe that in a small 
community, it is our obli-
gation to serve where we 
can to help the growth of 
the community.

Michael MatthewS
 I have been coaching 
and teaching for the past 25 
years. I have taught Eng-
lish from the 8th to 12th 

grade level. I have taught 
PE from the Jr. High level 
up to 12th grade as well. 
I have taught Communi-
cation Applications and 
Radio Broadcast classes 
at the high school level. I 
have coached football for 
12 years and basketball for 
22 years. I was a head bas-
ketball coach at two differ-
ent schools for 5 years and 
was part of a state football 
championship in Aledo in 
1998. I have been a head 
cross country coach, head 
golf coach and took a girl 
golfer to state as a medal-
ist 3 years in a row. I am 
a member of THSCA, 
TABC, Alumni of Texas 
State (Southwest Texas 
State University). I have 
co-owned and managed 
a BBQ and catering res-
taurant for 6 years. I had 
the opportunity to work 
for Bobby Valentine in 
Arlington, TX at Bobby 
V’s Sports Café. I am a 
Legal Shield Associate 
with Legal Shield. This is 
referral attorney Service 
Company in which I have 
a license through the State 
of Texas. In addition, I 
acquired a license for sell-
ing insurance and worked 

for AMBA (Association 
Member Benefit Advisors) 
for 1 year. This company 
is located in Austin, TX 
and is endorsed by Texas 
Retired Teachers Asso-
ciation. I have a Bachelor’s 
degree from Texas State 
(Southwest Texas State 
University) in English, 
Broadcast Journalism, and 
Physical Education. I have 
a Master’s in Education 
Administration Degree 
from TAMU at Commerce 
as well.
 My experience work-
ing in business outside of 
education field is a valu-
able asset. I have been in 
the management and sales 
business for about seven 
years.  In the restaurant 
business I was in charge of 
placing orders with suppli-
ers and scheduling deliver-
ies, resolving complaints, 
maintaining sanitation 
regulations with the health 
department and uphold-
ing safety standards of 
the patrons and staff. One 
area that I can see overlap-
ping would be performing 
record keeping task and 
meeting with vendors and 
sales representatives. On 
the financial side, I was 

in charge receipts and 
balances and cash reg-
ister. Bank deposits and 
the money count, was all 
handled by me. I was in 
charge with maintaining 
a budget to purchase food 
and materials for the res-
taurant as well.
 I am married 23 years 
to Andrea Matthews and 
I have three children who 
all attend public school 
in Salado. My wife is 
employed by Southwest 
Airlines for the past 22 
years. My children are 
McLane 19, Abbey 15, and 
Addison 9. I am currently 
teaching in Killeen ISD at 
Shoemaker High School. 
This year I am teaching 
Professional Communica-
tions at Shoemaker and 
I have taught English II 
& English IV previously 
for the past five years. I 
feel that my personality 
and being able to work 
with people to achieve a 
manageable and reason-
able outcome is a valuable 
asset. I look forward to 
hearing from you.
QueStionS anD anSwerS 

with the canDiDateS 
continue next weeK.

 Three candidates are 
vying for two two-year 
terms on the Village of 
Salado Board of Alder-
men: Frank Coachman and 
write-in candidates Dr. 
Amber Preston-Dankert 
and Linda Reynolds. 
 Below are the introduc-
tions the candidates gave 
of themselves at the Can-
didate Forum on April 18. 
Next week, we will have 
questions and answers 
with the candidates.

franK coachMan
 Frank Coachman, a 
Salado resident since 
2001, assumed the duties 
of Deputy Director for the 
Texas Music Educators 
Association in July 1999. 
TMEA is a professional 
organization comprised 
of over 12,000 K-16 ele-
mentary, band, orchestra, 
choir and collegiate music 
educators. Coachman’s 
duties include managing 
the scheduling, logistics 
and presentation compo-
nents for more than 700 
events during the annual 
three-day TMEA con-
vention. The show draws 
27,000 attendees, par-
ticipants, exhibitors and 
family members to San 
Antonio. He also guides 
and oversees the TMEA 
audition process for more 
than 60,000 high school 
students across the state 
who compete for mem-
bership in TMEA Region, 
Area and All-State bands, 
choirs and orchestras. For 

the previous 22 years, 
Coachman served the 
music education profes-
sion in the Killeen I.S.D. 
For 18 years he served as 
Director of Bands for C.E. 
Ellison High School.
 He presently is the 
Immediate Past President 
of the Board of Directors 
for the Salado Education 
Foundation and is cur-
rently serving as Vice-
President. He has served 
as a member of the Board 
of Directors for the Temple 
Symphony Orchestra and 
the Center for Educa-
tor Development in Fine 
Arts Summit Cadre since 
2001. He is a Past Presi-
dent of TMEA and also 
served as State Band Vice-
President from ‘90-92. 
Coachman is an honorary 
lifetime member of the 
Texas Music Adjudicators 
Association. He attended 
Texas Tech University and 
graduated from McMurry 
University with a B.F.A., 
Music Education degree. 
 Coachman seeks to 
continue serving as a 
Salado Village Alderman 
to assist in meeting the 
needs of fellow citizen/
neighbors and business 
owner/operators.  Frank’s 
best skill is that he makes 
things happen. He is orga-
nized, cost conscious, and 
committed. He believes in 
continuing to revise the 
Village’s short and long 
term visions, along with 
revising the master plan to 
establish healthy growth, 
seizing opportunities to 
enhance the village while 
striving to preserve and 
maintain the rich histori-
cal culture and quality of 
life in the village. Frank is 
currently serving as Chair 
of the Village Economic 
Development Committee. 
 Frank and his wife, 

Kaye, enjoy living in 
Salado. They have two 
married daughters and two 
grandchildren. Kaye and 
Frank, along with partners 
Julie and Rusty Schramm, 
are proprietors and opera-
tors of 21 Main, a business 
on Salado’s Main Street.

linDa reynolDS
 I am a retired teacher 
who moved to Salado to 
help care for my 92 year 
old mother. After teach-
ing in Indiana, Canada, 
New York and Maine, I 
was also ready for a warm 
sunny climate. 
    In my late 30’s, I was 
widowed, but managed to 
pay off two mortgages and 
help my daughter through 
college on a teacher’s pay. 
Today I am debt free, 
which means I may be one 
of the most fiscally con-
servative individuals in 
America!  
     Along with an under-
graduate degree from 
Indiana University, I have 
a masters degree from 
Syracuse University where 
I tutored football players 
who had weak reading 
skills. 
 I am a National Writing 
Project Fellow and an avid 
reader.
     When I moved to Salado 
four and a half years ago, 
the Village had one mil-
lion dollars in the bank.
   Today we are in debt and 
spending over $600 a day 
on interest sent to a Dallas 
bank. The administration 

has to beg for money to do 
the work our village taxes 
should support.
 My most heartfelt 
belief is that openness and 
honesty is the best policy.
 As an Alderman:
 1. I will respect all 
points of view, and respond 
with Thanks for Particpat-
ing to anyone who has the 
courage to stand before the 
board raising concerns.
 2. Since I am retired, I 
will always be available to 
help solve problems, how-
ever large or small.
 3. I will NOT vote to 
raise Village taxes for the 
third straight year in a row.

Dr. aMber 
PreSton-DanKert
 I am a third-genera-
tion Saladoan and sixth-
generation resident of 
Bell County. I graduated 
from Salado High School, 
received my Bachelors and 
Masters degrees in Jour-
nalism and Agriculture 
from Texas A&M Univer-
sity, and hold dual Doc-
torate degrees from both 
Texas A&M University 
and Texas Tech University 
in Agriculture and Natural 
Resource Science.  
 I am married to my 
husband, Will, and I have 
two children: Max is 12 
and Mia is three.  
 I currently work for the 
Department of Defense at 
Fort Hood as the Supervi-
sor of Wildlife Manage-
ment and I have been there 
for 11 years. Will retired 

from the Army after serv-
ing four tours in Iraq and 
Afghanistan, and he now 
owns his own small busi-
ness in Salado.
 Here are a few things 
about where I stand on 
the major issues affecting 
Salado right now:
 1) A sewer is impor-
tant to both Main Street 
and the west side of I-35. 
I’m glad that a couple 
weeks ago we secured the 
land and the permit Sanc-
tuary had offered us 2 
years ago. But, I think we 
took entirely too long and 
that we have hurt people 
in the process. We need 
to consider options that 
keep our costs low, and 
that will allow connection 
and operating costs to be 
affordable to businesses 
and landowners who may 
be struggling. Every deci-
sion we make effects the 
bottom line of business 
owners and residents alike.
 2) I am glad Sanc-
tuary will be coming to 
Salado. But, I don’t believe 
that we should have offered 
such steep incentives to 
get them here. Salado is a 
JEWEL, and they should 
have wanted to come here. 
I believe in incentives to 
entice new businesses to 
come to Salado, but there 
is a difference in offering 
incentives and giving away 
more than we can afford. 
We cannot give away so 
much that we can no longer 
afford to also care for the 
small businesses currently 
struggling in Salado. We 
should be offering incen-
tives to KEEP good busi-
nesses here, and we should 
be putting our money 
into areas that affect our 
current businesses and 
residents, such as roads 
and other infrastructure. 
Bringing in hundreds or 

thousands of new people 
through developments like 
Sanctuary will cause a 
huge toll on our infrastruc-
ture, but without income 
from taxes, we will have 
no more funds to pay 
for those infrastructure 
improvements.
 3) We should keep 
pushing to hold TxDOT 
and their contractors 
responsible for the failures 
we see along our stretch of 
I-35. It is time to finish the 
highway NOW, and travel-
ers should be allowed safe 
passage through Salado 
so that visitors will not be 
afraid to travel here.
 I want to tell you what 
I’ve learned while being 
on the Board of Alder-
man the past two years. 
You know that feeling you 
get when you’ve pulled an 
all-nighter with a sick kid, 
and you still have to get up 
and be a functioning adult 
at work the next day? That 
is how every Friday feels 
after a board meeting on 
Thursday. I’ve learned 
that you can’t make every-
one happy, and that’s ok 
as long as you know you 
did your best and kept the 
best interest of the village 
in your heart. I’ve learned 
that you can’t win every 
battle, but you can defend 
yourself and your position, 
and walk away with your 
dignity.  We must continue 
to arm ourselves with 
tools such as knowledge, 
wisdom, inner strength, 
foresight and persistence 
to keep coming up with 
new and innovative ways 
to draw people here. We 
all love this town. I bet 
each of you has your own 
special story about Salado 
that you share with people 
who are from out-of-town. 
I’m not done here. I am not 
done fighting for you, and 
for this town, just yet. 

cer at the El Paso Refinery 
and the oil refinery fire 
and HAZMAT trainer for 
Reno Nevada operation. 
He was also a liaison to 
OSHA.
 He is a member of the 
following organizations 
in Salado: Member of 
Charter Class Leadership 
Salado, Lions Club Past 
VP, Historical Society 
(Board of Directors: Past 
President, VP); Mill Creek 
Community Association  

President; Salado Volun-
teers (providing free lawn 
services for citizens and 
village)Salado Ambas-
sadors; past president 
Community Emergency 
Response Team; Past 
member Salado Cham-
ber of Commerce; Salado 
Methodist Church.
 He served as Vil-
lage Alderman for four 
years with primary duties 
including the wastewater/
sewer plants, researching 

issues, seeking advice and 
opinions from constitu-
ents, and, he says, “voting 
their voice.”
 
SKiP blancett
 Skip Blancett has been 
married to Gayle for 48 
years. They have three 
adult children: Tim Blanc-
ett, the general sales man-
ager of BMW in Raleigh 
North Carolina, Brad 
Blancett, manager of IBM 
in Raleigh, North Carolina 

and Hollye Blancett, an 
artist and author in Salado. 
They also have seven 
grandchildren: Emma, 
Abbey, Ryan, Trevor, 
Grace, Alex and Casey.
 Blancett holds a Bache-
lor’s degree in History and 
English Literature from 
Howard Payne University 
in Brownwood. He holds a 
Master’s degree in Theol-
ogy from Southern Meth-
odist University. He holds 
a second Master’s degree 

in International Relations 
from St. Mary’s University 
in San Antonio. He was 
awarded a Doctorate from 
Southern Methodist Uni-
versity.
 He is currently the 
Chief of Counseling and 
Chief of Programs, ESD 
at Fort Hood, where he is 
a GS-13 with more than 40  
employees in his charge.
 He is a retired Navy 
Captain, after 22 years in 
the service.

 Blancett is a retired 
United Methodist Min-
isted with 51 years of ser-
vice to churches.
 The Blancetts came to 
Salado more than 17 years 
ago when Skip was called 
to take over the Salado 
United Methodist Church.
 He lists stained glass 
and acrylic painting as his 
hobbies.
 He was elected Mayor 
of Salado in 2014.
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Wild About Texas
Michael Price

There is an old saying 
“If it looks like a duck 
and acts like a duck, then 
it must be a duck.” How-
ever, there is a species of 
bird that is often mistaken 
for a duck because of its 
appearance and aquatic 
tendencies, but is actually 
NOT a duck. That bird is 
the American Coot.

 The American Coot 
(Fulica americana) is a 
common bird year-round 
throughout much of the 
western United States, 
including all but the Upper 
Gulf Coast region of 
Texas. There it is common 
only in the winter months. 
It can be observed on just 
about any large body of 
permanent to semi-perma-
nent bodies of freshwater. 

 At first glance, this 
particular species of 
aquatic bird appears to 
be rather drab in color-
ation. However, it is upon 
closer examination (often 
through the aid of binocu-
lars) that this bird’s true 
beauty can be appreciated. 
The wings and stout body 
are a shade of dark gray, 
almost black, oftentimes 
with a light sprinkling of 
white dots on the chest 
area. The small head and 
thick neck are black, and 
there is a peppering of 
white dots that surround 
the bright red eyes. Mature 

American Coot

OPEN TO THE PUBLIC 
 Practice Facility                    Memberships Available 

millcreek-golf.com       

(254) 947-5698

18 unforgettable holes of Golf designed by Robert Trent Jones, Jr. Book Your Tee Time Today

Open for Breakfast 7 a.m. Daily
Mill Creek Country Club Bar & Grill 

open to the public 7 a.m. - 7 p.m. 

Dine In  or  Carry Out

American Coot is often mistaken for duck

Remodeling 
to open with 

New Owner - Sally Volney 
and manager Alice Winders

Susan Marie’s

Custom blown 
glass made
in Salado.

View our gallery
of hand-blown pieces 

or make your very own

#2 Peddlers Alley 
Salado Texas 76571

254-947-0339 
(by appointment)

106 North Main Street

(next to Ambrosia Tea Room)  

(254) 855-5538 Private Showings

adults also have a red 
frontal shield just above 
the short white bill that 
extends onto the forehead. 
The short legs are typically 
an olive hue. Both sexes 
are similar in appearance, 
with body lengths of about 
15 inches and a wingspan 
of just over two feet. 

 Coots are commonly 
observed while foraging 
for food either on land 
along the water’s edge 
or while casually swim-
ming on the surface. Its 
gait while on land makes 
it appear lazy and clumsy, 
almost chicken-like with 
its head bobbing back 
and forth. However, if 
it feels threatened, it is 
quick to take to the waters 
to paddle away to a safe 
distance from a potential 
predator. While searching 
for food along the shore-
line, it immerses its head 
and neck into the shallow 
waters, leaving just its 
backend and tail tipped up 
above the surface. When 
foraging in deeper waters, 
it will dive up to 25 feet 
below the surface to obtain 
its food. It feeds primarily 
on roots of aquatic plants, 

although a variety of other 
items such as leaves, seeds, 
insects, and small amphib-
ians are also consumed. 

 The flight pattern is a 
simple one, with the wings 
beating rapidly as it flies 
in a fairly straight line. 
If disturbed while swim-
ming, it will run across 
the surface of the water to 
obtain enough momentum 
to achieve flight. 

These birds are typi-
cally found in small 
groups of two to four 
animals, although they 
will often congregate in 
larger flocks when they 
are searching for suitable 
feeding areas, particularly 
while on land. They pair 
up during the breeding 
season, with the male and 
female remaining monog-
amous during this time. 
The males actively pursue 
the females during court-
ship, many times chas-
ing her across the surface 
of the water. The female 
responds with nasally 
hoarse grunts when she is 
receptive to her mate. The 
pair assists each other with 
the building of the floating 
nest, which is made pri-
marily from dead stems. 
Both sexes also incubate 
the eggs, which are pink-
ish in coloration, are about 
two inches in length, and 
number anywhere from 
two to 12. Incubation time 
is about three weeks in 
length. The young are pre-
cocial, which means that 
they are born with their 
eyes open, have a covering 
of down, and have the abil-
ity to leave the nest within 
a day of hatching. The 
hatchling birds are taken 
care of by both sexes, and 
most begin flight at about 
seven weeks of age. Each 
pair of adults will have one 
to two broods annually. 

 The American Coot is 
a common to nearly abun-
dant bird throughout its 
range in Texas. Many are 
observed while foraging 
in lawns along lakes and 
large ponds. It can be quite 
wary of anything that it 
perceives as a potential 
threat, so having a good 
pair of binoculars handy is 
a must for close-up view-
ing. 

free wifi

Beer or Wine Tasting DailY $10
Live music every Friday & saturday

5 huge tvs
Sun -Thur Noon - 10 p.m. | Friday Noon - Midnight | Saturday Noon -1 a.m.

418 N. Main Street              (254) 947-9000

150 wines 
from around 

the world

41 taps of 
Texas Craft 

Brews

(254) 947-0027 | (800) 724-0027

Historic Bed and Breakfast ~Weddings ~ Receptions  ~ Meetings

Inn at Salado

North Main & Pace Park Dr.  inn-at-salado.com                   

Corner of Royal Street and Center Circle (West)

(254) 947-1960

 Open

Mon, Wed, Thurs 5 p.m.

Fri, Sat & Sun 11 a.m.

Closed Tues

A place for weary travelers, thirsty 

tourist, and hungry neighbors!

Serving Comfort Food
with a Full Bar &
16 Beers on Tap!

PizzaPlaceSalado.com

947-0022
230 North Main Street

Open Daily 11 am

The Pizza Place

Handcrafted Pizza and Sandwiches

Hand Dipped Blue Bell Ice Cream

Baked Pasta Dishes | Wings

All You Can Eat Salad Bar

 Pickup   •   Dine-in  •  Delivery

Open at Lunch
no minimum orders
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731 McKay Lane
3 BR, 4.5 BA

$515,721

7585 Delwood St., Belton
3 BR, 2 BA
$299,921

1602 Mill Creek Dr., Salado
4 BR, 3 BA
$239,721

7311 Rickey Drive, Temple
4 BR, 2 BA
$149,721

1295 Western Trail, Salado
3 BR, 2.5 BA on 9+ ac.

$425,021

1401 Mill Creek Dr., Salado
3 BR, 3.5 BA

$395,721

• Creeks of Salado: Estate-sized lots starting at $60,000
• Mill Creek lots: $32,000 - $49,000
• Hidden Springs lots:  $39,900 - $74,900 
• 1.1 tree covered acres on Center Circle.
• 1.25 ac. Commercial tract in Jarrell at I-35 & Meadow Valley Loop.
• 4.6 ac. fronting I-35, just S. of Salado
• 11.7 ac. tract on West side of I-35 frontage rd. between Belton & Salado.
• Beautiful 3 acres with native trees, wildlife and large 3/2 mobile home U/C

2301 Indian Trail, Salado
3 BR, 2 BA
$299,721

1002 Wildberry Circle, Belton
4 BR, 3.5 BA on 1.25 ac.

$559,921

1218 Chisholm Trail, Salado
4 BR, 3 BA
$239,521

207 Champion Dr., Little River
4 BR, 3 BA

5014 JI Bruce, Temple
3 BR, 2 BA

401 OW Lowrey, Salado
3 BR, 2 BA

SO
LD

860 N. Main
Salado, Tx

254.947.5050
www.C21BB.

Text 
C21BB 

to
 87778

Download our 
mobile app

Area Land Listings

SO
LD

SO
LD

coNTINued oN, pg 2d

3116 River Place
Belton, TX

Price Improvement!!!

colonialrealestate.com
301 N. Main St. Salado, Texas

Serving Central Texas, South 
Texas, Hays County, Bell County, 

Highland Lakes and the 
Texas Hill Country.

Lynette McCain-Jones
 Texas REALTOR®

(254) 718-0820

Katlyn Volney
 Texas REALTOR®

(254) 913-7485

‘the best experience in real estate’

A u t o m o b i l e  & 
S m A l l  e n g i n e   
RepAiR

Egbert Automotive, 
Locally owned and operated. 899 
Holland Road (FM2268) Call (245) 
947-5782 for all your automotive 
needs.

E & E  A i r - C o o l e d 
Engines: Shindaiwa Dealer, 
parts, sales and service, chain 
saw sharpening, 254-947-8006, 
24767 FM 2268.         tfnd

B&K Small Engine 
Repair: Lawn mowers, trim-
mers, edgers, chain-saws, much 
more, 254-933-7557.                  tfnd

C.A.R.S.  Col l is ion 
Center: auto body repairs, 
detail shop, 1914 S. IH-35 Belton, 

254-933-7400.            tfnd

Child CARe 
bAbySitting

The Play Yard: 6 weeks 
to 12 years with age appropriate 
curriculum, drop of and pick up 
from Salado schools, 254-947-
1153.  tfnb

ComputeRS

Walt Tollefson computer 
repairs and sales, data recovery, 
configurations, Salado Plaza suite 
#135, 254-291-6354.   tfnd

dRy CleAneRS

Salado Cleaners: Laun-
dry, dry cleaning, alterations, 

leather, suede, 1209 N. Stage-
coach, 254-947-7299. tfnd

Mill Creek Cleaners, 
quality dry cleaning, laundry, 
alterations, 213 Mill Creek Dr. 
Suite 200, 254-947-0100.    tfnd

diRt/Stone WoRk

Lone Star Grading, 
commercial, residential, industrial 
excavation, grading, paving, pads, 
driveways, roads, 254-947-0149 
or 254-933-7900

CBS Construction: septic 
tanks, house pads, driveways, 
lot clearing, top soil, 254-718-
1752.                       tfnd
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FinAnCiAl & ReAl 
eStAte SeRviCeS

Troy L Smith Financial: 
Personal investment solutions. 
254-947-0376, Troylsmith.com.

Alton D. Thiele PC: 
Certified Public Accountant, tax 

hour Health Club. Fit-
ness classes, personal training 
available, 24 hour access. 254-
947-1063. 

Angelic Herbs: Profes-
sional Wellness, Lifestyle, 
weight loss and stress manage-
ment solutions. C J Harbuz, CNHP 
947-1909, 560 N. Main Suite 10.

Crain Chiropractic & 
Wellness- chiropractic care, 
massage therapy, acupuncture 
and holistic care. 418 N. Main St. 
#5.,947-2225.

Integrity: Rehab & 
Home Health. Physical 
therapy, speech therapy, occu-
pational therapy, in-home skilled 
nursing. integrityrehab.net, 254-
699-3933.

Massage Therapy - 
Salado Fitness, 8 a.m. - 8 
p.m. daily - by appointment only. 
Same day available (254) 338-
9564 Heather LMT. 1/14tfn

The Remedy- Massage 
Therapy. TheRemedySalado.
com, Libby Nichols MT044934. 
113 N. Stagecoach Rd. Suite 5. 
(254)624-7912.

T herapeut ic  Mas-
sage, stress management 
and healthy lifestyle strategies, 
Linda Pritchard-Egg, RN, LMT, 
254-947-4263.

Family Dentistry: Lum-
ineers for straighter, whiter teeth. 
Douglas B. Willingham, DDS, 
254-947-5242.

The Yoga Room- 560 
North Main #8, Saladoyoga.com. 
254-791-9440.

heAt & AiR

Britt Heating & Air: 
Installation and repairs, 254-
760-1004, 254-947-5263, TACL 
#B006640

Bell Air Conditioning: 
All brands repairs, free estimates, 
100% financing available, 254-
939-1141. TACLA002113C

JeWeleRS

Salado Creek Jewel-
ers by Kiki Creations:  
106 North Main St. 254-855-5538, 
private showings.

Lastovica Jewelers: 
in-store jewelry repairs, diamond 
sales, setting and appraisal, 
custom design, watch repair, 
254-773-5772.

Devereaux’s Jewelers: 
Quality crafted custom work, 
jewelry repair, appraisals, watch 
repair, stone setting, diamond 
sales, photo design. 254-771-
1260.

lAndSCAping

lAWnWoRk & tRee

J & W Lawn Care, Your 
complete lawn care service. Let us 
work for you. Brian Wooley (254) 
718-5295 or Randy Jackson, 54 
year resident of Salado (254) 
760-2439.

Scout’s Tree Service 
and Lawn Care. For 
free estimate or questions call 
(254)654-0213.

Trees, Shrubs & Land-
scaping,  Pruning, www.
victormareklandscaping.com. 
1-512-818-3822, Removal and 
Hauling. Flower beds, yard work, 
top soil.  Serving Salado 32 years. 
0724tfn 

Double J Tree Service: 
Lot clearing, acreage mowing, 
chipping, mulching, trimming, 512-
635-4064. 512-746-272.

peRSonAl SeRviCeS

If you need an expe-
rienced cargiver full 
time or live in call 254-421-1599. 
4/14-5/5b

Would you like some-
one to run errands for 
you, do your grocery or gift shop-
ping, or arrange for other house-
hold services? Give us a call and 
we can arrange to do it ... As You 
Wish! Call 254-228-9962 or visit 
our website at www.asyouwish.
us. 4/14-4/21b

Guiding Light Home 
Care for all your home 
care needs. Licensed by the 
State of Texas and all our caregiv-
ers are bonded and insured. Call 
512-863-7233 or visit us at www.
GuidingLightHomeCare.com 

April 22-24 & April 29-May 1
Friday: 6pM to 8pM

Saturday and Sunday: Noon to 5pM
Admission : Adults $5 - Children (under 12) FREE

purchase Tickets at any parade Home
During Open Hours Above!

Parade map available at www.tahb.org/parade
or the FREE Parade Smart App.

Tickets Good
For  Unlimited Viewing!

Complete Appliance Package includes Dual Fuel Range & Undercounter Microwave

3 Bay Garage           ADA Features           12’ Ceilings            8’ Doors

Outdoor Kitchen with Fireplace       Family Room with Gas Fireplace 

Parade of Homes
MF Construction Inc. is proud to present 

3116 Hester Way

This contemporary 

home has 

4 bedrooms and

 3 full baths

2828 sq ft

Visit our other Parade Entry 

1901 Kevlin Trail

April 22 - 24 & April 29 - May 1
Fridays 6 - 8 p.m.  Saturdays & Sundays noon - 5 p.m.

15 words   $7
.25 per word after

advertising@
SaladoVillageVoice.com

PO Box 587
Salado, TX 76571

Drop Box at 
Salado Village Voice

Office in Salado Plaza

Advertising is prepaid

Cash or Check 
Visa or Mastercard

may be used for 
purchases over $20Words: ____ First 15 words $7 + .25 per word = ______  Number of weeks to run ad: _______ Total due: ________

NAME: PHONE:
ADDRESS:
EMAIL:

 1+ Acre Homesites
• Salado School District 
• No City Taxes
• Highly Restricted
• No Homeowners Association 
• Combined lots at discount
• Mail delivered to house

RaneyRealEstate.net

ANNA LOU RANEY, Broker/Realtor 254-913-1215
DANIEL RANEY, Realtor 254-760-2591
ANN CARROLL, Realtor 254-760-0101

returns, business accounting, 
auditing, consulting, 254-939-
0701.                 tfnd

Bruce A. Bolick, CPA: 
Payroll, W-2, Direct Deposit, 
By appointment, 254-718-7299. 
SaladoCPA@aol.com.           tfnd

First Community Title, 

branches in Salado, Temple, 
Killeen and Gatesville. 40 N. 
Main Street, Salado 254-947-
8480.               tfnd

The Personal Wealth 
Coach®:  SEC registered 
investment advisor, highly per-
sonalized portfolio design and 
management, 254-947-1111.

Monteith Abstract & 
Title Company: Full service title 
company, 213 Mill Creek Dr., Suite 
#140, 254-947-3922.

John Hall: Insurance and 
financial services, auto, home, 
ranch, business, life, health, 254-
778-8087. 

Rita Zbranek, Farmers 
Insurance, auto, home, life, com-
mercial, 254-947-0995.

Finney Insurance, home, 
auto, life, commercial, liability, 
farm, ranch, 254-947-3599.

FloRiSt

Brookshire Brothers full 
service florist. Blooming plants. 
254-947-8922.

FoR SAle

Dee’s Antique Mall - 
Furniture, Glassware, Keepsakes 
at 702 North Main Street. Over 30 
vendors (254) 947-3775 tfn

Salado Antique Mall 
and Bee’s Antiques 
-  Antiques, vintage and col-
lectables, many vendors at one 
location 751 Stagecoach Road, 
North I-35 frontage road (directly 
behind Dee’s Antiques on Main) 
947-3355.   Salado Market Days 
second weekend of each month.  

Creekside Qual ity 
Used Furniture: Save 
On- Leather sofas, recliners and 
office desk#6 Old Town Road 
254-947-9477. Follow us on FB.

gARAge, AuCtionS, 
eStAte SAle

Estate Sale- Saturday and 
Sunday 8 a.m.- 1 p.m. , 4/23 & 
4/24. 1701 Guess Drive. Salado, 
Tx 76571. 

gARbAge

Clawson Disposal: Com-
petitive pricing for great garbage 
service; containers, too. 512-
746-2000.

heAlth And FitneSS

Anytime Fitness- 24 
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the heart of Mill Creek.  Two 
living, one dining room with open 
kitchen.  This home even boasts 
of a butler’s pantry for extra stor-
age.  Recently remodeled master 
bathroom with walk-in shower 
and separate tub.  Multi-level 
backyard makes this home perfect 
for entertaining.  $299,721.  2301 
Indian Trail, Salado. Century 21 
Bill Bartlett  947-5050.

Home on 9  acres 
fronting the Willing-
ham Creek in Hidden 
Springs.  Heavily wooded 
acreage creates a private setting.   
3 BR, 3 full baths, 2 half baths.  
Beautiful beam vaulted ceiling in 
living area.  Up to 3 horses are 
allowed.  1295 Western Trail, 
Salado.  $425,021. Century 21 
Bill Bartlett 947-5050

pRopeRty FoR SAle

Two 12 acre lots on 
Darr’s Creek: On Lindeman 
Road. Electricity, Jarrell-Schw-
ertner water. Interesting site with 
beautiful pasture-land and trees. 
Offered separately or together. 
254-760-4346 or (254) 947-5049.          
7/18tfnb

Bell County Land - 6 ac. 
I-35; 20 ac. native oaks, home, 
guest house; 50 ac. I-35 Belton; 
50 ac. South of Salado, pond, 
barn.  Many more tracts to choose 
from.  Century 21 Bill Bartlett, 
Salado  www.C21bb.com 254-
947-5050.11/10 tfnf

Kevlin Trail - Only 1 
lot left! Premier half-acre lot, 
underground utilities ready for 
building. $59,900. Call Raney 
and Associates: 254-913-1215. 
tfn08/02

Great location just 
off Main Street in estab-
lished neighborhood. Lot size is 
.517 Acre  $ 72,500 Call Raney 
and Associates: 254-913-1215. 
tfn08/20

Homesites in Heritage 
subdivision, 1+ acres, 
Salado schools, no city taxes, 
financing, restricted, call Raney 
and Associates: 254-913-1215.
tfn08/20

SeRviCeS

Party room available 
for rent $25/hour.  Plan your 
holiday event at our place.  Salado 
Winery, 841 N. Main Street, (254) 
947-8011.

Cutting Edge Contrac-
tors-  Remodeling, roofing, 
custom patios, concrete, painting, 
dry wall. 254-624-0741 or tommy.
mungia@cuttingedgecontrac-
tors.us

StoRAge

Visit www.cedarval-
leystorage.com to find out 
more about the facility on FM 2843 
or call 512-417-7196.  
11/24tfnb

StowAway Storage 
Household - Commercial 10X10 
- 10x20 - 22x40 Clean, lighted, 
fenced, Key punch entry. 947-
5502 or 721-1807              tfnb

Storage space in 
Salado 8X12, 16X24 and up. 
Some have drive-in doors. Stage-
coach Storage 254-778-6779. tfnb 

Subscribe Today
First Class Mail Delivery
$26 year in Bell County

$28 statewide      $36 outside Texas

(254) 947-5321

Jenny Wiggin Potter- 
Colorist, Hairstylist at 
Expressions, 3126 South 31st St. 
across from HEB  in Temple. (254) 
774-9751.

Salon of Salado- Full 
service salon, walk-ins welcome. 
Susan Haywood 32 year expe-
rience. (254)947-7282, cabin 
across from Salado Creek Winery.

Mary Kay Products- 
Anne Marie Harwell, consultant. 
254-258-4460, web: marykay.
com/AnneMarieHarwell. 8/6tfnb

Mary Kay Cosmetics, 
Glenda McCravey, Beauty Con-
sultant, (254)654-0059. web: 
marykay.com/gmccravey. 3/17-
5/4b

Hairitage Barber Shop: 
Full service Barber Shop, call 254-
947-3309 for appointments. 

The Haire Shop, full ser-
vice salon, walk-ins accepted. 
254-760-1990. 

peSt ContRol

Ace Pest Control: Cus-
tomer satisfaction guaranteed, 
free estimates, TPCL #12512; 
David Preston. 254-947-4222

plumbing

Moffat & Daughters 
Plumbing: Service, repair, 
remodeling, 254-289-5986 Master 
LIC # M017002

Salado Plumbing. In-
home repairs, 254-947-5800. 
Master LIC M 16892

Yount Sewer & Drain: 
septic tank & grease trap pump-
ing, 254-947-5036

RentAl/leASe 
ReSidentiAl

3BR, 3 1/2 BA, 2200 
Sq. Ft., 3 Car Garage, Golf 
Cart Garage. All brick, on golf 
course. 254-721-3578, ask for 
Frank. 8/13 tfnb

For Rent clean 2 BR, 
2 B duplex, $700 mo. call 
760-4440. 0918tfnb

Charming, spacious, 
2/2/1 townhome for 
rent. Clean!! 6 closets, vaulted 
ceiling, w/d closet inside. Walk 
to shopping center. Lawn care 
provided. 254-913-9813.
10/2tfnb

ReSidentiAl SAleS

Perfect home over-
looking the Texas Hill 
Country. Hill country flavored 
home on 5 gorgeous acres with 
barn for horses $429,900. More 
info at www.1349hiddensprings.
com Call First Texas Brokerage 
947-5577

Family friendly 4 bed-
room layout with flex room!!  
Extremely well kept & pretty 4 BR 
home in Mill Creek.  3 BR, 2 BA 
downstairs with isolated master.  
4th BR/BA upstairs along with flex 

room—office, media, exercise, 
kid’s den.  Beautiful wood floors 
in living room.  Wood burning 
fireplace.  New roof & gutters 
and garage door system in 2015.  
Solar screens for efficiency.  Very 
convenient location to the heart 
of Salado.  1218 Chisholm Trail, 
Salado.  $239,521.   Century 21 
Bill Bartlett 947-5050  2/2tfnf

Lovely 3 BR, 4.5 BA 
home close to Main Street in 
Salado.  Bonus room upstairs 
could be used for office, media or 
additional bedroom.  Two living 
areas and  2 dining downstairs.  
Large kitchen opens into breakfast 
area & living room.  Beautiful glass 
doors open onto a large deck with 
swimming pool & rock fireplace.  
Large, native live oak trees shade 
the front yard.  731 McKay Lane, 
Salado.  $515,721 Century 21 Bill 
Bartlett  947-5050.

Per fect  home fo r 
entertaining.  Views of the 
creek from the master bedroom, 
living area, guest bedroom & 
bonus room.  Large outside porch 
with fire pit & gazebo.  3 BR, 3.5 
BA , 2 living, 2 dining and 31 x 22 
room that could be a game room 
or bonus room.  Open kitchen with 
granite counter tops.  $395,721.  
1401 Mill Creek Dr. , Salado.   
Century 21 Bill Bartlett  947-5050.

Escape to your own 
resort all on 5 pristine acres. 
As you walk into this home you 
will be taken by the grand great 
room with high ceilings, custom 
wood beams and large windows 
overlooking the swimming pool. 
$599,875. Call Ryan 541-2255. 
First Texas Brokerage 254-947-
5577 9/8tfn

Old world Charm and 
Custom craftsmanship 
can be seen throughout this 
Texas Hill Country Farm House 
on 4.9 tree-covered acre estate. 
Features include: Spray foam 
insulation. 2 tankless water heat-
ers. 2-16 seer AC/Heating units 
$549,900. Call Ryan  541-2255. 
First Texas Brokerage 947-5577 
9/8tfn

Elegant Austin Stone 
Home on tree-covered 
lot. Large covered back patio 
overlooking the tropical landscap-
ing and swimming pool. Granite 
counters, stainless steel appli-
ances. $499,900 Call First Texas 
Brokerage 947-5577.

Unique contemporary 
home secluded on over 
an acre with trees and stone 
patios. Custom built with soaring 
ceilings, inviting irregular rooms, 
3 bedrooms, 3 baths, large living 
area, open kitchen with breakfast 
room plus a flex room. Outdoor 
cooking with bar and patios. 701 
Indian Trail $309,900 Raney 
& Associates, 254-913-1215. 
11/19tfnb

3 BR, 2 BA home in Mill 
Creek with two dining & two 
living areas.  Wonderful 23 x 15 
workshop in back yard for a car 
or work area.  Open kitchen with 
breakfast area.  Landscaped back 
yard with deck.  Centrally located 
with easy access to downtown 
Salado.  2106 Smith Bluff, Salado.  
$219,921. Century 21 Bill Bartlett  
947-5050.
01/23tfnf

Incredible back yard 
on this 3 BR, 2 BA home in 

$16  a week 
Put your business card 

here and get a free 
classified each week.

advertising@saladovillagevoice.com 
(254) 947-5321

IT Specialist Needed
%artlett (lectric &ooperatiYe, ,nc is currently seeNinJ a Tualified candidate 
for an IT Specialist. 
An Associates or Technical School degree is preferred.  Microsoft and / or 
&isco certification are a plus�  Must haYe a PiniPuP of three years ZorN 
experience in netZorNinJ and 3& hardZare installation and support� 7he can-
didate Pust Ee aEle to diaJnose, trouEleshoot and resolYe proElePs in a sys-
tePatic and tiPely Panner and Ee self PotiYated Zith Jood coPPunications 
sNills� 3osition includes Eut is not liPited to the support of %(&·s /$N�:$N, 
security, (�Pail serYer, fireZall, ZeE paJe, telecoPPunications, report Zrit-
inJ and facilitation of third party softZare Yendors�

&oPpetitiYe 3ay 	 %enefits� 

(PployPent reTuires�
Background check,
3re�ePployPent druJ screen,
3hysical, 7; DriYers /icense, 
Good driving record 

,nterested applicants, please suEPit your resuPe to�
DeEEie :riJht
Bartlett Electric Cooperative, Inc.
3�O� %ox �00
%artlett, 7; �65��
dZriJht#Eartlettec�coop

$16  a week 
Put your business card 

here and get a free 
classified each week.

advertising@saladovillagevoice.com 
(254) 947-5321

Yount Sewer & Drain
Septic Service, L.C.

Septic tank 
& grease trap 

pumping

254 947-5036

Moffatt & Daughters
Plumbing Co. 

Service • Repair • Remodeling

Riannai authorized service provider

George (Bubba) Moffatt

254 289-5986 (local)

Master Plumber

Lic M017002

B&K Small Engine Repair
5571 West Hwy 190 Belton

Lawn Mowers (all sizes)

Trimmers • Edgers

Chain-Saws • Generators

Golf Carts Service & Repair

Prompt Professional Service
Most all makes and models 

Pick -up and delivery available

(254) 933-7557

 
ANNA LOU RANEY, Broker/Realtor 254-913-1215

DANIEL RANEY, Realtor 254-760-2591
ANN CARROLL, Realtor 254-760-0101

MLS
MULTIPLE LISTING SERVICE Temple/Belton 

Board of Realtors

RaneyRealEstate.net
For photographs and detailed descriptions of these unique properties

LAND LISTINGS
1014 ARROWHEAD DRIVE

Unique lot with an established neighborhood 
in the heart of Mill Creek. $35,000

694 ASHLEY COURT  
Great location just off Main Street in estab-
lished neighborhood. Lot size is .517 Acre  $ 

72,500

KEVLIN TRAIL Only 1 lot left! 
Premier half-acre lot, underground utilities 

ready for building. $59,900

Only nine 1+ acre lots in the beautiful 
Heritage subdivision

701 INDIAN TRAIL
Just in time for spring!  Over an Acre with trees and patios for outdoor cook-
ing and entertaining. There is a nice fenced area for pets, 2 car garage plus a 
carport and lots of privacy. A unique 3 BR-3 BA home with an open kitchen, 
breakfast room with views of trees and deer roaming at a distance, formal 

dining and a great room with a wall of windows and a WBFP. $309,900.

List your property with 
Raney and Associates

UNDER CONTRACT
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254-770-3325 • 2825 Thornton Lane • Temple off HK Dodgen Loop 363, next to Hancock Fabrics

We Guarantee the 
Lowest Prices

Mattress World
Family Owned and Operated since 1999

Simmons Beauty Rest

Adjustible Beds

4x3

4x4

254-770-3325 • 2825 Thornton Lane • Temple off HK Dodgen Loop 363, next to Hancock Fabrics

Mattress World
Family Owned and Operated since 1999

We Guarantee the Lowest Prices

Simmons Beauty Rest
Adjustible Beds

A/C
Repair

 ALL BRANDS
Free Estimates &  Second Opinions

100% Financing Available

Senior Citizens Discount on service

939-1141
Toll Free 877-422-5500  • www.bellaircond.com

310 E. Central Ave. • Belton
SERVING CENTRAL TEXAS FOR OVER 38 YEARS

TACLA002113C

CBS Construction

Gravel Driveways | Parking Lots
Septic Tanks | House Pads
Lot Clearing | Demolition

Chet Sutton, owner-operator

254 718-1752

Salado Plumbing

947-5800

“We are ready”
In home repairs

 

Master LIC M 16892

Britt Heating & 
Air Conditioning

 Installations • Repairs
 Office 947-5263
 Mobile 760-1004
 Serving Salado for 25 years 
 TACL #B006640

Bulletin 1790-1 
Exhibit B 

Modified 4-15-2016 

STATEMENT OF NONDISCRIMINATION 

In accordance with Federal civil rights law and U.S. Department of Agriculture (USDA) 
civil rights regulations and policies, the USDA, its Agencies, offices, and employees, and 
institutions participating in or administering USDA programs are prohibited from 
discriminating based on race, color, national origin, religion, sex, gender identity 
(including gender expression), sexual orientation, disability, age, marital status, family/
parental status, income derived from a public assistance program, political beliefs, or 
reprisal or retaliation for prior civil rights activity, in any program or activity conducted 
or funded by USDA (not all bases apply to all programs).  Remedies and complaint filing 
deadlines vary by program or incident. 

Persons with disabilities who require alternative means of communication for program 
information (e.g., Braille, large print, audiotape, American Sign Language, etc.) should 
contact the responsible Agency or USDA's TARGET Center at (202)720-2600 (voice and 
TTY) or contact USDA through the Federal Relay Service at (800)877-8339. 
Additionally, program information may be made available in languages other than 
English. 

To file a program discrimination complaint, complete the USDA Program Discrimination 
Complaint Form, AD-3027, found online at http://www.ascr.usda.gov/
compliantfilingcust.html and at any USDA office or write a letter addressed to USDA and 
provide in the letter all of the information requested in the form.  To request a copy of the 
complaint form, call (866)632-9992.  Submit your completed form or letter to USDA by: 

  (1)  mail: U.S. Department of Agriculture  
    Office of the Assistant Secretary for Civil Rights 
    1400 Independence Avenue, SW 
    Washington, D.C.  20250-9410; 
   
  (2) fax: (202)690-7442; or 

  (3) email: program.intake@usda.gov 

This Institution is an equal opportunity provider, employer, and lender.

Bartlett Electric Cooperative, Inc

April 11
 5:22-6:24 p.m., 3400 
Block and Homestead Rd. 
Out to a Motor Vehicle Ac-
cident unknown injuries. 
Arrived on scene to find 1 
vehicle with major dam-
age. HHFD EMS was on 
scene and had all patient 
care. Set up traffic control 
and scene safety. SW Bell 
VFD arrived on scene and 
assisted with scene. HHFD 
Medic transported patient. 
2 units, 3 personnel.
April 12
 6:51-7:05 a.m., 358 
Sparrow and I-35 Service 
Rd. Out to a Motor Ve-
hicle Accident, unknown 
injuries. Searched from the 
287 to the 282 and nothing 
found. Only one caller had 
called it in, advised dis-
patch nothing found and 
all units cleared. 2 units, 2 
personnel.
 6:46-7:11 p.m., 11200 
Block Oak Tree. Arrived 
on scene to find patient 
sitting on floor. Patient de-
nied any injuries. Lift as-
sist only. 1 unit, 2 person-
nel.
 11:16-11:36 p.m., 200 
Block MM SB. Out pri-
ority 2 to the 279 SB for 
a single vehicle accident. 
Went en route and arrived 
on scene to find 1 vehicle 

in the grass median with 
moderate damage. 1 pa-
tient was in vehicle and he 
denied any injuries or EMS 
treatment Monitored and 
Scott & White arrived on 
scene and got a no trans-
port. Stood by until DPS 
arrived on scene. 2 units, 6 
personnel.
April 13
 12:10-3:54 a.m., 284 
SB. Out priority 2 to the 
283 SB for an 18-wheel-
er accident blocking SB 
lanes. Went en route and 
arrived on scene to find 
the 18 wheeler jackknifed 
b/w the SB walls blocking 
traffic. Patient denied any 
injuries or EMS treatment. 
Driver stated he was haul-
ing dry goods, only noth-
ing dangerous. Provided 
scene safety and traffic 
control. Upon inspection 
the 18 wheeler knocked 
some barriers into the NB 
lanes. A truck was placed 
on the NB side to block the 
inside lane. Stood by until 
wrecker arrived on scene 
and moved 18 wheeler 
from roadway. Placed ab-
sorbent on the road for 
cleanup. James Construc-
tion arrived on scene to 
fix the barricades. SPD 
and Bell Co. Constable on 
scene and assisted with ac-

vised them of the situation. 
Remained on scene as a 
precaution until fire burned 
down. 1 unit, 1 personnel.
 10:15-10:38 p.m., 
23200 Block IH-35 MM 
276. Dispatched to a bus 
on fire. Arrived on scene 
to find bus in Williamson 
County and Jarrell FD on 
scene. Stopped on scene 
and was canceled by Jarrell 
FD. 2 units, 4 personnel.
April 16
 4:27-4:49 p.m., 600 
Block Royal Street. Ar-
rived on scene to find the 
patient sitting in a chair. 
Patient complained of left 
hip pain. Patient was in po-
sition of comfort. Patient 
aware, stated she tripped 
and fell on her hip. Ob-
tained vitals and charted. 
Scott & White Medic ar-
rived on scene and took 
over patient care. Scott & 
White transported. 2 units, 
4 personnel.
 4:41-5:17 p.m., Wild-
fire Arena. Out to a possi-
ble broken arm. Arrived on 
scene to find female patient 
sitting on ground. Female 
stated she had tripped and 
fell and had tried to catch 
herself with right arm. 
Patient stated severe pain 
in right forearm. Applied 
splint to right forearm. 
Scott & White transported. 
1 unit, 5 personnel.
 5:46-5:59 p.m., 400 
Block OW Lowrey. Dis-
patched for water leak in 
the garage from a broken 
line. Arrived on scene to 
find the home owner had 
found the main and cut off 
the water. No further assis-
tance needed from FD and 
all units cleared. 2 units, 3 
personnel.
 5:13-5:52 p.m., 10800 
Block Sam Neil Rd. Out 
for a male patient diffi-
culty breathing. Arrived 
on scene to find patient 
laying in bed with labored 
breathing. Obtained vitals 
and charted. Scott & White 
arrived on scene and trans-
ported. 2 units, 4 person-
nel.

cident and traffic. 6 units, 9 
personnel.
 4:11-4:50 p.m., 282 NB 
I-35 Rest Area. Out to a 
patient with chest pain. Ar-
rived on scene to find the 
patient walking around. 
Patient did not speak Eng-
lish and it was difficult to 
get what was wrong. Got 
vitals on patient. Scott & 
White arrived on scene 
and took over patient care. 
Scott & White transported. 
2 units, 2 personnel.
April 14
 9:18-9:30 a.m., 1200 
Block Hidden Springs Dr. 
Out in reference to a fire 
alarm activation. Canceled 
en route by Bell County 
Communications. 1 unit, 2 
personnel.
 11:26 p.m.- 12:01 
a.m., 4100 Block W. Am-
ity. Out to a priority 2 As-
sault. Staged with Scott & 
White Medic at FM 1670 
and Amity until scene was 
code 4. Arrived on scene 
with medic, after scene 
was cleared by Sheriff’s 
Office Scott & White Med-
ic had patient care. Patient 
refused to be transported to 
the hospital.2 units, 3 per-
sonnel.
April 15
 2:57-3:51 a.m., 1000 
Block Wilkinson Ln. Dis-
patched for a lifting assist 
only. Arrived on scene to 
find 87 year old female on 
the ground. Belton Medic 
had patient care and Salado 
assisted getting her back 
on her feet. 1 unit, 1 per-
sonnel.
 6:21-6:31 p.m., Old 
Mill Rd. and Whispering 
Oaks. Out to a trailer on 
fire. Was advised by Cen-
ter that truck had left and 
was not on fire. They ad-
vised FD that it was pos-
sible control burn. 3 units,  
3 personnel. 
 6:50-8:03 p.m., Old 
Mill and Arrowhead. Out 
in reference to a controlled 
burn. Arrived on scene to 
find a burn pile approxi-
mately 20 ft. x 15 ft., with 
no further threats. Made 
contact with caller and ad-

$16  a week 
Put your business card 

here and get a free 
classified each week.

advertising@saladovillagevoice.com 
(254) 947-5321

Salado Volunteer Fire Department 
Report April 11-16
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TexSCAN Week of                 
April 17, 2016

HOME BUSINESS
OPPORTUNITY TO GET PAID DAILY, 
Great Home Business, Please call 
1-832-225-5005 first. Ask about cash 
referral! Joshua 1-903-706-6031, 
Fred 1-469-909-6624, fredcornell@
legalshieldassociate.com, LegalShield, 
Independent Associates 

LaNd aUctION
Auction, Texas Recreational Retreat, 
4/23 • 11 AM, Sweeny, TX, 229± acres, 
170± acres of water acres, Fantastic 
Duck Hunting, United Country - bigInk 
Real Estate, Mark Thomas, Auctioneer 
• Lic #13784

         dRIvERS TN: CDL Drivers-
ATTN: CDL DRIVERS-Avg. $60k+/yr, 

$2k Sign-On Bonus, Family Company 
w/Great Miles, Love Your Job and Your 

Truck,  CDL-A Req- 1-877-258-8782, 
www.drive4melton.com

Drivers-OTR Miles! Paid loaded/Empty on 
Practical miles. volvos/aPUs, 1 year OtR 
Exp. Req. Good Home time/benefits. www.
climateexpress.com or 1-636-584-6073
OWNER OPERATORS ONLY! 80% 
Gross on Flatbed Freight! Home Week-
ends. Permits Provided. File/Pay Fuel 
Taxes. Owner Operators Lease Today! 
cdL-a, 25 yrs., 2 years OtR experience. 
1-870-336-9051

INSURaNcE aGENtS
EARN $500 A DAY: Insurance Agents 
Needed • Leads, No Cold Calls • 
Commissions Paid Daily • Lifetime 
Renewals • Complete Training • Health 
& Dental Insurance • Life License 
Required. Call 1-888-713-6020

ScHOOL/tRaINING
AIRLINE CAREERS begin here - Get 
started training as FAA certified Aviation 
technician. Financial aid for qualified 
students. Job placement assistance. 
aviat ion Inst i tu te of  Maintenance  
1-800-475-4102

PHONE aNd INtERNEt
AT&T U-Verse Internet starting at $15/ 
a month or TV & Internet starting at 
$49/a month for 12 months with 1-year 
agreement.  Call 1-800-425-9081 to learn 
more.RIvERS

REaL EStatE PayMENtS
RECEIVING PAYMENTS from real 
estate you sold? Get Cash now! 
Call  Steve: 1-888-870-2243,www.
SteveCashesNotes.com

MEdIcaL
GOT KNEE PAIN?  Back Pain? Shoulder 
Pain? Get a pain-relieving brace - little or 
NO cost to you. Medicare Patients call 
Health Hotline Now! 1-800-518-0173 

REaL EStatE
10.10 Acres, Duval County. End of 
Road privacy. Behind locked gate. 
Heavy South Texas brush cover, deer, 
hogs, turkey. $1793/down, $297/mo. 
(30-years, 9.9%). 1-866-286-0199. www.
ranchenterprisesltd.com
M o b i l e  H o m e s  w i t h  A c r e a g e . 
Ready to move in. Seller Financing 
(subject to credit approval). Lots 
of room for the price, 3Br 2Ba. No 
renters.1-817-983-7784.
20 Acres $0 Down, Only $128/mo. 
Near El Paso, TX. Owner Financing,          
NO CREDIT CHECKS! Beautiful Views, 
Free Information. 1-877-433-9828, 
LoneStarInvestments.com

Extend your advertising reach with TexSCAN, your Statewide Classified Ad Network.

NOTICE: While most advertisers are reputable, we cannot guarantee products or services advertised. We urge readers to use caution and when in doubt, 
contact the Texas Attorney General at 1-800-621-0508 or the Federal Trade Commission at 1-877-FTC-HELP. The FTC web site is www.ftc.gov/bizop

Run your ad In texScaN!

To Order: Call this Newspaper 
direct, or call texas Press Service 

at 1-800-749-4793 today!

Statewide Ad .................$550
288 Newspapers, 844,050 Circulation

North Region Only .....$250
95 Newspapers, 297,505 Circulation

South Region Only ....$250
101 Newspapers, 366,627 Circulation

West Region Only ......$250
92 Newspapers, 205,950 Circulation

Salado Village Voice 
 (254) 947-5321
to order today

LONE STAR GRADING
& MATERIALS

COMMERCIAL  H  RESIDENTIAL
INDUSTRIAL

EXCAVATION • GRADING • SITE PREPARATION
YARDS • LOT CLEARING • PADS • ROADS

DRIVEWAYS • PARKING LOTS
ALL TYPES DIRT WORK • MATERIALS & HAULING

***FREE ESTIMATES***

(254) 947-0149 or (254) 933-7900
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J & W Lawn Care
Your Complete Lawn Care Service

Let Us Work For You

(254) 760-2439  
Randy Jackson
54 year resident of Salado

(254) 718-5295

Brian Wooley
Cpt. Temple Fire Department

Double J
  Tree
      Service

LOT CLEARING
ACREAGE MOWING

CHIPPING/MULCHING
TREE TRIMMING & REMOVAL

LICENSED SEPTIC SYSTEM INSTALLATION
TRACTOR WORK

24 HR EMERGENCY CALL

W. J. Martone

512-746-2172
Johnnie R. Martone

512-635-4064
No Job too Small

Free estimates

Mike Graf, Applicator                          License #0711115

PREMIER LAWN SPRAYING
Mowing and Trimming Services

- Weed Control
- Turf Disease Management
- Nutritional Programs
- Residential and Commercial

(254) 392-1031

- Mowing and Trimming
- Fire Ant Control
- Licensed and Insured

premierlawnspraying.com

Subscriptions to 

Salado Village Voice

(254) 947-5321

Name: 

Address:

Phone: 

Email: 

Mail payment to Salado Village Voice, 

P.O. Box 587, Salado, TX 76571
 Mastercard       VISA       Discover

Number: 

Expiration Date:    Code: 

Name on Card: 

First Class Mail Delivery includes access to the 
Digital Edition at saladovillagevoice.com

$26 per year in Bell County

$28 per year outside Bell County

$38 per year outside Texas
$20 Online Access Only

PAY ONLINE at 

SaladoVillageVoice.com

WE BUY OIL, GAS & MINERAL RIGHTS
Both non-producing and producing, including
Non-Participating Royalty Interest (NPRI)

Please provide us your desired price 
when you contact us and we will 

evaluate for a possible offer.

Lobo Minerals, LLC
P.O. Box 10906 • Midland, TX 79702

C: 806-620-1422

lobomineralsllc@gmail.com

New Braunfels Area Car Club
Swap Meet & Sunday Car Show

April 22-24, 2016
Comal County Fairgrounds

801 E. Common Street • New Braunfels
www.newbraunfelscarclub.com • No Dogs Please

APRIL 23-24 AT THE BUDA CITY PARK  
IN BUDA, TX (JUST SOUTH OF AUSTIN)

FOR MORE INFO,  
VISIT OUR WEBSITE: 
WWW.BUDALIONS.COM

19TH ANNUAL

BUDA LIONS COUNTRY FAIR 
and WIENER DOG RACES 2016

April 11
 10:46 a.m., Police De-
partment. Suspicious Cir-
cumstance, walk in at the 
Police Department for a 
Red Ford F-150 was go-
ing around trying to sell a 
“TV” and other home elec-
tronics. Left Police Depart-
ment but was unable to lo-
cate.
 9:59 p.m., Police De-
partment. Civil Matter, 
was advised by dispatch to 
call an individual in refer-
ence to a Civil Matter. I 
called individual at phone 
number that was provided 
by dispatch. Individual 
did not answer so I left a 
voice-mail.
 10:58-11:12 p.m., 285 
or 286 Southbound IH 35. 
Agency Assist, dispatched 
to a possible disabled ve-
hicle on Southbound IH-35 
somewhere around the 286 
or 287. I found the vehicle 
at the 287 Southbound. 
The driver had run out of 
gas. I gave him a courtesy 
ride to CEFCO, where he 
bought a gas can and gas. 
I gave him a courtesy ride 
back to his vehicle. The 
driver added the gas to his 
vehicle and was back on 
his way.
April 12
 8:01-8:04 a.m., 1200 
Block Chisholm Trail. 
Alarm Residential, arrived 
all code-4, clear.
 1:25-1:30 p.m., 285 
North I-35. Traffic Con-
trol, call for a vehicle 
broke down on interstate. 
Vehicle’s battery was dead 
and it was jumped off and 
back on road. 
April 13
 8:26 a.m., 1400 Block 
IH-35, North Bound. 
Stalled Vehicle, vehicle 
will not start. Wrecker en 
route.
 11:50-11:59 a.m., 285 
South Bound. Crash, crash 
on IH-35 Southbound with 
a crashed semi blocking 
both lanes of traffic. The 
truck also hit the concrete 
median and pushed it into 
the NB lane of traffic. 
 4:09-4:23 a.m., 285 
NB. Stranded Motorist, 
disabled motorist at the 
285 NB IH-35. The vehicle 
was dead, we managed to 
get it going and they were 
back on road.
 10:56 p.m., 313 N. 
Stagecoach Rd. (Police 
Department). Suicidal 
Subject, flagged down by 
complainant while leaving 
the office. States her son 
is having mental health 
issues. Spoke to patient 
and determined he posed 
a threat to himself and oth-
ers. Patient transported.

April 14
 3:28-3:31 p.m., 1600 
Block Mill Creek. Civil 
Matter, individual wanted 
a check of the location to 
determine if a vehicle was 
there. No vehicles located, 
the location is for sale. No 
answer  on call back.
 11:38 p.m., 1991 N. 
Stagecoach Rd. Agency 
Assist, Home Invasion 
reported in area. Vehicle 
and suspect descriptions 
broadcast. Vehicle match-
ing description observed 
crossing FM 2484 and en-
tering Holiday Inn parking 
lot. Subjects located and 
detained until Sheriff’s 
Office and C.I.D. arrived. 
Subjects transported to jail. 
Report.
April 15
 2:48 p.m., IH-35. Wel-
fare Concern, public ser-
vice. Female advised they 
were going through Salado 
and someone threw some-
thing off the bridge and 
broke their window. Stated 
this occurred 35 minutes 
ago. When asked if she 
saw anyone, she stated no 
they just heard something 
hit the window.
 6:24-6:29 p.m., 1200 
Block Old Mill Rd. Fire, 
trailer reported to be on 
fire. Arrived on scene to 
find a controlled burn in 
progress. SVFD is aware.
 8:22-8:50 p.m., 2300 
Block Chisholm Trail. 
Alarm Residential, false 
alarm.
 10:04-10:16 p.m., 1500 
Block Guess Dr. Miscel-
laneous, medic/chest pain. 
Originally dispatched with 
an address that does not 
exist. Once the address 
was corrected, I arrived on 
scene and marked address 
for SVFD. Clear with Scott 
& White and SVFD.
 10:35-10:50 p.m., N. 

Robertson at FM 2484. 
Welfare Concern, disabled 
motorist. Traveler ran out 
of gas. Fuel obtained and 
she is back on her way.
 11:50-11:51 p.m., 400 
Block Thomas Arnold Rd. 
Suspicious Person, person 
reported to be in the area of 
the old Play Yard. checked 
all businesses, schools and 
streets from Salado Creek 
Rd. down to CEFCO un-
able to locate. Clear.
 10:52-10:53 p.m., 
Brookshire Brothers. 
Alarm Business, arrived 
on scene and found the 
back door by the box 
crusher open, I entered the 
building and found it clear, 
waiting on key holder. Key 
holder secured building.
 10:08 p.m., 1000 Block 
N. IH-35. Crash, dis-
patched in reference to a 
possible crash. Arrived on 
scene and made contact 
and the vehicle was bro-
ken down and they have 
already called a tow truck. 

 6:43 p.m., 285 North 
IH-35. Ill Person, dis-
patched in reference to a 
driver in a maroon Honda 
possibly having a medical 
issue. The vehicle left city 
before I could get to the 
highway.
April 17
 4:11-4:25 p.m., Twelfth 
Green and Chisholm. Sus-
picious Circumstances, 
call for above location for 
a solicitor in the location. 
Attempted to locate indi-
vidual in a black jeep but 
was unable to locate.
 1:26 p.m., 5600 Block 
Hackberry. Agency As-
sist, suicidal subject with a 
weapon. Arrived on scene 
and caller was 96. Clear.
April 17
 4:14-4:16 p.m., Salado. 
Agency Assist, alarm. Ar-
rived on scene and talked 
to the business owner and 
she stated it is weather re-
lated and they will have to 
call the alarm company to 
reset it.

NORTHERN AZ WILDERNESS RANCH
Quiet & secluded 37 acre off grid

ranch bordering 640 acres of State Trust land at cool
clear 6,400’ elevation. Near historic pioneer town &
fishing lake. No urban noise, pure air & AZ’s best
climate. Blend of fragrant mature evergreens & grassy
meadows with sweeping views across surrounding
wilderness mountains and valleys. Abundant clean
groundwater, free well access, loam garden soil &
maintained road access. Camping and RV use ok.
$28,900, $2,890 dn, seller financing. Free brochure with
similar properties, prices, photos / topo map / weather
area info: 

$249 MONTH

800.966.6690
1st United Realty  sierramountainranch.com.

Salado Police Department Incident 

Report April 11-17
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2016 Cadillac SRX Luxury # GS586296 Lease for 39 months, 10,000 miles per year, MSRP $46,635, $1800 lease cash, residual $27981.00, money factor .0008, $1999 due 
at signing excluudes TT&L. 2016 Cadillac CTS # G0120787 Lease for 39 months, 10,000 miles per year, MSRP $50,595, $2000 lease cash, residual $29345.10, money 
factor .00105, $1999 due at signing excludes TT&L Offers good thru 4/31/2016.  All prices plus TT&L. Photos for illustrative purposes only.

2016 SRX LUXURY COLLECTION 

$467 / 39 / $1999
PER MONTH MONTHS

LEASE FOR

5 6 2 5 S .  G e n e r a l  B r u c e D r. 
a t  I 3 5 ,  Te m p l e ,  T X 
( 2 5 4 )  7 7 1- 0 1 2 8 
g a r l y n s h e l t o n . c o m

GARLYN SHELTON 
CADILLAC 

2016 CTS 2.0T SEDAN

$575 / 39 / $1999
PER MONTH MONTHS

LEASE FOR

 The 2016 Parade of 
Homes opens next week-
end and runs for two 
weekends.  Homes will be 
open on Fridays from 6 - 
8 p.m. and Saturdays and 
Sundays from 12 - 5 p.m.  
Tickets are $5 for adults 
and free for children 12 

and under. Tickets may be 
purchased at any home on 
the tour. Tickets are good 
for all 6 days of the Parade 
for unlimited viewing so 
attendees should feel free 
to return to any home on 
tour if they wish. This 
annual tour is the best way 

to view the latest homes 
and the newest communi-
ties throughout our area.
 There are 22 beauti-
ful homes on Parade this 
year from 14 of our area’s 
finest builders ranging 
in size from 1900 square 
feet to over 4000 square 

feet.  This year, featured 
homes range in price from 
$189,000 to over $700,000.  
There is something to see 
for everybody’s needs and 
budget.  If you are not in 
the market for a new home, 
come out anyway. Many 
homes are decorated and 

showcase great ideas and 
the hottest design trends. 
 The official Parade of 
Homes information will be 
available online at www.
tahb.org/parade. Tick-
ets will be sold at every 
Parade home. Homes 
this year are located in 

the Temple, Belton, and 
Salado areas.
 “We are excited about 
this Parade of Homes and 
the assortment of designs 
and styles offered,” said 
Patrick Johnson, President 
of the Temple Area Build-
ers Association. 

Parade of Homes for Temple, Belton, Salado areas held next two weekends


