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Fright Trail begins this weekend: Page 1C

With the drop of hundreds of golf 
balls from the helicopter owned by 
Richard Potts of Paradise Helicop-
ters hovering over the #9 green at 
Mill Creek, the Salado Chamber of 
Commerce annual Golf Tournament 
came to a successful end on Oct. 6. 
The tournament, chaired by Dave Her-
mann, owner of The Range Restaurant, 
had more than 80 players, including 
teams of military players from Fort 
Hood sponsored by local businesses.
(Photo by Royce Wiggin)

	 Salado Education 
Foundation has awarded 
more than $300,000 in 
scholarships to graduating 
Salado High School stu-
dents.
	 The Foundation has 
also awarded more than 
$60,000 in Innovative 
Teaching Grants to Salado 
school teachers.
	 For more than a de-
cade, the Salado Educa-
tion Foundation has sup-
ported higher education 
goals of its students and 

improving local educa-
tion through Innovative 
Teaching Grants to Salado 
school teachers.
	 Chiefly, it is able to do 
so due to the success of its 
annual Salado Cattlemen’s 
Ball, which will be 6:30-
10:30 p.m. Oct. 15 at Ten-
roc Ranch.
	 Last minute tickets of 
$75 per person can be pur-
chased at Salado ISD Ad-
ministration offices, Cen-
tury 21 Bill Bartlett Real 
Estate, Johnny’s Steaks & 

Barbecue and 21 Main.
	 The Cattlemen;s Ball 
will begin at 6:30 p.m. 
Oct. 15 at Tenroc Ranch.
	 Bill Hall will gavel the 
auction, following a ribeye 
steak dinner catered by 
Johnny’s Steaks and Bar-
Be-Que. 
	 Local favorite Freddie 
Fuller Band will enter-
tain the crowd with classic 
country music before the 
gavel drops.

Last chance for tickets
to Cattlemen’s Ball	 There is a Lion/Lioness 

in all of us. On Oct. 15 you 
will be able to “Roar”.   
	 Whether you are com-
peting or cheering for lo-
cal athletes and athletes 
from around the state, you 
will enjoy The Lion Roars 
Track & Field Games Oct. 
15 at Salado High School.
	 Sponsored by the 
Salado Lions Club, the 
Lion Roars Track & Field 
Games will feature some 
of the top competitors in 
senior events.
	 Among those top com-
petitors are Donald Curry 
and Jeff Brower, who are 

ranked third and eighth in 
the nation respectively in 
the men’s 55-59 year old 
Pole Vault. Flay Deats is 
ranked third in the nation 
in that event for 50-54 year 
olds.
	 On the women’s side, 
Jane Hemby is seventh in 
the women’s 50-54 year 
old Pole Vault and Cyndy 
Slovak-Barton is ranked 
seventh in that competi-
tion for women age 55-59.
	 In the discus, Scott Er-
ikson is ranked third in the 
men’s 50-54 age group.
	 Tom Dalke is ranked 
second in the men’s 45-49 

Javelin.
	 There will be athletes 
from the ages of 9 to 90 
who will be competing 
in track events of 60m, 
800m, 100m, 400m, 
1500m 200m and field 
events of Long Jump, High 
Jump, Pole Vault, Shot 
Put, Javelin, Discus, and 
Triple Jump. The games 
will conclude with the ex-
citing 4X100 Relay made 
up of teams that will be 
formed from the compet-
ing athletes.
	 Bring your family and 
friends for this first ever 
event in Salado.

Lions Roar Track & Field
features top competitors

	 Salado aldermen will 
consider David Miller as 
Interim City Manager fol-
lowing an executive ses-
sion 6:30 p.m. Oct. 13. 
The board, after voting in 
Sept. 15 to put city admin-
istrator Kim Foutz on paid 
administrative leave “for 
a period not to exceed 30 
days under terms set by 
the Mayor, in order for the 
Mayor or his designees to 
conduct an investigation 
into complaints against 
the Administrator and to 
determine if the Admin-
istrator’s employment con-
tract should be terminated 
for Good Cause,” voted 
on Oct. 6 to unilaterally 
terminate its employ-
ment agreement with Kim 
Foutz.
	 The vote came on a mo-
tion by alderman Amber 
Preston-Dankert to follow 
the advice and financial 
support of the village in-
surance carriers support-
ing unilateral severance of 
the agreement.
	 While the board voted 
to sever the employment 
agreement, it did not an-
nounce a severance date 
in the motion approved 
by aldermen. Mayor Skip 
Blancett told Salado Vil-

lage Voice that the date of 
severance is Nov. 7. Foutz 
will remain on paid ad-
ministrative leave until the 
date of severance. The Vil-
lage is further obligated 
to a severance amount of 
12 months of the admin-
istrator’s salary current 
($80,000) plus the value 
of any accrued and unused 
vacation and sick/person-
al leave days. Severance 
Benefits include continued 
health insurance benefits 
of $517 per month for up 
to six months provided 
Foutz does not take earlier 
full time employment and 
benefits elsewhere.
	 Finally, according to 
the employment agree-
ment, “In the event of a 
Unilateral Severance, the 
parties agree not to make 
disparaging comments or 
statements about each oth-
er.”
	 In addition to the vote 
to unilaterally severe 
Foutz’ employment in Sal-
ado, the board also voted 
to hire Judy King as an ad-
ministrative assistant.
	 Aldermen will consider 
“any necessary action as 
it relates to the position of 
Interim Village Adminis-
trator” following the ex-

ecutive session Oct. 13.
	 David Miller was the 
Deputy City Manager for 
the City of Bedford, Texas 
from February 2010 to 
February 2015. 
	 He was the City Man-
ager of Forest Hill, Texas 
from April 2006 to De-
cember 2009.
	 He was the City Man-
ager of Kennedale, Texas 
from November 2002 
to April 2006. He was 
the assistant/interim city 
manager there from April 
2002 until he was hired as 
the city manager later that 
year.
	 Miller worked for the 
Town of Trophy Club from 
September 1990 to April 
2002, where he became 
the Director of Public 
Safety.
	 He holds a Bachelor 
of Science in Business 
Administration. He pur-
sues continuing education 
through the Texas Mu-
nicipal League, Texas City 
Managers Association and 
International City Manag-
ers Association. He holds 
a Master Peace Officer 
certification and is a certi-
fied firefighter and certi-
fied emergency medical 
technician.

	 Much of the history 
of Salado is linked to 
Salado Masonic Lodge 
#296. Many of the men 
who founded Salado were 
Masons. 
	 The Masonic Lodge 
will mark its 150th anni-
versary in June 2017.
	 On Oct. 23, it will 
join the more than 1,000 
lodges under the jurisdic-
tion of the Grand Lodge 
of Texas Ancient, Free and 
Accepted Masons in host-
ing an Open House for the 
community.
	 Salado Masonic Lodge 
#296 will open its doors 
to the community 2-4 p.m. 
on Oct. 23. There will 
be representatives of the 
Appendant Bodies, includ-
ing the Shrine, the Scot-
tish Rite, the York Rite 
and the Knights Templar.
	 The following history 
of the lodge is taken from 
the lodge’s program during 
its Century Celebration in 
1967 written by the late 
Charlton E. Johnson.
	 The petitioners for 
Dispensation and Char-
ter were: E. Sterling C. 
Robertson, Harvey Smith, 

W.A. Davis, O.T. Tyler, 
A. Rowland, Robert B. 
Halley, Jno. A. Tyler, F. 
A. Bigelow, N.R. Land, 
H.J. Chamberlain, W.R. 
Karnes, G.W. Wade, M.W. 
Adams, Jno T. Flint, Geo. 
W. McWhirter, Welborn 
Barton, Jas. Tinnin, A. 
Tinnin, and Jesse Raborn.
	 The Minutes of Salado 
Lodge were destroyed in a 
fire about 1883 and we are 
deprived of that source of 
information as to the early 
activities of the Lodge, 
after Dispensation.
	 We may safely assume, 
however, that education 
was one of the principal 
objectives of the Lodge 
and a matter stressed in its 
discussions and proceed-
ings.
	 Thirty-three percent 
of the teachers and sev-
enty-seven percent of the 
Trustees of the College 
were Masons. The found-
ers (of the College), most 
of whom have been found 
to be Masons, also made 
provision in the Deeds of 
purchase of lots to prohibit 
the sale of intoxicating 
beverages by the drink in 

Salado.
	 “It seems,” writes Mrs. 
Felda Shanklin, Salado 
historian, “that most all 
of those early Salado men 
were Masons.”
	 The Charter for Salado 
Masonic Lodge was 
granted by the Grand 
Lodge of Texas on June 13, 
A.D. 1867, and was signed 
by Grand Master John R. 
Freitwell.
	 The first Grand Lodge 
Report of Salado Lodge 
after the granting of a 
Charter shows the fol-
lowing officers: E.S.C. 
Robertson, W.M.; Harvey 
Smith, S.W.; W.A. Davis, 
J.W.; O.T. Tyler, Treas.; W. 
Barton, Sec.; J.W. Tinnin, 
S.D.; I. Raborn, J.D.; R.B. 
Halley, Tiler. This report 
also shows a membership 
of twenty-two M.M. by 
affiliation, one Fellow-
craft, five Enter Appren-
tices, and one Past Master.
	 On the back of a Grand 
Lodge, Report U. D., there 
is this notation: “The 
Lodge Room of Salado 
Lodge is the second story 

Aldermen sever Foutz’ employ, 
consider interim manager

Salado Masonic Lodge 
hosts open house Oct. 23

Visitors swarmed the Bake Sale during the Christmas in October weekend spon-
sored by the Ladies Auxiliary on Oct. 7-8 at The Venue. For more photos, visit 
saladovillagevoice.com (Photo by Royce Wiggin)

See Masonic Lodge, Page 3A
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	 We are in the midst of 
an epic media freakout.
	 It is a subset of a larg-
er liberal panic over Don-
ald Trump’s strength in 
the general election. The 
mood of the center-left is, 
“America, how dare you?” 
The outraged incompre-
hension is seeping into 
and, increasingly, driving 
the coverage of the race.
	 The freakout began a 
few weeks ago when Don-
ald Trump started to close 
the polling gap with Hil-
lary Clinton, and picked 
up intensity as the race 
essentially became a tie. 
The media is going to be 
in a perpetual state of high 
anxiety and dudgeon until 
Election Day.
	 The press is playing 
catch-up. It didn’t take 
much foresight to realize 
that giving Trump $2 bil-
lion worth of free publicity 
in his primary battle might 
help him win his party’s 
nomination. Still, it was all 
fun and games as long as 
the ratings were good and 
Trump trailed Hillary. 
	 Not anymore. There 
have been two seminal 
events in the freakout. 
The first was the absurdly 
over-the-top criticism of 
Matt Lauer for not being 
tough enough on Trump 
at an NBC national-secu-
rity forum. Lauer couldn’t 
have satisfied his critics 
short of slapping Trump in 
the face and demanding, 
“Have you no sense of de-
cency, sir?” 
The second was a New 

The Media Freakout

York Times “news analy-
sis” on Trump’s disavow-
al of birtherism that was 
intended as an exemplary 
act of journalistic aggres-
sion -- a rhetorical assault 
worthy of the poison pen 
of Maureen Dowd that 
led the paper with the ex-
tremely hostile headline, 
“Trump Gives Up a Lie, 
But Refuses to Repent.”
	 Some of the an-
ti-Trumpism in the press 
has been expressed in 
pointless and annoying 
gestures, such as CNN’s 
practice of fact-checking 
Trump’s statements in 
snarky chyrons at the bot-
tom of the screen.
	 More significant-
ly, Lester Holt tilted an-
ti-Trump during the de-
bate. Trump got tougher 
questions than Clinton, 
who was spared queries on 
matters such as the Clin-
ton Foundation and Beng-
hazi. And he fact-checked 
Trump in real time twice, 
arguably getting his cor-
rection of Trump about a 
complex stop-and-frisk 
case wrong. Notably, Holt 
got positive reviews.
	 Trump is indeed a 
different kind of animal 
and has stressed every in-
stitution that has encoun-
tered him over the past 
year, from the Republican 

National Committee to ri-
val campaigns to the press. 
But the current media 
freakout is hard to take, 
and a mistake.
	 One, it is galling, 
since the media is collec-
tively deciding to give up 
on an objectivity that it 
never had. John McCain 
and Mitt Romney, up-
standing, honorable men 
who weren’t allegedly 
threats to the republic, 
were on the receiving end 
of more negative coverage 
than Barack Obama. 
	 Two, it speaks to a 
certain contempt for the 
media’s fellow citizens, 
who are presumed incapa-
ble of rationally evaluating 
the candidates without its 
thumb on the scale.
	 Three, if Trump loses, 
the press will go right back 
to its pose of objectivity. 
Whereas the only good 
thing about the media’s 
current jag is that it might 
represent movement to-
ward a more British-style 
(and traditional Amer-
ican-style) journalism, 
with outlets forthrightly 
acknowledging their parti-
san allegiances.
	 Nothing is going to 
dissuade the press from 
its current course, though. 
There is no reasoning with 
fear and loathing.

Rich Lowry is editor of the 
National Review.
(c) 2016 by King Features 
Synd., Inc.

By Sam Pizzigati
	
	 The United States, any-
one could reasonably ar-
gue, has the most accom-
plished elite athletes in the 
world. The best evidence? 
In Rio this past summer, 
young American men and 
women finished at a com-
fortable first place in the 
Olympic final medal tally.
	 But what if we com-
pared nations on the fit-
ness of average young peo-
ple, not elite athletes? How 
would the United States 
stack up then?
	 Not too well, concludes 
a global study just pub-
lished in the British Jour-
nal of Sports Medicine. 
This new research — con-
ducted by a team of aca-
demics from Canada, the 
United States, and Austra-
lia — looked at the fitness 
levels of 1.1 million young 
people aged 9 to 17, from 
50 different nations.
	 In this competition, 
young people in the United 
States didn’t finish first. 
They finished an appalling 
47th out of 50.
	 “If all the kids in the 
world were to line up for 
a race,” report author Dr. 
Grant Tomkinson summed 
up, “the average American 
child would finish at the 
foot of the field.”
	 How could the Unit-
ed States, a nation that 
prides itself on nurturing 
Olympic champions, have 
an overall population of 
young people so unfit?
	 The new study doesn’t 
answer that question di-
rectly. But it does make a 
fascinating connection. In 
nations with smaller gaps 
between rich and poor, 

young people show higher 
levels of fitness.
	 Income inequality, as 
the study puts it, appears 
to be a “strong structural 
determinant of health” in 
children and youth.
	 This linkage won’t sur-
prise anyone who’s been 
following research on in-
equality. In recent years, 
investigators have detailed 
that people in societies 
with lower levels of in-
equality live longer than 
people in nations with 
high inequality, like the 
United States.
	 Residents of more equal 
nations also trust each oth-
er more, bully each other 
less, and enjoy better men-
tal health.
	 But why should social 
indecency and ill health 
thrive in unequal places? 
And, more pointedly, what 
explains the link between 
inequality and youth fit-
ness?
	 No one knows for sure, 
but analysts have some 
ideas.
	 Some lean toward a 
fiscal explanation. In un-
equal nations, they point 
out, wealth and political 
power tend to concentrate 
in the hands of an awe-
somely affluent few. These 
privileged individuals 
typically don’t use public 
services and often resent 
having to pay taxes to help 
fund them.
	 In deeply unequal na-
tions, this combination of 
political power and resent-
ment ends up generating 
government budgets that 
gut public services the rich 
seldom use — everything 
from public parks to pub-
lic education.
	 Amid the resulting 

fiscal austerity, public 
parks start closing. Public 
schools start charging par-
ents hefty fees if their kids 
want to play school sports.
	 As a result, fewer kids 
get to play and exercise. 
A top-heavy distribution 
of wealth translates, in ef-
fect, into less-active child-
hoods.
	 Other analysts take a 
more physical approach 
and focus on the stress 
that inequality inevitably 
generates. This ongoing 
stress pounds relentlessly 
on our immune systems. 
And the things we take for 
relief from that pounding 
— drugs or sugar-packed 
snacks, for instance — 
typically leave us less fit.
	 Both these fiscal and 
physical explanations have 
merit. And both help us 
understand the importance 
of doing all that we can to 
reduce inequality.
	 If we want to see all 
kids have the chance to 
become champions in life, 
we’ll need to start adopt-
ing, as the authors of the 
new global fitness study 
conclude, “policies aimed 
at reducing the gap be-
tween rich and poor.”
	 Veteran labor journal-
ist and Institute for Policy 
Studies associate fellow 
Sam Pizzigati edits Too 
Much, a newsletter on ex-
cess and inequality. Sam 
Pizzigati, an Institute for 
Policy Studies associate 
fellow, co-edits Inequality.
org. His latest book is The 
Rich Don’t Always Win: 
The Forgotten Triumph 
over Plutocracy that Cre-
ated the American Middle 
Class, 1900-1970. 

	 For 16 hours, this last 
weekend was phenomenal! 
	 10 a.m.  Christmas in 
October opened with a 
host of people stream-
ing through.  The Ladies 
Auxiliary greeted, smiled, 
assisted vendors, modeled 
clothes, and sold bake 
goods.  The vendors were 
pleased.  It was a grand 
day!
	 10 a.m. Salado Histor-
ical Society dedicated a 
Texas Historical Marker 
in honor of Alice Gray 
Hamblin.  David Yielding, 
Historian, told how Alice 
Gray Hamblin and her 
husband, William, opened 
their home for children to 
enjoy the benefits of qual-
ity education.  The Salado 
Civic Center is the site of 
the Hamblin Home.
	 10 a.m. Keep Salado 
Beautiful Yard and Gar-
den Tour.  Joyce and CR 
Pennington, Nancy and 
Owen Messenger, Alice 
and George Romfh, Shir-

ley and Bill Pinkston, and 
Mickey and Linda Rawls 
presented beautiful, ele-
gant gardens.  Addition-
ally, Salado Library, St. 
Joseph’s Episcopal, Green 
Bridge, Sirena, Collgeg 
Park, and SUMC Historic 
Chapel displayed beautiful 
gardens.  
	 2 p.m.. The first prac-
tice of Christmas Carol,  
Shannon Ashe, Director, 
was held.  Under the Oc-
tober sun, the actors per-
formed with the promise 
of a great performance 
December 2,3,9, and 10.
	 5 p.m.. Gary Gibbs, 
Executive Director, Texas 
Commission on the Arts, 

presented The Salado Art 
and Cultural District Des-
ignation from the State of 
Texas.  Salado is among 35 
Texas locations to receive 
the designation.  As Mr. 
Gibbs read, “The Salado 
Art and Cultural District 
demonstrates that culture, 
the sum total of every-
thing that shapes the way 
of life in a town, can lead 
to transformation, revital-
ization, economic devel-
opment and a better, more 
vibrant community.”  This 
is a most coveted award.
	 Sunday, 9 Oct, 3 p.m. 
The Central Texas Area 
Museum and the Institute 
for the Humanities host-
ed Ron Coley, filmmaker, 
underwater photographer, 
and innovator of SCUBA 
equipment.  His presenta-
tion depicted the world of 
water and its relationship 
to humankind.  
	  Thank you for a great 
weekend! 

Eventful weekend in Salado

Why Our Kids Are Coming 
in Last Place
global research links income inequality to the poor fitness of America’s youth.
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You should see this...

of a stone building twenty 
by forty feet.” These fig-
ures are the same dimen-
sions as those of one wing 
of the Salado College 
building and there seems 
to be no doubt that the 
College and the Lodge 
were using the same build-
ing in those early days 
- an arrangement that is 
not surprising, since both 
had similar objectives and 
both had the same man, 
E. Sterling Robertson, as 
their highest official.
	 Later, Salado Lodge 
secured an interest in the 
title to the upper story 
of the Baptist Church 

in Salado, and for many 
years met in a Lodge 
room on the second floor 
of the church building. In 
a church rebuilding and 
enlargement program, 
the question came up as 

to how to dispose of the 
interest of the Lodge in the 
old building. This prob-
lem was solved by liter-
ally sawing off the upper 
half of the building and 
moving it to, and setting it 

Masonic Lodge FROM Page 1A
up as a Lodge room a short 
distance away on some 
land donated to the Lodge 
by Bro. Charlton E. John-
son, Past Master of Salado 
Masonic Lodge.

Benjamin Guenther performs, Michael Pritchett paints and Public 
Arts League of Salado president Jill Shipman accepts a proclama-
tion from Texas Commission on the Arts executive director Gary 
Gibbs declaring the Village of Salado as a Cultural Arts District. 
Public Arts League of Salado sponsored a reception on Oct. 8 at 
the Sculpture Garden around the announcement. 
(Photos by Marilyn Fleischer)

Salado Historical Society dedicated a new Texas 
State State Historic Commission historical marker 
on Oct. 8 on the grounds of the Salado Civic Center. 
Shown above are (from left) Joy Aiken, a descendent 
of the Aiken family in Salado, Susan Carroll, who 
wrote the script for the marker, Dr. James Haney, 
Sandi Wicker, president of the Salado Historical 
Society and Dr. David Yeilding, who gave the presen-
tation.The marker commemorates the life of Alice Joy 
Gray Hamblem. “After moving to Salado about 1869, 
the Hamblens added significantly to the develop-
ment of the community where William worked as a 
farmer, minister and trusteee of Salado College. The 
family boarded students even though their home 
was brimming with their own large family. IN 1924, in 
keeping with the family’s strong support for educa-
tion, Alice donated the Hamblen homestead so that 
the land could be used to build a well-poisitioned 
public school.  (Photo by Marilyn Fleischer)

The Central Texas Area Museum, in conjunction with 
the Institute for the Humanities Salado, hostedre-
nowned speaker Ron Coley Oct. 9 at the museum’s 
event hall. Coley is shown above with Coleman Hamp-
ton, curator of the museum, and Jane Wilmer, widow 
of Institute founder Harry Wilmer.  (Courtesy photo)



Page 4A  SALADO Village Voice, October 6, 2016

Lobby
 Mon - Fri  9 a.m. - 3 p.m.

Drive-in
 Mon - Thur 

7:30 a.m. - 4 p.m. 
 Fri 

7:30 a.m. - 5:30 p.m.
Sat  

9 a.m.- noon

Member FDIC

Main Street at 
Thomas Arnold Road, Salado

(254) 947-5852 

fsbcentex.com 

Community LifeCommunity Life

SALADO CLEANERS
Laundry • Dry Cleaning • Alterations

1209 N. Stagecoach
(Next to the Library)

254-947-7299

Wash & Fold
7 a.m. - 7 p.m. Mon - Fri • 7 a.m. - 3 p.m. Sat

Leslie White 
Escrow Officer

First Community Title
40 N. Main Street 

254-947-8480 (f)254-947-9480 
www.fcttx.com 

or find us on facebook

213 Mill Creek Dr., #140

Liz Armstrong
Salado Branch Manager

Escrow Officer

liz.armstrong@monteithtitle.com

(254) 947-3922
fax (254) 947-8632

www.monteithtitle.com

You Have a Choice™
Home owned and operated since 1876.

The Mortgage You Need - The Service You Expect
• Competitive Rates
• Fixed and Adjustable Rate Mortgage Loans
• Conventional, FHA, VA & USDA Financing
• Mortgages for Home Owners and Investors
• Home Equity Loans

Lorraine Basham, Sr. Loan Officer
Registered Mortgage Loan Orginator
NMLS #415114

CALL TODAY FOR YOUR 
FREE MORTGAGE CONSULTATION

(254) 760-0534 cell
(254) 947-3454 office

40 North Main, Suite C, Salado, TX
lorraineb@fairwaymc.com

All loans subject to credit approval

Copyright©2016 Fairway Independent Mortgage Corporation. NMLS#2289. 4801 S. Biltmore Lane, Madison, WI 
53718, 1-877-699-0353. All rights reserved. This is not an offer to enter into an agreement. Not all customers will 
qualify. Information, rates and programs are subject to change without notice. All products are subject to credit and 
property approval. Other restrictions and limitations may apply. Equal Housing Lender. 

Salado Montessori 
Preschool

Meet and Greet

Join us at 4 p.m.
October 15

Salado Wine Seller
841 N Main Street

Learn about Montessori
Meet with a Montessori Rep

Children’s Area Available

for more information contact
alissa_chere@yahoo.com

(817) 690-3744

	 The 11th Annual Cen-
tral Texas Turkey Trot; 5K 
and 10K timed race “The 
Fastest Trot in Town”    
will take place 	 8 a.m.  
Nov. 19. at Brazos Park 
East,  2000 Martin Luther 
King Dr.  Waco. Random 
Cash Drawing!  Cash priz-
es for the first place male 
and female runner in each 
age category in both the 
5K and 10K race.  Lots of 
door prizes.   Plus  First 
place gets a turkey;  Sec-
ond place gets a pumpkin 
pie; and Third place gets 

a gift card to one of two 
restaurants.  
	 Altrusa of the Brazos 
is part of an international 
service organization.  Lo-
cal clubs respond to needs 
that they identify in the 
community.  Altrusa of the 
Brazos was moved by the 
plight of the 1,500 home-
less students in Waco ISD 
(the largest school district 
in McLennan County), to 
do everything they could 
to help the homeless stu-
dents be successful in 
school.

Texas Turkey Trot to help 
homeless students in Waco

	 Aging expert Dr. Bill 
Thomas and musical guest 
Nate Silas Richardson of-
fer an entertaining and 
highly disruptive explora-
tion of aging at the Waco 
Hippodrome Theater 
(724 Austin Ave) 2:30 - 
4:30 p.m. and 7-8:30 p.m. 
Wednesday, Nov. 16 as 
part of The Age of Disrup-
tion Tour.
	 The Age of Disruption 
2016 Tour is a modern day 
American Chautauqua 
movement barnstorming 

the country in a rock n’ 
roll tour bus to bring com-
munities a new and highly 
disruptive understanding 
of aging.
	 Created by Dr. Bill 
Thomas, one of the most 
innovative and creative 
thinkers working in med-
icine today, the Tour 
brings a radical new ap-
proach  and conversation 
to growth and aging. 
	 The 2016 tour features 
Disrupt Dementia, a com-
munity-based workshop, 

and Dr. Thomas’ signa-
ture “non-fiction theater” 
performance, Life’s Most 
Dangerous Game, featur-
ing the unconventional 
pairing of a physician (Dr. 
Thomas) and a musician, 
Nate Silas Richardson.
	 Disrupt Dementia Ag-
ing Workshop, 2:30- 4:30 
p.m. -- An exclusive docu-
mentary by the director of 
Alive Inside, followed by 
a community engagement 
workshop designed for 
people living with demen-
tia and care partners.
	 Aging Life’s Most Dan-
gerous Game – Theatre 
Performance, 7-8:30 p.m. 
Dr. Thomas’ signature 
“non-fiction” theatrical 
performance features orig-
inal music, storytelling, 
poetry and groundbreak-
ing insights on aging and 
care. Featuring musical 
guest Nate Silas Richard-
son.
	 You can purchase tick-
ets at https://drbillthomas.
org/local/waco-tx/. Tick-
et Information: $20 per 
show; $40 for both.

The Center for Growing and Becoming 
presents Age of Disruption Tour
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Dr. Travis Burleson, Senior Pastor
WEDNESDAY

5 p.m.  Fellowship Meal
5:30 p.m. Jr. High Midweek
6 p.m.  FBC-U (Adult Bible Studies)
6 p.m. ESL
6 p.m.  AWANAS (Age 3 - 6)
6 p.m.  Bible Drill (Grade 4 – 6)
7 p.m. Worship Choir Rehearsal
7:15 p.m. High School Midweek

www.fbcsalado.org
(254) 947-5465

Main St. at the Creek

SUNDAY

8:30 a.m. Early Worship Service
9:45 a.m. Small Group Bible Study
11 a.m.     Late Worship Service

....serving those who love and remember

(254) 947-0066
949 West Village Road, Salado

BroeckerFuneralHome.com

Dossman 
Funeral Home

2525 N. Main • Belton • 933-2525
“In Service to our fellow man...”

I urge, then, first of all, that requests, prayers, intercession 
and thanksgiving be made for everyone - for kings and all 
those in authority, that we may live peaceful and quiet lives 
in all godliness and holiness.

				    1 Timothy 2:1,2

  

IH-35 at Blacksmith Rd.
947-5241 

Sunday
Bible Classes • 9 a.m.      Worship • 10 a.m.

Spanish Worship - Call Church for times

Wednesday
Bible Classes • 6:30 p.m.

The Salado Church of Christ
‘Shaped by His Cross, Sharing His 

truth, Showing His love.’ 

 “We invite you to worship 
with us at any available 
opportunity. You will find 
a group of sincere, God-
loving and Christ-exalting 
people, who will make you 
feel at home with our church 
family.    
  -Joe Keyes, minister

St. Joseph’s 
Episcopal Church

881 North Main Street
947-3160

S t J o s e p h S a l a d o . o rg

Sunday School
Sun. • 9:30 a.m.

Holy Eucharist
Sun. • 11 a.m.

St. Stephen
Catholic 
Church

Mass Schedule
Tuesday - 6 p.m. 

Wed & Thurs - 8:30 a.m.
Friday - Noon

Saturday - 5:30 p.m.
Confesssions 4:30-5:15 p.m. 

or call for an appointment
Friday

Adoration (Holy Hour) 11 a.m.
Sunday

 (English) 9 a.m.
(Spanish) 11 a.m. 

Office Hours: Monday - Friday 
9 a.m. - Noon & 1:30 - 3 p.m.

601 FM 2268 
947-8037

www.saintstephenchurch.org

Religious Education
 Classes - Wednesday

 K thru 12th            5:30 - 8 p.m. 

Visit 
SaladoVillageVoice.com

Rev. Lara Whitley Franklin, Pastor
 650 Royal Street    
  (254) 947-5482

www.saladoumc.org 

Office hours:  
Mon - Fri 8:30 a.m. - 4 p.m.
Facebook.com/saladoumc

Sunday, October 16
9 am Worship service in Worship Center Traditional
10 am Sunday School All Ages
11:15 am Worship Service in Chapel Contempory

Wednesday, October 19
5:15 pm  Fellowship Meal
6 pm Adult Book Study “Parables”
6 - 7 pm   Adult Ramp project
6 - 7 pm  M & M Kids 
6 - 7:30 pm  “FourTwelve” Youth in the YAC

5798 FM 2484   
(254) 947-5917

GraceBCSalado.org

Mon 10 a.m.      Women’s Bible Study
Tues 7 a.m.  Men’s Bible Study

Wed 6:30 p.m. 
Adult Bible Study, Prayer and Mission Friends

Youth: RAs and GAs and Upstairs Ministry

Pastor Jason Goings

You’re invited to our 
10 a.m. Sunday Worship

Come as you are!

Small group bible studies follow worship

16258 Gooseneck Road,  Salado

(254) 947-7211    
www.3ccowboyfellowship.org

Follow our events on our website calendar

October 30
5th Sunday Pot Luck

following the 11 a.m. servie 

The Salado Ladies Auxiliary 

genuinely thanks everyone who 

contributed in various ways to 

help make our 

2016 CHRISTMAS IN OCTOBER 

event a huge success. 

We truly appreciate your 

continued support!

	 Tom Hughes, a member 
of the Bell County His-
torical Commission and 
member of the MAJ White 
SCV Chapter, will speak 
on the topic of the historic 
Bell County Courthouse 
during the Bell County 
Genealogical Society 6:30 
p.m. Oct. 18 at the McLane 
Room in the third floor of 

the Temple Public Library.
	 At the Library, take 
the elevator to the third 
floor and  walk down hall-
way to the McLane Room 
(take hallway to the right 
after exiting elevator and 

continue down hallway to 
large glass doors).
	 For more information 
about the Bell County Ge-
nealogical Society, visit 
www.txbcgs.org.

Bell County Courthouse discussed 
at Genealogical meeting Oct. 18

	 The University of Mary 
Hardin Baylor Opera Cru, 
a children’s opera, will 
perform Goldie B. Locks 
and the Three Singing 
Bears at the Cultural Ac-
tivities Centers Oct. 25-
26 for area 3-5th graders. 
These performances will 
be part of the CAC’s Arts 
in Education outreach 

program. All shows tradi-
tionally take place at 9:30 
a.m., 10:30 a.m., and 12:30 
p.m. on the dates assigned.
Tickets are available to the 
public for $3; reservations 
are required in advance by 
calling the CAC 254-773-
9926. The Cultural Activ-
ities Center is located at 
3011 N. 3rd St in Temple. 

For more information on 
upcoming events, enter-
tainment, and classes visit 
cacARTS.org.
	 The performance of 
Goldie B. Locks and the 
Three Singing Bears is 
written by John Davies, 
directed by UMHB’s Di-
rector of Opera and Mu-
sical Theatre, George 
Hogan. The Cultural Ac-

tivities Center holds Arts 
in Education programs 
for ages K-8 grade and 
serves over 9,000 area 
students each year.  The 
2016-2017 Arts-in-Educa-
tion includes future per-
formances 3rd-5th grades, 
“Internet Safety, Jan. 10 
-11, at the CAC, with a 
Belton performance on 
Jan. 12 and for K-2 “Trou-
ble on the Double” by Pol-
lyanna Theatre on Nov. 8 
- 9, as well as “Character 
Counts” a magician show 
on Feb. 14-15. There is 
also a performance that 
follows at Belton High 
School’s campus on Feb. 
16. There is also one more 
fall Middle School per-
formance on Nov. 1, 2 by 
Mark Shelton.   
 	

UMHB’s Opera Cru brings Goldie B. Locks 
and the Three Singing Bears to the CAC



Page 6A  SALADO Village Voice, October 13, 2016

2016 Cadillac CTS stk# H0142881 Lease $495/Month for 36 months MSRP 53,375, $1900 CCR, Residual $29,356.25, 
Money Factor .000175, $5337 Down Excludes 1st Month Payment, Taxes and Fees, 10Ka year. 2017 Cadillac XT5 
stk#HZ159838 Lease $449/Month for 36 MSRP $47,685, $1700 CCR, Residual $26,703.60, Money Factor .00008, $3995 
Down Excludes 1st Month Payment, Taxes and Fees. 10yr miles 2016 Cadillac CT6 stk#HU130578 Lease $619/Month 
for 36 months MSRP $62,610, $2200 CCR, Residual $34,435.50, Money Factor .0001, $4,590 Down Excludes 1st Month 
Payment, Taxes and Fees, 10K a year. 10K a year Good thru October 31, 2016. Photos for illustrative purposes only.

2017 CTS RWD 2.0T Lux

$495 / 36 
PER MONTH MONTHS

LEASE FOR

5 6 2 5 S .  G e n e r a l  B r u c e D r.  a t  I 3 5 ,  Te m p l e ,  T X 
( 2 5 4)  7 7 1- 0 1 2 8 
g a r l y n s h e l t o n . c o m

GARLYN SHELTON CADILLAC 

GARLYN SHELTON CADILLAC

2017 CT6 Luxury RWD

$619 / 36 
PER MONTH MONTHS

LEASE FOR

2017 XT5 Luxury RWD

$449 / 36
PER MONTH MONTHS

LEASE FOR

(254) 727-5700          #hechoenqueso 

Homemade Mexican Fusion
Available for events & catering

Every Friday 4-10 p.m. 
at Barrow Brewing Co on Royal Street

Follow us on Facebook & Instagram for our current location

   S
aturday

  October 22

9 am - 4
 pm

           Salado High School
        1880 Williams Rd., Salado, TX

Homemade Decor., Wreaths, Gifts, Crafts, 
Candles, Fall Decor., 
Food, Silent Auction and 

Much More! 

        Salado Class of 2020

  Fall Extravaganza

  Vendors Welcome
                   Vendor Applications available 
                                      by emailing 

saladoclassof2020@gmail.com

8398 Interstate 35 Frontage Road, Belton         (254) 947-8349

Need your counter-tops 
re-sealed and/or polished?  

We do that!

Political ad paid for by Olga Bradley, 8841 Brewer Land, Salado, TX 76571 
and not authorized by any candidate or candidate’s committee.

MCCA board would like to say thanks:
To all who attended our annual picnic on Saturday

To MCCC for the use of Sherrill Park
To the SVFD, Police Dept, and Medi Evac for your support

To Brookshire Bros. for hotdogs and buns
To Sams Club for the gift certificate

To the village for use of tables and chairs
To our “chefs”

To Ace Pest Control for getting rid of the ants
For the awesome music by Tanner Newman

To God for such wonderful weather

www.devereauxjewelers.com

	 The Gov. Samuel 
Mathews Colonial Dames 
XVII Century Chap-
ter will meet 10:30 a.m. 
Saturday, October 15, at 
the Grace Presbyterian 
Church, 2401 South 57th 
Street, Temple.
  Jane Debenport will pres-
ent the program, “Coats of 
Arms.”
	 The Gov. Samuel 
Mathews CDXVIIC Chap-
ter will have an assigned 
table at the 16th Annu-
al Genealogy Lock-In, 
Friday, October 21. This 
workshop  will be held at 
the West Waco Library 
and Genealogy Center.  	
	 For more  information 
call  254-750-5945.

Colonial Dames 
meet in Temple 
Oct. 15

By Elisha Smith, elishas@cfra.
org, Center for Rural Affairs  
	 Sadly, many school 
aged children do not know 
where their food comes 
from. In fact neither do 
many adults. According 
to a survey commissioned 
by the U.S Farmers and 
Ranchers Alliance, 72% of 
consumers know nothing 
or very little about farm-
ing or ranching.
 	 But Farm to School 
Programs are trying to 
change that. Thirty mil-
lion kids eat school lunch 
every day. More than 
42,000 schools partici-
pate nationwide in Farm to 
School initiatives reaching 

an estimated 23.6 million 
children.  
 	 October is National 
Farm to School Month, a 
time to recognize the im-
portance of farm to school 
as a means to improve 
child nutrition, support 
local economies, and ed-
ucate communities about 
the origins of their food.
 	 “Farm to School” refers 
to schools serving local, 
farm-fresh foods ranging 
from fruits and vegetable 
to honey and meat.  These 
programs enrich the con-
nection communities have 
with fresh, healthy food 
and local food producers 

by changing food purchas-
ing and educatrrion prac-
tices at schools. Students 
gain access to healthy, 
local foods as well as ed-
ucation opportunities such 
as school gardens, cook-
ing lessons and farm field 
trips.
 	 The 2016 National 
Farm to School Month 
theme, One Small Step, 
highlights simple ways 
anyone can get informed, 
get involved and take ac-
tion to advance farm to 
school in their own com-
munities and across the 
country. Learn more at 
farmtoschool.org.  

Celebrate National Farm to 
School Month in October

	 October has arrived at 
last, and with it thoughts 
turn to cooler days and 
fall colors, whether it is in 
home décor or the clothes 
you choose to wear.  And 
it just in time for the 21st 

annual Salado United 
Methodist Church Gar-
den Guild Style Show 
and Luncheon scheduled 
for Nov. 5. Fashions will 
be provided by Christi’s, 
Elizabeth’s, Magnolias of 
Salado, and Susan Marie’s.  
These shops will also 
present  the latest jewelry 
and accessories.
	 You are invited to  join 
in the days activities to be 
held at the Salado United 
Methodist Church, 650 
Royal Street. A lunch cre-
ated by the Garden Guild 
Ladies will begin at 12:30  
accompanied by music 
and song by Elaine Gar-
cia.	
	 Following at 1 p.m.the 
fashion show will begin.  
“Just a few clues I over-
heard are: Velvet is going 
to be great this season.  
Not just for holiday but for 
everyday.   Dress it up for 
evening or wear for day-
time as well.” says Bobbie 
Carroll.
	 “Along with a rich co-
gnac brown we will be 
seeing a lot of jewel tones 
such as garnet, ruby and 
sapphire.  Accessories too, 
will include really big, 
bright jewel tone pieces. 
Long range hint: Navy is 
going to be really big for 

spring 2017.”
	 “Embroidery and em-
broidered sweater knit is 
big, and our all time fa-
vorite denim is still with 
us.  Also still around, are 
long tunics, but short tops 
will be in vogue, as well.  
There are leggings and 

there are palazzio pants, 
there are short, short skirts 
and long skirts, take your 
choice!  Whether it is 
oversized or embroidered 
it’s all about the details.             
Nice thing is, it’s the year 
to wear what you like and 
what looks best on you!” 
	  Tickets are $25.   For 
more information call 947-
5482.        

Mark your calendar for the SUMC Garden 
Guild Style show and luncheon Nov. 5

Local model from the 
2015  fashion show is 
Deborah Roberson. 
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One Call Does It All
(254) 933-7400

www.cars-collision.com

1914 S. IH 35, Belton

Cliff Coleman, owner

Paint & Body • Frame Repair • Hail Repair
FREE ESTIMATES              INSURANCE CLAIMS WELCOME

Vintage 
Vinyl 

available
at Sofi’s

across from 
Stagecoach

401 South Main 

Colorist
Hairstylist 

Jenny Wiggin Potter 

Keratin Treatments
Dreamcatchers Extensions

(254) 534-3169

Expressions  774-9751
3126 South 31st Street   across from HEB in Temple

Brookshire Brothers
floral department  947-8922

Fall Look Bouquets

& Fall Decor

	 Salado Eagles will host 
the Lorena Leopards, both 
of which are tied for first 
place in District 9-4A with 
Robinson, at 7:30 p.m. 
Oct. 14.
	 The Eagles are on a 
four-game win streak after 
going on the road to beat 
Fairfield 21-14 last week. 
	 Lorena blew past the 
2-4 Mexia Blackcats 42-14 
to improve to 3-3 on the 
year.
	 Meanwhile, Robinson 
traveled to Connally to 
breeze past the 3-3 Cadets 
49-29 to improve to 5-1 on 
the year.
	 Mexia travels to Con-
nally while the Rockets 
host Fairfield this week.
	 The Leopards are led 
by senior quarterback Cole 
Baker, who has thrown for 
920 yards so far this sea-
son. His favorite targets 
are Jacob Spivey, who has 
407 yards on 20 catches 
and a touchdown.
	 Junior Thorr Hoffman 
leads Lorena with 408 
yards on the ground.

	 Salado scored touch-
downs in the second, third 
and fourth quarters to beat 
the Fairfield Eagles at 
home Oct. 7.
	 The Eagles offense 
pounded out 300 yards on 
the ground. Meanwhile 
quarterback Haire con-
nected twice with Aaron 
Torczynski on two passes 
for 14 yards in the air.
	 Two Salado runners got 
past the 100 yard mark. 
Trey Sheppard had 137 
yards on 25 touches. Tor-
czynski had 104 yards on 
23 carries. Jake Harvey 
added another 49 yards on 
10 carries and Jake Elliot 
had 10 yards on three car-
ries for the Eagles.
	 Salado marked 23 first 
downs in the pound and 
ground game.
	 Salado drew first blood 
with a five yard TD run by 
Torczynski a with 9:29 left 
in the first half. The PAT 
failed. 

	 With 5:22 left in the 
half, Fairfield scored on 
a 32 yard run by Zac Bar-
low, who led the team with 
71 yards on nine carries. 
He also threw for 98 yards 
and a touchdown of 14-of-
24 passing and an inter-
ception late in the game by 
Cutter Hudgens that sealed 
the win.
	 Salado took the lead in 
the third on a 1 yard dive 
by Torczynski with 5:24 
left. Tate Harvey ran in 
the two-point try to give 
Salado a 14-7 lead.
	 The Eagles added to 
the lead with 4:47 left in 
the game on a 15 yard run 
by Sheppard. Jake Walrath 
kicked the extra point for a 
21-7 lead.
	 Barlow connected with 
senior Nic Mooneyham 
for a five yard touchdown 
with 3:40 left in the game. 
Erick Rodriguez Reyes 
kicked the extra point to 
bring the score to 21-14.
		

Eagles notch district win
Tate Hill (33) and Andrew Sniggs (57) converge on Fairfield’s Nick Mooneyham. 
(Photo by Ron Leguin)

Aaron Torczynski bulls into the endzone for Salado. 
(Photo by Ron LeGuin)
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Therapeutic Massage
Stress Management & 
Healthy Lifestyle

Linda Pritchard-Egg, RN, LMT
254.947.HAND (4263)
101 N. Main St. Salado
(next door to The Range)
handlmt@gmail.com

Full schedule at saladoyoga.com

560 North Main #8

Salado Yoga 
and Wellness

• Yoga
• Massage Therapy
• Raindrop Therapy
• Reflexology
• Elite Personal Training
• Metabolic Testing
• Anti Inflammatory
   Nutrition Plans
• Hypno Therapy

 (254) 791-9440

rain
Chiropractic 
& Wellness

Allyn Crain, DC
Wellness Consultant & Chiropractor

947-2225

Keeping Salado Healthy

Joining our team: 
Massage Therapists

418 N Main St #5 
next to Salado Creek Winery

Your home for 
chiropractic care, 
massage therapy, 

acupuncture 
and holistic care

Jennifer Hulme and Sandy Hankins

24 HOUR HEALTH CLUB

(254) 947-1063        213 Mill Creek Drive #155

Fall into Fall
Personal Training 

Specials Available
Fitness Classes Included

Personal Training Available
24 Hour Access

Activity & Diet Tracking Apps

Massage Therapy
The Remedy

113 N. Stagecoach Rd. Suite 5

Call (254) 624-7912
to schedule your therapeutic massage

Do you suffer from 
Headaches? Migranes? 
We’ve Got The Remedy!

Libby Nichols
MT044934

TheRemedySalado.com

Stop by. We’d love to meet you.
815 North Stagecoach Road
Salado, Texas 76571
Phone: 254-947-8636
HorizonBankTexas.com

T E X A S - B A S E D .
I N D E P E N D E N T L Y  O W N E D .  
I N D I V I D U A L L Y  D E D I C A T E D .

The banking services your business calls for, 
from a bank you can call your neighbor.

601 FM 2268 East of  Wildfire Arena
saintstephenchurch.org

October 16

Food Served 10:30 a.m. - 1p.m.
BBQ - Mexican Food - Snow Cones - Hamburger - Hotdog - Frito Pie - Nachos
Silent Auction   Cake Walk   Classic Car Show 
Live Music    Spanish Dancers   Games  Raffle

Live Auction at 1 p.m.

U8 Girls Recreational Team 
Princess Kitties
(from left) Addison Turner, Assistant Coach Jessie 
Ventimiglia, Katie Rich, Emily Steigerwalt, Isabella 
Harris, Sophia Patton, Addilee Harris and Coach Dan-
iel Steigerwalt. (Photo by Joanna Steigerwalt)

U8 Boys Recreation Soccer 
Team Troublemakers
(From left) Brody Rosamond, Carter Oldham, Weston 
Sauceda, Luke Harrell and Blaine Zuckero. Not pic-
tured: Jack Carpenter and Bo Zanowiak.
(Courtesy Photo)

	 The Salado Class of 
2020 invites you to its  
Fall Extravaganza (Arts 
& Crafts Fair) on Oct. 22 
at the Salado High School 
cafeteria and practice gym. 
The event will feature fan-
tastic vendors from 9 a.m. 
to 4 p.m.  
	 There will also be a 
silent auction, a bake sale 
and other concessions.
	 This will be a chance to 
get some early Christmas 

shopping done and sup-
port the Salado High Class 
of 2020.	
	 Among the items you 
can find will be holiday 
and seasonal wreaths, 
gifts, crafts, candles and 
fall decor.
	 If you or your business 
would like to be a vendor 
for the Fall Extravaganza, 
send an email to salado 
classof2020@gmail.com 
to learn details. 

SHS Class of 2020 sets 
Fall Extravaganza

	 Salado cross country 
teams got a good look at 
the district when they ran 
in the Lampasas Meet on 
Oct. 6. 
	 The varsity boys scored 
183 points to place sixth in 
the field of 15 teams from 
1A to 4A.
	 Hunter Haas led the 
boys with his 21st place 
finish on a time of 18:19.7. 
Also scoring for Salado 

were Luke Markham, 
25th, 18:32.4; Horacia 
Huerta, 38th, 19:15.7; Seth 
Neal, 45th, 19:31.6 and 
Manual Magadan, 54th, 
20:23.7. Also runnign for 
the Eagles were Hank 
Miller, 21:16.4; Ryan Tr-
enholm, 22:34.4 and Ryan 
Cook, 22:48.8.
	 The varsity girls placed 
eighth in a field of 15 
teams with an overall 

score of 243.
	 Catalina Langlitz led 
the girls, placing 22nd 
with a time of 13:25.7 on 
the two mile course. Also 
scoring for the girls were 
Taylor Rich, 49th, 14:19.0; 
Ansley Flowers, 51st, 
14:21.9; Regina Deen, 
58th, 14:31.2 and Katie 
Kendall, 63rd, 14:54.2. 
Also running were Rebec-
ca Gonzales, 15:11.7 and 
Annie Ewton, 15:36.9.
	 The junior varsity girls 
placed fifth, scoring 156 
points.  Natale McBryde 
placed 18th with a time 
of 15:08.6. Other JV girls 
scoring for Salado were 
Erin McBryde, 30th, 
15:44.3; Olivia Sula, 33rd, 
16:25.7; Cassidy Brown, 
37th, 17:00.9; Reagan 
Morreale, 38th, 17:01.6. 
Also running were Cuy-
ler Aycock, 17:13.7, Jes-
sie Laverdiere, 17:55.1 
and Maritza Villafranco, 
19:10.0.

	 Salado Junior High 
Boys Cross Country Team 
placed second in the Lam-
pasas Meet Oct. 6.

	 Logan Rickey, third, 
12:49; Chris Ortiz, sixth, 
12:58; Trey Graham, tenth, 
13:16; Dustin Wilson, 
17th, 14:13; Isaac Huerta, 
18th, 14:13; Adan Giral, 
19th, 14:24; William Won, 
20th, 14:25; Aaron Trela, 
21st, 14:30; Colin Wilson, 
25th, 14:57; Juaquin Tobi-
as, 26th, 15:01; Sam Gist; 
28th, 15:23; Ross Vincent; 
32nd, 16:27.
	 Salado Junior High 
Girls Cross Country won 
the Lampasas Meet Oct. 6.
	 Jaci McGregor, first, 
12:46; Avery Fossum, 
seventh, 14:27; Kimber-
ly Kendall, 11th, 14:45; 
Savannah Piche’, 16th, 
15:16; Preslee Webb, 22nd, 
15:38; Eishen Young, 27th, 
15:51; Morgan Mays, 31st, 
16:09; Lily Lougheed, 
33rd, 16:13; Hannah 
White, 46th, 16:58; Gia 
Price, 49th, 17:03; Anne 
Marie Gilmore, 50th, 
17:04; Lindsey Neas, 51st, 
17:06; Laura Willingham, 
70th, 19:05; Emma Grant, 
78th, 20:19; Bailey Piche’, 
82nd, 21:03; McKenzie 
Hawkins, 85th, 22:16.

The Salado FC ‘02 Div II boys team is pictured after 
their 2-1 victory over Lonestar on Oct. 8: (front row, 
from left) Dustin Wilson, Caleb Sirmon, Drew Bird, 
Nader Smien and William Won; (back row, from left) 
Avery Womack, Nicholas Lemus, Chris Ortiz, Juaquin 
Tobias, Matthew Taylor, Sam Gist, and Trip Mitchell. 
(Courtesy photo)

XC squads run in Lampasas to get ready for district
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Douglas B. Willingham, D.D.S.

(254) 947-5242
Main and Thomas Arnold Road

www.saladodentistry.com

Get Straighter, Whiter 
Teeth, Without Removing 

Healthy Tooth Structure

A 
Life-Changing 

Smile 
is in 

Your Future

Starbucks Coffee Company
Brooke May, Mngr. 

(254) 933-2179
Coffee, Pastries 

and more

200 N IH35               Belton

Digital Rewards

200 N IH35               
Belton

Brooke May, Mgr. 
(254) 933-2179

Digital Rewards  |  Wifi  |  Drive-Thru

World’s Largest #StarbucksDate
2 p.m. - close     February 13 

Fun surprises. Special pairings menu.
Sparks of love.

starbucks.com

LASTOVICA
Fine Jewelers, Inc.

“Known for Service” 
Prompt In-Store Jewelry Repairs 

Diamond Sales • Custom Casting • Diamond 
Appraisal • Watch Repair • Diamond Setting 

Jewelry Repair
1202 S 31st St. & Ave. L • Temple

773-5772

WE BUY SCRAP GOLD & SILVER

Texas Coin Connection
108 E FM2410, Suite G  -  Harker Heights

Buy       Sell      Trade
Gold, Silver, Coins, Currency & Jewelry

(254) 699-2646
Locally Owned - Salado Resident

Salado Junior Basketball League
Registration begins Oct. 3

Forms Due Oct. 17
Pick up forms at Thomas Arnold Elementary

or Salado Intermediate School
Playdays for the season will be Oct. 24 & 25

  All Salado Youth grades 1 thru 6.

   Contact: Kristi Maedgen   913-5037
  Scott Mescher    913-5542
  Jodee Preston  718-0240

Animal Medical Salado
Full Service Vet Hospital        

saladovet.com

(254) 947-8800
Dr. Lindsay Quirk-Fultz                    Dr. Linda Quirk

October 16 - 22 is 
National Veterinary Technician Week

Thank  you, veterinary technicians, 
for all you do!

  JD's Grill
OPEN Daily for Breakfast & Lunch        6 a.m. - 2 p.m.

inside 
JD's Travel Center

15881 South IH 35 
in Salado 

Breakfast Special
2 Eggs, Hashbrowns,

Bacon or Sausage,
and Toast or Biscuit

$399

Lunch Special
Burger, Fries

and a 16 oz Drink
Hamburger $519

Cheeseburger $569

Take I35 Exit South 283 or North 282

(254) 947-5228 NEW 2 U 
RESALE SHOP

inside JD's Travel Center

Furniture  |  Home Decor
Collectables

	 Salado Lady Eagles 
split their district games 
last week, losing to Llano 
in four sets on Oct. 4 and 
sweeping Lampasas on 
Oct. 7.
		  1	 2	 3	 4	 5	 F
SHS	 25	 18	16	 17	 --	 1
LHS	 20	25	25	 25	 --	 3
	 The Lady Eagles lost 
on the road to the Llano 
Lady Jackets Oct. 4. After 
winning the first set, the 
Lady Eagles lost the next 
three.
	 Salado had 12 aces in 
the match, led by Katie 
Robinson and Natalie Fort 
with four each. Also scor-
ing aces were Brettney 
Fuller, Kerrigan Hearne, 
Lindy Martin and Mikaela 
Heiner, one each.
	 Victoria DeKay led the 
girls in attacking the net 
with 17 kills. Also record-
ing kills were Robinson, 
10, Mariah Vaillancourt, 
four, Brianna Washington 
and Jamie Rich, two each 
and Martin, one.
	 Vaillancourt blocked 
three shots while Wash-
ington and Martin blocked 
one each.
	 Martin led the girls 
with 24 assists followed by 
Fuller’s 12 assists.
		  1	 2	 3	 4	 5	 F
SHS	 25	 25	25	 --	 --	 3
LHS	 11	 13	12	 --	 --	 0
	 Salado swept Lampa-
sas in easy fashion Oct. 7, 
seemingly scoring at will.
	 The girls had 17 aces 
with Robinson scoring six 
of them. Also scoring aces 
were Fuller, Heiner and 
Natalie Fort, two each and 

Hearne, one.
	 The Lady Eagles had 27 
kills in the match, spread 
among six players. Rob-
inson led the squad with 
nine, followed by DeKay, 
eight, Rich and Martin, 
three each,  and Washing-
ton and Vaillancourt, two 
each.
	 Vaillancourt blocked 
two shots while Rich and 
Washington blocked one 
each.
	 Hearne led the defense 
with six digs. Fort had five 
digs, followed by Fuller 
and Martin, three each, 
Robinson and Heiner, two 
each and Rich, one.
	 Martin had 15 assists 
and Fuller had 11.

Eagles JV	 20
Fairfield JV	 19
	 Salado Junior Varsity 
Eagles edged Fairfield 20-
19 on Oct. 6 to improve to 
5-1 on the year and 1-0 in 
district play.
	 Wesley Quinn scored in 
the first quarter on a three 
yard run. The two-point 
try failed. 
	 Fairfield also scored in 
the first quarter, but con-
verted the kick for a 7-6 
lead.
	 Salado took the lead 
in the second quarter on 
a Brandon McEndree two 
yard run. Quinn ran the 
ball in for a two-point con-
version.
	 The Eagles held a nar-
row 14-13 lead at the half.
	 Samuel Brown scored 
in the third quarter on a 14 
yard run, but the two-point 
conversion run failed.
	 Fairfield added a touch-
down in the fourth, but 
couldn’t convert the extra 
point, giving Salado the 
20-19 win.
	 Quinn, Barrett Schoen-
rock, Bryce McEndree and 
Ryan Starritt led the of-
fense.
	 Hunter Bales, Tommie 
Barker, Gordy Wilson, 
Clayton Zak and Nicholas 
Deen led the defense.
	 “This was a great de-
fensive game played by 
the team,” Coach Troy 
Ramsey said. “The team 
is showing great effort and 
enjoying playing together.”
Eagles 9th	 6
Fairfield 9th	 8
	 Salado ninth grade Ea-
gles lost to Fairfield 6-8 on 
Oct. 6 due to a failed two-
point conversion.
	 Jacob Markham caught 
16 yard pass from Caleb 

Self for a touchdown in the 
first quarter, but the two-
point conversion failed.
	 The Eagles defense 
held Fairfield scoreless 
until the fourth quarter. 
Fairfield converted the 
two-point try for the 8-6 
win.
	 Hunter Pannell and 
Brian Chavez led the de-
fensive effort for Salado.
	 “The kids played tough 
for all four quarters,” 
Coach Scott Ringo said.
	 The ninth graders are 
4-2 on the year and 0-1 in 
district play.
8th A		  14
Fairfield	 6
	 Salado eighth grade A 
team beat Fairfield A team 
14-6 on Oct. 6 to improve 
to 4-1 on the year.
	 Wrook Brown scored 
on a one yard dive in the 
first quarter. He ran a two-

point conversion for an 8-0 
lead.
	 Brown threw a 50 yard 
pass to Kole Maedgen dur-
ing the second quarter for 
the longest TD pass in dis-
trict. The PAT failed.
	 Fairfield scored a 
touchdown in the third 
quarter but the point-after 
failed.
	 Brown led the offense.
	 Payton Miller and La-
Trelle Jenkins led the de-
fense. 
7th A		  14
Fairfield	 0
	 Salado seventh graders 
are 5-0 on the year after 
shutting out the Fairfield 
seventh grade A team 14-0 
on Oct. 6.
	 Blake Volk scored on a 
12 yard run in the fourth 
quarter to give Salado a 
6-0 edge.
	 Nolan Williams scored 

on a 15 yard run, followed 
by a two-point conversion 
by Volk for the 14-0 lead.
	 Volk led the offense 
while Hutton Haire led the 
defense.
SJH B Team	 12
Fairfield B 	 14
	 The combined B teams 
of Salado lost to Fairfield 
in a game that was decided 
by an extra point. 
	 Both teams scored a 
touchdown in the first 
quarter, but neither team 
converted the point-after.
	 Wesley Hernandez 
scored on a 35 yard run in 
the first quarter for Sala-
do.
	 Hernandez  also scored 
on a 30 yard run in the 
fourth quarter, but the PAT 
failed.
	 Fairfield converted its 
point-after on the touch-
down they scored in the 
fourth quarter for the win. 

Eagles under-varsity vs. Fairfield

By Abbie James

Salado Youth Leadership

	 At the F.R.I.E.N.D.S. 
Resilience training for 
teens in Fort Hood, Salado 
Youth Leadership learned 
about key characteristics 
on being a team player. 	
	 The students learned 
the ins and outs about re-
silience and how to use it 
in their lives. They were 

reminded that when life 
is not going the way you 
planned to stay optimistic. 
	 The students then got 
to go through many real 
life experiences that a sol-
dier goes through every 
day. During situations that 
arose the student leaders 
had to stay positive and 
work with their team to 
remain resilient just as a 
soldier would.

Natalie Fort digs a shot for Salado. (Photo by Tim Fleischer)

SHS youth leaders
train for resilience

Salado Youth Leadership: (Front row, from left) Su-
perintendent Michael Novotny, Andrew Novotny, Ben 
Sunshine, Emaly Vrooman, Katelyn Seymour, Abbie 
James, Maddie Krustchinsky, and Kenzie Pardon; 
(top) Hunter Howton and Piper Randolph.

Victoria DeKay and Mariah Vaillancourt block a shot. (Photo by Tim Fleischer)

Visit saladovillage 
voice.com for photo 
galleries of volleyball 
and football games.

Lady Eagles split Llano, Lampasas



Tues - Fri  8 a.m. - 6 p.m.
Walk-Ins Accepted    Appointments Honored

The Haire Shop
Barber - Beauty - Body

213 Mill Creek Dr., Suite 160

Tammy  (254) 760-1990

PHYSICAL THERAPY • SPEECH THERAPY • PELVIC HEALTH 
OCCUPATIONAL THERAPY  •  IN-HOME SKILLED NURSING 

Multiple Locations  |  www.IntegrityRehab.net  | 254.699.3933    

Ace
Pest and Lawn

Locally Owned and Operated 
Licensed by the Structural Pest Control Board TPCL #12512

Customer 
Satisfaction 
Guaranteed

Free Estimates 947-4222

860 N. Main 
254-947-5050

c21bb.com

Good Luck from your ‘Home’ Team

Please call for an appointment (254) 947-3309
1325 N. Stagecoach Road

Your time is valuable! Save a trip and time. 

Come learn & grow with us 

947-1153
6 weeks to 12 years

Christian Environment
TSR Certified Preschool

Age appropriate Curriculum
All ages Drop off & Pick up@Salado ISD

The
 Play Yard

Two Salado Locations
15299 S IH 35 | Thomas Arnold Road

Preschool Infant Center

SALADO

Member 
FDIC

Go !  Eagles  Go!
We stand behind our home town teams
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WT

Co
mputer Services

Walt’s PC Repair
    & Gaming Zone

walt@walttollefson.com

Walt Tollefson, 
Owner     

Mark Peterson, 
Manager

Let us sell your 
stuff on

(254) 291-6354

SALADO PLAZA suite #135a
Mon - Fri 9 - 5 | Sat noon - 3

2016 Cross Country Schedule
August 19 	 Temple Lions Park		  Canceled
August 27 	 Moody
September 2 	 Temple Pro-Fit Timing 		  Boys 3rd, Girls 4th
September 10 	 Liberty Hill			   Boys 4th, Girls 6th
September 15 	 Gatesville				  
September 22 	 Salado Tenroc Ranch Invitational	 Boys 3rd, Girls 3rd
October 1 	 McNeil Varsity Old Settlers Park
October 1 	 McGregor JV
October 6 	 Lampasas High School		  Boys 5th Girls 8th
October 12 	 District Meet: Lampasas H.S.
October 29 	 Regional Meet: Huntsville
November 5	 State Meet Round Rock
Boys Coach: Michael Goos
Girls Coach: Corey Baird

Salado Varsity Football
Date	 Opponent			   Time
08/13	 Leander Glenn Scrimmage	 TBA
08/18	 Jarrell Scrimmage at home	 TBA
08/26	 Troy at UMHB Field		  3-15 L
09/02	 @ Comfort			   0-20 L
09/09	 Hyde Park			   28-9 W
09/16	 @ Florence			   38-8 W
09/23	 Austin St. Dominic (Homecoming)	42-17 W
09/30	 OPEN WEEK
10/07	 @ Fairfield*			   21-14 W
10/14	 Lorena*				   7:30 p.m.
10/21	 @ Mexia*			   7:30 p.m.
10/28	 @ Robinson			   7:30 p.m.
11/04	 Connally			   7:30 p.m.

Salado JV Football
Date	 Opponent			   Time
08/13	 Leander Glenn Scrimmage	 TBA
08/18	 Jarrell Scrimmage at home	 TBA
08/25	 @ Troy				    8-0 W
09/01	 Comfort				   28-0 W
09/08	 @ Hyde Park			   8-15 L
09/15	 Florence				   30-0 W
09/22	 @ Austin St. Dominic		  22-7 W
09/29	 OPEN WEEK
10/06	 Fairfield*			   20-19 W
10/13	 @ Lorena*			   6:30 p.m.
10/20	 Mexia*				    6:30 p.m.
10/27	 Robinson			   6:30 p.m.
11/03	 @ Connally			   6:30 p.m.

Salado Freshman Football
Date	 Opponent			   Time
08/13	 Leander Glenn Scrimmage	 TBA
08/18	 Jarrell Scrimmage at home	 TBA
08/25	 @ Troy				    2-28 L
09/01	 No Game
09/08	 Taylor Freshmen			   42-0 W
09/15	 Taylor				    30-0 W
09/22	 @ Leander Glenn		  24-0 W
09/29	 @ Belton			   60-0 W
10/06	 Fairfield*			   6-8 L
10/13	 @ Lorena*			   5:00 p.m.
10/20	 Mexia*				    5:00 p.m.
10/27	 Robinson			   5:00 p.m.
11/03	 @ Connally			   5:00 p.m.

Salado Jr. High Football
Date	 Opponent		  Time
09/08	 @ Smithville		  4:30/5:15/6:00/7:00
09/15	 @ Florence		  TBA
09/22	 Jarrell			   5:00/5:45/7:00
09/29	 McGregor		  4:30/5:15/6:00/7:00
10/06	 @ Fairfield* 8th 14-8W, 7th 14-0W, B 8-6L
10/13	 Lorena*			  4:30/5:15/6:00/7:00
10/20	 @ Mexia*		  4:30/5:15/6:00/7:00
10/27	 @ Robinson		  4:30/5:15/6:00/7:00
11/03	 Connally		  4:30/5:15/6:00/7:00

* Denotes District 9-4A Games

Salado Eagle Head Football Coach Alan Haire

Salado Athletic Director Paul Baird; Salado ISD Sup’t Dr. Michael Novotny

Salado High School Principal Ross Sproul; Salado Junior High Principal Marvin Rainwater

Varsity Volleyball
Date	 Opponent	 Time
8/8	 Troy	 3-0 W
8/12&13	Wimberly Silver Winner
		  Hamshire-Fannett	 2-0W
		  Lockhart	 1-2 L
		  Laredo-United	 2-0 W
		  Marion	 2-0 W
		  Burnet	 2-1 W
		  Caddo Mills	 2-1 W
8/16	 @ Ellison	 2-3 L 
8/18&20	Gatesville: 3rd Place
		  Rogers	 0-2 L
		  Temple	 2-0 W
		  McGregor	 2-0 W
		  Waco	 2-0 W
		  Belton	 2-1 W
8/19	 Belton	
8/23	 Harker Heights	 6 p.m.
8/25&27	Groesbeck Silver 2nd
		  Franklin	 0-2 L
		  Live Oak	 2-1 W
		  Elgin	 2-0 W
		  West	 2-0 W
		  Huffman	 0-2 L
8/26	 Rogers	 2-3 L
8/30	 Jarrell	 3-1 W	
9/2	 @ Academy	 1-3 W	
9/6	 @ Killeen	 1-2 L
9/9	 Llano*	 3-1 W
9/13	 @ Lampasas*	 3-0 W
9/16	 Glenn*	 3-1 W
9/20	 @ Burnet*	 1-3 L
9/23	 Liberty Hill*	 0-3 L
9/27	 @ Taylor	 3-1 W
10/4	 @ Llano*	 1-3 L
10/7	 Lampasas*	 3-0 W
10/11	 @ Glenn*	 6 p.m.
10/14	 Burnet*	 6 p.m.
10/18	 @ Liberty Hill*	 6 p.m.
10/21	 Taylor	 6 p.m.

JV Volleyball
Date	 Opponent	 Time
8/8	 Troy	
8/16	 @ Ellison	
8/23	 Harker Heights	 5 p.m.
8/26	 Rogers	 4:30
8/30	 Jarrell	 5 p.m.
9/2	 @ Academy	 4:30
9/6	 @ Killeen	 5 p.m.
9/8&10	 Salado JV Tourney	TBA
9/9	 Llano*	 5 p.m.
9/13	 @ Lampasas*	 5 p.m.
9/16	 Glenn*	 5 p.m.
9/20	 @ Burnet*	 5 p.m.
9/23	 Liberty Hill*	 6 p.m.
9/27	 @ Taylor	 5 p.m.
10/4	 @ Llano*	 5 p.m.
10/7	 Lampasas*	 5 p.m.
10/11	 @ Glenn*	 5 p.m.
10/14	 Burnet*	 5 p.m.
10/18	 @ Liberty Hill*	 5 p.m.
10/21	 Taylor	 5 p.m.

Freshman Volleyball
Date	 Opponent	 Time
8/8	 Troy	
8/16	 @ Ellison	
8/23	 Harker Heights	 5 p.m.
8/26	 Rogers	 4:30
8/30	 Jarrell	 5 p.m.
9/2	 @ Academy	 4:30
9/6	 @ Killeen	 5 p.m.
9/8&10	 Salado JV Tourney	TBA
9/9	 Llano*	 5 p.m.
9/13	 @ Lampasas*	 5 p.m.
9/16	 Glenn*	 5 p.m.
9/20	 @ Burnet*	 5 p.m.
9/23	 Liberty Hill*	 6 p.m.
9/27	 @ Taylor	 5 p.m.
10/4	 @ Llano*	 5 p.m.
10/7	 Lampasas*	 5 p.m.
10/11	 @ Glenn*	 5 p.m.
10/14	 Burnet*	 5 p.m.
10/18	 @ Liberty Hill*	 5 p.m.
10/21	 Taylor	 5 p.m.

Front, from left) Hannah Humphrey, #7 Piper Randolph, #21 Breigh Oliver, #9 Charity Pryor, #2 Hannah Reavis, 
#5 Catalena Langlitz, #14 Bailey Lomas; (Back, from left) Grace Graham, #4 Allison Brinkman, #10 Christin 
Wilson, #3 Emaly Vrooman, #24 Maddie Wade, #11 Erin Faske, #1 Jamie Rich. (photo by Tim Fleischer)

Head Volleyball Coach: Heather Shannon

Assistant Coaches: Diane Konarik, Kory Craddick and Mirah Wilcox.

2016 Lady Eagles Volleyball

2016 Freshmen Lady Eagles

727 S. Main Street, Belton

Sh el l e ysautosal es . n et

T e x a s  F r i e n d ly
E a g l e  P r o u d

Now Accepting New Patients

Kevin R. DeLane, DDS
orthodontist

Ortho@CenTexSmiles.com
facebook.com/CenTexSmilesOrtho

485 Thomas Arnold Road

(254) 947-4011

	 Salado High School 
Student Council is host-
ing a Pink Week to raise 
awareness and funds for 
Cancer research.  Clubs 
that are participating in 
this week’s events include 
the school’s Art Club sell-
ing pink bandanas, the As-
tra Club selling pink tat-
toos, Volleyball pre-sold 
tee shirts and the National 

Honor Society is selling 
pink lemonade at Friday 
night’s football game.  The 
cheerleaders and Student 
Council are sponsoring 
a survivor walk Oct. 14. 
Anyone who has survived 
cancer or wants to walk in 
honor of a cancer patient 
can meet at the football 
field at 7:00 p.m. to walk 
one lap around the track. 

Pink Week activities
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THERANGERESTAURANT.COM

a fresh 
TAKE ON LUNCH

FRIDAYS        SATURDAYS

11:30 a.m.- 2:30 p.m.

at the range
101 MAIN salado

 254.947.3828

G

''

 1109 W. Village Rd, Salado (behind Sonic)                            

Monday thru Saturday         10 a.m. to 9 p.m.

Liquor Store

(254) 947-7117

A Refreshing Splash of Flavor
We carry a fine selection of infused and flavored spirits

THURS - SAT 10 - 5 SUN 12 - 5 MON 10 - 5
CLOSED TUES & WED       947-3355

751 Stagecoach Road  I-35 frontage road North
Clean Restrooms

SALADO ANTIQUE MALL
and Bee’s Antiques

Thousands of Antiques, Collectibles and Primitives
 in a unique and inviting atmosphere

The Original Salado Market Days
9-5 on the 2nd weekend - Don’t miss Nov. 12 - 13

Alexander’s
Distillery

Book Your 
Holiday Party 

Today

spaces for large 
and small groups 

ALEXANDER'S DISTILLERY DOES CATERING
602 Center Circle       (254) 947-5554

Salado’s Tablerock 
Walking Trail will be 
magically transformed 
into a Fright Trail on Oct. 
15, 22 and 29.  From dusk 
(6:30 p.m.) ‘till the ap-
proach of the witching 
hour (9:30 p.m.) Goblins 
will extract a $3 fee from 
children and a $5 fee from 
big children for a walk 
on the spectral side of 
Tablerock.  

 The Bell County Sher-

iff’s Posse will direct traf-
fic, actors will guide and  
enlighten you with facts 
about respective authors 
as they lead you to scenes 
from Macbeth, The Invis-
ible Man, Dracula, Fran-
kenstein, The Mummy’s 
Curse, Phantom of the 
Opera, Boo Radley from 
To Kill a Mockingbird, an 
excerpt from Edgar Allen 
Poe by Thom the World 
Poet from Australia,  and 

more of America’s most 
treasured classics.   One 
section of the trail will 
portray Alice in Wonder-
land, Billy Goat Gruff and 
the Troll who guards the 
bridge, Dorothy and the 
Wicked Witch VS Glenda 
the Good Witch, elves and 
blithe spirits.  Actors will 
enact scenes from chosen 
classical tales of terror 
and from Grimm’s Fairy 
Tales to entertain and edu-
cate both the young and 
the young at heart.  Again 
this year Andy Anderson, 
Chief Meteorologist for 
channel 6, will portray 
The Headless Horseman.  

 Snacks and drinks will 
be available at the conces-
sion stand to refresh you.  
Smelling salts will be on 
hand for the weak of heart.  
Tablerock Trail is located 
in Salado at 409 Royal 
Street, three blocks east 
of down town.  Students 
earn Community Service 
hours for their volunteer 
service to Tablerock Am-
phitheater.  For more in-
formation, call Tablerock 
at (254) 947-9205 or e-
mail tablerock1@aol.
com.  Click MAP on the 
Tablerock web site (www.
tablerock.org) for direc-
tions to Tablerock’s Fright 
Trail. 

Tablerock Fright Trail brings classic scares to life

The Headless Horseman

	 C J Harbuz, owner of 
Angelic Herbs and Certi-
fied IN.FORM Coach in-
vites you join the IN.FORM 
Journey to Living Well. 
	 “Like anything else I 
have recommended in my 
20 years of offering natural 
health options in Salado, I 
use the products and pro-
grams I offer benefiting 
from the results while I 
share with others,” Harbuz 
said. “Being a part of the 
recently completed 13 week 
journey I coached, I have 

removed over 20 lbs and 
reversed over 20 years off 
metabolic age as a side ef-
fect of being on a program 
scientifically proven to re-
verse metabolic disorders.”
 	 Harbuz says that 
IN.FORM is not a “healthy 
bubble” way of life. “It is 
preparing people to live 
and flourish in any food 
environment they encoun-
ter,” she added. “Choos-
ing the healthiest options 
when eating out, planning 
and cooking nourishing 

foods at home throughout 
the week, enjoying food at 
celebration in moderation 
and re-creating family fa-
vorites. It offers alteration 
not deprivation to flourish 
for life.”
 	 To learn more about 
how IN.FORM works and 
how participants are expe-
riencing results, Harbuz in-
vites you to come to a free 
Introductory Program 5:15-
6:15 p.m. Oct. 18 at Angelic 
Herbs.

Join the IN.FORM Journey

	 Integrity Rehab + 
Home Health will host a 
family friendly outdoor 
movie night 7 - 9 p.m. Nov. 
12 at Tablerock Amphithe-
ater. 	
	 Arrive early for games, 
prizes, and concessions.  
To miss this event would 
be truly inconceivable!
	 The community is in-
vited to join Integrity 
Rehab + Home Health at 
Tablerock to watch the 
family favorite The Prin-

cess Bride 
	 The Princess Bride is 
a classic tale of adventure, 
pirates, miracles, and true 
love.  The 1987 film fea-
tures Cary Elwes, Man-
dy Patinkin and Robin 
Wright and is directed by  
Rob Reiner.  
	 To reserve your free 
ticket for the event go 
to IntegrityMovieNight.
EventBrite.com or call 
(254) 699-3933 x112.

Integrity Rehab sponsors Free Outdoor Movie Night

The Princess Bride stars Cary Elwes and Robin Wright.

 The First Annual Keep Salado 
Beautiful Yard and Garden Tour was 
a success; the weather was perfect, 
the gardens were spectacular and our 
visitors were enchanted. We cannot 
thank our Homeowners enough for 

the time and care that they gave to preparing their gardens 
for the Tour:   
Nancy and Owen Messenger, Joyce and CR Pennington, Shirley 
and Bill Pinkston, Linda and Micky Rawls, and Alice and George 
Romfh. The KSB Board and Garden Tour Committee was tireless, 
but special thanks goes to Margaret Williamson, Vickie Kelly, 
GeorgeAnn Valentine, Miriam Jordan, Lisa Nix, and Yvonne Lane. 
An “Above and Beyond Award” goes to Joyce Pennington!! 
Our Village sponsors make our work possible and we es-
pecially appreciate the help from First State Bank and the 
Salado Village Voice.  
Our partnerships with Salado Ladies Auxiliary and PALS are 
further examples of how our Village works together to get 
things done!
Thank you to all that attended; we’ll let you know when the 
date is set for the second annual Garden Tour.

Susan Terry
KSB Chair
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Village of Salado Calendar of Events
Thru Nov. 3
	 Early Voting for the 
General Election at 
Salado Civic Center. 
October 13
	  Salado ISD Flu Vac-
cine Clinic, Preregistra-
tion was required 
October 13
	 Watch D.O.G.S. Pizza 
Night, 6 - 7:15 at Salado 
Intermediate School. 
October 13
	 Estate Planning 
hosted by Ken Reynolds, 
6 p.m. at Holiday Inn 
Express
October 14
	 Salado ISD Noon 
Release
October 14 
	 Salt Creek Revival, 
8 - 11 p.m. at Chupaca-
bra Craft Beer & Salado 
Lone Star Winery
October 15
	 Smokin’ Sneakers 
Run, 1/2 marathon and 
5K to benefit Salado Vol-
unteer Fire Department. 
info: active.com
October 15
	 The Lions Roar 
Track and Field Games

October 15
	 Asanas & Ales, 9:30 - 
11 a.m. at Barrow Brew-
ing Company
October 15
	 Mixed Media Can-
vas Class, 10:30 a.m. at 
Stamp Salado. $30 info: 
stampsaladotexas.com
October 15
	 Gift Giving Galore 
Sewing Kit and Purse 
Class, 1:30 p.m. at 
Stamp Salado. $28 info: 
stampsaladotexas.com
October 15
	 Paul Cox, 7 p.m. at 
The Range
October 15 
	 Brian Bell, 9 p.m. - 
midnight at Chupacabra 
Craft Beer & Salado 
Lone Star Winery
Oct.  15, 22 & 29
	 Tablerock’s Fright 
Trail,  6:30 - 9 p.m. info: 
(254) 947-9205
October 16
	 St. Stephen Catholic 
Church Fall Fest, food 
10:30 a.m. - 1 p.m. and 
Live auction at 1 p.m., 
car show, cake walk, live 
music info: saintstephen-
church.org

October 16
	 Sunday Afternoon 
Live Music, 3 - 5 p.m. at 
Barrow Brewing Compa-
ny. info: barrowbrewing.
com
October 18
	 Beer and Bratwurst 
Ribbon Cutting, 5 - 6:30 
p.m. at Arts & Leisure
October 18
	 N.FORM free intro-
ductory program, 5:15 
- 6:15 p.m. at Angelic 
Herbs
October 20
	 Pint Night and Octo-
berfest Music, 6 p.m. - 
midnight at Chupacabra 
Craft Beer & Salado 
Lone Star Winery
October 18
	 Bell County Genea-
logical Society Meet-
ing, 6:30 - 8 p.m. at the 
McLane Room, 3rd floor, 
Temple Public Library, 
100 West Adams Avenue. 
Topic: The historic Bell 
County Courthouse by 
Tom Hughes. Public 
welcome to attend.
October 20
	 The Priest’s Pint, 
6:30 - 8 p.m. at Barrow 
Brewing Company

October 21 - 23
	 Ultra 520K Texas 
Race info: ultra502k-
texas.com
October 21
	 Wes Perryman and 
John Napier, 7 - 9 p.m. at 
Barrow Brewing Compa-
ny info: barrowbrewing.
com
October 21 
	 Smoking Maxx 
Carter, 8 - 11 p.m. at 
Chupacabra Craft Beer 
& Salado Lone Star 
Winery
October 22
	 Fall Extravaganza 
arts and craft sale to 
benefit SHS class of 2020
October 22
	 Using Cosmic Gilding 
Flakes Class, 10:30 a.m. 
at Stamp Salado. $28 
info: stampsaladotexas.
com
October 22
	 “Treat” Yourself To 
Some Candy Class, 1:30 
p.m. at Stamp Salado. 
$28 info: stampsalado-
texas.com
October 22
	 October Pub Crawl, 
6 - 10 p.m. across Salado. 
info: salado.com
October 22
	 Joe Berg, 7 p.m. at 
The Range
October 22
	 BenJamin, 7 p.m. on 
the Patio at The Range
October 22
	 Justin Bravo and the 
Kind, 7 - 9 p.m. at Bar-
row Brewing Company 
info: barrowbrewing.
com
Oct. 22, 28, 29
	 Salado Ghost Walk, 
8 p.m. Take a lantern-
lit stroll down Salado’s 
Main Street and get lost in 
tales of cowboys, Indians, 
buried treasure and, of 
course, ghosts. Website: 
www.saladoghostwalk.
com

October 22 
	 Brian Bell, 9 p.m. - 
midnight at Chupacabra 
Craft Beer & Salado 
Lone Star Winery
October 23
	 Salado Masonic 
Lodge Open House, 2-4 
p.m. at the Lodge, 90 S. 
Church St. Learn more 
about Masonry and the 
history of Salado Lodge 
and Salado Masons. Also 
learn about the Appendant 
bodies, including Shriners, 
Scottish Rite, York Rite 
and Knights Templar. 

Oct. 24 - Nov. 4
	 Early Voting period
October 24
	 Salado ISD School 
Board Meeting, 6 p.m. at 
Salado Civic Center.
October 27
	 Salado Area Republi-
can Women, 11:30 a.m. 
at Salado Civic Center. 
Speaker:  Dr. Dawn 
Buckingham, Candidate 
for State Senate
October 28
	 Royal Art Walk, 
Royal Street. info: royal-
streetartwalk.com
October 28
	 On Tap!, 7 - 9 p.m. at 
Barrow Brewing Compa-
ny info: barrowbrewing.
com
October 28
	 Salt Creek Revival, 
8 - 11 p.m. at Chupaca-
bra Craft Beer & Salado 
Lone Star Winery
October 29
	 Salado Masonic 
Lodge #296 potluck lun-
cheon, noon Salado Civic 
Center. Presentation 
of 65-year pin to Jack 
Oliver and 6-year pin to 
Truett Williams.
October 29
	 Christmas Table Top 
Banner Class, 10:30 a.m. 
at Stamp Salado. $38 
info: stampsaladotexas.
com
October 29			 
	 William Clark Green, 
7 p.m. at Johnny’s Out-
back info: johnnysout-
back.com
October 29 
	 Smokin Maxx Carter, 
9 p.m. - midnight at 
Chupacabra Craft Beer 
& Salado Lone Star 
Winery

October 30
	 Trunk or Treat, 5 - 7 
p.m. at Salado United 
Methodist Church
October 30
	 Ballot Box Bedlam 
at Barrow Brewing or 
Sexit: the Sinister Salado 
Succession Scheme, a ra-
dio melodrama by Gary 
Askins, 7 p.m. at Barrow 
Brewing Co. Tickets:  
$10 at EventBrite. Pro-
ceeds benefit Public Arts 
League of Salado. 
November 3 
	 Pint Night and Salt 
Creek Revival, 6 p.m. - 
midnight at Chupacabra 
Craft Beer & Salado 
Lone Star Winery
November 4
	 Brian Bell, 8 - 11 p.m. 
at Chupacabra Craft 
Beer & Salado Lone Star 
Winery
November 4, 5, 19
	 Salado Ghost Walk, 
8 p.m. Take a lantern-lit 
stroll down Salado’s Main 	
Street and get lost in tales 
of cowboys, Indians, 
buried treasure and, of 
course, ghosts. Website: 
www.saladoghostwalk.
com.

November 5
	 Open House at 
Springhouse on Royal 
Street. 
November 5
	 Salado United Meth-
odist Church Garden 
Guild Style Show, 12:30 
p.m. at the church. 
RSVP by Nov. 1 (254) 
947-5482 
November 5
	 Bell County Star 
Party, 6:30 - 9 p.m. at 
Overlook Park, Stillhouse 
Hollow Lake on FM1670. 
Central Texas Astronomi-
cal Society. info: centex-
astronomy.org.

November 5
	 Tanner Newman, 9 
p.m. - midnight at Chu-
pacabra Craft Beer & 
Salado Lone Star Winery
November 6
	 Daylight Savings 
Time ends at 2 a.m.. Set 
your clocks back 1 hour. 
November 7
	 Salado Historical 
Society Pot Luck Chili 
Dinner, 6:30 p.m. at 
Church of Christ Activ-
ity Center. Drinks and 
Chili furnished, bring a 
side or dessert to share. 

Beer or Wine Tasting Daily $10
Live music every Friday & saturday

5 huge tvs
Sun -Thur Noon - 10 p.m. | Friday Noon - Midnight | Saturday Noon -1 a.m.

150 wines from 
around the world

50 + taps of Texas 
Craft Brews

new location 
401 s main on the corner of Royal and Main

216 Roya l  Street

Glass & Metal Art | Antique Majolica 
J.Hilburn Custom Menswear | Comphy Sheets 

(254)  947-5554

Cowboys Bar-B-Q
Exit 285 • 1300 Robertson RD

Catering, Take Out or Dine In

254-947-5700  Miguel Perez, owner

Slow Cooking Fast Service

Springhouse
120 Royal Street              

Mon - Sat  10:30 - 5     (254)947-0747

End of Summer 

Boutique Sale

Open Daily 
(254) 947-1909

560 N. Main 
Suite 10  

IN.FORM Free Introductory Program
5:15 - 6:15 p.m., Tuesday, Oct. 18  

Group Starting Oct. 25
Join us to get fit for the holidays

William Clark Green will perform at Johnny’s Outback October 29

MUD PIES 
POTTERY

HAND THROWN POTTERY 
ONE PIECE AT A TIME 

Handmade 
Pottery,

Homemade 
Fudge 

OVER 50 FLAVORS
including Sucrose free 

Gluten Free

Closed Mondays

18 N. Main Salado 

947-0281 

Opening Soon
Space Available
(325) 668-7852
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Mondays
	 Yoga for Women’s 
Health, 9 a.m. at Salado 
Yoga and Wellness Info: 
(254) 681-7623.
	 Children’s Story and 
Craft Time, 11 a.m. at 
Salado Public Library. 
info: (254) 947-9191	
	 Salado Village Artists 
Stitchers & Knitters, 
2 p.m. at Salado Village 
Artists Building.
	 Classified advertis-
ing deadline for Salado 
Village Voice, noon. info: 
advertising@saladovilla-
gevoice.com
	 Monday Madness 
Sale, 2 - 5 p.m. at Stamp 
Salado. 
	 Yoga Basics & Be-
yond, 6 p.m. at Salado 
Yoga and Wellness. Info: 
(254) 681-7623.
	 Salado Masonic 
Lodge, Floor practice is  
6:30 p.m. at the Lodge ev-
ery Monday except Stated 
Meeting. Stated meeting 
is 7:30 p.m. Monday on or 
before Full Moon.

First Monday
	 Salado First Monday 
Gardeners, 8 a.m. at the 
Visitor Center.
	 Monday Club, 2 p.m. 
at Salado United Method-
ist Church Youth Activi-
ties Center
	 Salado Historical 
Society board meeting, 
6 p.m. at Salado Public 
Library.	
Second Monday
	 Second Monday Book 
Club at Salado Winery, 7 - 
9 p.m.
	 Public Arts League of 
Salado open board meet-
ing, 5 p.m. at the Visitor’s 
Center on Main Street.
	 Salado FFA Meeting, 
6 p.m. at Salado High 
School AG building Sept. 
- May.
	 Salado Youth Fair 
Booster Club meeting, 
after the FFA meeting at 
Salado High School AG 
building. Info: SYFB-
Club@gmail.com
	 Salado Athletic 
Boosters Club meeting, 
7 p.m. at the High School 
Library. (no July meeting)

Third Monday
	 Salado United Meth-
odist Women, 5:45 p.m. at 
Salado United Methodist 
Church Room 117	
Fourth Monday
	 Salado Public Library 
Board of Trustees Meet-
ing, 5 p.m. at the library

Tuesdays
	 Learning English 
Among Friends (LEAF) 
class, 4:30 p.m. at Thomas 
Arnold Elementary. Class 
for Salado ISD parents 
interested in learning Eng-
lish. 947-6910
	 YogaStrong, 9-10 a.m. 
at Salado Yoga and Well-
ness. Info: (254) 681-7623.
	 Salado Village Art-
ists, Village Art Building, 
9 a.m., Bring your artwork 
third Tuesday will be set 
up for still life. 
	 Adult game day at 
Presbyterian Church of 
Salado, 10 a.m.
	 Sit & Knit, 10 a.m. 
- noon at Salado Public Li-
brary. info: (254) 947-9191
	 Salado Rotary Club, 
11:30 a.m. at Johnny’s 
Steaks & Barbecue first 
three Tuesdays of month; 
Roving Social after hours  
on fourth Tuesday of 
month.
	 Chair Yoga, noon - 1 
p.m. at Salado Yoga and 
Wellness  Info: (254) 681-
7623.
	 Tex Mex Tuesday at 
Alexander’s Distillery 
(254) 947-5554
	 Prix Fixe at The 
Range, 5 p.m.- close. 
$14.95 for entree, dessert, 
drink.
	 Salado Community 
Chorus practice, 6 p.m., 
Salado Civic Center, un-
less otherwise noted. info: 
(254) 541-7824

	 Restorative Yoga, 6 - 7 
p.m. at Salado Yoga and 
Wellness  Info: (254) 681-
7623.
	 Team Roping Prac-
tice, 6:30 p.m. at 3C 
Cowboy Fellowship 
Arena. Call before you 
haul 947-7214

First Tuesday
	 Salado Village Artists 
Board Meeting, 9 a.m. 
at the Village Art Build-
ing. Followed by General 
Meeting at 10:30 a.m.
	 Salado 4-H Club 
meeting, 6 p.m. at Salado 
Intermediate Cafeteria, 
Sept. - May.

Third Tuesday
	 Bell County Genea-
logical Society Meeting, 
6:30 p.m. at Temple Public 
Library.
	 Bunco, 6:30 p.m. at 
Salado Lone Star Winery 
and Chupacabra Craft 
Beer

Wednesdays
	 IN.FORM course, 5 
p.m. at Angelic Herbs. 
Info: (254) 947-1909
	 Yoga for Core, 8 - 
8:50 a.m. at Salado Yoga 
and Wellness. Info: (254) 
681-7623.
	 Power Flow Yoga 
level 1&2, 6:10-7:10 p.m. 
at Salado Yoga and Well-
ness. Info: (254) 681-7623.
	 WOW Wednesday at 
Angelic Herbs. 947-1909
	 Wine Wednesday at 
Alexander’s Distillery 
(254) 947-5554

Second Wednesday
	 Salado Lions Club, 
11:30 a.m., Salado Civic 
Center.

Third Wednesday
	 Mah Jongg at Salado 
Public Library, 10 a.m.-2 
p.m. 

Fourth Wednesday
	 Salado Lions Club, 
11:30 a.m., Salado Civic 
Center.

Thursdays
	 Flow & Glow Yoga, 
8:45 - 10:15 a.m.  at Salado 
Yoga and Wellness  Info: 
(254) 681-7623.
	 Chair Yoga, noon - 1 
p.m. at Salado Yoga and 
Wellness  Info: (254) 681-
7623.
	 Hatha Flow levels 
1&2, 6:15 - 7:15 p.m. at 
Salado Yoga and Wellness  
Info: (254) 681-7623.
	 Salado Aldermen 
meeting, 6:30 p.m., Mu-
nicipal building, 301 N. 
Stagecoach Rd. Meeting 
is open to the public. First 
and third Thursday are 
regular meetings and sec-
ond and fourth Thursday 
are workshop meetings.

First Thursday
	 Chisholm Trail 
American Business 
Woman’s Association 
meeting, 6 p.m. at First 
Presbyterian Church of 
Salado.

Second Thursday
	 Salado Ladies Aux-
iliary Meeting, 9 a.m. 
at the Salado United 
Methodist Church Youth 
Activities Center.
	 Crop Night, 5 - 9 p.m. 
at Stamp Salado,  $5 res-
ervation required: (254) 
947-8848
	 Neighbors Night Out, 
6 - 10 p.m. at Barrow 
Brewing Company. info: 
barrowbrewing.com

Regular Events in Village of Salado

	 Barrel Racing, 7 p.m. 
at 3C Cowboy Fellowship 
Arena. Call before you 
haul 947-7214

Third Thursday
	 Salado Chamber 
of Commerce Board 
Meeting, 8:30 a.m. at the 
Visitors Center.
	 Yoga on Salado 
Square, 9 - 9:45 a.m., 
info: erinelizabechlabadie.
com 
	 Third Thursday 
Music Club, 5 - 8 p.m. at 
JD’s Travel Center. Old 
time music, acoustic only. 
Everyone welcome to 
come play or listen.

Fourth Thursday
	 Barrel Racing Prac-
tice, 7 p.m. at 3C Cowboy 
Fellowship Arena. Call 
before you haul 947-7214

Fridays
	 Pop in for a pastry, 
8:30 - 9:30 a.m. at First 
Community Title. 
	 Display advertising 
deadline for Salado Vil-
lage Voice, noon. info: 
advertising@saladovilla-
gevoice.com
	 Hecho En Queso food 
truck, 4-10 p.m. at Bar-
row Brewing Co. on Royal 
Street. info: barrowbrew-
ing.com

(254) 947-0027 | (800) 724-0027

Historic Bed and Breakfast ~Weddings ~ Receptions  ~ Meetings

Inn at Salado

North Main & Pace Park Dr.  inn-at-salado.com                   

Mill Creek Cleaners

Quality Dry Cleaning, Laundry, 
Alterations & Custom Tailoring

213 Mill Creek Drive, Suite 200
Salado Plaza next to Brookshire Brothers

Mon-Fri 8-6 • Sat 9-2 • Closed Sunday
 (254) 947-0100

	 Friday Night Special 
at Mill Creek Country 
Club Bar and Grill. Menu 
changes every week. Call 
947-5698.
	 Live music at Chu-
pacabra Craft Beer & 
Salado Lone Star Win-
ery
Fourth Friday
	 Fourth Friday Gospel 
Singing, 7 p.m. at First 
Cedar Valley Baptist 
Church on FM 2843. Pot 
luck to follow, bring a 
favorite dish or dessert.
	 Royal Art Walk, late 
shopping, dining, art and 
entertainment

Saturdays
	 Hatha Flow Levels 
1 & 2, 8:30-9:30 a.m. at 
Salado Yoga and Well-
ness. Info: (254) 681-7623
	 Studio Time for 
Salado Village Artists 
members, 10 a.m. info: 
saladovillageartists.com
	 Prenatal Yoga, 10:30 
- 11:30 a.m. Salado Yoga 
and Wellness. Info: (254) 
681-7623.
	 Live music in The 
Lounge, upstairs at The 
Range Restaurant on 
Main St., 7 p.m. Artists 
change weekly. Check 
website for details. 

	 Live music at Chupa-
cabra Craft Beer & Salado 
Lone Star Winery

First & Third Saturday
	 Trudy’s Closet, 8 a.m. 
at Grace Baptist Church

Second Saturday
	 Asanas & Ales, 9:30 - 
11 a.m. at Barrow Brew-
ing Company
Sundays
	 Open discussion Al-
Anon Meeting, 6 p.m. 
Salado United Methodist 
Church Youth Activities 
Center.

	 Hatha Therapy, 3 - 4 
p.m. at Salado Yoga and 
Wellness. Info: (254) 681-
7623

Second Weekends
	 Salado Market Days, 
9 a.m.-5 p.m. at Salado 
Antique Mall, 721 Stage-
coach Road. Salado’s 
original Market Days 
event. info: (254) 947-
3355.

Submit your 
calendar listing at

saladovillagevoice.com

Custom blown 
glass made
in Salado.

View our gallery
of hand-blown pieces 

or make your very own

#2 Peddlers Alley 
Salado Texas 76571

254-947-0339 
(by appointment)

OLD FASHIONED BURGERS
                    and ICE-CREAM

882 North Main Street

 facebook.com/burgersICEcream
plus.google.com/+OldFashionedBurgersandicecreamSalado

(254) 947-5271

$1 off any burger or 
sandwich combo 

with this ad

TRY OUR NEW MENU

Magnolias 
of Salado

#1 Salado Square | Main Street  
254-947-0323 | magnoliasofsalado.com

Salado United Methodist Church will host its annual Trunk or Treat 5 - 7 p.m. Oct. 30. The annual event fea-
tures candy stations, fun games and activities, food and safe, family friendly fun for the community. 
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1. 	 Animal Medical Salado	 254-947-8800	 S
2.	 JD’s Travel Center	 254-947-5228	 D
3.	 The Play Yard Preschool	 254-947-1153	 $
5.	 Wildfire Ranch Arena	 877-947-9988	 E
6.	 St. Stephen Catholic Church	 254-947-8037	 C
7. 	 Egbert Automotive	 254-947-5782	 $
8.	 SALADO COLLEGE HILL PARK	 	
10.	 Stagecoach Inn Restaurant	 under renovation
13.	 PUBLIC RESTROOMS
14.	 Central Texas Area Museum	 254-947-5232	 E
15.	 Vintage Vinyl inside Sofi’s	 254-947-4336	 S
17. 	 SHADY VILLA CENTER
		  Salado Lone Star Winery	 254-947-0237	 S
		  Chupacabra Craft Beer	 254-947-0237	 S
19. 	 Salado Glassworks	 254-947-0339	 S
23.	 Barrow Brewing Co. 	 254-947-3544	 D
	 Henco en Queso Food Truck on Fridays	 D
24.	 Springhouse	 254-947-0747	 S
27.	 The Shed	 254-947-1960	 D
26.	 Gallerie V		  S
29. 	 Inn on the Creek B&B	 254-947-5554	 L
	 Alexander’s Distillery	 254-947-5554	 D
32.	 Tablerock Amphitheater	 254-947-9205	 E
34.	 HISTORIC SALADO CEMETERY		
36.	 Salado United Methodist Church	254-947-5482	 C
37.	 First Baptist Church of Salado	 254-947-5465	 C
43.	 CREEKSIDE CENTER
48.	 W.A. Pace Memorial Park	 254-947-5060
50.	 THE VERANDA
		  A. First Texas Brokerage	 254-947-5577	 R
51.	 First State Bank	 254-947-5852	 $

Shopping Map of Salado

52.	 FIRST CENTRE
		  A. First Community Title	 254-947-8480	 R
		  B. Farmers Insurance 
		       Zbranek Agency	 254-947-0995	 $
53.	 Timeless	 254-947-4779	 S
54.	 Inn at Salado B&B	 254-947-0027	 L
55.	 SALADO SQUARE
		  A. Magnolia’s	 254-947-0323	 S
		  B. Lively Coffeehouse & Bistro 254-947-3688	 D
56.	 The Range at the Barton House	 254-947-3828	 D
	 Linda Rountree Pritchard Egg 
		       Massage Therapist	 254-947-4263	 $
58.	 Salado Family Dentistry	 254-947-5242	 S
61. 	 Salado Creek Jewelers by Kiki	 254-855-5538	 S
63.	 Mud Pies Pottery	 254-947-0281	 S
		  Sir Wigglesworth Fudge
64.	 The Shoppes on Main in Salado	 254-947-0888	 S
70.	 OLD CHURCH PLACE
		  The Pizza Place	 254-947-0222	 D
72.	 ERA Colonial Real Estate	 254-947-3400	 $
75.	 SALADO CIVIC SQUARE
76.	 Uncle Junk’s		  S
79.	 CORNETT CORNER
		  Crain Chiropractic & Wellness	 254-947-2225 	 $
80.	 Historic Log Cabins & Aiken Cemetery
81.	 Salado Art Center and Village Artists
82.	 Salado Civic Center
		  Salado ISD Administration	 254-947-5479	 E
85.	 Salado Visitors Center	 254-947-8634
	 Salado Chamber of Commerce	254-947-5040
86.	 Salado Wine Seller	 254-947-8011	 S

87.	 St. Joseph’s Episcopal Church	 254-947-3160	 C
89. 	 Presbyterian Church of Salado	 254-947-8106	 C
90.	 Troy Smith Financial Services	 254-947-0376	 $
91.	 Salado Sculpture Garden 
92.	 SALADO ARTS COMPLEX
96.	 THE STAGESTOP CENTER
		  Bruce Bolick, CPA	 254-718-7299	 $
		  The Yoga Room	 254-681-7623	 $
		  Angelic Herbs	 254-947-1909	 S
97.	 Creekside Used Furniture	 254-947-9471	 S
99.	 Dee’s Antiques	 254-947-3775	 S
		  Princess Way Miniatures and Gifts
98.	 Stamp Salado	 254-947-8848	 S
100.	 Salado Post Office	 254-947-5322	
101.	 Century 21 Bill Bartlett 
		  Real Estate	 254-947-5050	 R
102.	 Subway	 254-947-5593	 D
	 Old-Fashioned Burgers	 254-947-5271	 D
103.	 The Personal Wealth Coach	 254-947-1111	 $
105. SALADO PLAZA SHOPPING CENTER
		  B. Salado Village Voice	 254-947-5321	 $
		  B. Ace Pest Control	 254-947-4222	 $
		  B. Walt Tollefson Computer	 254-291-6354	 $
		  B. Finney Insurance	 254-947-3599	 $
		  B. Monteith Abstract & Title	 254-947-3922	 $
		  B. Anytime Fitness	 254-947-1063	 $
		  B. The Haire Shop	
		      Tammy Haire, stylist	 254-760-1990	 $
		  B. Mill Creek Cleaners	 254-947-0100	 $
		  C. Brookshire Brothers	 254-947-8922	 S
108.	 Mill Creek Country Club	 254-947-5698	 E
109. 	Salado Public Library	 254-947-9191	 E
110.	 Salado Cleaners	 254-947-7299	 $
111.	 Hairitage Barber Shop	 254-947-3309	 $
116. 	Salado High School	 254-947-5429	 E

119.	 Salado Fire Department Station #2
121.	 Grace Baptist Church	 254-947-5917	 C
124.	 Cowboy’s Barbecue	 254-947-5700	 D
125.  Fairway Sports Vehicles	 254-947-4065	 S
130. 	Johnny’s Steaks & Bar-Be-Que	 254-947-4663	 D
135.	 Embrace Smiles	 254-947-4011	 S
136.	 Salado Fitness Massage TherapS
		  Heather Foster-Sparks, LMT	 254-338.9564	 S
138.	 Salado Lady Eagles Softball Field		
139.	 Thomas Arnold Elementary	 254-947-5191	 E
140.	 Salado Intermediate School	 254-947-1700	 E
141. 	Salado Junior High School	 254-947-6985	 E
142.	 Salado Eagle Stadium		
143.	 Eagle Baseball Field		
144.	 Village Spirits	 254-947-7117	 S
145.	 Broecker Funeral Home	 254-947-0066	 S
147.	 Salado Masonic Lodge #296	 254-458-2643	CV
148.	 Salado Baptist Church Youth Activities Center
151.	 Salado Fire Department Station #1
152.	 Salado Church of Christ	 254-947-5241	 C
153. 	Village of Salado	 254-947-5060	
156.	 Salado Antique Mall	 254-947-3355	 S
157.	 Horizon Bank Salado	 254-947-8636	 $
159.	 Cedar Valley Baptist Church	 254-947-0148	 C

NOT SHOWN ON MAP 
3C Cowboy Fellowship 	 254-947-7211	 C
Coleman Auto Restoration	 254-933-7400	 $
Don Ringler	 254-774-6500	 S
Garlyn Shelton Cadillac	 254-771-0128	 S

To advertise your  business in the Salado 
Village Voice newspaper, 

call Marilyn at 254.947.5321 

7

LIVELY
• COFFEEHOUSE & BISTRO •

EST. 2015

21 North Main Street        Salado Square       (254) 947-3688

GET LIVELY WED - SAT 9 - 4 
SUN 10 - 4 | MON 9 - 4 closed Tues

Coffee | Espresso
Breakfast | Lunch

Bagel | Croissant | Pastry
Toast Selections

Salad | Soup | Sandwich
Subscribe Today

Digital and First Class Mail Subscriptions
Available at SaladoVillageVoice.com
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	 This deal occurred many 
years ago in a match between 
Cadbury’s and Waddington’s, 
two English bridge clubs. The 
deal could be regarded as 
more amusing than instruc-
tive, but it is published here 
so that our readers will have 
some idea of how the other 
half lives.
	 North was Tony Priday, 
partnered by G.C.H. Fox, both 
well-known international 
players. As to what happened 
on the deal, No. 13 in the 
match, we couldn’t possibly 
do better to describe it than 
did Ewart Kempson, whose 
witty account appeared in the 
British Bridge Magazine, of 
which he was the editor.
	 “Sitting North and play-
ing Acol, Mr. Priday opened 
the bidding smartly with one 
heart. Maybe I’m a bit old-
fashioned, but to my way of 
thinking, one club is a better 
bid. It is true that the club suit 
is not as good as the heart 
suit -- this is probably what 
influenced Mr. Priday -- but I 
always think one should pre-
pare for a rebid when open-

Contract
Bridge
By Steve Becker

ing, and if South responds 
one diamond, North is free 
to rebid one heart if the other 
inmates don’t mind. 
	 “East had the temerity 
to bid one notrump, which 
South doubled. It seemed to 
the deafened spectators that 
Mr. Fox was not doubling 
for takeout. A swift redouble 
by West allowed Mr. Priday 
to show his other suit with a 
corking bid of two clubs. This 
infuriated Mr. Fox into two 
notrump, which was defeated 
by three tricks undoubled. 
“Why Mr. Fox bid only two 
notrump on his 17-point hand 

after Mr. Priday had opened 
vulnerable is one of those 
unsolved and unsavoury 
crimes which will remain 
in the open files at Scotland 
Yard probably forever.
	 “Mr. Priday described it 
as a gross overbid. ‘It should 
have been obvious, even to 
Foxy, that I had made one 
of my very fine psychs,’ said 
Mr. Priday.
	 “’Nothing about your bid-
ding is ever obvious to me,’ 
riposted Mr. Fox.”
	 (c) 2016 King Features 
Syndicate Inc.

How the other half lives

1. HISTORY: Where did 
Lyndon Johnson take the oath 
of office following President 
Kennedy’s assassination?
2. LANGUAGE: What does 
the word “gesundheit” mean 
when it follows a sneeze?
3. MUSIC: What singer’s life 
was portrayed in the auto-
biography “Lady Sings the 
Blues”?
4. TELEVISION: Where was 
“The Untouchables” drama 
set?
5. ANATOMY: What is a 
more common name for the 
sternum?
6. SCIENCE: What is the 
unit that is used to measure 
sound level?
7. INVENTIONS: What was 
demonstrated for the first 
time on Dec. 31, 1879, in 
Menlo Park?
8. GENERAL KNOWL-
EDGE: What are the colors 
of Israel’s flag?
9. MYTHOLOGY: In 
mythology, what do therio-
morphic gods represent?
10. GEOGRAPHY: What is 
the only Northeastern U.S. 
state that borders Canada but 
not the Atlantic Ocean or a 
Great Lake?
Answers
1. Aboard Air Force One
2. A wish in German for 
“good health”
3. Billie Holiday
4. Chicago
5. The breastbone
6. Decibel
7. Incandescent light
8. Blue and white
9. Animals
10. Vermont

If you enjoy the Puzzle page,
 try our interactive crossword and 

sudoku puzzles online at:
saladovillagevoice.com
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Wild About Texas
Michael Price

A multitude of animals 
elicit thoughts of mystery 
and fear among people. 
These include animals 
such as spiders, scorpions 
and snakes. However, one 
creature that lives in a 
shroud of mystery is found 
right here in West Texas. 
Many people know about 
the great horned owl, but 
few are truly familiar with 
their habits.

The great horned owl 
(Bubo virginianus) is a 
large bird of prey that is 
found throughout most of 
North and South America, 
from Canada to Argen-
tina. In fact, it has the 
largest range of any of the 
owl family Strigidae, also 
known as the true owls.

This particular species 
of owl is a habitat general-
ist, able to live in just about 

The Great Horned Owl

OPEN TO THE PUBLIC 
 Practice Facility                    Memberships Available 

millcreek-golf.com       
(254) 947-5698

18 unforgettable holes of Golf designed by Robert Trent Jones, Jr. Book Your Tee Time Today

Open for Breakfast 7 a.m. Daily
Mill Creek Country Club Bar & Grill 

open to the public 7 a.m. - 7 p.m. 
Dine In  or  Carry Out

The Great Horned Owl can see in the 
dark with its large eyes

any type of habitat that 
supports tree life, includ-
ing mesquite trees of the 
Panhandle, the live-oaks 
of the Edwards Plateau 
and the pines of the Trans-
Pecos mountains. The 
only requirement is that 
the trees provide enough 
cover to support a place 
to nest and to be a center 
point for nocturnal forays.

At first glance, great 
horned owls appear to be 
drab in color. Upon further 
inspection, however, it is 
obvious that the colors and 
patterns are arranged in a 
very detailed manner. The 

under parts, particularly 
the breast area, are light 
and are marked with an 
assortment of horizontally 
placed black lines that 
vary from thin to thick. 
The upper parts are brown, 
with an intricate array of 
dark and light swirls and 
circles.

The face can be a variety 
of colors — gray, brown 
and even reddish on some 
individuals. The face is set 
apart with an outline of 
black semicircles on each 
side of the head. The eyes 
are large, almost as large 
as the eyes of a human, 
and are a deep yellow. The 
beak is dark, curved and 
extremely sharp. The scaly 
legs and feet are feathered 
all the way to the long, 
powerful talons.

As the name implies, 
there are two large tufts of 
feathers at the top on each 
side of the head. These 
tufts are not true horns, nor 
are they ears. The reason 
for these tufts is unknown, 
but their presence enables 

a quick identification for 
anyone who observes this 
majestic bird. As stated 
earlier, great horned owls 
are large, and females are 
the larger of the two sexes. 
An adult specimen can 
approach a body height of 
28 inches with a wingspan 
of just over 5 feet. Large 
adults can weigh up to 3 
pounds.

Great horned owls typi-
cally breed earlier than 
most other native birds, 
with selection of a mate 
taking place as early as 
December. In fact, many 
potential mates are heard 
calling during the fall 
months, generally begin-
ning in October. The call 
is unmistakable, being a 
low-pitched “who-who-
whoo-whoo”. On rare 
occasions, this call pattern 
is five syllables.

Breeding takes place 
in late January or early 
February, and the one to 
five (generally three) eggs 
are laid approximately a 
month later. The amount 
of time for incubation 
varies, but it generally 
takes about a month. The 
young stay in the nest for 
an additional six weeks, 
fed by both parents.

This species of owl is 
known for its feeding pro-
pensities, consuming large 
amounts of many harmful 
mammals such as mice, 
rats and rabbits. Its large 
eyes are capable of seeing 
into the pitch black of dark 
nights, and its hearing may 
actually be a stronger asset 
than its nocturnal sight.

Great horned owls are 
capable of swiveling their 
heads at 270 degree angles, 
scouring the ground for 
potential prey. Other than 
the food items already 
mentioned, they also have 
been known to feed on 
raccoons, opossums, wea-
sels and armadillos. Rep-
tiles such as snakes make 
up a small portion of their 
diet, but surprisingly, other 
birds make up a large per-
centage of their prey.

Other than man, there 
are no potential predators 
of this bird of prey other 
than members of its own 
species.

106 North Main Street
(next to Ambrosia Tea Room)  

(254) 855-5538 Private Showings

ART LESSONS
Beginner and Intermediate classes available
Sign up today (469) 877- 0374

#1 Royal Street

Corner of Royal Street and Center Circle (West)
(254) 947-1960

 Open
Mon, Wed, Thurs 5 p.m.
Fri, Sat & Sun 11 a.m.

Closed Tues

A place for weary travelers, thirsty 
tourist, and hungry neighbors!

Tried our Pulled Pork?
Cooked to Perfection on 

The Big Green Egg!

Shop at Salado’s Boutique Marketplace
Women’s Apparel, Shoes ~ Flip Flops to Boots,
Jewelry, Baby Gifts & Apparel, Gourmet Food,

 Home Decor & Furniture, Home Fragrance, 
Junk Gypsy™ Paint,  Gifts & More

22 North Main Street

Timeless
Upscale Consignment

#3 North Main
Corner of Main and Pace Park Road

Women’s Clothing, Jewelry,
 Local Art and Home Décor

642 N. Main St.     (254) 947-8848 

sta mpsal adotex as.com

Rubber Stamps
Scrapbooking

ribbons
Great Classes

Princess Way Miniatures & Gifts

702 N. Main inside Dee’s Antiques  

Dollhouses, Furniture and More

42 Dealers

Dee’s Antique Mall
(254) 947-3775 702 N Main Street 

FURNITURE
GLASSWARE     KEEPSAKES

SUN & WED Noon - 5  
THURS - FRI 10 - 5 | SAT 10 - 6 

CLOSED MON & TUES

PizzaPlaceSalado.com

947-0022
230 North Main Street

Open Daily 11 am

The Pizza Place

Handcrafted Pizza and Sandwiches
Baked Pasta Dishes | Wings
All You Can Eat Salad Bar

 Pickup   •   Dine-in  •  Delivery

Open at Lunch
no minimum orders
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colonialrealestate.com

Saturday, October 15th, 2016

*Cash prizes distributed in Visa gift cards to winners. Must be 21 to enter. Winner will be notified after event by phone.

Join us for our

12:00 - 3:00 PM

777 Indian Trail, Harker Heights, TX 76548
ERA Colonial Real Estate

A u t o m o b i l e  & 
S m a l l  E n g i n e   
Repair

E & E  A i r - C o o l e d 
Engines: Shindaiwa Dealer, 
parts, sales and service, chain 
saw sharpening, 254-947-8006, 
24767 FM 2268.         

B&K Small Engine 
Repair: Lawn mowers, trim-
mers, edgers, chain-saws, much 
more, 254-933-7557.                  
tfnd

C.A.R.S.  Col l is ion 
Center: auto body repairs, 
detail shop, 1914 S. IH-35 Belton, 
254-933-7400.           
 tfnd

Child Care 
Babysitting

The Play Yard: 6 weeks 
to 12 years with age appropriate 
curriculum, drop of and pick up 
from Salado schools, 254-947-
1153.  tfnb

Cleaning

Clear Vision Clean-
ing- Residential and commercial 
cleaning service. (254)314-5050.

QuickDri Carpet Clean-
ing- carpet, upholstery, tile and 
grout. Salado owned and oper-
ated. (254)231-5870, quickdri.
com. tfn

Computers

Walt Tollefson computer 
repairs and sales, data recovery, 
configurations, Salado Plaza suite 
#135, 254-291-6354.   
tfnd

Dry Cleaners

Salado Cleaners: Laun-
dry, dry cleaning, alterations, 
leather, suede, 1209 N. Stage-
coach, 254-947-7299. tfnd

Mill Creek Cleaners, 
quality dry cleaning, laundry, 
alterations, 213 Mill Creek Dr. 
Suite 200, 254-947-0100.    

3029 Heritage Loop, Nolanville
4 BR, 3.5 Baths

$439,921

2205 High View, Belton
4 BR, 3.5 BA

$589,921

2 Cliffhouse Dr., #318, Belton
2 BR, 2 BA
$189,921

1307 Indian Trail, Salado
3 BR, 2.5 BA

$239,921

1307 Walker Circle, Salado
3 BR, 2.5 BA

$459,721

404 FM 2268, Salado
3 BR, 2 BA w/ 1 BR, 1 BA apartment, on 3 ac.

$399,921

• Mill Creek lots: $35,000 - $45,000
• Hidden Springs lots:  $42,721 - $57,900 
• 1.1 tree covered acres on Center Circle.
• 1.25 ac. Commercial tract in Jarrell at I-35 & Meadow Valley Loop.
• 13.8 acres, native pasture with hillside views. Owner financing available. 
• 99 ac. Native pasture, views, spring-fed creek, pond and farmhouse SOLD
• 99 ac. w/ 3 BR, 2 BA, workshop and barn.
• 170 ac., with 2 farm houses and barn, between Temple, Belton and Academy

1012 Mill Creek Dr., Salado
3 BR, 2 BA

1207 Baines St., Salado
4 BR, 2 BA
$231,721

2101 Forest Trail, Temple
3 BR, 2 BA
$214,921

1315 Walker Circle, Salado
3 BR, 3 BA
$479,021

1208 Mission Trail, Salado
4 BR, 2 BA on 3+ ac.

$369,721

11534 Stinnett Mill Rd., Salado
5 BR, 4 BA on 2 ac.

$489,721

860 N. Main
Salado, Tx

254.947.5050

Area Land Listings

SOLD

www.C21BB.com
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Finney Insurance, home, 
auto, life, commercial, liability, 
farm, ranch, 254-947-3599.

Florist

Brookshire Brothers full 
service florist. Blooming plants. 
254-947-8922.

For Sale

Antiques at Dee’s 
Antique Mall - Furniture, 
Glassware, Keepsakes at 702 
North Main Street. Over 30 ven-
dors (254) 947-3775 tfn

Antiques at Salado 
Antique Mall and Bee’s 
Antiques -  Antiques, vintage 
and collectables, many vendors 
at one location 751 Stagecoach 
Road, North I-35 frontage road 
(directly behind Dee’s Antiques on 
Main) 947-3355.   Salado Market 
Days second weekend of each 
month.  tfn

Furniture at Creekside 
Quality Used Furni-
ture: Save On- Leather sofas, 
recliners and office desk#6 Old 
Town Road 254-947-9477. Follow 
us on FB.

Garage, Auctions, 
Estate Sale

Oct. 14 and 15. Lots 
of  good items. Small 
appliances, leather couch, linens, 
blankets, generator, travel bags, 
medical equip, on and on, 605 
Santa Clara Rd. Salado.

Yard Sale, 14-15 Oct. 
8am-1pm. 3561 West Amity Rd. 
Salado. Kids have all moved 
out so we are downsizing. It all 
must go.

Mission Thrift Shop- 
12237 FM 2843- Salado. 1st and 
3rd weekends. 9-5, something for 
everyone.

Garbage

Clawson Disposal: Com-
petitive pricing for great garbage 
service; containers, too. 512-
746-2000.

Health and Fitness

Anytime Fitness- 24 
hour Health Club. Fit-
ness classes, personal training 
available, 24 hour access. 254-
947-1063. 

Angelic Herbs: Profes-
sional Wellness, Lifestyle, 
weight loss and stress manage-
ment solutions. C J Harbuz, CNHP 
947-1909, 560 N. Main Suite 10.

Crain Chiropractic & 
Wellness- chiropractic care, 
massage therapy, acupuncture 
and holistic care. 418 N. Main St. 
#5.,947-2225.

Integrity: Rehab & 
Home Health. Physical 
therapy, speech therapy, occu-
pational therapy, in-home skilled 
nursing. integrityrehab.net, 254-
699-3933.

Massage Therapy - 
Salado Fitness, 8 a.m. - 8 
p.m. daily - by appointment only. 
Same day available (254) 338-
9564 Heather LMT. 1/14tfn

The Remedy- Massage 
Therapy. TheRemedySalado.
com, Libby Nichols MT044934. 
113 N. Stagecoach Rd. Suite 5. 
(254)624-7912.

T herapeut ic  Mas-
sage, stress management 
and healthy lifestyle strategies, 
Linda Pritchard-Egg, RN, LMT, 
254-947-4263.

Family Dentistry: Lum-
ineers for straighter, whiter teeth. 
Douglas B. Willingham, DDS, 
254-947-5242.

The Yoga Room- 560 
North Main #8, Saladoyoga.com. 
254-791-9440.

Heat & Air

Britt Heating & Air: 
Installation and repairs, 254-
760-1004, 254-947-5263, TACL 
#B006640

Bell Air Conditioning: 
All brands repairs, free estimates, 
100% financing available, 254-
939-1141. TACLA002113C

Jewelers

Salado Creek Jewel-
ers by Kiki Creations:  
106 North Main St. 254-855-5538, 
private showings.

Lastovica Jewelers: 
in-store jewelry repairs, diamond 
sales, setting and appraisal, 
custom design, watch repair, 
254-773-5772.

Devereaux’s Jewelers: 
Quality crafted custom work, 
jewelry repair, appraisals, watch 
repair, stone setting, diamond 
sales, photo design. 254-771-
1260.

Landscaping

Lawnwork & Tree

J & W Lawn Care, Your 

complete lawn care service. Let us 
work for you. Brian Wooley (254) 
718-5295 or Randy Jackson, 54 
year resident of Salado (254) 
760-2439.

Scout’s Tree Service 
and Lawn Care. For 
free estimate or questions call 
(254)654-0213.

Trees, Shrubs & Land-
scaping,  Pruning, www.
victormareklandscaping.com. 
1-512-818-3822, Removal and 
Hauling. Flower beds, yard work, 
top soil.  Serving Salado 32 years. 

Double J Tree Service: 
Lot clearing, acreage mowing, 
chipping, mulching, trimming, 512-
635-4064. 512-746-272.

Personal Services

Jenny Wiggin Potter- 
Colorist, Hairstylist at 
Expressions, 3126 South 31st St. 
across from HEB  in Temple. (254) 
774-9751.

Salon of Salado- Full 
service salon, walk-ins welcome. 
Susan Haywood 32 year expe-
rience. (254)947-7282, cabin 
across from Salado Creek Winery.

Hairitage Barber Shop: 
Full service Barber Shop, call 254-
947-3309 for appointments. 

The Haire Shop, full ser-
vice salon, walk-ins accepted. 
254-760-1990. 

Pest Control

Ace Pest Control: Cus-
tomer satisfaction guaranteed, 
free estimates, TPCL #12512; 
David Preston. 254-947-4222

Plumbing

Moffat & Daughters 
Plumbing: Service, repair, 
remodeling, 254-289-5986 Master 
LIC # M017002

Salado Plumbing. In-
home repairs, 254-947-5800. 
Master LIC M 16892

Yount Sewer & Drain: 
septic tank & grease trap pump-
ing, 254-947-5036

Rental/Lease 
Residential

3BR, 3 1/2 BA, 2200 
Sq. Ft., 3 Car Garage, Golf 
Cart Garage. All brick, on golf 
course. 254-721-3578, ask for 
Frank. 8/13 tfnb

For Rent clean 2 BR, 
2 B duplex, $700 mo. call 
760-4440. 0918tfnb

Charming, spacious, 
2/2/1 townhome for 
rent. Clean!! 6 closets, vaulted 
ceiling, w/d closet inside. Walk 
to shopping center. Lawn care 
provided. 254-913-9813.

Residential Sales

Perfect home over-
looking the Texas Hill 
Country. Hill country flavored 
home on 5 gorgeous acres with 
barn for horses $429,900. More 
info at www.1349hiddensprings.
com Call First Texas Brokerage 
947-5577

Home on approx. 3 
acres close to down-
town Salado.  Two living, 
one game room, 3 BR, 2 BA home 
with a 1 BR, 1 BA apartment.  
Beautiful large oak trees cover 
the acreage.  Nice concrete floor 
shop in back yard for projects or 
storage.  404 FM 2268, Salado.  
$399,921. Century 21 Bill Bartlett 
947-5050  2/2tfnf

Great location in the 
heart of Mill Creek.  
Spacious 3 BR, 2 BA with master 
down.  Fresh paint!  Fabulous 
kitchen, solid surface counter 
tops, tons of cabinets, desk area 
& wet bar that opens through 
to living/dining.  Sunny break-
fast area with French doors to 
front entry.  Master suite has 
wood shutters & walk-in shower.  
Half bath down & large full bath 

Salado Plumbing

947-5800

“We are ready”
In home repairs

 

Master LIC M 16892

Clear Vision Cleaning
One Call Cleans it All

(254) 314-5050
Tonya Nolan, Owner

Residential & Commercial Cleaning Service
Like Clear Vision Cleaning on Facebook

Let the light shine through

Windows | Gutters
Powerwashing

Ceiling Fan Cleaning

(254) 931-6172
ClearViewWindows_Belton@yahoo.com

Clear View Window Cleaning

A/C
Repair

 ALL BRANDS
Free Estimates &  Second Opinions

100% Financing Available

Senior Citizens Discount on service

939-1141
Toll Free 877-422-5500  • www.bellaircond.com

310 E. Central Ave. • Belton
SERVING CENTRAL TEXAS FOR OVER 38 YEARS

TACLA002113C

CHASE
REMODELING & CONCRETE, INC

Carpentry, Painting, 
Decks, Patios, 
Room Add-ons

Ken (512) 595-1003

Yount Sewer & Drain
Septic Service, L.C.

Septic tank 
& grease trap 

pumping

254 947-5036

Dirt/Stone Work

Lone Star Grading, 
commercial, residential, industrial 
excavation, grading, paving, pads, 
driveways, roads, 254-947-0149 
or 254-933-7900

CBS Construction: septic 
tanks, house pads, driveways, 
lot clearing, top soil, 254-718-
1752.                       tfnd

Financial & Real 
Estate Services

Troy L Smith Financial: 
Personal investment solutions. 
254-947-0376, Troylsmith.com.

Alton D. Thiele PC: 
Certified Public Accountant, tax 
returns, business accounting, 
auditing, consulting, 254-939-
0701.                 tfnd

Bruce A. Bolick, CPA: 
Payroll, W-2, Direct Deposit, 
By appointment, 254-718-7299. 
SaladoCPA@aol.com.           tfnd

First Community Title, 
branches in Salado, Temple, 
Killeen and Gatesville. 40 N. 
Main Street, Salado 254-947-
8480.               tfnd

The Personal Wealth 
Coach®:  SEC registered 
investment advisor, highly per-
sonalized portfolio design and 
management, 254-947-1111.

Monteith Abstract & 
Title Company: Full service title 
company, 213 Mill Creek Dr., Suite 
#140, 254-947-3922.

John Hall: Insurance and 
financial services, auto, home, 
ranch, business, life, health, 254-
778-8087. 

Rita Zbranek, Farmers 
Insurance, auto, home, life, com-
mercial, 254-947-0995.

Britt Heating & 
Air Conditioning

 Installations • Repairs
 Office 947-5263
 Mobile 760-1004
 Serving Salado for 25 years 
 TACL #B006640

Locally Owned and Operated

889 FM 2268 (Holland Road)

Brakes | Tires | Belts and Hoses
Muffler Check | Exhaust Check
Engine Light | Heating and A.C. 

Steering and Suspension | State Inspections

VILLAGE OF SALADO, TEXAS 
NOTICE OF PUBLIC HEARING  

PLANNING & ZONING COMMISSION 
AND BOARD OF ALDERMEN 

The Planning and Zoning Commission will conduct a meeting at 4:00 PM., Tuesday, November 8, 2016, at the 
Village of Salado Municipal Building, 301 N. Stagecoach Road, Salado, Texas, to hold a public hearing on the 
following item: 

Hold a public hearing and consider a re-plat of Lot 11, Block 1 in Mill Creek Courtyard Homes, a 
subdivision located in the ETJ near the intersection of O.W. Lowery and Chisholm Trail (map available at 
City Hall). 

Information regarding this replat is on file for public examination in the City Secretary’s Office, 301 North 
Stagecoach Road, Salado, Texas. 

The Planning and Zoning Commission recommendation will be forwarded to the Board of Aldermen for public 
hearing, consideration, and approval at its meeting at 6:30 P.M. Thursday, November 17, 2016, at the Village of 
Salado Municipal Building, 301 N. Stagecoach Road, Salado, Texas.  

If you require interpreter services for the deaf or hearing impaired, please contact the City Secretary at City Hall 
at least 48 hours in advance, at 254-947-5060.
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upstairs.  Open living dining has 
vaulted ceiling & wood burn-
ing fireplace flanked by built-in 
cabinetry.  Large yard, covered & 
open patios, trees.  1307 Indian 
Trail, Salado.  $239,921. Century 
21 Bill Bartlett  947-5050.

Escape to your own 
resort all on 5 pristine acres. 
As you walk into this home you 
will be taken by the grand great 
room with high ceilings, custom 
wood beams and large windows 
overlooking the swimming pool. 
$599,875. Call Ryan 541-2255. 
First Texas Brokerage 254-947-
5577 9/8tfn

Old world Charm and 
Custom craftsmanship 
can be seen throughout this 
Texas Hill Country Farm House 
on 4.9 tree-covered acre estate. 
Features include: Spray foam 
insulation. 2 tankless water heat-
ers. 2-16 seer AC/Heating units 
$549,900. Call Ryan  541-2255. 
First Texas Brokerage 947-5577 
9/8tfn

Elegant Austin Stone 
Home on tree-covered 
lot. Large covered back patio 
overlooking the tropical landscap-
ing and swimming pool. Granite 
counters, stainless steel appli-
ances. $499,900 Call First Texas 
Brokerage 947-5577.

4 BR, 2BA home on 3+ 
acres in Salado.  Fenced 
& cross-fenced for animals in 
Hidden Springs Subdivision.  3 
BR, 2 BA downstairs & bonus bed-
room/flex room upstairs.  Open 
floorplan with kitchen, breakfast, 
living & dining room perfect for 
entertaining or a large family 
gathering.  Master suite has 2 

vanities with separate shower & 
tub.  Split bedroom arrangement.  
Security system will convey with 
home.  1208 Mission Trail, Salado, 
$369,721. Century 21 Bill Bartlett  
947-5050.
01/23tfnf

This home is breath-
taking, simply breath-
taking!  Walk in the front door 
& have a view of the gorgeous 
living room, swimming pool & golf 
course.  Escape to your covered 
patio and have privacy from the 
neighbors & golfers provided by 
the lovely and tasteful landscap-
ing.  The kitchen opens to the 
family & breakfast room and view 
of the outdoor pool & golf course.  
You will be amazed with the size of 
the master bath to include a walk-
in shower.  1307 Walker Circle, 
Salado.  $459,721.  Century 21 
Bill Bartlett  947-5050.

Home on 9  acres 
fronting the Willing-
ham Creek in Hidden 
Springs.  Heavily wooded 
acreage creates a private setting.   
3 BR, 3 full baths, 2 half baths.  
Beautiful beam vaulted ceiling in 
living area.  Up to 3 horses are 
allowed.  1295 Western Trail, 
Salado.  $425,021. Century 21 
Bill Bartlett 947-5050

Property For Sale

Bell County Land - 6 ac. 
I-35; 20 ac. native oaks, home, 
guest house; 50 ac. I-35 Belton; 
50 ac. South of Salado, pond, 
barn.  Many more tracts to choose 
from.  Century 21 Bill Bartlett, 
Salado  www.C21bb.com 254-
947-5050.11/10 tfnf

from 1D
Kevlin Trail - Only 1 
lot left! Premier half-acre lot, 
underground utilities ready for 
building. $59,900. Call Raney 
and Associates: 254-913-1215. 
tfn08/02

Homesites in Heritage 
subdivision, 1+ acres, 
Salado schools, no city taxes, 
financing, restricted, call Raney 
and Associates: 254-913-1215. 
tfn08/20

Services

Cutting Edge Contrac-
tors-  Remodeling, roofing, 
custom patios, concrete, painting, 
dry wall. 254-624-0741 or tommy.
mungia@cuttingedgecontrac-
tors.us

Party room available 
for rent $25/hour.  Plan your 
holiday event at our place.  Salado 
Winery, 841 N. Main Street, (254) 
947-8011.

Storage

StowAway Storage 
Household - Commercial 10X10 
- 10x20 - 22x40 Clean, lighted, 
fenced, Key punch entry. 947-
5502 or 721-1807              tfnb

Storage space in 
Salado 8X12, 16X24 and up. 
Some have drive-in doors. Stage-
coach Storage 254-778-6779. tfnb 

Upholstery

Custom upholstery, resi-
dential, commercial, Kasmir fabric 

LONE STAR GRADING
& MATERIALS

COMMERCIAL  H  RESIDENTIAL
INDUSTRIAL

EXCAVATION • GRADING • SITE PREPARATION
YARDS • LOT CLEARING • PADS • ROADS

DRIVEWAYS • PARKING LOTS
ALL TYPES DIRT WORK • MATERIALS & HAULING

***FREE ESTIMATES***

(254) 947-0149 or (254) 933-7900
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Moffatt & Daughters
Plumbing Co. 

Service • Repair • Remodeling

Riannai authorized service provider
George (Bubba) Moffatt

254 289-5986 (local)

Master Plumber
Lic M017002

 1+ Acre Homesites
• Salado School District 
• No City Taxes
• Highly Restricted
• No Homeowners Association 
• Combined lots at discount
• Mail delivered to house

RaneyRealEstate.net

ANNA LOU RANEY, Broker/Realtor 254-913-1215
DANIEL RANEY, Realtor 254-760-2591
ANN CARROLL, Realtor 254-760-0101

Double J
  Tree
      Service

LOT CLEARING
ACREAGE MOWING

CHIPPING/MULCHING
TREE TRIMMING & REMOVAL

LICENSED SEPTIC SYSTEM INSTALLATION
TRACTOR WORK

24 HR EMERGENCY CALL

W. J. Martone
512-746-2172

Johnnie R. Martone
512-635-4064

No Job too Small
Free estimates

CBS Construction

Gravel Driveways | Parking Lots
Septic Tanks | House Pads
Lot Clearing | Demolition

Chet Sutton, owner-operator

254 718-1752

  
ANNA LOU RANEY, Broker/Realtor 254-913-1215

DANIEL RANEY, Realtor 254-760-2591
ANN CARROLL, Realtor 254-760-0101

GEORGE ROMFH, Realtor 254-718-6845

MLS
MULTIPLE LISTING SERVICE Temple/Belton 

Board of Realtors

RaneyRealEstate.net
For photographs and detailed descriptions of these unique properties

List your property with 
Raney and Associates

LAND LISTINGS

702 DEGRUMMOND WAY
Beautiful treed street this home is 
privately located on 1.53 acres with 
backyard fenced. 3 BR, 2.5 BA, for-
mal and informal dining, large great 
room with stone WBFP, multi pur-
pose 21 X 13 room upstairs.  

$385,000

341 WINDMILL HILL
Outstanding view on 5 .14 acres. 
Two wings: west with hardwoods 
floors, formal living and dining, 
breakfast room, open kitchen, mas-
ter bedroom with large bath and 
closets with adjoining study plus 
a second bedroom; east wing has  
game room, small kitchen area, two 
bedrooms and one bath. Very liv-
able.

 $599,900

NEW ROOF

1615 MILL CREEK DRIVE
Beautiful Chicago Brick home 
on historic Salado Creek! 5 BD, 3 
1/2 BA. Master suite is spacious 
with sitting area overlooking the 
creek, luxurious bath with 2 walk-
in closets. Security system, sprin-
kler system, large covered patio 
overlooking Salado creek and Mill 
Creek Golf Course. 5th bedroom 
or office has patio with creek view. 
Hardwood floors throughout living 
areas. So much room for family and 
entertaining!

$495.000  

1017 NORTH RIDGE
This home has charm galore, de-
signed by Darwin Britt. Former home 
of Texas writer A. C. Greene. Archi-
tectural features include wide wood 
plank floors, large beams, beaded 
board and stained glass! Secluded 
on .793 wooded acre, master bed-
room on first floor, two bedrooms 
up plus a study. Cupla on the third 
floor. Separate guest or mother-in-
law suite.

Ann Carroll (254) 760-0101
George Romfh (254) 718-6845

1207 CHISHOLM TRAIL
Desirable brick home with beautiful 
trees and located on the corner. Close 
to shopping this home has 4 BR, 2 BA. 
The living room has cathedral ceiling 
with a beam, WBFP and opens to the 
dining room and kitchen.  

$195,000

850 GREAT OAKS
Picturesque home on 3 acres with 
3 BD, 3 BA, large great room and 
dining room with charisma galore! 

$325,000

UNDER CONTRACT

694 ASHLEY COURT  Great location just off Main Street in established neighborhood. Lot size is .517 Acre  $ 72,500

KEVLIN TRAIL Only 1 lot left! Premier half-acre lot, underground utilities ready for building. $59,900

Only nine 1+ acre lots in the beautiful HERITAGE SUBDIVISION

UNDER CONTRACT

Al Clawson Disposal, Inc. 
(512) 930-5490    •    www.ClawsonDisposal.com

ASK US ABOUT OUR SERVICES
Waste Pickup    •    Recycling    •    Roll-Off Containers

gallery, free pickup and delivery, 
Recovery Room, 254-699-6105.

Vets, Pets & 
Livestock

Lost housecat! Dark 
brown and white. Diamond mark 
on nose pink tinged ear. Answers 
to Katy Sue. Royal View area. 
(254) 760-4266.

Animal Medical- Full ser-
vice vet hospital, (254)947-8800.

Window Cleaning

Clear View Window 
Cleaning: Windows, gutters, 
powerwashing, ceiling fan clean-
ing. (254)931-6172.

Oct. 3
	 7:01-7:22 p.m., 300 
Block Royal St. Advised 
kid possibly carrying a 
pick. I checked, could not 
locate. 
	 10:58-11:16 p.m., 900 
Block North Main St. Busi-
ness Alarm, false alarm.
	 12:12-12:22 p.m., 1500 
Block Guess Dr. Alarm 
Residential, secure.
	 12:25-12:29 p.m., 1000 
Block West Village. Crash, 
person struck by vehicle in 
parking lot.
Oct. 4
	 7:25 p.m., 200 Block 

Mary Lane or Hidden 
Glen. Disturbance.
Oct. 7
	 9:39-9:44 a.m., 2000 
Block Bluff Circle. Alarm 
Residential, all secure.
	 9:48-9:51 a.m., 200 
Block Mill Creek. Bur-
glary of construction trail-
er. Report.
	 9:21 p.m., 284 North. 
Crash.
Oct. 8
	 12:56-1:00 p.m., 282 
S. Main St. Criminal Mis-
chief, unable to locate.
	 7:34-7:46 p.m., 282 
Southbound IH-35. Roll 

over crash.
	 10:15-10:33 p.m., 100 
Block Royal St. Distur-
bance, intoxicated male.
	 10:41 p.m., 100 Block 
Royal Disturbance, call for 
the Brewery for a distur-
bance. Arrived and it was 
an off duty police officer 
that talked to a citizen but 
citizen thought he was be-
ing harassed. 
	 9:09-9:13 a.m., 815 N. 
Stagecoach Rd. (Horizon 
Bank). Alarm Business, 
custodial crew inside.
	

Salado Police Report Oct. 3-8
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Oct. 3
	 7:06-7:55 a.m., 2100 
Block Chisholm Trail. Out 
for a patient sick. Arrived 
on scene with Scott & White 
EMS and assisted them with 
patient loading.  Patient was 
transported. 1 unit, 1 person-
nel.
	 8:06-8:41 p.m., FM 
2484 and Rocking H Rd. Ar-
rived on scene to find patient 
with 2nd degree burns to 9 
percent of her body. Patient 
aware, no breathing prob-
lems. Medic unit arrived 

on scene and transported. 2 
units, 4 personnel.
	 11:54 a.m.- 12:23 p.m., 
10000 Block Cedar Knob 
Church Rd. Patient had 
fallen, Harker Heights trans-
ported. 1 unit, 1 personnel.
	 12:27-12:37 p.m., 1000 
Block S. Robertson Rd. Out 
for a patient pinned between 
car and gas pump. Arrived 
on scene to find SPD and BC 
Constable on scene with no 
one pinned. Patient had been 
between 2 vehicles. 3 units, 
5 personnel.

	 2:38-2:54 p.m., 000 
Block Rose Lane. Out for a 
grassfire. Arrived on scene 
to find a small grassfire 
burning towards a house. 
Attacked the fire and ex-
tinguished it. Grassfire had 
started from a burn pile. 
Extinguished all the fire and 
burn pile. 3 units, 5 person-
nel.
	 4:05-5:48 p.m., FM 
2115 and Hackberry Rd. 
Out for a grass fire, arrived 
on scene to find a hay field 
on fire with 11 round bales 
burning. Started attack 
on fire and called for mu-
tual aide from Holland and 
Bartlett VFD. They arrived 
on scene and assisted with 
extinguishing the fire. Once 
fire was out and all hot spots 
around the perimeter were 
out. Cleared Holland  and 
Bartlett. Checked one last 
time for hot spots and found 
none. 11 round bales were 
left burning in the field. 10 

personnel.
Oct. 4
	  4:13-4:53 p.m., 17000 
Block FM 2115. Out for a 
patient that had possibly 
overdosed on pills. Ar-
rived on scene with BCSO 
and found patient laying on 
floor unconscious. Got vi-
tals, checked airway and it 
was clear. Report given to 
Scott & White EMS. Scott 
& White arrived on scene 
and took over patient care. 
Assisted them with patient. 
Scott & White transported. 2 
units, 4 personnel.
Oct. 5
	 9:56-10:36 a.m., 286 
Exit SB 287 MM SB. Out 
for a diesel spill coming 
from an 18-wheeler. Arrived 
on scene to find the spill and 
18-wheeler in the city of 
Belton and the fuel leak was 
stopped. Notified dispatch 
and had Belton FD en route. 
Stood by until wrecker ar-
rived on scene and no more 

hazards. Once truck and 
clean up was done from spill 
all units cleared. 1 unit, 2 
personnel.
	 7:25-7:42 p.m., 11200 
Block Irene Ln. Out to pri-
ority 1 trauma. Arrived on 
scene to find 4 year old fe-
male sitting on father lap 
outside mother was apply-
ing pressure to the left side 
of head with paper towels. 
Mother stated patient was 
running on gravel drive and 
fell. Examined area and 
found a very small lacera-
tion that had already sealed 
itself. Parents were in-
formed of EMS options and 
chose to refuse medical care 
or transport. Patient refusal 
signed, witness by SPD of-
ficer. 2 units,  3 personnel.
	 2:48-3:02 p.m., 284 NB 
I-35. Out for a Motor Vehicle 
Accident unknown injuries. 
Went en route and searched 
from the 286 to the 282 and 
found no wreck. Found at 

the 282 NB a wrecker pick-
ing up a truck and trailer. No 
accident found and all units 
cleared. 2 units, 2 person-
nel.	
Oct. 7
	 11:52 a.m.- 12:01 p.m., 
000 Block Homestead Rd. 
Out for a patient chest pain. 
Canceled en route. 2 units, 2 
personnel
	 1:48-2:08 p.m., 1800 
Block William Rd. Trash 
can fire/was out on arrival. 1 
unit, 2 personnel.
Oct. 8
	 7:27-8:12 a.m., 282 SB. 
Rollover, SUV had rolled 
over and was upright along 
the service rd. Driver was 
the only patient and was still 
in driver seat, restrained and 
aware. Patient had no com-
plaints but did not recall 
the event. Assisted Scott & 
White with extrication onto 
the stretcher. Transported. 1 
unit, 1 personnel.
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