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Editor-in-Chief

	 The Salado Chamber of 
Commerce and Visitors Cen-
ter will move south to the 
Salado Museum after appro-
priate renovations are made 
for staff offices.
	 The renovations are esti-
mated at about $10,000. The 
Chamber Board of Direc-
tors awarded the bid to SVC 
Remodeling Construction at 
their March 16 meeting. 
	 Work will begin March 27 
and is expected to take about 
three weeks to complete. The 
Chamber and Visitors Center 
will give its current landlord, 
Tim Brown 30 days notice 
before vacating the current 
premises for the new location 
on South Main Street.
	 The new location will 
cost the Chamber $1,000 per 
month and the Chamber will 
have the first four months at 
no cost in order to recoup 
some its initial expenses in 
making the move to South 
Main Street.
	 While the Chamber is 
making this move, the Vil-
lage of Salado Board of Al-
dermen will meet on March 
23 in executive session to dis-
cuss the contract between the 

Chamber of Commerce and 
the Village of Salado. 
	 According to the agenda 
for the special called meet-
ing, the board will consult 
with Village attorney Linda 
Sjogren to seek her advice on 
the “duties and obligations of 
the parties and contract com-
pliance regarding: Contract 
between the Village of Sala-
do and the Salado Chamber 
of Commerce.”
	 Aldermen approved a con-
tract with the Salado Cham-
ber of Commerce on Sept. 1 
2016 to provide consultation 
services to the Village.
	 At that time, alderman 
Frank Coachman made a mo-
tion to approve and offer the 
contract to the Chamber of 
Commerce. Mayor Pro Tem 
Brown seconded. 
	 At that time, aldermen had 
a lengthy discussion about 
Chamber and Hotel/Motel 
funds, as well as Chamber 
reserves, and the need for the 
funds to be spent in a legal 
manner.
	 The motion carried 4-1 
with Alderman David Wil-
liams voting against.
	 The 2016-17 hotel occu-
pancy tax (HOT) budget is 
$187,850 in income, includ-
ing a transfer of $30,000 

from the HOT reserves to the 
HOT operating fund. It antic-
ipates $150,000 in occupancy 
taxes.
	 For expenses, it allots 
$20,550 in benefits for two 
employees and $122,100 in 
salaries and payroll taxes. It 
allocates $5,000 for a direc-
tor benefit program, $950 for 
insurance and a payment of 
$39,250 to the Salado Cham-
ber of Commerce.
	 The contract outlines a 
Scope of Work to be per-
formed by the Salado Cham-

ber of Commerce on behalf 
of the Village of Salado. The 
Scope of Work can be found 
in the Village of Salado bud-
get for 2016-17.
	 All events, rent and utili-
ties for the Chamber office 
and visitors center, market-
ing and advertising and other 
expenses are funded by the 
Chamber of Commerce.
	 HOT revenues are based 
on taxable occupancy to the 
lodging properties that are 
within the Extra-territorial 
jurisdiction (ETJ) of the Vil-

lage of Salado. 
	 Taxable occupancy re-
ceipts for calendar year 2016 
totaled $2.26 million. 
	 In 2007, occupancy re-
ceipts totaled $3.9 million 
with an inventory of 311 
rooms. The Stagecoach Inn 
accounted for just over a third 
of those revenues in 2007. At 
an assumed $110 average, 
this represents 35,454 room 
nights.
	 In calendar year 2015, 
HOT receipts totaled $2.66 
million. Stagecoach Inn mo-

tel closed early in the third 
quarter of 2015, taking 82 
rooms out of the inventory 
of rooms for Salado, lower-
ing the total inventory to 189 
rooms.
	 Calendar year 2014 was 
the final full year with Stage-
coach Inn motel contributing 
to the HOT funds. That year, 
taxable occupancy receipts 
totaled $2.88 million.
	 Salado Village Voice 
compiled a 10-year history of 
hotel occupancy receipts for 
Salado. 
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Graph A Graph B

Graph A: Total Hotel 
Occupancy Taxable 
Receipts per year for 
Salado (inside and out-
side city limits)
Graph B: Total Hotel 
Occupancy Taxable 
Receipts per year for 
Salado (inside and 
outside city limits) with 
Stagecoach Inn hotel 
receipts removed. Data 
from https://comptrol-
ler.texas.gov/transpar-
ency/open-data/hotel-
receipts/

Chamber plans move
		  Aldermen mull contract with CofC for use of HOT funds

By Tim Fleischer

Editor-in-Chief

	 If approved by the vot-
ers in the Village of Salado 
May 6, the disannexation of 
a large -- almost entirely resi-
dential -- portion of the Vil-
lage could result in the loss 
of  just over $170 million in 
market value.
	 Bell County Appraisal 
District, at the request of 
Salado Village Voice, calcu-
lated the loss in market value, 
taxable value and freeze ad-
justed value to the Village of 
Salado should the disannex-
ation proposal pass in May.
	 Marvin Hahn, chief ap-
praiser of BellCAD, stated 
that the market value of 
the property in the pro-
posed disannexation area is 
$170,082,524. The total Mar-
ket Value for the Village of 
Salado, according to the cer-
tified appraisal for 2016 was 
$289,774,823. 
	 The disannexation would 
leave a total market value of 
$119.6 million for the Village 
of Salado.
	 According to the 2016 
certified values, the Village 
of Salado has a certified total 
freeze adjusted taxable value 
of $168,130,780. The total 
freeze adjusted taxable value 
for the disannexation area is 
$81,638,646.
	 That total freeze adjusted 
taxable value for the Village 
of Salado was budgeted to 
generate a total of $911,100.97 
at the $0.5419 total tax rate 
for the 2016-17 fiscal year. 
Of that total in property tax 
revenue, $575,007.27 is for 
debt service ($0.542 per $100 
tax rate) for the $8.2 million 
sewer bond.
	 The maintenance and 
operation tax is $0.199 per 
$100. It generates $336,093 
in M&O revenues for the Vil-
lage. The loss of  $81.6 mil-
lion in freeze adjusted tax-

able property  would result 
in the loss of $163,195.65 in 
local revenue to the Village 
of Salado.
	 While the Village could 
face losing the local mainte-
nance and operating revenue, 
the property owners in the 
disannexation area would 
continue to be liable for their 
pro rata portion of the bond 
indebtedness.
	 According to Sec. 43.143. 
(c) of the Local Government 
Code: “If the area withdraws 
from a municipality as pro-
vided by this section and if, 
at the time of the withdrawal, 
the municipality owes any 
debts, by bond or otherwise, 
the area is not released from 
its pro rata share of that in-
debtedness.  The governing 
body shall continue to levy 
a property tax each year on 
the property in the area at 
the same rate that is levied 
on other property in the mu-
nicipality until the taxes col-
lected from the area equal its 
pro rata share of the indebt-
edness.  Those taxes may be 
charged only with the cost 
of levying and collecting the 
taxes, and the taxes shall be 
applied exclusively to the 
payment of the pro rata share 
of the indebtedness.  This 
subsection does not prevent 
the inhabitants of the area 
from paying in full at any 
time their pro rata share of 
the indebtedness.”
	 Hahn stated that home-
owners whose taxes are fro-
zen will not see an increase 
in taxes due to the disannex-
ation election.
	 However, property owners 
whose taxes are not frozen 
will be taxed at the same rate 
for the I&S as other proper-
ties in the Village.
	 In addition, the property 
owners of the disannexed 
area will be responsible for 
the cost of levying and col-
lecting the taxes. How much 

that might be has not been 
determined.
	 The potential impact upon 
the M&O budget of the Vil-
lage of Salado is daunting, to 
say the least.
	 Faced with the loss of 
more than $163,195.65 in 
M&O revenues, aldermen 
will either have to drastically 
cut its budget for 2017-18 or 
increase the M&O to the re-
maining properties by a sub-
stantial amount.
	 In order to the same 
$336,093 in M&O revenues 
for the Village in 2017-18 as 
it did in 2016-17, the Village 
could face an increase in the 
M&O property tax to $0.3889 
per $100 valuation. This esti-
mate is based upon the loss of 
the disannexed area from the 
tax rolls and no other changes 
in property values. 
	 However, the board of al-
dermen in setting the budget 
for 2017-18 could adopt a tax 
rate that is 8 percent more 
than the effective tax rate 
(the rate needed to retire the 
debt and generate the same 
amount of revenue as the 
previous year) without facing 
the possibility of a rollback 
election. This could raise 
the M&O rollback rate to 
$0.4200 per $100.
	 Coupled with the current 
I&S tax rate of $0.342 per 
$100 would bring the pos-
sible rollback rate to $0.762 
per $100 evaluation, making 
the Village of Salado’s prop-
erty tax the second-highest in 
Bell County behind Rogers’ 
tax rate of $0.7897 per $100.
	 Advocates of disannex-
ation have stated that they 
will be protected from an-
nexation by other municipali-
ties such as Belton, because 
they will remain within the 
ETJ of Salado.
	 According to the minutes 
of the Aug. 25 2016 special 
called meeting of aldermen, 
See Disannexation, page 3A

Village will lose more than 
$170 Million in market 
value due to disannexation 

	 Wildflower Weekend 
March 24-26 will have ac-
tivities and events throughout 
the entire Village for any age 
group to enjoy. 
	 The Wildflower Pub 
Crawl on March 24 will of-
ficially kick off the weekend. 
Each “stop” will feature a 
different Texas craft beer for 
you and your party to savor.  
This event is for adults 21 and 
over only.  Go to Salado.com 
for more information and to 
buy tickets.
	 The Edgy Art Show will 
be an interactive event 11 
a.m.-3 p.m. at Peddler’s Alley. 
Watch this family friendly 
event as artists compete live 
for your votes at the fourth 

Taste wines from 20 Texas wineries during the 9th Annual Texas Wine and Rogue Art Fes-
tival March 25-26 on the grounds of Salado Winery, 841 N. Main St. (Photo by Marilyn Fleischer)

annual Edgy Live Art Com-
petition located at 2 Peddler’s 
Alley (next door to Salado 
Glassworks).  Featured artists 
will create amazing pieces of 
art in several different medi-
ums and you can pick your 
favorite artist and a chance 
to win the competition piece.  
Tickets will be available for 
purchase at Edgy.  
	 The 17th Annual Wild-
flower Art Fair & Festival 
will be March 25-26 in Pace 
Park. This family friendly 
event features many vendors 
selling handcrafted art from 
all over the state.  Wood-
working, fine jewelry, origi-
nal paintings, photography, 
and food vendors.  Admis-

sion is $2.
	 The Texas Wine and 
Rogue Art Festival will be 
March 25-26 on the grounds 
of  Salado Winery and Salado 
Wine Seller, 841 N. Main St. 
The event features dozens of 
wineries from across Texas, 
delectable artisan foods and 
displays by Texas artists in 
several media.  Call 254-947-
8011 or visit saladowine.com 
for more information. 
	 Children and well-be-
haved pets on leashes are al-
lowed.  
	 For information visit Sala-
do.com or call Salado Cham-
ber of Commerce and Visi-
tors Bureau at 254-947-5040.  

	 Salado placed second 
among communities of 3,000 
or less in the 2017 Governor’s 
Community Achievement 
Awards (GCAA), one of the 
most prestigious annual en-
vironmental awards in Texas. 
Muenster took first place in 

the small town division and 
will be awarded a $90,000 
landscape grant.
	 Salado is also one of 21 
communities in Texas to re-
ceived the Award of Excel-
lence for applications receiv-
ing a score of 90 or higher in 

Keep Texas Beautiful gives 
Salado Award of Excellence 

2017. Killeen and Nolanville 
also received the Award of 
Excellence.
In addition, the Salado Vol-
unteers received the Civic 
Organization Award for the 
work they do in beautifying 

Wildflower Weekend 
brings art to Salado
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Heritage Forum
by Edwin Feulner

Rich 
Lowry

	 Of all the arguments to 
make for repealing and re-
placing Obamacare, the very 
worst is that people don’t 
need health insurance.
	 Yet this is a Trump ad-
ministration talking point. 
White House press secretary 
Sean Spicer recently told re-
porters, “When we get asked 
the question, ‘How many 
people are going to get cov-
ered?’ that’s not the ques-
tion that should be asked.” 
Pressed on the merits of the 
bill by George Stephanopou-
los on ABC’s “This Week,” 
Office of Management and 
Budget Director Mick Mul-
vaney shot back, “You’re 
worried about getting people 
covered.” As if that’s a woe-
ful mistake.
	 This is a strange rhetor-
ical tack for officials in an 
administration led by a pres-
ident who pledged to cover 
everyone. Nor is it substan-
tively or political defensible. 
Repealing and replacing 
Obamacare will require ev-
ery ounce of persuasiveness 
that Republicans can muster, 
especially with the Congres-
sional Budget Office now es-
timating that under Trump-
care, 14 million fewer people 
will be insured in 2018. The 
early signs aren’t encourag-
ing. 
	 It is true that health insur-
ance isn’t a panacea. There 
is an academic debate about 
whether having health insur-
ance leads to longer lives, 
and all sorts of factors be-

The worst argument for Trump-care

sides insurance affect health 
and the quality of medical 
care (geography, for in-
stance, can have more of an 
impact on care than whether 
someone is insured).
	 Still, there is abundant ev-
idence of the benefits of in-
surance. Research has found 
that Romneycare in Mas-
sachusetts improved mea-
sures of physical and mental 
health. A Rice University 
study of the Houston area 
found that people with insur-
ance report being in better 
health than those who lack 
it. If nothing else, insurance 
is protection against cata-
strophic health expenses and 
provides a sense of security.
	 Republicans obviously 
shouldn’t accept the prem-
ises of their detractors. By 
all means, they should hit 
the dubious methodology of 
the CBO, which vastly over-
estimated how many people 
would be covered on the 
Obamacare exchanges in the 
first place. And they should 
point out Obamacare’s man-
ifest failings, including an 
overreliance on the deeply 
flawed Medicaid program 
and insurance exchanges that 
are shaky at best (the exec-
utive of Aetna recently said 

they are in a “death spiral”). 
But the best response to 
criticisms that Trumpcare 
doesn’t cover enough people 
is simple and more funda-
mental -- to get the coverage 
numbers up. If the head-
line-grabbing numbers from 
the CBO don’t prompt the 
GOP to realize this, nothing 
will. Making the tax cred-
it in the Republican plan 
more generous further down 
the income scale would be 
a start. President Trump’s 
promises about universal 
coverage aren’t achievable, 
but to lurch in the other di-
rection and dismiss the sig-
nificance of health insurance 
is politically poisonous.
	 At its best, the Trump 
phenomenon pointed to a 
GOP more grounded in the 
economic realities of work-
ing-class life. It is remark-
able, then, that the first major 
legislative priority out of the 
box is being sold, in part, in 
stereotypically Republican 
terms, and by Trump’s own 
team. 
	 Before going further 
down this road, they should 
think about why Trump, with 
his keen gut-level political 
instinct, never told audienc-
es or interviewers that he’d 
be fine with fewer people 
having insurance, and adjust 
their rhetoric and their plan 
accordingly. 
	 Rich Lowry is editor of 
the National Review.
	 (c) 2017 by King Features 
Synd., Inc.

Q & A Town Hall planned 
for April 4
	 A Question and Answer 
Town Hall is Tuesday, 4 
April, 6:30 p.m.. in the Civic 
Center.  Our Village Attor-
ney, Alan Bojorquez, will 
answer questions concerning 
matters of interest or issues 
on the May Ballot.  An excel-
lent opportunity to receive 
legal/accurate answers.
	 Monday Evening with the 
Mayor, 27 March, 6:30 p.m. 
will be another opportunity 
for residents who have lived 
in Salado two years or less 
to ask questions about Sala-
do and meet other new res-
idents.   The first meeting 
was excellent.   We left with 
new friends and perspec-
tives about Village Life.  The 
meeting is in the Municipal 
Building not the Civic Cen-
ter. 
	 Secret meetings?  Please 
know “The Village of Sala-
do reserves the right to ad-
journ into executive session 
at any time during the course 
of a meeting to discuss any 

matters authorized by Texas 
Government Code Sessions 
551.071 (Consultation with 
an Attorney), 551.072 (De-
liberations about Real Prop-
erty), 551.073 (Deliberations 
about gifts and donations), 
551.074 (Personnel Mat-
ters), 551.076 (Deliberations 
about Security Devices), and 
551.087 (Economic Develop-
ment).  The Aldermen/Lady 
are very conscious of Walk-
ing and Eating Quorums.  
	 Congratulations, Keep 
Salado Beautiful (KSB)!  
KSB Salado entered the State 
Keep Texas Beautiful (KTB) 
2017 Governor’s Community 

Achievement Awards.  The 
results:
	 The Salado KSB Volun-
teer Team, the Salado Six, 
WON the Civic Organiza-
tion Award and will be rec-
ognized in June’s KTB State 
meeting, San Antonio.
	 The Salado KSB received 
the AWARD OF EXCEL-
LENCE for a total score of 90 
or above.  Additionally, The 
Salado KSB was SECOND 
in the Landscape Awards for 
towns under 3,000.  THIS 
IS STATE COMPETITION 
and look what Salado KSB 
did! 
	 Three years ago, KSB, 
consisted of a small commit-
tee chaired by Susan Terry.  
In this week’s Board Meet-
ing, 10 Board Members and 
Chair, Susan Terry, made 
exciting plans for this year.  
Experience the Salado Spir-
it! 
	 What is wrong with Sala-
do?  NOTHING!

To the Editor:
	 It’s time the real story is 
told as to why the sewer is 
taking so long to get started. 
There is a local person that 
has extensive Commercial 
property holdings in Salado 
and that person seems to be 
concerned that the future de-
velopment of the Sanctuary 
will impact their property in a 
negative way. This person has 
called every State and Feder-
al Agency that has jurisdic-
tion over the implementation 
of the sewer system and has 
repeatedly thrown roadblocks 
that have caused delays of 8 
months or longer. Because of 
this persons complaints, ad-
ditional studies have had to 

be performed to the tune of 
$77,000 dollars. It is because 
of this persons greed that the 
Village Taxpayers have had 
to spend over $100,00 dollars 
total and the project is still on 
hold. The engineering work 
for the plant and the pipelines 
are complete and the Village 
is ready to go out for bid on 
the total project as soon as 
the last Federal Agency gives 
their approval. What is sad is 
that one person can hold an 

entire community ransom for 
their own personal gain. 
	 Our village voted for this 
sewer project, it’s time to let 
the Aldermen do their job and 
get the Sewer moving. There 
seems to be just a handful of 
people in our Village that are 
against everything, it’s time 
to do what they majority vot-
ed to do. Folks we got the 
“Tail wagging the Dog!!!
	 Sincerely, 
	 Dave Gardner

Reader says the
“Tail wagging the Dog “

	 President Trump’s exec-
utive order on immigration 
has more than its fair share 
of critics. Among them, ap-
parently, is someone at the 
Department of Homeland 
Security. The leaked report 
indicating that the chil-
dren of immigrants raised 
in America radicalize at a 
higher rate than their parents 
do was plainly meant to un-
dercut the president’s order.
	 But regardless of what 
motivated the leak, the re-
port underscores a serious 
problem with the process by 
which immigrants become 
Americans. In short, it’s bro-
ken. Our slogan “e pluribus 
unum” -- Latin for “out of 
many, one” -- has become a 
joke.
	 Many of America’s insti-
tutions no longer promote 
assimilation. And it isn’t 
only conservatives who are 
worried.
	 Consider what the dis-
tinguished liberal historian 
Arthur M. Schlesinger Jr. 
had to say in his book “The 
Disuniting of America.” He 
argued that a stress on eth-
nicity has benefits, but that 
“its underlying philosophy 
is that the United States is 
not a nation of individuals 
at all but a nation of groups, 
that ethnicity is the defining 
experience for Americans.” 
This dogma, he warned, “re-
places assimilation by frag-
mentation, integration by 
separatism. It belittles unum 
and glorifies pluribus.”
	 The noted conservative 
William E. Simon Jr. has 
sounded the same alarm: 
“There are disturbing signs 
that here in America differ-
ence and separateness are 
becoming more pronounced 
than unity and harmony.” 
And the distinguished cul-

tural historian Samuel P 
Huntington warns in this 
book “Who Are We?” that 
citizenship has been deval-
ued and that a revival of na-
tional identity is crucial to 
America’s very survival.
	 What has gone wrong? 
Simon is right to trace the 
trend not to any basic change 
in the immigrant population 
-- today’s newcomers are as 
willing as ever to be assim-
ilated -- but to the cultur-
al revolution of the 1960s, 
which was led by elite young 
students and the post-col-
lege generation of the day. 
In the backlash to the war 
in Vietnam, authority was 
called into question, and the 
nation’s superiority was no 
longer accepted.
	 Patriotism itself became 
suspect, derisively equated 
with Rudyard Kipling’s jin-
goism: “To be born an En-
glishmen means winning the 
first prize in God’s lottery.” 
The American flag became 
a right-wing symbol, bran-
dished by the people who 
beat up protest marchers. 
“Americanization” was seen 
as coercive, even ruthless 
– in the catch-phrase of the 
day, the equivalent of de-
stroying a village in order to 
save it.
	 The cultural relativists 
largely succeeded in impos-
ing their attitude on the po-
litical scene. But, as usual, 
the pendulum swung too far. 
If nothing was better than 
anything else, then nothing 
could be much worse. Mor-
als were as relative as val-
ues; the criminal, molded 

by genes and environment, 
wasn’t really responsible for 
his or her crimes. And love 
of country was simply naïve 
and embarrassing.
	 Even Ralph Nader was 
brusquely rebuffed when 
he suggested that 100 of 
America’s biggest business-
es should honor their coun-
try by reciting the Pledge of 
Allegiance at their annual 
meetings. Only one company 
agreed. Half never respond-
ed. The CEO of Aetna Insur-
ance told Nader that his idea 
was “contrary to the princi-
ples on which our democracy 
was founded.”
	 In fact, the Pledge was on 
the wane even in the nation’s 
classrooms, where for de-
cades it had marked the be-
ginning of each school day. 
By one count, fewer than 
half of America’s teachers 
and students now recite it.
	 What matters, of course, 
isn’t the Pledge itself, but 
the ideals that it stands for. 
Today’s immigrants are en-
couraged to think, act and 
identify as a separate group, 
not to identify proudly as 
Americans. Can we be sur-
prised that some of them 
would become easy prey for 
terrorist recruiters?
	 I doubt that the leaker of 
that DHS report was trying 
to force us to confront our 
assimilation problem. But 
that’s exactly what we need 
to do. Otherwise it’s only 
a matter of time before we 
cease being a nation entirely.
Ed Feulner is founder of The 
Heritage Foundation (www.
heritage.org).

(Dis)United We Stumble
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RITA ZBRANEK
254-947-0995
40 S. MAIN ST. STE. A • SALADO, TX 76571

www.farmersagent.com/rzbranek

DON’T COMPROMISE ON AUTO 
INSURANCE, GET FARMERS.

PERSONAL SERVICE YOU DESERVE. CALL TODAY. 

YOUR LOCAL FARMERS AGENT
CURRENTLY OFFERS SAVINGS FOR:

The Mortgage You Need - The Service You Expect
• Competitive Rates
• Fixed and Adjustable Rate Mortgage Loans
• Conventional, FHA, VA & USDA Financing
• Mortgages for Home Owners and Investors
• Home Equity Loans

Lorraine Basham, Sr. Loan Officer
Registered Mortgage Loan Orginator
NMLS #415114

CALL TODAY FOR YOUR 
FREE MORTGAGE CONSULTATION

(254) 760-0534 cell
(254) 947-3454 office

40 North Main, Suite C, Salado, TX
lorraineb@fairwaymc.com

All loans subject to credit approval

Copyright©2016 Fairway Independent Mortgage Corporation. NMLS#2289. 4801 S. Biltmore Lane, Madison, WI 
53718, 1-877-699-0353. All rights reserved. This is not an offer to enter into an agreement. Not all customers will 
qualify. Information, rates and programs are subject to change without notice. All products are subject to credit and 
property approval. Other restrictions and limitations may apply. Equal Housing Lender. 

Finney Insurance Agency

820 S. Main Street, Belton
Allison@finneyinsurance.com

(254) 939-5751

Home • Auto • Life • Liability 
Commercial • Farm • Ranch

Agent Allison Finney

Salado
254.947.8480

Gatesville
254.865.2114

Temple
254.773.7750

Harker Heights
254.699.1102

FCTTX.com

First Community Title
Serving Bell, Coryell and  Williamson Counties

Coryell

Bell

Williamson

213 Mill Creek Dr., #140

Liz Armstrong
Salado Branch Manager

Escrow Officer

liz.armstrong@monteithtitle.com

(254) 947-3922
fax (254) 947-8632

www.monteithtitle.com

You Have a Choice™
Home owned and operated since 1876.

Bruce A. Bolick, CPA
Tax Time is here!

Call for an appointment
(254) 718-7299 or (254) 947-1040

560 North Main, Suite 4, Office 3
ACROSS FROM THE CIVIC CENTER

SaladoCPA@aol.com

the board took two actions 
regarding property that dis-
annexes from the Village of 
Salado. 
	 The board approved a 
Resolution that would au-
thorize the “release or trans-
fer of any disannexed areas 
from the extraterritorial ju-
risdiction of the Village and 
recognizing the statutory 
requirement that property 
owners disannexed or re-
leased from the extraterrito-
rial jurisdiction of the Vil-
lage will still be responsible 
for the indebtedness of the 
Village incurred while prop-
erty was within the territori-
al limits of the Village, and 
authorize city administrator 
to take appropriate action, as 
presented. Fred Brown made 
the motion, which received a 
second from Frank Coach-
man. The motion carried 
unanimously.
	 Aldermen at that meeting 
also approved an “interlocal 
agreement transferring prop-
erty located in the extrater-
ritorial jurisdiction from the 
Village to the extraterritorial 
jurisdiction of a neighbor-
ing municipality” and “au-
thorized  city administrator 
to take appropriate action 
including negotiations with 
neighboring city.”
	 Then-city administrator 
Kim Foutz explained that 
this agreement would be put 
into use only if property is 
disannexed.
	 Coachman  made the 
motion, which was also ap-
proved unanimously.
	 If the disannexation were 
to pass in a referendum, the 
incumbent members would 
retain their seats until a spe-
cial election was conducted 
to replace them.
	 The disannexation elec-
tion is on the same ballot 
as an aldermen election in 
which seven candidates are 

vying for three two-year 
terms on the board. Three of 
those candidates are incum-
bents: Fred Brown, Michael 
McDougal and David Wil-
liams. Challengers are Judy 
Fields, Andy Jackson, Linda 
Reynolds and Chris Tramel. 
Six of the seven candidates 
live in the proposed area for 
disannexation. Reynolds is 
the only candidate who does 
not reside in the proposed 
area of disannexation.
	 Furthermore, if the dis-
annexation election passes, 
the remaining aldermen and 
mayor will have to vacate 
their offices because they 
live in the disannexed area.
	  The local government 
code states in Sec. 22.041.  
“VACANCY ON GOVERN-
ING BODY IS CREATED.  
(a)  If an alderman moves 

from the ward from which 
the alderman is elected, the 
alderman’s office is consid-
ered vacant.”
	 Because there is more 
than one vacancy at one 
time, according to Sec. 
22.011 of the local govern-
ment code: “FILLING VA-
CANCY IN MUNICIPAL 
OFFICE UNDER SPECIAL 
CIRCUMSTANCES.  If a 
vacancy occurs in a munic-
ipal office by a resignation 
or in another manner and if 
the vacancy cannot be filled 
as provided by other law, the 
commissioners court of the 
county in which the munic-
ipality is located shall order 
an election to fill the vacan-
cy if the court is petitioned to 
do so by at least 26 taxpaying 
voters residing in the munic-
ipality.”
	
 	
ht t p: //www.beltontexas.

Disannexation FROM Page 1A
Buttons show
set April 1-2
	 “Buttons Bridging the 
Gap,” Texas State Button So-
ciety’s [TSBS] annual Spring 
Show is open to the public 
Saturday and Sunday, April 
1-2. Hosted by Waco’s Bra-
zos Button Club, the event is 
admission FREE and family 
friendly. All are invited to 
view, learn and discover but-
tons as affordable works of 
art in miniature.
	 Button collectors from 
across Texas — and around 
the country — will gath-
er in Waco to learn more 
about these small, often 
hand-crafted treasures.
	 Showrooms are open to 
the public 9 a.m. - 5 p.m. 
Saturday and 10 a.m. - 2 p.m. 
Sunday at the Hilton Waco 
[113 S. University Parks Dr., 
Waco, Tx 76701]. For other 
details visit texasstatebutton-
society.com. 
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Community LifeCommunity Life

Lobby
 Mon - Fri  9 a.m. - 3 p.m.

Drive-in
 Mon - Thur 

7:30 a.m. - 4 p.m. 
 Fri 

7:30 a.m. - 5:30 p.m.
Sat  

9 a.m.- noon

Member FDIC

Main Street at 
Thomas Arnold Road, Salado

(254) 947-5852 

fsbcentex.com 

Mill Creek Cleaners

Quality Dry Cleaning, Laundry, 
Alterations & Custom Tailoring

213 Mill Creek Drive, Suite 200
Salado Plaza next to Brookshire Brothers

Mon-Fri 8-6 • Sat 9-2 • Closed Sunday
 (254) 947-0100

  

IH-35 at Blacksmith Rd.
947-5241 

Sunday
Bible Classes • 9 a.m.      Worship • 10 a.m.

Spanish Worship - Call Church for times

Wednesday
Bible Classes • 6:30 p.m.

The Salado Church of Christ
‘Shaped by His Cross, Sharing His 

truth, Showing His love.’ 

 “We invite you to worship 
with us at any available 
opportunity. You will find 
a group of sincere, God-
loving and Christ-exalting 
people, who will make you 
feel at home with our church 
family.    
  -Joe Keyes, minister

St. Stephen
Catholic 
Church

Mass Schedule
Tuesday - 6 p.m. 

Wed & Thurs - 8:30 a.m.
Friday - Noon

Saturday - 5:30 p.m.
Confesssions 4:30-5:15 p.m. 

or call for an appointment
Friday

Adoration (Holy Hour) 11 a.m.
Sunday

 (English) 9 a.m.
(Spanish) 11 a.m. 

Office Hours: Monday - Friday 
9 a.m. - Noon & 1:30 - 3 p.m.

601 FM 2268 
947-8037

www.saintstephenchurch.org

Religious Education
 Classes - Wednesday

 K thru 12th            5:30 - 8 p.m. 

St. Joseph’s 
Episcopal Church

881 North Main Street
947-3160

S t J o s e p h S a l a d o . o rg

Sunday School
Sun.  10:10 a.m.
Holy Eucharist

Sun.  9 a.m. & 11 a.m.

	 Kamylle Palomino of 
Salado became the bride of  
Capt. Joshua Coleman, also 
of Salado, during a double 
ring ceremony March 18, 
2017 at The Springs Event 
Center in Georgetown. Dr. 
Travis Burleson of First Bap-
tist Church of Salado offici-
ated the ceremony.
	 The bride is the daughter 
of Anthony and Lisa Palomi-
no of Salado.
	 The groom is the son of 
Cliff and Regina Coleman of 
Salado and the late Christy 
Coleman of Salado.
	 The bride is a 2008 grad-
uate of Salado High School 
and a graduate of Texas 
A&M University and UT 
Medical Branch with a Doc-
torate of Physical Therapy. 
She is a physical therapist at 
Kidz Therapeze in Killeen.
	 The groom is also a 2008 
graduate of Salado High 
School. He is a graduate of 
the U.S. Military Academy 
at West Point with a Bache-
lor’s Degree in Environmen-
tal Engineering. He is a cap-
tain in the U.S. Army.
	 The bride wore an Ivory 

Morilee fit and flare dress 
with elegant embroidery and 

Kamylle Palomino marries 
Capt. Joshua Coleman

beading over Chantilly lace 
and covered button detail 

down the back.
	 Kelsey Palomino, of Sal-
ado and sister of the bride, 
served as Maid of Honor.
	 Bridesmaids were Brittni 
Willis of Houston, Jackie 
Ferguson of Germany, Sa-
tyra Jenkins of College Sta-
tion, Karleigh Goodnight of 
Salado, and Junior Brides-
maid Arianna Cruz cousin of 
the bride of Temple
	 Kyle Stammer of Fay-
etteville, NC, served as Best 
Man.
	 Groomsmen were Gar-
ret Ward, brother of the 
groom of Salado, Hunter 
Ward, brother of the groom 
of Salado, Craig Jackson of 
Anchorage, AK, Nick Kiser 
of Nashville, TN, and Chris 
Helgeson of Leesville, LA.
	 Serving as Greeters were  
Anthony Guerra and Aidan 
Guerra, both of Temple and 
cousins of the bride.
	 Parents of the groom Cliff 
and Regina Coleman hosted  
a rehearsal dinner at Cimar-
ron Hills Country Club.
	 Following a honeymoon 
trip to New Zealand, the 
couple will make their home 
in Georgia where Capt. Cole-
man is stationed.

	 Cedar Valley Baptist 
Church invites you to join 
them for gospel singing 7-10 
p.m.  March 24.
	 A pot luck meal will fol-
low the gospel singing.
	 The church is located 
eight miles southwest of Sal-
ado at 12337 FM 2843.
	 For more information, 
call 254-947-5100.

	 Dean Mooney, floral de-
signer for Brookshire Broth-
ers, will provide the pro-
gram for the Chisholm Trail 
American Business Wom-
en’s Association at the April 
6, meeting.  Social time 
starts at 6 p.m. at the Pres-
byterian Church of Salado, 
105 Salado Plaza Drive. The 
meeting will start at 6:15 
p.m. Dessert will be provid-
ed but individuals are invit-

ed to bring a dinner meal if 
they wish.
	 Mooney has been the 
florist designer for Brook-
shire Brothers since the store 
opened seven years ago. In 
1980 he was on the Teleflo-
ra design team to decorate 
the White House.  One of 
his many accomplishments 
came in 1992 when he was 
inducted into the prestigious 
organization of American 

Institute of Floral Design-
ers. Dean will design and 
demonstrate some unique 
and interesting arrangements 
at the meeting. 
	 Visitors are welcome.  
	 For more information 
contact Charmaine Barker 
at charmainebarker@gmail.
com or Dorothy Dentry at 
ddentry13@gmail.com or 
254 947-4667.

Floral designer Dean Mooney 
presents  ABWA program Gospel Singing 

held March 24

	 First United Methodist 
Church in Bartlett (645 W. 
Clark Street) is holding a Ga-
rage Sale, Saturday, April 1, 
8 a.m. - 2 p.m. They will also 
be selling Sausage Wraps, 
Baked Goods (individual and 
family size), and cold bottles 
of water.  Among the items 
available are a small stove 
hood, a large carpet remnant, 
several children’s bikes as 
well as the usual small ap-
pliances, home décor & fur-
nishings, kitchen items, chil-
dren’s items, books, etc. 

Bartlett Methodist 
hold Garage Sale
April 1

Kamylle Palomino  now Mrs. Joshua Coleman

	 Salado Lions Club will 
hold a garage sale at Jack’s 
Barn, 525 Pace Park Rd. on 
April 1. 
	 Anyone thinking about 
their spring cleaning is asked 
to donate their items to the 
Lions Club 9 a.m.-3 p.m. 
March 29-March 31. The 
club will accept donations 
at Jack’s Barn during those 
hours.
	 If you need items picked 
up prior to these dates, call 
Tom McMahan at 254-717-

4534.
	 Proceeds from the Garage 
Sale will be used to fund the 
many civic activities the Sal-
ado Lions Club is involved 
in, such as scholarships for 
graduating seniors, eye ex-
ams and glasses for finan-
cilly disadvantaged children, 
the Salado Family Relief 
Fund, the Texas Lions Camp 
for children with physical 
disabilities and other civic 
activities in the Salado com-
munity.
	

Lions collect items 
for Garage Sale

	 Salado Masonic Lodge 
#296 will present Lisa M. 
Nix with its Mirabeau B. 
Lamar Medal during a lun-
cheon noon March 25 at the 
Salado Civic Center.
	 Mirabeau Lamar, a mem-
ber of Harmony Lodge #6, 
was the second President of 
the Republic of Texas. He is 
remembered as the “Father 
of Public Schools in Texas.”
	 The award is presented to 
Nix for her excellence in ed-
ucation and for her outstand-
ing service to the communi-
ty of Salado and the Salado 
school. 
	 The lunch will be a pot 
luck style offering. 

Nix honored by Masonic 
Lodge March 25
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....serving those who love and remember

(254) 947-0066
949 West Village Road, Salado

BroeckerFuneralHome.com

Dossman 
Funeral Home

2525 N. Main • Belton • 933-2525
“In Service to our fellow man...”

When I remember You on my bed, I meditate on You in the night 
watches, For You have been my help...

				    Psalm 63: 6,7

16258 Gooseneck Road,  Salado
Church service starts 10 am

(254) 947-7211
www.3ccowboyfellowship.org
Follow events on our website calendar

Rev. Lara Whitley Franklin, Pastor
 650 Royal Street    
  (254) 947-5482

www.saladoumc.org 

Office hours:  
Mon - Fri 8:30 a.m. - 4 p.m.
Facebook.com/saladoumc

Sunday, March 26
9 am Worship service in Worship Center Traditional
10 am Sunday School All Ages
11:15 am Worship Service in Chapel Contemporary
5 - 8 pm  Wild Game Dinner @ Tenroc Ranch

“FourTwelve” Youth in the YAC
Fellowship Meal
Adult Book study “Parables”
Adult Ramp project
M&M Kids

5 - 7:15 pm  
5:15 pm
6 pm
6-7 p.m         
6-7 pm  

Wednesday, March 29

Salado Lions Club

Garage Sale
April 1 at Jack’s Barn

525 Pace Park Road
8 a.m. - ?

Donations accepted thru March 31
pickup available (254) 717-4535  |  dropoff 9 - 4 

gracesalado.com  |  5798 FM 2484 in Salado  |  254.947.5917

A people of biblical faith,
eternal hope, and radical love.

	 The Annual Wild Game 
Dinner begins 5 p.m. March 
26 at Tenroc Ranch in Sala-
do.
	 Proceeds benefit the lo-
cal and foreign missions of 
the Salado United Methodist 
Church.
	 The Wild Game Dinner 
features the dishes from 
some of the finest cooks of 
wild game and fish in the 

SUMC March 26 Wild Game 
Dinner  to benefit mission 

(Photo by Tim Fleischer)
You’ll love the flavors of the annual Wild Game Dinner at Tenroc Ranch on March 26. 
Sponsored by Salado United Methodist Church, donations are accepted at the door.

area.
	 You will find dishes fea-
turing venison, bison, wild 
boar, game birds such as 
quail and dove, trout, bass, 
and exotic dishes as well.
	 You can support this ef-
fort by donating wild game 
or fish or auction items. 
Johnny Bratton will gavel a 
live auction during the eve-
ning. There will also be a 

silent auction.
	 There will be a Cowboy 
Cooking demonstration. Paul 
Cox will perform during the 
evening for your entertain-
ment.
	 Donations will be accept-
ed at the door.
	 For more information 
about the event, call the 
church at 254-947-5482.

	 When it comes to plants, 
research is constantly being 
done to find and improve 
characteristics of the many 
different varieties of flow-
ering, and fruiting plants, 
as well as trees and grasses.   
Those which perform well 
and have the desired charac-
teristics may get to wear the 
title of Texas Superstar®.
	 When you think about 
Superstar plants, popularity 
and success comes to mind.  
When it comes to being a 
Texas Superstar®, a plant 
must be not only beautiful, 
but must also perform well 
for both the consumer and 
the grower. 
	 Texas Superstars® are va-
rieties which have been sub-
jected to statewide testing by 
Texas A&M AgriLife Re-
search and the Texas A&M 
AgriLife Extension Service.  
It is not easy to become a 
Texas Superstar® and it cer-
tainly doesn’t happen over-
night.
	 First, a plant undergoes 
several of years of extensive 
field trails during which it 
has to show itself to be dis-
ease and insect tolerant, 
beautiful, and yet require 
minimal care and minimal 
need for chemical pest con-
trol.   Next the decision on 
what plants will be marketed 
as Texas Superstar® plants is 
made by an Executive Board 
based on observations made 
at plots and demonstration 
trials throughout the state.  
Finally, growers must be able 
to produce a sufficient num-
ber of the plants to meet the 
increased demand created by 
Texas Superstar® marketing. 
Along with A&M designated 
EarthKind® plants, some 27 
different Texas Superstar® 
plants will be available for 
purchase at the annual Bell 
County Master Gardener’s 
annual spring plant sale be-
ing held Saturday, 8 a.m. – 1 
p.m., March 25 at the Bell 
County AgriLife Building 
grounds located at 1605 N. 
Main in Belton.  Many cate-
gories of specialty and Heir-
loom plants will be available 
including annuals, perenni-
als, roses, succulents, vines, 

trees, shrubs, groundcovers, 
herbs and vegetables.  Just 
a few of the Superstars you 
can find at the sale are: 
Artic Frost and Orange Frost 
Satsumas are a cross be-
tween cold hardy Changsha 
tangerines and very high 
quality Satsumas. The fruits 
are very sweet, easy to peel 
and only have one or two 
seeds per fruit. David Ro-
driguez, a member of the 
Texas Superstar® selection 
board has noted that as op-
posed to other satsumas, 
which are grafted to another 
variety rootstock, the Arc-
tic and Orange Frost vari-
eties are grown from their 
own rootstock. They can be 
used as accent plants for the 
backyard or container plants.  
Give them 8-10 hours of full 
sun daily and they can reach 
8-12 feet tall in the ground or 
6 feet in a container.  Plant-
ing time for these evergreen 
citrus is spring, and in win-
ter they are cold tolerant to 
10° or 15º Fahrenheit respec-
tively.  They are designed 
to expand in-ground citrus 
growth into our USDA Har-
diness Zone 8.  
	 New Gold Lantana – A 
drought tolerant, heat loving, 
low maintenance perennial 
with a wealth of golden yel-
low flowers. Reduced fruit 
set promotes prolific bloom-
ing spring till frost. Deer tol-
erant, this lantana is a very 
adaptable and popular peren-
nial.  Two feet tall, four-foot 
width. Full sun.
	 Mexican Bush Sage – 
A tough, drought tolerant, 
highly pest resistant salvia 
with showy spikes of pur-
ple and white, or solid pur-
ple, blossoms. Also good as 
a cut flower.  Blooms in the 
fall, grows three feet tall and 
wide.  To keep from stem 
breakage, protect from high 
winds.  Full sun.
	 Gold Star Esperanza - 
Spectacular heat–tolerant 
Texas native with striking 
masses of golden yellow, 
trumpet–shaped flowers. 
Highly pest resistant. Won-
derful in containers to ac-
cent entry and patio, also in 
mass plantings.  Blooms ear-

ly summer till frost, four feet 
tall and three feet wide.  Full 
sun.
	 Tycoon Tomatoes - Ty-
coon is an exceptional large 
round tomato variety. The 
plant is determinate and is 
known for its heat setting 
ability as well as its resis-
tance to tomato yellow leaf 
curl virus.  Because it is de-
terminate it only reaches 3 to 
4 feet high and 2-3 feet wide.  
Plant early spring in a well-
drained soil, when danger of 
frost is past. Full sun.
	 Laura Bush Petunia - A 
hybrid between VIP and old 
fashioned petunia which was 
born & bred in Texas. This 
reseeding, old fashioned 
petunia has fragrant violet 
flowers on a vigorous, heat–
tolerant plant. It performs 
well even in alkaline soils.  
Laura Bush grows 24 inches 
tall and 36 inches wide.  It 
should be cut back 20% each 
month and blooms spring to 
frost.  Full sun.
	 If you have additional 
questions, contact the Texas 
A&M AgriLife Extension 
Service, Bell County Office, 
1605 North Main Street, 
Suite 102, Belton, Texas or 
call the office at 254-933-
5305.

U

Bell County Master Gardener’s 
Annual Spring Sale

	 Belton, Texas – The Uni-
versity of Mary Hardin-Bay-
lor will hold its 18th annual 
health fair, Health Quest 
2017, 10 a.m.-2 p.m. March 
24, in the McLane Great 
Hall of the Bawcom Student 
Union on the UMHB cam-
pus. This event is free to the 
public.
	 Health Quest is a com-
munity event showcasing 
exhibitors from health and 
wellness-related business-
es, including Belton Eye 
Care, Henry Schein Medical 
Group, Montgomery Chi-
ropractic, and the Temple 

Walk-in Clinic. There will 
also be representatives from 
several regional and area 
hospitals including Hillcrest 
Health Systems, Baylor Scott 
& White Hospital, Seton 
Health Care, and Metroplex 
Hospital.
	 Exhibits as well as Health 
screenings will be available, 
including blood pressure, 
glucose tests, cholesterol 
checks, visual testing, and 
depression and mood screen-
ings. Wellness education, 
including information about 
skin care, preventative health 
care, and eye health will be 

offered. There will also be 
stations at which visitors can 
donate blood, get registered 
as a bone marrow donor, or 
enjoy a free massage.
	 Door prizes will be given 
throughout the fair.
	 For more information 
about Health Quest, con-
tact Debbie Rosenberger, 
BSN, RN- BC, Coordinator 
of UMHB Health Services, 
at (254) 295-4623 or visit 
the Health Quest website at 
http://cths.umhb.edu/health-
quest.

Health Quest 2017 UMHB’s 18th Annual Health Fair
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2017 Cadillac ATS Luxury Sedan stk# H0111501 $399 mo 39 month 10k yr lease through GM Financial WAC , .00029 
money factor $1300 lease cash  $2999 Due at signing , cash down excludes taxes, 1st payment and fees WAC $20121 
residual value 2017 Cadillac XT5 Base Sstk#HZ185889 $379mo 39 month 10k yr lease $22867 residual , .00027 money 
factor through GM Financial WAC, 1700 lease cash and 2000 Cadillac Loyalty (with qualified vin) $3499 due at signing 
excludes taxes, 1st payment ,and fees. Expires 12/31/16. Photos for illustrative purposes only.

5 6 2 5 S .  G e n e r a l  B r u c e D r.  a t  I 3 5 ,  Te m p l e ,  T X 
( 2 5 4 )  7 7 1- 0 1 2 8 
g a r l y n s h e l t o n . c o m

GARLYN SHELTON CADILLAC 

GARLYN SHELTON CADILLAC

2017 ATS Luxury Sedan

$399 / 39 
PER MONTH MONTHS

LEASE FOR

2017 XT5 

$379 / 39
PER MONTH MONTHS

LEASE FOR

Subscribe today 
SaladoVillageVoice.com

Digital and Print Editions Available

Tickets: 254-526-9090 or Vlakilleen.org

Theatre to EXPERIENCE - not just see
Vive Les Arts Theater | 3401 South W S Young Drive, Killeen

March 31 - April 9

Classic comedy The Odd Couple, brings the trials and tribulations 

of Felix Unger and Oscar Madison to the present day

Oscar & Felix

8398 Interstate 35 Frontage Road, Belton
(254) 947-8349

Need your counter-tops 
re-sealed and/or polished?  

We do that!

Alton D. Thiele PC
Serving Central Texas Since 1979

• Tax Return Preparation & Planning
• Small Business Accounting Service
• Accounting & Auditing Service
• Business Counsulting
• Payroll Check Processing & Reporting
• Tax-Exempt Organization Consulting
• Quickbooks Installation & Consulting
• Retirement Planning

Alton D. Thiele, CPA
Kevin S. Cowan, CPA

254-939-0701 alton@adtcpa.com
toll free 1-800-772-7043
300 E Ave C, Belton

adtcpa.com

Ceiling Fans | Light Fixtures 
Window Treatments | Home Decor

TheShadeShopSalado.com                        
230 North Main Street #102 

(254) 290-7000

The Shade Shop

Ceiling Fans | Light Fixtures | Window Treatments | Home Decor

TheShadeShopSalado.com                        
230 North Main Street #102 

(254) 290-7000

The Shade Shop

floral department  947-8922

It is Planting Time at

Brookshire Brothers

Trees and Shrubs
one gallon pots 

3 for $10

Knockout Roses 
$1399

tulip bouquet 
special $999 CUSTOM UPHOLSTERY 

 CUSTOM SIZE MATTRESSES 
FREE PICK UP & DELIVERY 

515 E. VET. MEMORIAL BLVD. HARKER HEIGHTS

254-699-6105

	 The deadline for qualified 
residents to register to vote 
in the May 6 election is April 
6.
	 Seven candidates are vy-
ing for three two-year terms 
on the Village of Salado 
Board of Aldermen. Those 
candidates are incumbents 
Fred Brown, Michael Mc-
Dougal and David Williams 
and challengers Judy Fields, 
Andy Jackson, Linda Reyn-
olds and Chris Tramel.
	 A proposal for the disan-
nexation of a part of Salado 
is on the May 6 ballot.
	 According to Sam Taylor, 
communications director for 
the Texas Secretary of State 
office,  the disannexation 
election “would be within 
the municipal boundaries.” 
	 “Sec. 43.143(a) of the Tex-
as election code says that 
once the 50 signature thresh-
old is reached, ‘the mayor 

shall order an election on the 
question in the municipali-
ty,’” Taylor stated in a March 
13 email to Salado Village 
Voice.
	 Two meetings have been 
set concerning the May 6 
election.
	 A Question and Answer 
Town Hall has been set for 
6:30 p.m. April 4 at the Sal-
ado Civic Center, according 
to Mayor Skip Blancett. The 
Village Attorney Alan Bo-
jorquez “will answer ques-
tions concerning matters of 
interest or issues on the May 
Ballot,” according to Blan-
cett, who added that this will 
be “an excellent opportunity 
to receive legal/accurate an-
swers.”
	 Additionally,	 Mill Creek 
Community Association will 
sponsor a Town Hall meeting 
on the subject of Disannex-
ation at 6 p.m. April 8 at the 
Salado Intermediate School 
cafeteria.
	 John Newman, one of the 
organizers of the disannex-
ation petition, and county 
commissioner Tim Brown 
are scheduled to speak at the 
MCCA meeting.
	 Early voting will begin on 
April 24. The last day of ear-
ly voting will be May 2.
	 Early voting will be con-
ducted in person at the Sala-
do Civic Center. 
	 Early voting hours are 
these: 7:30 a.m.-4:30 p.m. 
April 24, April 26-28 and 
May 1 and 7 a.m.-7 p.m. 
April 25 and May 2.
	 Election day, the polls 
will be open 7 a.m.-7 p.m. at 
the Salado Civic Center.
	 The last day to apply for 
a ballot by mail is April 25. 
Applications for a ballot by 

mail must be mailed to Judy 
King, Village of Salado, PO 
Box 219, Salado, TX 76571.
	 There will be no Salado 
ISD Board of Trustees elec-
tion. The following will be 
inducted into office for three 
year terms to begin in May: 
Dr. Kim Bird (incumbent), 
Nate Self and Troy Smith. 
	 There will be no Salado 
Public Library District elec-
tion either. The following 
will be inducted into office 
for two year terms on the 
board of directors: Bobbette 
Bell, Soo Kim-Delio and Pa-
tricia Rehm.
	 Qualifications to vote, ac-
cording to the Bell County 
Voter Registrar are these:
	 • You must register to vote 
in the county in which you 
reside.
	 • You must be a citizen of 
the United States
	 • You must be at least 17 
years and 10 months old to 
register and you must be 18 
years of age by election day.
	 • You must not be final-
ly convicted of a felony, or 
if you are a felon, you must 
have completed all of your 
punishment, including any 
term of incarceration, pa-
role, supervision, period of 
probation, or you must have 
received a pardon.
	 An application for voter 
registration can be filled out 
online at https://webservices.
sos.state.tx.us/vrapp/index.
asp. After answering the first 
question, fill out the form 
completely and press submit.  
You will need to print your 
application, sign and date 
it; then mail the application 
to: Elections Administra-
tor, Shawn Snyder, P.O. Box 
1629, Belton 76513.	

Deadlines, town hall meetings 
approach for May 6 election
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One Call Does It All
(254) 933-7400

www.cars-collision.com

1914 S. IH 35, Belton

Cliff Coleman, owner

Paint & Body • Frame Repair • Hail Repair
FREE ESTIMATES              INSURANCE CLAIMS WELCOME

Colorist
Hairstylist 

(254) 534-3169

Jenny Wiggin Potter 

Keratin Treatments
Dreamcatchers Extensions

New Location        Expressions     774-9751
 3126 South 31st Street across from HEB in Temple

Cakes, Pies, Cookies, brownies, 
Cinnamon Rolls and so much more— 

Bake Sale 

Come purchase superior home baked goods and in 
turn support a safe drug and alcohol free event:  
Project Graduation 

CLASS of 2017  
Project Graduation 

 

Time: 8am-1pm 

Date: Saturday, 

03/25/17 

Location: Ace Hardware 

Salado Varsity Lady Eagles soccer
(Front row, from left) #17 Olivia Sula, #12 Grace Graham, #20 Brileigh Cole, #10 Annie 
Ewton, #9 Kristin Crouch; (middle row, from left) #6 Candace Brown, #3 Rylie Stewart,  
#15 Madison Spradlin, #2 Hannah Reavis and #18 Rebecca Gonzales; (back row, from 
left) #7 Tyler Pierce, #00 Danielle McDaniel, #13 Reagan Morreale. (Photo by Royce Wiggin)

	 Salado Lady Eagles will 
face the Taylor Lady Ducks 
in the first round of the 4A 
Soccer playoffs at 5:30 p.m. 
March 23 at Manor High 
School.
	 The girls are Co-District 
Champions with an 11-1 dis-
trict record. They are 16-4-1 
on the year and ranked #9 
in state by the Texas Girls 
Coaches Association, after 
beating Gatesville in a play-
off warm up game on March 
20.
	 Salado notched the Co-
Championship after a 7-2 win 
over Gateway prep on March 
14.
	 Madison Spradlin and An-
nie Ewton both scored two 
goals in the match. 
	 Gateway took an early 2-0 
lead, scoring goals at 2:32 
and 19:07. 
	 Spradlin scored the first 
goal for Salado at 32:53 to 

pull within one.
	 A minute later, Reagan 
Morreale tied the game at 
34:04. 
	 Ewton took an assist from 
Kristin Crouch at 38:14 for 
the Lady Eagles to go up 3-2.
	 In the extra time of the 
first period, Ewton took an 
assist from Hannah Reavis to 
give Salado a 4-2 lead.
	 Morreale gave an assist to 
Reavis at 3:30 in the extra pe-
riod.
	 In the second half, Re-
becca Gonzales took an as-
sist from Spradlin to score at 
52:22.
	 Spradlin scored her sec-
ond goal of the match on a 
penalty kick at 64:55.
	 Danielle McDaniel made 
two saves for the Lady Ea-
gles.
	 In the warm-up game on 
March 20, the Lady Eagles 
beat Gatesville 5-1 on the 

road.
	 Five different girls put the 
ball in the net for Salado.
	 Hannah Reavis started the 
scoring at 9:22, taking an as-
sist from Reagan Morreale.
	 Madison Spradlin scored 
at 14:53 on an assist from 
Reavis.
	 Gatesville scored a goal at 
15:46.
	 After a shot on goal a min-
ute earlier, Morreale scored 
at 31:03 with an assist from 
Ashlen LaCanne to make the 
score 3-1.
	 Annie Ewton netted a goal 
in the second half at 59:27 on 
an assist from Reavis.
	 Cat Langlitz put a shot in 
the net at 62:39 for the final 
score of 5-1.
	 Danielle McDaniel made 
a save early in the second pe-
riod. 
	 Gatesville made a save 
late in the game at 75:59.

	 Salado Eagles, ranked 
fourth in state 4A soccer, will 
face LaGrange Leopards, the 
fourth place team from Dis-
trict  at 7:30 p.m. March 23 at 
Manor High School.
	 The boys are 21-2 after 
beating Gatesville in a warm-
up match on the road March 
20.
	 Kaden Smien, after hav-
ing his cross shot blocked in 
the first minute, scored a goal 

for the Eagles at 3:21 in the 
match. 
	 Gatesville tied the match 
at 58:40.	
	 Camden LaCanne scored 
on a penalty kick at 72:00. 
	 Costas Loullis scored on a 
penalty kick at 78:12.
	 Salado Eagles suffered 
their second loss of the soc-
cer season in a non-district 
warm-up match on March 
14. The Eagles played the 6A 

Harker Heights Knights at 
home, losing 2-0.
	 Salado took three shots on 
target and missed two other 
shots. 
	 Trey Shepard made nine 
saves to keep the game score-
less in the first 60 minutes of 
the match.
	 The Knights scored two 
goals within 15 seconds in 
the 67th minute of the match 
for the win.

Co-District champions will 
face Taylor in first round

Eagles take on LaGrange in 
first round of soccer playoffs

	 The Central Texas Youth 
Coalition announces the 2017 
Central Texas Incredible 
Kids who will be honored at 
the 18th annual Central Texas 
Incredible Kids Celebration 
at 11:30 a.m. April 13 in the 
Bell County Expo Assembly 
Hall in Belton.  
	 The youth were selected 
from nominations received 
from local schools, organiza-
tions, and individuals.   

	 The 2017 Central Texas 
Incredible Kids are:  Jacoby 
Calloway, 4th Grade, Sparta 
Elementary, Belton ISD; 
Joey DeLeon, 4th Grade, Jef-
ferson Elementary, Temple 
ISD; Kosi Eneli, 7th Grade, 
South Belton Middle School; 
Emma Rose Gill, 7th Grade, 
Homeschool; Matthias 
Lease, 4th Grade, Providence 
Preparatory School; Kamryn 
Mayberry, Senior, Copperas 

Cove High School; Emily 
McBreen, 9th Grade, Salado 
High School; Yasmin Rivas, 
Senior, Temple High School 
& Edwards Academy; Caitlin 
Stanke, 10th Grade, Rogers 
High School; Ciara Stanke, 
8th Grade, Rogers Middle 
School; Alfred Eric Story, 
8th Grade, Gatesville Ju-
nior High School; and Kayla 
West, Junior, Killeen High 
School.

McBreen is an Incredible Kid
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Stop by. We’d love to meet you.
815 North Stagecoach Road
Salado, Texas 76571
Phone: 254-947-8636
HorizonBankTexas.com

B A N K I N G  T H A T  
G O E S  A B O V E  A N D  
B E Y O N D ,  W I T H O U T  
L E A V I N G  T E X A S

At Horizon Bank, we understand local 
businesses—because we are one.

  JD's Grill
OPEN Daily for Breakfast & Lunch        6 a.m. - 2 p.m.

inside 

JD's Travel Center
15881 South IH 35 

in Salado 

Breakfast Special
2 Eggs, Hashbrowns,

Bacon or Sausage,
and Toast or Biscuit

$399

Lunch Special
Burger, Fries

and a 16 oz Drink

Hamburger $519

Cheeseburger $569

Take I35 Exit South 283 or North 282

(254) 947-5228
NEW 2 U 

RESALE SHOP
Furniture  |  Home Decor

Collectables

Starbucks Coffee Company
Brooke May, Mngr. 

(254) 933-2179
Coffee, Pastries 

and more

200 N IH35               Belton

Digital Rewards

200 N IH35               
Belton

Brooke May, Mgr. 
(254) 933-2179

Digital Rewards  |  Wifi  |  Drive-Thru

World’s Largest #StarbucksDate
2 p.m. - close     February 13 

Fun surprises. Special pairings menu.
Sparks of love.

starbucks.com

SALADO CLEANERS
Laundry • Dry Cleaning • Alterations

1209 N. Stagecoach
(Next to the Library)

254-947-7299

Wash & Fold
7 a.m. - 7 p.m. Mon - Fri • 7 a.m. - 3 p.m. Sat

WE BUY SCRAP GOLD & SILVER

Texas Coin Connection
108 E FM2410, Suite G  -  Harker Heights

Buy       Sell      Trade
Gold, Silver, Coins, Currency & Jewelry

(254) 699-2646
Locally Owned - Salado Resident

Animal Medical Salado
Full Service Vet Hospital        

saladovet.com

(254) 947-8800
Dr. Lindsay Quirk-Fultz                    Dr. Linda Quirk

A Healthy Pet
is a Happy Pet

Our Wellness and 
Vaccination Programs

will keep them 
that way

Salado FFA students compete across the state

Kamryn Cole placed 3rd with her Hampshire Market Bar-
row at the Houston Livestock show. She qualifed for the 
auction.

Bailee Barrett placed 7th at the Houston Market Goat 
Show. She qualifed for the auction.

Allison Brinkman placed 
in the top 30 of 1663 Live-
stock contestants at the 
Houston Livestock Judging 
Contest. She was awarded 
a $2000 calf scramble cer-
tificate to be used toward a 
project for the 2017 season.

Alexandria Harris’ Champion Polled Hereford heifer at the Star of Texas Rodeo in Austin. 
This heifer is a senior yearling heifer, owned and bred. The calf on her side is the heifer 
that will show next show season. Harris also won her class at the Houston Livestock Show.

Kenzie Pardon 2016 all 
around Champion Texas Ju-
nior Livestock Association 
Lamb Exhibitor. High Point 
Intermediate Showman-
ship. 

Kaydee Free with her 2nd place steer at Fort Worth Market 
steer show. Free qualified for the sale. 

Caleb Dockray Champion Suffolk Breeding Ewe at the Fort 
Worth Stock Show. 

Stuart Lastovica took Division Champion Angus breeding 
heifer at the Fort Worth Livestock Show. This is a bred and 
owned female from his herd.

Where is your subscription? 
Print and Digital editions available

SaladoVillageVoice.com
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– FEATURING OUR FINEST COOKS OF WILD GAME AND FISH –

T E N R O C  R A N C H  •  S A L A D O ,  T E X A S

Sponsored By:

650 Royal Street • Salado, Texas 76571 • (254) 947-5482

Salado United Methodist Church

Therapeutic Massage
Stress Management & 
Healthy Lifestyle

Linda Pritchard-Egg, RN, LMT
254.947.HAND (4263)

254.541.6369
handlmt@gmail.com

	 Salado Eagles are 2-0 
in district after Mercy Rule 
wins over Burnet and Lean-
der Glenn, including a no-hit-
ter tossed by Jacob Wilk last 
week.
		  R	 H	 E
LGHS	 0	 0	 5
Salado	 12	 14	 1
	 Jacob Wilk threw a 
no-hitter, striking out 12 of 
the 15 batters he faced as the 
Salado Eagles crushed Lean-
der Glenn 12-0 in the district 
opener March 14.
	 Only one Leander Glenn 
batter reached base due to 
a catcher interference call. 
Wilk picked him off at first 
as he led off of the bag too 
far. He threw the ball just 58 
times.
	 Wilk scored the first run 
for Salado, reaching on a 
two-out single in the first. He 
stole second and scored on an 
error by Glenn.
	 Cullen McKinney walked 
in the second, scoring on a 
two-out triple to deep right 
by Drew Dobbins. Dobbins 
scored on an error.
	 Salado added two more in 
the third. With one out, Kade 
Maedgen walked. Belton 
Farr double to deep left, scor-
ing Maedgen on the throw. 
McKinney singled with two 
outs to score Farr.
	 Salado scored seven runs 
in the bottom of the fourth.
The Eagles peppered the 
Glenn pitcher with four 
straight doubles to opposite 
fields.  Dobbins led off with a 
double to right, scoring on a 
double by Ryan Oakes to left. 
Oakes scored on a double to 
the opposite field by Wilk 
and Wilk scored on a double 

to the opposite field by Tate 
Harvey. Maedgen singled to 
score Harvey. Farr singled 
and stole second. Parker Sea-
ton walked and McKinney 
singled toload the bases. The 
pitcher hit Rustin Hale to 
push across a run and Ryan 
Oakes doubled right to score 
three runners before the last 
out was recorded.
		  R	 H	 E
Salado	 15	 10	 1
BHS	 2	 2	 1
	 Salado scored nine runs in 
the fifth inning to notch their 
second district win 15-2 by 
manner of the Mercy Rule on 
March 17.
	 The Eagles tallied 10 
hits in the game. Meanwhile 
Drew Dobbins held the Bull-
dogs to just two hits as he 
struck out six batters and 
walked one in the five-inning 
mound appearance.
	 Salado jumped out to a 
3-0 lead in the top of the first. 
Dobbins led off the game 
with a single to deep right. 
He stole second and scored 
on a singled to right by Ryan 
Oakes. Jacob Wilk followed 
with another shot to right to 
put runners at second and 
third. Oakes crossed home on 

a passed ball. Wilk scored on 
a walk.
	 The Bulldogs got both of 
their hits in the bottom of the 
first, scoring two runs. 
	 The Eagles added three 
runs in the fourth for a 6-2 
lead. Rustin Hale singled 
to left and went to second 
on a ground-out.  With two 
outs and a Hale at third on a 
passed ball, Wilk walked and 
stole second. Harvey singled 
to deep left, scoring Hale 
and Wilk. Harvey stretched 
the single on the attempts to 
throw out Wilk. Two walked 
loaded the bases and Harvey 
scored on a passed ball for 
before final out.
	 Fourteen batters came up 
to the plate in the top of the 
fifth as the Eagles added nine 
more runs. Cullen McKin-

ney led off the inning with a 
walk. Hale walked  and Dob-
bins doubled to right, scoring 
McKinney. Oakes walked 
loading the bases. Wilk 
walked to push Hale across 
home plate. Harvey then hit 
a booming 3 RBI triple to 
right. He scored on a single 
by Kade Maedgen to put the 
Eagles up 13-2. 
	 McKinney and Hale 
walked again in their sec-
ond plate appearances of the 
inning. McKinney stole sec-
ond, scoring on a single by 
Dobbins that put runners at 
the corners. Hale scored on 
a passed ball before the final 
out ended the frame.
	 Dobbins put the Bulldogs 
out in short order with two 
strikeouts and a forced fly 
out to right to end the game.

Wilk throws 12 Ks on way to no-hitter

No Mercy
Lady Eagles
4-0 in district
with 10-run wins
	 Salado Lady Eagles 
crushed Burnet 16-0 with 
14 hits to improve to 4-0 in 
district play last week.
		  R	 H	 E
Salado	 16	 14	 0
BHS	 0	 1	 5
	 Salado had 14 hits in 
the game including a grand 
slam  homerun by Abbie 
James that gave the Lady  
Eagles an 8-0 lead in the 
top of the first. Salado had 
singles by Piper Randolph 
(two), Rebecca Dockray and  
Breigh Oliver and doubles 
by Jenna Calder and Christin 
Wilson in the inning.  
	 The Lady Eagles added 
four in the second inning. 
Marissa Gonzales and 
Oliver had singles while 
Randolph had a double. In 
the third, Salado scored 
three more runs with singles 
by Gonzales and Bailey 
TIndell. 
	 Tindell pitched the entire 
game for the Lady Eagles, 
facing 10 batters. She gave 
up one hit and struck out five 
batters.
		  R	 H	 E
LGHS	 0	 1	 4
Salado	 10	 9	 0
	 Salado Lady Eagles 
Mercy Ruled the Leander 
Glenn Lady Grizzlies March 
16, winning 10-0 in five 
innings.
	 Salado talled nine hits in 
the win.
	 Salado scored two runs 
in the third on a single by 
Breigh Oliver and an RBI 
double by Christin Wilson 
(who scored on a passed 
ball).
	 The Lady Eagles added 
six runs in the fourth. Piper 
Randolph hit a 3 RBI triple 
and scored on a single 
by Oliver. Jenna Calder 
doubled to score Oliver and 
scored on a passed ball. 
	 Oliver and Wilson hit 
RBI singles in the fifth to 
end the game.
	 Dockray got the win 
for Salado, pitching the 
entire game. She faced 15 
batters, striking out five and 
allowing one hit.
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PHYSICAL THERAPY • SPEECH THERAPY • PELVIC HEALTH 
OCCUPATIONAL THERAPY  •  IN-HOME SKILLED NURSING 

Multiple Locations  |  www.IntegrityRehab.net  | 254.699.3933    

727 S. Main Street, Belton

Sh el l e ysautosal es . n et

T e x a s  F r i e n d ly
E a g l e  P r o u d

Ace
Pest and Lawn

Locally Owned and Operated 
Licensed by the Structural Pest Control Board TPCL #12512

Customer 
Satisfaction 
Guaranteed

Free Estimates 947-4222

Come learn & grow with us 

947-1153
6 weeks to 12 years

Christian Environment
TSR Certified Preschool

Age appropriate Curriculum
All ages Drop off & Pick up@Salado ISD

The
 Play Yard

15299 S IH 35  Salado

SALADO

Member 
FDIC

Go !  Eagles  Go!
We stand behind our home town teams

Tues - Fri  8 a.m. - 6 p.m.
Walk-Ins Accepted    Appointments Honored

The Haire Shop
Barber - Beauty - Body

213 Mill Creek Dr., Suite 160

Tammy  (254) 760-1990

860 N. Main 
254-947-5050

c21bb.com

Good Luck from your ‘Home’ Team

Now Accepting New Patients

Kevin DeLane
orthodontist

485 Thomas Arnold Road
saladoorthodontics.com
(254) 947-4011

LASTOVICA
Fine Jewelers, Inc.

“Known for Service” 
Prompt In-Store Jewelry Repairs 

Diamond Sales • Custom Casting • Diamond 
Appraisal • Watch Repair • Diamond Setting 

Jewelry Repair
1202 S 31st St. & Ave. L • Temple

773-5772

www.devereauxjewelers.com

WT

C
om

puter Services Walt’s PC Repair
(254) 721-2218

Call today for an appointment
Mobile PC Repair for Salado 

& the surrounding communities

www.WaltTollefson.com

Please call for an appointment (254) 947-3309
1325 N. Stagecoach Road

Your time is valuable! Save a trip and time. 

Subscribe to 
Salado Village Voice

254.947.5321

March 13
	 4:48-5:10 p.m., 3500 
Block FM 2484. Out for a 
patient with low Blood Pres-
sure at the Scott & White 
Clinic. Arrived on scene and 
got patient info from nurs-
es and relayed it to Scott & 
White Medic. Once Scott 
& White Medic arrived on 
scene, assisted them with pa-
tient loading. Scott & White 
transported patient. 2 units, 2 
personnel.
March 14
	 2:49-3:14 a.m., 282 NB 
I-35. Out for a Motor Vehi-
cle Accident unknown inju-
ries. Arrived on scene to find 
Scott & White on scene and 
they advised no injuries. Set 
up traffic control and scene 
safety. Found a car that had 
run up under the back of an 
18-wheeler trailer with major 
damage and oil on roadway 
from car. Applied absorbent 
to the oil spill. Scott & White 
got no transports on both pa-
tients and cleared. Remained 
on scene until wrecker arrived 
on scene and removed car 
from under back of 18-wheel-
er trailer. 2 units, 2 personnel.
	 7:52-8:14 a.m., 1700 
Block Chisholm Trail. Out 
for an 86 year old female with 
shortness of breath. Went en 

route and arrived on scene 
to find Scott & White Med-
ic on scene with patient care. 
Assisted Medic with moving 
patient to stretcher and into 
ambulance. Medic transport-
ed patient. 2 units, 2 person-
nel.
	 8:50-9:12 a.m., 100 Block 
Rock Creek. Out for a patient 
Victim of Fall. Arrived on 
scene to find patient sitting in 
a chair with neighbors by her. 
Patient was aware and did 
not want any EMS. Canceled 
Scott & White and no other 
assistance needed. 1 unit, 3 
personnel.
	 11:40 p.m.- 12:13 a.m., 
500 Block San Pedro Rd. 
Out for a 41 year old male, 
difficulty breathing. Patient 
experiencing pain in his low-
er back. Extremities and lat-
eral ribs. Patient vitals taken 
and charted. Scott & White 
Medic arrived on scene and 
took over patient care. Scott 
& White transported. 2 units, 
3 personnel.
March 15
	 9:14-9:51 a.m., 1000 
Block Great Oaks. Out prior-
ity 1 for a 53 year old male 
with back pain and difficulty 
breathing. Went en route and 
arrived on scene to find Scott 
& White Medic. Medic ad-

vised they were going to need 
help moving patient. Addi-
tional units arrived to help 
Scott & White Medic with 
moving patient. Patient was 
moved to stretcher and then 
into ambulance. Medic trans-
ported. 3 units, 4 personnel.
March 16
	 6:24-6:54 p.m., 500 Block 
West Village Rd. Out for a fe-
male patient with chest pain. 
Obtained vitals and charted. 
Monitored patient until Scott 
& White Medic arrived on 
scene. Assisted Scott & White 
with loading patient. Scott & 
White transported. 4 units, 6 
personnel.
	 10:42-11:36 p.m., Wil-
liams Rd. Out for a single ve-
hicle traffic accident. Arrived 
on scene to find 1 vehicle in 
the ditch with moderate dam-
age. Driver of the vehicle was 
not on scene. Checked vehicle 
for any fire hazards and found 
none. Set up scene safety and 
traffic control. 4 units, 7 per-
sonnel.
March 17
	 10:06-10:49 a.m., 500 
Block West Village. Out for 
an unconscious female pa-
tient. Arrived on scene to 
find patient unconscious. 
Obtained vitals and charted. 
Scott & White arrived on 
scene and took over patient 
care. Medic transported pa-
tient. 1 unit, 2 personnel.
	 11:19-11:41 a.m., 5700 
Block Elm Grove Rd. Out for  
75 year old male with high 
blood pressure and broken 
tail bone. Arrived on scene to 
find Medic on scene. Advised 
they needed no assistance. 1 
unit, 1 personnel.
	 11:49 a.m.- 12:34 p.m., 
282 SB. Out for a 49 year 
old male psych patient. Pa-
tient monitored until Scott 
& White Medic arrived on 
scene and took over patient 
care. Scott & White got a no 
transport. Patient care turned 
over to BCSO. 2 units, 5 per-
sonnel.
	 8:22-9:12 p.m., 8300 
Block FM 2843. Out prior-
ity 1 to a possible rollover. 
Went en route and arrived 
on scene to find 1 vehicle on 
it’s wheels had rolled over. 
Found patient had no injuries. 
Patient was assessed and de-

nied any medical treatment. 
Provided scene safety and 
traffic control. Scott & White 
Medic arrived on scene and 
took over patient care. Med-
ic got an no transport. Stayed 
on scene until PD needed no 
further assistance. 3 units, 6 
personnel.
March 18
	 10:12-10:32 a.m., Days 
Inn. Out for a patient with 
chest pain. Arrived on scene 
to find patient sitting in her 
car. Patient was complaining 
of chest pain to center of her 
chest. Got vitals on patient 
and charted. BFD Medic ar-
rived on scene and took over 
patient care. Medic transport-
ed patient. 2 units, 3 person-
nel.
	 10:30-11:03 a.m., 22500 
Block IH-35 SB. Out priori-
ty 1 to a 56 year old female 
difficulty breathing. Arrived 
on scene to find the patient 
sitting in her vehicle. Placed 
patient on monitor and vitals 
were taken and charted. Scott 
& White Medic arrived on 
scene and took over patient 
care. Assisted Medic with 
moving patient to stretcher 
and into ambulance. Scott & 
White transported patient. 1 
unit, 2 personnel.
	 3:02-3:20 p.m., 281 NB 
at Rest Area. Out priority 3 
for an 8 year old male pos-
sible broken arm. Right arm 
showed swelling and tender-
ness to the right wrist area. 
Scott & White Medic trans-
ported. 1 unit, 1 personnel.
March 19
	 7:00-8:44 a.m., NB at 
Main Street Exit. Wreck at 
283. 3 units, 5 personnel.
	 5:54-6:12 p.m., 10500 
Block IH-35. Out for a sick 
person, Scott & White Medic 
was on scene and had patient 
contact. Scott & White got a 
no transport. 2 units, 5 per-
sonnel.
	 7:04-7:25 p.m., Pace Park 
and Main St. Patient stated 
he had chest pain and was 
passing out. Scott & White 
Medic arrived on scene and 
took over patient care. Scott 
& White transported patient. 
3 units, 3 personnel.
	
		
	

Salado Volunteer Fire Department 
Report March 13-19

	 The 15th Annual Smokin’ 
Spokes Bike Ride, benefit-
ing the Salado Volunteer 
Fire Department, will be 
held March 25, with the ride 
beginning at 8 a.m. at the 
Salado Intermediate School 
parking lot. All routes will 
begin and end in the Salado 
Intermediate School park-
ing lot. As in previous years, 
a variety of routes will be 
available for riders to choose 
from, with each route differ-
ing in distance and overall 
difficulty.
	 Riders can pick from 15, 
27, 57, 70, 85 and 102 mile 
rides. Most routes will take 
cyclists east to the Summer’s 
Mill area, and also west to 
Stillhouse Hollow Lake.
	 There are rest stops desig-
nated with each route.  “We 
placed most of our rest stops 
at very scenic locations,” 
said Shane Berrier, Salado 
Volunteer Fire Department 
Chief.  “One is on the shore 
of Stillhouse Hollow Lake; 
one is at the Overlook Park 
on top of the dam to Still-
house Hollow; and one is at 

Smokin’ Spokes
Bike ride March 25 benefits SVFD

King and Queen of the Hill
The first male and female to reach the top of Eagles Nest Hill will be crowned the King and 
Queen of the Hill during the annual Smokin’ Spokes March 25, in Salado. For information 
about routes and registration, visit saladospokes.com.  

Summer’s Mill.”
	 Entry fee will be $35 for 
pre-registration and $40 for 
on-site registration.  The first 
300 pre-registered riders will 
be guaranteed a Smokin’ 
Spokes T-Shirt. Pre-Register  

by March 19. Check-in begins 
at 6 a.m.
	 Click on saladospokes.
com/ to register via the 
internet and learn more about 
the race, including maps of 

the various routes.
	 On-site registration can be 
completed for $40 per rider.  
	 Free food and drinks will 
be handed out to riders all 
day long at the finish line.
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 1109 W. Village Rd, Salado (behind Sonic)                            

Monday thru Saturday         10 a.m. to 9 p.m.

Liquor Store

(254) 947-7117

Salado’s Finest Selection of Domestic, 
Import, Commercial & Craft Beers

Sunday 
Brunch 
10:30 am - 2:00 pm

Inn on the Creek • 602 Center Circle 
(254) 947-5554

Beer or Wine Tasting Daily $10
Live music every Friday & saturday

5 huge tvs

Sun -Thur Noon - 10 p.m. | Friday Noon - Midnight | Saturday Noon -1 a.m.

150 wines from 
around the world

50 + taps of Texas 
Craft Brews

401 s main on the corner of Royal and Main

(254) 727-5700          #hechoenqueso 

Homemade Mexican Fusion
Available for events & catering

Every Friday 4-10 p.m. 
at Barrow Brewing Co on Royal Street

Follow us on Facebook & Instagram for our current location

BREAKFAST, 
LUNCH & DINNER

MON - SAT 7AM-9PM
SUN 7AM-10PM

  (254) 947-4663
301 THOMAS ARNOLD ROAD

 JOHNNYSSTEAKSANDBBQ.COM

SAT APRIL 15
JOHNNYSOUTBACK.COM

We Cater All Occasions!
WEDDINGS     REUNIONS    CORPORATE GATHERINGS

HAIL AND FAREWELLS     ANNIVERSARIES

CANTINA    OUTDOOR VENUE

THERANGERESTAURANT.COM

a fresh 
TAKE ON LUNCH

FRIDAYS        SATURDAYS
11:30 a.m.- 2:30 p.m.

at the range
101 MAIN salado

 254.947.3828

G

''

	 Songwriters could win a 
week in a spa and condo in 
Branson, a $1,000 songwrit-
er video, consultation with 
New York copyright attor-
ney Jeff Jacobson and more 
through the Songsmith Texas 
Music Weekend seminar and 
concert March 25-26 in Sal-
ado.
	  Famed Texas songwriters 
Lloyd Maines and Terri Hen-
drix will perform in concert 
at the Salado Civic Center 
7:30 p.m. March 25. Tickets 
are $25. Richard Paul Thom-
as will open the concert.
	 A day-long seminar will 
follow on March 26. Tickets 
are $100.
	 Maines is a Grammy 
Winning Texas Music pro-
ducer and multi- instrumen-
talist, who has been involved 
in over 4000 recordings with 
many of Texas’ A-List art-
ists. His 40 years of experi-
ence and wisdom in both 
the art and business of mu-
sic will be invaluable for all 
songwriters and musicians 
who hope to succeed in the 
21st Century Music Busi-
ness.
	 Hendrix is a multi-instru-
mentalist and independent 
artist who has released more 
than 14 albums on her own 
Wilory Records. Her songs 
cover a wide range of genres 
from folk, to pop, country, 

blues and jazz.
Scott Hoying
	 The deadline for the 
Songsmith Showdown Song-
writing Contest is Feb. 28.
	 Multi-Grammy winner 
and Texas singer-songwriter 
Scott Hoying from the Pen-
tatonix, is a final judge in the 

showdown.
	 “Songsmith is a Texas-
based fellowship  of  team 
members, made up of anyone 
interested in songs – song-
writers, vocalists, musicians, 
producers, promoters, and 
fans,” said local songwriter 
Richard Paul Thomas. “We 

are committed to promot-
ing the vast musical talent of 
all genres here in Texas, and 
to bring Texas Music to its 
rightful place as a leader in 
the 21st Century Music Busi-
ness.”

Lloyd Maines and Terri Hendrix perform March 25 at the Salado Civic Center.

Lloyd Maines and Terri Hendrix in concert May 25;
day-long songwriting seminar on March 26

	 The Salado Museum and 
College Park will host a 
Writers’ Workshop 2 p.m. 
March 25, in the Museum 
Event Hall, 423 S. Main St. 
in Salado. The event, be-
ing held in conjunction with 
the traveling exhibit, Texas 
Writers, on display at the 
museum through March 31, 
includes Texas authors Dr. 
Barry Hankins, Jessica D. 
Lovett, and Carol Wilson.
 	 The exhibit and workshop 
are made possible by grant 
funding from Humanities 

Texas, state affiliate of the 
National Endowment for the 
Humanities, and by fund-
ing from the Salado Public 
Library. Both events are 
free and open to the public. 
The workshop will include a 
short talk by each author dur-
ing the first hour followed by 
break-out groups where at-
tendees can speak with each 
of the authors individually.
 	 Dr. Hankins is a profes-
sor of history and head of the 
Baylor University History 
Department. He has writ-

ten numerous books on re-
ligious fundamentalism and 
evangelicals; his latest book 
is Woodrow Wilson: Ruling 
Elder, Spiritual President.
	 Lovett holds a Master’s 
degree in humanities with an 
emphasis in creative writing 
from Tiffin University and 
a Bachelor of Arts degree 
in literature from Howard 
Payne University. Her debut 
novel is entitled Transplant-
ing Hope.
	 Wilson, who makes Tem-
ple her home, is the author 

of The Stage Stops Here, the 
History of the Stagecoach 
Inn, Salado, Texas and In 
the Governor’s Shadow: The 
True Story of Ma and Pa Fer-
guson. 
 	 The museum’s traveling 
panel exhibit features in-
formation on Texas writers 
from the mid-20th century 
to the present day (www.hu-
manitiestexas.org). Salado’s 
ties to arts, culture, and edu-
cation make this exhibit rel-
evant to the Village’s past, 
present, and future.

Writers’ workshop March 25
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Village of Salado Calendar of Events
March 23   
	 Salado Area Republi-
can Women Fine China 
Luncheon, 11:30 a.m. in 
the Blue Heron room at 
Tenroc. speaker: Cecilia 
Abbott info: barclaymc-
cort@gmail.com
March 23
	 R Bank Ribbon Cut-
ting, 4 - 6 p.m. with Salado 
Chamber of Commerce. 
Jarrell Banking Center, 50 
West FM 487 in Jarrell.
March 23
	 The Royal Street Art 
Walk (RAW), 6 - 9 p.m. 
along Royal Street, Feb 
- Nov. info: royalstreetart-
walk.com

March 24
	 Sirril Art Gallery’s Art 
Show and Sale, 6 - 9 p.m. 

March 24
	 Lenten Fish Fry, 5:30 
pm at St. Stephen Catholic 
Church Parish Hall. Sta-
tions of the Cross follows, 
6 p.m. - 7 p.m.
March 24
	 Salado Pub Crawl, 6 - 
10 p.m. across the village. 
info: salado.com
March 24
	 Pub Crawl stop with 
music by Taylor Tomp-
kins, 7 p.m.  to 11 p.m.  at 
Chupacabra Craft Beer & 
Salado Lone Star Winery 
info: (512) 576-0123
March 24
	 Smokin’ Maxx, 7 - 10 
p.m. at Barrow Brewing 
Co. info: barrowbrewing.
com
March 25
	 Smokin’ Spokes Bike 
Race to benefit Salado 
Volunteer Fire Depart-
ment. Register at: active.
com

March 25
	 Bell County Master 
Gardener’s annual spring 
plant sale, 8 a.m. - 1 p.m. 
at Bell County AgriLife 
Building grounds, 1605 N. 
Main, Belton
March 25
	 Bake Sale to benefit 
SHS Project Graduation 
2017, 8 a.m. - 1 p.m. at Ace 
Hardware
March 25
	 Salado Youth Baseball 
Opening Day Ceremonies, 
9 a.m. at Salado Youth 
Baseball Fields. Games 
throughout the day, eve-
ning screening of Field of 
Dreams
March 25
	 6 Cards with Graphic 
45 “Nature’s Sketchbook” 
Class, 10:30 a.m. at Stamp 
Salado on Main Street. 
info: (254) 947-8848 
March 25
	 Mirabeau B. Lamar 
Medal presentation and 
luncheon hosted by Salado 
Masonic Lodge #296, noon 
at the Salado Civic Center.  
Recipient:  Lisa M. Nix

Salado Youth Baseball will kick off the season with an Opening Day Ceremony 9 a.m. 
at the Youth Baseball fields. Games will continue throughout the day and an evening 
screening of Field of Dreams will close out the day. 

March 25 - 26
	 Texas Wine and Rogue 
Art Fest, Saturday, noon 
- 5 p.m., Sunday, noon - 4 
p.m. at Salado Winery 
Company. info: saladow-
inefestival.com (254) 947-
8011
March 25 - 26
	 Wildflower Arts & 
Crafts Festival. info: 
salado.com
March 25
	 Edgy Art Show. info: 
salado.com
March 25
	 Art on the Veranda - 
Pastels by Bob Stover, 1:30 
- 3:30 p.m. at The Antique 
Rose of Bell
March 25
	 Creative Glitter Card 
Class by Jenice, 1:30 p.m. 
at Stamp Salado on Main 
Street. info: (254) 947-8848
March 25
	 Open Mic session for 
classical guitarists, 2 - 6 
p.m. at The Strawberry 
Patch. with host Dow Fer-
guson
March 25
	 Historic Salado Ghost-
walk info: saladoghost-
walk.com

theMustard Seed
B U T I K

APPAREL		&		GIFT
S

642 North Main
10 a.m. - 5 p.m. 

 Thursday • Friday • Saturday

March 25
	 Smoken Maxx Carter, 
8 p.m.  - Midnight  at 
Chupacabra Craft Beer & 
Salado Lone Star Winery 
info: (512) 576-0123
March 25
	 Songsmith Spring Con-
cert: Terri Hendrix and 
Lloyd Maines, 7:30 p.m. at 
Salado Civic Center. Tick-
ets: songsmithonline.com 
March 25
	 Music of Tanner New-
man, 7 - 9 p.m. at Barrow 
Brewing Co
March 26
	 Songsmith Spring 
Songwriting Seminar with 
Lloyd Maines and Terri 
Hendrix, 10 a.m. - 4 p.m. at 
Salado Civic Center Reg-
istration: songsmithonline.
com
March 26
	 Wild Game Dinner, 5 - 8 
p.m. at Tenroc Ranch. info: 
(254) 947-5482
March 26
	 Salado Masonic Lodge 
Stated Meeting, 7:30 p.m.
March 27 - 31
	 Glass and Gold Class at 
Glass River Designs. info: 
(254) 947-0002

March 27
	 Salado Public Library 
Board of Trustees Meet-
ing, 5 p.m. at Salado Public 
Library
March 27
	 Salado ISD School 
Board Meeting, 6 p.m. at 
Salado Civic Center.
March 28
	 Taste of Central Texas, 
6 - 9 p.m. at Bell County 
Expo Center. Proceeds 
fund Central Texas Youth 
Services. info/tickets: 
centraltexasyouthservices 
.com
March 29 - 30
	 Donations accepted at 
Jack’s Barn for Salado Li-
ons Club Garage Sale info: 
(254) 717-4534
March 30
	 Pint Night with Ranger 
Creek Brewery,  6 p.m. - 
Midnight  at Chupacabra 
Craft Beer & Salado Lone 
Star Winery info: (512) 
576-0123
March 31
	 Drop off for Project 
Graduation Garage Sale 
Fundraiser, 4 - 9 p.m. at 
SHS Cafeteria. info and 
transportation assistance: 
(254) 239-4000
Weekends

March 31 - April 15
	 Blow Your Own Easter 
Egg at Salado Glassworks. 
reservations at saladoglass-
works.com
March 31
	 Lenten Fish Fry, 5:30 
pm at St. Stephen Catholic 
Church Parish Hall. Sta-
tions of the Cross follows, 6 
p.m. - 7 p.m.

MUD PIES 
POTTERY

HAND THROWN POTTERY 
ONE PIECE AT A TIME 

Handmade 
Pottery,

Homemade 
Fudge 

OVER 50 FLAVORS
including Sucrose free 

Gluten Free

Closed Mondays

18 N. Main Salado 

947-0281 

ATTENTION
1860 Shop Patrons

Birds are now looking for their new home
Put your birdhouses out so they see yours is available  

Make sure they are clean  
Put fine saw dust in the bottom
Saw dust is available at the shop

33 S. Main St.
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642 N. Main St.     (254) 947-8848 

sta mpsal adotex as.com

Rubber Stamps
Scrapbooking

ribbons
Great Classes

Shop at Salado’s Boutique Marketplace
Women’s Apparel, Shoes ~ Flip Flops to Boots,
Jewelry, Baby Gifts & Apparel, Gourmet Food,

 Home Decor & Furniture, Home Fragrance, 
Junk Gypsy™ Paint,  Gifts & More

22 North Main Street

OLD FASHIONED BURGERS
                    and ICE-CREAM

882 North Main Street

 facebook.com/burgersICEcream
plus.google.com/+OldFashionedBurgersandicecreamSalado

(254) 947-5271

$1 off any burger or 
sandwich combo 

with this ad

TRY OUR NEW MENU

Timeless
Upscale Consignment

#3 North Main
Corner of Main and Pace Park Road

Women’s Clothing, Jewelry,
 Local Art and Home Décor

106 North Main Street
(next to Ambrosia Tea Room)  

(254) 855-5538 Private Showings

PizzaPlaceSalado.com

947-0022
230 North Main Street

Open Daily 11 am

The Pizza Place

Handcrafted Pizza and Sandwiches
Hand Dipped Blue Bell Ice Cream

Baked Pasta Dishes | Wings
All You Can Eat Salad Bar

 Pickup   •   Dine-in  •  Delivery

Open at Lunch
no minimum orders
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Mondays
	 Children’s Story and 
Craft Time, 11 a.m. at 
Salado Public Library. info: 
(254) 947-9191	
	 Classified advertising 
deadline for Salado Village 
Voice, noon. info: classi-
fides@saladovillagevoice.
com	
Salado Village Artists 
Stitchers and Knitters, 2 
p.m. at Salado Village Art-
ists Building.
	 Salado Masonic Lodge, 
Floor practice is  6:30 p.m. 
at the Lodge every Mon-
day except Stated Meeting. 
Stated meeting is 7:30 p.m. 
Monday on or before Full 
Moon.

First Monday
	 Salado First Monday 
Gardeners, 8 a.m. at the 
Visitor Center.
	 Monday Club, 2 p.m. 
at Salado United Method-
ist Church Youth Activities 
Center
	 Salado Historical Soci-
ety board meeting, 6 p.m. 
at Salado Public Library.	
Second Monday
	 Second Monday Book 
Club at Salado Winery, 7 - 9 
p.m.
	 Public Arts League of 
Salado open board meeting, 
5 p.m. at the Visitor’s Center 
on Main Street.
	 Salado FFA Meeting, 6 
p.m. at Salado High School 
AG building Sept. - May.
	 Salado Youth Fair 
Booster Club meeting, after 
the FFA meeting at Salado 
High School AG building. 
Info: SYFBClub@gmail.
com
	 Salado Athletic Boost-
ers Club meeting, 7 p.m. at 
the High School Library. (no 
July meeting)

Third Monday
	 Salado United Method-
ist Women, 5:45 p.m. at 
Salado United Methodist 
Church Room 117
	 Salado Democrats, 7 
p.m. at Salado Public Li-
brary

Fourth Monday
	 Salado Public Library 
Board of Trustees Meet-
ing, 5 p.m. at the library

Tuesdays
	 Salado Village Artists, 
Village Art Building, 9 a.m., 
Bring your artwork third 
Tuesday will be set up for 
still life. 
	 Adult game day at Pres-
byterian Church of Salado, 
10 a.m.

	 Sit and Knit, 10 a.m. 
- noon at Salado Public 
Library. info: (254) 947-9191
	 Salado Rotary Club, 
11:30 a.m. at Johnny’s 
Steaks and Barbecue first 
three Tuesdays of month; 
Roving Social after hours  
on fourth Tuesday of 
month.
	 Tex Mex Tuesday at 
Alexander’s Distillery (254) 
947-5554
	 Prix Fixe at The Range, 
5 p.m.- close. $14.95 for 
entree, dessert, drink.
	 Salado Community 
Chorus practice, 6 p.m., 
Salado Civic Center, Febru-
ary - April info: (254) 541-
7824 or saladochorus.com
	 Team Roping Practice, 
6:30 p.m. at 3C Cowboy 
Fellowship Arena. Call 
before you haul 947-7214

First Tuesday
	 Salado Village Artists 
Board Meeting, 9 a.m. at 
the Village Art Building. 
Followed by General Meet-
ing at 10:30 a.m.
	 Salado 4-H Club meet-
ing, 6 p.m. at Salado In-
termediate Cafeteria, Sept. 
- May.

Third Tuesday
	 Bell County Genea-
logical Society Meeting, 
6:30 p.m. at Temple Public 
Library.
	 Bunco, 6:30 p.m. at 
Salado Lone Star Winery 
and Chupacabra Craft Beer

Fourth Tuesday
	 Night of Ministry, 7 
p.m. at 3C Cowboy Fellow-
ship

Wednesdays
	 IN.FORM course, 5 
p.m. at Angelic Herbs. Info: 
(254) 947-1909
	 Wine Wednesday at 
Alexander’s Distillery (254) 
947-5554

Second Wednesday
	 Salado Lions Club, 
11:30 a.m., Salado Civic 
Center.

Third Wednesday
	 Mah Jongg at Salado 
Public Library, 10 a.m.-2 
p.m. 

Regular Events in the Village of Salado 
Fourth Wednesday
	 Salado Lions Club, 
11:30 a.m., Salado Civic 
Center.

Thursdays
	 Salado Aldermen meet-
ing, 6:30 p.m., Municipal 
building, 301 N. Stagecoach 
Rd. Meeting is open to 
the public. First and third 
Thursday are regular meet-
ings and second and fourth 
Thursday are workshop 
meetings.

First Thursday
	 Chisholm Trail Ameri-
can Business Woman’s 
Association meeting, 6 p.m. 
at First Presbyterian Church 
of Salado.
	 Village of Salado Board 
of Aldermen meeting, 6 
p.m. at Municipal Building

Second Thursday
	 Salado Ladies Auxil-
iary Meeting, 9 a.m. at the 
Salado United Methodist 
Church Youth Activities 
Center.
	 Barrel Racing, 6:30 p.m. 
at 3C Cowboy Fellowship 
Arena. Call before you haul 
947-7214

Third Thursday
	 Salado Chamber of 
Commerce Board Meet-
ing, 8:30 a.m. at the Visitors 
Center.
	 Village of Salado Board 
of Aldermen Workshop 
Session, 6 p.m. at Municipal 
Building

Fridays
	 Pop in for a pastry, 8:30 
- 9:30 a.m. at First Commu-
nity Title. 
	 Display advertising 
deadline for Salado Village 
Voice, noon. info: advertis-
ing@saladovillagevoice.com
	 Hecho En Queso food 
truck, 4-10 p.m. at Bar-
row Brewing Co. on Royal 
Street. info: barrowbrewing.
com
	 Friday Night Special at 
Mill Creek Country Club 
Bar and Grill. Menu changes 
every week. Call 947-5698.
	 Live music at Chupaca-
bra Craft Beer and Salado 
Lone Star Winery

Fourth Friday
	 Fourth Friday Gospel 
Singing, 7 p.m. at First Ce-
dar Valley Baptist Church 
on FM 2843. Pot luck to 
follow, bring a favorite dish 
or dessert.

Saturdays
	 Studio Time for Salado 
Village Artists members, 
10 a.m. info: saladovil-
lageartists.com
	 Live music in The 
Lounge, upstairs at The 
Range Restaurant on Main 
St., 7 p.m. Artists change 
weekly. Check website for 
details. 

Salado Winery Company & Salado Wine Seller will host Ostrich Egg Painting noon - 6 p.m. 
on April 8. Participants receive a cleaned ostrich egg, decorations, paint, egg dye, and a 
free glass of wine from Salado Winery. Tickets available on Eventbrite.com

Subscribe Today
SaladoVillageVoice.com

 Digital and Print Editions Available

@saladovoicesaladovillagevoice Stay up to date with us

Publishers of 
Salado: A Jewel

in the Crown 
of Texas

First Quarter 2017
Published by Salado Village Voice

saladovillagevoice.com

SALADO 
A JEWEL  IN THE CROWN OF TEXAS

Jewel Ad Deadlines
Second Quarter

February 9 
Third Quarter

May 11
Fourth Quarter

August 10
E-mail: advertising@
saladovillagevoice.com

254.947.5321
213 Mill Creek Dr., Suite #125

LIVELY
• COFFEEHOUSE & BISTRO •

EST. 2015

21 North Main Street        Salado Square       (254) 947-3688

GET LIVELY WED - SAT 9 - 4 
SUN 10 - 4 | MON 9 - 4 closed Tues

Coffee | Espresso
Breakfast | Lunch

Bagel | Croissant | Pastry
Toast Selections

Salad | Soup | Sandwich

Corner of Royal Street and Center Circle (West)
(254) 947-1960

 Open
Mon, Wed, Thurs 5 p.m.
Fri, Sat & Sun 11 a.m.

Closed Tues

A place for weary travelers, thirsty 
tourist, and hungry neighbors!

Tried our Pulled Pork?
Cooked to Perfection on 

The Big Green Egg!

Open Daily (254) 947-1909
 560 N. Main, Suite 10  

When it comes to 
HEALTH & HOME...

THINK GREEN!

	 Live music at Chupaca-
bra Craft Beer and Salado 
Lone Star Winery
First and Third Saturday
	 Trudy’s Closet, 8 a.m. at 
Grace Baptist Church

Second Saturday
	 Asanas and Ales, 9:30 - 
11 a.m. at Barrow Brewing 
Company
Sundays
	 Sunday Brunch, 10:30 
a.m. - 2 p.m. at Alexanders 
Distillery on Center Circle

	 Open discussion Al-
Anon Meeting, 6 p.m. 
Salado United Methodist 
Church Youth Activities 
Center.

Second Weekends
	 Salado Market Days, 9 
a.m.-5 p.m. at Salado An-
tique Mall, 721 Stagecoach 
Road. Salado’s original Mar-
ket Days event. info: (254) 
947-3355.
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Shopping Map of Salado

7

#	 Business Name	 Type
3	 Wildfire Ranch Arena	 V
4	 St. Stephen Catholic Church	 C
6	 Salado College Park	 V
7	 Raney & Associates	 $
8	 Stagecoach Inn	 D
9	 Salado Museum	 V
10	 Sofi’s	 S
12	 Chupacabra and 	 D
	 Salado Lone Star Winery	 D
14	 Salado Glassworks	 A
17	 Barrow Brewery	 D
	 Hecho en Queso Food Truck Fri.	 D
20	 Springhouse 	 S
21	 The Venue                   	 V
22	 The Shed 	 D
24	 Tablerock	 V
26	 Salado United Methodist Church	 C
29	 Alexander’s	 D
29	 Inn on the Creek	 L
30	 First Baptist Church	 C
32	 First Texas Brokerage	 $
33	 First State Bank	 $
34	 First Community Title	 $
	 Farmer’s Insurance	 $
	   Zbranek Agency
40	 W.A. Pace Memorial Park 	 V
46	 The 1860s Shop	 S	
47	 Timeless	 S
48	 The Inn at Salado	 L
49	 Lively Coffeehouse & Bistro	 D
49	 Magnolias	 S
50	 The Range at the Barton House	 D
	 Linda Roundtree Pritchard Egg	 $
	      massage therapist
55	 Salado Family Dentistry	 $
57	 Mud Pies	 S
58	 The Shoppes on Main #1	 S
60	 Salado Creek Jewelry	 S
62	 The Pizza Place	 D
	 The Shade Shop	 S
65	 ERA Colonial Real Estate	 $
73	 Crain Chiropractic & Wellness	 $
75	 Angelic Herbs	 S
	 Bruce Bolick, CPA	 $
76	 Salado Civic Center	 $
78	 The Mustard Seed	 S
79	 Salado Chamber/Tourism Bureau	 $
81	 Salado Wine Seller and	 D
	 Salado Winery Co.
82	 St. Joseph’s Episcopal Church	 C
85	 Dee’s Antique Mall	 S
85	 Salado Post Office	 $
86	 Bill Bartlett – Century 21	 $
86	 Subway	 D
	 Old Fashioned Burgers 	 D 
87	 The Personal Wealth Coach	 $          
89	 Stamp Salado	 S
90	 Presbyterian Church of Salado	 C
91	 Troy Smith Financial Services	 $
92	 Salado Sculpture Garden	 A
96	 Salado Village Voice	 $
	 Ace Pest Control	 $
	 Montieth Abstract & Title	 $
	 The Haire Shop	 $
	 Integrity Rehab	 $
	 Mill Creek Cleaners	 $
97	 Brookshire Brothers	 S
100	Salado Public Library	 C
101	 Salado Cleaners	 $
102	 Hairitage Barber Shop	 $
113	 Salado Church of Christ	 C
118	 Salado Market Days	 S
119	 Salado Antique Mall       	 S
120	 Horizon Bank	 $
129	 Cowboy’s Barbecue	 D
130	 Village Spirits	 S
132	 Broecker Funeral Home	 $
133	 Johnny’s Steaks and BBQ	 D
135	 Embrace Smiles	 $
136	 Salado Schools & Stadium	 C
139	 Cedar Valley Baptist Church	 C

Not Shown on the Shopping Map
Animal Medical	 $
JD’s Travel Center	 D
The Play Yard Preschool	 $
Don Ringer	 $
Garlyn Shelton	 $
3C Cowboy Fellowship 	 C
Coleman Auto Restoration	 $
Walt Tollefson Computer Repair	 $
Finney Insurance	 S
Grace Baptist Church	 C
Mill Creek Country Club	 D/V Historical Markers in Salado

6.	 Salado Historic College Hill
8.	 Shady Villa Hotel (Stagecoach Inn)
8.	 Main Street Bridge
16.	 Barber-Berry Mercantile
23.	 The Baines House
24.	 Historic Dipping Vats
25.	 The A.J. Rose Mansion
26.	 Old Methodist Chapel

Shopping Map 
of historic Salado

N
orth

Residential

27. 	 Caskey-Hendricks House
28.  	Dr. McKie Place (Twelve Oaks)
29.	 Alexander’s Distillery
30.	 First Baptist Church
31.	 The Tyler House
35.	 Salado Masonic Lodge #296
45. 	 The Anderson House 
46	 Old Saloon
48.	 The Norton-Orgain House

50. 	 The Barton House
51.	 The Levi Tenney House
55. 	 The Armstrong Adams House
61. 	 Historic Lenticular Bridge
49.	 The Vickrey House
76.	 Boles-Aiken & Denman Cabins
77.	 The Robert B. Halley House
79.	 The Reed Cabin
100.	The Josiah Fowler House

Map Legend
S	 Shopping
A	 Art and Galleries
L	 Lodging
D	 Dining and Drinks
V	 Venues & Sights
$	 Services
C	 Churches and Education
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	 In this deal from a club 
duplicate, only one North-
South pair made four spades 
even though the contract was 
unstoppable with correct play.
	 At most tables, the bidding 
went as shown, and West led 
the jack of clubs. Declarer put 
up dummy’s king in order to 
try a spade finesse, losing the 
eight to West’s queen. A second 
club was taken by the ace, and 
the king of spades then lost to 
East’s ace. East returned a third 
club, ruffed by South with the 
nine.
At this point, virtually all the 
declarers drew West’s last trump 
with the jack and attempted to 

Contract
Bridge
By Steve Becker

run the diamonds. But when 
East showed out on the second 
diamond, the contract went 
down the drain. Although South 
could ruff a fourth round of 
diamonds in dummy, he would 
have no entry to the closed hand 
to collect his last two diamonds. 
So, after cashing the A-K-Q of 
diamonds, these declarers next 
led a heart toward dummy and 

finished down one, losing two 
hearts and two spades.
	 At one table, though, South 
saw a way to give himself an 
extra chance if the diamonds 
broke 4-1. After ruffing the 
club return at trick five, he rea-
soned that if the diamonds were 
divided 3-2, no harm could 
come from cashing the A-K 
before drawing the last trump. 
If both opponents followed 
suit to the A-K, he could then 
cash the jack of spades before 
running the diamonds. If the 
second diamond happened to 
get ruffed, the contract was 
doomed anyway.
	 The advantage of this 
approach can be seen in the 
actual deal. When declarer 
cashed the two top diamonds, 
East showed out, but was 
unable to ruff. South then led 
a low diamond and ruffed it in 
dummy to establish the suit. 
Dummy’s remaining trump was 
led to the jack, and the rest of 
the diamonds were run. West 
got his heart trick at the end, 
and South got a well-deserved 
top score.
	 (c) 2017 King Features Syn-
dicate Inc.

A self-inflicted injury

1. FOOD & DRINK: What is 
meringue made of?
2. MOVIES: What were the 
names of the tunnels in the 
movie “The Great Escape”?
3. GENERAL KNOWLEDGE: 
Pure gold consists of how many 
karats?
4. LITERATURE: In which of 
Charles Dickens’ novels does 
the character of Fagin appear?
5. GEOGRAPHY: What 
Pacific island nation is known 
by the initials FSM?
6. ANATOMY: How many 
chambers are in the human 
heart?

If you enjoy 
the Puzzle 

page,
 try our inter-
active cross-

word and 
sudoku puz-

zles online at:
saladovillage-

voice.com

7. MUSIC: How many keys are 
on a standard piano?
8. BIBLE: How old was Methu-
selah when he died?
9. MEASUREMENTS: What 
degree of latitude is the Equa-
tor?
10. ANIMAL KINGDOM: 
What is a group of rhinos 
called?

Answers
1. Whipped egg white and sugar
2. Tom, Dick and Harry
3. 24
4. “Oliver Twist”
5. Federated States of Micro-
nesia
6. Four
7. 88
8. 969 in the Hebrew Bible
9. Zero
10. A crash
	 (c) 2017 King Features Syn-
dicate, Inc.
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Wild About Texas
Michael Price

	 When a person mentions 
the word “rattlesnake”, the 
image immediately conjured 
up is that of the defensively 
coiled and agitated Dia-
mondback Ratter. However, 
in Texas, there are eight spe-
cies of rattlesnakes, and one 
of my favorites is the variety 
that rarely makes its pres-
ence known by utilizing the 
tell-tale rattle. 
	 The Black-tailed Rattle-
snake (Crotalus {molossus} 
ornatus) occurs from cen-
tral New Mexico eastward 
through the Chihuahuan 
Desert portions of western 
Texas to near Austin, then 
south to the Mexican states 
of Coahuila and Nuevo 
Leon. In Texas, it is most 
frequently observed in the 
mountainous areas of the 
Trans-Pecos, less often in 
the Hill Country. Unlike its 
close relative the Western 
Diamondback Rattlesnake, 
Black-tailed Rattlesnakes 
are habitat specialists, living 
primarily in the canyons and 
streambeds of these areas.
	 This is a moderately large 
species of rattlesnake that 
can attain lengths of up to 
four feet, with the record 
size being fifty-two inches, 

Black-tailed Rattlesnake

The Black-tailed Rattlesnake mates for life

although most adults average 
just over three feet in length. 
	 Black-tailed Rattlesnakes 
have unique and distinctive 
coloration and pattern char-
acteristics. The most obvious 
is the dark tail that ranges 
in color from jet black to a 
charcoal black. Another is 
the black nose and forehead 
that gives this snake the 
appearance of having dipped 
the front part of its face into 
black ink. The background 
is primarily black along the 
spine, with a pattern of vari-
ably colored patches of pale 
scales along the first half 
of the body. At least in the 
confines of this state, these 
pale patches range in color 
from light tan to yellow to 
greenish. Specimens from 
the limestone-filled Edwards 
and Stockton Plateaus typi-
cally are lighter in coloration 
than the ones that inhabit the 
igneous rock mountains of 
the Trans-Pecos. No other 
rattlesnake that lives in this 
animal’s range exhibits these 

characteristics. 
	 Like other rattlesnakes, 
the head of this species is 
distinctly wider than the 
neck, giving this animal the 
famous “diamond-shaped” 
head. The pupils are ellipti-
cal, and the rattle is large 
and is capable of being heard 
from several yards away.
	 Unlike other large spe-
cies of rattlesnakes, the 
Black-tailed Rattlesnake 
does not winter together in 
large numbers. The process 
of brumation, (not hiberna-
tion as the animal does not 
sleep through the winter, 
but rather just slows its heart 
rate and metabolism) gener-
ally takes place between late 
October to mid-March. Even 
in mid-winter, this species 
may make an appearance on 
exceptionally warm days to 
bask in the heating rays from 
the sun, particularly females 
that are carrying fertilized 
ova. 
	 Breeding takes place in 
the fall, with the female hold-

ing on to its mate’s sperm 
over the winter until spring, 
when ovulation actually 
takes place. Several studies 
have shown that this species 
of snake will “mate for life”, 
reproducing with the same 
mate year after year while 
cohabitating in the same 
area. Blacktails are ovivipa-
rous, which means they give 
birth to living young, and 
the nine-inch-long neonates 
(which number from 6 to 
10) are typically born in late 
summer and early fall. Other 
than having a “button” on the 
end of the tail, they are exact 
replicas of the adults and are 
fully capable of fending for 
themselves, including having 
fully functional fangs and 
venom apparatus’.
	 This species is typically 
crepuscular (active at dawn 
and dusk) during the spring 
and fall when night-time 
temperatures begin to fall 
and are nocturnal (active at 
night) during the summer 
months when the daytime 
temperatures exceed intoler-
able highs. It uses its venom 
to obtain its prey, which is 
primarily made up of rodents 
of various sizes. Juveniles 
will occasionally add lizards 
to its diet.  
	 Black-tailed Rattlesnakes 
as a whole are not as high-
strung and temperamental as 
the more common Western 
Diamondback Rattler, and 
their venom is only about 
eighty percent as potent. 
This does not make them any 
less dangerous, but because 
they live in areas that are 
generally inaccessible to the 
general public, they are not 
considered by most to be 
a serious threat to people. 
In fact, many ranchers will 
often leave the “colas negras” 
alone, while exterminating 
any and all Diamondbacks 
on sight. 
	 When participating in 
outdoor activities, the risk of 
encountering a Black-tailed 
Rattler is remarkably slim, 
although it can and does 
happen occasionally. If such 
an encounter occurs, remem-
ber that this animal, despite 
its harmful capability, is 
more afraid of you than you 
are of it and it would prefer 
to be left alone. 

42 Dealers

Dee’s Antique Mall
(254) 947-3775 702 N Main Street 

FURNITURE
GLASSWARE     KEEPSAKES

SUN & WED Noon - 5  
THURS - FRI 10 - 5 | SAT 10 - 6 

CLOSED MON & TUES

Salado Grown and Salado Made
Your Hometown Winery

841 N. Main St

Salado Grown and Salado Made
Your Hometown Winery

(254) 947-8011

THURS - SAT 10 - 5 SUN 12 - 5 MON 10 - 5
CLOSED TUES & WED       947-3355

751 Stagecoach Road  I-35 frontage road North
Clean Restrooms

SALADO ANTIQUE MALL
and Bee’s Antiques

Thousands of Antiques, Collectibles and Primitives
 in a unique and inviting atmosphere

The Original Salado Market Days
9-5 on the 2nd weekend - Don’t miss April 8 - 9

Follow us on FaceBookSaladoAntique Mall.com

SOFI’S
at the Stagecoach

401 S. Main      (254) 947-4336

FLAX clothing
Fly London Shoes

Vintage Vinyls

OPEN TO THE PUBLIC 
 Practice Facility                    Memberships Available 

millcreek-golf.com       
(254) 947-5698

18 unforgettable holes of Golf designed by Robert Trent Jones, Jr. Book Your Tee Time Today

Open for Breakfast 7 a.m. Daily
Mill Creek Country Club Bar & Grill 

open to the public 7 a.m. - 7 p.m. 
Dine In  or  Carry Out

Magnolias 
of Salado

#1 Salado Square | Main Street  
254-947-0323 | magnoliasofsalado.com

Springhouse
120 Royal Street              

Mon - Sat  10:30 - 5     (254)947-0747

An Eclectic Mix of 
New and Vintage Furniture, 

Home Decor, Gifts and 
a Ladies Boutique

(254) 947-0027 | (800) 724-0027

Historic Bed and Breakfast ~Weddings ~ Receptions  ~ Meetings

Inn at Salado

North Main & Pace Park Dr.  inn-at-salado.com                   

Cowboys Bar-B-Q
Exit 285 • 1300 Robertson RD

Catering, Take Out or Dine In

254-947-5700  Miguel Perez, owner

Slow Cooking Fast Service
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990 Lake Road, Belton
3 BR, 2 BA
$169,921

9499 Live Oak Dr., Salado
5 BR, 3.5 BA on 5.4 ac.

$465,021

1295 Western Trail, Salado
3 BR, 3 full BA, 2 half BA on 9+ ac.

$425,021

209 CR 483 Lott
3 BR, 2 BA

1307 Walker Circle, Salado
3 BR, 2.5 BA

$449,721

404 FM 2268, Salado
3 BR, 2 BA w/ 1 BR, 1 BA apartment, on 3 ac.

$399,921

• Hidden Springs lots:  $36,500 - $59,900
• 1.1 tree covered acres on Center Circle.
• 10 acre homesite with road frontage on two sides, near Bartlett.
• 12.5 acres, beautiful acreage homesite. Salado ISD
• 18 ac. native pasture with hillside views. Seller financing available. 
• 99 ac. w/ 3 BR, 2 BA, workshop and barn. SOLD
• 170 ac., with 2 farm houses and barn, between Temple, Belton and Academy

3029 Heritage Loop, Nolanville
4 BR, 3.5 BA

$439,921

3300 Chisholm Trail, Salado
3 BR, 2.5 BA

$269,921

1315 Walker Circle, Salado
3 BR, 3 BA
$479,021

2205 High View, Belton
4 BR, 3.5 BA .

$559,921

2 Cliffhouse Dr. #318, Belton
2 BR, 2 BA
$175,921

860 N. Main
Salado, Tx

254.947.5050

Area Land Listings

3107 Hester Way, Salado
4 BR, 3 BA
$349,921

www.C21BB.com

SOLD

Clear  V iew Window 
Cleaning: Windows, gutters, 
powerwashing, ceiling fan cleaning. 
(254)931-6172.
Window Washing Won-
ders: Professional window clean-
ing. Residential and Commercial. 
(254)231-3289.

Computers
Walt Tollefson  computer 
repairs and sales, data recovery, 
configurations,, 254-291-6354.   tfnd

Dry Cleaners
Salado Cleaners: Laundry, 
dry cleaning, alterations, leather, 
suede, 1209 N. Stagecoach, 254-
947-7299. tfnd
Mill Creek Cleaners, quality 
dry cleaning, laundry, alterations, 213 

Mill Creek Dr. Suite 200, 254-947-
0100.    tfnd

Dirt/Stone Work
Lone Star Grading, commer-
cial, residential, industrial excavation, 
grading, paving, pads, driveways, 
roads, 254-947-0149 or 254-933-
7900
CBS Construction: septic 
tanks, house pads, driveways, lot 
clearing, top soil, 254-718-1752.  tfnd

Employment 
Opportunities
Part time job opening.  
Assistant to Property 
Manager.  20 hours per week 
involving indoor and outdoor mainte-
nance, cleaning, yard work and other 

duties as needed.  Job involves physi-
cal labor and applicants should be 
able to perform all necessary tasks.
Interested applicants can email 
Salado United Methodist Church at 
sumc@saladoumc.org or call 254-
947-5482.
The Inn at Salado is 
accepting applications 
for an Breakfast Cook /Housekeep-
ing. Duties to include cooking and 
serving breakfast for guest, also 
housekeeping. Must be willing to 
work weekdays and weekend. Must 
be a people person and be able to 
multi-task. Please send resume to 
rooms@inn-at-salado.com or come 
in person to fill out an application 

Automobile & Small 
Engine   Repair
E&E Air-Cooled Engines: 
Shindaiwa Dealer, parts, sales and 
service, chain saw sharpening, 254-
947-8006, 24767 FM 2268.         tfnd
C.A.R.S. Collision Center: 
auto body repairs, detail shop, 1914 
S. IH-35 Belton, 254-933-7400.            
tfnd
Child Care 
The Play Yard: 6 weeks to 12 
years with age appropriate curricu-
lum, drop of and pick up from Salado 
schools, 254-947-1153.  tfnb

Cleaning
Clear Vision Cleaning - 
Residential and commercial cleaning 
service. (254)314-5050.

RDJ Lawn Care
Complete Lawn Care Service

Mowing | Edging | Landscaping

Tree Trimming | Power Washing

and more

   Free Estimates - Call Today
 (254) 760-2439  
   Randy Jackson

Insured
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947-0376, Troylsmith.com.
Alton D. Thiele PC: Certified 
Public Accountant, tax returns, busi-
ness accounting, auditing, consulting, 
254-939-0701. tfnd
Bruce A. Bolick, CPA: Pay-
roll, W-2, Direct Deposit, By appoint-
ment, 254-718-7299. SaladoCPA@

aol.com.           tfnd
The Personal Wealth 
Coach®: SEC registered invest-
ment advisor, highly personalized 
portfolio design and management, 
254-947-1111.

Real Estate 

Services 
First Community Title, 
branches in Salado, Temple, Killeen 
and Gatesville. 40 N. Main Street, 
Salado 254-947-8480.               tfnd
Monteith Abstract & Title 
Company: Full service title company, 

Continued on, Pg. 3D

Monday through Saturday between 
11 a.m. and 3 p.m. at Inn at Salado 
7 North Main or call 254-947-0027 
between 10 a.m. and 4 p.m.

Financial
Troy L Smith Financial: 
Personal investment solutions. 254-

213 Mill Creek Dr., Suite #140, 254-
947-3922.

Insurance
John Hall: Insurance and finan-
cial services, auto, home, ranch, 
business, life, health, 254-778-8087. 
Rita Zbranek, Farmers Insur-
ance, auto, home, life, commercial, 
254-947-0995.
Finney Insurance, home, 
auto, life, commercial, liability, farm, 
ranch, 254-947-3599.

Florist
Brookshire Brothers full 
service florist. Blooming plants. 254-
947-8922.

For Sale
A n t i q u e s  a t  D e e ’s 
Antique Mall - Furniture, 
Glassware, Keepsakes at 702 North 
Main Street. Over 30 vendors (254) 
947-3775 tfn
Ant iques at  Salado 
Antique Mall and Bee’s 
Antiques -  Antiques, vintage 
and collectables, many vendors at 
one location 751 Stagecoach Road, 
North I-35 frontage road (directly 
behind Dee’s Antiques on Main) 947-
3355. Salado Market Days second 
weekend of each month.  tfn

Free
Free boxes available at 
Salado Winery, 841 N Main 
St, great for moving, pick up during 
weekdays 12-6 pm.

Garage, Auctions, 
Estate Sale
Moving Sale for Bennie 
and Wylene Williams. 
1430 N. Robertson Rd. Friday and 
Saturday, March 24 and 25, 9 a.m.-1 
p.m., Sunday, March 26, 1:30- 3:30 
p.m. www.bellcountyestatesales.com, 
by estate sales.
Salado Project Gradua-
tion Communicty Garage 
Sale: Saturday, April 1st from 8 a.m 
.- 4 p.m.  All proceeds will help fund 
Project Graduation Celebration. Item 
donations are accepted. Item dona-
tions may be dropped off at the High 
School Cafeteria on Friday, March 
31st from 4-9 p.m.  For assistance 

  

ANNA LOU RANEY, Broker/Realtor 254-913-1215
DANIEL RANEY, Realtor 254-760-2591
ANN CARROLL, Realtor 254-760-0101

GEORGE ROMFH, Realtor 254-718-6845

MLS
MULTIPLE LISTING SERVICE

Temple/Belton 
Board of Realtors

RaneyRealEstate.net

List your property with 
Raney & Associates

LAND LISTINGS
800 Hillcrest 

Unusual lot needs creative builder. Lots of trees  $18,000
694 ASHLEY COURT  

Great location just off Main Street in established 
neighborhood. Lot size is .517 Acre  $72,500

KEVLIN TRAIL 
Only 1 lot left! Premier half-acre lot, 

underground utilities ready for building. $59,900
HERITAGE SUBDIVISION

Only nine 1 + acre lots left in this beautiful subdivision.
For more information check our website.

HIDDEN SPRINGS
3.49 Acres On Mission Trail right off of Long Meadow

Beautiful building site with mature trees.

2007 HIGHLAND DRIVE
Beautiful home overlooking #8 
T Box, Creek One on the Mill 
Creek Golf Course with 3 BR, 
2.5 BA, large great room with 
soaring ceiling, music/study 
room, open kitchen with break-
fast room and bar. Must see 
views from this custom built 
home.  

$269,000

1208 MILL CREEK DRIVE
Magnificent live oak tree graces 
the front of this well maintained 
home. Large great room with 
wall of glass overlooking the 
backyard, generous fireplace, 2 
large screened porches.Master 
bedroom and bath plus bed-
room 2 and 3 with a bath are 
downstairs. 17 X 16 bedroom 
with bath upstairs. Fenced 
backyard and a playhouse or 
workshop.  

$250,000

716 DEGRUMMOND WAY
Impressive custom built home that 
is a Southern Living Idea Home. A 
fabulous drive-up that features 5 
bedrooms, 5 .5 baths, with mas-
ter and guest suite downstairs. 
Must see all the extras.. Located 
on a tranquil tree lined street in the 
heart of beautiful Salado. 

$639,000

NEW LISTING

801 BLAYLOCK CIRCLE
Immaculate 4 bedroom, 3 bath, 
custom, one owner home.
Large great room with wood burn-
ing fireplace and built-ins.
Two car plus golf cart garage.

$269,900

NEW LISTING

SOLD

UNDER 

CONTRACT

continued on next page

transporting items to the school, 
please contact Julie Ruiz at (254)239-
4000 or julie_ruiz@yahoo.com.  

Garbage
Clawson Disposal: Competi-
tive pricing for great garbage service; 
containers, too. 512-746-2000.

Health and Fitness
Angelic Herbs: Profes-
sional Wellness, Lifestyle, 
weight loss and stress management 
solutions. C J Harbuz, CNHP 947-
1909, 560 N. Main Suite 10.
Crain Chiropractic & 
Wellness- chiropractic care, 
massage therapy, acupuncture and 
holistic care. 418 N. Main St. #5.,947-
2225.
Integrity: Rehab & Home 
Health. Physical therapy, speech 
therapy, occupational therapy, in-
home skilled nursing. integrityrehab.
net, 254-699-3933.
Therapeutic Massage, 
stress management and healthy life-
style strategies, Linda Pritchard-Egg, 
RN, LMT, 254-947-4263.
Family Dentistry: Lumineers 
for straighter, whiter teeth. Douglas 
B. Willingham, DDS, 254-947-5242.

Heat & Air
Britt Heating & Air: Instal-
lation and repairs, 254-760-1004, 
254-947-5263, TACL #B006640
Bell Air Conditioning: All 
brands repairs, free estimates, 100% 
financing available, 254-939-1141. 
TACLA002113C

Jewelers
Salado Creek Jewelers 
by Kiki Creations:  106 
North Main St. 254-855-5538, private 
showings.
Lastovica Jewelers: in-
store jewelry repairs, diamond sales, 
setting and appraisal, custom design, 
watch repair, 254-773-5772.
Devereaux’s Jewelers: 
Quality crafted custom work, jewelry 
repair, appraisals, watch repair, stone 
setting, diamond sales, photo design. 
254-771-1260.
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Britt Heating & 
Air Conditioning

 Installations • Repairs
 Office 947-5263
 Mobile 760-1004
 Serving Salado for 25 years 
 TACL #B006640

Double J
  Tree
      Service

LOT CLEARING
ACREAGE MOWING

CHIPPING/MULCHING
TREE TRIMMING & REMOVAL

LICENSED SEPTIC SYSTEM INSTALLATION
TRACTOR WORK

24 HR EMERGENCY CALL

W. J. Martone
512-746-2172

Johnnie R. Martone
512-635-4064

No Job too Small
Free estimates

675 W. Hwy 190 • Belton 
www.surfacesource.net

Flooring • Cabinets • Countertops
Remodeling Services 

Tub to Shower Conversions 
VISIT OUR SHOWROOM 

254.939.6464

Landscaping

Lawnwork & Tree
RDJ Lawn Care Complete 
Lawn Care Service (254) 760-2439
Scout’s Tree Service and 
Lawn Care. For free estimate or 
questions call (254)654-0213.
Trees, Shrubs & Land-
scaping,  Pruning, www.victor-
mareklandscaping.com. 1-512-818-
3822, Removal and Hauling. Flower 
beds, yard work, top soil.  Serving 
Salado 34 years. 0724tfn 
Double J Tree Service: 
Lot clearing, acreage mowing, chip-
ping, mulching, trimming, 512-635-
4064. 512-746-2172.

Personal Services
Jenny Wiggin Potter- 
Colorist, Hairstylist at 
Expressions, 3126 South 31st St. 
across from HEB  in Temple. (254) 
774-9751.
Hairitage Barber Shop: 
Full service Barber Shop, call 254-
947-3309 for appointments. 
The Haire Shop, full service 
salon, walk-ins accepted. 254-760-
1990. 

Pest Control
Ace Pest Control: Customer 
satisfaction guaranteed, free esti-
mates, TPCL #12512; David Preston. 
254-947-4222

Plumbing
Moffat & Daughters 
Plumbing: Service, repair, 
remodeling, 254-289-5986 Master 
LIC # M017002
Salado Plumbing. In-home 
repairs, 254-947-5800. Master LIC 
M 16892
Yount Sewer & Drain: 
septic tank & grease trap pumping, 
254-947-5036

Rental/Lease 
Residential
3BR, 3 1/2 BA, 2200 Sq. 
Ft., 3 Car Garage, Golf Cart Garage. 
All brick, on golf course. 254-721-
3578, ask for Frank. 8/13 tfnb
For Rent clean 2 BR, 2 B 
duplex, $700 mo. call 760-4440. 
0918tfnb
Charming, spacious, 
2/2/1 townhome for rent. 
Clean!! 6 closets, vaulted ceiling, 
w/d closet inside. Walk to shopping 
center. Lawn care provided. 254-
913-9813. 
0/2tfnb

Residential Sales
716 DeGrummond Way 
Impressive custom built home that 
is a Southern Living Idea Home. A 
fabulous drive-up that features 5 
bedrooms, 5 .5 baths, with master 
and guest suite downstairs.Must see 
all the extras.. Located on a tranquil 

tree lined street in the heart of beauti-
ful Salado. $639,000. Call Raney and 
Associates: 254-913-1215.
801 Blaylock Circle  This 
Immaculate custom 4 bedroom and 
3 bath, one owner home features 
a large great room with wood burn-
ing fireplace and built-ins. Two car, 
plus golf cart garage. $269,900, 
Call Raney and Associates: 254-
913-1215. 
2007 Highland Drive  Beau-
tiful home overlooking #8 T Box, 
Creek One on the Mill Creek Golf 
Course. 3 BR, 2.5 BA, large great 
room with soaring ceiling, music/study 
room, open kitchen with breakfast 
room and bar. Must see views from 
this custom built home. $269,000 
Call Raney and Associates: 254-913-
1215. tfn01/12
Perfect home overlook-
ing the Texas Hill Coun-
try. Hill country flavored home 
on 5 gorgeous acres with barn 

for horses $429,900. More info at 
www.1349hiddensprings.com Call 
First Texas Brokerage 947-5577
Home on approx. 3 acres 
close  to  downtown 
Salado.  Two living, one game 
room, 3 BR, 2 BA home with a 1 
BR, 1 BA apartment.  Beautiful large 
oak trees cover the acreage.  Nice 
concrete floor shop in back yard for 
projects or storage.  404 FM 2268, 
Salado.  $399,921. Century 21 Bill 
Bartlett 947-5050  2/2tfnf
Home on Mill Creek Golf 
Course.  Incredible view from the 
living, breakfast area and kitchen.  
Beautiful salt water pool and hot 
tub.  Landscaped backyard provides 
privacy.  The dream kitchen is perfect 
for the culinary chef.  Three bed-
rooms, three baths, two living and 
two dining room home is perfect for 
entertaining or for overnight guests.  
Living area has custom entertainment 
center.  1315 Walker Circle, Salado.  

Yount Sewer & Drain
Septic Service, L.C.

Septic tank 
& grease trap 

pumping

254 947-5036

Let the light shine through

Windows | Gutters
Powerwashing

Ceiling Fan Cleaning

(254) 931-6172
ClearViewWindows_Belton@yahoo.com

Clear View Window Cleaning

Moffatt & Daughters
Plumbing Co. 

Service • Repair • Remodeling

Riannai authorized service provider
George (Bubba) Moffatt

254 289-5986 (local)

Master Plumber
Lic M017002

continued from previous  page

LONE STAR GRADING
& MATERIALS

COMMERCIAL  H  RESIDENTIAL
INDUSTRIAL

EXCAVATION • GRADING • SITE PREPARATION
YARDS • LOT CLEARING • PADS • ROADS

DRIVEWAYS • PARKING LOTS
ALL TYPES DIRT WORK • MATERIALS & HAULING

***FREE ESTIMATES***

(254) 947-0149 or (254) 933-7900

H H

H H

H  H  H

H  H  H

H  H  H

H  H  H

H
  H

  H

H
  H

  H

H
  H

  H

H
  H

  H

®
Serving Central Texas, South 

Texas, Hays County, Bell County, 
Highland Lakes and the Texas Hill 

Country.

Kathy Ruiz
 Texas REALTOR®

(254) 681-2112

   Lovely Executive Home 
situated on a beautifully 
landscaped corner lot in a 
gated community. Enjoy a 
spacious open floor plan with a 
Family Room boasting a corner 
fireplace and a wall of windows 
withwith an elegant sliding door 
feature. The Kitchen offers 
granite counters, pantry and 
breakfast bar. The Master 
retreat features bath with 
garden tub with walk behind 
shower and an amazing closet. 
LargeLarge secondary bedrooms, 
powder room, separate utility 
area and much more round out 
this quality built Cameo Home.

8019 Bella Charca
Nolanville, TX

$364,700

Newly Completed Construction!

www.colonialrealestate.com
301 N. Main St. Salado, Texas

4b/2.5ba/2,825sqft

CBS Construction

Gravel Driveways | Parking Lots
Septic Tanks | House Pads
Lot Clearing | Demolition

Chet Sutton, owner-operator

254 718-1752

A/C
Repair

 ALL BRANDS
Free Estimates &  Second Opinions

100% Financing Available

Senior Citizens Discount on service

939-1141
Toll Free 877-422-5500  • www.bellaircond.com

310 E. Central Ave. • Belton
SERVING CENTRAL TEXAS FOR OVER 38 YEARS

TACLA002113C

Salado Plumbing

947-5800

“We are ready”
In home repairs

 

Master LIC M 16892

$479,021. Century 21 Bill Bartlett  
947-5050.
Escape to your own 
resort all on 5 pristine acres. As 
you walk into this home you will be 
taken by the grand great room with 
high ceilings, custom wood beams 
and large windows overlooking the 
swimming pool. $599,875. Call Ryan 
541-2255. First Texas Brokerage 254-
947-5577 9/8tfn

Old world Charm and 
Custom craftsmanship 
can be seen throughout this Texas 
Hill Country Farm House on 4.9 
tree-covered acre estate. Features 
include: Spray foam insulation. 2 
tankless water heaters. 2-16 seer AC/
Heating units $549,900. Call Ryan  
541-2255. First Texas Brokerage 
947-5577 9/8tfn
Continued on, pg. 4D

$16  a week 
Put your business card 
here and get a free clas-

sified each week.
advertising@saladovillagevoice.com 

(254) 947-5321
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Residential And Commercial
Power Washing, Gutters & Screen Repair   

Zack Tumlinson
(254) 231-3289

Window Washing Wonders
You’ll Wonder Why You Ever Tried 

to Clean Your Own Windows

WindowWashingWonders@gmail.com
www.facebook.com/WindowWashingWonders

Al Clawson Disposal, Inc. 
(512) 930-5490    •    www.ClawsonDisposal.com

ASK US ABOUT OUR SERVICES
Waste Pickup    •    Recycling    •    Roll-Off Containers

Elegant Austin Stone 
Home on tree-covered 
lot. Large covered back patio 
overlooking the tropical landscaping 
and swimming pool. Granite counters, 
stainless steel appliances. $499,900 
Call First Texas Brokerage 947-5577.
This home is breathtak-
ing, simply breathtak-
ing!  Walk in the front door & 
have a view of the gorgeous living 
room, swimming pool & golf course.  
Escape to your covered patio and 
have privacy from the neighbors & 
golfers provided by the lovely and 
tasteful landscaping.  The kitchen 
opens to the family & breakfast room 
and view of the outdoor pool & golf 
course.  You will be amazed with the 
size of the master bath to include a 
walk-in shower.  1307 Walker Circle, 
Salado.  $449,721.  Century 21 Bill 
Bartlett  947-5050.

Home on 9 acres fronting 
the Willingham Creek in 
Hidden Springs.  Heavily 
wooded acreage creates a private 
setting.   3 BR, 3 full baths, 2 half 
baths.  Beautiful beam vaulted ceil-
ing in living area.  Up to 3 horses 
are allowed.  1295 Western Trail, 
Salado.  $425,021. Century 21 Bill 
Bartlett 947-5050

Property For Sale
Hidden Springs 3.49 Acres 
On Mission Trail right off of Long 
Meadow. Beautiful building site with 
mature trees. Call Raney and Associ-
ates: 254-913-1215. tfn02/15
Bell County Land - 6 ac. 
I-35; 20 ac. native oaks, home, guest 
house; 50 ac. I-35 Belton; 50 ac. 
South of Salado, pond, barn.  Many 
more tracts to choose from.  Century 
21 Bill Bartlett, Salado  www.C21bb.

com 254-947-5050.11/10 tfnf
694 Ashley Court - Great 
location just off Main Street in estab-
lished neighborhood. Lot size is 
.517 acre. $72,500. Call Raney and 
Associates: 254-913-1215. tfn01/12
Kevlin Trail - Only 1 lot 
left! Premier half-acre lot, under-
ground utilities ready for building. 
$59,900. Call Raney and Associates: 
254-913-1215. tfn08/02
Homesites in Heritage 
subdivision, 1+ acres, 
Salado schools, call Raney and 
Associates: 254-913-1215. tfn08/20

Services
The Shade Shop: Ceiling 
fans, light fixtures, home decor and 
window treatments at 230 North 
Main. (254) 290-7000

Storage

StowAway Storage House-
hold - Commercial 10X10 - 10x20 
- 22x40 Clean, lighted, fenced, Key 
punch entry. 947-5502 or 721-1807              
tfnb
Storage space in Salado 
8X12, 16X24 and up. Some have 
drive-in doors. Stagecoach Storage 
254-778-6779. tfnb 

Upholstery
Custom upholstery, resi-
dential, commercial, Kasmir fabric 
gallery, free pickup and delivery, 
Recovery Room, 254-699-6105.

Vets, Pets & 
Livestock
Animal Medical- Full service 
vet hospital, (254)947-8800.

Classifieds from 3D


