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	 Keep Texas Beautiful re-
cently announced The Sal-
ado Six as a winner of the 
2017 Keep Texas Beautiful 
Awards - Civic Organization 
Award - Project, one of the 
awards it bestows to honor 
those who protect the Texas 
environment and support 
the organization’s mission 
to make Texas the clean-
est, most beautiful state in 
the nation. The Keep Texas 
Beautiful Awards - Civic Or-
ganization Award - Project 
recognizes contributions by 
civic organizations that sup-
port the KTB mission.
	 Each year, Keep Texas 
Beautiful acknowledges de-
serving individuals, busi-
nesses, community groups, 
civic organizations, media, 
government entities and law 
enforcement officials for 
their commitment to an array 
of environmental issues, in-

cluding litter prevention and 
community beautification, 
volunteerism, illegal dump-
ing enforcement and educa-
tion.
	 The Salado Six consist of 
volunteers, Hans Fields, Joe 
Oliver, Tommye Prater, Don-
ald Hogue, Mel Williams, 
and Roy Harden, that have 
been committed to maintain-
ing the landscape in the Vil-
lage of Salado since 1998 by 
mowing, edging, planting, 
and increase visual enhance-
ments for residents and visi-
tor’s enjoyment the natural 
beauty of the Village of Sala-
do.   
	 Award winners will be 
recognized at KTB’s 50th 
Annual Conference, held 
June 12-14 in San Antonio. A 
full list of winners and award 
descriptions, as well as infor-
mation about the conference 
can be found at www.ktb.org.  

Salado Six earn 
KTB Civic award

Salado Six are (from left) Roy Harden, Joe Oliver, Merle 
Stalcup, Donald Hogue, Mel Williams and Hans Fields. 

By Tim Fleischer

Editor-in-Chief

	 Questions about the metes 
and bounds of the proposed 
disannexation area arose at 
the April 8 town forum on 
Disannexation. The questions 
may linger long after the May 
6 election, to be finally deter-
mined by the courts.	
	 “We didn’t have an engi-
neer prepare this,” said Sal-
ado FED UP spokesperson 
John Newman in response 
to a question about how the 
metes and bounds of the 
proposed disannexation area 
were determined. “I spent 
two months in county records 
preparing this.”
	 Chapter 43 of the Local 
Government Code states in 
subsection 143 “Disannex-
ation by Petition and Election 
in General Law Municipal-
ity” that the petition to the 
mayor of the municipality 
“describes the area by metes 
and bounds.”
	 “We used the documents 
the Village filed in 2000 to 
set the metes and bounds 
of the perimeter of the city 
limits,” Newman said. “And 
then we found the appropri-
ate plats to set what would be 

the future property line break 
line on that.”
	 Newman discussed a 
comment at a previous meet-
ing about the expense to the 
Village for engineering to 
determine if the metes and 
bounds close. “The Village’s  
engineer spent a great deal of 
time and effort in trying to 
determine whether the metes 
and bounds closed. What we 
found in the documents filed 
with the county was that 
there was absolutely no way 
that they could close because 
they don’t have calls for every 
dimension.”
	 Newman said that the 
Village claims a rather ex-
pensive number on this, but 
“in fact, it would take any 
decent engineer a minute 
looking at this document file 
from the county to realize 
that there’s no way you could 
do that (close the metes and 
bounds).”
	 “We tried to identify as 
best we could what the metes 
and bounds were,” Newman 
said.
	 “It is our suspicion that 
they (Board of Aldermen) 
didn’t turn it (petition for 
election) down on that (metes 
and bounds) is that the docu-

ments they filed in 2000 were 
no good,” Newman said. 
“They would have to go in 
and defend what they did in 
2000.”
	 “It was supposed to be 
professionally prepared,” he 
added.
	  Alan Bojorquez ad-
dressed the issue of “metes 
and bounds” and the 2000 
incorporation election. “The 
standards to incorporate re-
quired the petitioners to sub-
mit a plat describing the area. 
The term plat is not defined 
anywhere in state law and has 
been interpreted to mean a 
map or drawing.” Bojorquez’ 
law firm represents the Vil-
lage of Salado.
	 Bojorquez said he has 
seen more than a dozen in-
corporations during his two-
plus decades as a municipal 
attorney. “I have seen where 
someone has gotten a county 
tax map and a Sharpie and 
drawn a border, circulated 
a petition, turned it into the 
county, had an election and 
become a city.”
	 “No survey is required,” 
Bojorquez added. “The 
county judge was satisfied in 
2000. That is the end of the 
question.”

	 However, regarding disan-
nexation, the law is specific, 
Bojorquez said. 
	 He added that the metes 
and bounds of the disannex-
ation petition “included text 
and a drawing. The drawing 
was part of the petition that 
was circulated for signatures, 
the text wasn’t, according to 
Bojorquez.
	 He added: “The map cir-
culated with the petition does 
not line up with the map the 
engineer drew based upon 
the metes and bounds.”
	 According to Bojorquez, 
there are multiple places, 
“some small and some quite 
large, where the lines do not 
meet.”
	 “You can’t tell based on 
the metes and bounds if a 
property is in or out, if it 
cuts through a house or not,” 
Bojorquez said. “Those are 
some of the discrepancies. So 
whether or not the metes and 
bounds turned in with the pe-
tition meets the standard of 
the law for metes and bounds 
is yet to be determined.”
	 “All we can tell now,” he 
added, “is that they don’t line 
up and don’t meet.”
	

By Tim Fleischer

Editor-in-Chief

	 If the disannexation elec-
tion is successful on May 6, it 
is likely to be litigated.
	 One issue will be whether 
the disannexed properties 
will be liable for their pro 
rate share of the $8.2 million 
in bonds sold for the Salado 
sewer system.
	 Local Government Code 
Sec. 43.143 deals with the pro 
rate share of debt for which 
the property owners of a dis-
annexed area are liable. Sec. 
43.148 addresses the refund 
of taxes and fees.
	 Sec. 43.143 (c) is clear on 
the debt. “If the area with-
draws from a municipality 
as provided by this section 
and if, at the time of the 
withdrawal, the municipality 

owes any debts, by bond or 
otherwise, the area is not re-
leased from its pro rata share 
of that indebtedness. The 
governing body shall con-
tinue to levy a property tax 
each year on the property in 
the area at the same rate that 
is levied on other property 
in the municipality until the 
taxes collected from the area 
equal its pro rata share of the 
indebtedness. Those taxes 
may be charged only with the 
cost of levying and collecting 
the taxes, and the taxes shall 
be applied exclusively to the 
payment of the pro rata share 
of the indebtedness.
	 This subsection does not 
prevent the inhabitants of the 
area from paying in full at 
any time their pro rata share 
of the indebtedness.”
	 However, John Newman, 

spokesperson for Salado FED 
UP (Friends of an Election 
for Disannexation) says that 
the property owners will not 
be liable for the sewer debt 
because of Section 43.148 
REFUND OF TAXES AND 
FEES, which states “(a) If 
an area is disannexed, the 
municipality disannexing 
the area shall refund to the 
landowners of the area the 
amount of money collected 
by the municipality in prop-
erty taxes and fees from 
those landowners during the 
period that the area was a 
part of the municipality less 
the amount of money that the 
municipality spent for the di-
rect benefit of the area during 
that period.”
	 When questioned about 
the sewer debt by alderman 
Frank Coachman at an April 

8 town hall meeting on Dis-
annexation, Newman said, 
“They’re outside of the vil-
lage. They won’t be paying 
any Village taxes. All the 
Village taxes go away. And 
now you want to hit me with 
the debt stuff.”
	 “There’s 43.148 that you 
failed and this attorney failed 
to mention,” he said.
	 Coachman said that when 
the properties are released 
from the city, they will no 
longer have the exemptions 
and “They will then pick up 
the debt service,” the resident 
said.
	 “What debt service?” 
Newman responded.
	 “You’re not providing 
sewer to those properties,” 
Newman said, adding that 
because the properties re-

John Newman says he spent two months researching county records to create a map and metes and bounds description 
of the proposed disannexation area.

Questions continue on whether 
Disannexation Metes & Bounds close 

Issue of paying bond debt likely to be 
litigated if May 6 election is succesful

	 Village of Salado voters 
will have a chance to meet 
the candidates for Aldermen 
face to face at a Candidate 
Forum 6:30 p.m. April 18 at 
the Salado Civic Center.
	 Salado Village Voice 
readers can read candidate 
profiles this week on Page 
2A and online at saladovilla-
gevoice.com. This week, the 
profiles focus on introducing 
the candidates. Future weeks 
will be questions directed at 
the candidates, beginning 
with the Disannexation peti-
tion and election in the April 
20 edition. 
	 Alderman candidates in-
clude Judy Fields, David T. 
Williams, Fred Brown, Andy 
Jackson, Christopher Tramel,
Michael McDougal and Lin-
da Reynolds. 
	 At the Candidate forum 
April 18, moderator Dave 
Swarthout, Chair of the 
Chamber/Tourism Board, 
will introduce the candidates 
at the beginning of the ses-
sion.
	 Each candidate will have  
three minutes for opening 
remarks which may include 
biographic information, plat-
form information or any oth-
er pertinent information they 
wish to impart. 
	 Questions will be collect-

ed from the audience, fielded 
and given to the moderator 
for the candidates to answer. 
	 Each candidate will be 
given two minutes to answer. 
	 Candidates will rotate 
during the question and an-
swer session. 
	 At the end of the question/
answer period, in reverse or-
der to the introductions, each 
candidate will be given two 
minutes for closing remarks.
	 Early voting begins for the 
Aldermen election. Also on 
the ballot is a local decision 
to consider disannexation of 
a large part of the Village of 
Salado.
	 Early voting will begin 
on April 24. The last day of 
early voting will be May 2.
	 Early voting will be con-
ducted in person at the Sala-
do Civic Center. 
	 Early voting hours are 
these: 7:30 a.m.-4:30 p.m. 
April 24, April 26-28 and 
May 1 and 7 a.m.-7 p.m. 
April 25 and May 2.
	 Election day, the polls will 
be open 7 a.m.-7 p.m. at the 
Salado Civic Center.
	 The last day to apply for 
a ballot by mail is April 25. 
Applications for a ballot by 
mail must be mailed to Judy 
King, Village of Salado, P.O. 
Box 219, Salado, TX 76571.

	 Saladoans are invited to 
the annual Easter Sunrise 
Service, beginning at 7 a.m. 
April 16 in Salado’s Pace 
Park.

	 Each year, many of the lo-
cal churches gather together 
to hold the Sunrise Service.
	 For other Easter services, 
turn to page 4A.

Easter Sunrise Service 
set in Pace Park April 16

Meet your 
candidates for 
Salado Aldermen

See Debt, Page 6A
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An Introduction to the Villagers running for Salado Board of Aldermen
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Judy 
Fields
	 Born and raised in Odes-
sa, Texas. Married, three 
children.
	 E D U C A -
TION: Odessa 
High School; 
Texas West-
ern College 
(UTEP)
  CIVIC EN-
GAGEMENT:
Salado Resident 10 years:
	 •  Salado Historical Soci-
ety—Director 7 years
	 • Ladies Auxiliary—10 
years
	 • Salado Area Republican 
Women
	 • Citizens Emergency Re-
sponse Team
	 • Citizens On Patrol
	 • Tourism Board--4 years
	 •Offer Free Tours of Sala-
do
El Paso Resident 35 years:
	 • Taught elementary/high 
school-8 years
	 • Hospital Administra-
tion-15 years
	 • Worked to found El Paso 
Ronald McDonald House; 
board member 10 years 
	 • CASA Volunteer-liaison 
serving abused children.
	 • El Paso Chevron Em-
ployees Credit Union-first 
woman serving on board-4 
years
	 • Charter Member Loma 
Terrace Baptist Church
	 • El Paso Historical Soci-
ety
	 Beaumont Resident: 8 
years and Qatar Resident 2 
years.
 	 After serving on Salado’s 
Tourism Council for four 
years, I am concerned by the 
striking year after year de-
crease in community events.  
	 With the recent comple-
tion of Interstate 35 coupled 
with the soon to open Stage-
coach restaurant, Salado is 
poised, once again, to ac-
commodate a great volume 
of tourists   Saladoans should 
be making plans to exten-
sively advertise our village 
and these events throughout 
this region, and the state.   
We are a beautiful village 
with a unique history. This 
unique history gives us a tre-
mendous occasion to invite 
people to Salado’s offerings.
 	 My main goal in running 
for Alderman is to promote 
Salado by more awareness 
of who we are.  Our location 
on I-35 gives us geographical 
advantages that must be uti-
lized. Proper publicity will 
make travelers aware that 
Salado is a true must-see 

destination point. We cannot 
allow a failing infrastructure 
to negatively affect the pros-
perity of our once thriving 
village. Our town and our 
citizens should flourish as 
we close the door on stifling 
highway construction and 
pave a new path to success 
for the village of Salado. 

David T. 
Williams
	 My name is Dave Wil-
liams, and I am running for 
re-election as a Village of 
Salado Alderman.  
	 I am married with 6 grown 
children and 3 grand-chil-
dren.  My wife, Karen, and I 
have lived in Salado for 3-1/2 
years.  When house hunting 
in late 2013, 
we fell in 
love with the 
beautiful oak 
trees, winding 
roads, creek, 
and historic 
district of Salado.  This is 
our home and our communi-
ty.
	 I am recently retired. I 
previously served 27 years as 
a Marine Corps Officer, re-
tiring as a Colonel; 10 years 
as a Department of Defense 
Acquisition Program Man-
ager; and 6 years as a Hos-
pital Administrator.  I am a 
member of the Salado Lion’s 
Club; Salado Historical So-
ciety; Order of Daedalians; 
Heart of Texas Corvette 
Club; Military Officers of 
America Association; and 
Chairman of the Central 
Texas Marines.
	 I have a Bachelors of Sci-
ence degree from the United 
States Naval Academy and 
a Masters Degree from the 
College of Notre Dame of 
Maryland. 
	 I chose a commission in 
the United States Marine 
Corps primarily because of 
the Corps ethos to, “Take 
care of your men before 
yourself.”  I understood and 
embraced the idea that lead-
ers are placed in their posi-
tions of authority to serve 
those entrusted into their 
care.  	
	 I have continued to serve 
the citizens of Salado for al-
most two years as an Alder-
man.  I am a firm believer 
that all citizens deserved to 
be treated respectfully and 
according to the ordinances 
and policies when it comes 
to municipal matters.  I am 
a detailed person that asks a 
lot of questions to ensure we 
fully understand the issue at 

hand and the potential con-
sequences of our decisions. 
	 What I am offering the 
citizens of Salado are the tal-
ents I have developed and the 
experience I have gained.  

Fred 
Brown
	 I’m Fred Brown and I’m 
married to Jane Brown. 
We have been married for 
42 years and have 2 grown 
daughters and 4 grand-
daughters. I am a deacon 
at First Baptist Church and 
Jane and I teach a married 
couples Sunday School class. 
You have trusted me to be an 
Alderman for the Village for 
the past 4 years and am cur-
rently your Mayor-Pro-Tem.
	 Prior to moving to Sala-
do in 2011, I 
was the Texas 
State Repre-
sentative for 
district 14, 
Bryan, Col-
lege Station 
and Texas A&M serving 7 
terms. During my legislative 
career I authored extensive 
higher education legislation 
and I also authored the senior 
and disabled homestead tax 
freeze. I served as the Chair 
of the Health and Human 
Services Oversight commit-
tee, Chair of the Regulatory 
Committee on Appropria-
tions, Vice Chair of Higher 
Education, Chair of Budget 
and Oversight for Higher 
Education, and served on the 
Texas Legislative Council.
	 Prior to my election to 
the Texas House, I served 9 
years on the College Station 
City Council, 7 as Mayor-
Pro-Tem.
	 Jane and I built our first 
home in Mill Creek in 1977, 
and moved to College Sta-
tion in 1982.
	 During the late 80s and 
the 90s we owned a second 
home in Salado and we knew 
this was where we wanted 
to someday return and call 
home. 
	 It has been and honor for 
me to be able to serve the cit-
izens of Salado under 2 great 
Mayors as we try to guide 
our Village through con-
trolled growth while keeping 
the historical aspect of the 
Village in check.
	 Jane and I thank you for 
allowing us to be a part of 
this community that we so 
love.

Andy 
Jackson
	 I am Andy Jackson and 
I am running for alderman.  
My family has been in the 
central Texas area since the 
mid 1800’s.  My father was 
born and raised in Florence, 
my mother in Austin.  I was 
born and raised in Austin.  I 
began visiting Salado as a 
child and have returned of-
ten ever since.  My wife, Kay, 
and I have chosen to make 
Salado our retirement home.  
We moved here about two 
and a half 
years ago 
and are both 
active in our 
community.  
Our three 
children are 
married and live in Texas and 
California.  I currently serve 
on the Planning and Zoning 
Commission, the Econom-
ic Development, Street Im-
provements, and Main Street 
Committees.  I am involved 
in many local organizations 
and very active in the Salado 
Church of Christ.
	 I will retire from the 
University of Texas MD 
Anderson Cancer Center as 
their Purchasing Manager 
effective at the end of April.  
During my career, I worked 
for large and small compa-
nies and owned and operated 
a diverse set of businesses 
which broadened my compe-
tence in accounting, finance, 
investments, project manage-
ment, personnel, purchasing, 
and most important of all, 
listening.  I have attended al-
most every meeting of the al-
dermen since moving here.  I 
have studied the issues, chal-
lenges and opportunities fac-
ing Salado.  I have listened 
to different solutions offered 
by a wide range of develop-
ers, business owners, subject 
matter experts and interested 
citizens of Salado.
	 I believe I have a set of 
skills that will allow me to 
work with the other aldermen 
and contribute to a compre-
hensive plan that will allow 
all of us to benefit from the 
growth that is coming and at 
the same time keep our vil-
lage as the wonderful place 
that brought each of us here.  
I hope you will consider me 
worthy of your vote.

Christopher 
Tramel
	 Raised in Killeen, the 
product of a military family, 
I enlisted in the Army im-
mediately af-
ter graduating 
high school. 
I completed 
several duty 
assignments, 
both inside the United States 

and overseas, including a 
combat tour in Iraq and PCS 
assignment to Korea. 
 	 After leaving the Army, 
I completed my education at 
Texas State University and 
certified as a Professional 
Property Inspector. Along 
with my wife Carrie Tramel 
I created Tramel Property 
Inspections and within three 
years, we were voted the best 
Home Inspection Company 
in the Central Texas area.
 	 I believe  in the premise 
of small government, the 
preservation of individual 
liberty, and government ac-
countability. Further, I be-
lieve that those who are se-
lected to govern should serve 
the people with integrity and 
a sense of respect. I am ded-
icated to the preservation, 
success, and well-being of 
the Village of Salado and its 
residents.
 	 In my spare time, I en-
joy fishing, outdoor activi-
ties and spending time with 
my wife Carrie and our four 
children Grace, Emma, Sam-
uel Glenn, and Scarlett.

Michael 
McDougal
	 I am married to my wife, 
Carrol, who has lived in 
Salado for 29 years.  I have 
resided here 
for the past 
12 years, but 
invested in 
Salado in the 
1980’s.  My 
backg round 
is 40 years of service in the 
U.S. Army, retired as Major 
General,  29 years in Texas 
Public Education, retired as 
Superintendent of Schools 
in Sherman, Texas, and 10 
years in Higher Education 
as an Associate Professor 
at SouthEastern Oklahoma 
State.  While living in Sala-
do I have been active in com-
munity service while serv-
ing on Boards of the Salado 
United Methodist Church, 
Salado Civic Center, Mill 
Creek Community Associa-
tion, Lions Club, Association 
United States Army and the 
Bell County Historical Mu-
seum.
	 Serving on your Board of 
Alderman for the past 4 years 
has been a wonderful expe-
rience.  Much has been ac-
complished, however, much 
remains to be accomplished.  
My view on the responsibil-
ity of service to all citizens,  
is to remember that I work 
on behalf of all.  Yes, many 
decisions are required and 
many hours must be spent 
on behalf of the Village, but, 
that is what I signed up for.  
Staying abreast of factual 
information is absolutely 
essential in sound decision 
making.  Anything less is not 

what our citizens deserve or 
expect.  
	 My view is that the Vil-
lage Board should continue 
to place major emphasis on 
solidifying a primary reason 
that has attracted thousands 
of visitors to the Village in 
the past and will continue to 
do so.  Our Historical val-
ue is well established and 
should continue to be high-
ly promoted.  This, coupled 
with continuing and enhanc-
ing the Main Street project, 
will create a better revenue 
position   for  our  merchants 
and to the overall fiscal  base 
of the Village.  Your bond 
package approval will abso-
lutely promote an extremely 
beneficial Village for us all.
	 Thanks for reading & for 
your vote consideration.

Linda 
Reynolds
	 Whatever the outcome of 
this election, I will support 
No Raising Taxes and a Sew-
er Rebate for 
H o m e s t e a d 
Homes that 
pay for De-
veloper Wel-
fare. K.I.S.S.: 
Keep it Small and Salty!
	 Linda Alonzo Reynolds, 
born 1946, a Baby Boomer! 
I am the daughter of  Elea-
zar Alonzo b.1921-Goliad 
Tx and Geraldine Newmarch 
b.1923 MI.
	 In 2016, I was a Salado 
alderman candidate and re-
ceived 238 write in votes-A 
loss, but Thank You Salado 
Voters!
	 If at first you don’t suc-
ceed...
	 In 1959 I was baptized at 
the Arlington Baptist Church 
in Indianapolis, Indiana.
	 I married James Farrin 
Reynolds in 1968 and grad-
uated from Indiana Universi-
ty, 1969. 
	 My daughter was born in 
Edmonton, Alberta Canada, 
1970. (Ted Cruz  born 1970, 
Calgary, Canada.)
	 I graduated in 1979 with a 
Masters from Syracuse Uni-
versity and my husband died 
in 1982. 
	 Eventually, I moved to 
Bar Harbor, Maine to help 
his ailing mother and be near 
family.     
	 My daughter graduated 
from Mary Hardin Baylor 
and works in nursing in Aus-
tin.
	 When I retired from 
teaching over 35 years, I once 
again moved to help  my 93 
year old mother remain as 
independent as possible.
	 In 2011, I moved to Sal-
ado where I bought a small 
house in a lovely, peaceful 
neighborhood. I voted for 
the sewer bond and thought 
I was helping the schools, 
the West side development, 
and Main Street businesses. 
After casting my vote, I  dis-
covered that the two young 
families in my neighborhood 
were moving to the ETJ. 
     Then I realized that  even 
if you stand up and say you 
would like the leaders to 
support the peace, quiet and 
safety of your neighborhood, 
they don’t care. 
	 Whatever the outcome 
of this election, I will sup-
port No Raising Taxes and a 
Sewer Rebate for Homestead 
Homes that pay for Develop-
er Welfare. K.I.S.S.: Keep it 
Small and Salty!

NEXT WEEK: Salado 
Village Voice will focus 
questions next week on 
the topic that appears to 
be of most interest to our 
readers and to the voters 
of Salado: Disannexation.
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• Competitive Rates
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NMLS #415114
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FREE MORTGAGE CONSULTATION
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(254) 947-3454 office

40 North Main, Suite C, Salado, TX
lorraineb@fairwaymc.com

All loans subject to credit approval
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53718, 1-877-699-0353. All rights reserved. This is not an offer to enter into an agreement. Not all customers will 
qualify. Information, rates and programs are subject to change without notice. All products are subject to credit and 
property approval. Other restrictions and limitations may apply. Equal Housing Lender. 

Finney Insurance Agency

820 S. Main Street, Belton
Allison@finneyinsurance.com

(254) 939-5751

Home • Auto • Life • Liability 
Commercial • Farm • Ranch

Agent Allison Finney

Salado
254.947.8480

Gatesville
254.865.2114

Temple
254.773.7750

Harker Heights
254.699.1102

FCTTX.com

First Community Title
Serving Bell, Coryell and  Williamson Counties

Coryell

Bell

Williamson

213 Mill Creek Dr., #140

Liz Armstrong
Salado Branch Manager

Escrow Officer

liz.armstrong@monteithtitle.com

(254) 947-3922
fax (254) 947-8632

www.monteithtitle.com

You Have a Choice™
Home owned and operated since 1876.

Bruce A. Bolick, CPA
Tax Time is here!

Call for an appointment
(254) 718-7299 or (254) 947-1040

560 North Main, Suite 4, Office 3
ACROSS FROM THE CIVIC CENTER

SaladoCPA@aol.com

To the Editor:
	 I consider Nancy Snead a 
long time friend of my fami-
ly.  Her children and my chil-
dren went to Salado schools 
together back in the early 
80’s.  I respect her as an ed-
ucator, citizen and a person 
who still has her independent 
spirit about her. 
	 Nancy, I don’t think any-
one would consider you “a 
lemming who will blindly 
follow the dictates of any-
one”. News flash neither am 
I. You and I must not know 
the same senior citizens.  
The ones I know are some of 
the best informed, well edu-
cated, independent thinking 
people in our village and 
they vote in large numbers.    

	 I am voting against the 
de-annexation of part of our 
beloved Village.  I returned 
home to Salado, not Mill 
Creek.  My roots are deep 
here; my grandparents came 
here in 1935 to make a better 
life for their family. Yes, my 
taxes are “capped” but I don’t 
apologize for that fact.  This 
November I will be 75 years 
old.  I have had a job since 
I was 13 and do to this day.  
Maudie and I have worked 
hard all of our 53+ years of 

marriage, lived on a budget, 
we skimped and saved but 
through it all we have been 
and continue to be blessed.  
With a lot more years behind 
us than are ahead of us, it is 
ok if our taxes are capped.   
It is ok that we get to vote on 
this issue. 
	 Darrell Street

	 PS. I had to look up the 
definition of the word “lem-
ming.”

Neighbors self judgement 
defended by reader

	 Thank you for attending 
two Town Hall meetings, 
Tuesday, 4 April, and Satur-
day, 8 April.  The number of 
people that attended indicat-
ed that Democracy is alive 
and well in Salado.  As Alan 
Bojorquez, Village Attorney, 
said, “This was good.  Put 
everything out on the table, 
discuss it, and make person-
al decisions.  I am proud of 
Salado citizens for taking 
this approach and attending.  
I am glad I participated and 
was able to make a contribu-
tion.” 
	 A family considering 
buying a Salado home, called 
Sunday: “We attended Satur-
day’s Town Hall because we 

Democracy in action at the Town 
Hall meetings April 4 & April 8

heard much Salado negativ-
ism in North Texas. How-
ever, when we heard Salado 
citizens speaking eloquently 
of their Salado love, we are 
moving to Salado as quickly 
as possible.”
	 Note from Congressman 
John Carter’s Office ar-
rived last week: “I chatted 
briefly with U.S. Fish and 
Wildlife Service re: Salado.  
While they are progressing 

on a biological opinion and 
don’t foresee any huge head-
aches, I urged them to keep 
in touch with the Village as 
things move forward.”
	 TXDoT is working on 
the following: (1) the Sal-
ado Plaza Bridge lights (2) 
the request for 2 Cultural 
District signs on I-35, (3) the 
status of I-35 Purple Heart 
Village signs, and (4) the 
Main Street sidewalks and 
streetlights. 
	 The Village is working on 
a truck route for big trucks. 
Our narrow streets and wa-
ter bridge cannot take their 
weight or size. (2) Large 
neighborhood trees with low 
hanging branches.  Our new 

City Administrator and Po-
lice Chief will address these 
issues.
	 Lone Star E-Bikes, elec-
tric motors bikes for people 
who love and want to bike 
but are not physically able, is 
strongly considering Salado.
	 Sage Hill Market is mov-
ing into the Horsefeathers 
building.
	 Howling Wolf purchased 
the buildings across Main 
street from the Range, refur-
bishing them, and will soon 
move to that location. 



Page 4A  SALADO Village Voice, April 13, 2017

Community LifeCommunity Life

Visit Saladovillagevoice.com
for community and special events 

Submit your event to 
News@saladovillagevoice.com

Mill Creek Cleaners

Quality Dry Cleaning, Laundry, 
Alterations & Custom Tailoring

213 Mill Creek Drive, Suite 200
Salado Plaza next to Brookshire Brothers

Mon-Fri 8-6 • Sat 9-2 • Closed Sunday
 (254) 947-0100

Salado’s Future:
N   O   W   H   E   R   E

It all depends on how you see it.  It’s the choice fac-
ing every citizen of Salado.  You can choose to read 
the seven letters above as “NOWHERE,” which is 
where we are headed as a village if we continue to do 
nothing.  Or you can choose to read it as two words:  
Our future is “NOW  HERE.”

I believe the time is NOW and the place is HERE.  The 
next two or three years are an unprecedented time 
for Salado to move forward and improve our image, 
our infrastructure and our natural beauty as a village.

If you agree, I seek your support to become a new 
member of the Board of Aldermen.

ANDYJACKSON4SALADO@GMAIL.COM
Political ad paid for by Andy Jackson Campaign

A better Salado for all of Salado

2017 Cadillac ATS Luxury Sedan stk# H0111501 $399 mo 39 month 10k yr lease through GM Financial WAC , .00029 
money factor $1300 lease cash  $2999 Due at signing , cash down excludes taxes, 1st payment and fees WAC $20121 
residual value 2017 Cadillac XT5 Base Sstk#HZ185889 $379mo 39 month 10k yr lease $22867 residual , .00027 money 
factor through GM Financial WAC, 1700 lease cash and 2000 Cadillac Loyalty (with qualified vin) $3499 due at signing 
excludes taxes, 1st payment ,and fees. Expires 12/31/16. Photos for illustrative purposes only.

5 6 2 5 S .  G e n e r a l  B r u c e D r.  a t  I 3 5 ,  Te m p l e ,  T X 
( 2 5 4)  7 7 1- 0 1 2 8 
g a r l y n s h e l t o n . c o m

GARLYN SHELTON CADILLAC 

GARLYN SHELTON CADILLAC

2017 ATS Luxury Sedan

$399 / 39 
PER MONTH MONTHS

LEASE FOR

2017 XT5 

$379 / 39
PER MONTH MONTHS

LEASE FOR

Alton D. Thiele PC
Serving Central Texas Since 1979

• Tax Return Preparation & Planning
• Small Business Accounting Service
• Accounting & Auditing Service
• Business Counsulting
• Payroll Check Processing & Reporting
• Tax-Exempt Organization Consulting
• Quickbooks Installation & Consulting
• Retirement Planning

Alton D. Thiele, CPA
Kevin S. Cowan, CPA

254-939-0701 alton@adtcpa.com
toll free 1-800-772-7043
300 E Ave C, Belton

adtcpa.com

The Chisholm Trail American Business Women’s Association is busy planning their 22nd 
Annual Style Show and Benefit Luncheon set for Thursday, May 11.  The event starts 
at 11 a.m.. at The Venue, 200 College Street. The meal will be catered by The Range at 
Barton House. Spring fashions from Christy’s, Springhouse, Magnolia’s and Susan Ma-
rie’s will be modeled.  Tickets are $30 and may be purchased at any of the participating 
shops, from any local ABWA member or by mailing a $30 check to Barclay McCort, 406 
Royal View, Salado, TX 76571. Checks are to be made out to Chisholm Trail Chapter 
ABWA. Reserved tables of eight are available also. Contact Barclay McCort at barclaymc-
cort@gmail.com for more information.	

	 The Body of Christ Com-
munity Clinic (BOCCC) 
will hold its fourth annual 
fundraising banquet 5:45 
p.m., May 2 in the McLane 
Great Hall on the campus of 
the University of Mary Har-
din Baylor,.
	 Headlining the event this 
year is a very special musi-
cal duo, David Perez Guerra 
and Roger Bennet who will 
present “Sharing the Joy of 
Music.” These two very tal-
ented musicians have been 
performing across the state 
with their unique blend of 

classical and modern music.
	 The theme of this year’s 
banquet is “Together We 
Heal,” celebrating the 
achievements of the BOC-
CC’s building and opening 
a new dental clinic last fall, 
and recognizing the need 
for the BOCCC’s continual 
outreach to meet the need 
of area residents. One key 
fundraising focus,with this 
year’s banquet, is the goal of 
raising sufficient funds to be 
able to expand the operating 
hours of the clinics.
	 Individual ticket prices 

for the event are $40 per per-
son or a table of eight may be 
purchased for $300. Other 
sponsorships levels include 
$500 for Gold, $1,000 for 
Platinum, $2,500 for Patron, 
and $5,000 for Sustaining. 
Tickets may be purchased 
from the BOCCC’s medical 
clinic located at 2210 B Hol-
land Road in Belton. Reser-
vations need to be made by 
April 21.
	 Board Chairman, John 
C. Perry, said, “This is our 
major fundraiser and we cer-
tainly hope that the people 
in Belton, Salado and Tem-
ple will come out and help 
us. They have been so very 
generous in the past, and 
even though we have fin-
ished the new dental clinic, 
we need the funds to be able 
to expand our hours.” Donna 
Dunn, Executive Director, 
added, “We have been so 
very blessed by the wonder-
ful support we have received, 
and we hope to further our 
mission of helping those who 
need our help. Our banquet 
will help us to raise the funds 
to do just that.”

Body of Christ Clinic fundraiser  
held at Mary Hardin Baylor

	 Saladoans are invited to 
the annual Easter Sunrise 
Service, beginning at 7 a.m. 
April 16 in Salado’s Pace 
Park.
	 In addition, the local 
churches announce the fol-
lowing services for Easter 
Week.
Salado United Methodist 
Church
	 Maundy Thursday service 
will be 6:30 p.m. April 13 in 
the historic Chapel.
	 Good Friday service will 
be 6:30 p.m. April 14 in the 
Chapel.
	 The church invites the 
community families to an 
Easter Egg Hunt on the 
grounds of the church 3:30-5 
p.m. April 15.
	 The Easter Cantata “On 
a Hill Too Far Away” will 
feature the Chancel Choir 
and full orchestra 9 a.m. and 
11:15 a.m. on Easter Sunday, 

April 16.
	
St. Stephen Catholic Church
	 Holy Thursday Mass will 
be 7 p.m. April 13.
	 Good Friday service will 
have the Youth Stations of 
the Croos at noon April 14.
	 Good Friday Veneration 
of the Cross will be a bilin-
gual service at 3 p.m. April 
14.
	 Easter Saturday Vigil will 
be 9 p.m. April 15.
	 Easter Sunday will have 
English Mass at 9 a.m., 
Spanish Mass at 11 a.m. and 
an Easter Egg Hunt at 10:30 
a.m. April 16.
	 St. Joseph’s Episcopal 
Church
	 Maundy Thursday Ser-
vice will be 6:30 p.m. April 
13.  
	 Good Friday Service at 
6:30 p.m. on April 14.
	 Easter Sunday services 

are at 9 a.m. and 11 a.m. on 
April 16.
Presbyterian Church of Sal-
ado
	 Maundy Thursday service 
will be 6 p.m. April 13 and 
will include communion and 
a light meal.
	 Easter Sunday service 
will be 10 a.m. April 16.

First Baptist Church of Sal-
ado
	 Palm Sunday services at 
8:30 a.m. and 11 a.m. will be 
an observance of the Lord’s 
Supper.
	 Easter Sunday will be 
three services: 8:30 a.m. 
Classic Worship; 9:45 a.m. 
Small Group Bible Study 
and 11 a.m. Contemporary 
Worship Service on April 16.
	 The church will have no 
evening activities or services 
on Easter Sunday April 16.

Easter Services in Salado
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....serving those who love and remember

(254) 947-0066
949 West Village Road, Salado

BroeckerFuneralHome.com

Dossman 
Funeral Home

2525 N. Main • Belton • 933-2525
“In Service to our fellow man...”

When I remember You on my bed, I meditate on You in the night 
watches, For You have been my help...

				    Psalm 63: 6,7

16258 Gooseneck Road,  Salado
Church service starts 10 am

(254) 947-7211
www.3ccowboyfellowship.org
Follow events on our website calendar

gracesalado.com  |  5798 FM 2484 in Salado  |  254.947.5917

A people of biblical faith,
eternal hope, and radical love.

Dr. Travis Burleson, Senior Pastor

Wednesday, April 19

www.fbcsalado.org
(254) 947-5465

Main St. at the Creek
    Easter Sunday, April 16
   7 a.m.         Community Sunrise Service in Pace Park
   8:30 a.m.    Classic Worship Service
   9:45 a.m.    Small Group Bible Study (SS) 
   11 a.m.      Contemporary Worship Service   

       No Evening activities or services

5 p.m.  Fellowship Meal
5:30 p.m. Jr. High MIDWEEK
6 p.m.  Adult Bible Study

6 p.m. ESL
6 p.m.  The Mix (Pre-K - 6)
6 p.m.  Bible Drill (Grade 4 – 6)
7:07 p.m. High School MIDWEEK

  

IH-35 at Blacksmith Rd.
947-5241 

Sunday
Bible Classes • 9 a.m.      Worship • 10 a.m.

Spanish Worship - Call Church for times

Wednesday
Bible Classes • 6:30 p.m.

The Salado Church of Christ
‘Shaped by His Cross, Sharing His 

truth, Showing His love.’ 

 “We invite you to worship 
with us at any available 
opportunity. You will find 
a group of sincere, God-
loving and Christ-exalting 
people, who will make you 
feel at home with our church 
family.    
  -Joe Keyes, minister

St. Stephen
Catholic 
Church

Mass Schedule
Tuesday - 6 p.m. 

Wed & Thurs - 8:30 a.m.
Friday - Noon

Saturday - 5:30 p.m.
Confesssions 4:30-5:15 p.m. 

or call for an appointment
Friday

Adoration (Holy Hour) 11 a.m.
Sunday

 (English) 9 a.m.
(Spanish) 11 a.m. 

Office Hours: Monday - Friday 
9 a.m. - Noon & 1:30 - 3 p.m.

601 FM 2268 
947-8037

www.saintstephenchurch.org

Religious Education
 Classes - Wednesday

 K thru 12th            5:30 - 8 p.m. 

St. Joseph’s 
Episcopal Church

881 North Main Street
947-3160

S t J o s e p h S a l a d o . o rg

Sunday School
Sun.  10:10 a.m.
Holy Eucharist

Sun.  9 a.m. & 11 a.m.

Rev. Lara Whitley Franklin, Pastor
 650 Royal Street    
  (254) 947-5482

www.saladoumc.org 

Office hours:  
Mon - Fri 8:30 a.m. - 4 p.m.
Facebook.com/saladoumc

Sunday, April 16 Easter Sunday
7 am Sunrise Service at pace Park
9 am Easter Cantana in Worship Center
10 am  Sunday School All Ages
11:15 am Easter Cantana in Worship Center

“FourTwelve” Youth in the YAC
Fellowship Meal
Adult Book study “Parables”
Adult Ramp project
M&M Kids

5 - 7:15 pm  
5:15 pm
6 pm
6-7 p.m         
6-7 pm  

Wednesday, April 19

	 Bring your Grandma’s buttons to the Temple Public 
Library 1-5 p.m. April 20 to learn more about the small, 
utilitarian buttons of the 1880s called ‘China Buttons’.
The China Buttons Road Show, in the third floor board 
room of the Temple Public Library, will have members of 
the Central Texas B&B Button Club on hand to help vis-
itors identify the materal, age, construction and other 
characteristics of the buttons that they may bring. There 
is no charge for the event. The button enthusiasts want 
to share their knowledge with other collectors or anyone 
interested about the old buttons they make come across 
from family, estate sales or otherwise. For more informa-
tion, contact Janice Canard at jcanard4930@gmail.com.
photo courtesy Jamie Wolfe

	 The Holland Woman’s 
Study Club will hold it’s 
annual fundraiser Chicken 
Spaghetti Luncheon, Bake 
Sale, and Silent Auction, 
11a.m.-1 p.m. April 18 at the 
Kuhlmann Civic Center in 
Holland. Plates are priced at 
$9 which includes chicken 
spaghetti, salad, bread, des-
sert and a drink.
 Proceeds benefit HISD 
Scholarships, B.J. Hill Li-
brary, Kuhlmann Civic Cen-

	 Salado Area Republican 
Women’s April meeting. 
is planned for 6 p.m. April 
20,  at Tenroc in the Sirena 
Room. 
	 The guest speaker for the 
event will be Jonas Miller 
who is currently the Chief of 
Staff for U.S. Congressman, 
John “Judge” Carter. Mill-
er has been a senior advisor 
for numerous campaigns 
for the U.S. Congress, State 

Senate, State Representative 
and county elections. He will 
provide the latest events oc-
curring in Washington and 
updates on Congressman 
Carter’s work during the first 
quarter of 2017. 
	 The event will be ca-
tered by Dave Hermann, 
The Range Restaurant. The 
evening’s menu will in-
clude Quesadilla’s Smoked 
Chicken, Guatemalan 

Braised Beef and Barbecue 
Pork Sliders, Uptown Que-
so “Bar”, Dips with Chips, 
Crisps and Crackers, Cran-
berry Chicken Salad on pita 
chips, Cheese, Fruit and 
Vegetable Crudite. Cost will 
be $20 per person. For plan-
ning purpose RSVP by Fri-
day, April 14, for seating and 
food to: Barbara Swarthout- 
bswarthout@mygrande.net 
– 414-491-2341 Cell. A $20 
check may also be mailed to 
SARW, PAC; PO box 373; 
Salado, TX 76571.		
		

ter and other local projects.
 	 For questions or takeout 

orders, call 254-203-2585 or 
512-657-8772.

Congressman Carter’s Chief of Staff to update SARW

Holland Study Club 
spaghetti/auction 
fundraiser

	 Families who have suf-
fered the loss of a child, are 
invited to a Compassionate 
Friends Bluebonnet Chapter 
meeting 6:30 p.m. April 13 
at the Family Center across 
from the  Harper Talasek 
Funeral Home at 500 West 
Barton (corner of North 9th 
and Barton) in Temple.  The 
child could have been any 
age from an infant to an 
adult.  This is a local chap-
ter of The Compassionate 
Friends,  a nonprofit self-

	 Neema House/Village 
will be doing their 4th An-
nual 5K Formula Walk/Run 
8:30 a.m. April 29 a Lions 
Parks, 4320 Lions Park Rd. 
(off Hickory Rd) in Temple.  
This run will benefit aban-
doned, orphaned, and at risk 
infants in Arusha and Tanza-
nia. Early registration is now 
until April 21 and costs $35.  

help bereavement support or-
ganization for families that 
have experienced the death 
of a child. The meeting will 
be 6:30 p.m.- 8 p.m. at the 
Family Center.  
	 For more information, 
call Sue Hamby, PhD at 254-
228-6473.  To learn more 
about The Compassionate 
Friends, visit the national 
website at www.compassion-
atefriends.org.

After April 21, registration 
will be $40. Registration for 
participants 18 and under 
is $15. For more informa-
tion about Neema House/
Village and the run, visit 
www.neemavillage.org You 
can register online at www.
runsignup.com/Race/Tx/
NeemaHouseFormulaRun .  

5K RUN to Benefit Orphans

Compassionate Friends meet April 13 
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8398 Interstate 35 Frontage Road, Belton
         (254) 947-8349

Looking for a granite 
lazy susan or pastry board?  

We have them!

Ceiling Fans | Light Fixtures | Window Treatments | Home Decor

The Shade Shop
230 North Main Street #102 

(254) 290-7000
TheShadeShopSalado.com

Ceiling Fans | Light Fixtures 
Window Treatments | Home Decor

The Shade Shop
230 North Main Street #102 

(254) 290-7000
TheShadeShopSalado.com                       

Sign-up and pay at: 
Vive Les Arts Theater, 3401 South W S Young Drive, Killeen

First Come First Served!                      (254) 526-9090
               Vendor set-up 9 - 10 a.m.

VENDOR REGISTRATION OPEN
Booth Rates

Outside the tent: $35         Inside the Tent: $45
VLA Lobby $55

or donate a silent auction item that is equal to, 
or greater than the booth rental  (with management approval)

VLA Legends Market
10 a.m. - 5 p.m.   April 21

floral department  947-8922

Brookshire Brothers
Tulip Bouquet
Special $9.99 

Easter Lilies

Lobby
 Mon - Fri  9 a.m. - 3 p.m.

Drive-in
 Mon - Thur 

7:30 a.m. - 4 p.m. 
 Fri 

7:30 a.m. - 5:30 p.m.
Sat  

9 a.m.- noon

Member FDIC

Main Street at 
Thomas Arnold Road, Salado

(254) 947-5852 

fsbcentex.com 

CUSTOM UPHOLSTERY 
FREE PICK UP & DELIVERY 

515 E. VET. MEMORIAL BLVD. HARKER HEIGHTS

254-699-6105

	 Birding, bee, and butterfly 
enthusiasts are beginning to 
hear the buzz about Salado’s 
newest grant program for 
the development of a natural 
habitat for Monarch butter-
flies along Salado Creek.
	 On April 4, Monarch 
Watch - through The Univer-
sity of Kansas - awarded the 
Salado Habitat Initiative its 
first grant to begin the devel-
opment of habitat essential to 
the monarch butterfly. 
	 The habitat will be along 
the banks of Salado Creek, 
which will be filled with 
Texas native plants, nectar 
plants, and other native pol-
linators. Initial efforts are to 
be inclusive of plant species 
that attract honey bees, hum-
mingbirds, and monarch but-
terflies.
	 The Salado Habitat Ini-
tiative has begun discussions 
with Texan by Nature, an or-
ganization based in Austin 
and founded by Laura Bush. 
Salado Habitat Initiative 
is seeking designation as a 
Monarch Wrangler by Texan 
by Nature.
	 Commitments for the hab-

itat designation can include 
developing a three-year man-
agement plan, removing in-
vasive species, creating and 
posting educational signage, 
conducting native plant iden-
tification tours, and tagging 
monarch butterflies to help 
track migration.
	 The Salado Rotary Club, 
under an agreement with the 
Pace Park Board of Trust-
ees,  will improve access to 
the habitat, so that visitors to 
Pace Park can enjoy not only 
the beauty of the flowering 
plants, but also the season-
al migration of butterflies, 
birds, and bees pollinating 
our area. 
	 The Salado Rotary Club 
already assists with grounds 
keeping and maintenance 
for Pace Park. Members of 

the local chapter are coordi-
nating with other volunteers 
to prepare the soil and have 
irrigation ready to encourage 
plants to take hold. 
	 Keep Salado Beautiful is 
engaging in these efforts by 
contributing the guidance of 
their Certified Master Gar-
deners and Master Natural-
ists toward the cause. 
	 Requests to help prepare 
the land, place the plants, 
keep records and to film the 
progress of the project are 
many.  Salado Citizens and 
organizations are invited to 
come forward and partici-
pate in this effort to beautify 
and enhance the Village.  
	 If you would like to assist, 
write to the Salado Rotary 
Club, P.O. Box 965, Salado, 
TX  76571

Salado Habitat Initiative  earns grant to 
develop monarch butterfly  sanctuary

The Monarch Caterpillar (larvae) eat for two weeks until 
they enter the chrysalis stage. After metamorphosis they 
emerge as the familiar orange and black butterfly.

ceive no direct benefit, they 
cannot be taxed.
	 “The municipality in their 
ordinance of disannexation 
will release the property in 
lieu of no back pay on those 
refunds of taxes and fees,” 
Newman adding, pointing to 
a disannexation in Mission, 
Texas.
	 Coachman countered, 
“Because you are in the  
boundary that voted on the 
sewer bond, you are liable 
for that.”
	 “Well,” Newman said, 
“we’re ready to litigate on 
that.”
	 “If 43.148 did not exist, 
this wouldn’t happen. But 
it exists and it’s happening 
now,” Newman said.
	 Bojorquez deflected the 
section 43.148 as not being 
applicable to the debt service 
for the sewer bonds.
	 He pointed to the expe-
rience of his staff attorneys 
Laura Mueller (who worked 
with Texas Municipal 
League (TML) and Linda 
Sjogren (former city attor-
ney for San Angelo and Big 
Spring).

	 “We are in unison on 
this,” he said. 
	 “If that property disan-
nexes and if there is bonded 
indebtedness at the time of 
disannexation,” they are lia-
ble for the debt. “There is no 
ambiguity, there is no vague-
ness. The language is clear.”
	 Furthermore, “the tax 
code makes it clear that a 
municipality only has au-
thority to grant any exemp-
tion within the city limits,” 
Bojorquez said. “If a prop-
erty is no longer in the city 
limits, the Village of Salado 
will have no authority to pro-
vide any sort of cap or ex-
emption on taxes.”
	 “Somebody who may not 
be responsible for the debt 
service today, is going to be 
responsible for the debt ser-
vice after May,” if the disan-
nexation election passes, he 
said. 
	 “When voters voted to 
approve bonds, the Attorney 
General’s office has gone 
through and approved the 
issuance of those bonds,” he 
said, “it is as though a lien 
has been put on those prop-
erties.”

Debt FROM Page 1A
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Schools & SportsSalado

Children are a gift from God - Psalm 127:3
OFFERING PRIVATE

ENROLL NOW FOR 2017-18

K IDS’  ZONE  LEARN ING CENTERK IDS’  ZONE  LEARN ING CENTER

Christian-based ABEKA curriculum
Emphasis on Christian Character Building
Students are engaged at their own level,         
and encouraged to excel as they progress 
Daily access to technology resources
Experienced, award-winning teacher

• Gifted & Talented • ESL certification
• Phonics • STEM

Curriculum includes Field Trips, Gardening,
& Daily Devotionals
Scope & Sequence designed to meet all TEKS, 
so students easily integrate into public school
Low Student/Teacher Ratio

104 Copper Lane
Jarrell, TX 76537
512-746-2333

104 Copper Lane
Jarrell, TX 76537
512-746-2333

Join us for an informal Q&A session with teacher 
McKenzie Teer on April 18, 6 pm - 7 pm.  

For questions, information, or to schedule a tour of our facility, 
call us or email Whitney Hicks at WhitneyHicks777@yahoo.com.

KINDERGARTEN
& 1ST GRADE

KINDERGARTEN
& 1ST GRADE

CALL TODAY!
512-746-2333 Kids’ Zone Jarrell

One Call Does It All
(254) 933-7400

www.cars-collision.com

1914 S. IH 35, Belton

Cliff Coleman, owner

Paint & Body • Frame Repair • Hail Repair
FREE ESTIMATES              INSURANCE CLAIMS WELCOME

	 The Salado One-Act Play 
is headed to the state meet for 
the eighth time in the school’s 
history. This year’s play, St. 
Hugo of Central Park, will 
be the first to perform at 
the Conference 4A contest 4 
p.m., April 12 at the Round 
Rock ISD Performing Arts 
Center.
 	 Changing styles from their 
past productions of historical 
drama, this year’s play is a 
dark comedy based on a fic-
tional messianic archetypal 
plot. 
	 Hugo DePew is a young 
man with an unusual ambi-
tion: he wants to be a saint. 
Hearing the voice of God, 
Hugo goes to live in Central 
Park to tend the pigeons. A 
miracle occurs: a blind man 
is cured and Hugo is on his 
way to sainthood, but there is 

a horrifying catch to his God-
given power in this whimsi-
cal fable for all audiences.
 	 Members of this year’s 
SOAP team are: Payton 
Blisard, Hayden Morris, 
Kaydee Free, Bobby Cun-
ningham, Rayne Polkowski, 
Nolan Maldonado, Cynthia 
Howell, Ashley Ruiz, Syd-
ney Blisard, Kelsey Marquis, 
Noah Barker, Faith Madsen, 
Nathan Cahoon, Christian 
Ortiz, William Arnett, Paige 
Aydell, Marshall Hildebrand, 
Jacob Mandeville, James Si-
wert, Sebastian Welch, Heidi 
Kelley, Maddie Krustchin-
sky, Maddy Martinez, and 
Loriann Turk.
 	 The play is directed by J.J. 
Jonas and Dixie Darling Mc-
Collough.
	 The following students 
earned individual awards at 

the Regional Competition: 
Best Actor – Payton Blisard; 
All Star Cast – Kaydee Free; 
Honorable Mention All Star 
Cast – Rayne Polkowski; 
Honorable Mention All Star 
Cast – Bobby Cunningham 
and Outstanding Technician 
– Paige Aydell
	 The only public perfor-
mance of this play will be 
held at 7 p.m. April 18 at the 
high school cafeteria.
	 Also, the following stu-
dents earned individual 
awards at the Area One Act 
Play competition: All Star 
Cast – Payton Blisard; Hon-
orable Mention All Star Cast 
– Kaydee Free; Honorable 
Mention All Star Cast – Faith 
Madsen and Outstanding 
Technician – Paige Aydell.
 

SHS One-Act Play  St. Hugo 
heads to state competition

Kaydee Free Paige Aydell Payton Blisard

	 Salado Eagles are second 
place in district 19-4A after 
beating Lampasas, Burnet 
and Leander Glenn in recent 
games. The Eagles are 6-2 in 
district and 12-10-1 on the 
year. 

		  R	 H	 E
BHS	 2	 5	 3
SHS	 12	 9	 2
	 Salado put the Mercy Rule 
in effect in a 12-2 win over 
the visiting Burnet Bulldogs 
on April 10. The Eagles had 
nine hits while the Bulldogs 
had five.
	 The Eagles scored seven 
runs in the first, Drew Dob-
bins led off the game by 
reaching on an error by the 
second baseman. He went 
to second on a wild pitch. 
Ryan Oakes walked. Belton 
Farr laid down a sacrifice 
bunt toward the pitcher but 
reached first on the throw. 
The bunt scored Dobbins 
and Oakes went to third. Ja-
cob Wilk doubled to score 
Oakes and move Farr to 
third. Kade Maedgen singled 

to score Garr and advance 
Wilk. Parker Seaton tripled 
to deep right scoring Wilk 
and Maedgen. Rustin Hale 
grounded into the infield and 
Seaton was caught trying to 
reach home. Hale scored on 
a double by McKinney, who 
scored on an error. 
	 Farr walked to lead off 
the bottom of the second. A 
single by Jacob Wilk moved 
him to third. He scored on a 
passed ball.
	 Farr scored again in the 
fourth. He hit a double to left 
and stole third. Jacob Wilk 
doubled to deep left to score 
Farr. Wilk advanced on a 
ground out and scored on a 
single by Seaton.
	 The Eagles added two 
more in the bottom of the 
fifth to end the game early. 
McKinney walked. An error 
put Parker Shelley at first and 
McKinney at second. An-
other walk loaded the bases. 
McKinney scored on a sac-
rifice fly by Oakes. Shelley 
stole home to end the game.

		  R	 H	 E
SHS	 9	 15	 1
LGHS	 0	 1	 0
	 Drew Dobbins struck out 
five Leander Glenn batters 
over a four inning appear-
ance on the mound April 7 to 
earn the win over the Griz-
zlies.
	 Three other pitchers came 
on the mound: Max Marin 
and Belton Farr both struck 
out two batters in their one-
inning appearances and 
Ryan Oakes struck out one 
in his one-inning stint on the 
mound.
	 Salado batters were busy, 
notching 15 hits for nine 
runs.
	 Jacob Wilk scored in the 
second inning after hitting 
a double. He advanced on a 
wild pitch and scored on a 
sacrifice fly by Kade Maed-
gen.
	 Salado added four runs 
in the third. Parker Shelly 
walked and  advanced on a 
passed ball. He went to third 
on a ground-out. With two 
See Baseball pg 3B

Baseball second in District
Jacob Wilk pitched six innings during a shut out game against Lampassas on April 4.  He 
allowed four hits and struck out 10 batters. photo by Ron LeGuin
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Stop by. We’d love to meet you.
815 North Stagecoach Road
Salado, Texas 76571
Phone: 254-947-8636
HorizonBankTexas.com

T E X A S - B A S E D .
I N D E P E N D E N T L Y  O W N E D .  
I N D I V I D U A L L Y  D E D I C A T E D .

The banking services your business calls for, 
from a bank you can call your neighbor.

Douglas B. Willingham, D.D.S.

(254) 947-5242
Main and Thomas Arnold Road

www.saladodentistry.com

Get Straighter, Whiter 
Teeth, Without Removing 

Healthy Tooth Structure

A 
Life-Changing 

Smile 
is in 

Your Future

LASTOVICA
Fine Jewelers, Inc.

“Known for Service” 
Prompt In-Store Jewelry Repairs 

Diamond Sales • Custom Casting • Diamond 
Appraisal • Watch Repair • Diamond Setting 

Jewelry Repair
1202 S 31st St. & Ave. L • Temple

773-5772

SALADO CLEANERS
Laundry • Dry Cleaning • Alterations

1209 N. Stagecoach
(Next to the Library)

254-947-7299

Wash & Fold
7 a.m. - 7 p.m. Mon - Fri • 7 a.m. - 3 p.m. Sat

WE BUY SCRAP GOLD & SILVER

Texas Coin Connection
108 E FM2410, Suite G  -  Harker Heights

Buy       Sell      Trade
Gold, Silver, Coins, Currency & Jewelry

(254) 699-2646
Locally Owned - Salado Resident

Animal Medical Salado
Full Service Vet Hospital        

saladovet.com

(254) 947-8800
Dr. Lindsay Quirk-Fultz                    Dr. Linda Quirk

A Healthy Pet
is a Happy Pet

Our Wellness and 
Vaccination Programs

will keep them 
that way

www.devereauxjewelers.com

Salado Area Republican 
Women are pleased to be 
able to again offer two $1000 
scholarships to Salado High 
School Senior ladies in good 
standing with a 2.5 GPA or 
better.  

Applications can be ob-
tained from counselor Anita 
Morales’ office and must 
be postmarked by April 28, 
2017.  

Information is also listed 
on the Salado ISD website. 
If you have any further ques-
tions, call Salado Area Re-
publican Women Scholarship 
Chair Charmaine Barker at 
(254) 290-3805.

SHS Scholarships 
offered by SARW

	 Congratulations again to 
the UIL Academic students 
and coaches for winning the 
4A Region III Championship 
this weekend out of approxi-
mately 50 high schools in our 
region.
Top Three Teams in Region:
First Place Sweepstakes – 
Salado (248 points)
Second place – Little Cypress 
(215 points)
Third place – Liberty Hill 
(130 points)
Individual Results:
Number Sense – first place 
team 
Second – Jeremy Cannon

Third – Trey Sheppard 
Sixth – Ryan Kyburz
Contributing Team Member 
– Caleb Chambliss
Calculator Applications – 
Second place team
Fourth – Charity Pryor
Sixth – Kristen Crouch
Seventh – Kate Kyburz
Eighth – Averie Piatt
Spelling - First place team 
First – Kayla Manning 
Second – Katie Kendall 
Fifth – Cassidy Brown
Contributing Team Member: 
Matt Stahnke
Current Events – Second 
place team (possible wild-
card team to state)
Third – Luke Miller 
Seventh – Nathaniel Sun-
shine 
Eighth – Kade Maedgen 
Contributing Team Member: 
Quade Brown
Headline Writing
Third – J.B. Stockton
Mathematics 
Fourth – Kayla Manning 
Sixth – Trey Sheppard
Speech – First place team
LD Debate
First – Hannah Wilson
Sixth – Josh Cannon 
Persuasive Speaking  
Second – Kamrie Rhoads
Sixth – Luke Miller
Informative Speaking 
Fourth – Hannah Wilson (al-
ternate to state)
Poetry Interpretation 
Second – Rayne Polkowski
Prose Interpretation 
Fourth – Courtney Evans (al-
ternate to state)
Fifth – Nathan Cahoon

UIL Academics wins 4A 
Region III Championship

Number Sense, first place team (from left): Trey Sheppard, Ryan Kyburz, Jeremy Cannon, 
Caleb Chambliss.

Current Events, second 
place team (possible wild-
card team to state) (from 
left): Quade Brown, Kade 
Maedgen, Luke Miller. Not 
pictured- Nathaniel Sun-
shine.

Spelling, first place team (from left): Matt Stahnke, Kayla Manning, Cassidy Brown, Katie 
Kendall.

Headline Writing- J.B. Stock-
ton

Speech, first place team (from left): Rayne Polkowski, Ka-
mrie Rhoads, Hannah Wilson.

Photos by 
Royce Wiggin
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Colorist
Hairstylist 

Jenny Wiggin Potter 

Keratin Treatments
Dreamcatchers Extensions

(254) 534-3169

Expressions  774-9751
3126 South 31st Street   across from HEB in Temple

	 Costas Loullis is the Dis-
trict 25-4A Most Valuable 
Player, Trey Sheppard is the 
Goalkeeper of the Year and 
Coach Michael Goos is the 
Coach of the Year in boys 
soccer. District 25-4A an-
nounced its All-District boys 
soccer team late last week 
and Salado had five players 
named to the First Team, five 
named to the Second Team 
and three received Honorable 
Mention.
	 Loullis, a junior  led the 
boys to a 22-3 record as Cen-
ter Forward for the Eagles. 
He scored 26 goals and gave 
four assists for a total of 56 

points.
	 Sheppard, also a junior, 
was the Goalkeeper MVP. He 
had 185 saves and recorded 
16 shut outs, a school record 
for the Salado Eagles soccer 
program.
	 Also named to the First 
Team All District were se-
niors Daniel Magadan and 
Camden LaCanne, both at-
tacking midfielders for the 
Eagles. 
	 Magadan scored 20 points 
for the Eagles in 2016-17, 
with seven goals and six as-
sists.
	 LaCanne scored 19 points, 
with seven goals and five as-

Boys Soccer takes All District honors

	 The #12 Salado Lady Ea-
gles are in second place in 
perhaps the toughest softball 
district in the state.
	 District 19-4A has three 
teams in the top 25 as of 
the latest Texas High School 
Girls Coaches Association 
(THSGCA) poll. Liberty 
Hill, with a 22-1-1 record is 
tops in the state. Salado is 
ranked #12 and Lampasas, 
which the Lady Eagles beat 
7-2 on April 4, is ranked #24.
	 Nearby District 20, which 
District 19-4A will pair off 
against in the first round of 
the playoffs, has two teams 
in the top 25: #10 La Grange 
and #14 Giddings.
	 District 17-4A, which 
boasts #2 Lorena and #11 
Robinson, is also part of Re-
gion III.	
		  R	 H	 E
SHS	 10	 13	 0
LGHS	 0	 5	 2
	 Jenna Calder threw out a 
runner trying to steal third 
base in the bottom of the 
sixth and Rebecca Dockray 
struck out a batter for the 
final two outs in the 10-0 
rout of the Leander Glenn 
Lady Grizzlies by the Salado 
Lady Eagles April 7 on the 
road.	
	 The Lady Eagles out hit 
the Lady Grizzles 13 to five. 
Dockray struck out five bat-
ters, allowed five hits and 
walked two. The defense al-
lowed no runner to get past 
second base.
	 Meanwhile, the Lady Ea-
gles scored four runs in the 
first, five in the fifth and 
put the final nail in the cof-
fin with a solo homerun by 
Christin Wilson in the top of 
the sixth.
	 Piper Randolph led off the 
game with a single and stole 
second base. A single by 
Dockray put runners at the 
corners and Calder slapped a 
two-run double into left. She 
stole third and scored on a 
passed ball to give the Lady 
Eagles a 3-0 lead before the 
first out of the game was re-
corded.
	 Marissa Gonzales hit a 
full-count pitch for a sin-
gle and went to second on a 
passed ball. With two outs, 
Bailey Tindell hit a single to 
center to score Gonzales.

	 Calder led off the fifth 
with her second double of the 
game. Wilson knocked her in 
on a single to center. A sin-
gle by Gonzales put runners 
on the corners and Gonzales 
stole second before a double 
by Brooke Miller scored both 
runners. Miller advanced on 
a ground out but was thrown 
out at home on a fielder’s 
choice that allowed Lindy 
Martin to get to first. An er-
ror by the left fielder allowed 
Abbie James to reach second 
and Martin to go to third.  
Both runners scored on a sin-
gle by Dockray.
		  R	 H	 E
LHS	 2	 5	 5
Salado	 7	 8	 2
	 Bailey Tindell allowed 
just five hits off of the Lam-
pasas Lady Badger bats and 
struck out three to notch a 
complete game win over the 
#24 team in state on April 4.
	 Salado led throughout the 
game, scoring two runs in 
the first, two in the third and 
three in the fifth.
	 In usual fashion, Pip-
er Randolph led off with a 
single for the Lady Eagles. 
She got to third on a well-

laid down bunt by Rebecca 
Dockray. An error by the 
first baseman allowed Ran-
dolph to score and Dockray 
to go to second. An error by 
the pitcher let Dockray go to 
third. She scored on a bunt by 
Christin Wilson. 
	 In the third, Jenna Calder 
led off with a walk. Christin 
Wilson hit a double. Maris-
sa Gonzales singled to score 
Calder and put runners at the 
corners. 
	 Elizabeth Ford hit into 
a double play, but Wilson 
scored on the play.
	 In the bottom of the fifth, 
Dockray was hit by the pitch-
er and Calder walked. Wil-
son singled and an error by 
the centerfielder allowed 
Dockray to turn third toward 
home. With runners at sec-
ond and third, Gonzales sin-
gled to score Calder. Regina 
Deen laid down a bunt, but an 
error on the catch by the first 
baseman allowed Wilson to 
score.
	 Wilson led the girls going 
3-for-3 with an RBI. Ran-
dolph and Gonzales both hit 
two singles, Gonzales had 
two RBI.

Eagle Softball second in District

Piper Randolph led off with a single against the Lampasas 
Lady Badgers in the April 4 victory. photo by Ron LeGuin

Baseball 
outs, Belton Farr singled to 
score the runner.  He stole 
second and scored on a sin-
gle by Wilk. Kade Maedgen 
singled and Rustin Hale hit 
a booming to right to score 
both runners.
	 Cullen McKinney led off 
the fourth with a double. Gar-
rett Knight singled to right to 
put runners at the corners. 
Drew Dobbins hit a sacrifice 
to centerfield to score McK-
inney. Ryan Oakes hit a sin-
gle to right to put runners at 
the corners.  Jackson Arren-
dondo grounded out to short, 
scoring a runner. Wilk sin-
gled to right to Oakes before 
the third out was recorded.
LHS	 0	 4	 6
SHS	 9	 5	 0
	 Salado Eagles shut out the 
Lampasas Badgers 9-0 in a 
home game April 4.
	 The Badgers got into scor-
ing position four times, but 

the Salado defense stymied 
Lampasas by leaving runners 
stranded or putting the run-
ner out trying to get home.
	 Salado scored two runs in 
the first, third and fifth in-
nings and three runs in the 
fourth.
	 Drew Dobbins and Ryan 
Oakes got on base with back 
to back walks in the first. 
Dobbins stole second and 
went to third on a passed ball 
before scoring on an error. 
Oakes went to second on a 
wild pitch and then to third 
on a single by Tate Harvey. 
He scored on a sacrifice fly 
by Jacob Wilk for a 2-0 lead.
	 In the third, Belton Farr 
and Harvey both walked. 
Farr stole second and ad-
vanced and scored on passed 
balls. Harvey scored on an 
error.
	 Dobbins singled with one 
out in the fourth. He stole 

sists.
	 Junior Brandon Rodriguez 
is the third underclassman to 
receive All District honors. 
He was a defensive mid-field-
er for the Eagles and scored 
seven points for the Eagles 
with two goals and three as-
sists.
	 Second Team members 
were seniors Ryan Cook and 
Sam Shearer,  juniors Ar-
mando Castillo and Kaden 
Smien and sophomore Caleb 
Chambliss.
	 Senior Luke Markham, 
junior Manuel Tonchez and 
sophomore Jack Spradlin all 
received Honorable Mention.

continued from 1B
second. Oakes walked and 
both runners advanced on a 
passed ball. An error allowed 
Harvey to go to first and 
Dobbins to score, but Oakes 
was tagged out trying to get 
home. Wilk knocked a tri-
ple to deep right scoring two 
runs and giving Salado a 7-0 
lead.
	 In the fifth, Kade Maed-
gen single to left. Parker Sea-
ton followed with a single to 
deep right. Cullen McKinney 
sacrificed to deep left, scor-
ing Maedgen. An error al-
lowed Rustin Hale to reach 
and Seaton to score.
	 Wilk pitched six innings, 
getting the win for Salado. 
He allowed four hits and 
struck out 10 batters. Max 
Marin closed the game, strik-
ing out one in his appearance 
on the mound.
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727 S. Main Street, Belton

Sh el l e ysautosal es . n et

T e x a s  F r i e n d ly
E a g l e  P r o u d

Ace
Pest and Lawn

Locally Owned and Operated 
Licensed by the Structural Pest Control Board TPCL #12512

Customer 
Satisfaction 
Guaranteed

Free Estimates 947-4222

Come learn & grow with us 

947-1153
6 weeks to 12 years

Christian Environment
TSR Certified Preschool

Age appropriate Curriculum
All ages Drop off & Pick up@Salado ISD

The
 Play Yard

15299 S IH 35  Salado

SALADO

Member 
FDIC

Go !  Eagles  Go!
We stand behind our home town teams

Tues - Fri  8 a.m. - 6 p.m.
Walk-Ins Accepted    Appointments Honored

The Haire Shop
Barber - Beauty - Body

213 Mill Creek Dr., Suite 160

Tammy  (254) 760-1990

860 N. Main 
254-947-5050

c21bb.com

Good Luck from your ‘Home’ Team

Now Accepting New Patients

Kevin DeLane
orthodontist

485 Thomas Arnold Road
saladoorthodontics.com
(254) 947-4011

Please call for an appointment (254) 947-3309
1325 N. Stagecoach Road

Your time is valuable! Save a trip and time. 

PHYSICAL THERAPY • SPEECH THERAPY • PELVIC HEALTH 
OCCUPATIONAL THERAPY  •  IN-HOME SKILLED NURSING 

Multiple Locations  |  www.IntegrityRehab.net  | 254.699.3933    

	 The Salado Lady Eagles 
won the Academy track meet 
last week while the Varsity 
Eagles placed second in their 
division.

Varsity Girls
	 Salado Varsity Girls won 
the Academy High School 
Relays April 6 scoring 111 
points. 	
	 High Jump: Lorna Fleet, 
second, 4’-10”.
	 400 Meter Dash: Taylor 
Rich, fourth, 1:06.22.
	 800 Meter Run: Brianna 
Washington, second, 2:21.71; 
Catalina Langlitz, fourth, 
2:39.38.
	 1600 Meter Run: Catalina 
Langlitz, sixth, 5:55.65.
	 100 Meter Hurdles: Sarah 
Kelarek, second, 16.82.
	 300 Meter Hurdles: Macy 
Trasher, first, 48.70.
	 400 Meter Relay: Kaia 
Philen, Piper Randolph, Re-
gina Deen, Sarah Kelarek, 
second, 50.93.
	 800 Meter Relay: Kaia 
Philen, Piper Randolph, Regi-
na Deen, Sarah Kelarek, first, 
1:48.40.
	 1600 Meter Relay: Brian-
na Washington, Macy Trash-
er, Regina Deen, Taylor Rich, 
third, 4:16.99.
	 Long Jump: Kaia Philen, 
fifth, 15’-8”; Elizabeth Ford, 
sixth, 15’-1 3/4”.
	 Discus: Brittney 
Vrooman, first, 111’-5”.
	 Triple Jump: Elizabeth 
Ford, third, 34’-9 1/2”; Ma-
riah Vaillancourt, sixth, 32’-2 
3/4”.

Varsity Boys
	 Salado Varsity Boys 
placed second in the Acade-
my High School Relays April 
6 scoring 109 points.
	 100 Meter Dash: Cade 
Depoy, sixth, 11.57.
	 200 Meter Dash: Garrett 
Knight, fourth. 24.08.
	 1600 Meter Run: Hunter 
Haas, third, 4:57.58.
	 3200 Meter Run: Hunter 
Haas, fourth, 10:52.45.
	 110 Meter Hurdles: Cutter 
Hudgens, first, 14.58; Holden 
Ford, second, 14.66.
	 300 Meter Hurdles: Cutter 
Hudgens, first, 41.24.
	 400 Meter Relay: Jake 
Elliott, Holden Ford, Cutter 
Hudgens, Justin Learn, first, 
43.06.
	 800 Meter Relay: Jake 
Elliott, Holden Ford, Justin 
Learn, Wade Woods, second, 
1:31.73.

	 1600 Meter Relay: Jake 
Elliott, Chase Harwell, Justin 
Learn, Wade Woods, second, 
3:32.32.
	 Shot Put: Zack Adams, 
fourth, 42’-1”.
	 Triple Jump: Holden Ford, 
first, 41’-2”.

JV Boys
	 Salado JV Boys won the 
Academy High School Relays 
April 6 scoring 142 points. 
	 400 Meter Dash: Clayton 
Zak, fourth, 57.59.
	 800 Meter Run: JB Stock-
ton, third, 2:19.38; Zane 
Frederickson, fourth, 2:19.93.
	 1600 Meter Run: Seth 
Neal, fourth, 5:31.51.
	 3200 Meter Run: Seth 
Neal, second, 11:55.65.
	 110 Meter Hurdles: Kyle 
Saunders, first, 17.50; Ryan 
Kyburz, third, 18.46.
	 300 Meter Hurdles: Sam-

mye Brown, second, 46.76; 
Ryan Kyburz, third, 47.74; 
Kyle Saunders, fifth, 48.12.
	 400 Meter Relay: Caleb 
Self, Clayton Zak, Jeb Sproul, 
Quade Brown, third, 46.59.
	 800 Meter Relay: Ca-
leb Self, Connor Cook, Jeb 
Sproul, Quade Brown, sec-
ond, 1:38.20.
	 1600 Meter Relay: Cade 
Scallin, Caleb Self, Clay-
ton Zak, Connor Cook, first, 
3:49.09.
	 Long Jump: Sammye 
Brown, fifth, 17’-7”.
	 Shot Put: Benjamin Sun-
shine, third, 37’-0”.
	 Discus: Juan Castillo, sec-
ond, 98’-9”; Cash Eddleman, 
third, 92’-7”.
	 Triple Jump: Jacob Wal-
rath, third, 35’-11”.
	 High Jump: Cade Scallin, 
second, 5’-6”.

JV Girls
	 Salado JV Girls placed 
fourth in the Academy High 
School Relays April 6, scor-
ing 79.5 points.
	 100 Meter Dash: Angela 
Sanders, first, 13.29; Lexie 
Lima, second. 13.36; Katelyn 
Seymour, sixth, 13.97.
	 200 Meter Dash: Natalie 
McBryde, first, 29.12.
	 400 Meter Dash: Natalie 
McBryde, fourth, 1:09.15.
	 100 Meter Hurdles: Bai-
ley Lomas, fourth. 19.49; Ra-
chel Luke, sixth, 19.91.
	 400 Meter Relay: Angela 
Sanders, Bailey Lomas, Kate-
lyn Seymour, Lexie Lima, 
first, 53.42.
	 800 Meter Relay: Angela 
Sanders, Bailey Lomas, Kate-
lyn Seymour, Lexie Lima, 
third, 1:59.02.
	 Triple Jump: Lexie Lima, 
first, 30’-6 1/4”.

Mariah Vaillancourt gets air in the triple jump, where she placed sixth in the Academy 
Track Meet last week. (Photo by Tim Fleischer)

Ladies win at Academy 

	 The Salado Spirit U15 
soccer club tied Giddings 
1-1 on March 25 then beat 
the NASA Dynamites 4-0 on 
April 1 and the East Austin 
Dragonflies 3-1 on April 8 in 
Salado Youth Soccer Associ-
ation matches.
	 Against the Dynamites, 
Ashley Voelter scored two 
goals while Lily Lougheed 
and Allison Carnahan each 
scored one.
	 The Salado Spirit beat 
the East Austin Dragonflies 
3-1 April 8.  Two goals were 
made by Ashley Voelter, and 
one by Aubrey Heffner.  
	 Selah Kurtz attacks the ball with a vengeance.       (Photo by Lee Lougheed)

Salado Spirit U15
girls winning
in youth soccer

Holly Wright denies an East Austin Dragonflies player an 
opportunity. (Photo by Lee Lougheed)

(Photo by Lee Lougheed) 
Grace Graham leaps into action for the Salado Spirit.
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THERANGERESTAURANT.COM

a fresh 
TAKE ON LUNCH

FRIDAYS        SATURDAYS
11:30 a.m.- 2:30 p.m.

at the range
101 MAIN salado

 254.947.3828

G

''

Salado Grown and Salado Made
Your Hometown Winery

841 N. Main St

Salado Grown and Salado Made
Your Hometown Winery

(254) 947-8011

BREAKFAST, 
LUNCH & DINNER

MON - SAT 7AM-9PM
SUN 7AM-10PM

  (254) 947-4663
301 THOMAS ARNOLD ROAD

 JOHNNYSSTEAKSANDBBQ.COM

SAT APRIL 15
JOHNNYSOUTBACK.COM

We Cater All Occasions!
WEDDINGS     REUNIONS    CORPORATE GATHERINGS

HAIL AND FAREWELLS     ANNIVERSARIES

CANTINA    OUTDOOR VENUE

theMustard Seed
B U T I K

APPAREL		&		GIFT
S

Join us on third Thursdays
10 a.m. - 5 p.m.                        Thursday • Friday • Saturday

642 North Main

5 - 8 p.m. on April 20

Shop&
Sip

Beer or Wine Tasting Daily $10
Live music every Friday & saturday

5 huge tvs

Sun -Thur Noon - 10 p.m. | Friday Noon - Midnight | Saturday Noon -1 a.m.

150 wines from 
around the world

50 + taps of Texas 
Craft Brews

401 s main on the corner of Royal and Main

	 Salado hosts the first an-
nual “Art Attack” April 28-
30 with a multitude of events 
featuring culinary, literary 
and musical venues
	 Activities and events will 
be held throughout the Vil-
lage with the fun beginning 
Friday night with the regu-
larly scheduled Fourth Fri-
day of the month Royal Art 
Walk (RAW -royalstreetart-
walk.com) 6-9 p.m. April 28.
	 Charlie Robison will be 
the headliner at Johnny’s 
Outback. Gates open at 6 
p.m. Tickets are available at 
johnnyssteaksandbbq.com.
	 A multitude of events 
are scheduled for Saturday, 
April 29.
 	 Playing on the military 
“attack” theme these two 
venues will send you on a 
public art reconnaissance 
mission to find the art check-
points.  You take a selfie for 
proof of your find and to win 
points for earning your ra-
tions.  
	 There will also be “Art-
ists in Action” in both loca-
tions to the likes of some 
very famous sculptors. Come 
find your inner artist with 
these interactive sessions. 
Kids can come too with their 
very own rations and fun.
	 Addressing the literary 
aspect, plan to attend the 
Salado Public Library’s spe-
cial screening of a New York 
Broadway play, “Act One” 
starring the television actor 
Tony Shalhoub and Andrea 
Martin at 10 a.m. April 29. 
Admission is free, but you 
must register attendance at 
salado.com
	 Tablerock Amphitheater 
also gets in on the weekend 
literary action with a “Story-
teller” themed extravaganza!  
Learn how to be a storyteller 
in two sessions of classes and 
then come to be entertained 

as you get to hear some tall 
tales and other entertaining 
stories from bonafide pro-
viders of this literary craft.
	 Session one of the Sto-
rytelling Class presented by 
professional stroytellers will 
be 9:30-noon April 29 at 
Tablerock. Session two will 
be 1:30-4 p.m. Cost is $20 
for adults and $10 for chil-
dren 12 and under.
	 Later in the evening, the 
Professional Tejas Story-
tellers will take the stage 
at Tablerock Amphitheater 
6:30 p.m. April 29. Enjoy a 
casual dinner of hamburgers, 
hot dogs, snacks and drinks 

at Tablerock Concessions 
and then from 7–9 p.m. lis-
ten to these talented artists. 
Tickets are $10 for adults and 
$5 for children 12 and under.
	 Tablerock also hosts Live 
Oral Review (LOR). Time to 
record for time immemorial 
yours, a family member, a 
friend’s etc.  life story!  Pro-
fessional Productionist, Joe 
Pehoski, has created this sys-
tem that can evoke memories 
that capture the essence and 
values of life.  Interview ses-
sions are 1.5 hours long and 
begin with earliest memories 
and continues into adulthood 
capturing all kinds of mo-

ments.  Only three sessions 
will be held for one individ-
ual per session.  Two CD’s 
are created ---one unedited 
and one edited. There will 
be three sessions available 
for one person per session at 
$150 each. Times are 8:30-
10 a.m., 10:30 a.m.-noon and 
1:30-3 p.m.
	 Sign up to be in a Salado 
commercial being filmed 
downtown at 11 a.m. April 
29. Register at salado.com.
	 Covering the musical as-
pect of “Art Attack” will be 
The Texas Fingerstyle Gui-
tar Association providing 
an afternoon concert from 
nationally known guitar-
ist, humorist, storyteller and 
finger picking champion 
Shane Adkins. The concert 
will be 1:30-3 p.m. April 29 
at the Salado Museum, 423 
S. Main St. Tickets are $20 
for adults and $10 for stu-
dents. This concert is part of 
the Texas Fingerstyle Guitar 
Association weekend gather-
ing at the Salado Museum & 
College Park 9 a.m.-7 p.m. 
April 29 and 9 a.m.-4 p.m. 
April 30.  The public is wel-
come to attend any part of 
the weekend meeting event.    
	 Art, Art, Art! – The Sal-
ado Gallery Trail will give 
you the opportunity to meet 
and interact with local art-
ists at Salado’s finest art 
galleries. Resident and spe-
cial invited artists who show 
nationally and internationaly 
will be actively working and 
interacting with guest.  Sa-
vory snacks will be provided 
for your enjoyment. Purchase 
tickets online then pick up 
your Passport for the Trail 
at the Salado Visitor Center.  
Tickets are $39.95 for adults 
21 and over.

Art Attack weekend April 28 - 30

Shane Adkins will perform April 29 at the Salado Museum 
as part of the Texas Fingerstyle Guitar Association gather-
ing in Salado during Art Attack weekend. 

Salado Museum names new Curator
intern and projects assis-
tant here at the museum last 
year during the early stages 
of our current revitalization 
program,” says Bill Kinni-
son, SMCP president. “The 
program includes a facelift 
for our 100-year-old build-
ing, an upgrade of the ex-
hibits and an expansion of 
museum programs. 

Calcote will join support-
ers of the museum in our 
ongoing effort to create ex-
hibits and host events that 
highlight the rich heritage 
and history of Salado.” 

The Board of Directors of 
the Salado Museum and Col-
lege Park (SMCP) has named 
Madeleine Calcote as Execu-
tive Director/Curator for the 
historic museum effective 
May 2. 

Calcote holds a Bachelor’s 
degree in Art History with 
a focus in Museum Stud-
ies from Millsaps College 
in Jackson, Mississippi, and 
will graduate from Baylor 
University in Waco, Texas, 
this May with a Master’s de-
gree in Museum Studies. 

“Calcote worked as an 
Recently, she completed a 

large collections project at 
the Dr. Pepper Museum and 
Free Enterprise Institute in 
Waco, processing and acces-
sioning over 500 objects in a 
12-week period. 

The Salado Museum and 
College Park, a 501(c)(3) 
non-profit organization, was 
formed in January 2017 with 
the merger of the historic 
Central Texas Area Museum 
(est. 1959) and the Robert-
son Colony-Salado College 
Foundation (est. 1973). The 
mission of the newly formed 
organization is to promote 
and preserve the pioneer his-
tory of Salado, through edu-
cational programs and the 
exhibition of artifacts, books 
and papers that document 
the settlement and heritage 
of this area. 

The Museum is located 
at 423 South Main Street 
in Salado across from the 
Stagecoach Inn. College 
Park is just south of the mu-
seum. www.saladoscottish-
festival.com.  

Madeleine Calcote, Cura-
tor for Salado Museum and 
College Park.
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Village of Salado Calendar of Events
April 13
	 Salado Band Boosters 
program fundraiser, 5 - 8 
p.m. at Freddy’s Steak-
burgers in Harker Heights. 
April 13
	 Ribbon Cutting, 6 p.m. 
at Pretty Planks, 3883 
Royal Street.
April 13
	 Pint Night, 6 p.m. - 
Midnight  at Chupacabra 
Craft Beer & Salado Lone 
Star Winery info: (512) 
576-0123
April 14 - 17
	 No Salado ISD classes
April 14
	 Fire Street Pizza Food 
Truck at Barrow Brewing 
Co.
April 15
	 Community Easter 
Egg Hunt, 3:30 - 5 p.m. at 
Salado United Methodist 
Church. Bring a nonper-
ishable food item for the 
Salado Food Pantry
April 15
	 Central Texas Astro-
nomical Society Star Party, 
8 - 11 p.m. at Overlook 
Park, 3740 FM 1670. info: 
centexastronomy.org
April 16
	 Community Sunrise 
Easter Service, 7 a.m. at 
Pace Park

April 18
	 Informal Q&A for 
Private Kindergarten and 
First Grade Classes, 6 - 7 
p.m. at Kids’ Zone Learn-
ing Center, 104 Copper 
Lane, Jarrell. speaker: 
McKenzie Teer, Teacher. 
info: (512) 746-2333
April 18
	 Salado Aldermen Can-
didate Forum, 6:30 p.m. at 
Salado Civic Center
April 20
	 Salado High School 
Choir program fundraiser, 
5 - 8 p.m. at Freddy’s 
Steakburgers in Harker 
Heights. 
April 20
	 Sip and Shop, 5 - 8 p.m. 
at The Mustard Seed, 642 
North Main
April 20
	 Salado Area Republican 
Women, 6 p.m. at the Si-
rena Room of Tenroc. info: 
Jonas Miller, Chief of Staff 
for U.S. Congressman, 
John Carter
April 20
	 Village of Salado Board 
of Aldermen Workshop 
Session, 6 p.m. at Municipal 
Building

April 20
	 The Priest’s Pint, 6:30 - 
8 p.m. at Barrow Brewing 
Co. Featuring: Matthew 
Stattler

April 21
	 Over the Plate food 
truck at Barrow Brewing 
Co. 
April 22
	 Salado Earth Day 5K 
Troll Trot and Trash-Off, 8 
a.m. - 2 p.m. at College Hill 
Park on Main Street and 
College Hill Road. Signup 
at runsignup.com
April 22
	 Asanas & Ales Yoga 
with Tiffany S. Humphrey, 
10 - 11:30 a.m. 
April 22 
	 Spring Flower Pots 
Class, 10:30 a.m. at Stamp 
Salado. info: (254) 947-
8848
April 22 
	 E “Z”- Folding Spring 
Cards Class, 1:30 p.m. at 
Stamp Salado. info: (254) 
947-8848
April 24
	 Pre K and Kindergarten 
Round–up, 8:30 a.m. - 2:30 
p.m. at Thomas Arnold 
Elementary Media Room. 
info: (254) 947-6925
April 24
	 Salado 7 on 7 League 
Football games, 5 - 6 grade 
teams: 6 p.m. – 7 p.m. and 
7 - 8 grade teams: 7 p.m. – 
8 p.m. at Eagle Stadium
April 24
	 Salado ISD School 
Board Meeting, 6 p.m. at 
Salado Civic Center. 
April 24 - May 2 
	 Early voting by person-
al appearance in the May 
6 election at Salado Civic 
Center. 
April 27
	 Salado Junior High Soc-
cer program fundraiser, 5 - 
8 p.m. at Freddy’s Steak-
burgers in Harker Heights 
April 27
	 Networking After 
Hours, 5:30 p.m. at Inn 
at Salado. Sponsored by 
Salado Chamber of Com-
merce

Salado United Methodist Church hosts the Salado Community Easter Egg Hunt on April 
15. Bring a nonperishable food item to donate to the Salado Food Pantry to the event 
held 3:30 - 5 p.m. on Saturday. 

April 27
	 Pint Night with RAHR 
Brewery, 6 p.m. - Midnight 
at Chupacabra Craft Beer 
& Salado Lone Star Win-
ery  info (512) 576-0123
April 28
	 Royal Street Art Walk 
(RAW), 6 - 9 p.m. along 
Royal Street, info: royal-
streetartwalk.com
Weekends 
April 28 - May 13 
	 Blow Your Own Beer 
Mug at Salado Glassworks. 
reservations at saladoglass-
works.com
April 28 - 30
	 Art Attack info: salado.
com
April 29
	 Community Yard Sale 
and New2U Inventory Re-
duction Sale, 7 a.m. at JD’s 
Travel Center, 15881 South 
IH 35. info: James (254) 
947-5228
April 29
	 Sustaining Earth Every 
Day (S.E.E.D.) Fest, 10 - 
5 p.m. at The Unitarian 
Universalist Fellowship of 
Bell County, 1726 Morgans 
Point Road, Morgans Point 
Texas.
April 29 
	 Iris Folding Trio Class, 
10:30 a.m. at Stamp Sala-
do. info: (254) 947-8848 
April 29 
	 Frayed Quilting Cards 
Class, 2 p.m. at Stamp 
Salado. info: (254) 947-
8848 
April 30
	 Kite Fest Salado, 1 - 4 
p.m. at the Chapel at 
Caliber Oak, 5235 Royal 
Street. info: (254) 718-0680
April 30
	 Salado Masonic Lodge 
Stated Meeting, 7:30 p.m.
May 1
	 Adult Crafts, 2 - 4 p.m. 
at Salado Public Library. 
register at 947-9191
May 1
	 Salado 7 on 7 League 
Football games, 5 - 6 grade 
teams: 6 p.m. – 7 p.m. and 
7 - 8 grade teams: 7 p.m. – 
8 p.m. at Eagle Stadium
May 4
	 Local Authors Recep-
tion, 5:30 - 7:30 p.m. at 
Salado Public Library
May 4
	 Village of Salado Board 
of Aldermen meeting, 6 
p.m. at Municipal Building

May 5 - 6
	 Tablerock Gospel Fes-
tival, Saturday 6 - 9 p.m. 
and Sunday 10 a.m. - 9 
p.m., adults $5 under 12 
$3. info: (254) 634-4658
May 6
	 Polls open, 7 a.m. - 7 
p.m. at Salado Church of 
Christ Activity Center
May 6
	 Historic Salado Ghost-
walk info: saladoghost-
walk.com
May 8

	 Salado 7 on 7 League 
Football games, 5 - 6 grade 
teams: 6 p.m. – 7 p.m. and 
7 - 8 grade teams: 7 p.m. – 
8 p.m. at Eagle Stadium
May 8
	 Salado Masonic Lodge 
Stated Meeting, 7:30 p.m.
May 11
	 American Business 
Women of America Style 
Show and Benefit Lun-
cheon, 11 a.m. at The 
Venue. info: barclaymc-
cort@gmail.com
May 11
	 Pint Night with Deep El-
lum Brewery, 6 p.m. - Mid-
night at Chupacabra Craft 
Beer & Salado Lone Star 
Winery info (512) 576-0123
May 13
	 Salado Lions Club 
Pancake Breakfast, 7:30 - 
10 a.m., at the Church of 
Christ Activity Center
May 13 - 14
	 Salado Market Days, 9 
a.m.-5 p.m. at Salado An-
tique Mall, 721 Stagecoach 

Road. info: (254) 947-3355

May 13
	 UIL Academic Recep-
tion, 5 p.m. at Salado High 
School Cafeteria 
May 15
	 Salado 8th grade Grad-
uation, 6 p.m. at Salado 
Intermediate School
May 15
	 Salado 7 on 7 League 
Football games, 5 - 6 grade 
teams: 6 p.m. – 7 p.m. and 
7 - 8 grade teams: 7 p.m. – 
8 p.m. at Eagle Stadium
May 15 - 19
	 Glass and Gold Group-
ies at Glass River Designs. 
Prerequisite: Glass and 
Gold Class. info: (254) 947-
0002
May 16
	 Salado High School Art 
Show,  5 - 6 p.m. at SHS 
Cafeteria 
May 16
	 Senior Awards Night, 6 
p.m. at Salado High School 
Cafeteria

Live Music
in Salado

Friday
	 Smoken Maxx Carter, 
7 - 11 p.m. at Chupacabra 
Craft Beer & Salado Lone 
Star Winery

Saturday
	 Eli Young Band, 6 - 11 
p.m. at Johnny’s Outback.
Tickets: $15 in advance / 
$20 the day of the show 
	 Paul Cox at The Range 
at The Barton House
	 Blessed Union of Blues, 
7 - 9 p.m. at Barrow Brew-
ing Co. Check Point Ger-
many Food Truck on site. 
	 Dan Johnson, 8 p.m.  to 
Midnight at Chupacabra 
Craft Beer & Salado Lone 
Star Winery

April 21
	 Steve Hamende, 7 p.m. - 
11 p.m. at Chupacabra Craft 
Beer & Salado Lone Star 
Winery

April 22
	 The Deep End, 7 - 9 p.m. 
at Barrow Brewing Co. Ko-
rean Kravings food truck 
on site
	 Free Live Music, 8 p.m. 
- Midnight at Chupacabra 
Craft Beer & Salado Lone 
Star Winery 

Live Music Venues:
Barrow Brewing Co. barrowbrewing.com
Chupacabra Craft Beer & Salado Lone Star Winery
chupacabratxcraftbeer.com
Johnny’s Outback johnnysoutback.com
The Range at the Barton Housetherangerestaurant.com

Blessed Union of Blues will perform April 15 at Barrow 
Brewing Co. 

send your 
music event listings to

 news@saladovillagevoice.com
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254.947.5321
213 Mill Creek Dr., Suite #125

  

Community Yard Sale
JD's Travel Center

7 a.m. April 29

15881 South IH 35 
Take I35 Exit South 283 or North 282

 NEW 2 U 
INVENTORY REDUCTION SALE 

Set-up begins at 6 a.m. on April 29
Tables not provided

Speak with James for more details (254) 947-5228
Management reserves the right to refuse 

any item(s) being sold that are inappropriate
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Mondays
	 Children’s Story and 
Craft Time, 11 a.m. at 
Salado Public Library. info: 
(254) 947-9191	
	 Classified advertising 
deadline for Salado Village 
Voice, noon. info: classi-
fides@saladovillagevoice.
com	
Salado Village Artists 
Stitchers and Knitters, 2 
p.m. at Salado Village Art-
ists Building.
	 Salado Masonic Lodge, 
Floor practice is  6:30 p.m. 
at the Lodge every Mon-
day except Stated Meeting. 
Stated meeting is 7:30 p.m. 
Monday on or before Full 
Moon.

First Monday
	 Salado First Monday 
Gardeners, 8 a.m. at the 
Visitor Center.
	 Monday Club, 2 p.m. 
at Salado United Method-
ist Church Youth Activities 
Center
	 Salado Historical Soci-
ety board meeting, 6 p.m. 
at Salado Public Library.	
Second Monday
	 Second Monday Book 
Club at Salado Winery, 7 - 9 
p.m.
	 Public Arts League of 
Salado open board meeting, 
5 p.m. at the Visitor’s Center 
on Main Street.
	 Salado FFA Meeting, 6 
p.m. at Salado High School 
AG building Sept. - May.
	 Salado Youth Fair 
Booster Club meeting, after 
the FFA meeting at Salado 
High School AG building. 
Info: SYFBClub@gmail.
com
	 Salado Athletic Boost-
ers Club meeting, 7 p.m. at 
the High School Library. (no 
July meeting)

Third Monday
	 Salado United Method-
ist Women, 5:45 p.m. at 
Salado United Methodist 
Church Room 117
	 Salado Democrats, 7 
p.m. at Salado Public Li-
brary

Fourth Monday
	 Salado Public Library 
Board of Trustees Meet-
ing, 5 p.m. at the library

Tuesdays
	 Salado Village Artists, 
Village Art Building, 9 a.m., 
Bring your artwork third 
Tuesday will be set up for 
still life. 
	 Adult game day at Pres-
byterian Church of Salado, 
10 a.m.
	 Sit and Knit, 10 a.m. 
- noon at Salado Public 
Library. info: (254) 947-9191
	 Salado Rotary Club, 
11:30 a.m. at Johnny’s 
Steaks and Barbecue first 
three Tuesdays of month; 
Roving Social after hours  
on fourth Tuesday of 
month.
	 Tex Mex Tuesday at 
Alexander’s Distillery (254) 
947-5554
	 Prix Fixe at The Range, 
5 p.m.- close. $14.95 for 
entree, dessert, drink.
	 Salado Community 
Chorus practice, 6 p.m., 
Salado Civic Center, Febru-
ary - April info: (254) 541-
7824 or saladochorus.com

	 Team Roping Practice, 
6:30 p.m. at 3C Cowboy 
Fellowship Arena. Call 
before you haul 947-7214

First Tuesday
	 Salado Village Artists 
Board Meeting, 9 a.m. at 
the Village Art Building. 
Followed by General Meet-
ing at 10:30 a.m.
	 Salado 4-H Club meet-
ing, 6 p.m. at Salado In-
termediate Cafeteria, Sept. 
- May.

Third Tuesday
	 Bell County Genea-
logical Society Meeting, 
6:30 p.m. at Temple Public 
Library.
	 Bunco, 6:30 p.m. at 
Salado Lone Star Winery 
and Chupacabra Craft Beer

Fourth Tuesday
	 Night of Ministry, 7 
p.m. at 3C Cowboy Fellow-
ship

Wednesdays
	 IN.FORM course, 5 
p.m. at Angelic Herbs. Info: 
(254) 947-1909
	 Wine Wednesday at 
Alexander’s Distillery (254) 
947-5554

Second Wednesday
	 Salado Lions Club, 
11:30 a.m., Salado Civic 
Center.

Third Wednesday
	 Mah Jongg at Salado 
Public Library, 10 a.m.-2 
p.m. 

Fourth Wednesday
	 Salado Lions Club, 
11:30 a.m., Salado Civic 
Center.

Thursdays
	 Salado Aldermen meet-
ing, 6:30 p.m., Municipal 
building, 301 N. Stagecoach 
Rd. Meeting is open to 
the public. First and third 
Thursday are regular meet-
ings and second and fourth 
Thursday are workshop 
meetings.

First Thursday
	 Chisholm Trail Ameri-
can Business Woman’s As-
sociation meeting, 6 p.m. at 
First Presbyterian Church of 
Salado.
	 Village of Salado Board 
of Aldermen meeting, 6 
p.m. at Municipal Building

Regular Events in the Village of Salado 
Second Thursday
	 Salado Ladies Auxil-
iary Meeting, 9 a.m. at the 
Salado United Methodist 
Church Youth Activities 
Center.
	 Barrel Racing, 6:30 p.m. 
at 3C Cowboy Fellowship 
Arena. Call before you haul 
947-7214

Third Thursday
	 Salado Chamber of 
Commerce Board Meet-
ing, 8:30 a.m. at the Visitors 
Center.
	 Village of Salado Board 
of Aldermen Workshop 
Session, 6 p.m. at Municipal 
Building

Fridays
	 Pop in for a pastry, 8:30 
- 9:30 a.m. at First Commu-
nity Title. 
	 Display advertising 
deadline for Salado Village 
Voice, noon. info: advertis-
ing@saladovillagevoice.com
	 Hecho En Queso food 
truck, 4-10 p.m. at Bar-
row Brewing Co. on Royal 
Street. info: barrowbrewing.
com
	 Friday Night Special at 
Mill Creek Country Club 
Bar and Grill. Menu changes 
every week. Call 947-5698.
	 Live music at Chupaca-
bra Craft Beer and Salado 
Lone Star Winery
Fourth Friday
	 Fourth Friday Gospel 
Singing, 7 p.m. at First Ce-
dar Valley Baptist Church 
on FM 2843. Pot luck to 
follow, bring a favorite dish 
or dessert.

Saturdays
	 Studio Time for Salado 
Village Artists members, 
10 a.m. info: saladovil-
lageartists.com
	 Live music in The 
Lounge, upstairs at The 
Range Restaurant on Main 
St., 7 p.m. Artists change 
weekly. Check website for 
details. 

	 Live music at Chupaca-
bra Craft Beer and Salado 
Lone Star Winery
First and Third Saturday
	 Trudy’s Closet, 8 a.m. at 
Grace Baptist Church

Second Saturday
	 Asanas and Ales, 9:30 - 
11 a.m. at Barrow Brewing 
Company
Sundays
	 Sunday Brunch, 10:30 
a.m. - 2 p.m. at Alexanders 
Distillery on Center Circle
	 Open discussion Al-
Anon Meeting, 6 p.m. 
Salado United Methodist 
Church Youth Activities 
Center.

Second Weekends
	 Salado Market Days, 9 
a.m.-5 p.m. at Salado An-
tique Mall, 721 Stagecoach 
Road. Salado’s original Mar-
ket Days event. info: (254) 
947-3355.

(254) 727-5700          #hechoenqueso 

Homemade Mexican Fusion
Available for events & catering

Every Friday 4-10 p.m. 
at Barrow Brewing Co on Royal Street

Follow us on Facebook & Instagram for our current location

MUD PIES 
POTTERY

HAND THROWN POTTERY 
ONE PIECE AT A TIME 

Handmade 
Pottery,

Homemade 
Fudge 

OVER 50 FLAVORS
including Sucrose free 

Gluten Free

Closed Mondays

18 N. Main Salado 

947-0281 

The Salado Chamber will host an Alderman Candidate forum at 6:30 p.m. on April 18 at 
the Salado Civic Center. 

42 Dealers

Dee’s Antique Mall
(254) 947-3775 702 N Main Street 

FURNITURE
GLASSWARE     KEEPSAKES

SUN & WED Noon - 5  
THURS - FRI 10 - 5 | SAT 10 - 6 

CLOSED MON & TUES

SOFI’S
at the Stagecoach

401 S. Main      (254) 947-4336

FLAX clothing
Fly London Shoes

Vintage Vinyls

OPEN TO THE PUBLIC 
 Practice Facility                    Memberships Available 

millcreek-golf.com       
(254) 947-5698

18 unforgettable holes of Golf designed by Robert Trent Jones, Jr. Book Your Tee Time Today

Open for Breakfast 7 a.m. Daily
Mill Creek Country Club Bar & Grill 

open to the public 7 a.m. - 7 p.m. 
Dine In  or  Carry Out

Magnolias 
of Salado

#1 Salado Square | Main Street  
254-947-0323 | magnoliasofsalado.com

OLD FASHIONED BURGERS
                    and ICE-CREAM

882 North Main Street

 facebook.com/burgersICEcream
plus.google.com/+OldFashionedBurgersandicecreamSalado

(254) 947-5271

$1 off any burger or 
sandwich combo 

with this ad

TRY OUR NEW MENU

PizzaPlaceSalado.com

230 North Main Street
Open Daily 11 am

The Pizza Place

Handcrafted Pizza and Sandwiches
Baked Pasta Dishes | Wings

Hand Dipped Blue Bell Ice Cream
All You Can Eat Salad Bar

 Pickup   •   Dine-in  •  Delivery

Open at Lunch
no minimum orders
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Shopping Map of Salado

7

#	 Business Name	 Type
3	 Wildfire Ranch Arena	 V
4	 St. Stephen Catholic Church	 C
6	 Salado College Park	 V
7	 Raney & Associates	 $
8	 Stagecoach Inn	 D
9	 Salado Museum	 V
10	 Sofi’s	 S
12	 Chupacabra and 	 D
	 Salado Lone Star Winery	 D
14	 Salado Glassworks	 A
17	 Barrow Brewery	 D
	 Hecho en Queso Food Truck Fri.	 D
20	 Springhouse 	 S
21	 The Venue                   	 V
22	 The Shed 	 D
24	 Tablerock	 V
26	 Salado United Methodist Church	 C
29	 Alexander’s	 D
29	 Inn on the Creek	 L
30	 First Baptist Church	 C
32	 First Texas Brokerage	 $
33	 First State Bank	 $
34	 First Community Title	 $
	 Farmer’s Insurance	 $
	   Zbranek Agency
40	 W.A. Pace Memorial Park 	 V
46	 The 1860s Shop	 S	
47	 Timeless	 S
48	 The Inn at Salado	 L
49	 Lively Coffeehouse & Bistro	 D
49	 Magnolias	 S
50	 The Range at the Barton House	 D
	 Linda Roundtree Pritchard Egg	 $
	      massage therapist
55	 Salado Family Dentistry	 $
57	 Mud Pies	 S
58	 The Shoppes on Main #1	 S
60	 Salado Creek Jewelry	 S
62	 The Pizza Place	 D
	 The Shade Shop	 S
65	 ERA Colonial Real Estate	 $
73	 Crain Chiropractic & Wellness	 $
75	 Angelic Herbs	 S
	 Bruce Bolick, CPA	 $
76	 Salado Civic Center	 $
78	 The Mustard Seed	 S
79	 Salado Chamber/Tourism Bureau	 $
81	 Salado Wine Seller and	 D
	 Salado Winery Co.
82	 St. Joseph’s Episcopal Church	 C
85	 Dee’s Antique Mall	 S
85	 Salado Post Office	 $
86	 Bill Bartlett – Century 21	 $
86	 Subway	 D
	 Old Fashioned Burgers 	 D 
87	 The Personal Wealth Coach	 $          
89	 Stamp Salado	 S
90	 Presbyterian Church of Salado	 C
91	 Troy Smith Financial Services	 $
92	 Salado Sculpture Garden	 A
96	 Salado Village Voice	 $
	 Ace Pest Control	 $
	 Montieth Abstract & Title	 $
	 The Haire Shop	 $
	 Integrity Rehab	 $
	 Mill Creek Cleaners	 $
97	 Brookshire Brothers	 S
100	Salado Public Library	 C
101	 Salado Cleaners	 $
102	 Hairitage Barber Shop	 $
113	 Salado Church of Christ	 C
118	 Salado Market Days	 S
119	 Salado Antique Mall       	 S
120	 Horizon Bank	 $
129	 Cowboy’s Barbecue	 D
130	 Village Spirits	 S
132	 Broecker Funeral Home	 $
133	 Johnny’s Steaks and BBQ	 D
135	 Embrace Smiles	 $
136	 Salado Schools & Stadium	 C
139	 Cedar Valley Baptist Church	 C

Not Shown on the Shopping Map
Animal Medical	 $
JD’s Travel Center	 D
The Play Yard Preschool	 $
Don Ringer	 $
Garlyn Shelton	 $
3C Cowboy Fellowship 	 C
Coleman Auto Restoration	 $
Walt Tollefson Computer Repair	 $
Finney Insurance	 S
Grace Baptist Church	 C
Mill Creek Country Club	 D/V Historical Markers in Salado

6.	 Salado Historic College Hill
8.	 Shady Villa Hotel (Stagecoach Inn)
8.	 Main Street Bridge
16.	 Barber-Berry Mercantile
23.	 The Baines House
24.	 Historic Dipping Vats
25.	 The A.J. Rose Mansion
26.	 Old Methodist Chapel

Shopping Map 
of historic Salado

N
orth

Residential

27. 	 Caskey-Hendricks House
28.  	Dr. McKie Place (Twelve Oaks)
29.	 Alexander’s Distillery
30.	 First Baptist Church
31.	 The Tyler House
35.	 Salado Masonic Lodge #296
45. 	 The Anderson House 
46	 Old Saloon
48.	 The Norton-Orgain House

50. 	 The Barton House
51.	 The Levi Tenney House
55. 	 The Armstrong Adams House
61. 	 Historic Lenticular Bridge
49.	 The Vickrey House
76.	 Boles-Aiken & Denman Cabins
77.	 The Robert B. Halley House
79.	 The Reed Cabin
100.	The Josiah Fowler House

Map Legend
S	 Shopping
A	 Art and Galleries
L	 Lodging
D	 Dining and Drinks
V	 Venues & Sights
$	 Services
C	 Churches and Education
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	 In the play of many deals, 
the winning action is found only 
because of a fear that certain 
key cards might be unfavorably 
located. At times, however, this 
feat should assert itself during 
the bidding of a hand, before 
the play has even begun! For 
example, take this case where 
South wound up in six spades 
after the sequence shown.
	 West led a diamond, and 
the slam went down the drain 
when East took the first two 
tricks with the A-Q of dia-
monds. Undeniably, it was bad 
luck to lose the slam because 
West found the killing suit to 
lead and East held the ace and 

Contract
Bridge
By Steve Becker

queen. Even so, the fact remains 
that North was remiss during 
the bidding when he chose to 
bid six spades instead of six 
notrump, which was ice-cold 
against any lead.

	 North should have reasoned 
that, if South had the seven 
spade tricks he was likely to 
have for his vulnerable four-
spade bid, 12 tricks were cer-
tain -- provided the defense 
did not take the first two dia-
mond tricks. This should have 
convinced North -- after using 
Blackwood and learning that 
South had only one ace -- that 
the slam would be far safer if 
East was the opening leader 
instead of West.
	 It might seem odd for a 
player to prefer six notrump 
as his final contract when he 
knows that he and his partner 
have at least a 10-card trump 
suit to lean on. But prudence, 
common sense and the safety 
factor all dictate that North 
should be declarer, and that 
thought should take precedence 
over everything else.
	 (c) 2017 King Features 
Synd., Inc.

Prudence and common sense

1. METALS: What alloy is cre-
ated by mixing copper and zinc?
2. MATH: What is an obelus in 
mathematical formulas?
3. THEATER: What long-
running play featured the song 
“Luck Be a Lady”?
4. ACRONYMS: What does 
LED stand for?
5. ANATOMY: What is a more 
common name for the hallux? 
6. GEOGRAPHY: In what 
country is Port Said located?
7. FASHION: What is a more 
common name for “frogs” on 
military-type jackets?

If you enjoy 
the Puzzle 

page,
 try our inter-
active cross-

word and 
sudoku puz-

zles online at:
saladovillage-

voice.com

8. LANGUAGE: What is the 
name for the type of marriage 
where a woman has more than 
one husband?
9. HISTORY: How many sol-
diers were in an Imperial 
Roman legion?
10. GENERAL KNOWL-
EDGE: In what country did the 
dance called the tango develop?

Answers

1. Brass
2. Division sign
3. “Guys and Dolls”
4. Light-emitting diode
5. Big toe
6. Egypt
7. Braided fasteners
8. Polyandry
9. 5,000
10. Argentina

(c) 2017 King Features Synd., 
Inc.
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Wild About Texas
Michael Price

Birdwatching is a great way to enjoy the outdoors. 

Birdwatching 101
Generally speaking, most 

people have a hobby or two 
in which they enjoy partici-
pating in aside from their 
daily routines. For some it 
may be playing or just watch-
ing sports, for others it may 
be something like stamp 
collecting or coin collect-
ing, and for others it may be 
fishing or hiking. There is a 
hobby that has really taken 
hold in the United States 
over the past several decades 
and that is birdwatching, or 
birding for short. 

	It has been estimated 
that more than sixty million 
people in the United States 
participate in birding annu-
ally. And this great state 
of ours is a prime area to 
birdwatch due to favorable 
weather conditions, as well 
as geographical placement. 

	As I begin to generalize 
a short overview about this 
hobby, let me just say that 
the space allotted for this 
column is not nearly enough 
to cover the hows, the whats, 
the whens, the wheres and 
the whys of birding. It is 
meant to literally be an over-
view of a tremendous oppor-
tunity to get outdoors.

	If one is interested in 
birding, there are several 
items that can be considered 
to be necessities to obtain 
before beginning. The first 
is a good bird identification 
book. There are several qual-
ity books to choose from, 

and making that selection 
depends largely on how seri-
ous you see yourself partici-
pating in the hobby. One of 
my favorites is the Birds of 
Texas by Fred J. Alsop III. 
This is one of several field 
guides by the Smithson-
ian Handbook series. The 
next item to obtain would 
be a good set of binoculars. 
These are needed for those 
hard-to-see species that are 
too small or too far away to 
make a positive ID. Another 
item would be a good digital 
camera. A few years ago, a 
digital DSLR with a large 
telephoto lens was the way 
to go. Now, there are sev-
eral point and shoot cam-
eras that have up to twelve 
times zoom capabilities, as 
well as several megapixels, 
available for a third of what 
a single DSLR telephoto lens 
costs. Digital cameras are 
really good to use in the field 
as they allow you to photo 
a bird, then zoom in for a 
closer look to aid in the iden-
tification. 

	When in the field bird-
watching, there are several 
questions to ask and answer 
about a bird’s body to assist 
with making a positive iden-
tification. First impressions 

THURS - SAT 10 - 5 SUN 12 - 5 MON 10 - 5
CLOSED TUES & WED       947-3355

751 Stagecoach Road  I-35 frontage road North
Clean Restrooms

SALADO ANTIQUE MALL
and Bee’s Antiques

Thousands of Antiques, Collectibles and Primitives
 in a unique and inviting atmosphere

The Original Salado Market Days
9-5 on the 2nd weekend - Don’t miss May 13 - 14

Follow us on FaceBookSaladoAntique Mall.com

are the most important in 
making that ID. Is the head 
striped, crested, or capped? 
Is there markings present on 
the face, such as masking, 
eye rings, or ear patches? Is 
the color of the body plum-
age red, blue, or brown? Are 
the underparts spotted or 
streaked? Is the tail forked, 
rounded, long, or short? Is 
there distinctive markings on 
the tail such as spots, bands, 
or bars? What about the 
bill? Is it needlelike, or is it 
hooked, or is it cone-shaped?

	There are also other 
things besides physical attri-
butes to observe. What is the 
surrounding habitat like? 
What kind of voice does 
the bird utilize? What is its 
behavior? Does it hop on the 
ground, does it fly from bush 
to bush, or does it soar? What 
is its flight pattern? Does it 
exhibit a direct straight line 
flight? Or does it hover or 
zig-zag?

	As you can see, there 
are several key elements in 
learning how to be a bird-
watcher. But with the mas-
tery of these elements, then 
you are well on your way 
to become an experienced 
birder. Happy birding! 

 1109 W. Village Rd, Salado (behind Sonic)                            

Monday thru Saturday         10 a.m. to 9 p.m.

Liquor Store

(254) 947-7117

Celebrate with style
Large or small - we have the supplies you need

Corner of Royal Street and Center Circle (West)
(254) 947-1960

 Open
Mon, Wed, Thurs 5 p.m.
Fri, Sat & Sun 11 a.m.

Closed Tues

A place for weary travelers, thirsty 
tourist, and hungry neighbors!

Tried our Pulled Pork?
Cooked to Perfection on 

The Big Green Egg!

(254) 947-0027 | (800) 724-0027

Historic Bed and Breakfast ~Weddings ~ Receptions  ~ Meetings

Inn at Salado

North Main & Pace Park Dr.  inn-at-salado.com                   

Sunday 
Brunch 
10:30 am - 2:00 pm

Inn on the Creek • 602 Center Circle 
(254) 947-5554

106 North Main Street
(next to Ambrosia Tea Room)  

(254) 855-5538 Private Showings

Open Daily 
(254) 947-1909

 560 N. Main, Suite 10  

GET HOPPING FOR SPRING

Gifts
Healthy Living Products

Open Daily 
(254) 947-1909

 560 N. Main, Suite 10  

HOP IN AND
SEE WHAT IS NEW

Gifts | Healthy Living

Shop at Salado’s Boutique Marketplace
Women’s Apparel, Shoes ~ Flip Flops to Boots,
Jewelry, Baby Gifts & Apparel, Gourmet Food,

 Home Decor & Furniture, Home Fragrance, 
Junk Gypsy™ Paint,  Gifts & More

22 North Main Street

Cowboys Bar-B-Q
Exit 285 • 1300 Robertson RD

Catering, Take Out or Dine In

254-947-5700  Miguel Perez, owner

Slow Cooking Fast Service

642 N. Main St.     (254) 947-8848 

sta mpsal adotex as.com

Rubber Stamps
Scrapbooking

ribbons
Great Classes

Timeless
Upscale Consignment

#3 North Main
Corner of Main and Pace Park Road

Women’s Clothing, Jewelry,
 Local Art and Home Décor

Springhouse
120 Royal Street              

Mon - Sat  10:30 - 5     (254)947-0747

An Eclectic Mix of 
New and Vintage Furniture, 

Home Decor, Gifts and 
a Ladies Boutique

LIVELY
• COFFEEHOUSE & BISTRO •

EST. 2015

21 North Main Street        Salado Square       (254) 947-3688

GET LIVELY WED - SAT 9 - 4 
SUN 10 - 4 | MON 9 - 4 closed Tues

Coffee | Espresso
Breakfast | Lunch

Bagel | Croissant | Pastry
Toast Selections

Salad | Soup | Sandwich
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1005 Indian Tr., Salado
2 BR, 2 BA
$259,721

1295 Western Trail, Salado
3 BR, 3 full BA, 2 half BA on 9+ ac.

$425,021

1307 Walker Circle, Salado
3 BR, 2.5 BA

$449,721

404 FM 2268, Salado
3 BR, 2 BA w/ 1 BR, 1 BA apartment, on 3 ac.

$399,921

• Hidden Springs lots:  $36,500 - $59,900
• 1.1 tree covered acres on Center Circle.
• 10 acre homesite with road frontage on two sides, near Bartlett.
• 12.5 acres, beautiful acreage homesite. Salado ISD
• 18 ac. native pasture with hillside views. Seller financing available. 
• 99 ac. w/ 3 BR, 2 BA, workshop and barn. SOLD
• 170 ac., with 2 farm houses and barn, between Temple, Belton and Academy

3300 Chisholm Trail, Salado
3 BR, 2.5 BA

$269,921

1315 Walker Circle, Salado
3 BR, 3 BA
$459,021

2205 High View, Belton
4 BR, 3.5 BA .

$559,921

860 N. Main
Salado, Tx

254.947.5050

Area Land Listings

3107 Hester Way, Salado
4 BR, 3 BA
$349,921

www.C21BB.com

11079 Stinnett Mill, Salado
4 BR, 4 BA
$379,921

We have buyers searching for:
• Homes on small acreage under $400,000       • Farm and ranch acreage

• Unimproved tracts of land 2 - 20 acres  • 3 or 4 BR homes under $300,000 in Salado

Call Century 21 Bill Bartlett today. 254-947-5050
You may be surprised at current market values!

No phone calls. 4/6-4/13
Part time job opening.  
Assistant to Property 
Manager.  20 hours per week 
involving indoor and outdoor mainte-
nance, cleaning, yard work and other 
duties as needed.  Job involves physi-
cal labor and applicants should be 
able to perform all necessary tasks.
Interested applicants can email 
Salado United Methodist Church at 
sumc@saladoumc.org or call 254-
947-5482.
The Inn at Salado is 
accepting applications 
for an Breakfast Cook /Housekeep-
ing. Duties to include cooking and 
serving breakfast for guest, also 
housekeeping. Must be willing to 
work weekdays and weekend. Must 

be a people person and be able to 
multi-task. Please send resume to 
rooms@inn-at-salado.com or come 
in person to fill out an application 
Monday through Saturday between 
11 a.m. and 3 p.m. at Inn at Salado 
7 North Main or call 254-947-0027 
between 10 a.m. and 4 p.m.

Financial
Troy L Smith Financial: 
Personal investment solutions. 254-
947-0376, Troylsmith.com.
Alton D. Thiele PC: Certified 
Public Accountant, tax returns, busi-
ness accounting, auditing, consulting, 
254-939-0701. tfnd
Bruce A. Bolick, CPA: Pay-
roll, W-2, Direct Deposit, By appoint-
ment, 254-718-7299. SaladoCPA@
aol.com.           tfnd

The Personal Wealth 
Coach®: SEC registered invest-
ment advisor, highly personalized 
portfolio design and management, 
254-947-1111.
Real Estate 
Services 
First Community Title, 
branches in Salado, Temple, Killeen 
and Gatesville. 40 N. Main Street, 
Salado 254-947-8480.               tfnd
Monteith Abstract & Title 
Company: Full service title company, 
213 Mill Creek Dr., Suite #140, 254-
947-3922.

Insurance
John Hall: Insurance and finan-
cial services, auto, home, ranch, 

Automobile & Small 
Engine   Repair
E&E Air-Cooled Engines: 
Shindaiwa Dealer, parts, sales and 
service, chain saw sharpening, 254-
947-8006, 24767 FM 2268.         tfnd
C.A.R.S. Collision Center: 
auto body repairs, detail shop, 1914 
S. IH-35 Belton, 254-933-7400.            
tfnd
Child Care 
The Play Yard: 6 weeks to 12 
years with age appropriate curricu-
lum, drop of and pick up from Salado 
schools, 254-947-1153.  tfnb

Cleaning
Clear Vision Cleaning - 
Residential and commercial cleaning 
service. (254)314-5050.

Clear  V iew Window 
Cleaning: Windows, gutters, 
powerwashing, ceiling fan cleaning. 
(254)931-6172.
Window Washing Won-
ders: Professional window clean-
ing. Residential and Commercial. 
(254)231-3289.

Computers
Walt Tollefson  computer 
repairs and sales, data recovery, 
configurations,, 254-291-6354.   tfnd

Dry Cleaners
Salado Cleaners: Laundry, 
dry cleaning, alterations, leather, 
suede, 1209 N. Stagecoach, 254-
947-7299. tfnd
Mill Creek Cleaners, quality 
dry cleaning, laundry, alterations, 213 

Mill Creek Dr. Suite 200, 254-947-
0100.    tfnd

Dirt/Stone Work
Lone Star Grading, commer-
cial, residential, industrial excavation, 
grading, paving, pads, driveways, 
roads, 254-947-0149 or 254-933-
7900
CBS Construction: septic 
tanks, house pads, driveways, lot 
clearing, top soil, 254-718-1752.  tfnd

Employment 
Opportunities
Receptionist/Escrow 
Assistant - Excellent phone 
and customer service skills, account-
ing experience helpful. Send resume 
to liz.armstrong@monteithtitle.com. 
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Classified ads 
due by 

Monday noon
15 words for $7 

(.25 per word after) 
prepaid

send your information: 
classifieds@saladovillagevoice.com

(254) 947-5321
Office in Salado Plaza

suite 125

Classified Ads from 1D
business, life, health, 254-778-8087. 
Rita Zbranek, Farmers Insur-
ance, auto, home, life, commercial, 
254-947-0995.
Finney Insurance, home, 
auto, life, commercial, liability, farm, 
ranch, 254-947-3599.

Florist
Brookshire Brothers full 
service florist. Blooming plants. 254-
947-8922.

For Sale
A n t i q u e s  a t  D e e ’s 
Antique Mall - Furniture, 
Glassware, Keepsakes at 702 North 
Main Street. Over 30 vendors (254) 
947-3775 tfn
Ant iques at  Salado 
Antique Mall and Bee’s 
Antiques -  Antiques, vintage 
and collectables, many vendors at 
one location 751 Stagecoach Road, 
North I-35 frontage road (directly 
behind Dee’s Antiques on Main) 947-
3355. Salado Market Days second 
weekend of each month.  tfn

Free
Free boxes available at 
Salado Winery, 841 N Main 
St, great for moving, pick up during 
weekdays 12-6 pm.

Garage, Auctions, 
Estate Sale
2 Family Garage Sale: 
April 15, 7:30 a.m.- 1:00 p.m. 819 
Blaylock Circle.
Moving sale April 15. 701 
Ridgecrest Dr.,  Salado Household 
goods, tools, furniture.
Garage Sale- Friday, 8 a.m.- 5 
p.m., Saturday, 8 a.m.- 3 p.m. 2025 
The Creeks Dr. All proceeds go to 
Gift of Grain.
Bring your items to sell 
at the Community Yard 
Sale and New2U Inventory Reduc-
tion Sale on April 29, 7 a.m. at JD’s 
Travel Center, 15881 South IH 35. 
info: James (254) 947-5228. 4/6-4/26

Garbage
Clawson Disposal: Competi-
tive pricing for great garbage service; 
containers, too. 512-746-2000.

Health and Fitness
Angelic Herbs: Profes-
sional Wellness, Lifestyle, 
weight loss and stress management 
solutions. C J Harbuz, CNHP 947-
1909, 560 N. Main Suite 10.
Crain Chiropractic & 
Wellness- chiropractic care, 
massage therapy, acupuncture and 
holistic care. 418 N. Main St. #5.,947-
2225.
Integrity: Rehab & Home 
Health. Physical therapy, speech 
therapy, occupational therapy, in-
home skilled nursing. integrityrehab.
net, 254-699-3933.
Therapeutic Massage, 
stress management and healthy life-

style strategies, Linda Pritchard-Egg, 
RN, LMT, 254-947-4263.
Family Dentistry: Lumineers 
for straighter, whiter teeth. Douglas 
B. Willingham, DDS, 254-947-5242.

Heat & Air
Britt Heating & Air: Instal-
lation and repairs, 254-760-1004, 
254-947-5263, TACL #B006640
Bell Air Conditioning: All 
brands repairs, free estimates, 100% 
financing available, 254-939-1141. 
TACLA002113C

Jewelers
Salado Creek Jewelers 
by Kiki Creations:  106 
North Main St. 254-855-5538, private 
showings.
Lastovica Jewelers: in-
store jewelry repairs, diamond sales, 
setting and appraisal, custom design, 
watch repair, 254-773-5772.
Devereaux’s Jewelers: 
Quality crafted custom work, jewelry 
repair, appraisals, watch repair, stone 
setting, diamond sales, photo design. 
254-771-1260.

Landscaping

Lawnwork & Tree
RDJ Lawn Care Complete 
Lawn Care Service (254) 760-2439
Scout’s Tree Service and 
Lawn Care. For free estimate or 
questions call (254)654-0213.
Trees, Shrubs & Land-
scaping,  Pruning, www.victor-
mareklandscaping.com. 1-512-818-
3822, Removal and Hauling. Flower 
beds, yard work, top soil.  Serving 
Salado 34 years. 0724tfn 
Double J Tree Service: Lot 
clearing, acreage mowing, chipping, 
mulching, trimming, 512-635-4064. 
512-746-2172.

Personal Services
Jenny Wiggin Potter- Col-
orist, Hairstylist at Expres-
sions, 3126 South 31st St. across 
from HEB  in Temple. (254) 774-9751.
Hairitage Barber Shop: 
Full service Barber Shop, call 254-
947-3309 for appointments. 
The Haire Shop, full service 
salon, walk-ins accepted. 254-760-
1990. 

Pest Control
Ace Pest Control: Customer 
satisfaction guaranteed, free esti-
mates, TPCL #12512; David Preston. 
254-947-4222

Plumbing
Moffat & Daughters 
Plumbing: Service, repair, 
remodeling, 254-289-5986 Master 
LIC # M017002
Salado Plumbing. In-home 
repairs, 254-947-5800. Master LIC 
M 16892
Yount Sewer & Drain: 
septic tank & grease trap pumping, 

$16  a week 
Put your business card 

here and get a free 
classified each week.

advertising@saladovillagevoice.com 
(254) 947-5321

254-947-5036

Rental/Lease 
Residential
Charming, spacious, 
2/2/1 townhome for rent. 
Clean!! 6 closets, vaulted ceiling, 
w/d closet inside. Walk to shopping 
center. Lawn care provided. 254-913-
9813, www.saladorentals.com.
3BR, 3 1/2 BA, 2200 Sq. 
Ft., 3 Car Garage, Golf Cart Garage. 
All brick, on golf course. 254-721-
3578, ask for Frank. 8/13 tfnb
For Rent clean 2 BR, 2 B 
duplex, $700 mo. call 760-4440. 

Residential Sales
3300 Chisholm Trail, 
Salado.   3BR, 2.5 BA close to 
Mill Creek Golf Course.  Master suite 
has a wonderful sitting area which 
looks over the back yard.  Master BA 
has separate shower/tub & two walk-
in closets.  Kitchen has a breakfast 
area & the dining room connects to 
the kitchen.  Brick fireplace in living 
area with views of the back yard.  
Private back yard with two large oak 
trees.  $269,921.
716 DeGrummond Way 
Impressive custom built home that 
is a Southern Living Idea Home. A 
fabulous drive-up that features 5 
bedrooms, 5 .5 baths, with master 
and guest suite downstairs.Must see 
all the extras.. Located on a tranquil 
tree lined street in the heart of beauti-
ful Salado. $639,000. Call Raney and 
Associates: 254-913-1215.
801 Blaylock Circle  This 
Immaculate custom 4 bedroom and 
3 bath, one owner home features 
a large great room with wood burn-
ing fireplace and built-ins. Two car, 
plus golf cart garage. $269,900, 
Call Raney and Associates: 254-
913-1215. 
Perfect home overlook-
ing the Texas Hill Coun-
try. Hill country flavored home 
on 5 gorgeous acres with barn 
for horses $429,900. More info at 
www.1349hiddensprings.com Call 
First Texas Brokerage 947-5577
Home on approx. 3 acres 
close  to  downtown 
Salado.  Two living, one game 
room, 3 BR, 2 BA home with a 1 
BR, 1 BA apartment.  Beautiful large 
oak trees cover the acreage.  Nice 
concrete floor shop in back yard for 
projects or storage.  404 FM 2268, 
Salado.  $399,921. Century 21 Bill 
Bartlett 947-5050  2/2tfnf
Home on Mill Creek Golf 
Course.  Incredible view from the 
living, breakfast area and kitchen.  
Beautiful salt water pool and hot 
tub.  Landscaped backyard provides 
privacy.  The dream kitchen is perfect 
for the culinary chef.  Three bed-
rooms, three baths, two living and 
two dining room home is perfect for 
entertaining or for overnight guests.  
Living area has custom entertainment 
center.  1315 Walker Circle, Salado.  
$459,021. Century 21 Bill Bartlett  
947-5050.
Escape to your own 
resort all on 5 pristine acres. As 
you walk into this home you will be 
taken by the grand great room with 
high ceilings, custom wood beams 
and large windows overlooking the 
swimming pool. $599,875. Call Ryan 
541-2255. First Texas Brokerage 254-
947-5577 9/8tfn
Old world Charm and 
Custom craftsmanship 

can be seen throughout this Texas 
Hill Country Farm House on 4.9 
tree-covered acre estate. Features 
include: Spray foam insulation. 2 
tankless water heaters. 2-16 seer AC/
Heating units $549,900. Call Ryan  
541-2255. First Texas Brokerage 
947-5577 9/8tfn
Elegant Austin Stone 
Home on tree-covered 
lot. Large covered back patio 
overlooking the tropical landscaping 
and swimming pool. Granite counters, 
stainless steel appliances. $499,900 
Call First Texas Brokerage 947-5577.
This home is breathtak-
ing, simply breathtak-
ing!  Walk in the front door & 
have a view of the gorgeous living 
room, swimming pool & golf course.  
Escape to your covered patio and 
have privacy from the neighbors & 
golfers provided by the lovely and 
tasteful landscaping.  The kitchen 
opens to the family & breakfast room 
and view of the outdoor pool & golf 
course.  You will be amazed with the 
size of the master bath to include a 
walk-in shower.  1307 Walker Circle, 
Salado.  $449,721.  Century 21 Bill 
Bartlett  947-5050.
Home on 9 acres fronting 
the Willingham Creek in 
Hidden Springs.  Heavily 
wooded acreage creates a private 
setting.   3 BR, 3 full baths, 2 half 
baths.  Beautiful beam vaulted ceil-
ing in living area.  Up to 3 horses are 
allowed.  1295 Western Trail, Salado.  
$425,021. Century 21 Bill Bartlett 
947-5050

Property For Sale
Bell County Land - 6 ac. 
I-35; 20 ac. native oaks, home, guest 
house; 50 ac. I-35 Belton; 50 ac. 
South of Salado, pond, barn.  Many 
more tracts to choose from.  Century 
21 Bill Bartlett, Salado  www.C21bb.
com 254-947-5050.11/10 tfnf
694 Ashley Court - Great 
location just off Main Street in estab-
lished neighborhood. Lot size is 
.517 acre. $72,500. Call Raney and 
Associates: 254-913-1215. tfn01/12
Kevlin Trail - Only 1 lot 
left! Premier half-acre lot, under-
ground utilities ready for building. 
$59,900. Call Raney and Associates: 
254-913-1215. tfn08/02
Homesites in Heritage 
subdivision, 1+ acres, 
Salado schools, call Raney and 
Associates: 254-913-1215. tfn08/20

Services
The Shade Shop: Ceiling 
fans, light fixtures, home decor and 
window treatments at 230 North Main. 
(254) 290-7000

Storage
StowAway Storage House-
hold - Commercial 10X10 - 10x20 
- 22x40 Clean, lighted, fenced, Key 
punch entry. 947-5502 or 721-1807              
Storage space in Salado 
8X12, 16X24 and up. Some have 
drive-in doors. Stagecoach Storage 
254-778-6779. tfnb 

Upholstery
Custom upholstery, residen-
tial, commercial, Kasmir fabric gallery, 
free pickup and delivery, Recovery 
Room, 254-699-6105.

Vets, Pets & 
Livestock
Animal Medical- Full service 
vet hospital, (254)947-8800.

LONE STAR GRADING
& MATERIALS

COMMERCIAL  H  RESIDENTIAL
INDUSTRIAL

EXCAVATION • GRADING • SITE PREPARATION
YARDS • LOT CLEARING • PADS • ROADS

DRIVEWAYS • PARKING LOTS
ALL TYPES DIRT WORK • MATERIALS & HAULING

***FREE ESTIMATES***

(254) 947-0149 or (254) 933-7900
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Al Clawson Disposal, Inc. 
(512) 930-5490    •    www.ClawsonDisposal.com

ASK US ABOUT OUR SERVICES
Waste Pickup    •    Recycling    •    Roll-Off Containers

  

ANNA LOU RANEY, Broker/Realtor 254-913-1215
DANIEL RANEY, Realtor 254-760-2591
ANN CARROLL, Realtor 254-760-0101

GEORGE ROMFH, Realtor 254-718-6845

MLS
MULTIPLE LISTING SERVICE

Temple/Belton 
Board of Realtors

RaneyRealEstate.net

LAND LISTINGS
800 Hillcrest 

Unusual lot needs creative builder. Lots of trees  $18,000
694 ASHLEY COURT  

Great location just off Main Street in established 
neighborhood. Lot size is .517 Acre  $72,500

KEVLIN TRAIL 
Only 1 lot left! Premier half-acre lot, 

underground utilities ready for building. $59,900
HERITAGE SUBDIVISION

Only five 1 + acre lots left in this beautiful subdivision.
For more information check our website.

HIDDEN SPRINGS
3.49 Acres On Mission Trail right off of Long Meadow

Beautiful building site with mature trees.
SOLD

716 DEGRUMMOND WAY
Impressive custom built home that 
is a Southern Living Idea Home. A 
fabulous drive-up that features 5 
bedrooms, 5 .5 baths, with mas-
ter and guest suite downstairs. 
Must see all the extras.. Located 
on a tranquil tree lined street in the 
heart of beautiful Salado. 

$639,000

801 BLAYLOCK CIRCLE
Immaculate 4 bedroom, 3 bath, 
custom, one owner home.
Large great room with wood burn-
ing fireplace and built-ins.
Two car plus golf cart garage.

$269,900

SOLD

CBS Construction

Gravel Driveways | Parking Lots
Septic Tanks | House Pads
Lot Clearing | Demolition

Chet Sutton, owner-operator

254 718-1752

RDJ Lawn Care
Complete Lawn Care Service

Mowing | Edging | Landscaping

Tree Trimming | Power Washing

and more

   Free Estimates - Call Today
 (254) 760-2439  
   Randy Jackson

Insured
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Britt Heating & 
Air Conditioning

 Installations • Repairs
 Office 947-5263
 Mobile 760-1004
 Serving Salado for 25 years 
 TACL #B006640

Double J
  Tree
      Service

LOT CLEARING
ACREAGE MOWING

CHIPPING/MULCHING
TREE TRIMMING & REMOVAL

LICENSED SEPTIC SYSTEM INSTALLATION
TRACTOR WORK

24 HR EMERGENCY CALL

W. J. Martone
512-746-2172

Johnnie R. Martone
512-635-4064

No Job too Small
Free estimates

NOTICE: While most advertisers are reputable, We cannot guarantee products or services advertised. We urge readers to use caution and when in doubt, 
contact the Texas Attorney General at 1-800-621-0508 or the Federal Trade Commission at 1-877-FTC-HELP. The FTC web site is www.ftc.gov/bizop

Run Your Ad In TexSCAN!

To Order: Call this Newspaper 
direct, or call Texas Press Service

 

at 1-800-749-4793 Today!

Statewide Ad
 
....................

$

$550
239 Newspapers, 617,408 Circulation

North Region Only ........

$

250
69 Newspapers, 165,558 Circulation

South Region Only ....... $250
85 Newspapers, 267,744 Circulation

West Region Only  ......... $250
85 Newspapers, 184,106 Circulation

TexSCAN Week of                 April 09, 2017

 

HELP WANTED

  AUCTION
           CDL TRAINING

     CREDIT REPAIR

    ACERAGE  

    FARM MACHINERY   MINERAL RIGHTS  

 MISCELLANEOUS  

 

  

Our Sportsmen     will    Pay Top 
dollar t o hunt your land.Call  for a 
free base camp leasing packet  & 
Quote.

We buy oil,    gas &   mineral rights. Both 
non -producing and producing    including 
non- Participating Royalty Interest (NPRI). 
Provide us your desired   price for an offer 
evaluation. Call Today     1-806-620-1422. 

ship!       Free      info/   DVD: 
www.  norwoodsawmills.com,
1-800- 578-1363,     Ext.300N.             

DRIVER - CDL  A TRAINING $500- 
$1000 Incentive Bonus. No  Out Of 
Pocket Tuition Cost!. Get  your CDL 
in 22 days. 6 day refresher courses 
available. Minimum 21 years.1-855
-755-5545.EOE.   www.kllmdrivingacademy.com

www.BaseCamp Leasing.com

SAWMILLS  from only  $ 4397.00-
Make & Save Money with your 
own bandmill- Cut  lumber    any 
dimension.        In stock ready  to

Buda Lions County Fair and  Wiener dog
races 2017. April 23-24th Buda City   Park
For more information: www.budalions.com

Restore your credit score! A plus rated 
BBB. With 14 years experience. Get the 
credit   score you   need  and   deserve!
Satisfaction guaranted. 1-888-589-9998

Schneider jobs available in  your 
area! Earn up to $68,000! Flexible 
Schedules.Performance  bonuses. 
$6,000      tuiton       reinbursment 
available   for    qualified    drivers.

 www. schneiderjobs.com. Apply   today!

33 Acres Across from  Walmart   - 
Liberty, TX - Auction April 18.   Last 
Ask   $2.7M-   Sells at $975K Info  : 
JonesSwenson.com or 1-800-460 -
2078 WS Swenson  #7809 10% BP
Hunting, retirement,  investment 
property. 20-60 acres in   Edwards, 
Kinney, Concho,  Coke,      Menard 
Counties.   Scenic views,      native 
game with free ranging  exotics   in 
some    counties.   30 - year owner 
financing, 5% down.   1-800-876-9720, 
wwww.ranchenterprisesltd.com

New Braunfels Area Car Club.Swap
meet & Sunday Car Show. April 21  -
23, 2017. Comal County  Fairgrouds
101 E. Common Street New Braun  -
fels   www. newbraunfelscarlub. com John Dotson Trucking. Seeking exper-

ienced belly dump driver.   Class a  CDL
minmum 2 years. Experience.    Steady
work!     Call now       1-512-376-4  878.

Email today lobomineralsLLC@gmail.com

Salado Village Voice 
 (254) 947-5321, to order today

675 W. Hwy 190 • Belton 
www.surfacesource.net

Flooring • Cabinets • Countertops
Remodeling Services 

Tub to Shower Conversions 
VISIT OUR SHOWROOM 

254.939.6464

Yount Sewer & Drain
Septic Service, L.C.

Septic tank 
& grease trap 

pumping

254 947-5036

Let the light shine through

Windows | Gutters
Powerwashing

Ceiling Fan Cleaning

(254) 931-6172
ClearViewWindows_Belton@yahoo.com

Clear View Window Cleaning

Moffatt & Daughters
Plumbing Co. 

Service • Repair • Remodeling

Riannai authorized service provider
George (Bubba) Moffatt

254 289-5986 (local)

Master Plumber
Lic M017002

A/C
Repair

 ALL BRANDS
Free Estimates &  Second Opinions

100% Financing Available

Senior Citizens Discount on service

939-1141
Toll Free 877-422-5500  • www.bellaircond.com

310 E. Central Ave. • Belton
SERVING CENTRAL TEXAS FOR OVER 53 YEARS

TACLA002113C

Salado Plumbing

947-5800

“We are ready”
In home repairs

 

Master LIC M 16892

Residential And Commercial
Power Washing, Gutters & Screen Repair   

Zack Tumlinson
(254) 231-3289

Window Washing Wonders
You’ll Wonder Why You Ever Tried 

to Clean Your Own Windows

WindowWashingWonders@gmail.com
www.facebook.com/WindowWashingWonders

April 3
	 7:37-7:54 p.m., Salado 
High School. Out for a gener-
al fire alarm. Arrived on scene 
and proceeded with investiga-
tion. Found cleaning crew had 
set off alarm. 2 units, 4 per-
sonnel.
	 6:11-7:08 p.m., NB Rest 
Area. Dispatched for a vehi-
cle accident, arrived on scene 
to find one vehicle against 
the wall. All occupants were 
out of the vehicles, all occu-
pants were checked and no 
one wanted EMS. Checked 
vehicle for leaks and fire haz-
ard, but nothing was found. 
Remained on scene blocking 
traffic until released by DPS. 
2 units, 6 personnel.
April 4
	 1:04-1:12 a.m., 5700 
Block FM 2484. Out for the 
control burn behind Grace 
Baptist Church. Arrived on 
scene to find the pile burned 
down and no flames visible. 
But some smoke blowing to-
wards trailers. Made contact 
with caller and talked to him. 
Caller agreed to leave it and 
he would deal with it tonight. 
No further assistance needed 
and all units cleared. 2 units, 
2 personnel.
	 2:42-3:15 a.m., 2100 
Block Bluff Circle. Dis-
patched for a patient with 
hip pain. Arrived on scene to 
Scott & White Medic with pa-
tient care. Helped Medic load 
patient for transport. Medic 
transported patient. 1 unit, 2 
personnel.
	 12:32-12:46 a.m., 279 NB. 
Out for a grassfire at the 279 
NB. Went en route and arrived 
on scene to find the small fire 
at the 275 MM and Jarrell 
VFD on scene and it was out, 
no other fire or dangers and all 
units cleared. 1 unit, 2 person-
nel.
	 7:43-8:02 p.m., 280 NB 
Service Rd. Dispatched for a 
possible vehicle fire. Checked 
I-35 South and North bound 

and found a small DBF crew 
where a compressor was 
smoking. 3 units, 7 person-
nel.
April 5
	 2:25-3:02 p.m., 200 
Block Mill Creek Dr. Out 
for a female patient difficulty 
breathing from an allergic 
reaction. Arrived on scene 
to find the patient in obvious 
distress. Patient had wheez-
ing when breathing. Patient 
stated she is allergic to soy 
and ate food containing it. 
Patient’s tongue began to 
swell. Assisted patient with 
administering her EPI Pen. 
Obtained vitals and charted. 
Scott & White Medic ar-
rived on scene and took over 
patient care. Scott & White 
Medic transported emergen-
cy traffic with FD member on 
board. 2 units, 4 personnel.
April 6
	 8:49-9:49 p.m., 8300 
Block Brewer Ln. Out for a 
female patient sick. Arrived 
on scene to find the patient, 
had no patient contact. Scott 
& White Medic arrived on 
scene and had patient con-
tact. Scott & White transport-
ed patient. 1 unit, 1 person-
nel.
April 7
	 9:41-9:58 a.m., 10600 
Block Cedar Knob Church 
Rd. Out for a patient chest 
pain and not eating. Ar-
rived on scene to find Harker 
Heights Medic on scene. 
Assisted them with loading 
patient. Medic transported 
patient. 1 unit, 1 personnel.
April 8
	 5:17-5:42 p.m., 1900 
Block Old Mill. Out for a 
patient with general illness. 
Went en route and arrived on 
scene to find Scott & White 
Medic on scene with all pa-
tient care. Assisted Medic 
with moving patient to 
stretcher and into ambulance. 
Medic transported patient. 1 
unit, 1 personnel.

	 8:59-9:24 p.m., 1200 
Block Mill Creek. Out prior-
ity 3 for a 83 year old female 
patient with general illness. 
went en route and arrived on 
scene to find Scott & White 
Medic on scene with all pa-
tient care. Assisted Medic 
with moving patient to 
stretcher and into ambulance. 
Medic transported patient to 
Scott & White and all units 
cleared. 1 unit, 1 personnel.
	 9600 Block Norwood. 
Child with an insect bite. 
Arrived on scene to find a 
3 year old female sitting in 
moms lap. Patient had bite 
on her right thigh. Wound 
had two puncture marks ap-
proximately 2 cm apart. Pa-

Invokana is a treatment for Type 
2 Diabetes. Lawsuits allege that 
Invokana may be linked to heart 
attacks, kidney failure and ketoacidosis, 
which is a diabetic coma that can lead 
to fatal sweeling in the brain. The FDA 
has warned about possible kidney 
injury and ketoacidosis. If you have 
taken Invokana and have one of 
these conditions, call us today for 
professional insight.

Fatal Swelling EXPERIENCE 
COUNTS
Lawyers with more 

than 100 years 
combined expertise.

1-800-460-0606
www.DefectiveDrugsLaw.com

Ryan A. Krebs, M.D., J.D.
Doctor-Lawyer in Full-time Law Practice

Richard A. Dodd, L.C.
Timothy R. Cappolino, P.C.

Board Certified Personal Injury Trial Law and Civil Trial 
Law by the Texas Board of Legal Specialization

NO FEE FOR FIRST VISIT
OFFIces In HOusTOn/cOnrOe, TempLe AnD AusTIn,

prIncIpAL OFFIce In cAmerOn

New Braunfels Area Car Club

Swap Meet & Sunday Car Show
April 22-24, 2016

Comal County Fairgrounds
801 E. Common Street • New Braunfels

www.newbraunfelscarclub.com • No Dogs Please

April 21-23, 2017

Jump behind the wheel 
and get your wheels going somewhere

Don’t sit back and spin your wheels aimlessly. Drive 
your truck, your career and your life forward with 

purpose as a respected member of the Schneider team. 

GET OUTTA THE
HAMSTER WHEEL

Get traction in your career  
schneiderjobs.com      800-44-PRIDE

tient had local swelling. Pa-
tient showed no signs of resp. 
distress. Patients family was 
unable to locate insect. Pa-
tient stated no pain. Patients 
mom advised they did not 
wish to be transported. EMS 
advised that if patients condi-
tion changed they would need 
to contact 911 or seek their 
PCP. MES stayed on scene to 
check status change. Patient 
showed no signs of change. 
EMS obtained patient refusal. 
2 personnel.
	 8000 Block Rita Bend. 
Requested for a male having 
shortness of breath. Scott & 
White transported. 2 person-
nel.

Salado Volunteer Fire Department 
Report April 3-8
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By Lyle Zoeller

Co. Ext. Agent

	 Spring has come a bit 
early this year and so has the 
Range and Pasture annual 
weeds.  I encourage every-
one who is planning some 
weed control to consider 
several factors before spray-
ing an herbicide to control 
weeds.
	 The first step in weed 
control is to identify the 
Weed or Weeds to be con-
trolled.  There are poten-
tially two types of Weeds 
to be controlled, Broad leaf 
weeds or Grassy weeds.  The 
Broadleaf weeds are most 
common on our Range lands 

and can be easily controlled 
with a wide Range of prod-
ucts.    The Grassy Weeds 
are more likely a problem 
in Coastal or Klein grass 
fields.  Controlling a grass in 
a grass is somewhat difficult 
as there are limited options.
	 The most common weeds 
to spray for would include 
common broom weed, rag-
weed, upright prairie cone-
flower, Henbit, mustards, 
and many others.  Weeds are 
most effectively controlled 
when they are very small.  
I have noticed the Broom 
weeds at 3-6 inches tall al-
ready.  Time is here to spray 
for them.

	 The Grassy Weeds like 
little Barley, Rescue Grass 
and Texas Winter Grass 
should have been controlled 
when the warm season pas-
tures were dormant in Febru-
ary.
	 The proper use of any 
of the Weed controls prod-
ucts is extremely important.  
Many products are “limited 
use” or “restricted use” and 
require a pesticide applica-
tor license from the Texas 
Department of Agriculture.  
Another issue is proper ap-
plication to avoid “drift” of 
the chemical product.  Cot-
ton is extremely susceptible 
to many of the common 

products used on Range and 
Improved pastures.  Drift 
damage can be seen for sev-
eral miles in some cases.  Be 
cautious around vegetable 
gardens and fruit trees.  To-
matoes plants are also very 
susceptible to damage.
	 Rangeland Brush control 
is typically a mid-summer 
to early fall applications.  
When looking to control 
mesquite with a foliar prod-
uct, the leaves need to have 
turned to a dark green color.  
They are currently a light, 
bright yellow/green.  Basal 
treatments or Individual 
Plant Treatment (IPT) can 
be done anytime.

	 Always read and follow 
all the labeled directions, 
“The label is the Law”.
	 Texas A&M AgriLife 
Extension has several good 
resources to help identify 
plants and make control 
recommendations at The 
AgriLife Bookstore.tamu.
edu.  Weed ID can also be 
done by emailing photos to 
L-Zoeller@tamu.edu 
Upcoming Events
	 Small Grain Field Day – 
McGregor, 7:30 a.m.- noon, 
April 28. Sponsored noon 
lunch.  CEU’s provided for 
individuals with a pesticide 
applicator license.  Registra-
tion is $10.  RSVP, for meal 

count by call 254-933-5305.
	 Bell County Poultry 
Workshop is 9:30-11:30 a.m. 
April 29 at the Bell County 
Extension Office Meeting 
Room at 1605 North Main 
Street, Belton.  The program 
speaker will be Alisa Haris-
ton.  It is FREE to all 4-H 
and FFA Exhibitors, parents, 
advisors and families who 
are interested in beginning 
a poultry project.  If you 
have any questions, about 
the FREE workshop, contact 
Whitney Grantham at the 
Bell County Extension Of-
fice at 254-933-5305.

Spring has arrived early, bringing weeds with it




