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     Salado High School had 
four films screened at the 
historic Paramount Theater 
in Austin at the 2018 UIL 
Young Filmmakers State 
Festival on Feb. 28. Two of 
the films won State Awards.
	 Rayne Polkowski and 
Heidi Kelley won the state 
narrative title with their film 
5.  A five dollar bill falls out 
of the hands of a rich man 
and is caught by the wind, 
traveling into the hands of 
many others and impacting 
them in different ways. 5 
dives deep into the people 
behind the hands, observing 
the value of money accord-
ing to different people and 
how it has affected each of 
them.
	 Roxi Thrasher and Rea-
gan Thrasher won the No-
bility Social Impact Award 
with their film In Time of 
Need. “In Time of Need” 
tells the story of non-profit 
organizations that respond 
to emergency situations. 

The individuals that work 
for these organizations are 
true super heroes that we 
often don’t recognize. With 
a year of tragedy and natu-
ral disaster in our own back 
yard, the message is timeless 
and hits close to home. This 
documentary exhibits the 
way they help people in their 
own time of need.
     Bridget Golden and Ash-
ley Ruiz placed second in 
narrative with their film 
Blank Eyes. In Blank Eyes, 
Amelia lives in a time when 
abnormal behavior could be 
enough reason to be admit-
ted, and lobotomies were 
considered “common medi-
cal procedures”. We watch 
the struggles of this teenage 
girl, fighting to defy the sys-
tem she’s in to save her san-
ity. This parallels to modern 
society in how we treat the 
people in the mental health 
or institutional systems. 
	 Madeline Krustchinsky 
placed fourth in documen-

tary with her film The Peo-
ple’s Car. The People’s Car 
explores the unique and ec-
centric Volkswagen collec-
tors culture.
	 All five of the Salado 
films that made the state 
semi-finals will be shown at 
The Beltonian theater 8 p.m. 
March 9.
	 Tickets are $4 + tax. They 
can be purchased at http://
thebeltoniantheatre.com/
salado-high-school-film-
showcase/
	 The animated film Too 
Good to Be True by Mat-
thew Faulkner and Alanna 
Jones will also be shown. 
Thomas loves his old car, 
but when he gets in a car ac-
cident, he has to get a new 
car. Thomas buys the new 
Fast Car 9000 which has all 
the new technology. Thomas 
soon finds out that this new 
car is not so good after all.
	 Salado Film Squad is 
under the direction of Tim 
Cook.

Salado High School had four films screened at the Filmmakers State Festival Feb. 28 
and two won state awards: (from left) Madeline Krustchinsky, Rayne Polkowski, Ashley 
Ruiz, Heidi Kelley, Reagan Thrasher, Roxi Thrasher Bridget Golden. (Courtesy photo)

State-winning films get
special local showing

	 On Feb. 26 the Salado 
Police Department received 
information regarding 29 
year old Dixie McCollough, 
Salado High School Teach-
er’s Assistant, allegedly en-
gaging in sexual intercourse 
with Salado High School 
male students.
	 Salado Police Depart-
ment provided their infor-
mation to the Bell County 
Sheriff’s Department Spe-
cial Crimes Unit for further 
investigation.
	 At this time, there are two  
minor male alleged victims, 
ages 15 and 16.
	 This investigation is on-
going.
	 Anyone with information 
is encouraged to contact the 
Special Crimes Unit at 254-
933-6769.
	 The Special Crimes Unit 
contacted the Texas Educa-
tion Agency (TEA). They 
too are conducting an inves-
tigation on McCollough.
	 An allegation of an inap-
propriate relationship be-
tween a Salado high school 
staff member and a high 
school student was reported 
to Salado ISD Superinten-
dent Michael Novotny in 
the afternoon of Feb. 26. 
Dr. Novotny reported that 
the employment of the staff 
member was terminated on 
Feb. 27.

	 “We immediately began 
an investigation in coopera-
tion with the Salado Police 
Department, Child Protec-
tive Services, the Bell Coun-
ty Sheriff Department and 
the Texas Education Agen-
cy,” Dr. Novotny stated. “I 
terminated the employment 
of the staff member alleg-
edly involved so she is no 
longer an employee of the 
Salado Independent School 
District.”
	 “These allegations are of 
grave concern to us all. Tex-
as laws, Board of Education 
policies and the Educator’s 
Code of Ethics are all crystal 
clear on this matter,” he stat-
ed. “Yet, despite this clarity, 
individuals sometimes use 
extremely poor judgment in 
carrying out their responsi-
bilities to students, families 

and the community.”
	 “I have no tolerance for 
staff members who com-
mit these alleged transgres-
sions,” he stated. 
	 “In all cases, the safety 
and protection of our stu-
dents is the highest priority,” 
he stated.
	 “We have a talented, 
smart and dedicated faculty 
working here in the Salado 
Independent School District. 
The commitment of our em-
ployees to the students and 
families in Salado is strong,” 
he stated. “We are com-
mitted to taking swift and 
decisive action when it is 
warranted and work toward 
preventing any future trans-
gressions.”
	 This is the third time in 
the past six years in which 
allegations were made of an 
inappropriate relationship 
between a school staff mem-
ber and a student have been 
made.
	 In 2013,  former Salado 
ISD teacher Lisa Wagnon 
was placed on 10 years pro-
bation for Sexual Assault of 
a Child.
	 In 2014, former teacher 
and coach Marcos Rene 
Garcia received eight years 
deferred adjudication proba-
tion for having an improper 
relationship with a student.

Investigation continues in
inappropriate relationship case 

Dixie McCullough

	 Scott Cosper and Brad 
Buckley will face each other  
in the Republican Primary  
run-off on May 25 for the 
Texas House District 54 
while Tim Brown and Bobby 
Whitson will be on the run-
off ballot for Bell County 
Commissioner Precinct 2.
	 Saladoan Cliff Coleman 
will be the next Justice of the 
Peace for Precinct 2, edging 
out fellow Saladoan Rich-
ard Sapp in the Republican 
primary. Coleman received 
1,098, 51.48 percent of the 
2,141 votes cast in the race. 
	 The race for the Texas 
House District 54, which  
includes parts of Bell and 
Lampasas counties, is an 
extremely close one between 
one-term incumbent Scott 
Cosper and Brad Buckley. 
	 With 100  percent report-
ing, Cosper had   4,472 votes 
to hold a narrow edge over 
Buckley, who had 4,173. 
Larry Smith had 1,390.
	 In Bell County, Cosper 
had 3,160 votes, 45.71 per-
cent, while Buckley had 
2,848 and Larry Smith tal-
lied 905 votes.
	 They will be joined on 
the Republican primary run-
off ballot by Tim Brown 
and Bobby Whitson for Bell 
County Commissioner Pre-
cinct 2, representing Salado 
and Harker Heights and the 
eastern part of Killeen.
	 Tim Brown, currently 
serving his sixth term as 
Bell County Commissioner 
Precinct 2, received  1,949 
votes, 44.46 percent of the 
total ballots, while Bobby 
Whitson received 1,457 
votes and Brit Owen re-
ceived 978 votes.
	 Paul LePak and Jeff Park-
er will be in a run-off for 
District Judge, 264th Judi-
cial District. LePak received 
6,548 votes for 41.06 percent 
of the total while Parker re-
ceived 1,178.
	 Saladoan Gaylon Evans 
earned the nod to be County 
Treasurer, taking 55.07 per-
cent of the vote in the Re-
publican Primary with 8,141 
over Jeanette Compean’s 
6,641 votes.
	 Nancy Boston will con-
tinue as Chair of the Re-
publican Party, earning 70 
percent (10,497) of the votes 
cast over Zenia Warren’s 
4,424.
	 There were few if any 
close races in the Republican 
primaries as voters chose in-
cumbents over challengers 
by wide margins, putting 
U.S. Sen. Ted Cruz, U.S. 
Rep. District 31 John Carter, 
Gov. Greg Abbott, Lt. Gov. 
Dan Patrick, Land Commis-
sioner George P. Bush, Ag 
Commissioner Sid Miller 
Railroad Commissioner 
Christi Craddick and State 
Representative in District 55 
Hugh Shine on the ballots in 
November general election.
	 With 63 percent of the 
statewide precincts report-
ing, the Republican stance 
will continue to be a con-
servative one on the issues 
as Republican voters over-
whelmingly supported all 
of the 11 propositions on the 
ballot.
	 Prop. 1: Replace property 
tax system: 65% favor.
	 Prop. 2: Toll roads voter 
approval: 90% favor.
	 Prop. 3: Selecting Speak-
er of the House: 85% favor
	 Prop. 4: Screening new 
hires.: 90% favor.

	 Prop. 5: School choice tax 
credits: 78% favor.
	 Prop. 6: Bathroom pri-
vacy: 90% favor.
	 Prop. 7: Abolish abortion: 
68% favor.
	 Prop. 8: Voter fraud felo-
ny: 95% favor.	
	 Prop. 9: Completely re-
peal Obamacare: 87% favor.
	 Prop. 10: 4% cap on prop-
erty tax growth: 94% favor.
	 Prop. 11: No tax dollars 
for pro stadiums: 87% favor.
	 With about 70 percent 
of the precincts report-
ing at presstime, it appears 
that Beto O’Rourke is the 
Democratic choice for the 
top of ballot, to face Ted 
Cruz in the November gen-
eral election for U.S. Senate. 
O’Rourke had 61.59 percent 
of the vote. 
	 The Democrats appear 
split on their choice to face 
U.S. Rep. John Carter in No-
vember. That race is likely 
headed to a run-off as well. 
With a third of the precincts 
reporting as of press time, 
Mary Jennings “MJ” Hegar 
had about 44 percent of the 
vote and Christine Eady 
Mann had 34 percent of the 
vote.
	 The race for the Demo-
cratic nomination for Gov-
ernor will go to a run-off 
between Lupe Valdez and 
Andrew White.  With about 
67 percent of the state pre-
cincts reporting, Valdez has 
received 42.6 percent of the 
vote and White has received 
28 percent of the ballots.
	 Mike Collier holds a 
small lead for the Lt. Gov-
ernor nomination over Mi-
chael Cooper.

	 Joi Chevalier and Tim 
Mahoney are less than 3 per-
cent apart in the Comptrol-
ler race with Chevalier at 51 
percent.
	 Roman McAllen holds a 
17 percent advantage over  
Chris Spellmon in the Rail-
road Commissioner race.
	 The Democrats continue 
to be left of center in their 
proposition choices.	
	 Prop. 1: Right to public 
education and affordable 
college.  96% favor.
Prop. 2: Refinance student 
loans at 0% through Fed Re-
serve. 94% favor.
	 Prop. 3: Medicare-for-all. 
95% favor.
Prop. 4: Earned paid fam-
ily and sick leave and living 
wage: 96% favor.
	 Prop. 5: National jobs 
program to replace crum-
bling infrastructure through 
low interest, long-term 
bonds: 93% favor.
	 Prop. 6: Right to clean 
air, safe water and healthy 
environment: 99% favor.
	 Prop. 7: Life of dignity 
with no discrimination or 
harassment: 97% favor.
	 Prop. 8: Right to afford-
able housing? 92% favor.
	 Prop. 9: Automatic voter 
registration and other rights 
to vote: 95% favor.
	 Prop. 10: End of mass in-
carceration: 97 pecent favor.
	 Proposition 11: Just and 
fair immigration reform: 
94% favor.
	 Proposition 12: Fair tax 
system, businesses pay too: 
97% favor

State Rep. Scott Cosper Challenger Brad Buckley

Commissioner Tim Brown Challenger Bobby Whitson

Saladon Cliff Coleman will 
be elected  Bell County Jus-
tice of the Peace Precinct 
Two, having no Democrat 
opponent.

Saladoan Gaylon Evans 
will be elected Bell County 
Treasurer, having no Demo-
crat opponent.

Two local GOP races 
heading to run-offs
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Rich 
Lowry

Market & Economic
Update
By Jeffrey W. McClure

	 If John Kelly didn’t ex-
ist, President Donald Trump 
would have to invent him, 
and he wouldn’t be able to.
	 The chief of staff had a 
rocky couple of weeks with 
the imbroglio over ousted 
White House staff secre-
tary Rob Porter, but he is as 
close as it gets to an indis-
pensable man in the Trump 
White House.
	 Where else is the pres-
ident going to find some-
one whom he likes and 
respects (at least on most 
days), who can intimidate 
the White House staff into 
a semblance of order, who 
has experience in wielding 
responsibility in even more 
difficult circumstances, 
and who shares Trump’s in-
stincts?
	 The last of these is the 
reason why, more than any 
other, there has been a ma-
jor downdraft in Kelly’s 
press coverage. He went 
from “Trump’s Last Best 
Hope,” per Time magazine 
last August, to a bitter dis-
appointment. A writer at 
FiveThirtyEight wrote a 
piece the other day explain-
ing “How the Media Bun-
gled the John Kelly Story,” 
referring not to any specific 
story about Kelly, but to the 
overall sense that he’d be a 
restraining influence on the 
president.
	 Kelly’s boosters in the 
media had a fantasy that he 
would show up at the White 

Why John Kelly Is Irreplaceable

House and take Trump 
aside at some point and ex-
plain, “It is my solemn duty 
to advise you, Sir, to accept 
whatever immigration pro-
posal that Lindsey Graham 
backs, and failing that, my 
resignation letter will be on 
your desk in the morning.”
	 This didn’t accord with 
Kelly’s hawkishness as sec-
retary of the Department of 
Homeland Security. What 
most people had missed 
about Kelly is that he’s an 
Irish Catholic kid from 
Boston who shares Trump’s 
Northeastern working-class 
conservative sensibility that 
is tough-minded and impa-
tient with political correct-
ness.
	 Kelly took justifiable 
incoming over the Porter 
fiasco, which was badly 
mishandled. But it wasn’t 
the chief of staff’s respon-
sibility to bird-dog Porter’s 
security clearance. 
	 With all the negative 
press coverage of the Por-
ter fiasco, stories inevitably 
emerged of Trump’s think-
ing about a replacement for 
Kelly. If Trump were actu-
ally to dump him, it’d be his 
most destructive personnel 
move since firing FBI Di-

rector James Comey.
	 Trump wouldn’t get 
someone whom he admires 
as much. The president re-
spects military men and 
billionaires, and perhaps 
the former even a little 
more than the latter. Kelly, 
the Marine general who lost 
a son in Afghanistan, can 
speak to Trump peer to peer 
in a way no Washington po-
litico can.
	 Trump wouldn’t find 
someone else who is so 
clearly in it for the right 
reasons. Kelly didn’t want 
the position and repeatedly 
refused it when it was first 
offered. He has no interest 
in jockeying for his next big 
Washington job or in cash-
ing in. 
	 Trump wouldn’t find 
a comparable enforcer. 
Kelly’s military bearing 
and no-nonsense demean-
or serve him well in the 
cockpit of Trump world. 
His extensive leadership 
experience in even more 
complicated, high-pressure 
situations has prepared him 
for an environment in which 
chaos and the sense of cri-
sis constantly emanate from 
the top.
	 In short, it is Kelly or 
bust. Trump should consid-
er himself fortunate to have 
him, and avoid the fool’s 
errand of trying to find an 
improvement.
Rich Lowry is editor of the Nation-
al Review. © King Features Synd.

The Markets
 	 The S&P 500 Stock In-
dex (“SPX”), our preferred 
proxy for the U.S. stock 
market, closed out the week 
at 2691.25, down 2.4 per-
cent for the week, and down 
about 6.4 percent from its re-
cent high mark near the end 
of last month. It had shown 
signs of creeping back to 
a full recovery before the 
President’s announcement 
that he intended to impose 
large import tariffs on steel 
and aluminum. The good 
news is that the SPX remains 
up 0.66 percent year-to-date 
and 12.93 percent for one 
year. More on that below.
 	 The yield on the bench-
mark 10-year U.S. Treasury 
note was up to nearly 3 
percent earlier in the week 
but declined to close at 
2.86 percent following the 
President’s announcement, 
suggesting that economic 
growth may not accelerate as 
fast as it previously indicat-
ed. Oil prices declined from 
$64 early in the week to $61 
onFriday, again reportedly 
in reaction to the threat of a 
trade war and resulting slow-
down in economic growth.
The Economy
 	 The Commerce Depart-
ment reported that personal, 
after tax, income rose 0.9 
percent in January as the fed-
eral government saw about a 
$115 billion decline in tax 
receipts, but in an unusual 
reaction, consumer spend-
ing, adjusted for inflation, 
fell 0.1 percent in January. 
That change was mirrored 
by a rise in the personal sav-
ings rate from 2.5 percent in 
December to 3.2 percent in 
January. The Personal Con-
sumer Expenditures Index 
(PCE), the Federal Reserve’s 
preferred inflation indicator, 
rose 1.7 percent from last 
year but appeared to be ac-
celerating toward the end of 
the year. Housing pending 
sales were down in reaction 
to increased mortgage rates 
and a shortage of houses for 

sale. Jobless claims contin-
ued to fall and hit the lowest 
level since 1969.
 	 Federal Reserve Chair-
man Jerome Powell testi-
fied before Congress again 
during the week and once 
again expressed his ob-
servation that the econo-
my appears to be stronger 
now than last year. That, of 
course, suggested that the 
Fed might raise interest rates 
faster than had been expect-
ed. The consensus estimate 
moved closer to four, 0.25 
percent interest rate increas-
es in 2018 from the previous 
three. Those increases would 
put short-term interest rates 
at about 2.5 percent by this 
time next year. If that hap-
pens, longer-term interest 
rates are likely to rise apace. 
If the “spreads” remain as 
they are, it would be reason-
able to then see the 10-year 
Treasury approaching 4 per-
cent and longer-term interest 
rates rise accordingly.
 	 Higher interest rates slow 
economic growth as loans 
needed to fund business ex-
pansions or buy big-ticket 
items, like cars and houses, 
become more expensive. 
They are, though, an indica-
tor that loan demand is high, 
and that itself is an indicator 
of a faster-growing econo-
my. All of that is a normal 
process as our economy ac-
celerates into a full-fledged 
expansion. It also suggests 
though that the forecast we 
earlier reported calling for 
2019 to be at or near the high 
mark in this cyclical expan-
sion is more and more likely 
to be correct.
 	 The surprise was the 
President’s announcement 
of an impending 25 percent 
tariff on steel imports and 
10 percent on aluminum. A 
very significant portion of 

the things we manufacture 
and sell in America and ex-
port are at least in part made 
of steel and aluminum. If 
U.S. plants raise their prod-
uct prices to match the new-
ly increased import prices, 
that rise would filter through 
into significantly high-
er prices for domestically 
produced automobiles, air-
planes, homes, commercial 
buildings, tools, beer cans, 
and a host of other products. 
Higher prices for the same 
products is the definition of 
“inflation.” Higher inflation 
would force the Fed to raise 
interest rates higher, slowing 
our economy. More, it would 
increase the price to make 
goods for export, reducing 
either profits or sales. Ad-
ditionally, since Canada 
and Mexico are among our 
biggest sources of import-
ed steel and are our biggest 
export customers, the threat-
ened counter-tariffs could 
create a lot of pain. Canada 
and the European Union 
have already announced 
they will impose defensive 
tariffs if we follow through 
with our tariffs on Steel and 
Aluminum. One thing that 
could prematurely terminate 
this economic expansion 
(and bull market) would be a 
global trade war.
 	 The stock market reflect-
ed that view. Since early 
2017, corporate earnings 
have risen about 15 percent, 
but after considering the im-
plications of the tax cut and 
the tariff announcement, the 
SPX is now only up about 13 
percent for one year. That 
differential suggests that the 
market sees those actions as 
reducing earnings into the 
future and is a reaction to 
that perception. This issue is 
worth watching.

	 The safety and protec-
tion of our students is our 
highest priority.  The fol-
lowing is a summary of 
some of the training cours-
es that our employees com-
plete annually.
	 Sexual Harassment: 
Student Issues & Response: 
This course provides school 
personnel with information 
about sexual harassment in 
both student-to-student and 
adult-to-student situations, 
background to know the 
consequences of inappro-
priate behavior and what 
might happen when the ap-
propriate action isn’t taken, 
corrective actions that will 
help remedy sexual harass-
ment situations in an edu-
cation environment, related 
statistical data, and indica-
tors for identifying sexual 
harassing behaviors. 
	 FERPA: Confidentiali-
ty of Records: This course 
addresses training needs re-
lating to student education 
records. This course covers 
important legal terms re-
lated to the Family Educa-
tional Rights and Privacy 
Act (FERPA), the gener-
al responsibilities of staff 
members under FERPA, 
FERPA’s rules regarding 
confidentiality and disclo-
sure, and the rights of stu-
dents to access and inspect 
their own education records 
kept by the school.
	 Bullying: Recognition 
& Response: This course 
provides users with a better 
understanding of bullying 
behavior, as well as their 
obligations to help prevent 
bullying. Topics covered in-
clude bullying basics, iden-
tifying bullying behavior, 
how bullying works and ef-
fective ways to address the 
problem.
	 Child Abuse: Mandato-
ry Reporting: This course 
provides background in-
formation on the different 

Superintendent’s 
Corner
by Dr. Michael  Novotny

types of child abuse/child 
maltreatment. It offers 
training scenarios for phys-
ical abuse, neglect, sexual 
abuse, and emotional abuse, 
identifies indicators to as-
sist in abuse and neglect, 
states the legal responsibil-
ities of reporting and han-
dling disclosures.
	 Dating Violence: Iden-
tification and Prevention: 
In this course, staff mem-
bers learn how to recognize 
signs of abuse, take steps to 
prevent abuse and learn the 
correct procedures to safe-
guard students.
	 Youth Suicide: Aware-
ness and Prevention: The 
goal of this course is to 
provide staff members with 
information that will help 
them reduce the likelihood 
of suicide among students. 
This course covers the 
scope of the problem of 
youth suicide, common risk 
factors related to youth sui-
cide, successful strategies 
for youth suicide preven-
tion, the immediate steps a 
staff member should take 
if they encounter a student 
who is threatening suicide, 
and best practices for in-
tervention after a suicide 
(“postvention”).
	 Bloodborne Pathogen 
Exposure Prevention: 
The Bloodborne Patho-
gen Exposure Prevention 
course introduces the type, 
statistics and scope of the 
disease; guidelines for the 
clean up and handling of po-
tentially infectious wastes 
or contaminated materials; 
the risks associated with 
workers exposed to BBPs 
(including vaccination and 

reporting information); and 
delivers training designed 
to emphasize the practices 
of proper exposure control.
	 The “Sexual Harass-
ment: Student Issues & Re-
sponse” training described 
above does address inap-
propriate educator student 
relationships.  As a result 
of the recent allegations of 
improper conduct by a for-
mer high school employee, 
we are going to require em-
ployees to complete this ad-
ditional training this spring 
and every year annually:
	 Sexual Misconduct: 
Staff-to-Student: This 
course provides information 
about the obligation of ev-
ery staff member to provide 
an appropriate level of care 
for all students. Specifical-
ly, this course explores the 
definition of sexual miscon-
duct, the legal obligations 
of school staff members, 
signs of sexual misconduct 
by staff members and how 
to create clear professional 
boundaries that protect you 
as well as students.
	 We are also going to have 
a forensic psychiatrist, who 
is an expert in this field, 
provide additional training 
for our employees.
	 We have a talented, smart 
and dedicated faculty work-
ing here in the Salado In-
dependent School District.  
The commitment of our 
employees to the students 
and families in Salado is 
strong.  We are committed 
to taking swift and decisive 
action when it is warranted 
and work toward preventing 
any future transgressions.

S&P 500 index down 6.4% from high 

Safety and protection of our 
students highest priority
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Arm teachers with mental 
health tools not guns

to teach, protect and serve 
them. Fighting gunfire with 
gunfire is not the answer.  
	 Parents should be aware 
that our schools are at risk 
for this situation at any 
school, at any time.  In 
the days since the Florida 
shooting, there have been at 
least five accounts of young 
people in the Houston area 
making threats against a 
school, outlining plans for 
on-campus violence, and 
even bringing a gun on cam-
pus, resulting in high alerts 
and school lockdowns.  
	 Instead of allotting fund-
ing to have teachers and 
other educators go through 
special gun training, why 
not change the system, mak-
ing it mandatory and fiscally 
viable for all teachers, coun-
selors, and others who work 
in a Texas school district, to 
learn to protect themselves 
and students by using an 
arsenal of early identifica-
tion and prevention tools to 
identify, resource and refer 
young people with mental 
health concerns? 
	 Significant strides have 
been made in some dis-
tricts, but so much more 
needs to be done all over 
our state.  We desperately 
need to adopt system-wide 
changes.  Too many schools 
in our state are sorely un-
der-resourced, when it 
comes to behavioral health 
issues, with some having 
no counselors and others 
only one counselor trained 
to recognize mental health 

concerns in young people.  
The research shows that ex-
panding school counseling 
services in schools is asso-
ciated with improvements in 
mental health and behavior, 
but also in student learning.
	 Children are living in 
troubled times, and unfortu-
nately teachers and schools 
bear the brunt of many of 
these concerns.  As part of 
the solution in our region, 
Mental Health America of 
Greater Houston, through 
its Center for School Behav-
ioral Health, works collabo-
ratively with 26 public and 
charter school districts and 
more than 80 child-serving 
organizations, institutions 
of higher learning, commu-
nity stakeholders, advocacy 
groups, students and par-
ents, to develop and imple-
ment projects and policies 
that promote the wellbeing 
of school-age children, pre-
vent the downward trajec-
tory of untreated behavioral 
health concerns, and appro-
priately address the needs 
of children with behavior-
al disorders, as well as the 
needs of children who have 
experienced trauma.
	 By working together with 
concerned state officials, we 
can better support our public 
education system to ensure 
that the behavioral health 
and wellbeing of all students 
and educators are addressed 
through early detection and 
prevention programs.

By Alejandra Posada, M.Ed.
Interim President and CEO
Mental Health America of Greater 
Houston  
Janet Pozmantier, M.S., LPC, 
LMFT, RPT                                                 
Director, Center for School Be-
havioral Health at                                    
Mental Health America of Greater 
Houston  
and Stephen H. Linder, Ph.D.
Board Chair

Mental Health America of Greater 
Houston

	 The recent shooting at 
a Parkland, Florida high 
school has opened the con-
versation and has many of us 
struggling with what needs 
to happen to prevent another 
tragedy like this from hap-
pening again.  For a young 
person to even have such 
thoughts and feelings is un-
imaginable.  To have them 
actually follow through with 
these heinous acts is chill-
ing. However, assigning 
teachers the responsibility 
to bear arms on campus as a 
means of protection for stu-
dents and themselves is not 
the answer to address cam-
pus gun violence.  The risks 
of “collateral damage” from 
armed teachers in a shootout 
could result in a more disas-
trous situation.  While there 
is no single best solution to 
eliminate the risk of more 
tragedies, we believe that a 
compelling answer can be 
found in the early detection 
and prevention of mental 
health issues in our children.
	 In a nationwide State of 
Mental Health in Ameri-
ca - Youth Data report for 
2017, Mental Health Amer-
ica found that 11.25% of 
U.S. teens and pre-teens, 
aged 12-17, reported suffer-
ing from at least one major 
depressive episode in the 
past year. In Texas, 67.3% 
of young people with major 
depression did not receive 
any mental health treatment. 
That means that 6 out of 10 
in this age group, who have 
depression and who are most 
at risk of suicidal thoughts, 
difficulty in school, and dif-
ficulty in relationships with 
others, do not get the treat-
ment they need.
	 Clearly now, more than 
ever, it is important that, as 
a society, we take the mental 
health of school-age chil-
dren seriously, and invest 
time, resources and aware-
ness for prevention and 
early intervention.  We can-
not afford to test an “O.K. 
Corral” theory against the 
wellbeing of our children 
and the educators who work 

Cliff Coleman 
and the 

Coleman family 
thank the 
citizens of 

Salado, Bartlett 
and Holland for 

their support 
during this 
campaign

Thank You

Bruce A. Bolick, CPA
Got all your 2017 info?

Call for an Appointment
(254) 718-7299 or (254) 947-1040

560 North Main, Suite 4, Office 3
ACROSS FROM THE CIVIC CENTER

SaladoCPA@aol.com

Salado
254.947.8480

Temple
254.773.7750

Harker Heights
254.699.1102

Closing Offices 
by appointment only in 

Gatesville
Copperas Cove 

Jarrell

Buying or selling a home 
can be stressful, 

we are here to help

FCTTX.com

  

• AUTO • MOTORCYCLE• BUSINESS

• HOME • CONDO• RENTER

• LIFE

• COLLECTABLE   
  AUTO

• MOBILE HOMES• BOAT

• PERSONAL
  WATERCRAFT

• RECREATIONAL     

 

  VEHICLES

RITA ZBRANEK
254-947-0995
40 S. MAIN ST. STE. A • SALADO, TX 76571

www.farmersagent.com/rzbranek

DON’T COMPROMISE ON AUTO 
INSURANCE, GET FARMERS.

PERSONAL SERVICE YOU DESERVE. CALL TODAY. 

YOUR LOCAL FARMERS AGENT
CURRENTLY OFFERS SAVINGS FOR:

Mill Creek Cleaners

Quality Dry Cleaning, Laundry, 
Alterations & Custom Tailoring

213 Mill Creek Drive, Suite 200
Salado Plaza next to Brookshire Brothers

Mon-Fri 8-6 • Sat 9-2 • Closed Sunday
 (254) 947-0100
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Community Life

Dr. Travis Burleson, Senior Pastor

WEDNESDAY
5 p.m.  Fellowship Meal
5:30 p.m. Jr. High MIDWEEK
6 p.m.  Adult Bible Study
6 p.m. ESL
6 p.m.   Kingdom Kids (K - 6)
6 p.m.  Bible Drill (4 - 6)
7:07 p.m. High School MIDWEEK

www.fbcsalado.org
(254) 947-5465

Main St. at the Creek

SUNDAY
8:30 a.m. Classic Worship Service
9:45 a.m. Bible Study
11 a.m.    Contemporary 
    Worship Service

  

IH-35 at Blacksmith Rd.
947-5241 

Sunday
Bible Classes • 9 a.m.      Worship • 10 a.m.

Spanish Worship - Call Church for times

Wednesday
Bible Classes • 6:30 p.m.

The Salado Church of Christ
‘Shaped by His Cross, Sharing His 

truth, Showing His love.’ 

 “We invite you to worship 
with us at any available 
opportunity. You will find 
a group of sincere, God-
loving and Christ-exalting 
people, who will make you 
feel at home with our church 
family.    
  -Joe Keyes, minister

16258 Gooseneck Road,  Salado
Church service starts 10 am

(254) 947-7211
www.3ccowboyfellowship.org
Follow events on our website calendar

www.devereauxjewelers.com

Schanna  (254) 421-5173

Salado’s Hair Shop
213 Mill Creek Dr., Suite 160

Schanna  
(254) 421-5173

Salado’s Hair Shop
213 Mill Creek Dr., Suite 160

Salado’s Hair Shop
213 Mill Creek Dr., Suite 160

Schanna  
(254) 421-5173

Salado’s Hair Shop
213 Mill Creek Dr., Suite 160

Schanna  
(254) 421-5173

Salado’s Hair Shop
213 Mill Creek Dr., Suite 160

Schanna  
(254) 421-5173

	 Nick Adams will be the 
featured speaker at the 12th 
Annual Fine China Lun-
cheon March 22, sponsored 
by the Salado Area Repub-
lican Women. 
	 Adams is a 33-year-old 
Australian native and le-
gal immigrant to the Unit-
ed States of America.  He 
is an author, commentator 

Nick Adams, founder of F.L.A.G., Foundation for Liberty 
and America’s Greatness

and founder of F.L.A.G., 
Foundation for Liberty and 
America’s Greatness.  Ad-
ams’ non-profit organiza-
tion is dedicated to provid-
ing training at elementary, 
middle, and high schools 
(primarily public schools) 
to increase patriotic pride 
and bridge the major civics 
deficiency that currently 
exists.  The FLAG board 
includes luminaries such 
as Col. Allen West, Dennis 
Prager, Pete Hegseth, and 
many others.
	 He was appointed an 
Honorary Texan, with Gov-
ernor Perry making the for-
mal appointment in 2013. 
He is based in Arlington, 
TX. The public is invited to 
attend this event. 
	 Tickets must be pur-
chased by March 16. Cost is 
$30 per person. They may 
be purchased by mailing in 
a check for $30 to SARW, 
PAC; PO Box 373; Salado, 
TX 76571. 

Adams  to speak at 
SARW luncheon 

	 Twenty plus artists from 
Salado will be showing 
their work at the State Cap-
itol Building on April 13 
through April 20. Several of 
these artists are nationally 
and internationally known. 
This exhibit will feature 
paintings, sculpture, glass, 
mixed media, literature and 
music.
	 A reception will be held 	
Friday night, April 13, from 
6 p.m. to 8:30 p.m. to honor 
the artists and to thank Sal-
ado for its support.
	 A chartered bus will de-
part from the Civic Center 
at 5 p.m. and return between 
9:30 and 10 p.m. The seat-
ing is limited. Call Cathy 
Sands (254) 913-5468 for 
reservations.
	 The cost of the round trip 
bus ticket is $20 per person.
	 Salado was awarded the 
designation for the Cultural 
Art District several months 
ago by the Texas Commis-
sion of the Arts. 		
	 “This designation is sig-
nificant because it not only 
recognizes the talent and 
the creative spirit of Sala-
do, it also gives Salado the 
ability to present visual and 
performing art. We are ex-
tremely privileged to have 
received this designation,”  
said Jill Shipman
	 This event is sponsored 
by the Salado Cultural Arts 
District and State Represen-
tative Scott Cosper.

	 Larry Prellop was born 
and raised in Austin. His 
parents owned property 
on Lake Travis, where the 
youngster began his love of 
water. As a teenager, Prel-
lop attended school, went 
to work, and then spent his 
evenings painting while 

he watched television. His 
mother, who worked at the 
State Board of Insurance, 
would sell Prellop’s paint-
ings for $25 to $50 to her 
coworkers.
	 “This was the first time 
I realized I could make 
money as an artist”, he said. 
From that point on, Prellop 
began entering small arts 
and crafts shows through-
out Texas, with the goal of 
eventually becoming a gal-
lery artist. He credits Por-
firio Salinas, Robert Wood 
and A. D. Greer as the big-
gest influences on his work.
	 Eventually, numerous 
galleries began buying 
Prellop’s paintings. In 1979, 
his work was published by 
Scafa-Tornabene, a New 
York-based art publishing 
company. He is currently 
published by Modern Art, 
a European art publishing 
company.
	 Outside of Texas, Prel-
lop is known primarily for 
his seascapes, which depict 
the rugged impact and dra-
ma of the Pacific Ocean. 
His seascapes include light-
houses, ships and marine 
objects.
	 Once he opened his Sal-
ado gallery in 1995, he be-
gan to paint Hill Country 
bluebonnet scenes. “I could 
sell my seascapes world-
wide, whereas bluebonnet 
paintings sell mostly in 
Texas,” he explained.
	 Prellop’s paintings are 
mostly of nature. While 
he doesn’t paint people, he 
occasionally includes ani-
mals in his scenes. In addi-
tion, he doesn’t paint many 
buildings, although occa-
sionally barns or windmills 
are depicted. “I like to fo-
cus on the natural beauty of 
the scenes,” he explained.
	 In 2001, Prellop created 
a painting depicting a mag-
nificent Texas Hill Country 
scene for Keep Texas Beau-

tiful, the nonprofit state 
affiliate of Keep America 
Beautiful. The organiza-
tion honored Prellop and 
his work as a visual link 
between the environmental 
efforts of volunteers across 
the state the natural beauty 
of the Texas Landscape.
	 Prellop’s landscapes and 
seascapes are well known 
throughout Texas and the 
United States. His paintings 
are in the private collec-
tions of Governor Rick Per-
ry, former Texas governors 

such as Governor Briscoe 
and other prominent elect-
ed officials such as Senator 
Lloyd Benson and Con-
gressman Ken Marchant. 
His paintings are also in the 
corporate collections of Cri-
terion Corporation, South-
land Corporation, and the 
Texas Banking Association. 
His art is distinctly realistic 
whether he is capturing the 
quiet water of a hill country 
stream or the pounding surf 
of the Gulf of Mexico.

Artist Larry Prellop will be one of the artist showing at the State Capitol building.

Salado Artist reception at 
State Capitol April 13
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Dossman 
Funeral Home

2525 N. Main • Belton

IN SERVICE TO OUR FELLOW MAN

 933-2525
serving all of Bell County

DossmanFH.com

gracesalado.com  |  Sunday at 10:30am  |  5798 FM 2484 in Salado

A people of biblical faith,
eternal hope, and radical love.

St. Joseph’s 
Episcopal Church

881 North Main Street
947-3160

S t J o s e p h S a l a d o . o rg

Sunday School
Sun.  9 a.m.

Holy Eucharist
Sun.  10 a.m.

St. Stephen
Catholic 
Church

Mass Schedule
Tuesday - 6 p.m. 

Wed & Thurs - 8:30 a.m.
Friday - Noon

Saturday - 5:30 p.m.
Confesssions 4:30-5:15 p.m. 

or call for an appointment
Friday

Adoration (Holy Hour) 11 a.m.
Sunday

 (English) 9 a.m.
(Spanish) 11 a.m. 

Office Hours: Monday - Friday 
9 a.m. - Noon & 1:30 - 3 p.m.

601 FM 2268 
947-8037

www.saintstephenchurch.org

Religious Education
 Classes - Wednesday

 K thru 12th            5:30 - 8 p.m. 

Community LifeCommunity Life

Obituaries

Lobby
 Mon - Fri  9 a.m. - 3 p.m.

Drive-in
 Mon - Thur 7:30 a.m. - 4 p.m. 

 Fri  7:30 a.m. - 5:30 p.m.
Sat   9 a.m.- noon

Member FDIC

Main Street at 
Thomas Arnold Road, Salado

(254) 947-5852 fsbcentex.com 

Central Texas Heart and Soul

Rev. David N. Mosser
 650 Royal Street    
  (254) 947-5482

www.saladoumc.org 

Office hours:  
Mon - Fri 8:30 a.m. - 4 p.m.
Facebook.com/saladoumc

Sunday, March 11
9 am Worship Service in Worship Center Traditional

10 am Sunday School all ages

11:15 am Worship Service in Chapel Contemporary

5:30 pm Youth FourTwelve - contact office for location

Wednesday, March 14
NO EVENING PROGRAMS - SPRING BREAK

....serving those who love and remember

(254) 947-0066
949 West Village Road, Salado

BroeckerFuneralHome.com

Heritage Country Church
1st Anniversary Celebration

10 a.m. on March 31 

FESTIVITIES FOR ALL AGES
Easter Egg Hunt

Lunch & Live Music

9929 Lark Trail, Salado

	 The Salado United 
Methodist Church (SUMC) 
hosted the first Wild Game 
Dinner and Auction almost 
20 years ago as a means to 
help fund SUMC’s commit-
ments to several non-profit 
organizations in Bell Coun-
ty. The first events were 
held at the fellowship hall 
of the original SUMC site 
near I-35 and Thomas Ar-
nold Road. 
	 Today, the church has 
continuously expanded the 
list to more than 20 orga-
nizations, mostly located 
in Bell County.  Thanks to 

community donations and 
involvement, the outreach 
now includes missions as 
far away as Kenya and Be-
lize. The complete list of 
mission and outreach proj-
ects is available through 
the church office and will 
also be available at the Wild 
Game Dinner. 
	 The event outgrew the 
fellowship hall at Salado 
United Methodist Church, 
and is now held at Tenroc 
Ranch. This year the Wild 
Game Dinner is sched-
uled for Sunday, March 18,  
5-7:30 p.m. 

	 There will be both a 
live and silent auction that 
offers something for every-
one. Last year items includ-
ed jewelry, dinner packag-
es from great restaurants, 
hunting trips, golf outings, 
baseball tickets, fine art, a 
fire pit, concert passes to 
Johnny’s Outback, a Hen-
ry rifle, gift baskets of all 
kinds, Persian rugs and 
many donated items and 
services from local artisans 
and merchants (even a mo-
torcycle). 
	 You are invited to be 
a part of this community 

Wild Game Dinner & Auction sponsored 
by Salado United Methodist Church

event on March 18. If you 
would like to donate auc-
tion items, now that they 
are needed and appreciat-
ed.  All donations are tax 
deductible and 100% of all 
monies raised by the dinner 
and auction go directly to 
benefit the charities sup-
ported by the Outreach Pro-
grams of SUMC. 
	 For more information 
call the Salado United 
Methodist Church at 254-
947-5482, or Wild Game 
Dinner Committee Mem-
ber, Paul Cox at 254-563-
6308.

Janice Means, President 
of the Ladies Auxiliary, 
and Deborah Roberson, 
Auxiliary member, pres-
ent a $1,000 check to 
Kirt Hearne, President of 
Horizon Bank and to the 
Salado Community Foun-
dation.  The Ladies Aux-
iliary encourages other 
civic organizations, as well 
as individuals, to donate 
to the Salado Community 
Foundation to assist in the 
completion of the second 
Gateway sign.  

L-R Deborah Roberson, 
Kirt Hearne and Janice 
Means

Spc. 
Devon Michael Wulff	
	 FORT HOOD, Texas - 
Fort Hood officials have re-
leased the name of a Soldier 
who was found unrespon-
sive in his Fort Hood resi-
dence Feb. 28. The Soldier 
was transported to Scott & 
White Hospital and died 

March 3.
	 Spc. Devon Michael 
Wulff, 23, whose home of 
record is listed as Hicks-
ville, Ohio, entered ac-
tive-duty military service 
in August 2015 as an infan-
tryman and was assigned to 
12th Cavalry Regiment, 1st 
Armored Brigade Combat 
Team, 1st Cavalry Division, 
Fort Hood, since February 
2016.
	 Wulff deployed in sup-
port of the Republic of Ko-
rea from February through 
October 2016.
	 Wulff’s awards and dec-
orations include a National 
Defense Service Medal, 
Global War on Terrorism 
Service Medal, Korean De-
fense Service Medal, Over-
seas Service Ribbon and 
Army Service Ribbon.

	 The Heart of Texas 
Chapter of the Sons of the 
American Revolution will 
have its bi-monthly meet-
ing and program 10 a.m., 
March 10 at the Salado Li-
brary, 1151 N. Main St.  
	 The program will be  on 
“The American Revolution 
- The Winter Encampment 
of 1778 at Valley Forge”.  
The presentation will be 
by Compatriot Frank Rohr-
bough.  He will address the 
events leading up to the 
Winter Encampment, the 
challenges facing General 
Washington to house and 
feed his Army and the liv-
ing conditions in camp and 
the rebuilding the Army 
for the coming summer 

campaign of 1778. He has 
done extensive research on 
George Washington while 
he was the Commander in 
Chief of the Continental 
Army during the Ameri-
can Revolution.  Compatri-
ot Rohrbough is a retired 
Air Force Colonel with a 
30 year service record who 
lives in Boerne.  
	 Individuals interested in 
researching their ancestors 
going back the American 
Revolution, joining the lo-
cal chapter of the Sons of 
the American Revolution 
(SAR) or just interested in 

 Compatriot 
Frank Rohrbough

Rohrbough presents details on Winter Encampment at Valley Forge
American history are wel-
come to attend. The goal of 
the SAR is to honor our an-
cestors and perpetuate our 
American heritage.
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March 18, 2o18
5:oo - 7:3o PM
Tenroc ranch 

 saladoumc.org

Salado United Methodist Church

Wild 
GaMe 
dinner -Sample Dishes with:

venison, bison, elk, Aoudad,
wild boar,  quail, pheasant,  
white-wing dove, salmon, 
catfish  & rattlesnake

-Silent & Live Auctions

-Proceeds Benefit Salado UMC 
Missions & Outreach

-Free Event 

Brookshire Brothers

Floral 
Department
 947-8922

Comming Soon:
Trees & Shrubs

Flowering and Vegetable
Seed Packets are in

LASTOVICA
Fine Jewelers, Inc.

“Known for Service” 
Prompt In-Store Jewelry Repairs 

Diamond Sales • Custom Casting • Diamond 
Appraisal • Watch Repair • Diamond Setting 

Jewelry Repair
1202 S 31st St. & Ave. L • Temple

773-5772

Clinton and Ledia Harwell cut the ribbon to officially 
open The Barton House restaurant at 101 N. Main St. 
The Harwells, owner of Pignetti’s Restaurant in down-
town Temple, purchased the Salado property in October 
and have been renovating the historic 1860s era build-
ing. The Barton House was welcomed by members of 
the Salado Chamber of Commerce board of directors.  
Armando Escalera (second row, second from right) is 
the General Manager of the restaurant. The restaurant 
held a cocktail party on March 5 to introduce the new 
business to area residents. The restaurant will be open 
11 a.m.-9 p.m. Wednesdays and Thursdays (lunch and 
dinner), 11 a.m.-10 p.m. (lunch and dinner) Fridays, 10 
a.m.-10 p.m. Saturdays (brunch, lunch and dinner) and 
10 a.m.-4 p.m. Sundays (brunch). Reservations are not 
necessary but can be made at 254-947-0441. The Bar-
ton House has an extensive list of wines available to en-
joy with your meals and you can buy bottles of wine for 
off-premise consumption. (Courtesy photo)

	 Players in the 23rd Annu-
al Denver Mills Golf Tour-
nament on Monday, March 
19, at Mill Creek Country 
Club will have a chance this 
year to win a one-year lease 
of a 2018 Ford Focus do-
nated by Johnson Brothers 
Ford of Temple and $10,000 
to be split with Tablerock. 
The tournament benefits 
Tablerock Festival of Sala-
do, Inc.
	 “We are especially grate-
ful to have many sponsors, 
such as Johnson Brothers 

Ford, returning this year. 
Our loyal sponsors and 

players make this tourna-
ment successful,” Tourna-
ment co-chair Letta Meinen 
said.  “Many have support-
ed us for two decades! We 
also welcome new sponsors 
and players, who always 
add excitement to this fun 
event.”
	 “All American Chevro-
let in Killeen is sponsoring 
a hole and team again this 
year, and they generously 
donate their team sponsor-
ship every year so that Fort 
Hood soldiers can play,” 
said Denver Mills, a Ta-
blerock board member and 
volunteer as well as tourna-
ment namesake. 
	 So far, Meinen added, 
41 area businesses and in-
dividuals are sponsors, and 
10 teams are expected to 
play. To register to play or 
sponsor, email tablerock1@
aol.com or phone (254) 
913-3890. Sponsorships are 
$450 for a team/hole com-
bo, $400 for a team of four 
players, $150 for a company 
banner, and $100 to sponsor 
a hole or for an individual 
player entry.
	 Registration is from 
11:30 a.m. until 12:50 p.m. 
on March 19, with players 
moving to their assigned 
holes for a shotgun start at 1 
p.m. Prizes will be present-
ed from 5:30 to 6 p.m. Other 
prizes include $400 for the 
first place team, $200 for 
second place, and Salado 
Legends tickets for third. 
	 Since 1996, the tourna-
ment has raised more than 
$74,000 for Tablerock, 
which provides performing 
arts, such as Salado Leg-
ends and A Christmas Carol 
for Central Texas residents 
and visitors. Last year the 
tournament netted $7,548 
to help support Tablerock. 
Proceeds also helped pro-
vide $13,200 in college 
scholarships to 18 Central 
Texas students serving on 
the Legends cast or crew. 
Tablerock has given more 
than $171,000 in scholar-
ships to date. 
	 Legends, an outdoor 
musical drama about Sala-
do’s history, features more 
than 120 community actors 
and has been presented for 
25 consecutive summers at 
Tablerock’s Goodnight Am-
phitheater. Both Legends 
and its author, Jackie Mills, 
have received national rec-
ognition from the Library 
of Congress and the Insti-
tute of Outdoor Drama.       
	 Tablerock is a 501(c)3 
non-profit organization, and 
donations are tax deductible 
to the extent allowed by the 
IRS. For information about 
visit: http://tablerock.org/

Car lease and cash prizes
Hole-in-one prizes enhance 23rd 
Annual Denver Mills Golf Tournament 
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Give me FIVE!
5 Certi�catesof Deposit

5 High Rates

For limited time, R Bank is 
o�ering 5 SPECIAL Certi�cates 
of Deposit with HIGH rates and 

di�erent terms. 
Choose the one that �ts your 

�nancial needs.

36-month Special Certificate of Deposit
 2.53% Annual Percentage Yield¹

24-month Special Certificate of Deposit 
 1.92% Annual Percentage Yield²

18-month Special Certificate of Deposit 
 1.67% Annual Percentage Yield³

12-month Special Certificate of Deposit 
 1.51% Annual Percentage Yield⁴

6-month Special Certificate of Deposit 
 1.16% Annual Percentage Yield⁵

$50,000 minimum required to open account. This amount is also the minimum balance required to earn the quoted Annual 
Percentage Yield. Rate and APY are current as of publication date and are subject to change without notice. 1 - Interest Rate is 
2.50% /  2 - Interest Rate is 1.90% / 3 - Interest Rate is 1.65% / 4 - Interest Rate is 1.50% / 5 - Interest Rate is 1.15%. Substantial 
interest penalty for early withdrawl.   

Jarrell Banking Center
50 West FM 487 | Jarrell Texas | 76537
P: 512.598.9050 | www.RBankTexas.com

	 Salado Lady Eagles 
Track team won the Roasa 
Relays hosted by Holland 
March 1 with a total of 
138.333 points. Academy 
placed second with 125 
points and Thrall placed 
third with 116 points.
	 Reginia Deen placed 
first in the 100 Meter Dash 
with a time of 12.68. Janiah 
Del Rio placed fourth with a 
time of 13.41.
	 Kaia Philen placed sec-
ond in the 200 Meter Dash 
with a time of 28.43. Angie 
Sanders placed fourth with a 
time of 29.10.
	 Taylor Rich placed first 
in the 400 Meter Dash with 
a time of 1:04.01. Samantha 
Vargas placed second with a 
time of 1:06.24.
	 Jaci McGregor placed 
first in the 800 Meter Run 
with a time of 2:28.56.
	 Jaci McGregor placed 
first in the 1600 Meter Run 
with a time of 5:40.76.
	 Sammie Bourque placed 
fourth in the 100 Meter Hur-
dles with a time of 17.81. 
Lorna Fleet placed fourth 
with a time of 18.37.
	 Salado’s 400 Meter Re-
lay Team of Angie Sanders, 
Janiah Del Rio, Kaia Philen 
and Reginia Deen placed 
first with a time of 51:53.
	 Salado’s 1600 Meter 
Relay Team of Janiah Del 
Rio, Reginia Deen, Saman-
tha Vargas and Taylor Rich 
placed first with a time of 
4:22.68.
	 Kaia Philen placed first 
in the Long Jump with a 
distance of 14-11 1/2. 

Angie Sanders hands off to Kaia Philen in the 4 X 100 
Meter Relay. The girls won the gold. (Courtesy photos)The pack was way behind Jaci McGregor.

Roasa Relays: Girls 
bring home gold

	 Landry Rogers placed 
second in the Discus with a 
distance of 99-2 1/2. 
	 Lorna Fleet placed 
fourth in the High Jump 
reaching a height of 4-6.
	 Presley Maddux placed 
second in the Pole Vault 
reaching a height of 9-6.

JV Girls 4th
	 Salado JV Girls Track 
Team placed fourth in the 
Roasa Relays hosted by 
Holland March 1 with a total 
of 82 points. Holland won 
the meet with 174 points.
	 Mia Patton placed first 
in the 200 Meter Dash with 
a time of 29.21.
	 Nena Vero placed first 
in the 800 Meter Run with a 
time of 2:50.65.
	 Lily Lougheed placed 
fifth in the 1600 Meter Run 
with a time of 7:08.08.
	 Lily Lougheed placed 
second in the 3200 Meter 
Run with a time of 15:19.24.
	 Salado’s 400 Meter Re-
lay Team of Ashley Voelter, 
Jorja Washington, Megan 
Manibusen and Mia Patton 
placed third with a time of 
58:38.
	 Salado’s 800 Meter Re-
lay Team of Ashley Voelter, 
Jorja Washington, Megan 
Manibusen and Mia Patton 
placed first with a time of 
1:57.34.
	 Salado’s 1600 Meter Re-
lay Team of Ashley Voelter, 
Jorja Washington, Megan 
Manibusen and Nena Vero 
placed first with a time of 
4:45.81.

	 Salado Varsity Boys 
Track placed second in the 
Roasa Relays hosted by 
Holland March 1 with 117 
points. Holland won the 
Meet with 120 points.
	 Cade DePoy placed 
sixth in the 100 Meter Dash 
with a time of 11.66.
	 Wade Woods placed first 
in the 400 Meter Dash with 
a time of 53.79.
	 Hunter Haas placed first 
in the 800 Meter Run with a 
time of 2:08.65.
	 Hunter Haas placed first 
in the 1600 Meter Run with 
a time of 4:53.46; Horacio 
Huerta placed second with a 
time of 5:17; Trey Graham 
placed third with a time of 
5:18.87.
	 Horacio Huerta placed 
first in the 3200 Meter Run 
with a time of 11:22.62.
	 Holden Ford placed first 
in the 110 Meter Hurdles 
with a time of 14.68.
	 Salado’s 800 Meter Re-
lay Team of Quade Brown, 
Holden Ford, Chase Har-
well and Gage Robinson 
placed first with a time of 
1:34.52.
	 Salado’s 1600 Meter Re-
lay Team of Quade Brown, 
Chase Harwell, Gage Rob-
inson and Wade Woods 
placed second with a time 
of 3:41.22.
	 Holden Ford placed 
fourth in the Long Jump 
with a distance of 17-6’ 
1/2”.
	 Juan Castillo placed 
third in the Discus with a 
distance of 102.
	 Holden Ford placed 
third in the Triple Jump with 
a total distance of 39’-10 
1/4”.

JV Boys 3rd
	 Salado JV Boys Track 
placed third in the Roasa 
Relays hosted by Holland 
March 1 with 128 points. 
Jarrell won the Meet with 
137 points.

	 Logan Pitts placed third 
in the 400 Meter Dash with 
a time of 1:00.68.
	 Logan Rickey placed 
second in the 800 Meter 
Run with a time of 2:17.02. 
Chris Ortiz placed fourth 
with a time of 2:19.28.
	 Logan Rickey placed 
first in the 1600 Meter Run 
with a time of 5:14.06. 
Grant Sellers placed second 
with a time of 5:30.52.
	 Grant Sellers placed first 
in the 3200 Meter Run with 
a time of 11:59.46. Cole 
McKinney placed fifth with 
a time of 12:28.
	 Dustin Frisby placed 
fifth in the 110 Meter Hur-
dles with a time of 21.96.
	 Wesley Hernandez 
placed second in the 300 
Meter Hurdles with a time 
of 48.19.
	 Salado’s 400 Meter Re-
lay Team of Clayton Zak, 
Dustin Frisby, Greg Wash-
ington and LaTrelle Jenkins 
placed fourth with a time of 
50:12.
	 Salado’s 800 Meter 
Relay Team of Baldimore 
Rodrick, Cade Scallin, La-
Trelle Jenkins and Noah 
Mescher placed first with a 
time of 3:51.50.
	 Salado’s 1600 Meter 
Relay Team of Cade Scal-
lin, Clayton Zak, LaTrelle 
Jenkins and Noah Mescher 
placed first with a time of 
3:51.50.
	 Wesley Hernandez 
placed fifth in the Long 
Jump with a distance of 16’.
	 Blake Marshall placed 
third in the Discus with 
a throw of 81’-11”. Trey 
Schaub placed sixth with a 
distance of 79’-7”.
	 Cade Scallin placed 
first in the High Jump with 
a height of 5’-4”. LaTrelle 
Jenkins placed sixth with a 
height of 5’-2”.
	 Kole Maedgen placed 
first in the Pole Vault with 
a height of 9’-0”. Preston 
Culp placed second with a 
height of 8’-6”.

Boys take silver
at Roasa Relays
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Ceiling Fans | Light Fixtures | Window Treatments | Home Decor

The Shade Shop
230 North Main Street #102 

(254) 290-7000
TheShadeShopSalado.com

Ceiling Fans | Light Fixtures 
Window Treatments | Home Decor

The Shade Shop
230 North Main Street #102 

(254) 290-7000
TheShadeShopSalado.com                       

WE BUY SCRAP GOLD & SILVER

108 E FM2410, Suite G  -  Harker Heights

Gold, Silver, Coins, Currency & Jewelry
(254) 699-2646

Locally Owned - Salado Resident

BUY    SELL   TRADE

CUSTOM UPHOLSTERY 
FREE PICK UP & DELIVERY 

515 E. VET. MEMORIAL BLVD. HARKER HEIGHTS

254-699-6105

Douglas B. Willingham, D.D.S.
(254) 947-5242

Main and Thomas Arnold Road
www.saladodentistry.com

Get Straighter, Whiter 
Teeth, Without Removing 

Healthy Tooth Structure

A 
Life-Changing 

Smile 
is in 

Your Future

675 W. Hwy 190 • Belton • 254.939.6464 
www.surfacesource.net

Flooring • Cabinets    
Countertops
Remodeling Services
and so much more 

www.FirstEyeCareSalado.com
Medical Insurance Accepted          Vision Plans Accepted

Vision Eye Examinations
Medical Eye Examinations

Designer Eyewear
Sunglasses

Contact Lenses Services
Eye Emergencies

Eye Disease Management
Red Eyes, Dry Eyes

Eye Allergies

(254) 781-0041

418 N. Main Street  

Salado’s eye doctor
Dr. Sarah Forrest, O.D.

NOW OPEN

AnimAl medicAl 
of SAlAdo

lindA Quirk, dvm         lindSAy fultz, dvm

Small Animal Medicine • Vaccinations 
Wellness Exams • Dentistry • Surgery
Spay/Neuter • Bathing & Boarding 
Microchipping • Royal Canin Diet

Heartworm/Tick & Flea Prevention 
  House Calls

Taking the Best Care
of Your Best Friend!

(254) 947-8800   www.saladovet.com
16231 FM 2115 Salado, TX 76571 (I-35 Exit 282)

Mon-Fri 7:30 a.m. -5:30 p.m.
Sat 7:30 - 11:30 a.m.  

Sun 4-5 p.m. pickup only

213 Mill Creek Dr. Ste. #100, Salado
(254) 947-4008

Monday - Saturday 8 a.m. - 6 p.m.
Sunday 10 a.m. - 4 p.m.

Salado’s Authorized Dealer

SPRING PLANTS 
arriving NOW!

	 Drew Dobbins pitched 
a no-hitter against the 
host team West Trojans on 
March 2  to lead the Salado 
Eagles in the West Base-
ball Tournament March 1-3, 
where the Eagles went 2-0-
2. The Eagles also forced 
the #2-ranked Robinson 
Rockets to accept a tie in 

the final game of the tour-
nament on March 3.
Robinson	 4
Salado		  4
	 Salado outhit the Rob-
inson Rockets in the final 
game of the tournament, 
tying the state-ranked team 
4-4. The Eagles scored 
three runs in the bottom of 
the seventh to force the tie.
	 Mac Miller led off the 
bottom of the final frame 
with a double to left field. 
Kade Maedgen walked to 
put runners on first and sec-
ond. 
	 Belton Farr singled to 
load the bases. 
	 Ryan Oaks walked, 
pushing a runner over home 
plate to bring the score to 
2-4.

	 Dustin Hawes fouled 
out for the first out with the 
bases still full. 
	 Farr was picked off by 
the pitcher and short stop at 
second before Jacob Wilk 
walked to load the bases 
again.
	 Rustin Hale hit a ground-
er, but an error by the third 
baseman allowed Hale to 
reach first and courtesy 
runner Parker Shelley and 
Oaks to score, tying the 
game at 4-4.
	 With runners at the 
corners, Robinson got out 
of trouble when Dobbins 
fouled out for Salado.
	 Max Marin got the start 
for Salado, pitching four 
innings, allowing four hits 
and four runs and striking 
out three. Maedgen pitched 
in relief, allowing no runs 
on one hit and striking out 
two. 
	 Salad outhit Robinson 
eight to five. Garnering hits 
for the Eagles were Farr 
and Miller, two hits each 
and Rustin Hale, Dobbins, 
Dustin Heath and Maedgen, 
one hit each. Oaks, Wilk, 
Hale, Dobbins and Maed-
gen all had 1 RBI in the 
game.	
Salado		  5
West		  0
	 Salado shut out West in 
the penultimate round of 
the tournament as Dobbins 
threw 90 pitches over six 
innings, striking out 10 bat-
ters on Mach 2. He also al-
lowed no run but the Salado 
defense committed two er-
rors, preventing an other-
wise perfect game on the 
mound for Dobbins.
	 Salado scored four runs 
in the third and a run in the 
sixth.
	 Jacob Wilk batted 3-for-
4 and scored a run to lead 
the Eagles. Rustin Hale 
went 2-for-3, scoring a run.  
Dobbins was 2-for-4 at the 
plate with 2 RBI and scor-
ing a run.

	 D Hawes and D Heath 
both had hits for Salado. 
Heath had 2 RBI.
Caldwell	 1
Salado		  5
	 Salado Eagles beat 
Caldwell 5-1 on Feb. 26 
with Garrett Knight getting 
the win on the mound.
	 Knight pitched four in-
nings, allowing three hits 
and no runs. He struck out 
seven batters.
	 The Eagles had seven 
hits in the game, led by Ja-
cob Wilk, who went 2-for-2 
and had 1 RBI.
	 Knight, Rustin Hale, 
D Hawes, D. Heath, Drew 
Dobbins and Ryan Oaks 
all had a hit in the game. 
Hawes, Knight and Mac 
Miller each batted in a run.
China Spring	 1
Salado		  1
	 China Spring scored a 
run in the top of the sixth to 
tie Salado in the first round 
of the West tournament on 
March 1.
	 Both teams had six hits 
in the game.
	 Ryan Oaks led Salado, 
going 2-for-4 at the plate. 
Dobbins was 1-for-2 with 
an RBI for the Eagles.
	 Jacob Wilk, D Hawes, 
and Mac Miller all had one 
hit.
Del Valle	 1
Salado		  3
	 Salado beat Del Valle 
3-1 in a non-district game 
Feb. 26.
	 The Eagles scored runs 
in the first, third and sixth 
innings.
	 Ryan Oaks scored two 
runs on one hit and a walk.
	 Jacob Wilk batted 3-for-
3 to lead Salado, knocking 
in 3 RBI including a homer.
	 Dustin Heath also had a 
hit for the Eagles.
	 Drew Dobbins pitched 
four innings, striking out 
seven batters and allowing 
no hits. Max Marin and Ja-
cob Wilk also allowed no 
hits on the mound for Sala-
do, striking out two each.

Eagles force #2 Robinson to tie, 
Dobbins no-hits West Trojans

	 Salado Lady Eagle Soft-
ball team starts district 
this week after taking first 
in the Silver Bracket of 
the Franklin Tournament 
March 1 and 3, where the 
girls faced six good teams.
Lady Eagles	 6
Caldwell	 9
	 Junior pitcher Becca 
Dockray was issued the 
first-round loss against 
Caldwell on March 1, as 
Salado fell 6-9.
	 Piper Randolph came in 
to close the game, getting 
two strikeouts.
	 Freshman Reese Preston 
led the girls at the plate, go-
ing 2-for-2 with 3 RBI.
	 Sophomore Breigh Oli-
ver also went 2-for-2 and 
had an RBI.
	 Randolph was 1-for-2 
with an RBI.
	 Sophomore Chris Wil-
son was 1-for-3 with an 
RBI.
	 Randolph and Oliver had 
two steals each in the game.
Lady Eagles	 6
Milano		  2
	 Salado bounced back 
from the loss to beat Milano 
6-2. Senior pitcher Bailey 
Tindell threw eight strike-
outs to earn the win on the 
mound for Salado.
	 Dockray led the girls at 
the plate, going 3-for-3 with 
2 RBI.
	 Wilson was 2-for-2 with 
2 RBI.
	 Freshman Rylee Oborski 
was 1-for-2 with 2 RBI. She 
also stole three bases.
	 Sophomores Erin Faske, 
Liz Ford, Wilson and Oliver 
all had stolen bases in the 
game. 
Lady Eagles	 11
Bruceville-Eddy	1

	 Salado smoked Brucev-
ille-Eddy 11-1 in the third 
round of the tournament. 
Tindell and Randolph each 
had a strikeout as Tindell 
got the win and Randolph 
came in to close.
	 Oliver was 2-for-2 
knocking in an RBI and 
scoring three runs.
	 Wilson hit a home run as 
she went 2-for-3 at the plate. 
She had 3 RBIs and scored 
three runs.
	 Sophomore Marissa 
Gonzalez was 2-for-3 with 
2 RBI.
	 Oliver and Faske stole 
three bases while Dockray 
and Randolph stole two 
bases each.
Lady Eagles	 20
A&M Cons. JV	 0
	 The Lady Eagles crushed 
A&M Consolidated JV 
squad 20-0 in the fourth 
round with Tindell pitching 
four strikeouts for the win. 
Randolph pitched in relief 

with one strikeout.
	 Preston led the team at 
the plate as she went 2-for-3 
and knocked in 3 RBI.
	 Oliver batted 3-for-3 and 
stole four bases. 
	 Wilson was 2-for-3 with 
two doubles.
	 Dockray was 2-for-3, 
stealing five bases.
	 Faske batted 1-for-1, 
earned two walks and stole 
three bases.
	 Senior Abbie James was 
1-for-2 and stole two bases.
Salado		  4
Milano		  3
	 Salado beat Milano 
4-3 in an international tie-
breaker. Faske scored the 
winning run on an error.
	 Dockray pitched nine 
strikeouts in earning the 
win on the mound.	
	 Oliver was 1-for-3, lead-
ing the team with three 
steals.
	 Wilson was 1-for-3 with 
an RBI.

	 Freshman Janiah Del 
Rio was 1-for-3.
	 Freshman Amanda Can-
tu was 1-for-2.
	 Ford was 1-for-2.
	 Faske had a stolen base 
and scored the winning run 
on an error.
Salado		  14
Blooming Grove	4
	 The Lady Eagles breezed 
past Blooming Grove 14-4 
in the Championship Game.
	 Dockray had six strike-
outs in the win on the 
mound.
	 She led the girls, batting 
3-for-3 with three RBI.
	 Wilson and Ford were 
3-for-4 at the plate.
	 Ford, Del Rio and Obor-
ski each knocked in 2 RBI.
	 Preston and Faske had 1 
RBI each.
	 In the tournament, the 
girls had 48 steals.

Lady Eagles take 1st in silver at Franklin

Salado Lady Eagles are (top row, from left) Coach Jodee Preston, Coach Derek Brown, 
Reese Preston, Chris Wilson, Liz Ford, Lorena Perez, Head Coach Ashton Cooper, Bec-
ca Dockray, Erin Faske; (bottom row, from left):  Rylee Oborski, Amanda Cantu, Breigh 
Oliver, Janiah Del Rio and Jorja Washington.  Not pictured: Bailey Tindell, Abbie James, 
Marissa Gonzalez and Piper Randolph. (Courtesy Photo)
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The Mortgage You Need - The Service You Expect
• Competitive Rates
• Fixed and Adjustable Rate Mortgage Loans
• Conventional, FHA, VA & USDA Financing
• Mortgages for Home Owners and Investors
• Home Equity Loans

Lorraine Basham, Sr. Loan Officer
Registered Mortgage Loan Orginator
NMLS #415114

CALL TODAY FOR YOUR 
FREE MORTGAGE CONSULTATION

(254) 760-0534 cell
(254) 947-3454 office

40 North Main, Suite C, Salado, TX
lorraineb@fairwaymc.com

All loans subject to credit approval

Copyright©2016 Fairway Independent Mortgage Corporation. NMLS#2289. 4801 S. Biltmore Lane, Madison, WI 
53718, 1-877-699-0353. All rights reserved. This is not an offer to enter into an agreement. Not all customers will 
qualify. Information, rates and programs are subject to change without notice. All products are subject to credit and 
property approval. Other restrictions and limitations may apply. Equal Housing Lender. 

Alton D. Thiele PC
Serving Central Texas Since 1979

• Tax Return Preparation & Planning
• Small Business Accounting Service
• Accounting & Auditing Service
• Business Counsulting
• Payroll Check Processing & Reporting
• Tax-Exempt Organization Consulting
• Quickbooks Installation & Consulting
• Retirement Planning

Alton D. Thiele, CPA
Kevin S. Cowan, CPA

254-939-0701 alton@adtcpa.com
toll free 1-800-772-7043
300 E Ave C, Belton

adtcpa.com

Finney Insurance Agency

(254) 939-5751

Home  |  Auto   |  Life  |  Liability   |  Commercial  |  Farm  |  Ranch

Agent Allison Finney

820 S. Main Street, Belton
Allison@finneyinsurance.com

6 weeks to 12 years Christian Environment
TSR Certified Preschool

+160 years staff experience

THE PLAY YARD PRESCHOOL

Come Learn & Grow With Us 

15299 S IH 35, Salado
Drop off & Pick up
at Salado ISD

947-1153

FULL SERVICE SMALL ANIMAL HOSPITAL
SMALL & EXOTIC ANIMAL MEDICINE

SURGERY & WELLNESS EXAMS
AFFORDABLE EMERGENCY CARE

(254)947-8058

IH 35 & FM 2484
1848 N. Robertson Rd

www.saladoveterinaryhospital.com

Salado Veterinary Hospital
M - F     24 hours
walk-ins after 6 p.m.

Saturday
1st & 3rd

15% off Office Visits for: 
Military, Teachers,

First Responders and Seniors 65+
20% off your first office visit 

for new clients or new pets

Salado High School will have four boys powerlifters competing in the Texas High 
School Powerlifting Association Region 2 Div. 2 Regional Championships to be held 
on March 10 in Temple. They are (from left to right) Horacio Huerta, 114 lb. weight 
class, Connor Cook, 181 weight class, Tommie Barker, 220 lb. weight class and Ryan 
Starritt, 220 lb. weight class. The boys powerlifting team is coached by Alan Haire. 
(Courtesy photo)

	 Salado JV Eagles al-
lowed just one run over the 
span of four games, win-
ning their own baseball 
tournament last week.
	 The JV Eagles shut 
out Del Valle 13-0, led by 
Ethan Scott, who scored 
two runs and had two hits. 
Nader Smien scored three 
runs and had one hit, Kon-
nor Baird, two runs, one hit;  
Hunter Bales, three runs, 
one hit; Jake Markham- 1 
run, 1 hit; Hunter Howton, 
one run and a double and 
Chase Alexander, one run.
	 Caldwell scored the only 

run against Salado in the 
tournament as the Eagles 
breezed past them 6-1 in 
the second round. Konnor 
Baird and Hunter Bales 
both boomed triples and 
scored a run to lead Sala-
do. Jake Markham also hit 
a triple for Salado. Scoring 
for the Eagles were Clayton 
Zak, one run, one hit, Caleb 
Self, one run, Chase Alex-
ander, one run and Stuart 
Lastovica, one run.
	 The Eagles blanked 
Newman 5-0. Earning extra 
base hits were Nader Smien, 
a triple and a run scored, 

and Ethan Scott, a double 
and a run scored. Also scor-
ing were Konnor Baird, one 
run, one hit, Hunter How-
ton, one run, one hit and 
Chase Alexander, one run. 
Jake Markham had two hits 
and Hunter Bales had one 
hit.
	 Salado blanked Cop-
peras Cove 5-0 in the final 
round of the tournament. 
Ethan Scott led the team 
with two runs and a double. 
Also scoring were Caleb 
Self, one run, single, Hunter 
Howton, one run and Car-
son King, one run, a single. 

JV Eagles sweep their tourney

Two Salado Lady Eagles 
Powerlifters (shown at 
right) medaled at the Re-
gional tournament on 
March 3: Reginia Deen, 
third place in 132 lb. 
class and Samantha Var-
gas, third place in 105 
lb. class. Also competing 
were Morgan Mays, ninth 
place in 97 lb. class, Do-
rislynn Edmondon, sixth 
place in 198 lb. class and 
Austyn Montemayor, ninth 
place in 198 lb. class (Courtesy photo)

Salado Eagle tennis team 
members competed in the 
Llano tournament recently 
with the following place-
ments (at right, from left 
to right) Paula Aviles, first 
place girls singles, Tyler 
Edmondson, second place 
boys singles, and Caroline 
Dabney, girls consolation. 
The Salado tennis team is 
coached by Kenny Mann.
(Courtesy photos)

Three Salado cheerleaders earned 4A Academic All-State honors (from left to right):  Kate Kyburz, Mikalann Hayslip 
and Haley Howton. Three of the team members earned 4A Academic All-State honors: Kyburz, Hayslip and Ashlen 
LaCanne (far right). The cheerleading squad is coached by Charla Kelley. (Photo by Royce Wiggin)
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104 Copper Lane, Jarrell  512-746-2333
105 Western Sky Trail, Jarrell 512-598-3900

4802 Moreland Drive, Georgetown 512-868-8300

KIDS’ ZONE  
Learning Center

NOW ENROLLING

CONSTRUCTIVE
LEARNING 

AHEAD

FAMILY-OWNED CHILDCARE CENTERS
SERVING AGES 0 TO 12 YEARS

CHILDREN ARE A GIFT FROM GOD -PSALM 127:3 

SALADO

Member 
FDIC

Go !  Eagles  Go!
We stand behind our home town teams

Now Accepting New Patients

Kevin DeLane
orthodontist

485 Thomas Arnold Road
saladoorthodontics.com
(254) 947-4011

860 N. Main  254-947-5050
c21bb.com

Good Luck from your ‘Home’ Team

Please call for an appointment (254) 947-3309
1325 N. Stagecoach Road

Your time is valuable! Save a trip and time. 

Ace
Pest and Lawn

Locally Owned and Operated 
Licensed by the Structural Pest Control Board TPCL #12512

Customer 
Satisfaction 
Guaranteed

Free Estimates 947-4222

	 Salado Lady Eagles are 
in first place in district soc-
cer after shutting out Flor-
ence 13-0 and Jarrell 7-0 
last week.

Lady Eagles	 13
Florence	 0
	 The varsity girls soc-
cer team crushed Florence 
13–0 March 2 in the final 
home game for the Lady 
Eagles. 
	 Aubrey Heffner scored 
the hat trick with three 
goals. Also scoring goals 
for the Lady Eagles were 
Allison Carnahan, two, 
Reilly Stewart two, Tyler 
Pierce, two and Ashlen 
LaCanne, Hannah Reavis, 
Lydia Smith and Reagan 
Morreale, one goal each. 

	 Salado Eagles will fin-
ish district soccer in a road 
game against Academy on 
March 9. They sit atop the 
district after beating Flor-
ence and Jarrell last week.
Eagles		  5
Florence		
1
	 Salado improved to 6-0  
in District 25-4A and 13-5-
1 overall with a 5-1 win at 
home against the Florence 
Buffaloes on March 2.
	 In the First Half the first 
goal came from Manuel 
Tonchez, assisted by Nicho-
las Lemus. The second goal 
came from Kaden Smien, 
assisted by Constantinos 
Loullis, who scored the 
third goal as well, assisted 
by Brandon Rodriguez. 
	 The second half had two 
goals. The first coming 
from Javier Chavez assisted 
by Jack Spradlin, the final 
goal came from Jake Wal-
rath, assisted by Brandon 
Rodriguez.

Eagles 		  5
Jarrell		  0
	 The varsity Eagles shut 
out Jarrell 5-0 on the road 
Feb. 27.
	 Kaden Smien scored the 
first goal, assisted by Con-
stantinos Loullis. 
	 Manuel Tonchez was 
assisted by Jack Spradlin. 
Those two switched roles 
for the third goal.
	 The remaining two goals 
were unassisted scores by 
Armondo Castillo, and 
Brandon Rodriguez.
	 The shutout was a shared 
effort from Trey Sheppard 
and Feerman Vitolas, as 
the defense secured its 10th 
shut out of the season.
JV Boys		 1
Jarrell JV	 0
	 The Junior Varsity boys 
defeated Jarrell 1-0 with 
the goal being scored MJ 
Garcia, assisted by Aaron 
Wilkerson. The shut out 
was shared by Ben Sun-
shine and Lucas Morvant.

	 Assists were recorded by 
Ashlen LaCanne, Hannah 
Reavis, Lauren Wilson, and 
Reagan Morreale.

Lady Eagles	 7
Jarrell		  0
	 The Lady Eagles varsi-
ty squad handled the Jar-
rell Lady Cougars on their 
home turf, shutting them 
out 7-0 on Feb. 27.
	 Tyler Pierce led the 
girls with two goals. Also 
scoring goals were Ashlen 
LaCanne, Aubrey Heffner, 
Hannah Reavis, Lauren 
Wilson, and Reagan Mor-
reale. 
	 Madison Spradlin  and 
Hannah Reavis both had 
two assists in the match.

Kaden Smien scored the first goal in the Salado Eagles’ 
shut out of Jarrell last week. (Photo by Lee Lougheed)

Eagles dominate district

Lady Eagles JV	3
Florence JV	 0
	 Salado Lady Eagles shut 
out the Florence Lady Buffs 
JV on the road Feb. 27 to 

hold on to first place in the 
district.
	 Goals were scored by 
Maddy Wade, two, and Lily 
Lougheed, one.

Lily Lougheed scored a goal against Florence. 
(Photo by Lee Lougheed)

Lady Eagles alone
at top of district

	 Salado 8th Grade Boys 
Track placed third in the 
Salado Jr. High Invitation-
al March 5 with 78 points. 
Troy won the meet with 154.5 
points.
	 100 Meter Dash: Ethan 
Johnson, sixth, 13.09.
	 400 Meter Dash: Ethan 
Bagley, second, 1:01.66.
	 800 Meter Dash: Adan 
Giral, sixth, 2:35.96.
	 1600 Meter Run: Isaac 
Huerta, sixth, 6:01.84.
	 2400 Meter Run: Isaac 
Huerta, second, 9:23.67.
	 110 Meter Hurdles: Nolan 
Williams, first, 18.44; Boden 
Savage, second, 18.48.
	 300 Meter Hurdles: 
Boden Savage, fourth, 50.12.
	 400 Meter Relay: Ethan 
Johnson, Chase Joiner, Alan 
Medina and Nolan Williams, 
fourth, 52.20.
	 800 Meter Relay: Ethan 
Johnson, Chase Joiner, Alan 
Medina and Nolan Williams, 
fourth. 52.20.
	 800 Meter Relay: Hunter 
Foster, Alan Medina, David 
Ochoa, Brady Wilson, fourth, 
1:54.63.
	 1600 Meter Relay: Ethan 
Bagely, Adan Giral, Boden 
Savage and Nolan Williams, 
fourth, 4:14.33.
	 Shot Put: Hunter Foster, 
sixth, 32’-8”.
	 Discus: Beau Hill, fifth, 
99’-8”.
	 High Jump: Nolan Wil-
liams, second, 5’-2”.
	 Pole Vault: Brian Rose, 
fifth, 7’-0”.
	
Salado 8th Grade Boys Track 
placed fifth in the Roasa Re-
lays hosted by Holland Feb. 
26 with 45.5 points. Acade-
my won the meet with 113.5 
points.
	 100 Meter Dash: Ethan 
Johnson, third, 12.88.
	 400 Meter Dash: Ethan 
Bagely, second, 1:01.92.
	 800 Meter Run: Adan Gi-
ral, fourth, 2:41.18.
	 1600 Meter Run: Ben 
Raines, sixth, 6:20.59.
	 2400 Meter Run: Ben 
Raines, sixth, 9:55.56.
	 110 Meter Hurdles: Nolan 
Williams, third, 17.72; Boden 
Savage, fifth, 18.93.
	 400 Meter Relay: Ethan 
Johnson, Alan Medina, Blake 

Volk, Nolan Williams, fifth, 
50.96.
	 800 Meter Relay: David 
Ochoa, Boden Savage, Blake 
Volk and Brady Wilson, sixth, 
1:52.25.
	 1600 Meter Relay: Ethan 
Bagley, Adan Giral, Braydon 
Sumners, third, 4:21.66.
	
Salado 7th Grade Boys Track 
placed first in the Salado 
Jr. High Invitational March 
5 with 137 points. Acade-
my placed second with 116 
points.
	 100 Meter Dash: Drew 
Bird, fifth, 13.61; Tanner 
Agee, sixth, 13.71.
	 400 Meter Dash: Noah 
Self, fourth, 1:04.33.
	 800 Meter Run: Ryland 
Woods, sixth, 2:54.55.
	 1600 Meter Run: Ryan 
Novotny, fourth, 5:53.86.
	 2400 Meter Run: Ryan 
Novotny, second, 9:16.20; 
Brooks Dabney, third, 
9:36.42; Jake Rechfertig, 
fifth, 9:50.91.
	 110 Meter Hurdles: Drew 
Gilmore, first, 21.60; Nathan 
Hanscom, fourth, 23.23; Jake 
Day, sixth, 23.42.
	 300 Meter Hurdles: Ki 
Hayes, third 55.37; Drew 
Gilmore, fifth, 58.40.
	 400 Meter Relay: Tan-
ner Agee, Adam Benavides, 
Drew Bird and Nathan 
Hanscom, second, 55.29.
	 800 Meter Relay: Tan-
ner Agee, Nathan Hanscom, 
Cade Strickland, Darius Wil-
son, third, 1:58.50.
	 1600 Meter Relay: Drew 
Bird, Ki Hayes, Noah Self 
and Darius Wilson, second, 
4:33.85.
	 Shot Put: Aidan McCann, 
first, 31’-3 1/2”.
	 Triple Jump: Caden 
Strickland, second, 31’-1 
1/4”.
	 High Jump: Noah Self, 
second, 4’-6”; Darius Wilson, 
third, 4’-6”.
	 Pole Vault: Ki Hayes, 
first, 6’-0”.

Salado 7th Grade Boys Track 
placed first in the Roasa 
Relays hosted by Holland 
Feb. 26 with 119 points. Jar-
rell placed second with 101 
points.
	 100 Meter Dash: Drew 
Bird, third, 13.52; Seth Rea-
vis, fifth, 14.00.
	 200 Meter Dash: Adam 
Benavides, second, 28.84; 
Alex Villafranco, fourth, 
30.02.
	 400 Meter Dash: Noah 
Self, first, 1:03.38; Tanner 
Agee, fourth, 1:09.30.
	 800 Meter Run: Ryland 
Woods, fifth, 2:53.19.
	 1600 Meter Run: Ryan 
Novotny, fourth, 5:59.69; 
Jake Rechfertig, fifth, 
6:21.62; Brooks Dabney, 
sixth, 6:27.28.
	 2400 Meter Run: Ryan 
Novotny, first, 9:11.27; Jake 
Rechfertig, third, 9:45.14; 
Brooks Dabney, fifth, 9:54.46.
	 110 Meter Hurdles: Drew 
Gilmore, first, 20.84; Nathan 
Hanscom, second, 20.99.
	 300 Meter Hurdles: Ki 
Hayes, third, 55.12; Drew 
Gilmore, fifth, 57.30.
	 400 Meter Relay: Tanner 
Agee, Drew Bird, Nathan 
Hanscom and Noah Self, 
fourth, 54.52.
	 800 Meter Relay: Nathan 
Hanscom, Seth Reavis, Ca-
den Strickland and Darius 
Wilson, third, 1:58.99.
	 1600 Meter Relay: Adam 
Benavides, Drew Bird, Ki 
Hayes and Noah Self, third, 
4:38.52.
	
	

Jr. High Boys Track
run in Holland, Salado

Jr. High Girls Track run in Holland, Salado
	 Salado 8th Grade Girls 
Track placed first in the Salado 
Jr. High Invitational March 5 
with 119 points. Jarrell placed 
second with 109.666. points.
	 400 Meter Dash: Jayden 
Goodnight, fourth, 1:11.89.
	 1600 Meter Run: Anna 
Lesley, second, 6:35.05; Anne 
Marie Gil., 6:53.28.
	 2400 Meter Run: Anna 
Lesley, second 10:39; Anne 
Marie Gil., fourth, 11:03.
	 100 Meter Hurdles: Darci 
Pryor, second, 18.21; Caelen 
Teer, fifth, 20.11.
	 300 Meter Hurdles: Avery 
Fossum, third, 54.46; Darci 
Pryor, fourth, 55.36.
	 400 Meter Relay: Avery 
Fossum, Eishen Young, Mia 
Saulter and Raleigh Meraz, 
third, 56.65.
	 800 Meter Relay: Eishen 
Young, Lily Hildebrand, Mia 
Saulter and Raleigh Meraz, 
second, 2:01.23.
	 1600 Meter Relay: Dar-
ci Pryor, Eishen Young, Mia 
Saulter and Raleigh Meraz, 
second, 4:48.61.

	 Long Jump: Eishen Young, 
fourth, 14’-1”.
	 High Jump: Lily Hildeb-
rand, second, 4’-2”; Lainey 
Taylor, third, 4’-0”.
	 Pole Vault: Jenna Hanscom, 
third, 6’-6”; Jasmine Hanscom, 
third, 6’-6”; Isabel Morter, 
fifth, 6’-0”.

Salado 8th Grade Girls Track 
placed second in the Roasa Re-
lays hosted by Holland Feb. 25 
with 73 points. Holland won 
the Meet with 75 points.
	 200 Meter Dash: Lily Hil-
debrand, sixth, 31.84. 
	 400 Meter Dash: Jayden 
Goodnight, fourth, 1:14.28.
	 1600 Meter Run: Anna 
Lesley, first, 6:27.68.
	 2400 Meter Run: Anna 
Lesley, first, 9:50.31; Anna Ma-
rie Gil., second, 10:42.75. 
	 100 Meter Hurdles: Darci 
Pryor, second, 17.12; Caelan 
Teer, fourth, 18.62.
	 300 Meter Hurdles: Avery 
Fossum, second, 54.46; Darci 
Pryor, fourth, 56.72.
	 800 Meter Relay: Eishen 

Young, Lily Hildebrand, Mar-
cie Pittman and Mia Saulter, 
second, 2:05.40.
7th Grade Track Results	
	
	 Salado 7th Grade Girls 
Track placed second in the 
Salado in the Salado Jr. High 
Invitational March 5 with 126 
points. Jarrell won the Meet 
with 191 points.
	 100 Meter Dash: Camille 
Brown, second, 14.82.
	 200 Meter Dash: Alex 
Dworaczyk, second, 30.85.
	 400 Meter Dash: Ellie 
Mescher, third, 1:10.19.
	 800 Meter Run: Natalie 
Burleson, fourth, 2:54.69.
	 1600 Meter Run: Ashlyn 
Williams, sixth, 6:46.59.
	 2400 Meter Run: Ashlyn 
Williams, fourth, 10:37.84; 
Kate Neas, sixth, 10:51.63. 
	 100 Meter Hurdles: Katey 
Bartek, first, 19.01; MaKayla 
Bush, fifth, 20.41.
	 300 Meter Hurdles: Hei-
di Teichelman, fourth, 58.18; 
Payton Brazzil, fifth, 59.73; 
MaKayla Bush, sixth, 1:02.08.

	 400 Meter Relay: Alex 
Dworaczyk, Ellie Mescher, Jor-
dan Dawson and Katey Bartek, 
first, 57.65.
	 800 Meter Relay: Brook 
Ellithorp, Camille Brown, Ha-
leigh Wilk and Harley Drouil-
lard, fifth, 2:12.34.
	 1600 Meter Relay: Alex 
Dworaczyk, Ellie Mescher, Ha-
leigh Wilk and Katey Bartek, 
third, 4:52.13.
 	 Shot Put: Alyssa Goodwin, 
third, 24’-6”; Madison Gra-
ham, sixth, 22’-4”.
	 Discus: MaKayla Bush, 
second, 59’-10”.
	 Triple Jump: Natalie 
Burleson, second, 27’-7 3/4”; 
Haleigh Wilk, third, 27’6 3/4”.
	 High Jump: Alex 
Dworaczyk, third, 3’-10”; Alli-
anna Boenker, 3’-10”.

Salado 7th Grade Girls Track 
placed second in the Roasa Re-
lays hosted by Holland Feb. 26 
with 89 points. Jarrell won the 
Meet with 113 points.
	 100 Meter Dash: Harley 
Drouillard, sixth, 15.00.

	 200 Meter Dash: Alex 
Dworaczyk, fourth, 31.61.
	 400 Meter Dash: Ellie 
Mescher, third, 1:11.16.
	 800 Meter Run: Natalie 
Burleson, third, 2:50.65.
	 1600 Meter Run: Ashlyn 
Williams, third, 6:48.63; Na-
talie Burleson, fourth, 6:50.28. 
	 2400 Meter Run: Ashlyn 
Williams, fourth, 10:24.78.
	 100 Meter Hurdles: Katie 
Bartek, first, 19.77; MaKayla 
Bush, third, 20.93; Brooke El-
lithorp, sixth, 21.87.
	 300 Meter Hurdles: Heidi 
Teichelman, third, 59.34.
	 400 Meter Relay: Alex 
Dworaczyk, Haley Piatak, Jor-
dan Dawson and Katie Bartek, 
second, 57.81.
	 800 Meter Relay: Angel 
Van de Plas, Camille Brown, 
Carissa Witmer and Haleigh 
Wilk, fourth, 2:11.09.
	 1600 Meter Relay: Ellie 
Mescher, Jordan Dawson, Ka-
tie Bartek and Peyton Brazzil, 
third, 4:56.56.
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Open for Lunch and Dinner
Brunch Saturday and Sunday 11 am - 3 pm
Closed Monday & Tuesday

213 MILL CREEK DR. #195    254.699.3933 

FREE Pelvic Health Screenings 
Thurs., 3/29 from 10 am– 4pm 

HOW? HEALTHY PEVLIC FLOOR MUSCLES 

 LAUGH  WIT HOUT LEAKING  

Magnolias 
of Salado

#1 Salado Square | Main Street  
254-947-0323 | magnoliasofsalado.com

DEE’S ANTIQUES
New owner

seeks
new dealers.
Call now to reserve your space
Various booth sizes available.

512.632.0798
702 N Main Salado

	 Decee Cornish and four 
of his fellow storytellers 
will give a concert 7-9 p.m. 
March 24 at the Goodnight 
Amphitheater at Tablerock 
in Salado. The ticket gate 
will open at 6:30 p.m. to 
purchase tickets to the 
show:  $10 for an adult and 
$5 for children 12 and un-
der.   
	 The Concession stand 
will also open at 6:30 p.m. 
for snacks, sandwiches and 
drinks.  
	 In case of rain the con-
cert will be on the inside 
stage behind the Main Am-
phitheater stage.
	 On the afternoon of 
March 24, from 1-3 p.m. 
at the Salado Public Li-
brary there will be a free 

workshop presentation by 
the five Storytellers  and a 
sign-up for area storytellers 
to organize a Bell County 
Storytellers League.   
	 You may also sign-up for 
the organization of the Bell 
County Storytellers League 
at Tablerock before and af-
ter the concert.  
	 Cornish is an award win-
ning Storyteller!   He is a 
five time Texas State Story 
telling Champion, a Tex-
as Commission of the Arts 
Touring Artist, Texas Li-
brarian Association Advo-
cate, Five Time Chair of the 
TLA Storytelling Round 
Table, a Program Provider 
for the Education Service 
Centers State of Texas and 
the 2015 National Storytell-

ing Network, “Storyslam” 
Champion and a member 
of the Tejas Storytelling 
Association.   He grew up 
in Houston, received his 
education as a member of 
the US Armed Forces.  In 
2004 Dee Cee was awarded 
the U.S. President’s Com-
mission on the Arts and the 
Humanities recognizing his 
work with the Coming Up 
Taller Award. 
    	For more information or 
price for group attendance 
call Jackie Mills at 254-
947-9205.     If you are in-
terested in having the five 
Tejas Storytellers present at 
your school while they are 
in Bell County March 22-
23, you may call  Jaye Mc-
Laughlin at 817-320-5046.

	 With sold-out national 
tours, a social media fol-
lowing of more than 6.5 
million, and YouTube views 
exceeding 100 million, 
Granger Smith has amassed 
a rabid audience, while 
building a truly ground-
breaking career. 
	 He will perform at John-
ny’s Outback to kick off the 
2018 Lone Star Music Se-
ries. Early ticket sales are 
$15 per person. Tickets are 
available at the gate for $20 
per person. Gates open at 6 
p.m. on March 31.
	 Other confirmed concert 
dates for the Lone Star Mu-
sic Series include the Randy 
Rogers Band on April 7, the 
Lonestar Music Legends 
Music Fest featuring Bran-
don Rhyder on April  13 
and William Clark Green 
on June 26.
	 Smith released When the 
Good Guys Win in the fall 
of 2017, debuting at #2 No. 
2 on Billboard’s Top Coun-
try Albums.
	 Happens Like That was 
the first release from the al-
bum, which follows the suc-
cess of Remington, his first 
release via Wheelhouse Re-
cord.
	 Granger’s previous al-
bum, Remington, released 
March 2016 via Wheelhouse 
Records, claimed the No. 1 
spot on the iTunes country 
album chart on release day 
and garnered him the No. 
1 debut for first week sales 
via Nielson Soundscan. 
	 Remington, produced 

by Granger Smith and 
Frank Rogers, featured 
the hit single “Backroad 
Song,” which landed the 
No. 1 spot at country radio 
(Billboard Country Air-
play, Mediabase and Music 
Row charts). Granger also 
received a BMI Country 
Award for writing, produc-
ing, publishing (Climbing 
Windmills) and performing 
“Backroad Song.” The fol-
low up smash, “If The Boot 
Fits,” reached the Top 5.
	 Granger was nominated 
in the Best New Country 
Artist category for the 2017 
iHeartRadio Awards taking 
place from the Forum in 
Los Angeles on March 5, 
2017. Granger was also in-
cluded in the 2017 crop of 
artists honored to perform 
at the CRS “New Faces” 
show in Nashville in Febru-
ary 2017. Last year, he went  
on tour with Luke Bryan on 
the “Huntin’, Fishin’, And 
Lovin’ Every Day Tour this 
fall.
	 Granger’s “YEE YEE 
NATION” headlining na-
tional tour consistently sold 
out and broken attendance 
records and merchandise 
records at nearly every ven-
ue over the past two and a 
half years. He performed at 
some of the country’s big-
gest festivals throughout 
the year and was recently 
on tour with both Flori-
da Georgia Line and Luke 
Bryan.
	 Granger’s comical coun-
try boy alter-ego, Earl Dib-

bles Jr., has its own fanatical 
following and garnered him 
a weekly segment called 
“Dip ‘Em and Pick ‘Em” 
on CBS Sports Network’s 
“Inside College Football,” 
in which he has appeared 
for the past four seasons. 
Granger has even been rec-
ognized by Variety for be-
ing the brainchild behind 
Earl Dibbles Jr. (among 
other character alter-egos 
including Donny Cowboy 
and Live with Lionel) and 

named one of their annual 
and lauded “10 Comics to 
Watch for 2016.”
	 Granger has been lauded 
by outlets like New York 
Times, Variety, Forbes, 
MusicRow, Rolling Stone, 
Billboard, Huffington Post, 
Taste of Country and Rare 
Country, among many oth-
ers. 
	 He has appeared on 
Jimmy Kimmel Live!, the 
Today Show and Fox & 
Friends.

Granger Smith will kick off Johnny’s
Outback’s Lone Star Music Series

Granger Smith will perform at Johnny’s Outback on 
March 31. (Courtesy photo)

DeCee Cornish, other storytellers
take stage March 24 at Tablerock

DeCee Cornish is a five-time Texas Storytelling Champion. He and four others will 
take the stage at Tablerock. (Courtesy photo)
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Inn on the Creek • 602 Center Circle 
(254) 947-3828

tuesday - thursday happy hour

Best view
& cocktails 

in town

 1109 W. Village Rd, Salado (behind Sonic)                            

Monday thru Saturday         10 a.m. to 9 p.m.

Liquor Store

(254) 947-7117

Salado’s Finest Selection of Domestic, 
Import, Commercial, and Craft Beers

Sláinte

Village of Salado Calendar of Events

THURS - SAT 10 - 5 SUN 12 - 5 MON 10 - 5
CLOSED TUES & WED       947-3355

751 Stagecoach Road  I-35 frontage road North
Clean Restrooms

SALADO ANTIQUE MALL
and Bee’s Antiques

Thousands of Antiques, Collectibles and Primitives in a unique and inviting atmosphere

The Original Salado Market Days
9-5 on the 2nd weekend - Don’t miss March 10 - 11

Follow us on FaceBookSaladoAntique Mall.com

21 North Main in the Salado Square

(254) 947-3688

Breakfast & Lunch
Sandwich • Soup • Salad 

Gourmet Coffee • Espresso • Smoothies
Homemade Breads & Bagels

WED - SAT   9 - 4 
SUN 10 - 4

MON   9 - 4 
closed Tuesday

LIVELY
COFFEE
HOUSE
& 
BISTRO

21 North Main in the Salado Square

(254) 947-3688

Breakfast & Lunch
Sandwich • Soup • Salad 

Gourmet Coffee • Espresso • Smoothies
Homemade Breads & Bagels

LIVELY
COFFEE
HOUSE
& 
BISTRO

WED - SAT   9 - 4 
SUN 10 - 4

MON   9 - 4 
closed Tuesday

21 North Main in the Salado Square(254) 947-3688

BREAKFAST & LUNCH
Sandwich • Soup • Salad 

Gourmet Coffee • Espresso 
Smoothies

Homemade Breads & Bagels

LIVELY
COFFEE
HOUSE
& 
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WED - SAT   9 - 4 
SUN 10 - 4    MON   9 - 4 

closed Tuesday
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COFFEE
HOUSE
& 
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21 North Main in the Salado Square

(254) 947-3688

Breakfast & Lunch
Sandwich • Soup • Salad 

Gourmet Coffee • Espresso • Smoothies
Homemade Breads & Bagels

WED - SAT   9 - 4 
SUN 10 - 4

MON   9 - 4 
closed Tuesday

LIVELY
COFFEE
HOUSE
& 
BISTRO

21 North Main in the Salado Square

(254) 947-3688

Breakfast & Lunch
Sandwich • Soup • Salad 

Gourmet Coffee • Espresso • Smoothies
Homemade Breads & Bagels

WED - SAT   9 - 4 
SUN 10 - 4

MON   9 - 4 
closed Tuesday

Fridays Thru March 23
	 St. Stephen Catholic 
Church Lenten Fish Fry, 
5:30 – 7:30 p.m. at St. 
Stephen’s Parish Hall. $10 
plate with proceeds ben-
efiting St. Stephen Youth 
Group
Thru March 24
	 Read Across America 
project at Salado Public 
Library. Passports avail-
able at the front desk.
March 9 - 10
	 Blow Your Own Beer 
Mugs for St. Patrick’s 
Day at Salado Glass-
works. Book your times 
online at saladoglass-
works.com
March 8
	 Salado Ladies Auxil-
iary Meeting, 9:30 a.m. 
refreshments, meeting 
at 10 a.m. at the Salado 
Church of Christ Activity 
Center. program: Jay and 
Mary Ford of Lone Star 
eBikes
March 9 - 16
	 Salado ISD Spring 
Break, noon release on 
March 9	
March 10
	 Heart and Hands Min-
istries food and clothing 
pantry, 9 - 11 a.m. at 
Salado Plaza Shopping 
Center. Donation/volun-
teer info: 947-5465
March  10 - 11
	 Salado Market Days, 
9 a.m. - 5 p.m. at Salado 
Antique Mall
March 10
	 Asanas & Ales, 10 a.m. 
at Barrow Brewing Co

March 11
	 Daylight savings time 
begins, 2 a.m., set your 
clock forward one hour
March 12
	 Children’s Story and 
Craft Time, 11 a.m. at 
Salado Public Library. 
info: (254) 947-9191
March 12
	 Salado Village Artists 
meet: Knitters 1 - 3 p.m.  
and Stitchers 1:30 - 4 
p.m. at Salado Village 
Artists Building
March 12
	 Classified advertis-
ing deadline for Salado 
Village Voice, noon. info: 
classifieds@saladovilla-
gevoice.com
March 13
	 Salado Village Artists 
meet, 9 - 11 a.m.  brush 
art, crafting and needle 
work at Salado Village 
Artist building
March 13
	 Salado Ladies Auxil-
iary meeting, 9:30 a.m. 
Social and 10 a.m. Meet-
ing at Salado Church of 
Christ Activity Center
March 13
	 Sit and Knit, 10 a.m. 
- noon at Salado Public 
Library. info: (254) 947-
9191
March 13
	 Salado Rotary Club, 
11:30 a.m. at Johnny’s 
Steaks and Barbecue 
March 13
	 Salado Community 
Chorus practice, 6 p.m., 
Salado Civic Center, info: 
saladochorus.com

March 14
	 Salado Lions Club, 
11:30 a.m., Salado Civic 
Center
March 15
	 Salado Chamber of 
Commerce Board Meet-
ing, 8:30 a.m. at the 
Visitors Center
March 15
	 Village of Salado 
Board of Aldermen 
Workshop Session, 6:30 
p.m. at Municipal Build-
ing
March 15
	 Salado Writers, 7 - 8 
p.m. at Salado Public 
Library
March 15
	 Priest’s Pint, 6:30 p.m. 
at Barrow Brewing Co

March 16-17
	 Blow Your Own Beer 
Mugs for St. Patrick’s 
Day at Salado Glass-
works. Book your times 
online at saladoglass-
works.com
March 17
	 Variety’s Kites for 
Kids, 11 a.m. - 4 p.m. 
at Peaceable Kingdom, 
19051 FM2484 . Free 
family event, blankets 
and coolers welcome. No 
pets. 
March 17
	 Sutton-Grant wedding 
celebration, noon toast 
at Barrow Brewing Co. 
The community is invit-
ed to celebrate with the 
newlyweds. Food trucks: 
Korean Kravings and 
Check Point Germany. 
Live music
March 17
	 Bell County Star Par-
ty, 8 - 11 p.m. at Overlook 
Park on Stillhouse Hollow 
Lake, 3740 FM1670. Reg-
istration recommended at 
centexastronomy.org
March 18
	 Wild Game Dinner, 
5 - 7:30 p.m. at Tenroc 
Ranch. Sponsored by 
Salado United Methodist 
Church. Free event, dona-
tions accepted, proceeds 
benefit SUMC Outreach 
and Missions
March 19
	 Children’s Story and 
Craft Time, 11 a.m. at Sal-
ado Public Library. info: 
(254) 947-9191
March 19
	 Denver Mills Golf 
Tournament to Benefit 
Tablerock 1 p.m. at Mill 
Creek Golf Course, $100 
entry fee:  (254) 947-9205
March 19
	 Salado Village Artists 
meet: Knitters 1 - 3 p.m.  
and Stitchers 1:30 - 4 p.m. 
at Salado Village Artists 
Building
March 19
	 Salado United Method-
ist Women, 5:45 p.m. at 
Salado United Methodist 
Church Room 117
March 19
	 Salado Democrats, 
7 p.m. at Salado Public 
Library
March 19
	 Salado Masonic Lodge 
Stated meeting, 7:30 p.m. 
at Salado Masonic Lodge. 
Dinner at 6:30 p.m.
March 20
	 Salado Village Artists 
meet, 9 - 11 a.m.  brush 
art, crafting and needle 
work at Salado Village 
Artist building
March 20
	 Sit and Knit, 10 a.m. 
- noon at Salado Public 
Library. info: (254) 947-
9191

March 20
	 Salado Rotary Club, 
11:30 a.m. at Johnny’s 
Steaks and Barbecue 
March 20
	 Salado Community 
Chorus practice, 6 p.m., 
Salado Civic Center, info: 
saladochorus.com
March 20
	 Bell County Genealog-
ical Society Meeting, 6:30 
p.m. at Temple Public 
Library
March 21
	 Mah Jongg at Salado 
Public Library, 10 a.m.-2 
p.m. 
March 22
	 Salado Area Republi-
can Women’s Fine China 
Luncheon, 11:30 a.m. at 
the Blue Heron of Tenroc. 
info: (254) 760-2456 or 
ddentry13@gmail.com
March 23
	 Wildflower Weekend 
Pub Crawl. info: salado.
com
March 23
	 Salado 4th Friday 
Sip and Shop, 5 - 8 p.m. 
across Salado
March 23
	 Chocolate Workshop, 
10:30 a.m. at Salado 
Public Library. speaker: 
Letta Meinen, pre-reg-
istration required (254) 
947-9191
March 23
	 Royal Street Art Walk 
(RAW),  6 - 9 p.m. info: 
royalstreetartwalk.com
March 23
	 RAW featured artist 
Tomas Fierro and the Ty-
ler Stuckey Band, 7 p.m. 
at Barrow Brewing Co

March 23-24
	 Blow Your Own Easter 
Eggs at Salado Glass-
works. Book your times 
online at saladoglass-
works.com. 
March 24
	 Heart and Hands Min-
istries food and clothing 
pantry, 9 - 11 a.m. at Sala-
do Plaza Shopping Center. 
Donation/volunteer info: 
947-5465
March 24
	 Asanas & Ales, 10 a.m. 
at Barrow Brewing Co
March 24 - 25
	 Texas Wine & Rogue 
Art Fest info: www.salad-
owinefestival.com
March 24
	 Tejas Storytellers 
workshop, 1 - 3 p.m. at 
Salado Public Library. 
Bell County Storyteller’s 
League is forming, sign up 
available at workshop. 
March 24
	 Storytellers Concert, 
7 - 9 p.m. at Tablerock. 
Doors and concession 
open at 6:30. info: ta-
blerock.org
March 24-25
	 Wildflower Arts and 
Crafts Festival at Salado 
Civic Center sponsored 
by Salado Chamber of 
Commerce. info: Cham-
ber@Salado.com
March 25
	 Community Easter 
Egg Hunt, 2 p.m. at 
Salado United Methodist 
Church
March 25 - 27
	 Bible Study with Dr. 
John Holbert, 6 p.m. in 
the Worship Center of 
Salado United Methodist 
Church
March 26
	 Children’s Story and 
Craft Time, 11 a.m. at Sal-
ado Public Library. info: 
(254) 947-9191
March 26
	 Salado Village Artists 
meet: Knitters 1 - 3 p.m.  
and Stitchers 1:30 - 4 p.m. 
at Salado Village Artists 
Building
March 26	
	 Library Board of 
Trustees Meeting, 5 - 6 
p.m. at Salado Public 
Library
March 27
	 Salado Village Artists 
meet, 9 - 11 a.m.  brush 
art, crafting and needle 
work at Salado Village 
Artist building

Live Music in Salado

Live Music Venues:
Barrow Brewing Company on Royal barrowbrewing.com

Saturday
	 Martian Folk invades 
Barrow, 7 - 9 p.m. at Bar-
row Brewing Co

Martian Folk invades Barrow Brewing Co March 10.

send your 
music event 
listings to

 news@saladovillagevoice.com

March 17
	 Blessed Union of Blues, 
noon at Barrow Brewing 
Co
	 La Orquesta Vulgar, 3 
p.m. at Barrow Brewing 
Co
	 Wayworn Traveler, 7 
p.m. at Barrow Brewing 
Co

Variety’s Peaceable Kingdom hosts Kites for Kids March 17. Attendees are encour-
aged to bring blankets and coolers to the free event. Enjoy kite-flying, food trucks, 
mini-golf, bounce houses, arts and crafts, face painting and other family friendly fun. 

PizzaPlaceSalado.com
947-0022

230 North Main Street

Open Daily at 11am

The Pizza Place

 Pickup   •   Dine-in  •  Delivery

Handcrafted Pizza  |  Wings  |  Sandwiches  |  Baked Pasta
Salad Bar  |  Beer  |  Hand Dipped Blue Bell

WATCH 
THE GAME
WITH US
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OLD FASHIONED BURGERS
                    and ICE-CREAM

882 North Main Street

 facebook.com/burgersICEcream
plus.google.com/+OldFashionedBurgersandicecreamSalado

(254) 947-5271

$1 off any burger or 
sandwich combo 

with this ad

TRY OUR NEW MENU

Shop at Salado’s Boutique Marketplace
Women’s Apparel, Shoes ~ Flip Flops to Boots,
Jewelry, Baby Gifts & Apparel, Gourmet Food,

 Home Decor & Furniture, Home Fragrance, 
Junk Gypsy™ Paint,  Gifts & More

22 North Main Street

642 N. Main St.     (254) 947-8848 

sta mpsal adotex as.com

Rubber Stamps
Scrapbooking

ribbons
Great Classes

Salado Grown and Salado Made
Your Hometown Winery

841 N. Main St

Salado Grown and Salado Made
Your Hometown Winery

(254) 947-8011

The Baines House 
Inn & Gallery

316 Royal Street
(254) 947-5260 | baineshouse.com

The Baines House 
Inn & Gallery

316 Royal Street
(254) 947-5260 | baineshouse.com

The Baines House 
Inn & Gallery

316 Royal Street
(254) 947-5260 | baineshouse.com

Stay in the Historic 1860’s Home of 
George Washington Baines

Comfort & Serenity 
with Nearby Shopping & Dining
Extensive Art | Fine  Antiques

106 North Main Street
(next to Ambrosia Tea Room)  

(254) 855-5538 Private Showings

SOFI’S a t  t h e 
S t a g e c o a c h

4 0 1  S .  M a i n                ( 2 5 4 )  9 4 7 - 4 3 3 6

N E W  F L A X 
B O O T S  &  S H O E S

Also at the Hub in Temple

Cowboys Bar-B-Q
Exit 285 • 1300 Robertson RD

Catering, Take Out or Dine In

254-947-5700 
Miguel Perez, owner

Slow Cooking
Fast Service

MUD PIES 
POTTERY

HAND THROWN POTTERY 
ONE PIECE AT A TIME 

Handmade 
Pottery

Sir
Wigglesworth’s

Homemade 
Fudge 

18 North Main 
947-0281 

(254) 947-1909 
open daily 560 N. Main, Suite 10  

Sidewalk Sale 
Saturday 10 - 2

10% of sales supports mission of 
SUMC Wild Game Dinner

JD's Travel Center

15881 South IH 35 , Salado                  (254)  947-5228

Take I35 Exit South 283 or North 282

PARDON 
OUR 

MESS

Still serving our customers....but

Facility upgrades happening now

Heart and Hands Ministries food and clothing pantry will be open 9 - 11 a.m. on 
March 10. The pantry is located at Salado Plaza Shopping Center and serves clients 
on the second and fourth Saturday of each month. 

Village of Salado Calendar
March 27
	 Sit and Knit, 10 a.m. 
- noon at Salado Public 
Library. info: (254) 947-
9191
March 27
	 Salado Community 
Chorus practice, 6 p.m., 
Salado Civic Center, info: 
saladochorus.com
March 28
	 Salado Lions Club, 
11:30 a.m., Salado Civic 
Center 
March 29
	 Maundy Thursday 
Service with communion, 
6 p.m. at the Worship 
Center of Salado United 
Methodist Church
March 30
	 Salado ISD closed
March 30
	 Good Friday Service, 6 
p.m. in Worship Center of 
Salado United Methodist 
Church. Program: “The 
Seven Last Words of Jesus 
Christ” A Commemora-
tion of Good Friday in 
Music
March 30-March 31
	 Blow Your Own Easter 
Eggs at Salado Glass-
works. Book your times 
online at saladoglass-
works.com. 
March 31
	 Heritage Country 
Church 1st Anniversary 
Celebration, 10 a.m., 
9929 Lark Trail. Easter 
Egg Hunt, lunch and live 
music for all ages
April 1
	 Sunrise Easter Ser-
vice, 7 a.m. at Pace Park. 
Hosted by Salado United 
Methodist Church
April 6
	 Youth Worship Night, 
8 - 10 p.m. at Tablerock. 
Area Church Bands join 
in the First Annual Youth 
Worship Night. contact 
director Paige Taylor for 
info: (254) 913-1664
April 7
	 Toast Two Years at 
Barrow Brewing Co. 
Enjoy new beers, Amurica 
TX vintage photobooth 
trailer, food from Hecho 
en Queso and Korean 
Kravings, local music and 
2-year anniversary pint 
glass (while supplies last)
April 7
	 Smokin Spokes, Salado 
Intermediate School, Info: 
saladospokes.com
April 12
	 Open House at Salado 
Montessori, 5 - 6:30 p.m. 
at 10880 FM 1670. Now 
enrolling for Fall Classes. 
info: (254) 947-4005
April 13
	 Lone Star Legends 
Music Fest featuring 
Brandon Rhyder, 5 p.m. 
at Johnny’s Outback. 
Proceeds benefit an 
all-abilities playground 
for Salado, sponsored 
by Sirena Fest. tickets at 
eventbrite.com, info at 
sirenafest.com
April 13 - 20 
The Amazing Creativity 
of Salado art exhibit at 
the Texas State Capitol 
Building. 
April 13-14
	 Date Night at Salado 
Glassworks. Adults only. 
Book your time online at 
saladoglassworks.com.
April 14
	 Troll Trot 5K, 8 a.m. at 
Salado Museum and Col-
lege Hill Park. register: 
runsignup.com
April 14
	 Salado Make a Dif-
ference Day across the 
Village. info:  keepsalado-
beautiful.com
April 14 - 15
	 Salado Market Days, 
9 a.m. - 5 p.m. at Salado 
Antique Mall

April 14
	 Farmers Market, 4 - 8 
p.m. at Barrow Brewing 
Co
April 14
	 Salado Lions Club 
Pancake Breakfast. info 
pending
April 15
	 Salado 4H Meeting, 
4 p.m. at Salado High 
School Cafeteria
April 20-21
	 Date Night at Salado 
Glassworks. Adults only. 
Book your time online at 
saladoglassworks.com
April 20-23 
	 30th Annual Lincoln 
and Continental Owner’s 
Club  Tri-Regional Meet, 
Salado at Holiday Inn 
Express Salado. 
April 23
	 Early Voting begins, 
7:30 a.m. - 4:30 p.m. at 
Salado Civic Center
April 23
	 Library Board of 
Trustees Meeting, 5 - 6 
p.m. at Salado Public 
Library
April 23
	 Salado Masonic Lodge 
Stated meeting, 7:30 p.m. 
at Salado Masonic Lodge. 
Dinner at 6:30 p.m.
April 24
	 Early Voting, 7 a.m. 
- 7 p.m. at Salado Civic 
Center
April 25
	 Early Voting, 7:30 
a.m. - 4:30 p.m. at Salado 
Civic Center
April 26
	 Early Voting, 7:30 a.m. 
- 8 p.m. at Salado Civic 
Center
April 26
	 Salado Community 
Chorus Spring Concert 
at First Baptist Church 
Salado
April 27
	 Early Voting, 7:30 
a.m. - 4:30 p.m. at Salado 
Civic Center
April 27
	 Salado 4th Friday 
Sip and Shop, 5 - 8 p.m. 
across Salado

April 27-28
	 Blow Your Own flow-
ers,  hearts or bowls for 
Mother’s Day. Book your 
times online at salado-
glassworks.com
April 28
	 Early Voting, 7 a.m. 
- 7 p.m. at Salado Civic 
Center
April 29
	 Early Voting, 9 a.m. 
- 5 p.m. at Salado Civic 
Center
April 29
	 St. Joseph’s Kite Fest, 
1 - 4 p.m. at Chapel at 
Caliber Oak. info: (254) 
718-0680
April 30
	 Early Voting, 7:30 
a.m. - 4:30 p.m. at Salado 
Civic Center
May 1
	 Early Voting - last day, 
7 a.m. - 7 p.m. at Salado 
Civic Center
May 4-5
	 Blow Your Own flow-
ers, hearts of bowls for 
Mother’s Day. Book your 
times online at salado-
glassworks.com.

May 5
	 Election Day, 7 a.m. - 7 
p.m. at Salado Civic Cen-
ter
May 5
	 Gospel Festival, 10 
a,m, - 9 p.m. at Tablerock. 
info: tablerock.org
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Shopping Map of Salado
Map Legend

S	 Shopping
A	 Art and Galleries
L	 Lodging
D	 Dining and Drinks
V	 Venues & Sights
$	 Services
C	 Churches and Education

#	 Business Name	 Type
4	 St. Stephen Catholic Church	 C
6	 Salado College Park	 V
7	 Raney & Associates	 $
8	 Stagecoach Inn	 D
9	 Salado Museum	 V
	 Salado Visitors Center	 $
	 Salado Chamber of Comerce	 $
	 Village of Salado Tourism Office	 $
10	 Sofi’s	 S
14	 Salado Glassworks	 A
17	 Barrow Brewing Company	 D
20	 Springhouse Emporium	 S
21	 The Venue                   	 V
22	 The Shed 	 D
24	 Tablerock	 V
26	 Salado United Methodist Church	 C
29	 Alexander’s Distillery	 D
29	 Inn on the Creek	 L
30	 First Baptist Church	 C
32	 First Texas Brokerage	 $
33	 First State Bank	 $
34	 First Community Title	 $
	 Farmer’s Insurance	 $
	        Zbranek Agency
40	 W.A. Pace Memorial Park 	 V
48	 The Inn at Salado	 L
49	 Lively Coffeehouse & Bistro	 D
49	 Magnolias	 S
55	 Salado Family Dentistry	 $
58	 The Shoppes on Main	 S
60	 Salado Creek Jewelry	 S
62	 The Pizza Place	 D
65	 ERA Colonial Real Estate	 $
73	 Cornett Corner
	   Investment Realty	 $
	   First Eye Care Salado	 S
75	 Angelic Herbs	 S
	 Bruce Bolick, CPA	 $
	 Lone Star EBikes	 S
76	 Salado Civic Center	 $
81	 Salado Wine Seller and	 D
	 Salado Winery Co.
82	 St. Joseph’s Episcopal Church	 C
85	 Salado Post Office	 $
86	 Bill Bartlett – Century 21	 $
86	 Subway	 D
	 Old Fashioned Burgers 	 D 
87	 The Personal Wealth Coach	 $          
89	 Stamp Salado	 S
90	 Presbyterian Church of Salado	 C
91	 Troy Smith Financial Services	 $
92	 Salado Sculpture Garden	 A
96	 Salado Plaza
	 Ace Pest Control	 $
	 Integrity Rehab	 $
	 Keith Ace Hardware	 $
	 Mill Creek Cleaners	 $
	 Salado’s Hair Shop	 $
	 Salado Village Voice	 $
97	 Brookshire Brothers	 S
100	Salado Public Library	 C
101	 Salado Cleaners	 $
104	Hairitage Barber Shop	 $
113	 Salado Church of Christ	 C
118	 Salado Market Days	 S
119	 Salado Antique Mall       	 S
126	 Cowboy’s Barbecue	 D
124 Salado Veterinary Hospital	 $
130	 Village Spirits	 S
132	 Broecker Funeral Home	 $
133	 Johnny’s Steaks and BBQ	 D
135	 Embrace Smiles	 $
136	 Salado Schools & Stadium	 C
139	 Cedar Valley Baptist Church	 C

Not Shown on the Shopping Map
Animal Medical	 $
JD’s Travel Center	 D
The Play Yard Preschool	 $
Don Ringer	 $
Garlyn Shelton	 $
3C Cowboy Fellowship 	 C
Grace Baptist Church	 C
Mill Creek Country Club	 D/V

Historical Markers in Salado

6.	 Salado Historic College Hill
8.	 Shady Villa Hotel (Stagecoach Inn)
8.	 Main Street Bridge
16.	 Barber-Berry Mercantile
23.	 The Baines House
24.	 Historic Dipping Vats

25.	 The A.J. Rose Mansion
26.	 Old Methodist Chapel
27. 	 Caskey-Hendricks House
28.  	Dr. McKie Place (Twelve Oaks)
29.	 Alexander’s Distillery

30.	 First Baptist Church
31.	 The Tyler House
35.	 Salado Masonic Lodge #296
45. 	 The Anderson House 
46	 Old Saloon

48.	 The Norton-Orgain House
50. 	 The Barton House
51.	 The Levi Tenney House
55. 	 The Armstrong Adams House
61. 	 Historic Lenticular Bridge

49.	 The Vickrey House
76.	 Boles-Aiken & Denman Cabins
77.	 The Robert B. Halley House
79.	 The Reed Cabin
100.	The Josiah Fowler House
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1. AD SLOGANS: Which 
company advertised its prod-
ucts with the tagline “Maybe 
she’s born with it”?
2. SCIENCE: What is the pro-
cess called when heat is trans-
ferred through a liquid or gas?
3. MOVIES: What is the theme 
song from “Titanic”?
4. MEASUREMENTS: How 
many pounds are in a ton 
(U.S.)?
5. ANATOMY: Metabolism 
is regulated by which gland in 
the human body?
6. LITERATURE: In which 
book in the Harry Potter series 
does the character of Dolores 

If you enjoy the 
Puzzle page,

 try our 
interactive 

crossword and 
sudoku puzzles 

online at:
saladovilla-

gevoice.com

Umbridge appear?
7. MYTHOLOGY: Who was 
the Roman god of strength?
8. MATH: What is the degree 
of a triangle?
9. MUSIC: What was the 
name of the Grateful Dead’s 
first album?
10. FAMOUS QUOTES: 
Which inspirational speaker 
once said, “Setting goals is 
the first step in turning the in-
visible into the visible”?

Answers

1. Maybelline
2. Convection
3. “My Heart Will Go On”
4. 2,000
5. Thyroid
6. “Harry Potter and the Or-
der of the Phoenix”
7. Hercules
8. 180 degrees
9. “The Grateful Dead” 
(1967)
10. Tony Robbins

	 (c) 2018 King Features 
Synd., Inc.

Most players are famil-
iar with the Bath Coup, even 
though they might not know 
the technical name for the play. 
It gets its name because the 
play is said to have originated 
in the resort town of Bath, En-
gland.

Consider this deal where 
West leads the king of hearts. 
If South knows his way around 
a bridge table, he plays the four 
on the king, hoping West will 
continue the suit and hand him 
an extra heart trick. The duck 
of the king, holding A-J-x, is 
called a Bath Coup.

However, if West is famil-
iar with this holdup play, he 

Contract
Bridge
By Steve Becker

will switch to a different suit 
after East plays the discourag-
ing deuce of hearts on the king. 
It is here that declarer must be 
careful not to dissipate his ad-
vantage.

Let’s say West shifts to a 
club at trick two. South can-
not afford to finesse, since 
this would subject him to de-
feat if the finesse lost and East 
returned a heart. So to ensure 
the contract, he goes up with 
the ace.

He next plays the K-Q of 
trumps, followed by the queen 
of diamonds. Assume East 
wins the second diamond with 
the ace and returns a heart. 
South takes his ace, crosses to 
dummy with a trump and dis-
cards his heart loser on dum-
my’s third diamond. He then 
concedes a club to the king to 
make the contract.

Observe that if South takes 
the king of hearts with the ace 
at trick one, he goes down. 
East later gains the lead with 
either a diamond or a club and 
returns a heart through declar-
er’s J-4. The Bath Coup thus 
proves to be the key to mak-
ing the contract, even though 
declarer may have no idea that 
the play he has employed car-
ries a very fancy moniker.

(c) 2018 King Features 
Syndicate Inc.

The bath coup
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Wild About Texas
Michael Price

Book Your Tee Time Today

Open for Breakfast 7 a.m. Daily
Mill Creek Country Club Bar & Grill 

open to the public 7 a.m. - 7 p.m. 
Dine In  or  Carry Out

18 unforgettable holes of Golf designed by Robert Trent Jones, Jr.

OPEN TO THE PUBLIC 
 Practice Facility                    Memberships Available 

millcreek-golf.com       
(254) 947-5698

120 Royal Street       (254) 947-0747              
Tues - Sat  10:30 - 5     

Springhouse Emporium

Shop Salado .......
Shop Springhouse

(254) 947-3969
www.LoneStarEBikes.com

560 N Main Street, Suite 1
10 AM - 7 PM DAILY

EBIKE SALES       RENTALS      SALADO TOURS

The Annex for 
Creative Learning 

featuring 
Pretty Planks | Jewelry

Bike Maintenance
Apple Computer classes and more

Maiden Made 
Jewelry 

560 N Main Street, Suite 2
(254) 947-3969

Resolve to
            live longer...

Ride!
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(254) 947-0027 | (800) 724-0027

Historic Bed and Breakfast ~Weddings ~ Receptions  ~ Meetings

Inn at Salado

North Main & Pace Park Dr.  inn-at-salado.com                   

Corner of Royal Street and Center Circle (West)
(254) 947-1960

 Open
Mon, Wed, Thurs 5 p.m.
Fri, Sat & Sun 11 a.m.

Closed Tues

A place for weary travelers, 
thirsty tourist, and hungry neighbors!

GOOD EATS, 
FULL BAR, 

10 TV’S

Red-spotted Toad

The Red-spotted Toad 
(Bufo punctatus) is one of 
nine species of “true” toads 
that occur in Texas, and it 
is arguably the most dis-
tinguishable. It can be ob-
served throughout Texas in 
all but the eastern ¼ of the 
state. It also occurs in most 
of the southwestern states, 
as well as far south as the 
state of Hidalgo, Mexico.

The habitats that this toad 
prefers to occupy vary from 
rocky deserts, open prai-
ries, grasslands, although 
it can also thrive in open 
range, mesquite-filled pas-
tures, and creosote flats. 
More often than not, it is 
associated closely with per-
manent or semi-permanent 
water sources, whether the 
water source be natural 
such as creeks or springs, 
or man-made such as cattle 
tanks. In addition to water 
sources, this species can 
live anywhere that has loose 
enough soil where it can 
bury itself deep enough to 
escape the heat and drought 
conditions.

The Red-spotted Toad is 
a moderately small amphib-
ian that has dry, wart-cov-
ered skin. It is one of the 
smallest “true” toads that 
inhabit this state, with adult 
females (the larger sex) at-
taining a total body length 
of just over two inches. 
The background coloration 
can vary from any shade 
of brown to olive-brown to 

olive gray. As the common 
name implies, it frequently 
is adorned with numerous 
small red dots, although in 
many individuals these dots 
are just a darker shade of 
brown. The belly coloration 
is off-white to white in col-
oration and oftentimes has 
small irregular dark spots. 
The paratoid glands are the 
large “bumps” immediately 
behind each eye, and in this 
species, they are round to 
slightly oval in appearance. 
Each toe on the hind feet 
end in a sharp black point, 
and there are two sharp tu-
bercles on each hind foot. 
The innermost tubercle is 
crescent-shaped. 

Red-spotted Toads, like 
other amphibian species, 
live a dual-life. In fact, 
the word amphibian itself 
means “double-life”. When 
the spring and summer 
rains begin, males of this 
species will congregate at 
shallow pools to begin to 
attract a mate. This attrac-
tion consists of calling in 
long, high-pitched, trill-
like bursts. When just one 
or two males is calling, the 
noise is nothing more than 
background noise. Howev-
er, like other “true” toads, 
when a large group begins 
to call in a chorus, the noise 
can be deafening. 

	 Once a male suc-

cessfully attracts a mate, 
they engage in the process 
of externally fertilizing the 
eggs. This process is known 
as amplexus. During this 
time, a male will wrap his 
forelegs around a receptive 
female and as she lays her 
eggs, he will fertilize each 
individual one as it exits the 
female’s body. Many thou-
sands of eggs may be laid 
each breeding session, and 
the number of sessions may 
vary from two to three an-
nually to once every two to 
three years. Breeding is all 
based upon sufficient rain-
fall, for the eggs are often 
laid in shallow, non-perma-
nent pools of water that dry 
up after just a few sunny 
days accompanied with un-
bearable heat. 

The life cycle of the 
Red-spotted Toad continues 
as the fertilized eggs hatch 
into tiny, dark tadpoles. 
These tadpoles are often 
referred to as “pollywogs”. 
They are fish-like in ap-
pearance, and they obtain 
their oxygen from the wa-
ter through gills. Within a 
day or two after hatching, 
they begin a miraculous 
metamorphosis where their 
lungs begin to develop, 
while at the same time, back 
legs begin to form on their 
bodies. Within the next day 
or two from then, front legs 

begin to appear, the tail 
begins to shrink, the lungs 
continue to develop, and the 
back legs become larger. 
This process continues for 
about a week after hatching, 
when the tiny toadlets have 
completed their change, 
looking like tiny replicas of 
the adults, thus beginning 
their “second” life. 

This species is highly 
nocturnal, and it feeds on 
large amounts of insects 
when moisture levels are at 
a sufficient level to prevent 
desiccation, therefore they 
are beneficial to agricultur-
ally-based ventures such as 
crops or gardens. 

Many myths surround 
toads, and the most com-
mon tale is the notion that 
toads cause warts on people 
if handled. This is not true 
of course, but rather, the 
secretions that are present 
when a toad is handled are 
either the poison from the 
paratoid glands, or urine as 
the toad is frightened. The 
poison of the Red-spotted 
Toad is not harmful to hu-
mans (although it has been 
said it is rather bitter), but 
it can cause yard animals 
such as dogs or cats to froth 
at the mouth. 

So the next time you see 
a Red-spotted Toad, or any 
toad for that matter, fear 
not, for you do not have to 
run to your local drugstore 
to buy anti-wart cream. Hot 
soap and water or hand-san-
itizer will do just fine.

Red Spotted toads are a boon to agriculture
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860 N. Main
Salado, Tx

254.947.5050
www.C21BB.com

248 Van Bibber, Salado
1.5 ac., beautiful setting, downtown Salado

$165,000

3084 Rolling Meadow, Salado
4 BR, 3 BA on 1.2 ac.

$569,921

1171 Morgan Dr., Temple
4 BR, 3.5 BA on 1.5 ac

10841 Stinnett Mill, Salado
6 BR, 3.5 BA

$629,921

10879 Stinnett Mill Rd., Salado
4 BR, 4.5 BA 

$619,921

1824 Mission Tr., Salado
4 BR, 3.5 BA on 8+ acres

$644,721

10951 Stinnett Mill Rd., Salado
4 BR, 3.5 BA

$629,921

10915 Stinett Mill, Salado
4 BR, 3.5 BA

$539,921

9652 Stinnett Mill Rd., Salado
3 BR, 2 BA on 10+ ac.

$489,000

• 1.5 ac. in downtown Salado. Perfect setting for a homesite.
• 3.7 to 6.4 ac. homesites, ready for horses or cattle & your custom home in Holland ISD
• 18 or 40 ac. native pasture with hillside views. Seller financing available. 
• 58 ac. in Holland ISD, convenient to Temple/Belton. Homesite, farming/ranching, or 
   recreation! U/C

Area Land Listings

1417 Starlight Dr., Temple
3 BR, 2 BA
$154,921

1400 Ashley Dr., Nolanville
3 BR, 2 BA
$121,000

909 Santa Maria, Salado
4 BR, 4.5 BA

SOLD

SOLD

Free
Free boxes available 
12-6 daily at Salado Winery. Most 
are used wine shipping boxes 
which are great for storing/moving 
ornaments, collectibles, or bottles.
Child Care
The Play Yard: 6 weeks 
to 12 years with age appropriate 
curriculum, drop of and pick up 
from Salado schools, 254-947-
1153.  tfnb

Church
Parents Day Out at 
Salado United Meth-

odist Church currently has 
limited openings in all classes for 
Spring 2018. Our Christ centered 
curriculum and activities are chosen 
to lay, a foundation for understand-
ing God, Jesus, the Bible, church, 
family, self and others. Tuesdays/
Thursdays 8:30 a.m. -2:30 p.m. 
Email: ttepera@saladoumc.org for 
more information.

Cleaning
Clear Vision Cleaning 
- Residential and commercial 
cleaning service. (254)314-5050.
Clear View Window 
Cleaning: Windows, gutters, 

powerwashing, ceiling fan cleaning. 
(254)931-6172.
Window Washing Won-
ders: Professional window clean-
ing. Residential and Commercial. 
(254)231-3289.

Dry Cleaners
Salado Cleaners: Laundry, 
dry cleaning, alterations, leather, 
suede, 1209 N. Stagecoach, 254-
947-7299. tfnd
Mill Creek Cleaners, 
quality dry cleaning, laundry, alter-
ations, 213 Mill Creek Dr. Suite 200, 
254-947-0100. tfnd

Dirt/Stone Work
Lone Star Grading, com-
mercial, residential, industrial exca-
vation, grading, paving, pads, 
driveways, roads, 254-947-0149 or 
254-933-7900
CBS Construction: septic 
tanks, house pads, driveways, lot 
clearing, top soil, 254-718-1752.  

Employment 
Opportunities
Small local Church is 
seeking to hire a part 
time secretary. Basic 
computer knowledge required. 

Experience with PowerChurch 
software and payroll is a plus but 
not required as training can be pro-
vided if needed. Compensation will 
be based on experience level. All 
applicants will require a background 
check and interview.  Please email 
your resume to heritagecountry-
church@gmail.com. 3/8-3/29b
Now hiring all positions 
JD’s Travel Center. Apply in person 
(254) 947-5228

Farm
Pine Meadow Farm- 
Riding instruction, reg oregon horse 

sale and miniature donkey sales. 
Featuring this week: Traveler, six 
year old grey gelding ready to be 
herd protector. 254-444-1988. 
3/8tfn

Financial
Troy L Smith Financial: 
Personal investment solutions. 254-
947-0376, Troylsmith.com.
Alton D. Thiele PC: Certi-
fied Public Accountant, tax returns, 
business accounting, auditing, 
consulting, 254-939-0701. tfnd



Page 2D, salado Village Voice, March 8, 2017

Classifieds from 1D

A/C
Repair

 ALL BRANDS
Free Estimates &  Second Opinions

100% Financing Available

Senior Citizens Discount on service

939-1141
Toll Free 877-422-5500  • www.bellaircond.com

310 E. Central Ave. • Belton
SERVING CENTRAL TEXAS FOR OVER 53 YEARS

TACLA002113C

Serving Salado & Central Texas
(512) 633-1558

We have investors looking 
for homes and land

254-780-5795
Repair or Replace

SALADO SERVICE CO.Landscape Exterior Lighting

Handyman

Services

Live Animal
Trapping

SINCE 1989

Tree Service
Pressure Washing
Decks/Fences
Stone Work
Rock Drives

Haul Offs
Refrigeration

Painting
A/C Repairs

Remodels

IF WE CAN’T FIX IT WE’LL FIND SOMEONE WHO CAN

Continued on, pg. 3D

2018 Cadillac XT5 
ULTRA LOW MILEAGE LEASES FOR WELL-QUALIFIED BUYERS

$399 / 39 / $399
PER MONTH* MONTHS

__________________________________

DUE AT SIGNING 
AFTER ALL OFFERS

No security deposit required. Tax, title, license extra. Mileage charge of $.25 per mile over 30,000 miles.

* Payments are for a 2018  Cadillac XT5 with an MSRP of $41,190 monthly payments total $15,561. Option to purchase 
at lease end for an amount of $21,830.70 . GM Financial must approve lease. Take delivery by 01/31/18. Mileage charge 
of $.25/mile over 30,000 miles. Lessee pays for maintenance, excess wear and a disposition fee of $595 or less at end 

of lease. Not available with some other offers

Garlyn Shelton 
Cadillac 

Garlyn Shelton Cadillac 
5625 S. General Bruce Dr 
Temple, TX 76502 

254-771-0128 
GarlynSheltonCadillac.com

Bruce A. Bolick, CPA: 
Payroll, Individual and Business 
Taxes.  By appointment, (254) 
718-7299. SaladoCPA@aol.com.           
tfnd
The Personal Wealth 
Coach®: SEC registered invest-
ment advisor, highly personalized 
portfolio design and management, 
254-947-1111.

Real Estate 
Services 
Investment Realty: Resi-
dential, Commercial and Investment 
Property. Serving Salado and Cen-
tral Texas. (512) 633-1558.
First Community Title, 
branches in Salado, Temple, Killeen 
and Gatesville. 40 N. Main Street, 
Salado 254-947-8480.               tfnd

Insurance
Rita Zbranek, Farmers Insur-

ance, auto, home, life, commercial, 
254-947-0995.
Finney Insurance, home, 
auto, life, commercial, liability, farm, 
ranch, 254-947-3599.

Florist
Brookshire Brothers full 
service florist. Blooming plants. 
254-947-8922.

For Sale
Antiques at Salado 
Antique Mall and Bee’s 
Antiques -  Antiques, vintage 
and collectibles, many vendors at 
one location 751 Stagecoach Road, 
North I-35 frontage road (directly 
behind Dee’s Antiques on Main) 
947-3355. Salado Market Days 
second weekend of each month.  tfn

Garage, Auctions, 
Estate Sale
ESTATE /  GARAGE 
SALE.Saturday, 3/10/2018 from 
8:00am to 12Noon. 1109 Salado 
Oaks Drive, Salado, Texas. Furni-
ture: Large Kitchen Hutch, Antique, 
Round Oak Kitchen Table, Antique 
White Couch, Two (2) Power Lift 
Recliners, five (5) Beds, Dresser; 
Refrigerator; Tools. Metal Desk.
Multi-Family sale 2716 
Winners Circle Dr, Salado. Lawn 
mower and equipment, tools, refrig-
erators, clothes, household items, 
GOLF CART, golf clubs, clothes, 
shoes. Friday, 7am-2pm, Saturday, 
7am-noon.

Garbage
Clawson Disposal: Com-
petitive pricing for great garbage 
service; containers, too. 512-746-
2000.

Health and Fitness
First Eye Care Salado; 
eye exams, eye disease manage-
ment, designer eyewear and con-
tact lens service. (254) 947-3783 
Angelic Herbs: Profes-
sional Wellness, Lifestyle, 
weight loss and stress management 
solutions. C J Harbuz, CNHP 947-
1909, 560 N. Main Suite 10.
Crain Chiropractic & 
Wellness- chiropractic care, 
massage therapy, acupuncture 
and holistic care. 418 N. Main St. 
#5.,947-2225.
Integrity:  Rehab & 
Home Health. Physical ther-
apy, speech therapy, occupational 
therapy, in-home skilled nursing. 
integrityrehab.net, 254-699-3933.
Family Dentistry: Lumi-
neers for straighter, whiter teeth. 
Douglas B. Willingham, DDS, 254-
947-5242.

Heat & Air
American Electric Com-
mercial, Residential, AC and Heat-
ing with over 30 years experience. 
Free estimates, licensed, bonded 

and insured. Locally owned and 
operated (254) 289-0566
Britt Heating & Air: Instal-
lation and repairs, 254-760-1004, 
254-947-5263, TACL #B006640
Bell Air Conditioning: 
All brands repairs, free estimates, 
100% financing available, 254-939-
1141. TACLA002113C

Jewelers
Salado Creek Jewelers 
by Kiki Creations:  106 
North Main St. 254-855-5538, 
private showings.
Lastovica Jewelers: 
in-store jewelry repairs, diamond 
sales, setting and appraisal, custom 
design, watch repair, 254-773-5772.
Devereaux’s Jewelers: 
Quality crafted custom work, jewelry 
repair, appraisals, watch repair, 
stone setting, diamond sales, photo 
design. 254-771-1260.

Landscaping

Lawnwork & Tree
Keith Ace Hardware has 
all your home and garden needs. 
213 Mill Creek Drive, Suite 106. 
(254) 947-4008.
Trees, Shrubs & Land-
scaping,  Pruning, www.victor-
mareklandscaping.com. 1-512-818-
3822, Removal and Hauling. Flower 
beds, yard work, top soil.  Serving 
Salado 35 years. 0724tfn 

Personal Services
Hairitage Barber Shop: 
Full service Barber Shop, call 254-
947-3309 for appointments. 
Salado’s Hair Shop, full 
service salon, walk-ins accepted. 
213 Mill Creek Dr. Suite 160. 
(254)421-5173. 

Pest Control
Ace Pest Control: Cus-
tomer satisfaction guaranteed, free 
estimates, TPCL #12512; David 
Preston. 254-947-4222

Plumbing
Moffat & Daughters 
Plumbing: Service, repair, 
remodeling, 254-289-5986 Master 
LIC # M017002
Salado Plumbing. In-home 
repairs, 254-947-5800. Master LIC 
M 16892
Yount Sewer & Drain: 
septic tank & grease trap pumping, 
254-947-5036

Rental/Lease

Commercial
Private office space 
within a suite of 4 offices in the 
Stagestop Building, 560 No. Main 
St., directly opposite Salado Civic 
Center. Reception area. Meeting 
area. Restroom within suite. Ample 
parking. $385/month plus electricity 
share. Contact Ann at 254-563-

3675. 3/8-3/29
For Lease: 2,200 sq ft office 
and warehouse Call 254-760-
4440  tfn
2500 sf space available 
in Stagestop Building at 560 N. 
Main St in Salado. I35 and Main 
Street frontages. Single story. 
Ample parking. Great retail or office 
location. $3000/month. Contact Ann 
at 254-563-3675. 1/18-3/29p

Rental/Lease 
Residential
Salado Townhouse 
updated, 2,375 sq. ft. 3 BR, 
2 1/2 BA. Washer/Dryer, fridge. 
Jetted Tub, fireplace. large private 
backyard with deck. 2 car garage. 
One block from Mill Creek Golf 
Clubhouse. No smoking, $1,700 
month, plus deposit. 1-916-502-
4403. 3/8-3/29b
9809 Southshore Dr. 
Salado-Rare find in Salado! 
Clean rental property located just 
outside of town. Great kitchen, 
fireplace, spacious master, and 
large fenced backyard. 3bed/2bath 
with flex room. Includes washer and 
dryer! $1375/month. First Texas 
Brokerage and the office number 
at 254-947-5577
600 W Village Rd-Great 
rental property in the heart of 
Salado! 3 bed/2 bath with newly 
installed vinyl flooring. Beautiful 
mature trees on site make this the 
perfect place for indoor and outdoor 
living! $1500/month. First Texas 
Brokerage and the office number 
at 254-947-5577
Charming, spacious, 
2/2/1 townhome for 
rent. Clean!! 6 closets, vaulted 
ceiling, w/d closet inside. Walk 
to shopping center. Lawn care 
provided. 254-913-9813, www.
saladorentals.com.
0/2tfnb
For Rent clean 2 BR, 2 
B duplex, $700 mo. call 760-
4440. 0918tfnb

Residential Sales
This 4 BR, 3.5 BA home 
can be your own private getaway 
on 8.27 wooded acres.    Open floor 
plan.  The sun room can be used for 
a 2nd living area, workout room or 
home office.  The 30’x40’ shop is 
perfect for the outdoor enthusiast or 
artisan.  Enjoy the country life, just 
minutes away from Salado.  1824 
Mission Trail, Salado.  $644,721. 
Century 21 Bill Bartlett  947-5050.
Salado townhouse on 
the creek!  Ideal location next 
to the clubhouse and overlooking 
beautiful Salado Creek.  3 bedroom, 
2 bath, single level home, opens to 
a deck on the high side creek bank.  
HOA covers lawn care, sprinklers & 
garbage pick-up.   Home is ready 
to update and make your own.  
$224,921.  1910 Old Mill Rd. #5, 
Salado. Century 21 Bill Bartlett 
947-5050  2/2tfnf
Impressive custom 
built home that is a Southern 
Living Idea Home. A fabulous 
drive-up that features 5 bedrooms, 
5 .5 baths, with master and guest 
suite downstairs. Must see all the 
extras. Located on a tranquil tree 
lined street in the heart of beautiful 
Salado. 716 DeGrummond Way 
$590,000. Call Raney and Associ-
ates: (254) 913-1215.
Amazing, one-of-a-kind 
home on a cul-de-sac. Serene 
wooded setting adjacent to Salado 
Creek with views highlighted by 
ceiling to floor windows and 4 
sets of French doors. 4 bedroom, 
charming great room with fireplace. 
Beaded board and beamed ceilings, 
batten-board walls throughout. 
128 Rock Creek Drive $595,000 
Call Raney and Associates: (254) 
913-1215.
Perfect home overlook-
ing the Texas Hill Coun-
try. Hill country flavored home 
on 5 gorgeous acres with barn 
for horses $429,900. More info at 
www.1349hiddensprings.com Call 
First Texas Brokerage 947-5577
This gorgeous custom 
home boasts 4 BR, 3 BA, an 
office & a bonus/game room.  Grand 
front view with large, mature trees, 
a beautiful steel front door, warm 
hardwood floors, and an open 
kitchen/living/dining concept.  The 
kitchen features a large rounded 
island, double ovens, & large 
walk-in pantry.  Beautiful wood 
beam detail on the ceiling!  Traver-
tine tile in the bathrooms.  A covered 
patio with outdoor grill is perfect 
for entertaining, and the back yard 
with mature trees backs up to an 
unimproved ranch property.  A true 
beauty!  3084 Rolling Meadow Dr.,  
Salado.  $569,921.   Century 21 Bill 
Bartlett 947-5050  2/2tfnf

 

ANNA LOU RANEY, Broker/Realtor 254-913-1215
DANIEL RANEY, Realtor 254-760-2591

MLS
MULTIPLE LISTING SERVICETemple/Belton 

Board of Realtors

List your home with the 
Raney Real Estate Team

RaneyRealEstate.net

LAND LISTINGS
HERITAGE SUBDIVISION

  Only two lots left!
Lot 6/7      4.28 acres $80,000

Lot 111.493 acres $52,000

KEVLIN TRAIL 
Only 1 lot left! Premier half-acre, 

underground utilities ready for building. 
$59,900

128 ROCK CREEK DRIVE
Amazing, one-of-a-kind home on a cul-de-sac. Se-
rene wooded setting adjacent to Salado Creek with 
views highlighted by ceiling to floor windows and 4 
sets of French doors. 4 bedroom, charming great 
room with fireplace. Beaded board and beamed 
ceilings, batten-board walls throughout. 

$595,000

716 DEGRUMMOND WAY
Impressive custom built home that is a Southern Liv-
ing Idea Home. A fabulous drive-up that features 5 
bedrooms, 5.5 baths, with master and guest suite 
downstairs. Must see all the extras. Located on a 
tranquil tree lined street in the heart of beautiful 
Salado. 

$575,000

702 DEGRUMMOND WAY
Custom home on 1.53 acres. Gorgeous trees, 3 bed-
rooms, 2.5 baths, great room with WBFP, custom 
mantle, cozy sitting room open to kitchen w/break-
fast bar, bay window, dining room and enclosed sun 
porch. 2017 Renovations include: painting, kitchen & 
master bath upgrades, Vacuflow central vac system 
etc. Spectacular and serene wooded setting, impos-
sible to re-create. 

$454,185

700 COLLEGE HILL DRIVE
Lovely custom built home, privately located on 3.4 
acres with huge live oak trees. Historic district close 
to dining and shopping. 3 bedrooms, 2 baths, large 
open living area with stone fireplace opening into 
breakfast room, curved breakfast bar and kitchen. 
Spacious laundry room w/sink. Spacious covered 
patio, 30.3 X 24.4 metal building, generator and large 
propane tank.

$430,000

ANN CARROLL, Realtor 254-760-0101
GEORGE ROMFH, Realtor 254-718-6845

Classified ads due by 
Monday noon

15 words for $7 (.25 per word after) 
prepaid

classifieds@saladovillagevoice.com
(254) 947-5321



BapBap’s
 Shredding
  Service
 (512) 415-1528

joseph_vaughn@msn.com          www.bapbaps.com

Joe Vaughn
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Subscribe Today
First Class Mail Delivery
$26 year in Bell County

$28 statewide      $36 outside Texas

Britt Heating & 
Air Conditioning

 Installations • Repairs
 Office 947-5263
 Mobile 760-1004
 Serving Salado for 25 years 
 TACL #B006640

Al Clawson Disposal, Inc. 
(512) 930-5490    •    www.ClawsonDisposal.com

ASK US ABOUT OUR SERVICES
Waste Pickup    •    Recycling    •    Roll-Off Containers

Yount Sewer & Drain
Septic Service, L.C.

Septic tank 
& grease trap 

pumping

254 947-5036

Salado Plumbing

947-5800

“We are ready”
In home repairs

 

Master LIC M 16892

Moffatt & Daughters
Plumbing Co. 

Service • Repair • Remodeling

Riannai authorized service provider
George (Bubba) Moffatt

254 289-5986 (local)

Master Plumber
Lic M017002

CBS Construction

Gravel Driveways | Parking Lots
Septic Tanks | House Pads
Lot Clearing | Demolition

Chet Sutton, owner-operator

254 718-1752

LONE STAR GRADING
& MATERIALS

COMMERCIAL  H  RESIDENTIAL
INDUSTRIAL

EXCAVATION • GRADING • SITE PREPARATION
YARDS • LOT CLEARING • PADS • ROADS

DRIVEWAYS • PARKING LOTS
ALL TYPES DIRT WORK • MATERIALS & HAULING

***FREE ESTIMATES***

(254) 947-0149 or (254) 933-7900
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Let the light shine through

Windows | Gutters
Powerwashing

Ceiling Fan Cleaning

(254) 931-6172
ClearViewWindows_Belton@yahoo.com

Clear View Window Cleaning

Escape to your own 
resort all on 5 pristine acres. As 
you walk into this home you will be 
taken by the grand great room with 
high ceilings, custom wood beams 
and large windows overlooking the 
swimming pool. $599,875. Call 
Ryan 541-2255. First Texas Bro-
kerage 254-947-5577 9/8tfn
Old world Charm and 
Custom craftsmanship 
can be seen throughout this Texas 
Hill Country Farm House on 4.9 
tree-covered acre estate. Features 
include: Spray foam insulation. 2 
tankless water heaters. 2-16 seer 
AC/Heating units $549,900. Call 
Ryan  541-2255. First Texas Bro-
kerage 947-5577 9/8tfn
Elegant Austin Stone 
Home on tree-covered 
lot. Large covered back patio 
overlooking the tropical landscaping 
and swimming pool. Granite count-
ers, stainless steel appliances. 
$499,900 Call First Texas Broker-
age 947-5577.
This incredible home 
nestled amongst the trees in Salado 
Mills features spray foam insu-
lation, granite counter tops in all 
wet areas, interior stone features, 
beautiful steel front door, 6 BR, 
(or 4 BR plus a downstairs office & 
large upstairs bonus room), 3 car 
garage, irrigated & sodded yard, 
security system pre-wiring & much 
more!  Subdivision will include a 
community pool & golf cart access 
to Mill Creek.  Enjoy the amenities 
of Salado without being in the city 
limits.  10841 Stinnett Mill Rd., 
Salado.  $629,921. Century 21 Bill 
Bartlett  947-5050.
Hor se  proper ty  in 
Salado!  Pamper your horses 
& yourself with this 3 BR, 2 BA 
custom home on 10.1 acres.  Roof 
replaced in 2014, CH&A, windows 
& doors all replaced in 2016.  Fire-
place in living room plus gas heater 
in kitchen.  Brick floors in much of 
the home.  Enclosed back porch 
w/ heat & air, new covered back 
patio.  Horse barn features Ritchie 
watering system in stalls & in back 
pasture.  4 custom stalls plus large 
foaling stall with attached pen.  Two 
additional smaller turnouts.  Wash 
bay with hot & cold water & heat 
lamps.  Heat insulation in entire 
barn.  Property is fenced & cross 
fenced.  Covered trailer parking, 
and much more!  9652 Stinnett Mill 
Rd., Salado.  $489,000.Century 21 
Bill Bartlett  947-5050.

Property For Sale
16+ acres in salado  
196,500 build hunt enjoy Shane 
Lacanne Entire 254-654-4066. 
2/1tfnb
Bell County Land -69+- 
ac. – w/ 3 BR ranch home; 20 ac. 
w/ frontage on Hwy. 95, Academy 
ISD; 18 ac. native pasture, seller 
financing available; 1.5 ac. in down-
town Salado, perfect for a homesite.  
Century 21 Bill Bartlett, Salado.  
www.c21bb.com  254-947-5050. 
11/10 tfnf
Kevlin Trail - Only 1 
lot left! Premier half-acre lot, 
underground utilities ready for 
building. $59,900. Call Raney and 
Associates: 254-913-1215. tfn08/02
Homesites in Heritage 
subdivision, 1+ acres, 
Salado schools, call Raney and 
Associates: 254-913-1215. tfn08/20

Services
Knife & Scissor Sharp-
ening, garden tools and chain-
saw chains. Ernie Freeland, factory 
trained and certified. 210-317-3195, 
Belton, Tx. 2/22-3/22b
Salado Service Co. - 
Handyman Services, Landscaping, 
Live Animal Trapping, Haul Offs, 
Remodels, A/C Repairs, Painting, 
Tree Service, Pressure Washing, 
Decks, Fencing, Rock Driveways, 
Stone Work. (254) 780-5795. 1/25-
7/6p
The Shade Shop: Ceiling 
fans, light fixtures, home decor and 
window treatments at 230 North 
Main. (254) 290-7000. 1/25-7/6p
Lone Star EBikes- Tours, 
rentals, sales. (254)947-3969, 560 
N. Main St. LoneStarEBikes.com

Storage
StowAway Storage 
Household - Commercial 10X10 - 
10x20 - 22x40 Clean, lighted, fenced, 
Key punch entry. 947-5502 or 721-
1807              tfnb
Storage space in Salado 
8X12, 16X24 and up. Some have 
drive-in doors. Stagecoach Storage 
254-778-6779.
 tfnb 

Upholstery
Custom upholstery, res-
idential, commercial, Kasmir fabric 
gallery, free pickup and delivery, 

Classifieds 

TexSCAN Week of 
March 4, 2018

ACREAGE
36.5 acres, Edwards County. End of road privacy. 
Live oak, cedar cover. Whitetail, free ranging exotics, 
hogs, turkey. $5,050 down, $836/mo. (9.9%, 30-years) 
800-876-9720. www.ranchenterprisesltd.com.

EVENTS
The Pleasanton Cowboy Homecoming and Turn-N-
Burn Festival will be held March 9-10. BBQ Cook-
off, dances featuring Koe Wetzel on Saturday. Visit 
www.pleasantoncofc.com for information.
Yoakum, TX – Shelley King Band Outdoor Concert 
& Street Dance, 7:30-10 p.m., Fri., March 16, Carl 
& Mary Welhausen Library. Free Admission. Project 
supported by a grant from the Texas Commission on 
the Arts, The City of Yoakum-Hotel Occupancy Tax 
Board and Friends of the Library.

FINANCE
Receiving payments from real estate you 
sold? Get cash now! Call Steve: 888-870-2243. 
www.SteveCashesNotes.com.
Need Fast Cash For Your Business: Accounts 
Receivable Financing. Call Bill Harris 214-
632-1359 for details or toll-free 800-442-2740; 
mazonfactoring.com.

WANTED
FREON R12 WANTED: Certified buyer will PAY 
CA$H for R12 cylinders or cases of cans. (312) 291-
9169;  www.refrigerantfinders.com.

OIL AND GAS RIGHTS
We buy oil, gas & mineral rights. Both non- producing 
and producing including non-Participating Royalty 
Interest (NPRI). Provide us your desired price for an 
offer evaluation. 806-620-1422, LoboMineralsLLC@
gmail.com. Lobo Minerals, LLC, PO Box 1800, 
Lubbock, TX 79408-1800.

TRUCK DRIVERS
Quality Drive-Away Inc., Looking for CDL A or 
B drivers to deliver new trucks all over the US and 
Canada. Experience Preferred. Must have DOT 
physical and be willing to keep logs. No DUIs in 
the last 10 years, Clean MVR. Apply Online at 
www.qualitydriveaway.com or call 574-642-2023.

Drivers Wanted: Owner Ops & Company. Home 
daily. Excellent money & benefits. Great bonuses. 
Newer fleet. Call now for opportunities in your area! 
888-549-1882. PAM Transport.

SAWMILLS
Sawmills from only $4,397.00 – Make & Save 
Money with your own bandmill – Cut lumber any 
dimension. In stock ready to ship! Free info/DVD: 
www.NorwoodSawmills.com. 800-567-0404, 
Ext.300N.

TV/INTERNET
DISH TV $59.99 For 190 Channels $14.95 High 
Speed Internet. Free Installation, Smart HD DVR 
Included, Free Voice Remote. Some restrictions apply. 
Call 877-625-4980.

Texas Press Statewide Classified Network 
251 Participating Texas Newspapers • Regional Ads

Start At $250 • Email ads@texaspress.com
NOTICE: While most advertisers are reputable, we cannot guarantee products or services advertised. We 
urge readers to use caution and when in doubt, contact the Texas Attorney General at 800-621-0508 or the 
Federal Trade Commission at 877-FTC-HELP. The FTC web site is www.ftc.gov/bizop.

Recovery Room, 254-699-6105.

Vets, Pets & 
Livestock
Animal Medical- Full ser-
vice veterinary hospital, (254)947-
8800.
Salado Veterinary Hos-
pital- Small animal & exotic, 24 
Hr. Emergency. Monday-Friday, 
www.saladoveterinaryhospital.com 
- Like us on Facebook.

from, 2D
Earn more with Quality!
30 YEARS OF SERVICE

Looking for CDL A or B drivers to deliver
new trucks all over the US and Canada.

Experience preferred. Must have DOT physical and be
willing to keep logs. No DUIs in last 10 years, cleanMVR.

Apply Online at
www.qualitydriveaway.com
or call 574-642-2023
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®
Serving Central Texas, South 

Texas, Hays County, Bell County, 
Highland Lakes and the 

Texas hill Country.

3b/2.5ba/3,753sqft

5140 Lakeside Drive
Belton, TX

  This custom resort-style 
home offers a private setting 
nestled on 7.72 acres among 
trees. There is recently 
installed tile flooring in all the 
main areas. The Master Suite 
offers great views, sitting 
area,area, walk-in closet and a barn 
door entrance to the Master 
Bath featuring a retiled 
shower, dual sink vanity and a 
corner tub also with a lake 
view. A Texas-Size deck is 
offered to enjoy a stunning 
viewview of the lake, breathtaking 
sunrises, or the hot tub.

Hulona Millsaps
 Texas REALTOR®

(254) 394-9595

$649,000

Re-Listed!

www.colonialrealestate.com
For the week of 02-26-18  through 03-04-18

3-1-18 		  Theft 					     500 Pace Park
3-3-18 		  Drug arrest 				    300 Blk N I-35
3-3-18 		  DWI arrest 				    I-35 and FM 2843
3-3-18 		  Crash 					     Robertson Rd. & FM 2484
3-3-18 		  Theft 					     1100 South Ridge
3-4-18 		  Disable vehicle 				    I-35 and 285
3-4-18 		  Business alarm 				    200 S Main
3-4-18 		  Business alarm 				    400 N Main
	 As part of the Racial Profiling Law, the Salado Police Department is required to edu-
cate the public on the complaint process for citizens who believe they have been the vic-
tims of racial profiling. Anyone who wishes to file a complaint, or complement, regarding 
an officer of the Salado Police Department, may do so in any of the following ways: 1. 
Send a written letter to P.O. Box 219, Salado, Texas, Attention Chief Ashe. 2. Email to 
Chief Ashe at rashe@saladotx.gov 3. Come to the police station at 313 N Stagecoach Drive 
Salado Texas. 4. Call Chief Ashe at 254-947-5681.       
Follow us for frequent updates: 
Facebook:  Village of Salado Police Department  & Twitter:  @saladopd

Village of Salado Police Report


