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As ugly as he is, the Troll at the walking bridge is one of the many things that makes Salado so beautiful. Salado artist 
Troy Kelley sculpted the Troll and Billy Goat Gruff. Keep Salado Beautiful learned March 23 that it received a Gover-
nor’s Award from Keep Texas Beautiful that includes a $90,000 landscaping grant. (File Photo by Steve Raub)

	 Keep Texas Beautiful 
(KTB) announced the win-
ners of the 2018 Governor’s 
Community Achievement 
Awards (GCAA), one of the 
most prestigious annual en-
vironmental awards in Tex-
as.  
	 Salado learned on March 
23 that it is one of the 10 
communities in the state to 
win a Governor’s Commu-
nity Achievement Award. As 
a result, Keep Salado Beau-
tiful will be the recipient of 
a $90,000 landscaping grant, 
the award for communities 
of less than 3,000.
	 Nearby Nolanville was 
also an award recipient, of 
$110,000 for communities of 
3,001-5,500 residents.
	 The awards recognize the 
best grassroots environmen-
tal programs in the state, and 
are awarded in 10 different 
population categories. Ev-
ery community in Texas is 
eligible to apply for a Gover-
nor’s Community Achieve-
ment Award. A community’s 
environmental program is 
judged on achievements in 
seven different areas: com-
munity leadership and coor-
dination, education, public 
awareness, litter prevention 
and cleanup, litter law and il-
legal dumping enforcement, 
beautification and commu-
nity improvement and solid 
waste management.
	 Keep Texas Beautiful and 
TxDOT first began working 
together in the late 1960s 
and have shared the com-
mon goals of making Texas 

roadways more attractive 
and safe for motorists and 
encouraging tourism. Since 
1985, KTB has partnered 
with TxDOT to support its 
anti-litter and beautification 
programs such as Don’t mess 
with Texas Trash-Off and 
the Governor’s Community 
Achievement Awards. The 
GCAA program has recog-
nized outstanding communi-
ties for more than 50 years, 
with TxDOT providing land-
scape funding since 1986.
	 “We’re so thrilled to have 
the opportunity to partner 
with TxDOT on the GCAA 
Awards. Congratulations to 
each of the award winners 
for being recognized for 
their hard work to beautify 
communities across Texas,” 
said Suzanne Kho, Execu-
tive Director of Keep Texas 
Beautiful.
	 KTB will formally recog-
nize and present the awards 
during its 51st Annual 
Conference in Georgetown 
scheduled for June 11-13, 
2018. 
	 The communities of 
Salado, Nolanville, Brady, 
Seabrook, Katy, Lake Jack-
son, Grapevine, Baytown, 
Abilene and Irving were se-
lected by a panel of judges 
to share $2 million divided 
by population category from 
the Texas Department of 
Transportation (TxDOT), 
to be used for landscaping 
projects along local rights-
of-way within their commu-
nities.

	 The last day to register to 
vote in the May 5 local elec-
tions in April 5.
	 Early voting begins in the 
May 5 elections on April 23 
and ends on May 1.
	 Salado ISD has called for 
a $49.4 million bond election 
for the construction of a new 
middle school, safety corri-
dors at Thomas Arnold el-
ementary and improvements 
to existing and construction 
of new athletic facilities.
	 The local ballot will 
also have contested races 
for Mayor of the Village of 
Salado and Village of Salado 
Board of Aldermen.
	 Three candidates have 
filed for election as May-
or: David Williams, Linda 
Reynolds and Skip Blancett 
(incumbent).
	 Five candidates have 
filed for two positions on 
the Board of Aldermen: 
Judy Fields, Michael Cog-
gin, Frank Coachman (in-
cumbent), Chad Martin and 
Becky Butscher.
	 Early voting and election 
day voting will be at the Sal-
ado Civic Center on Main St. 
	 Early voting hours are 
these:
	 April 23: 7:30 a.m.-4:30 
p.m.
	 April 24: 7 a.m.-7 p.m.
	 April 25: 7:30 a.m.-4:30 
p.m.
	 April 26: 7:30 a.m.- 8 
p.m.
	 April 27: 7:30 a.m.-4:30 

p.m.
	 April 28: 7 a.m.-7 p.m.
	 April 29: 9 a.m.-5 p.m.
	 April 30: 7:30 a.m.-4:30 
p.m.
	 May 1: 7 a.m.-7 p.m.
	 Election day hours are 7 
a.m.-7 p.m.
	 Texas law requires the 
photo identification.
	 This requirement is effec-
tive immediately.
	 Here is a list of the ac-
ceptable forms of photo ID:
	 • Texas Driver License 
issued by the Texas Depart-
ment of Public Safety (DPS)
	 • Texas Election Identifi-
cation Certificate issued by 
DPS
	 • Texas Personal Identifi-
cation Card issued by DPS
	 • Texas Handgun License 
issued by DPS
	 • United States Military 
Identification Card contain-
ing the person’s photograph
	 • United States Citizen-
ship Certificate containing 
the person’s photograph
	 • United States Passport 
(book or card)
	 With the exception of the 
U.S. Citizenship Certificate, 
which does not expire, for 
voters aged 18-69, the ac-
ceptable form of photo iden-
tification may be expired no 
more than four years before 
being presented for voter 
qualification at the polling 
place. For voters aged 70 or 
older, the acceptable form 
of photo identification may 

be expired for any length of 
time if the identification is 
otherwise valid.
	 Election Identification 
Certificates are available 
from DPS driver license of-
fices during regular business 
hours.
	 Here is a list of the sup-
porting forms of ID that can 
be presented if the voter 
does not possess one of the 
forms of acceptable photo 
ID and cannot reasonably 
obtain one:
	 • copy or original of a 
government document that 
shows the voter’s name and 
an address, including the 
voter’s voter registration 
certificate;
	 • copy of or original cur-
rent utility bill;
	 • copy of or original bank 
statement;
	 • copy of or original gov-
ernment check;
	 • copy of or original pay-
check; or
	 • copy of or original of (a) 
a certified domestic (from a 
U.S. state or territory) birth 
certificate or (b) a document 
confirming birth admissible 
in a court of law which es-
tablishes the voter’s identity 
(which may include a for-
eign birth document).
	 After presenting one of 
the forms of supporting ID 
listed above, the voter must 
execute a Reasonable Im-
pediment Declaration.

Salado was busy as can be during the Texas Wine and Rogue Art Festival at Salado 
Wine Seller (above) and the Wildflower Arts & Crafts Festival at the Salado Civic Center 
(top photo).  At top, Margaret Fulton Grimmer is an artist who has shown her work in 
Salado for almost two decades. 

Salado earns
Keep Texas
Beautiful award

April 5 is last day to register 
to vote for May 5 elections 
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Rich 
Lowry

Market & Economic
Update
By Jeffrey W. McClure

	 President Donald 
Trump’s pick for CIA direc-
tor is about to experience a 
good Borking. 
	 No one doubts her pro-
fessionalism, and she’s been 
endorsed by Obama intel-
ligence officials. Yet Gina 
Haspel’s long career at the 
agency, including exten-
sive work undercover in the 
field, is getting blotted out 
by her reported involvement 
in the CIA’s black-site in-
terrogation program, which 
has become a warrant to say 
anything about her. 
	 Her critics assert she 
should be in jail, and The 
New York Times editorial 
page wrote about her nom-
ination under the headline 
“Having a Torturer Lead 
the C.I.A.” 
	 Not to be outdone in 
demagogic attacks on any-
one associated with our 
national security apparatus, 
Sen. Rand Paul calls Haspel 
“the head cheerleader for 
waterboarding,” and claims 
she mocked a detainee for 
his drooling. The only prob-
lem is that this anecdote 
comes from a book by a 
contractor who worked with 
the CIA, James Mitchell, 
and it describes a man, not 
a woman, making the com-
ment. 
	 Factual accuracy aside, 
the attacks on Haspel are 
ahistorical in that they ig-
nore the context of the CIA 
program, and unfair inso-
far as they portray her as a 

Don’t Bork Gina Haspel

remorselessly cruel prime 
mover behind it. 
	 The interrogation pro-
gram began when al-Qaida 
operative Abu Zubaydah 
was captured in March 
2002. At the time, we be-
lieved another 9/11-style 
attack was imminent, and 
preventing it had an urgen-
cy fueled by raw memories 
of an event that was literally 
yesterday’s news. 
	 The interrogation pro-
gram wasn’t a rogue oper-
ation. The CIA repeatedly 
briefed select congressional 
leaders, especially the top 
Republicans and Democrats 
on the intelligence com-
mittees. It was approved at 
the highest level of the U.S. 
government, and the CIA 
sought, and got, explicit le-
gal approval from the De-
partment of Justice.
	 Haspel is connected in 
the press to the interroga-
tions of Abu Zubaydah, 
although the CIA hasn’t 
confirmed her participation 
and insists much of the re-
porting about her work in 
this period is erroneous.
	 But let’s consider Zu-
baydah’s case. He was not 
a detainee who had nothing 
to tell us, as he is often por-
trayed by critics of the CIA. 
Shortly after his capture, he 
identified Khalid Sheikh 

Mohammed as the master-
mind of 9/11.
	 The enhanced interroga-
tions were brutal. Zubaydah 
was struck, placed in stress 
positions, confined in small 
boxes and repeatedly water-
boarded. During one ses-
sion, he became unrespon-
sive. By any standard, this 
was extreme and right up to 
the legal line.
	 The CIA didn’t learn of 
any planned attack in the 
U.S.; it did become confi-
dent that Zubaydah wasn’t 
holding back anything. 
From his capture to his 
transfer to the Department 
of Defense on Sept. 5, 2006, 
information from him pro-
duced 766 intelligence re-
ports. 
	 In the cold light of day, 
we would have handled all 
of this differently. But this 
was a national failing, and 
at a time when we under-
standably believed we were 
in a race to prevent another 
atrocity on our shores. To 
punish Gina Haspel more 
than 15 years later for do-
ing what her country asked 
her to do, and in response 
to what she was told were 
lawful orders, would be a 
travesty and a disgrace.
But so were the confirma-
tion hearings of Robert 
Bork.
	 Rich Lowry is editor 
of the National Review. 
(c) 2018 by King Features 
Synd., Inc.

The Markets
 	 The U.S. stock market, as 
represented by the S&P 500 
Stock Index (SPX) closed out 
the week at 2588.26, mark-
ing the worst weekly decline 
since January 2016, down 
5.95 percent for the week. 
From its high on January 26, 
the SPX is now down 9.91 
percent, putting it within less 
than a tenth of a percent of 
the commonly-held defini-
tion of a “correction.” Shares 
of manufacturers, steelmak-
ers, and aluminum producers 
led the decline with Century 
Aluminum down 19 percent 
for the week. United States 
Steel was down 13 percent 
and Caterpillar down anoth-
er 5.6 percent.
 	 The culprit in this week’s 
decline was the potential ef-
fect of tariffs. It began with 
the President’s announce-
ment of tariffs on tens of 
billions of dollars’ worth of 
Chinese imports followed by 
counter-tariffs on American 
exports to China. Ironical-
ly, the steel and aluminum 
industries, those industries 
supposedly for which the 
steel and aluminum tariffs 
were created, now appear to 
be the ones that may suffer 
the most in the developing 
trade war.
 	 Meanwhile, the bench-
mark 10-year U.S. Treasury 
note yield declined to 2.815 
percent, a decline of 0.141 
points or about 5 percent 
from its recent high of 2.956 
percent. The decline was 
widely credited to a percep-
tion that the tariffs would 
have a negative effect on 
economic growth. The dol-
lar declined against world 
currencies by 0.66 percent 
while gold rose 2.52 percent 
to $1,352.90 on dollar weak-
ness and a flight to safety in 
the face of the potential trade 
wars.
The Economy
 	 U.S. domestic factory du-
rable goods orders rose in 
February 3.1 percent from 
January, the best gain in 
eight months and were up 9.1 
percent since last February. 

Business investment was up 
1.8 percent to $67.83 billion 
for the month, the highest 
level since 2014. The cause 
seems to be the new tax law 
that allows an immediate tax 
write-off for large commer-
cial equipment purchases. 
There was a 2.7 percent in-
crease in demand for Amer-
ican made primary metals 
in February, raising the to-
tal increase to 13.7 percent 
for the first two months of 
the year compared with last 
year.
 	 The acceleration in the 
domestic industrial sectors 
of our economy was mea-
sured just before President 
Trump’s announcement of 
steel and aluminum tariffs 
and should serve as a good 
benchmark for the tariffs’ 
domestic economic effect. 
Comments by manufactur-
ing executives since the tariff 
announcements suggest that 
the accelerating manufactur-
ing growth could be slowed 
or even reversed by the met-
als tariffs and the emerging 
trade war. Take note: The 
combination of massive tax 
cuts, large increases in gov-
ernment spending, and trade 
tariffs constitutes a major 
experiment in macroeco-
nomics. Over the next couple 
of years, we should see the 
results. Hopefully, we can 
learn from them.
 	 The Federal Reserve 
Board announced anoth-
er 0.25 percent rise in the 
interbank lending rate to a 
range between 1.5 percent 
and 1.75 percent. In its state-
ment, the Fed reaffirmed its 
intent to continue to raise 
interest rates at a moderate 
pace to head off a spike in 
inflation. What was not said 
but widely understood was 
that a combination of a $1.4 
trillion tax cut and a sepa-
rate $1.3 trillion spending 
bill could easily overstim-

ulate the economy during 
the next twelve to eighteen 
months and lead to a rise in 
inflation. The Fed’s prime 
mission is to prevent things 
like that from happening, so 
it will need to take preemp-
tive action by raising rates.
 	 U.S. new home sales 
declined slightly in Febru-
ary, down 0.6 percent for 
the month with the median 
price of a new home up 9.7 
percent from one year ago. 
The slowdown was general-
ly presumed to be a result of 
the rise in 30-year mortgage 
rates to 4.45 percent. At the 
same time, existing home 
sales, which compose most 
of the home market, rose 3 
percent in February. Existing 
home median values are up 
5.9 percent from February of 
2017.
 	 Economists surveyed 
by the Wall Street Journal 
continue to expect solid 
economic growth this year 
but have lowered the annual 
total. They also concluded 
that the health of the Ameri-
can economy currently faces 
a major threat if the tariff 
and counter-tariff trade war 
continues to develop. In a 
worst-case scenario where 
the U.S. withdraws from the 
North American Free Trade 
Agreement (NAFTA) and 
a trade war with China es-
calates, the U.S. could lose 
800,000 jobs and potentially 
enter a recession in 2019 or 
2020. For the short-term, the 
survey reported a consensus 
that economic growth would 
continue in 2018. That view 
was confirmed by Thurs-
day’s release by the Confer-
ence Board of their Index of 
Leading Economic Indica-
tors, all of which were posi-
tive. The Conference Board’s 
director of economic fore-
casting stated that at least for 
the rest of 2018, a recession 
was extremely unlikely. 

Superintendent’s 
Corner
by Dr. Michael  Novotny

Market drops 5.95% in one week

Here are some facts on growth, 
academics, finances in SISD
	 Next Thursday, April 5, 
is the final day to register in 
order to be eligible to vote 
in the May 5 Salado ISD 
bond election.  
	 The website to register 
is www.votetexas.gov/regis-
ter-to-vote/
	 This week I am provid-
ing a few facts regarding our 
school district’s academics, 
finances, and growth.
Academics
	 This school year our 
district earned the post-sec-
ondary readiness distinc-
tion from the Texas Edu-
cation Agency.  This award 
is based on the following 
nine criteria: State of Tex-
as Assessments of Aca-
demic Readiness (STAAR) 
scores, graduation rate, 
graduation plan rate, per-
centage of graduates that 
are college ready, percent-
age of high school students 
that complete an advanced 
or dual-credit course, Ad-
vanced Placement (AP) 
exam scores, SAT and ACT 
test participation, SAT and 
ACT test performance, and 
the percentage of graduates 
that complete one or more 
coherent sequences of Ca-
reer Technology Education 
(CTE) courses.
	 There are 1,216 school 
districts in Texas and we 
are one of only 58 districts 
(fewer than 5percent) that 
received this recognition.  
Out of the 159 school dis-
tricts in Central Texas 
(Austin/Waco regions) we 
are only of only six districts 
that received this recogni-
tion.  We are the only school 
district to receive this rec-
ognition out of all twelve 
districts in Bell County.
Finances
	 Our school district re-
ceived the highest (superior) 
rating and a perfect score of 
100 on the Financial Integ-

rity Rating System of Texas 
(FIRST) rating.  We have 
the lowest tax rate in our 
school district in the last 27 
years (since the 1989-1990 
school year).  In the past 
years we have refinanced 
previous bonds four times 
and saved our taxpayers a 
total of $3,138,337.
Growth
	 Our district’s enrollment 
has increased from 1,348 to 
1,854 students during the 
past five years.  This is a 
38percent increase, which 
is the highest percentage 
increase of all 81 school 
districts in the Waco region.  
Of those 506 additional stu-
dents, 410 of them (81per-
cent) are resident students 
that moved into the district, 
while 96 of them (19per-
cent) are out-of-district 
transfer students.  Over a 
year ago (January 2017), we 
discontinued accepting new 
transfer students with the 
following three exceptions: 
children of employees, sib-
lings of current transfer 
students, and children of 

active duty military or dis-
abled veterans.  As a result, 
our transfer student enroll-
ment decreased from 254 
students last year to 237 
students this year.  In spite 
of this, our enrollment still 
increased by 100 students 
because we have 117 more 
resident students move into 
our district this year.
	 Our district’s enrollment 
is projected to increase an-
other 939 students during 
the next ten years.  These 
enrollment projections are 
based on only resident stu-
dent growth and a continu-
ing decline in transfer stu-
dents.  If the May 5 bond 
election is approved, the 
new middle school would 
open in August 2020.  By 
then, our enrollment is pro-
jected to increase by anoth-
er 306 resident students.
	 Please remember that 
next Thursday, April 5, is 
the deadline to register in 
order to be eligible to vote 
in the May 5 Salado ISD 
bond election.
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By Kyle Isakower

	 The Trump Adminis-
tration unveiled an agenda 
for “energy dominance” 
shortly after taking office, 
promising to curb the glob-
al influence of countries 
like Russia and China with 
American energy exports.  
	 Whether or not the ad-
ministration succeeds will 
depend a great deal on 
ongoing trade talks with 
Canada and Mexico. U.S. 
negotiators continue to 
negotiate terms to mod-
ernize the North Ameri-
can Free Trade Agreement 
(NAFTA), the trade pact 
between the U.S., Mexico, 
and Canada. 
	 NAFTA has fostered a 
thriving North American 
energy market that current-
ly supports millions of U.S. 
jobs and keeps costs down 
for American consumers. If 
negotiators agree to elimi-
nate or weaken NAFTA’s 
Investor-State Dispute Set-
tlement (ISDS), we would 
open the door for Chinese 
and Russian energy inter-
ests to exert their influence 
right here in North Ameri-
ca. 
	 That’s a national securi-
ty outcome that no propo-
nent of U.S. “energy dom-
inance” would understand 
or support. 
	 NAFTA eliminated tar-
iffs on several oil and nat-
ural gas products between 
the United States, Canada, 
and Mexico.  In so doing, 

it has enabled each of our 
nations to benefit from one 
another’s considerable en-
ergy resources and techni-
cal capacities.
	 Consider America’s re-
lationship with Mexico. 
The United States is a net 
importer of crude oil from 
Mexico.  Yet much of that 
product is refined in Amer-
ican facilities and exported 
back to Mexico.  In fact, 
Mexico receives roughly a 
fifth of all refined petro-
leum product exports from 
the United States. 
	 Our southern neighbor is 
also a significant and grow-
ing importer of American 
natural gas, accounting for 
a whopping 60.2 percent of 
America’s natural gas ex-
ports. Meanwhile, Canada 
accounts for 61 percent of 
America’s crude oil exports 
and approximately a third 
of natural gas exports. 
	 This economic relation-
ship has been enormously 
beneficial for Americans. 
The U.S. Chamber of Com-
merce recently estimated 
that trade with Canada and 
Mexico supports nearly 14 
million American jobs.  
	 NAFTA has also helped 
to create a built-in advan-
tage for the U.S. to access 
Mexico’s newly opened en-
ergy market. US companies 
won 15 percent of the 47 
blocks awarded to foreign 
investors since 2015, while 
companies from Russia and 
China combined won 13 
percent of these blocks.

	 This could change 
quickly if NAFTA falls 
apart. By 2030, America’s 
diminished role in Mexi-
co’s energy economy could 
force that nation to rely 
more on investment from 
Russia and China.
	 That’s precisely what 
happened after America 
ceased to be the biggest 
investor in Venezuela’s oil 
sector. Within a few years, 
China and Russia had 
swooped in, loaning the na-
tion $60 billion to strength-
en its energy industry. 
	 In a post-NAFTA world, 
Mexico could easily shift 
to using funds from Russia 
and China to dramatically 
increase its own production 
and refining capacity, and 
making it less reliant on the 
United States as a result. 
	 Fortunately, U.S. trade 
representatives can avoid 
that scenario by ensuring 
that NAFTA is not only 
preserved, but strength-
ened. Ideally, a renegotiat-
ed trade pact would main-
tain an open energy market 
between the United States, 
Mexico, and Canada by 
making NAFTA perma-
nent and strengthening 
ISDS.
	 Today’s vibrant, inte-
grated North American 

energy market has served 
Americans well for years, 
while also keeping our 
nation’s global energy ri-
vals at bay. Failing to pre-
serve NAFTA would leave 
America less prosperous, 
less secure, and less influ-
ential around the world.

	 Kyle Isakower is the vice 
president for regulatory 
and economic policy at the 
American Petroleum Insti-
tute.

NAFTA supplies America 
with energy & power
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Community Life

Dr. Travis Burleson, Senior Pastor

WEDNESDAY
5 p.m.  Fellowship Meal
5:30 p.m. Jr. High MIDWEEK
6 p.m.  Adult Bible Study
6 p.m. ESL
6 p.m.   Kingdom Kids (K - 6)
6 p.m.  Bible Drill (4 - 6)
7:07 p.m. High School MIDWEEK

www.fbcsalado.org
(254) 947-5465

Main St. at the Creek

SUNDAY
8:30 a.m. Classic Worship Service
9:45 a.m. Bible Study
11 a.m.    Contemporary 
    Worship Service

  

IH-35 at Blacksmith Rd.
947-5241 

Sunday
Bible Classes • 9 a.m.      Worship • 10 a.m.

Spanish Worship - Call Church for times

Wednesday
Bible Classes • 6:30 p.m.

The Salado Church of Christ
‘Shaped by His Cross, Sharing His 

truth, Showing His love.’ 

 “We invite you to worship 
with us at any available 
opportunity. You will find 
a group of sincere, God-
loving and Christ-exalting 
people, who will make you 
feel at home with our church 
family.    
  -Joe Keyes, minister

www.devereauxjewelers.com

Schanna  (254) 421-5173

Salado’s Hair Shop
213 Mill Creek Dr., Suite 160

Schanna  
(254) 421-5173

Salado’s Hair Shop
213 Mill Creek Dr., Suite 160

Salado’s Hair Shop
213 Mill Creek Dr., Suite 160

Schanna  
(254) 421-5173

Salado’s Hair Shop
213 Mill Creek Dr., Suite 160

Schanna  
(254) 421-5173

Salado’s Hair Shop
213 Mill Creek Dr., Suite 160

Schanna  
(254) 421-5173

WWW.SALADOUMC.ORG
650 ROYAL ST.

SALADO, TX 76571

   
CELEBRATE  WITH

SALADO UNITED METHODIST CHURCH

EASTER SUNDAY
APRIL 1, 2018

SUNRISE SERVICE  
7 AM / 7 AM / PACE PARK

TRADITIONAL WORSHIP  
9 AM  / WORSHIP CENTER

SUNDAY SCHOOL 
 10 AM

MODERN WORSHIP 
11:15 AM / HISTORIC CHAPEL

St. Joseph’s 
Episcopal Church

881 North Main Street
947-3160

S t J o s e p h S a l a d o . o rg

Sunday School
Sun.  9 a.m.

Holy Eucharist
Sun.  10 a.m.

St. Stephen
Catholic 
Church

Mass Schedule
Tuesday - 6 p.m. 

Wed & Thurs - 8:30 a.m.
Friday - Noon

Saturday - 5:30 p.m.
Confesssions 4:30-5:15 p.m. 

or call for an appointment
Friday

Adoration (Holy Hour) 11 a.m.
Sunday

 (English) 9 a.m.
(Spanish) 11 a.m. 

Office Hours: Monday - Friday 
9 a.m. - Noon & 1:30 - 3 p.m.

601 FM 2268 
947-8037

www.saintstephenchurch.org

Religious Education
 Classes - Wednesday

 K thru 12th            5:30 - 8 p.m. 

	 Heritage Country 
Church will celebrate  its 
first anniversary  on March 
31 with a full day of activi-
ties.
	 The celebration begins 
begins with an Easter Egg 
hunt at 10 a.m. followed by 
lunch.
	 Lunch will be provided, 
along with live music, guest 
speakers and activities for 
all ages. State Rep. Hugh 

Heritage Country Church 
celebrates one year

Shine will be one of the 
guest speakers for the event. 
	 Heritage Country 
Church is located at 9929 
Lark Trail in Salado.
	 For more information, 
contact Courtney White-
field at heritagecountry-
church@gmail.com or call  
254-913-6119.

	 Salado youth are invited 
to a special Youth Worship 
Night April 6 at Tablerock 
Amphitheater on Royal St.
	 Youth Worship Night is 
a community-wide worship 
experience for the Salado 
Youth. 
	 The event starts at 8 p.m. 
April 6 with two bands and 
a speaker performing. 
	 Worship Night centers 
around three main ideas: 
unity in Christ, Giving 
back, and most of all Wor-
ship. 
	 The event will help ben-
efit the community Heart 
and Hands Ministry with 
canned good donations, 
monetary donations as well 

as opportunities to volun-
teer and serve. Heart and 
Hands Ministry will be 

at the event to accept any 
canned good or monetary 
donations. 

	 Worship Night is a free 
event open to all youth of 
Salado aiming to unify to-
gether and worship God as 
one body of Christ regard-
less of denominational dif-
ferences.
	 Union House will per-
form during the event. 
Union House is composed 
of college students who 
come from different cities 
in Texas. Most of them met 
in San Antonio while at-
tending Baptist University 
of the Americas. 
	 Karl Baker will be the 
speaker for the evening. 
He is the Assistant Baptist 
Student Ministry Director 
at UMHB since 2016. He is 
a 2014 Graduate of UMHB 
and is currently working to-
ward a Master’s degree. He 
is married to Melanie.
	

Karl Baker

Union House 

Youth Worship Night held April 6 
8 p.m. at Tablerock

	 Dearly Departed playing 
March  30-April 22 at the 
The Palace Playhouse lo-
cated directly across from 
the Palace Theatre at 817 S. 
Austin Avenue in George-
town.  It is a storefront 
transformed into an inti-
mate Black Box Theatre.
 	 Dearly Departed, written 
by David Bottrell and Jessie 
Jones is  directed by Ashlee 
Zoch.
	 In the backwoods of the 
Bible Belt, the beleaguered 
Turpin family proves that 
living and dying in the 
South are seldom tidy and 
often hilarious. Despite 
their earnest efforts to pull 
themselves together for 
their father’s funeral, the 
Turpins’ other problems 
keep overshadowing the 
solemn occasion.  However, 
they manage to help each 
other through their hours of 
need.
​	 *Standard and Premium 
Flex Passes can be used for 
this show.
​	 Adult-$30 Seniors (55+) 
/ Military / Students-$28
*$1 ticketing fee will be 
added per ticket at check-
out.
**Student Rush Tickets $18 
at the door with student ID.
​	 Tickets on sale now
www.georgetownpalace.
com.

Palace Playhouse
Tickets on sale

Salado Village Voice 
is your community 
newspaper for almost 
40 years. 
Share  your news with 
your Village. Send us 
your church activities, 
family news:  wed-
dings, anniversaries, 
a new baby or the loss 
of a loved one. We are 
part of the glue that 
makes a Village.
Send emails  with 
photos to:
News@
saladovillagevoice.
com
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Dossman 
Funeral Home

2525 N. Main • Belton

IN SERVICE TO OUR FELLOW MAN

 933-2525
serving all of Bell County

DossmanFH.com

gracesalado.com  |  Sunday at 10:30am  |  5798 FM 2484 in Salado

A people of biblical faith,
eternal hope, and radical love.

Obituaries

Lobby
 Mon - Fri  9 a.m. - 3 p.m.

Drive-in
 Mon - Thur 7:30 a.m. - 4 p.m. 

 Fri  7:30 a.m. - 5:30 p.m.
Sat   9 a.m.- noon

Member FDIC

Main Street at 
Thomas Arnold Road, Salado

(254) 947-5852 fsbcentex.com 

Central Texas Heart and Soul

Heritage Country Church
1st Anniversary Celebration

10 a.m. on March 31 
FESTIVITIES FOR ALL AGES

Easter Egg Hunt
Lunch & Live Music

Guest Speaker: Hugh Shine
9929 Lark Trail, Salado

LASTOVICA
Fine Jewelers, Inc.

“Known for Service” 
Prompt In-Store Jewelry Repairs 

Diamond Sales • Custom Casting • Diamond 
Appraisal • Watch Repair • Diamond Setting 

Jewelry Repair
1202 S 31st St. & Ave. L • Temple

773-5772

16258 Gooseneck Road,  Salado
Church service starts 10 am

(254) 947-7211
www.3ccowboyfellowship.org
Follow events on our website calendar

Rev. David N. Mosser
 650 Royal Street    
  (254) 947-5482

www.saladoumc.org 

Office hours:  
Mon - Fri 8:30 a.m. - 4 p.m.
Facebook.com/saladoumc

Sunday, April 1  Easter Sunday
7 am Sunrise Service @ Pace Park
9 am Worship Service in Worship Center Traditional

10 am Sunday School all ages

11:15 am Worship Service in Chapel Contemporary

Wednesday, April 4
5-7:30 pm “FourTwelve” Youth
5:15 pm Fellowship Meal
5:15 pm Trash to Treasure
6 - 7 pm Pastor’s Lectionary Study
6 - 7 pm M & M Kids

	 Services for Ernestyne 
Guess Spencer, 86, of Clif-
ton, formerly of Burleson 
and Salado were held at 
Salado Historic Cemetery, 
Friday, March 23 at 12:30 
p.m.
	 Ernestyne Spencer died 
March 20, 2018 at her res-
idence in Clifton.
	 She was born October 
11, 1931 in Decatur, Texas 
to Ernest and Edith Guess.  
The Guess family moved 
to Salado where she attend-

ed school and graduated in 
1948.  She met and married 
James Harold Spencer and 
they moved to McGregor.
	 Ernestyne Spencer 
worked as a bookkeeper in 
the medical field most of 
her life.  She was an avid 
reader, gardener and most 
important, member of the 
Red Hat Society.  
	 She  is preceded in death 
by her husband, two broth-
ers, James and Liles Guess 
and one sister, Juanda Gene 
Guess.
	 She is survived by Don-
na Kay Haynes and hus-
band Donald Spencer, two 
grandchildren, Tammy 
Spencer of Grandbury, 
and Cliff Haynes and wife 
Glenda of Clifton, two great 
great-grandchildren and 
numerous nieces and neph-
ews and two brothers, Larry 
Guess of Salado and Daryl 
Guess of Georgetown..

More than 230 individuals attended the Salado Area Republican Women’s Fine China Luncheon March22 at Ten-
roc.  There were 30 decorated tables and two that won first prize for best table. Lora Zuber (center) shown with her 
two daughters represent Watson Dental Laboratories, winner of best table in the Business Category. Shirley Lett 
won first place by an individual. Each recipient received a gift certificate for dining at the Barton House.

	 The community is invit-
ed to the annual Communi-
ty Easter Sunrise Service 
at 7 a.m. April 1 in Pace 
Park.
	 This will be the final 
community sunrise service.
	 Local churches will also 
have the following Holy 
Week services: 
	 Following is a list of 
some of those events:
	 Salado United Method-
ist Church 
	 Maundy Thursday ser-
vice 6 p.m. March 29 in the 
Worship Center.  
	 Good Friday March 30: 
Worship service 6 p.m. in 
the Worship Center: “The 
Seven Last Words of Jesus 
Christ.” A Commemoration 
of Good Friday in Music
	 Easter Sunday April 1:	  
	 9  a.m. Worship in Wor-
ship Center (Traditional)
	 10  a.m. Sunday School
	 11:15 a.m. Worship in 
Chapel (Contemporary)
	 St. Stephen Catholic 
Church will have the fol-
lowing Lenten and Easter 
events:
	 March 29: Church Youth  
Lock-In. The youth will 
spend the night in final 
preparation for the com-
ing of Christ at Easter. The 
church will begin Thurs-
day evening and spend the 
night on the church grounds 
doing a variety of fun and 
faith-filled activities. Friday 
morning will be spent pre-
paring to lead the Live Sta-
tions of the Cross at noon 
on Good Friday.
	 Holy Thursday: Bilin-
gual Mass at 7 p.m. Open-
ing of the Easter Triduum 
with Mass at 7 p.m.. Ado-
ration will follow until mid-
night.
	 Good Friday March 30:
	 Stations of the Cross: 
The Saint Stephen Youth 
Group will lead and dra-
matize the Stations of the 
Cross on Good Friday be-
ginning at noon.  
	 Veneration of the Cross 
(Bilingual) at 3 p.m.: “Be-
hold the wood of the cross, 
on which hung the salvation 

of the world!”
	 March 31 Easter Vig-
il Bilingual Mass 8 p.m.  
Come and be the first to 
celebrate the Resurrection 
of Christ and his victory 
over sin and death.
	 Easter Sunday, April 1
	 Easter Sunday Masses 
are at the regularly sched-
uled Sunday Mass times of 
9 a.m. and 11 a.m.
	 Easter Egg Hunt: Chil-
dren are invited to bring 
their Easter baskets and 
hunt for Easter Eggs at 
10:30 a.m. 
	 St. Joseph Episcopal 
Church
	 March 29: Maundy 
Thursday service, 6:30 p.m., 
Maundy Thursday liturgy 
with Holy Eucharist Rite 2 
followed by Stripping of the 
Altar.
	 March 30: Good Fri-
day  service at 6:30 p.m. 
Self guided Stations of the 
Cross are from 10 a.m. until 
5 p.m. Good Friday Liturgy 
at 6:30 p.m. Group Stations 
of the Cross will follow the 
service outside, weather 
permitting.
	 April 1: Easter Sunday, 
10 a.m. Confirmation and 
Reception at 10 a.m. ser-
vice. Easter Egg Hunt and 
Brunch will follow the 10 
a.m. service. Don’t forget to 
bring in wildflowers for the 
flowering of the Cross be-
fore the service. The Cross 
will be outside of the church 
in the courtyard.
Presbyterian Church 
of Salado
	 March 29: All are wel-
come for a Maundy Thurs-
day Service at 6 p.m..  This 
will include Holy Commu-
nion in a setting similar to 
the origional Jewish Pass-
over setting and will in-
clude a light meal.
	 Easter Sunday April 1: 
Easter Service will be at 10 
a.m. Easter Morning.  The 
church will have special 
music to help celebrate Je-
sus Christ Rising from the 
Dead.
Heritage Country Church

	 Heritage Country 
Church will celebrate  its 
first anniversary  on March 
31 with a full day of activi-
ties.
	 The celebration begins 
with an Easter Egg hunt at 
10 a.m. followed by lunch.
	 Lunch will be provided, 
along with live music, guest 
speakers and activities for 
all ages.
	 Heritage Country 
Church is located at 9929 
Lark Trail in Salado.
	 For more information, 
contact Courtney White-
field at heritagecountry-
church@gmail.com or call  
254-913-6119.
Salado Church of Christ
	 Salado Church of Christ 
will have regular services 
on Easter Sunday with Sun-
day school classes at 9 a.m. 
followed by worship ser-
vices at 10 a.m.
First Baptist Church 

of Salado
	 First Baptist Church 
will have regular services 
on Easter Sunday, April 1: 
Classic Worship Service at 
8:30 a.m., Small Group Bi-
ble Study (Sunday School) 
at 9:45 a.m. and Contem-
porary Worship Service at 
11:00 a.m.
Grace Baptist Church 
	 Grace Baptist Church 
invites you to worship with 
yon Easter Sunday morn-
ing beginning at April 1 at 
10:30 a.m.

	

Holy Week Church Services 

Ernestyne Guess Spencer

....serving those who love and remember

(254) 947-0066
949 West Village Road, Salado

BroeckerFuneralHome.com



Page 6A  SALADO Village Voice, March 29, 2018

Alton D. Thiele PC
Serving Central Texas Since 1979

• Tax Return Preparation & Planning
• Small Business Accounting Service
• Accounting & Auditing Service
• Business Counsulting
• Payroll Check Processing & Reporting
• Tax-Exempt Organization Consulting
• Quickbooks Installation & Consulting
• Retirement Planning

Alton D. Thiele, CPA
Kevin S. Cowan, CPA

254-939-0701 alton@adtcpa.com
toll free 1-800-772-7043
300 E Ave C, Belton

adtcpa.com

	 Salado resident Jennifer 
M. McGregor, MHA is the 
new Assistant Director for 
the Austin VA Outpatient 
Clinic.
	 “With this new leader-
ship now in place, our Aus-
tin Clinic is set to meet the 
growing needs of the Veter-
an population in Austin and 
its metropolitan area,” said 
Christopher R. Sandles, Di-
rector of CTVHCS.  “With 
McGregor leading day-to-
day operations at the Aus-
tin, I am confident we will 
continue to expand services, 
improve operations, and 
guide customer service to a 
new level of excellence.“ 
	 As the Assistant Direc-
tor for Austin, McGregor 
has the primary oversight 
for the administrative, reg-
ulatory, capital investments, 
labor relations, customer 
service and community 
partnership functions at 
the clinic plus she will pro-
vide oversite of Voluntary 
Service, Chaplain Service, 
Prosthetics and Sensory 
Aids Service, Corporate 
Compliance Section, and 
Customer Service Section 
across CTVHCS. 
	 McGregor began her VA 
career in June 2003 as an 
Administrative Resident at 
CTVHCS.  She served as 
the Administrative Officer 
for the Associate Director 
for Patient/Nursing Ser-
vice (ADPNS) from 2004 
to 2007; Health Systems 
Specialist, Revenue Co-
ordinator monitoring and 

evaluating the Veterans 
Equitable Resource Alloca-
tion (VERA) Program from 
2007 to 2008; Health Sys-
tems Specialist for the Ad-
ministrative Officer to the 
Chief of Staff from 2008 to 
2009.  and Chief, Systems 
Analysis and Management 
Section from 2009 to 2010 
where she was responsible 
for gathering data for the 
revenue generation cycle to 
identify, improve, and re-
fine systems and processes 
to enhance revenue genera-
tion.  McGregor has experi-
ence with System Redesign 
Program and Lean Six Sig-
ma programs which work to 
ensure a continual process 
improvement throughout 
the organization. 
	 In August 2010,  Mc-
Gregor was selected as the 
Veterans Integrated Service 
Network (VISN) 17, Busi-
ness Implementation Man-
ager where she served as the 
VISN 17 Choice Champion 
ensuring facilities within 
the network were imple-
menting the ever-changing 
Choice legislative policy, 

procedures, and processes 
for VA Community Care.  
During her tenure, she also 
served as the Acting, Assis-
tant Director at CTVHCS, 
supervising Medical Ad-
ministration Service, En-
vironmental Management 
Service, Prosthetics and 
Sensory Aid Devices, Lo-
gistics, and Canteen Ser-
vices. 
	 McGregor served as 
member to the VA Com-
munity Care Future State 
Transition Team under the 
Principal Deputy Under 
Secretary for Health.  Ms. 
McGregor also worked with 
internal and stakeholders to 
develop the plan to Consol-
idate VA Community Care 
Programs in response to 
the Congressional request 
contained in the “Veterans 
Budget and Choice Im-
provement Act.”  
	 Earlier this year, Mc-
Gregor served as the Act-
ing Associate Director at 
the South Texas Veterans 
Health Care System.  With 
a FY15 budget of $678 mil-
lion, she was responsible 
for the daily operations for 
Medical Administration 
Service, Prosthetics, Lo-
gistics, Human Resources, 
Fiscal, Decision Support 
Systems, Data Management 
and Radiation Safety. 
	 McGregor holds a Mas-
ter’s Degree in Healthcare 
Administration and Bach-
elor of Science in Biology, 
Minor in Psychology from 
the University of Mary Har-
din-Baylor. 

McGregor named Assistant 
Director Austin VA Clinic

J. David Stanford

November 26, 1945-March 25, 2018
	 J. David Stanford, Esq. passed away peacefully on 
March 25, 2018 at his home in Salado, Texas.  He was pre-
ceded in death by parents Hulen Preston and Dorothy Jane 
Knight Stanford and sister Roe Sharon.  He is survived by 
his devoted daughter Shannon Stanford Seib, husband Bri-
an, loving grandchildren Jackson Preston and Ellyn Ann, 
of Round Rock, and nephew, Collin Stanford of Austin.  He 
was a member of Salado United Methodist Church. 
 	 David’s life began November, 26, 1945 in Temple, Texas 
and he moved to Salado where he graduated from Sala-
do High School, playing numerous sports.   Mr. Stanford 
earned his BBA at North Texas State University where he 
was an active member of Kappa Sigma Fraternity, and, in 1970, he earned his law de-
gree from The University of Texas Law School, where he was associate editor of the 
Texas Law Review.  
	 Following graduation he married Jan Ellyn Jackson, of Cleburne, and moved to El 
Paso, where he began professional practice with Kemp, Smith, White, Duncan and 
Hammond Law Firm.  There his daughter Shannon was born. 
 	 Mr. Stanford developed a specialized focus in investment banking and financial 
institution representation.   In the early eighties, he was the Chief Executive Officer 
of Quinn & Co., Inc., a regional investment banking firm serving four southwestern 
states.  In 1986, he opened a Dallas office and served as President for Ryan, Beck & 
Co./Southwest, another regional subsidiary of a national investment banking firm. In 
1988, he established an independent practice, Stanford & Co.  
 	 In 1993, he returned to his hometown of Salado and established his practice there. 
He continued his focus on the acquisition and sale of regional banks, representing 
among others First State Bank of Austin owner Joe Long, and First State Bank of Cen-
tral Texas owner Don Grobowsky, of Temple.  
 	 Throughout his career, he served as officer and director of a number of civic, chari-
table and bar organizations as well as a board member for several financial institutions.
 	 J. David loved the life of a gentleman rancher.   He raised cattle on his own 7K 
Ranch in Salado and partnered in 7KX Ranch with cousin Glenn Hodge.  David bred 
and raced champion quarter horses.  He enjoyed a successful partnership in S Bar S 
Racing with partner K.C. Carden, of Sheridan, Wyoming.  Together, they won the 
Bank of American Racing Challenge leading owner awards in 2006 and 2007.  He 
also enjoyed a successful partnership with Triple M Farms breeders Ronnie and Ken 
Menard, of Broussard, Louisiana.
 	 The family deeply appreciates the tireless support of his friend of many years, Cindi 
Plasek, his unofficial second mother, Mary Hodge, and his loyal employees, Hermere-
gildo Urquiza and Lana Brown. They also wish to thank Linda, Monica, Micalyn, 
Rosemary and Jessica and Misty, of Interim Hospice for their caring assistance, and 
Drs. Curtis Mirkes, Lazaros Nikolaidis, Nimrit Goraya and Mark Lawrence, of Baylor 
Scott and White, for their professional and gentle care.  
 	 Most importantly to him was his love for his family and friends, animals and natu-
ral beauty of his ranch.   His grandchildren had the time of their lives when he drove 
them around his ranch in the John Deere ATV.  Granddaddy will be greatly missed.   
	 A memorial celebration of Mr. Stanford’s life will be held Thursday, March 29th at 
10:00 am, in the historic chapel at Salado Methodist Church.     
 	 Arrangements are being handled by Broecker Funeral Home in Salado. In lieu of 
flowers, you may wish to send a donation to your local animal shelter or charity of your 
choice.
Paid obituary

MICHAEL COGGIN, PE
FOR

SALADO VILLAGE ALDERMAN
Registered Professional Engineer

18 Year Resident of Salado
Graduate, Texas A&M

EXPERIENCE 
VISION

LEADERSHIP
Pol. Ad. Paid for Michael Coggin Campaign, Melanie Kirchmeier Treasurer

Vote

Jennifer McGregor

	 Grace Church Salado is 
taking an important step in 
caring for families across 
Central Texas as they wel-
come Lauren Wells as 
their new Director of Fam-
ily Ministries. Following 

her passion as  disciple for 
children of all ages, Lau-
ren and her husband, Luke, 
join Grace Church on Eas-
ter Sunday.  Lauren will 
lead in building programs 
designed to encourage the 

social, moral, and spiritual 
development of students.  
She is a graduate of the 
University of Mary Har-
din-Baylor and received her 
Master of Arts degree in 

Christian Education from 
Dallas Baptist University. 
She has served for the past 
two years as the Executive 
Director of Weekday Min-

istry at First Baptist Church 
in Belton where she trained 
teachers and staff.  Prior to 
that, Lauren was Assistant 
to the Executive Pastor for 

Business Administration at 
FBC Belton. It is her aim to 
care for children from birth 
through high school and 
equip parents to disciple 
their children. 
	 Grace Church has sever-
al Community Groups that 
meet throughout the week 
all around Bell County. 
They are happy to announce 
the launch of a new Com-
munity Group for students 
in grades 7-12 that meets on 
Thursday evenings in Sala-
do. Parents and students can 
learn more about this group 
and others at gracesalado.
com/groups. Those same 
students are invited to join 
us for a special Missionlab 
trip to New Orleans on June 
7-12. Interested parents can 
email info@gracesalado.
com for more information.

Grace Church Salado expands Family Ministries 

Luke and Lauren Wells

	 Salado resident Dr. Ed-
win Eugene “Gene” Ter-
ry was named a Fellow of 
Scott & White Clinic Class 
of 2018 on March 22.
	 Dr. Terry helped drive 
the mission of Scott & 
White through his work in 
cardiology and key admin-
istrative roles. His guiding 
principle: Preparation is the 
key to success.
	 After earning his med-
ical degree from Baylor 
College of Medicine and 
completing advanced train-
ing at the University of Tex-
as Medical Branch in San 
Antonio, Dr. Terry joined 
Scott & White in 1976. In 
1979, he was admitted into 
he American College of Car-
diology, and received exper-
tise and training. As Section 
Chief of Intensive Care Car-
diology, Medical Director of 
Intensive Car Services, and 
professor of Internal Medi-
cine and Surgery, Dr. Terry 
guided Scott & White as it 

strived to provide enhanced 
care for a full spectrum of 
heart and circulatory ail-
ments.
	 Throughout his medical 
practice, Dr. Terry under-
stood that caring for patients 
with heart ailments was 
more than prescribing pills 
and performing the correct 
procedures. That was why 

he emphasized the impor-
tance of constant attention 
to lifestyle changes, ade-
quate medication and psy-
chological changes. 
	 In his administrative 
roles, Dr. Terry helped pro-
vide mediation and guid-
ance as Scott & White 
leaders grappled with is-
sues vital to the health care 
system’s mission to provide 
comprehensive healthcare. 
Those conversations ran the 
gamut from finances and 
personnel, to patient satis-
faction and growth strategy. 
Although the issues often 
gave to rise many opinions, 
Dr. Terry helped guide lead-
ers to consensus.
	 Dr. Terry’s early com-
mitment to education has 
extended to his community. 
He has served 15 years on 
the board of Holy Trinity 
Catholic High School in 
Temple, advised Mended 
Hearts volunteers and sup-
ported arts and cultural or-
ganizations.

Edwin Eugene Terry, M.D. 
Fellow of Scott & White Clinic

Edwin Eugene Terry, M.D.
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AnimAl medicAl 
of SAlAdo

lindA Quirk, dvm         lindSAy fultz, dvm

Small Animal Medicine • Vaccinations 
Wellness Exams • Dentistry • Surgery
Spay/Neuter • Bathing & Boarding 
Microchipping • Royal Canin Diet

Heartworm/Tick & Flea Prevention 
  House Calls

Taking the Best Care
of Your Best Friend!

(254) 947-8800   www.saladovet.com
16231 FM 2115 Salado, TX 76571 (I-35 Exit 282)

Mon-Fri 7:30 a.m. -5:30 p.m.
Sat 7:30 - 11:30 a.m.  

Sun 4-5 p.m. pickup only

DON RINGLER
T�asCen�al

TOYOTA

WE’LL DOWhat It
TAKES

DONRINGLERTOYOTA.COM     254.774.6500

EXIT 294B OFF I·35 BETWEEN BELTON AND TEMPLE

DON RINGLER

FAMILY
PLAN

TOYOTA

$3,000 ADVANTAGE

See dealer for details

DON RINGLER
T�asCen�al

TOYOTA

Brookshire Brothers

Floral 
Department
 947-8922

Coming Soon:
Trees & Shrubs

Flowering and Vegetable
Seed Packets are in

Salado Public LibraryApril
Storytime

Mondays | 11 am. - noon

Sit and Knit
Tuesdays | 10 a.m. - noon

Adult Craft
April 4 | 2 - 4 p.m.
registration required

Mah Jongg
April 18 | 10 a.m. - 2 p.m.

Library Board of 
Trustees Meeting

April 23 | 5 - 6 p.m.
SaladoLibrary.org

(254) 947-9191

Library Hours

Mon - Wed & Fri  10 a.m. - 6 p.m.
Thurs  10 a.m. - 7:30 p.m.

Sat 10 a.m. - 5 p.m. 

Join us for a CHOCOLATE WORKSHOPApril 610:30 - 11:30 a.m.

Ask how our
Technology 

Resources
can help you file

	 Salado High UIL Aca-
demic Squad placed second 
in the District 19-4A con-
test, six points behind Lam-
pasas.
	 Lampasas scored 448 
points and Salado had 442 
points. Liberty Hill took 
third place with 433 points.
	 Regional competition 
will be April 13-14 at Sam 

Houston State University in 
Huntsville.
 	 Following are individual 
and team results from the 
district contest:
	 Number Sense,first 
place team: Trey Sheppard, 
first, Ryan Kyburz, second,  
Andrew Novotny, fourth 
and Ryder Haas, sixth.
 	 Calculator Applications, 
first place team: Charity 
Pryor, first, Luke Nelson, 
second, Kate Kyburz, fourth 
and Averie Piatt, fifth.
	 Mathematics, first place 
team: Kayla Manning, first, 
Ben Sunshine, third, Trey 
Sheppard, fifth and Eliza-
beth Won, seventh.
 	 Current Issues and 
Events: Luke Miller, first.
 	 Social Studies: Luke 
Miller, sixth.
 	 Computer Applications: 
Camryn Haltom, first, 
Hunter Howton, third, 
Madeson Haltom, fourth.
 	 Spelling and Vocabu-
lary, second place team: 
Kayla Manning, first, Kim-
berly Kendall, second. Oth-
er team members include: 
Lorna Fleet, Madeline Sun-
shine, and Matt Stahnke.

 	 Copy Editing: Ema-
ly Vrooman, first,  Jordan 
Stockton, second and JB 
Stockton, sixth.
 	 News Writing: JB Stock-
ton, fifth.
	 Feature Writing: Emaly 
Vrooman, fifth.
 	 Headline Writing: JB 
Stockton, third, Jordan 
Stockton, fourth and Emaly 
Vrooman, sixth.
	 Literary Criticism: Leah 
Martinez, fifth
 	 Team Speech, second 
place with 140 points.
	 Informative Speaking: 
Hannah Wilson, second and 
Josh Cannon, fourth
 	 Persuasive Speaking: 
Grace Rhoads, first, Con-
nor Howard, second and  
Christian Ortiz, fifth
	 Prose Reading: Jamie 
Rich, second, Ian Wilson, 
fourth and Nathan Cahoon, 
sixth.
 	 Poetry Reading: Caro-
line Dabney, second and 
Rayne Polkowski, fourth.
 	 Lincoln-Douglas De-
bate: Hannah Wilson, first,-
Josh Cannon, third and  
Grace Barker, fourth.

Scuttlers advances to Area
The Salado HS One-Act Play will compete for the UIL Area title in Temple on Thursday, 
March 29 at 3 p.m. The play advances from the Bi-District round. The play is Scut-
tlers by Rona Munro, a tale of urban city gangs in the 1880s in Manchester, England. 
Shown at right is Rayne Polkowski. (courtesy photo)

UIL Academic team
takes 2nd at District

Kayla Manning will be a 
double threat at UIL Re-
gionals Sam Houston 
State University in two 
weeks. She won first place 
in both spelling and math-
ematics at district.
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WE BUY SCRAP GOLD & SILVER

108 E FM2410, Suite G  -  Harker Heights

Gold, Silver, Coins, Currency & Jewelry
(254) 699-2646

Locally Owned - Salado Resident

BUY    SELL   TRADE

Give me FIVE!
5 Certi�catesof Deposit

5 High Rates

For limited time, R Bank is 
o�ering 5 SPECIAL Certi�cates 
of Deposit with HIGH rates and 

di�erent terms. 
Choose the one that �ts your 

�nancial needs.

36-month Special Certificate of Deposit
 2.53% Annual Percentage Yield¹

24-month Special Certificate of Deposit 
 1.92% Annual Percentage Yield²

18-month Special Certificate of Deposit 
 1.67% Annual Percentage Yield³

12-month Special Certificate of Deposit 
 1.51% Annual Percentage Yield⁴

6-month Special Certificate of Deposit 
 1.16% Annual Percentage Yield⁵

$50,000 minimum required to open account. This amount is also the minimum balance required to earn the quoted Annual 
Percentage Yield. Rate and APY are current as of publication date and are subject to change without notice. 1 - Interest Rate is 
2.50% /  2 - Interest Rate is 1.90% / 3 - Interest Rate is 1.65% / 4 - Interest Rate is 1.50% / 5 - Interest Rate is 1.15%. Substantial 
interest penalty for early withdrawl.   

Jarrell Banking Center
50 West FM 487 | Jarrell Texas | 76537
P: 512.598.9050 | www.RBankTexas.com

Douglas B. Willingham, D.D.S.
(254) 947-5242

www.saladodentistry.com

2 North Main Street at Thomas Arnold Road 
in the historic Armstrong Adams House c. 1868

Salado Family and Cosmetic Dentistry

Sara Yeager, Kim Newton 
Dr. Willingham, Cynthia Gandara

Preventive care for children and adults
Teeth whitening | Implant Restoration

Veneers & Cosmetic Crowns
Conscious & Full Sedation Dentistry Available

Douglas B. Willingham, D.D.S.
(254) 947-5242

www.saladodentistry.com

2 North Main Street at Thomas Arnold Road 
in the historic Armstrong Adams House c. 1868

Salado Family and Cosmetic Dentistry

Sara, Kim, 
Dr. Willingham & Cynthia

Preventive care for children and adults
Teeth whitening | Implant Restoration

Veneers & Cosmetic Crowns
Conscious & Full Sedation Dentistry Available

www.FirstEyeCareSalado.com
Medical Insurance Accepted          Vision Plans Accepted

Vision Eye Examinations
Medical Eye Examinations

Designer Eyewear
Sunglasses

Contact Lenses Services
Eye Emergencies

Eye Disease Management
Red Eyes, Dry Eyes

Eye Allergies

(254) 781-0041

418 N. Main Street  

Salado’s eye doctor
Dr. Sarah Forrest, O.D.

NOW OPEN

The Angell family is in full support of the proposed SISD school bond for two very special 
reasons:  Ren (6), who is currently a student at Thomas Arnold Elementary, and Charlie (4), 
who will be starting kindergarten in SY 2019-2020.  We firmly believe in the power of a great 
education and the wonderful schools in Salado are the main reason we moved here 10 years 
ago before we even had kids.  In Salado we get a quality education with a public school price 
tag.  That means that when we are asked to pay a little more in taxes each year our answer is 
a resounding YES.  
YES to enclosing the kindergarten/first grade wing and the gym and attaching them to the 

main building.  When my kindergartener needs to run over to the library to get another Acceler-
ated Reader book or needs to go to the office, we want to know that he is not walking outside 
on his own where any number of things could happen.  This is MUST in our book.  Too many 
bad things are happening at schools around the country and we want to know that should TAE 
have such an event, our 6 year old, the one whose hand we still hold to cross the street, will 
not be stuck outside.
YES to a new middle school so our boys aren't in an overcrowded classroom or in a portable. 

Building the new middle school removes three grade levels from Thomas Arnold Road, takes 
kids out of portables and relieves traffic congestion on and around Thomas Arnold road. We've 
all seen the new homes being built around Salado so we need to address the growth issue 
sooner rather than later.  It also means there will be less traffic on Thomas Arnold Road. Less 
traffic means increased safety.
While we know many of you are unsure about voting for this bond, we urge you to do your 

research and find out the facts.  Did you know that extracurricular activities are only 14% of the 
proposed bond?  That means $42 million out of $49.4 million addresses the issue of classroom 
capacity leaving  $7.4 to address safety and aging athletic facilities.  Keep in mind that a group 
of diverse community members have been working tirelessly to explore all options and to 
decide on the best way to address the most pressing issues our district is facing within the con-
straints of a budget. While they couldn't fix everything, they were able to put the safety of our 
children first.  Our family is proud of them for that and we say thank you for all of your hard work.  
We vote YES for Salado ISD and YES for all of the district’s children. 

Kamryn Cole placed 2nd in the Houston Livestock Show with her Middle Heavy weight 
Hampshire barrow. Shown through Bell County 4H. (Courtesy Photo)

Brody Cole placed 1st with his Light Heavyweight at the Houston Livestock Show.  
Shown through Bell County 4H. (Courtesy Photo)

	 Several Salado FFA stu-
dents competed in the re-
cent Austin Rodeo Youth 
Livestock show.
	 In the breeding beef 
heifers division, Stuart Las-
tovica had the Champion 
Angus Heifer and Cham-
pion Overall in the British 
Division.	
	 Cade Harris had the first 
place Polled Hereford and 
Reserve Champion in the 
junior yearling division. 
Alex Harris was second 
place in Angus. Cooper 
Free also had the fourth 
place angus.
	 In Junior Market Steers, 
Lastovica had first place 
in the British, followed by 
Maddison Brinkman in 
eighth place. Allison Brink-
man had the fourth place in 
all other crossbreeds.
	 Joann Steigerwalt 
showed in junior market 

goats and Kensley free 
showed in breeding beef 
heifers.
	 The following showed in 
junior market barrow: Trace 
Medlin, Kylee Cottle, Lo-
gan Taylor and Kory Walk-
er
	 “Our students earned 
over $20,000 in premiums 
at the livestock auction,” 
said FFA sponsor Kaleigh 
Black. “We are very proud 

of our students participation 
at major livestock shows 
across Texas this season! 
The chance to earn a posi-
tive return on investment is 
always the goal, but the life 
experience that comes with 
caring for these projects is 
invaluable. Salado FFA and 
Jr. FFA members are cham-
pions in and out of the show 
ring.” 

Stuart Lastovica with Champion Breeding Heifer.

Cade Harris with the Reserve Champion in the Junior 
Heifer Division of the Austin Rodeo Youth Livestock 

Salado FFA students show
at Austin Rodeo
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CUSTOM UPHOLSTERY 
FREE PICK UP & DELIVERY 

515 E. VET. MEMORIAL BLVD. HARKER HEIGHTS

254-699-6105

Ceiling Fans | Light Fixtures 
Window Treatments | Home Decor

TheShadeShopSalado.com                        
230 North Main Street #102 

(254) 290-7000

The Shade Shop

Ceiling Fans | Light Fixtures | Window Treatments | Home Decor

TheShadeShopSalado.com                        
230 North Main Street #102 

(254) 290-7000

The Shade Shop

FULL SERVICE SMALL ANIMAL HOSPITAL
SMALL & EXOTIC ANIMAL MEDICINE

SURGERY & WELLNESS EXAMS
AFFORDABLE EMERGENCY CARE

(254)947-8058

IH 35 & FM 2484
1848 N. Robertson Rd

www.saladoveterinaryhospital.com

Salado Veterinary Hospital
M - F     24 hours
walk-ins after 6 p.m.

Saturday
1st & 3rd

15% off Office Visits for: 
Military, Teachers,

First Responders and Seniors 65+
20% off your first office visit 

for new clients or new pets

	 Salado Eagles face Lla-
no on March 30 in a home 
baseball game before trav-
eling to Lampasas on April 
3 to finish the first round 
of District 19-4A. Llano 
is without a win in district 
play and Lampasas is in the 
middle of the pack while the 
Eagles are 4-0 in district so 
far and have outscored their 
19-4A opponents 38-1.
Taylor		  1
Salado		  3
	 Salado Eagles beat the 
Taylor Ducks 3-1 March 26 
and are now alone in first 
place in District 19-4A.
	 Salado scored runs in 
the first, third and sixth in-
nings. Taylor scored its only 
run in the second inning. 
	 With two outs and empty 
bases in the bottom of the 
first, Jacob Wilk doubled 
to deep left. He scored on a 
single by Rustin Hale. Hale 
advanced on a passed ball. 
Drew Dobbins walked and 
stole second before Taylor 
was able to get the third out.
	 After Taylor knotted the 
score at 1-1 in the second, 
Wilk singled to lead off the 
bottom of the third. He stole 
second and scored on a sin-
gle to center by Dobbins.
	 Mac Miller sealed the 
game with a solo homerun 

in the sixth.
	 Dobbins won the game 
with a five-inning per-
formance on the mound. 
He struck out six batters, 
walked one and allowed 
three hits and one earned 
run.
	 Wilk closed the game, 
striking out six batters over 
two innings, allowing just 
one hit.
Salado	 AB	 R	 H	 BI	 BB	SO
R Oaks	 3	 0	 0	 0	 1	 0
D Hawes	 3	 0	 1	 0	 0	 1
J Wilk	 3	 2	 2	 0	 0	 1
R Hale	 3	 0	 1	 1	 0	 0
C Self	 0	 0	 0	 0	 0	 0
D Dobbins	 1	 0	 1	 1	 2	 0
K Baird	 0	 0	 0	 0	 0	 0
M Miller	 2	 1	 1	 1	 0	 1
D Heath	 2	 0	 1	 0	 1	 1
KMeadgen	 0	 0	 0	 0	 0	 0
P Shelley	 3	 0	 1	 0	 0	 0
B Farr	 3	 0	 0	 0	 0	 1
G Knight	 -	 -	 -	 -	 -	 -
M Marin	 -	 -	 -	 -	 -	 -
Totals	 23	 3	 8	 3	 4	 5

Liberty Hill			   0
Salado					     8
	 Jacob Wilk hit two hom-
ers and a single to lead Sal-
ado to a shut out win over 
the Liberty Hill Panthers 
8-0 on March 20 in a home 
game.
	 Mac Miller doubled with 
two outs in the first to score 
Dustin Hawes, who walked, 
and Wilk, who singled to 
give Salado an early 2-0 
lead.
	 The Eagles added three 

runs in the third when Wilk 
smashed the ball over the 
left field fence to score 
Belton Farr, who reached on 
an error and Ryan Oakes, 
who walked.
	 Farr hit a booming triple 
to right field to score Dustin 
Heath, who reached on an 
error in the third for Salado 
to go up 6-0.
	 Hawes reached on a 
walk in the seventh before 
Wilk put the ball over the 
right field fence to bring the 
score to 8-0.
	 Oaks got the win on the 
mound, pitching three in-
nings. He allowed two hits 
and struck out five batters.
	 Drew Dobbins pitched 
in relief, striking out four 
batters, walking three and 
allowing a hit.
	 Wilk closed the game 
striking out all three batters 
he faced.
Salado	 AB	 R	 H	 RBI	BB	 SO
R Oaks	 3	 0	 0	 0	 1	 0
C Self	 0	 1	 0	 0	 0	 0
D Hawes	 2	 2	 0	 0	 1	 1
J Wilk	 4	 3	 3	 5	 0	 1
R Hale	 4	 0	 1	 0	 0	 1
D Dobbins	 3	 0	 1	 0	 1	 1
M Miller	 4	 0	 1	 2	 0	 2
D Heath	 4	 0	 0	 0	 0	 1
K Baird	 0	 1	 0	 0	 0	 0
G Knight	 3	 0	 1	 0	 0	 1
B Farr	 3	 1	 1	 1	 0	 0
M Marin	 -	 -	 -	 -	 -	 -
P Shelley	 -	 -	 -	 -	 -	 -
Totals	 30	 8	 8	 8	 3	 8

	 Salado Lady Eagles are 
alone at the top of District 
19-4A and propelled them-
selves into the Top 15 in 
4A softball when they beat 
the 12th ranked Liberty 
Hill Lady Panthers 4-3 last 
week.
Liberty Hill	 3
Salado		  4
	 Salado Lady Eagles took 
the visiting Liberty Hill 
Lady Panthers into extra 
innings to beat the state-
ranked district foe 4-3 on 
March 20.
	 Liberty Hill led after 
scoring two runs in the 
third. Ashlen Darner hit a 2 
RBI single.
	 The Lady Eagles scored 
three runs in the bottom of 
the third to take a slim 3-2 
lead. With one out in the in-
ning, Elizabeth Ford tripled 
to center and scored on a 
wild pitch. Piper Randolph 
walked and stole second 
base before Liberty Hill 
pitcher Abby Covington 
caught a pop up by Ryley 
Oborski for the first out. 
Breigh Oliver walked and 
both runners stole base. 
Christin Wilson singled, 
knocking in both runners. 
Amanda Cant singled and 
both runners were left 
stranded when Covington 
struck out the next batter.
	 In the sixth, Liberty 
Hill tied the game when 
Kandryn Faurie hit a sin-
gle to push Covington, who 
reached after being hit by a 
pitch, across the plate.		
	 The Eagles defense was 
stingy in the extra innings, 
as Piper Randolph and 
Christin Wilson combined 
to put three batters out in 
the eighth. Bailey Tindell 

struck out two batters in the 
ninth. Shortstop Breigh Oli-
ver caught an infield fly for 
the other out. Second base 
Amanda Cantu and Ran-
dolph threw out batters try-
ing to reach first in the final 
frame for Liberty Hill.
	 One batter reached base 
in the extra innings for Lib-
erty Hill: Ireland Sarget 
who hit a double with no 
outs in the ninth and was 
left stranded on second.
	 The Lady Panther de-
fense was equally tough as 
only Erin Faske reached (on 
a walk) in the eighth and 
ninth innings.
	 Oliver walked to lead 
off the bottom of the 10th. 
She stole second and went 
to third on an error that put 
Wilson on first. Amanda 
Cantu knocked in the win-
ning run for Salado.  
	 Tindell threw 135 pitches 
in her marathon appearance 
on the mound. She faced 39 
batters and threw 88 strikes. 
She hit one batter, walked 
two more and allowed seven 
hits. Tindell struck out nine 
batters.

SALADO	 AB	R	 H	 BI
P. Randolph	 1	 1	 0	 0  
R. Oborski	 5	 0	 0	 0
B. Oliver	 2	 2	 1	 0  
C. Wilson	 5	 0	 1	 2
A.  Cantu	 4	 0	 1	 1
R. Dockray	 2	 0	 0	 0
E. Faske	 2	 0	 0	 0
R. Preston	 4	 0	 1	 0
E. Ford	 4	 1	 1	 0
M. Gonzalez	 2	 0	 0	 0
TOTALS	 31	 4	 5	 3

Taylor		  3
Salado		  11
	 Salado Lady Eagles are 
alone at the top of District 
19-4A with an 11-3 win 
over the Taylor Lady Ducks 
at home on March 23. The 

win improves Salado to 6-0 
in district and 15-3 overall.
	 Salado took a demand-
ing lead in the bottom of the 
second, scoring seven runs 
with one out in the frame. 
Rylee Oborski hit a single 
and stole second and third. 
Faske walked and stole sec-
ond. Preston plated both 
runners with a single. Ford 
was hit by the pitcher and 
Piper Randolph walked to 
load the bases. Cantu dou-
bled to score three runners.
	 Oliver homered over 
centerfield, scoring Cantu. 
Taylor forced the next two 
outs to get out of the inning.
	 The Lady Ducks closed 
the gap with three runs in 
the top of the fifth. 
	 Salado followed with 
two more runs. Gonzalez 
and Oborski walked and 
scored on a single to center 
by Preston. 
	 Salado led 10-3 going 
into their final frame. With 
one out in the sixth, Wilson 

walked and went to second 
on a passed ball. Gonzalez 
hit an RBI single and stole 
second and third but was 
left stranded there.
	 Rebecca Dockray got the 
win on the mound for Sala-
do. She gave up three runs 
on two hits and two walks 
and struck out one batter. 
Tindell pitched in relief, 
giving up one hit and three 
walks.
	 Cantu and Oliver led 
Salado at the plate. Cantu 
drove in three runs with a 
triple and Oliver had a two-
run homer. Preston hit a sin-
gle for 2 RBI.
	 Salado JV Lady Eagles 
beat the Taylor Lady Ducks 
JV 9-0.

Win over state-ranked Liberty Hill puts 
Salado alone at top of District 19-4A

Eagles undefeated in district

Amanda Cantu gets a single. (Photo by Kristi Tindell)

(Photo by DeeDee Hawes)
First baseman Mac Miller tries to tag out a Taylor Duck who dives back safely.
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Salado ISD Honor Rolls 3rd 9 weeks
All A Students
1st Grade
Zane Abraham
Nathan Adams
Robert Alcozer
Dalainee Baker
John Bratton
Brinlee Broussard
Bo Bryant
Katie Cade
Benning Cain
Jackson Camp
Jemma Camp
Vonderek Casteel
Hunter Coburn
Yesenia Colon
Cloey Craig
Kendal Curtis
Urijah Davidson
Amelia Diaz
Addison Dunlap
Avery Dunlap
Corey Gardner
John Gearhart
Hunter Harrison
Julia Hehli
Camden Herrmann
Rylee Hilton
Brady Hintze
Hamilton Hughes
Nek Ibarra
Lillian Jahns
Kinley Jaynes
Madison Jaynes
Conley Johnston
Brayden Kessler
Kaleb Kessler
Jackson Kilpatrick
Whitley Ledbetter
Victoria Linn
Sabrina Lopez
Jesse Luna
Maverick Marshall 
Case Mayberry
Paxton Mitchel
Pierson Montgomery
Madisyn Morgan-Rodriguez
Camyn Mullins
Kash Newton
Staton Norman
Clayton Olson
Taylin Oswald
Holt Peterson
Victoria Poe
Lily Ray
Noah Reynolds
Slayde Rockwell
Rylee Rogers
Emma Rose
Olivia Royston
Giselle Rueda
Ryleigh Sanchez Martinez
Reese Smith
Mya Terwilliger
Dayana Trejo
Kenley Vasek
Sophia Warren
Bailey Whitley
Sloane Woods
2nd Grade
Zack Adcox
Zachary Armendariz
Aidan Ayala
Isabella Baran
Brylynn Beavers
Sophie Booker
Paityn Booth
Isabella Brunson
Annalee Bryant
Lane Burleson
Adam Cadenas
Luke Carlson
Mia Lily Delio
Tey’Shaun Diggs
Zoe Dodge
George Egbert
Landon Egbert
Natalia Estrella
Raeley Fleming
Caley Foster
John Goode
Ella Gourley
Hayden Griesemer
Owen Gunter
Claire Haight
Maggie Haney
Memphis Hawk
Leah Heavener
Angelica Hernandez
Valeria Hernandez
Hallie Howard
Selestte Hubbard
Micah Huss
John Jimenez
Sage Johnson
Ryley Klechka
Layla Kotalik
Cassidy Lange
Mercedes Lewis
Blake Matthews
Izabella McIntosh
Eva McLaren

Brylie Metz
Kathryn Miles
Lauren Moore
Carter Morris
Robert Mull
Samuel Nail
Stella Nail
Brody Nelson
Jett Newton
Emma Oglesby 
Carter Oldham
Nova Oldham
Sophia Patton
Brycen Prather
Renlee Rakowitz
Samuel Rechtfertig
Katie Rich
Adrian Robles Gonzalez
Natalie Rondon-Llobregat
Carlos Ruiz
Brody Schiller
Griffin Self
Cassandra Sheffield
Elissa Shepherd
Hudson Slimp
Lillian Smith
Noah Stanford
Daytona Sturges
Major Thomas
William Tipping
Xavier Torres Nunez
Jackson Tracy
Kendall Trautmann
Addison Turner
Alexis Tutor
Ali Uranga
Blake Watkins
Jordan Weaver
Avri Wells
Tyson White
3rd Grade
Shawn Adams
Kaiden Allen
Kaylee Bragg
Calyn Brazzil
Regina Briones Zepeda
Savannah Carroll
Gavin Cashion
Luis Chavez De La Cruz
Kayden Chellette
Kristen Clifton
Bristol Cox
Brylee Craddick
Rosemary Dennis
Anna Diaz
William Drigalla 
Kendall Edwards
Katie Ellithorp
Sydney Engleking
Caidynce Ferrell
Aubrey Forrest
Madison Gaither
Max Gist
Jenna Goodman
Bryan Hacker
Hudson Hawkins
Avery Hibner
Sasha Hoppe
Parker Humphries
Mazzy Johnson
Brenley Kelso
Audrey Kotalik
Luke Leiskau
Kate Maedgen
Addy McCoin
Dylan Miles
Aubrey Mullins
Brightyn Mullins
Reed Myers
Brayden Naegele
Christian Netto
Colt Norman
Layla Parker
Diego Quintanar-Zepeda
Hays Ramsey
Lorelai Reckefus
Valeria Sanchez
Nallely Siprian
Kenadi Smith
Emily Steigerwalt
Emma Terwilliger
Cora Thomas
Jackson Tipton
Ava Uranga
Jaina Veal
Bryan Villafranco Espinosa
Charlie Watkins
Webb White
Ryker Wilson
Brooklyn Winkler
Jake Wise
4th Grade
Andrew Adams
Luke Bauser
Kathryn Beene
Haley Brown
Madisyn Collins
Miles Crisp
Shelby Dodge
Michael Dorris
Wesley Engleking
Kyndyl Fleming

Kendra Flynn
Caitlyn Fowler
Reese Franks
Kensley Free
Lola Haas
Davis Kasper
Sydney Klechka
Reese Lange
Elizabeth Law
Emily Lemus
Solomon Loyd
Elizabeth Markham
Parker Montgomery
Thomas Novotny
Mason Olson
Karlee Parker
Andrew Patton
Owen Piatt
Katharine Ramos
Mahala Rhiddlehoover
Luke Rose
Adelaide Shenkir
Owen Stone
Grace Tipping
Taylor Tracy
Kailynn Woodberry
5th Grade
Zoie Adcox
Lauren Allison
Kaci Atchison
Betzaida Bahena
Kannon Baird
Rachel Bender
Carmen Bolick
Erin Breit
Mason Brown
Sofia Cadenas
Owen Curtis
Alejandro Delima Baca
Millye Edwards
Netanel Eldridge
Daniel Fisher
Cole Foster
Aidan Gaither
Gabriel Goodin
Robert Grant
Valente Hernandez
Korbin Konarik
Sydney Lange
Austin Lauw
Jace Light
Zackary Manthie
Shelby Maples
Brooke Matamoros
Richard McCoin
Benjamin McLane
Ian Miles
Macy Morris
Alyssa Neagle
Vianey Ochoa Chavez
Jackson Pennington
Madeline Rakowitz
Nathaniel Rechtfertig
Ayden Rose
Chloe Rose
Giselle Salazar
Ty Saulter
Lilly Sears
Elliot Self
Harrison Thrasher
Isabella Toquero
Jacob Underwood
Cassandra Vargas
Adelyn Watkins
Thomas Watkins
Riley Weaver
Alexa Williams
Brooklyn Williamson
London Woods
6th Grade
Corey Adams
Allison Alcozer
Davin Brazzle
Grace Clemons
Tatum Daniels
Casey Davis
May Davis
Douglas Jackson Delio
Luke Drigalla
Alexis Dudeczka
Paige Fariss
Meri Ella Fischer
Seamus Flanagan
Aleshanee Fowler
Connor Hamilton
Austin Hollas
Caden Jacobus
Sawyer Johnson
Lydia Lesley
Matthew Macek
Kase Maedgen
Reese Rich
Sawyer Roach
Zane Roche
Elizabeth Rose
Kade Schoepf
Melina Solis
Ethan Sunshine
Cooper Thomas
Olivia Walrath
Kirbee Webb

A/B Students
1st Grade
Emma Adams
Rylan Allbritton
Cruz Cox
Cannon Curtright
Leilanna Fields
William Guajardo
Jackson Harris
Jesse Hernandez Sanchez
Racey Hilton
Roman Howard
Landon Keeling
Ethan Ketcham
Angel Lemus Ramirez
Jack Lever
Chase McCann
Hunter McClellan
Colt McLaurin
Mayson Morreale
Javier Perez
Cristian Ponder
Ysabella Romero
Melody Santoya
Catelyn Sellers
Linkin Stoehr
Emmalyn Sumners
Brooklyn Volk
Jace Wilson
Wyatt Winchester
Christopher Yaguapaz
2nd Grade
Akram Abdelwahab
Couper Bales
Alijah Breaux
Dylan Breit
Sophia Castorena
Conner Cobb
Ryder Egbert
Gracie Elliott
Caedmon Flynn
Asa Goodin
Jesse Green
Leanne Hampton
Brinley Harrell
Luke Harrell
Addilee Harris
Payton Hill
Felipe Huerta
Jimmy Humphreys
Addison Ledger
Riley Ledger
Emily McDowell
Bethany McIntosh
William McLane
Jacqueline McNamara
Logan Neagle
Alexis Nix
Jose Pena
William Perez Nieves
Sadie Raymond
Jacqueline Rivas
Katlyn Robinson
Aldo Rocha
Brenyn Rogers
Joshua Romero
Weston Sauceda
Jace Saulter
Peyten Schaub
Jaycee Shumate
Catalyna Siprian
Allan Soto
Ulises Soto
Shelby Tubbs
Zoey Vespe
Adrian Villafranco
Olivia Volk
Kaydence Whitaker
Regan Yace
3rd Grade
Eva Alcozer
Alexis Alsop
Amirah Amani
Hannah Amani
Kalena Amani
Tatum Brantley
Ava Brazzle
Asaiah Breaux
Lilliana Castro
Yisel Chavez
Parker Coffey
Bailey Collins
Ky Cooper
Conlee Cox
Brenden Daggs
Kelli Darling
Lara De La Rosa
Matthew Dunlap
Brian Dworaczyk-Fuentes
Segiv Eldridge
Presley Farr
Paisley Foegelle
Paisley Friemel
Christopher Fudge
Isabella Harris
Braelynn Hendricks
Daniel Hernandez
Zoe Hernandez
Jasper Hunter
S C Inman
Robert Kessler 
Addison Kincaid

Thomas Arnold Elementary and Salado Intermediate
Kutter Lisenbe
Casey Lochridge
Hunter Manthie
Juan Martinez
Leighton Mayberry
Bret Mills
Blakeley Pekar
Eric Quiroga-Morales
Jaeden Reed
Phillip Reeder
Matthew Reynolds
Emmylou Robertson
Robert Shields
Jae Shirley
Kali Smith
Petyon Sniggs
Rylee Springston
Mialy Suarez
Caleb Swindoll
Jaxon Teer
Joseph Travis
Eduardo Vargas
Lillian Vasquez
Alexander Vespe
JuliAnn White
Noah Wilson
Braden Wright
Deanna Young
4th Grade
Cash Adams
Oscar Arango
Elijah Barker
Owen Barron
Luke Bingham
Zane Brown
Landon Bufkin
Chance Carlson
Madelyn Casper
Joselyne Castillo
Bradyn Castorena
Sydney Chipman
Caine Cruddas
Brody DeLukie
Brayden Dildine
Jacob Gonzalez
Jacklyn Hammond
Casen Harrell
Cadence Harris
Sean Hogue
Micah Jacquez
Serenity Jirasek
Karlee Konarik
Angelina Lane
Wyatt Ledbetter
Kerris Luedeke
Brooks Mayberry
Kenady McArthur
Brynlee Myers
Katelynn Palousek
Elijah Parrish
Gunner Peterson
Toni Pugh
Malena Rasmussen
Elliette Reed
Nicholas Rios
Callie Sandor
Madlyn Serna
Bailey Smith
Collin Strickland
Sean Sutiles
Avery Sutton
Presli Thompson
Angel Tonchez
William Tracy
Brianna Tutor
Peyton Whitaker
Jayden Wilson
Addison Winchester
5th Grade
Alicia Alsop
Layton Anderson
Jaemielee Ayala Nieves
Camden Aycock
Jonathan Brauchle
Anthony Breaux
Harper Brown
Isaac Capetillo
Riley Cashion
Teghan Chambers
Mia Chavez De La Cruz
Sebastián Chavez Perez
Brody Cole
Xavier Dabney
Isabella Dudeczka
Isabella Foster
Hannah Gearhart
Amber Gidley
Adam Gilliam
Jordyn Ingrum
Carter Jacobus
Pedro Karshis
Addison King
Brodie Landon
Katelynn LeBrecque
Johnathan Lemke
Ainsleigh Liebig
Addison Matthews
Hayden McGarry
Ian McGarry
McKenna Morris
Thomas Morter
Sean Murray

Wade Navarro
Philip Nikolaidis
Hope Osborne
Isabela Ponce-Barzaga
Jacob Preston
Benjamin Pugh
Colby Ramm
Blake Renick
Luke Reynolds
Faith Rhoads
Amyah Rogers
Marco Sanchez
Jett Stockton
Lindsay Sula
George Thorns
Gael Torres Tonches
Jackson Turk
Stephanie Villafranco
Lillian Voelter
Ryley White
Mason Whitley
Brooke Wilson
Ewan Yarbrough
Andrew Young
Rylee Young
6th Grade
Anahi Alvarado
Ariana Arango
Joshua Barker
Cort Bethel
Lucas Beyer
Rebekah Booth
Jackson Bragg
Bethany Braswell
MaKenzie Castorena
Ty Castro
Sabrina Chavez De La Cruz
Anakin Clark
William Coker
Hector Colon Jr
John Colvin
Emery Conner
Jocelynn Cousineau
Patyon Cunningham
Taylor Dabney
David Delarosa
Caleb Dockray
Isabella Dworaczyk-Fuentes
Jerry Ferrell
Jack Finch
Phoenix Flores
Tate Franks
Mea Fuller
Lauren Gomez
Hannah Gourley
Davis Graham
Eva Grigsby
Mary Grigsby
Katherine Haltom
Emma Hassell
Morgan Hauck
Emily Havelka
Jeb Hercules
John Hoogheem
Kaelyn Houston
Jack Ingrum
Kiren Jacquez
Eric Jimenez Palacios
Caitlyn Kasper
Anna Lajarin Rivero
Lucas Law
Caleb Lowery
Stephanie Martinez
Bryton Massar
Easton Mendenhall
Emmit Mendenhall
Morgan Morreale
Brody Neagle
Thomas Neas
Rainey Newman
Andreas Nikolaidis
Morgan Olson
Brayden Painter
Leyla Peralta
Janie Rainwater
Corde Ramsey
James Renick
Dusty Rhiddlehoover
Cameron Roe
Madyson Rosamond
Olivia Salter
Collin Schlegel
Tyler Sellars
Eric Soto
Jessica Soto
Emma Stoehr
Mary Stone
Rebekah Sutton
Lauren Thompson
David Villafranco
Emma Volk
Elly Wade
Troy Warren
Brianna Waters
Dylan Wigley
Lauren Wilson
Lexyana Wilson

SISD Honor Rolls sponsored by

First State Bank Central Texas
Lobby:  Mon - Fri  9 a.m. - 3 p.m.   

Drive-in:  Mon - Thurs 7:30 a.m. - 4 p.m.  •   Fri 7:30 a.m. - 5:30 p.m.  •   Sat  9 a.m. - noon
Main St. at Thomas Arnold Rd.  |  Salado  |  (254) 947-5852  |  Member FDIC
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Salado ISD Honor Rolls 3rd 9 weeks
All A Students
7th Grade
Brooke Bailey 
Andrew Bird  
Lydia Burleson  
Natalie Burleson  
Blake Calleros 
Owen Crisp 
Jordan Dawson 
Alexandria Dworaczyk-Fuentes   
Valerie Ellithorp  
Holly Giesecke 
Andrew Gilmore 
Alyssa Goodwin 
Caden Graham  
Madison Graham 
Erynn Hacker  
Evan Hardt  
Sydney Hasha  
Kade Hayes 
Lane Heath 
Robert Joiner  
Elizabeth Katz 
Jaxson Leiskau  
Kaden Lewis  
Ryden Lewis  
Ava Magoulick 
Evian Magoulick  
Robert McLane  
Brooke McLaurin  
Ellie Mescher 
Cooper Meyer  
Cutter Meyer 
Stephen Miles  
Nolan Miller  
Kathryn Neas  
Ryan Novotny  
Jade Oliver 
Haley Piatak 
Annalise Reed 
Matthew Rose  
Wyatt Schoenrock 
Noah Self 
James Tipton  
Angel Van de Plas  
Wilk Haleigh
Cavahn Wilson 
Ryland Woods  

8th Grade
Jackson Arnett  
Zuleika Ayala Nieves
Kaitlyn Casper  
Cooper Chambliss  
Kylee Cottle  
Emory Craddick  
Avery Fossum  
Anne Gilmore  
Hutton Haire 
McKenzie Hawkins 
Adan Hidrogo 
Marissa Lancaster 
Anna Lesley 
Cameron Morris  
Zachary Oas 
Savannah Oyler  
Darci Pryor  
Renee Roche 
Mia Saulter 
Cooper Scott 
Molly Simmonds 
Caleb Sirmon 
Lainey Taylor 
Caelan Teer  
Aubrey Watkins  
Laura Willingham 

9th Grade
Logan Atchison
Sawyer Bagley
Faith Barker
Rylee Corn
Chloe Ebeling
Justin Evans
Douglas Frisby
Diana Hernandez
Wesley Hernandez
Connor Howard
Kimberly Kendall
Nicholas Lemus
Amy Manning
Noah Mescher
Peyton Miller
Stuart Miller
Sophia Olivarez
Diego Romero
Morgan Schaub
Haley Sumners
Madeline Sunshine
Priscilla Torczynski
Aaron Trela
Nena Vero
Reid Vincent
Lauren Wilson
Jessica Young

10th Grade
Reece Brown
Hunter Finch
Lorna Fleet
Waylon Fleet
Logan Foster
Jasey Goings
Marissa Gonzalez
Hunter Howton
Paige Land
Rachel Luke
Cayden Meyer
Andrew Novotny
Erik Oas
Kenzie Pardon
Kaia Philen
Averie Piatt
Charity Pryor
Shane Roche
Angela Sanders
Hannah Seymore
Hunter Seymore
Emily Stuckly
Samantha Vargas
Christin Wilson

11th Grade
Maria Paula Aviles Fuentes
Grace Barker
Julia De Godoi Santos
Katelyn Fisher
Hailey Giesecke
Tate Harvey
Jeremy Jarvis
Jonathan Keyes
Eliot Mettenbrink
Henry Miller
Gillian Moszer
Luke Nelson
Rayne Polkowski
Brandt Rodeffer
Barret Schoenrock
Sarah Umpleby
Sebastian Welch
Aaron Wilkerson
Elizabeth Ann Won

12th Grade
Nicole Armitage
Joshua Cannon
Carissa Cerda
Natalie Fort
Camryn Haltom
Mikaela Heiner
Haley Howton
Madeline Krustchinsky
Ashlen LaCanne
Kayla Manning
Sari Marquardt
Christopher Miller
Ryan Oakes
Grace Rhoads
Emily Ritch
Ashley Ruiz
Taylor Schlegel
John Sheppard
Kaden Smien
Jeffery Stockton
Macy Thrasher
Hayley Vandeplas
Jon Whitson
Madison Whitson
Hannah Wilson

A/B Students
7th Grade
Tanner Agee  
Kennedy Anthony   
Katelyn Bartek  
Jeffrey Bauser  
Audrey Bender   
Kallin Brantley   
Brooke Burnett  
Jayten Burt  
Makayla Bush  
Evan Croftcheck 
Logan Culp  
Halle Curb  
Brooks Dabney   
Bristol Davis  
Jacob Day 
Lauren Drever 
Brazos Farr 
Jade Fields   
Nathan Hanscom 
Sydney Hasha 
Kye Hayes 
Maria Hernandez 
Dylan Hinton 
Tiffany Lange
Diamond Leach 
Ethan Llobregat 
Jett Luedeke  
Heather Mantanona 
Meagan McDowell  
Emma McKee  
Niamh McLaren  
William Messner 
Jordan Moore  
Grace Morris  
Aria Musselman   
Eduardo Ochoa-Chavez 
Amy Ortiz 
Grace Osborne  
Grace Plaster   
Seth Reavis  
Jacob Rechtfertig 
Hope Rhoads  
Lisa Schlessiger  
Carter Schulz  
Madelyn Schulz  
Raimy Sproul 
Joanna Steigerwalt 
Heidi Teichelman  

Salado Junior High and Salado High School
Kirsten Vesely  
Ethan Villanueva  
Ashlyn Williams 
Leiana Williams 
Darius Wilson-Soriano   
Carissa Witmer  
Reese Witmer  
Haley Worsdale 

8th Grade
Michaela Aycock  
Cory Bartek 
Nicholas Bates  
Arman De La Paz   
Hailey Fariss   
Megan Fossum   
Hunter Foster  
Kennedy Foster   
Haleigh Gieck   
Joshua Goings   
Emma Grant   
Jasmine Hanscom  
Jenna Hanscom   
Lillian Hildebrand   
Robert Hill   
Dakota Howard   
Matti Humphreys 
Sydney King  
Kenslee Konarik   
Taylor Kotalik   
Maxwell Markham   
Kennady Moffatt   
David Ochoa Chavez 
Waylon Padleski   
Maria Pauer   
Arielle Perez Nieves   
Alexander Pierce  
Macie Pittman   
Benjamin Raines   
Colin Reagan  
Payton Ringstaff   
Brian Rose  
Beau Sandor   
Boden Savage   
Lauren Sula   
Braydon Sumners   
Charley Thomas   
Aydin Toquero  
MariSol Tovar 
Aaron Tubbs   
Ross Vincent   
Nolan Williams 
Brady Wilson   
Jennifer Young  

9th Grade
Alexa Anderson
Jacob Armstrong
Grace Beene
Grace Bender
Wrook Brown
Amanda Cantu
Allison Carnahan
Kamryn Cole
Caroline Dabney
Zachary Dinkelman 
Hayden Flores
Rachel Frisby 
Samuel Gist
Helen Grace
Luke Grace
Christopher Graham
Ryder Haas
Faith Hamilton
Alexandria Harris
Aubrey Heffner
Raylan Highfield

Grace Hilfman
Rachael Jett
Jessica Knight
Daniel Lander
Dylan Laverdiere
Kathryn Law
Raegan Maag
Madisyn Maddux
Presley Maddux
Emma Madsen
Kole Maedgen
Morgan Mays
Ryan McBurney
Dillon McDaniel
Christie McDowell
Jaci McGregor
Lucas Morvant
Lindsey Neas
Rylee Oborski
Chris Ortiz
Mia Patton 
Nohemi Pena
Lorena Perez-Enriques
KC Perkins
Logan Pitts
Reese Preston
Logan Rickey
Brenden Santana
Jacob Tipton
Gricelda Vargas
Ashley Voelter
Kory Walker
Isabella Walters
Preslee Webb
Emalie White
Hannah White
Avery Womack
William Won
Avery Wright

10th Grade
Allison Brinkman
Maddison Brinkman
Erin Faske
Grace Graham
Madison Haltom
Nathan Hansen
Horacio Huerta
Alanna Jones
Carson King
Catalina Langlitz
Jessie Laverdiere
Bailey Lomas
Katie Malensky
Jacob Markham
Natalie McBryde
Audrey Moore
Garrett Olivarez
Bebe Rainwater
Piper Randolph
Hannah Reavis
Abigail Rembert
Taylor Rich
Gage Robinson
Landry Rogers
Andrew Scallin
Bailey Schaub
Ethan Scott
Jacob Selby
Nader Smien
Lydia Smith
Kaytlynn Swindoll
Reagan Thrasher
Jessie Ventimiglia
Emaly Vrooman
Madalyn Wade
Ian Wilson
Garrett Woods

SISD Honor Rolls sponsored by

First State Bank Central Texas
Lobby:  Mon - Fri  9 a.m. - 3 p.m.   

Drive-in:  Mon - Thurs 7:30 a.m. - 4 p.m.  •   Fri 7:30 a.m. - 5:30 p.m.  •   Sat  9 a.m. - noon
Main St. at Thomas Arnold Rd.  |  Salado  |  (254) 947-5852  |  Member FDIC
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11th Grade
Marcus Becker Klett
Caitlan Beyer
Samantha Bourque
Samuel Brown
Nicholas Burns
Nathan Cahoon
Caleb Chambliss
Connor Cook
Franchesca Dalton
Aunnika Deen
Nicholas Deen
Reginia Deen
Rebecca Dockray
Caden Donahue
Rustin Hale
Dalton Hawes
Sydney Hill
Taylor Law
Samuel Macek
Matthew Maldonado
Leah Martinez
Abbey Matthews
Matthew McBurney
Grace McKee
Trace Medlin
Corban Mescher
Abigail Molyneaux
Rachel Moore
Gabriel Morris
Tyler Oglesby
Anna Pryor
Savannah Reeder
Warren Roche
Matthew Sellers
Zachary Shaver
Parker Shelley
Johnny Smith
Ryan Starritt

12th Grade
Paige Aydell
Zavier Bagio
Cameron Bagley
Quade Brown
Madeline Carter
Saira De La Hoya
David Dobbins
Blayne Fox
Bridget Golden
Hayden Haire
Mikalann Hayslip
Cutter Hudgens
Abbie James
Kathryn Kyburz
Ryan Kyburz
Constantinos Loullis
Stevie Malensky
Erin McBryde
Danielle McDaniel
Owen Merriman
Nathan Moore
Reagan Morreale
Seth Neal
John Perez
Jose Perez Enriquez
Tyler Pierce
Kirk Pruitt
Carlos Quintero
Jamie Rich
Samantha Stanley
Bailey Tindell
Ryan Trenholm
Loriann Turk
Devon Vance
Maritza Villafranco Espinosa
Louis Walrath
William Whigham
Jacob Wilk

 	 Salado High School FFA 
students competed in the 
nation’s largest one-day Ca-
reer Development Event in 
the nation, held at Tarleton 
State University.
	 Following are the teams 
and their results:

Wool:
Kenzie Pardon
Emily Stuckly 
Matt McBurney
The  team finished 10th in 
the area and 53rd overall in 
their first contest together.

Veterinary Science:
Ryley Flores
Ryley Corn 

Michelle Melendez
Mackenzy Ferguson 
	 The team finished in the 
top 30 for this area in their 
first contest together. 

Livestock:
Maddison Brinkman-17th 
individual of 1,066
Allison Brinkman-60th in-
dividual of 1,066
Cooper Free
Erin Faske
	 Salado was 55th out of 
273 teams total. SHS was 
the eighth place team is 
schools from this area. 

Meats Evaluation:
Owen Dabney

Franchesca Dalton 
Matthew Maldonado 
	 The team was 55th over-
all for the contest, and sixth 
overall for this area. 

Nursery/Landscape:
Paige Aydell
Emaly Vrooman 
Maddy Martinez
Bebe Rainwater
	 The team was 36th over-
all and fifth overall for this 
area. 

Floriculture:
Alex Harris
Kamryn Cole
Kayla Hudgens 
	 Salado was in the top 

150 overall and top 25 for 
this area. 

Wildlife:
Ethan Reyes 
Sara Sodergren
	 These students com-
peted for individual scores 
only and did very well! 
 

TSU CDE
	 The FFA students also 
competed on March 23 at 
the Texas State University 
Career Development Event

Nursery/Landscape:  
10th Place Team

Paige Aydell-24th Individu-
al Overall
Maddy Martinez
Bebe Rainwater 
Emaly Vrooman 

Veterinary Science:
18th Place Team 
Makenzy Ferguson 
Michelle Melendez 
Mia Patton 
 

Texas A&M
Judging
	 FFA students competed 
in the Texas A&M Judging 
Clinics on March 24.

Wool:
Kenzie Pardon
Emily Stuckly 
Matt McBurney 

Livestock:
Allison Brinkman-Drop 
of 5 points off the judging 
floor
	 Maddison Brinkman-
Drop of 7 points off the 
judging floor

Meats:
Trey Schaub
Matthew Maldonado
Franchesca Dalton 

Food Science:
Blake Marshall
 

Career development, judging teams compete
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104 Copper Lane, Jarrell  512-746-2333
105 Western Sky Trail, Jarrell 512-598-3900

4802 Moreland Drive, Georgetown 512-868-8300

KIDS’ ZONE  
Learning Center

NOW ENROLLING

CONSTRUCTIVE
LEARNING 

AHEAD

FAMILY-OWNED CHILDCARE CENTERS
SERVING AGES 0 TO 12 YEARS

CHILDREN ARE A GIFT FROM GOD -PSALM 127:3 

SALADO

Member 
FDIC

Go !  Eagles  Go!
We stand behind our home town teams

Now Accepting New Patients

Kevin DeLane
orthodontist

485 Thomas Arnold Road
saladoorthodontics.com
(254) 947-4011

860 N. Main  254-947-5050
c21bb.com

Good Luck from your ‘Home’ Team

Please call for an appointment (254) 947-3309
1325 N. Stagecoach Road

Your time is valuable! Save a trip and time. 

Ace
Pest and Lawn

Locally Owned and Operated 
Licensed by the Structural Pest Control Board TPCL #12512

Customer 
Satisfaction 
Guaranteed

Free Estimates 947-4222

6 weeks to 12 years Christian Environment
TSR Certified Preschool

+160 years staff experience

THE PLAY YARD PRESCHOOL

Come Learn & Grow With Us 

15299 S IH 35, Salado
Drop off & Pick up
at Salado ISD

947-1153

Mill Creek Cleaners

Quality Dry Cleaning, Laundry, 
Alterations & Custom Tailoring

213 Mill Creek Drive, Suite 200
Salado Plaza next to Brookshire Brothers

Mon-Fri 8-6 • Sat 9-2 • Closed Sunday
 (254) 947-0100

Salado FFA Archery Team competed in the Texas NASP State Tournament Wednesday, 
March 21, 2018 in Belton. This was a historic moment for our chapter, the accom-
plishment of these archers has paved the way for this program for years to come. We 
were 32nd High Team in the State with a score of 2955 and a total of 66 bullseyes 
over all.  Following are the students: Ethan Reyes, Chase Alexander, Holden Ford, 
Chase Harwell, Kyle Saunders, Wade Woods, Chandler Wilhelm, Logan Roach, Emily 
Stuckly, Tyler Barrett, Matt McBurney, Cameron Bufkin, Micheal Combs, Hunter Sey-
more, Janet Eschmann, Catalina Langlitz, Tyler Compton, Franchesca Dalton, Kenzie 
Pardon, Maddy Wade, Mackenzy Ferguson, Abbie James, Maddison Brinkman  and 
Kaitlyn Combs. (Courtesy photo)

JV Girls
take 2nd
	 Salado JV Girls Track 
placed second with 107 
points in the Cougar  HS 
Relays hosted by Jarrell 
March 22. Jarrell won the 
meet with 140 points.
	 Mia Patton placed sec-
ond in the 200 Meter Dash 
with a time of 30.17.
	 Nena Vero placed sec-
ond in the 400 Meter Dash 
with a time of 1:09.19.
	 Nena Vero placed first 
in the 800 Meter Run with a 
time of 2:54.44.
	 Lily Lougheed placed 
fifth in the 1600 Meter Run 
with a time of 7:15.09.
	 Lily Lougheed placed 
third int he 3200 Meter Run 
with a time of 14:48.04.
	 Rachel Luke placed 
sixth in the 100 Meter Hur-
dles with a time of 25.56.
	 Rachel Luke placed 
fourth in the 300 Meter Hur-
dles with a time of 1:11.59.
	 Salado’s 400 Meter Re-
lay team of Mia Patton, 
Ashley Voulter, Megan 
Manibusen and Jorja Wash-
ington placed first with a 
time of 54.80.
	 Salado’s 800 Meter Re-
lay team of Mia Patton, 
Ashley Voulter, Megan 
Manibusen and Jorja Wash-
ington placed first with a 
time of 1:58.17.
	 Salado’s 1600 Meter 
Relay team of Nena Vero, 
Megan Manibusen, Ashley 
Voulter and Jorja Washing-
ton placed first with a time 
of 4:42.04.
	 Ashley Voulter placed 
third in the Long Jump with 
a distance of 13’-5 1/2”.
	 Jasey Goings placed 
fifth in the Discus with a 
distance of 66’-3”.
	 Salado High School var-
sity track teams will com-
pete at the Texas Relays on 
March 30 in Austin.
	

	 Salado Varsity Girls 
Track team won the Cougar 
HS Relay hosted by Jarrell 
March 22 with 127 points. 
Thrall placed second with 
86 points.
	 Reginia Deen placed 
first in the 100 Meter Dash 
with a time of 12.63. Eliza-
beth Ford paced fourth with 
a time of 13.13.
	 Kaia Philen placed 
fourth in the 200 Meter 
Dash with a time of 29.28. 
Breigh Oliver placed fifth 
with a time of 29.44.
	 Taylor Rich placed third 
in the 400 Meter Dash with 
a time of 1:04.03. Samantha 
Vargas placed fifth with a 
time of 1:05.06.
	 Salado’s 400 Meter Re-
lay team of Angie Sand-
ers, Reginia Deen, Breigh 
Oliver and Janiah Del Rio 
placed first with a time of 
51.01.
	 Salado’s 800 Meter Re-
lay team of Janiah Del Rio, 
Kaia Philen, Breigh Oliver 
and Elizabeth Ford placed 
first with a time of 1:50.85.
	 Salado’s 1600 Meter 
Relay team of Taylor Rich, 
Elizabeth Ford, Samantha 
Vargas and Reginia Deen 
placed first with a time of 
4:22.63.
	 Elizabeth Ford placed 
first in the Long Jump with 
a distance of 16’-5 1/2”.
	 Landry Rogers placed 
second in the Discus with a 
throw of 102’-6”.
	 Breigh Oliver placed 
second in the Triple Jump 
with a total distance of 34’-
2”.
	 Elizabeth Ford placed 
third in the High Jump 
with a height of 5’-0”. Lor-
na Fleet placed fifth with a 
height of 4’-8”.
	 Presley Maddux placed 
third in the Pole Vault reach-
ing a height of 9’6”.

Salado Varsity Boys Track 
team placed fourth with 91 
points in the Cougar HS Re-
lays hosted by Jarrell March 
22.
	 Wrook Brown placed 
third in the 200 Meter Dash 
with a time of 24.35.
	 Wade Woods placed 
third in the 400 Meter Dash 
with a time of 54.22. Mar-
cos Klett placed sixth with a 
time of 55.55.
	 Logan Rickey placed 
fifth in the 800 Meter Run 
with a time of 2:16.65.
	 Hunter Haas placed sec-
ond in the 1600 Meter Run 
with a time of 4:52.03.
	 Hunter Haas placed first 
in the 3200 Meter Run with 
a time of 10:57.35.
	 Holden Ford placed sec-
ond in the 110 Meter Hur-
dles with a time of 15.28.
	 Salado’s 400 Meter Re-
lay team of Aaron Torczyns-
ki, Wade Woods, Cade De-
Poy and Holden Ford placed 
third with a time of 45.24.
	 Salado’s 800 Meter Re-
lay team of Wrook Brown, 
Chase Harwell, Quade 
Brown and Holden Ford 
placed third with a time of 
1:34.91.

	 Salado’s 1600 Me-
ter Relay team of Quade 
Brown, Reid Vincent, Chase 
Harwell and Wade Woods 
placed third with a time of 
3:37.88.
	 Reid Vincent placed sec-
ond in the Long Jump with 
a distance of 20’-2”. Holden 
Ford placed fifth with a dis-
tance of 19’-4 1/2”.
	 Bobby Cunningham 
placed fourth in the Discus 
with a distance of 110’-4”

JV Boys
place 3rd
	 Salado JV Boys Track 
placed third with 106 points  
in the Cougar HS Relays 
hosted by Jarrell March 22. 
Jarrell won the meet with 
163 points.
	 Logan Pitts placed third 
in the 100 Meter Dash with 
a time of 11.84. 
	 Logan Pitts placed third 
in the 400 Meter Dash with 
a time of 59.37. 
	 Chris Ortiz placed fifth 
in the 800 Meter Run with a 
time of 2:31.13.
	 Grant Sellers placed 
third in the 1600 Meter Run 

with a time of 5:33.
	 Grant Sellers placed first 
in the 3200 Meter Run with 
a time of 12:01.38.
	 Wesley Hernandez 
placed first in the 300 Me-
ter Hurdles with a time of 
46.93. 
	 Salado’s 400 Meter Re-
lay team of Latrell Jenkins, 
Logan Pitts, Cade Scallin 
and Clayton Zak placed 
fourth with a time of 48.06.
	 Salado’s 800 Meter Re-
lay team of Latrell Jenkins, 
Noah Mescher, Cade Scal-
lin and Clayton Zak placed 
third with a time of 1:40.77.
	 Salado’s 1600 Meter 
Relay team of Cade Scallin, 
Noah Mescher, Latrell Jen-
kins and Clayton Zak placed 
first with a time of 3:49.68.
	 Logan Pitts placed 
fourth in the Long Jump 
with a distance of 16’-4”.
	 Cade Scallin placed 
fourth in the High Jump 
with a height of 5’-4”.
	 Kole Maedgen placed 
first in the Pole Vault reach-
ing a height of 9’-6”. Seth 
Culp placed second with a 
height of 9’-0”.

	

Angie Sanders hands off to Reginia Deen in the 4X100 Meter Relay. Salado girls took 
first in the event with a time of 51.01. Breigh Oliver and Janiah Del Rio are also on the 
team. (Photo by Lee Lougheed)

Holden Ford placed second in the 110 Meter Hurdles. Salado placed fourth in the 
Jarrell Cougar Relays last week. (Photo by Lee Lougheed)

Varsity runners take
4th at Cougar Relays

Ladies win Cougar RelaysJunior High Track Results
Page 3D this edition
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PizzaPlaceSalado.com

947-0022
230 North Main Street

Open Daily at 11am

The Pizza Place

 Pickup   •   Dine-in  •  Delivery

Have you tried our WINGS?
Salado’s favorite restau-

rants are offering a variety 
of Easter dining options. 
These family friendly 
brunches offer traditional 
classics as well as innova-
tive selections. 

Alexander’s Distillery
Easter Brunch at Alexan-

der’s Distillery features a 
prix fixe three course meal 
with a young adult menu for 
those under 12. 

Entrée selections include 
a roasted filet of beef ten-
derloin accompanied by  
mashed potatoes, roasted 
asparagus and a caber-
net-mushroom reduction 
glazed pork loin is paired 
with Brussels sprouts, 
mashed potatoes and a 
spicy peach glaze or choose 
tempura cod fish with Asian 
noodles with julienne vege-
tables and sweet chili sauce. 

The meal begins with 
either a cured and smoked 
salmon selection or an ap-
ple and spinach salad and 
ends with your choice of 
traditional crème brulée, 
Bananas Foster o​r wild Tex-
as berry cobbler with vanil-
la ice cream. 

Young adults can choose 
from a petit filet or crispy 
chicken tenders, both ac-
companied with vegetables 

or a baked a macaroni and 
cheese; all served with a va-
nilla bean ice cream. 

 Reservations are avail-
able online at inncreek.
com/alexanders-distillery 
or by phone (254) 947-3828
Alexander’s Distillery at 
Inn on the Creek is located 
on Center Circle.

Barton House
For Easter Barton House 

has created a special menu 
that ranges from appetiz-
ers to desserts with a kid 

friendly menu for the little 
ones. 

Appetizers include a 
green chili Bolognese 
stuffed mushroom, garlic 
shrimp or candied bacon 
tabla. Salad selections are 
Caesar, apples and arugula, 
mixed green salad or a blue 
corn crusted salmon salad. 

Entrée selections are 
smoked salmon Benedict, 
green chili potato cake 
Benedict, double D burger, 
pumpkin seed pesto salm-
on, chicken fried steak, 
Yucatan double pork chop, 
pollo San Juanita, Sea Bass 
or La Donna - a grilled filet 
mignon with diablo butter. 

Desserts include season-
al skillet cobbler with ice 
cream, key lime pie, salted 
caramel cheese cake and 
Capriotada - a traditional 
bread pudding that is usual-
ly eaten during the Lenten 
period in Mexico.  

The kids menu offers 
strawberry and cream 
French toast, Captain 
Crunch chicken tenders or 
mac and cheese with Gold-
fish crumble. 

The Barton House Easter 
menu will be served from 
11 a.m. - 4 p.m. Reserva-
tions are available online at 
thebartonhousesalado.com 
or by phone (254) 947-0441. 
Barton House is located on 
Main Street. 

Stagecoach Inn
The historic Stagecoach 

Inn will be celebrating Eas-
ter with a hot buffet, a cold 
buffet, and a variety of des-
serts. Featured are a carv-
ing station of house-cured 
ham with a local honey 
glaze and a waffle station.

 Menu favorites on the 
hot buffet include chick-
en fried steak with black 
peppercorn cream gravy, 
bacon and cheddar cheese 
grits and house cured and 
smoked bacon as well as 
other traditional favorites. 

The cold buffet includes 
seasonal fruit salad with 
poppyseed dressing, Texas 
pimento cheese sandwich-
es, field green salad with 
watermelon radish, sprouts 
and lemon vinaigrette as 
well as cinnamon rolls, 
cornbread muffins and cof-
fee cake. 

Dessert offerings include 
carrot cake, lemon tarts 
and butterscotch chocolate 
brownies.

Brunch is served from 11 
a.m. to 3 p.m. and reserva-
tions are available online 
at stagecoachsalado.com or 
by phone (254) 947-5111. 
Stagecoach Inn is located 
on Main Street.

Easter eats in Salado

Barton House is offering a smoked salmon Benedict on 
the Easter Menu. Alexander’s Distillery and Stagecoach 
Inn also have special offerings for Easter Sunday. 
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March 29
	 Maundy Thursday 
Service with communion 
6 p.m. at the Worship 
Center of Salado United 
Methodist Church
March 29
	 Maundy Thursday 
Service with Holy Com-
munion, 6 p.m. at the 
Presbyterian Church of 
Salado. Conducted in 
a setting similar to the 
original Jewish Passover, 
a light meal will be served
March 29
	 Maundy Thursday 
service, 6:30 p.m. at St. 
Joseph Episcopal Church. 
Maundy Thursday liturgy 
with Holy Eucharist Rite 
2 followed by Stripping of 
the Altar
March 30
	 Salado ISD closed
March 30
	 Stations of the Cross 
dramatization by the 
Saint Stephen Youth 
Group, noon at Saint 
Stephen Catholic Church
March 30
	 Good Friday  service, 
6:30 p.m. at St. Joseph 
Episcopal Church. Self 
guided Stations of the 
Cross are from 10 a.m. 
until 5 p.m. Good Fri-
day Liturgy at 6:30 p.m. 
Group Stations of the 
Cross will follow the 
service outside, weather 
permitting
March 30
	 Korean Kravings Food 
Truck 4 - 8 p.m. at Bar-
row Brewing Co 
March 30
	 Good  Friday Service 6 
p.m. in Worship Center of 
Salado United Methodist 
Church. Program: “The 
Seven Last Words of Jesus 
Christ” A Commemora-
tion of Good  in Music
March 30 - 31
	 Ostrich Egg Decorating  
at Salado winery.  6:30 
p.m. Saturday noon or 2 
p.m. tickets: eventbrite.
com
March 30 - 31
	 Blow Your Own Easter 
Eggs at Salado Glass-
works. Book your times 
online at saladoglass-
works.com. 
March 31
	 Heritage Country 
Church 1st Anniversary 
Celebration 10 a.m. 9929 
Lark Trail. Easter Egg 
Hunt lunch and live music 
for all ages
March 31
	 Finadene Food Truck 
4 - 8 p.m. at Barrow 
Brewing Co
April 1
	 Sunrise Easter Ser-
vice 7 a.m. at Pace Park. 
Hosted by Salado United 
Methodist Church
April 1
	 Easter Service, 10 a.m. 
at Presbyterian Church of 
Salado. Featured will be 
special music to celebrate 
Jesus Christ Rising from 
the Dead
April 1
	 Easter Sunday at St. 
Joseph Episcopal Church, 
10 a.m. Confirmation and 
Reception. Easter Egg 
Hunt and Brunch to fol-
low. Bring wildflowers for 
the flowering of the Cross 
in the courtyard before 
the service

April 1
	 Easter Egg Hunt, 10:30 
a.m. at Saint Stephen 
Catholic Church; follows 
morning services 
April 2
	 Salado First Monday 
Gardeners 8 a.m. at the 
Visitor Center.
April 2
	 Coloring with Karen 
10:30 a.m. - 2:30 p.m. at 
Stamp Salado
April 2
	 Children’s Story and 
Craft Time 11 a.m. at Sal-
ado Public Library. info: 
(254) 947-9191
April 2
	 Salado Village Artists 
meet: Knitters 1 - 3 p.m.  
and Stitchers 1:30 - 4 p.m. 
at Salado Village Artists 
Building
April 2
	 Salado Schools Alumni 
Association Annual Meet-
ing 6 p.m. at the Meadows 
Room of Salado Civic 
Center (old Study Hall)
April 2
	 Salado Historical Soci-
ety board meeting 6 p.m. 
at Salado Public Library

April 3
	 Salado Village Artists 
meet 9 - 11 a.m.  brush art 
crafting and needle work 
at Salado Village Artist 
building
April 3
	 Sit and Knit 10 a.m. 
- noon at Salado Public 
Library. info: (254) 947-
9191
April 3
	 Salado Rotary Club 
11:30 a.m. at Johnny’s 
Steaks and Barbecue
April 3
	 Salado Community 
Chorus practice 6 p.m. 
Salado Civic Center info: 
saladochorus.com
April 5
	 Detroit’s Own Food 
Truck 4 - 9 p.m. at Bar-
row Brewing Co
April 5
	 Chisholm Trail Amer-
ican Business Woman’s 
Association meeting 6 
p.m. at First Presbyterian 
Church of Salado.
April 5
	 Village of Salado 
Board of Aldermen meet-
ing 6:30 p.m. at Municipal 
Building. Includes Public 
Hearing to consider 
sign ordinance variance 
request in the Historic 
District

April 6
	 Youth Worship Night 
8 - 10 p.m. at Tablerock. 
Free community wide 
event. Music from Union 
House and others, Speak-
er: Karl Baker, contact 
director Paige Taylor 
for info: (254) 913-1664. 
Donations accepted for 
Heart and Hands Minis-
tries Food Pantry
April 7
	 Big Blue Birthday Bash 
10 a.m. - 3 p.m. at Stamp 
Salado. Special make n’ 
takes with Diane Mark 
and Karen
April 7
	 Toast Two Years at 
Barrow Brewing Co. 
Enjoy new beers, Amurica 
TX vintage photobooth 
trailer, food from Hecho 
en Queso and Korean 
Kravings, local music and 
2-year anniversary pint 
glass (while supplies last)
April 7
	 Smokin Spokes Salado 
Intermediate School Info: 
saladospokes.com
April 9
	 Children’s Story and 
Craft Time 11 a.m. at Sal-
ado Public Library. info: 
(254) 947-9191

Live Music in Salado

Live Music Venues:
Barrow Brewing Company on Royal barrowbrewing.com
Johnny’s Outback on Thomas Arnold johnnysoutback.com

Saturday
	 Granger Smith,  6 p.m. 
at Johnny’s Outback 
April 7
	 Toast Two Years at 
Barrow Brewing Co with 
music from Wayworn 
Traveler, Wes Perryman, 
BenJamin’ Guenther Mu-
sic, and the Chameleon 
Band
	 Randy Rogers Band, 6 
p.m. - 11 p.m. at Johnny’s 
Outback. tickets: johnny-
ssteaksandbbq.com

send your 
music event 
listings to

 news@saladovillagevoice.com

The Salado School Alumni Association will hold its Annual Meeting 6 p.m. on April 2 
in the Meadows Room of Salado Civic Center. Former students and teachers are en-
couraged to attend. The Meadows Room is the former Salado ISD study hall. Shown 
above are SHS students and faculty using the room in 1957

Calendar continues on 3C

(254) 947-3969
www.LoneStarEBikes.com

560 N Main Street, Suite 1
10 AM - 7 PM DAILY

EBIKE SALES       RENTALS      SALADO TOURS

The Annex for 
Creative Learning 

featuring 
Pretty Planks | Jewelry

Bike Maintenance
Apple Computer classes and more

Maiden Made 
Jewelry 

560 N Main Street, Suite 2
(254) 947-3969

Resolve to
            live longer...

Ride!

SOFI’S a t  t h e 
S t a g e c o a c h

4 0 1  S .  M a i n                ( 2 5 4 )  9 4 7 - 4 3 3 6

N E W  F L A X 
B O O T S  &  S H O E S

Also at the Hub in Temple

213 MILL CREEK DR. #195    254.699.3933 

FREE Pelvic Health Screenings 
Thurs., 3/29 from 10 am– 4pm 

HOW? HEALTHY PEVLIC FLOOR MUSCLES 

 LAUGH  WIT HOUT LEAKING  

Cowboys Bar-B-Q
Exit 285 • 1300 Robertson RD

Catering, Take Out or Dine In

254-947-5700 
Miguel Perez, owner

Slow Cooking
Fast Service

Corner of Royal Street and Center Circle (West)
(254) 947-1960

 Open
Mon, Wed, Thurs 5 p.m.
Fri, Sat & Sun 11 a.m.

Closed Tues

A place for weary travelers, thirsty 
tourist, and hungry neighbors!

Tried our Pulled Pork?
Cooked to Perfection on 

The Big Green Egg!

(254) 947-1909 
open daily

 560 N. Main, Suite 10  

Friend us on Facebook for 
Wellness Updates, 

Current Offers
 and Newest Artisan Gifts

Johnny’s Outback will 
kick off the 2018 Lone Star 
Music Series with Granger 
Smith on March 31. 

Smith brings a high en-
ergy show to Johnny’s, and 
you cannot help but wonder 
if you will see an appear-
ance from Earl Dibbles, Jr. 
at the Saturday night show.  

Smith’s debut single 
“Backroad Song” was a big 

hit on mainstream country 
radio.  In fact on February 
14, 2016, the single became 
the most played song in 
America as it topped all the 
mainstream radio charts.  
Granger released his latest 
album “When the Good 
Guys Win,” in the Fall of 
2017.

Other featured artists in 
the Lone Star Music Series 

at Johnny’s Outback include 
Randy Rogers on April 7, 
Turnpike Troubadours on 
May 11 and William Clark 
Green on June 23. 

Advance tickets for 
Granger Smith are available 
at johnnyssteaksandbbq.
com or at the restaurant for 
$15. Gates open at 6 p.m. 
with a $20 ticket at the gate.  

Lone Star Music Series kicks 
off at Johnny’s Outback

Texas born Granger Smith performs at Johnny’s Out-
back March 31. 
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120 Royal Street       (254) 947-0747              
Tues - Sat  10:30 - 5     

Springhouse Emporium

Shop Salado .......
Shop Springhouse

Inn on the Creek • 602 Center Circle 
(254) 947-3828

tuesday - thursday happy hour

Best view
& cocktails 

in town

Calendar continued from page 2C
April 9
	 Salado Village Artists 
meet: Knitters 1 - 3 p.m.  
and Stitchers 1:30 - 4 p.m. 
at Salado Village Artists 
Building
April 10
	 Salado Village Artists 
meet 9 - 11 a.m.  brush art 
crafting and needle work 
at Salado Village Artist 
building
April 10	
	 Salado Ladies Auxil-
iary meeting 9:30 a.m. 
Social and 10 a.m. Meet-
ing at Salado Church of 
Christ Activity Center
April 10
	 Sit and Knit 10 a.m. 
- noon at Salado Public 
Library. info: (254) 947-
9191
April 10
	 Salado Rotary Club 
11:30 a.m. at Johnny’s 
Steaks and Barbecue
April 10	
	 Salado Community 
Chorus practice 6 p.m. 
Salado Civic Center info: 
saladochorus.com
April 11
	 Salado Lions Club 
11:30 a.m. Salado Civic 
Center
April 12
	 Salado Ladies Auxil-
iary Meeting 9:30 a.m. 
at the Salado Church of 
Christ Activity Center
April 12
	 Open House at Salado 
Montessori 5 - 6:30 p.m. 
at 10880 FM 1670. Now 
enrolling for Fall Classes. 
info: (254) 947-4005
April 13
	 Lone Star Legends 
Music Fest featuring 
Brandon Rhyder 5 p.m. 
at Johnny’s Outback. 
Proceeds benefit an 
all-abilities playground 
for Salado sponsored by 
Sirena Fest. tickets at 
eventbrite.com info at 
sirenafest.com
April 13 - 20 
	 The Amazing Creativ-
ity of Salado art exhibit 
at the Texas State Capitol 
Building. 
April 13-14
	 Date Night at Salado 
Glassworks. Adults only. 
Book your time online at 
saladoglassworks.com.
April 14
	 Troll Trot 5K 8 a.m. at 
Salado Museum and Col-
lege Hill Park. register: 
runsignup.com

April 14
	 Salado Make a Dif-
ference Day across the 
Village. info:  keepsalado-
beautiful.com
April 14
	 Heart and Hands Min-
istries food and clothing 
pantry 9 - 11 a.m. at Sala-
do Plaza Shopping Center. 
Donation/volunteer info: 
947-5465
April 14
	 Farmers Market 4 - 8 
p.m. at Barrow Brewing 
Co
April 14 - 15
	 Salado Market Days 
9 a.m. - 5 p.m. at Salado 
Antique Mall
April 14
	 Salado Lions Club 
Pancake Breakfast. info 
pending
April 15
	 Salado 4H Meeting 
4 p.m. at Salado High 
School Cafeteria
April 16
	 Children’s Story and 
Craft Time 11 a.m. at Sal-
ado Public Library. info: 
(254) 947-9191
April 16
	 Salado Village Artists 
meet: Knitters 1 - 3 p.m.  
and Stitchers 1:30 - 4 p.m. 
at Salado Village Artists 
Building
April 16
	 Classified advertis-
ing deadline for Salado 
Village Voice noon. info: 
classifieds@saladovilla-
gevoice.com

April 16
	 Salado United Meth-
odist Women 5:45 p.m. at 
Salado United Methodist 
Church Room 117
April 16
	 Salado Democrats 7 
p.m. at Salado Public 
Library
April 17
	 Salado Village Artists 
meet 9 - 11 a.m.  brush art 
crafting and needle work 
at Salado Village Artist 
building
April 17
	 Sit and Knit 10 a.m. 
- noon at Salado Public 
Library. info: (254) 947-
9191
April 17
	 Salado Rotary Club 
11:30 a.m. at Johnny’s 
Steaks and Barbecue
April 17	 	
	 Salado Community 
Chorus practice 6 p.m. 
Salado Civic Center info: 
saladochorus.com
April 17
	 Bell County Genealog-
ical Society Meeting 6:30 
p.m. at Temple Public 
Library
April 18
	 Mah Jongg at Salado 
Public Library 10 a.m.-2 
p.m. 
April 19
	 Salado Chamber of 
Commerce Board Meet-
ing 8:30 a.m. at the Visi-
tors Center

Shop at Salado’s Boutique Marketplace
Women’s Apparel, Shoes ~ Flip Flops to Boots,
Jewelry, Baby Gifts & Apparel, Gourmet Food,

 Home Decor & Furniture, Home Fragrance, 
Junk Gypsy™ Paint,  Gifts & More

22 North Main Street
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Book Your Tee Time Today

Open for Breakfast 7 a.m. Daily
Mill Creek Country Club Bar & Grill 

open to the public 7 a.m. - 7 p.m. 
Dine In  or  Carry Out

18 unforgettable holes of Golf designed by Robert Trent Jones, Jr.

OPEN TO THE PUBLIC 
 Practice Facility                    Memberships Available 

millcreek-golf.com       
(254) 947-5698

(254) 947-5111

photo by Cody Graham

Open for Lunch and Dinner
Brunch Saturday and Sunday 11 am - 3 pm
Closed Monday & Tuesday

MUD PIES 
POTTERY

HAND THROWN POTTERY 
ONE PIECE AT A TIME 

Handmade 
Pottery

Sir
Wigglesworth’s

Homemade 
Fudge 

18 North Main 
947-0281 

OLD FASHIONED BURGERS
                    and ICE-CREAM

882 North Main Street

 facebook.com/burgersICEcream
plus.google.com/+OldFashionedBurgersandicecreamSalado

(254) 947-5271

$1 off any burger or 
sandwich combo 

with this ad

TRY OUR NEW MENU

Ostrich Egg Decorating  at Salado Winery. Sessions are 6:30 p.m. March 30 and 12 
noon and 2 p.m. March 31. Tickets are $45 and available at eventbrite.com
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Shopping Map of Salado
Map Legend

S	 Shopping
A	 Art and Galleries
L	 Lodging
D	 Dining and Drinks
V	 Venues & Sights
$	 Services
C	 Churches and Education

#	 Business Name	 Type
4	 St. Stephen Catholic Church	 C
6	 Salado College Park	 V
7	 Raney & Associates	 $
8	 Stagecoach Inn	 D
9	 Salado Museum	 V
	 Salado Visitors Center	 $
	 Salado Chamber of Comerce	 $
	 Village of Salado Tourism Office	 $
10	 Sofi’s	 S
14	 Salado Glassworks	 A
17	 Barrow Brewing Company	 D
20	 Springhouse Emporium	 S
21	 The Venue                   	 V
22	 The Shed 	 D
24	 Tablerock	 V
26	 Salado United Methodist Church	 C
29	 Alexander’s Distillery	 D
29	 Inn on the Creek	 L
30	 First Baptist Church	 C
32	 First Texas Brokerage	 $
33	 First State Bank	 $
34	 First Community Title	 $
	 Farmer’s Insurance	 $
	        Zbranek Agency
40	 W.A. Pace Memorial Park 	 V
48	 The Inn at Salado	 L
49	 Lively Coffeehouse & Bistro	 D
49	 Magnolias	 S
55	 Salado Family Dentistry	 $
58	 The Shoppes on Main	 S
60	 Salado Creek Jewelry	 S
62	 The Pizza Place	 D
65	 ERA Colonial Real Estate	 $
73	 Cornett Corner
	   Investment Realty	 $
	   First Eye Care Salado	 S
75	 Angelic Herbs	 S
	 Bruce Bolick, CPA	 $
	 Lone Star EBikes	 S
76	 Salado Civic Center	 $
81	 Salado Wine Seller and	 D
	 Salado Winery Co.
82	 St. Joseph’s Episcopal Church	 C
85	 Salado Post Office	 $
86	 Bill Bartlett – Century 21	 $
86	 Subway	 D
	 Old Fashioned Burgers 	 D 
87	 The Personal Wealth Coach	 $          
89	 Stamp Salado	 S
90	 Presbyterian Church of Salado	 C
91	 Troy Smith Financial Services	 $
92	 Salado Sculpture Garden	 A
96	 Salado Plaza
	 Ace Pest Control	 $
	 Integrity Rehab	 $
	 Keith Ace Hardware	 $
	 Mill Creek Cleaners	 $
	 Salado’s Hair Shop	 $
	 Salado Village Voice	 $
97	 Brookshire Brothers	 S
100	Salado Public Library	 C
101	 Salado Cleaners	 $
104	Hairitage Barber Shop	 $
113	 Salado Church of Christ	 C
118	 Salado Market Days	 S
119	 Salado Antique Mall       	 S
126	 Cowboy’s Barbecue	 D
124 Salado Veterinary Hospital	 $
130	 Village Spirits	 S
132	 Broecker Funeral Home	 $
133	 Johnny’s Steaks and BBQ	 D
135	 Embrace Smiles	 $
136	 Salado Schools & Stadium	 C
139	 Cedar Valley Baptist Church	 C

Not Shown on the Shopping Map
Animal Medical	 $
JD’s Travel Center	 D
The Play Yard Preschool	 $
Don Ringer	 $
Garlyn Shelton	 $
3C Cowboy Fellowship 	 C
Grace Baptist Church	 C
Mill Creek Country Club	 D/V

Historical Markers in Salado

6.	 Salado Historic College Hill
8.	 Shady Villa Hotel (Stagecoach Inn)
8.	 Main Street Bridge
16.	 Barber-Berry Mercantile
23.	 The Baines House
24.	 Historic Dipping Vats

25.	 The A.J. Rose Mansion
26.	 Old Methodist Chapel
27. 	 Caskey-Hendricks House
28.  	Dr. McKie Place (Twelve Oaks)
29.	 Alexander’s Distillery

30.	 First Baptist Church
31.	 The Tyler House
35.	 Salado Masonic Lodge #296
45. 	 The Anderson House 
46	 Old Saloon

48.	 The Norton-Orgain House
50. 	 The Barton House
51.	 The Levi Tenney House
55. 	 The Armstrong Adams House
61. 	 Historic Lenticular Bridge

49.	 The Vickrey House
76.	 Boles-Aiken & Denman Cabins
77.	 The Robert B. Halley House
79.	 The Reed Cabin
100.	The Josiah Fowler House
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1. U.S. CITIES: Which U.S. 
city is popularly known as 
“Beantown”?
2. MUSIC: What was the 
best-selling music single of all 
time?
3. MYTHOLOGY: In Greek 
mythology, how many graces 
are there?
4. TRANSPORTATION: 
Which major airport is known 
by the three-letter code DCA?
5. TELEVISION: What are 
the names of the two Muppet 
characters that heckle the cast 
from their balcony seats?
6. LITERATURE: What is the 
first name of Agatha Christie’s 

If you enjoy the 
Puzzle page,

 try our 
interactive 

crossword and 
sudoku puzzles 

online at:
saladovilla-

gevoice.com

detective Miss Marple?
7. PSYCHOLOGY: What is 
triskaidekaphobia?
8. GEOGRAPHY: What is 
the largest freshwater body in 
Africa?
9. GENERAL KNOWL-
EDGE: What was the stron-
gest earthquake recorded?
10. TOYS & GAMES: What 
is the main ingredient of Silly 
Putty? 

Answers
1. Boston
2. “Candle in the Wind” (1997, 
Elton John)
3. Three: Aglaia, Euphrosyne 
and Thalia
4. Washington National Air-
port
5. Statler and Waldorf
6. Jane
7. Fear of the number 13
8. Lake Victoria
9. 9.5 magnitude, near Valdiv-
ia, Chile, in 1960
10. Silicone
	 (c) 2018 King Features 
Synd., Inc.

Assume you’re in four 
spades and West cashes the 
A-K of hearts, then shifts to a 
trump.

You’re bound to lose a di-
amond trick, come what may, 
but the danger is that you may 
lose two. Situations like this 
occur all the time, and must 
be dealt with on a case-by-case 
basis.

One thing you shouldn’t do 
in this instance is to bank ev-
erything on East’s having the 
king of diamonds. It certain-
ly is tempting to finesse the 
queen, but that is something 
you should do only as a last 
resort.

Contract
Bridge
By Steve Becker

First you should try to 
learn where the king is locat-
ed. Accordingly, after winning 
the trump return, you lead the 

queen of clubs. When West 
follows low, you go up with the 
ace, making a mental note that 
East almost surely has the king 
since West presumably would 
have covered the queen if he 
could have.

Next you lead a club and 
ruff it. If East plays the king on 
this trick, which is likely, you 
have a much better picture of 
the hand than you had at the 
start. You still may be unable 
to make the contract, but at 
least you know West has the 
king of diamonds. This is be-
cause he opened the bidding as 
dealer and could scarcely have 
done so without the diamond 
king.

Your one hope now is that 
West was dealt the singleton 
or doubleton king. If he has 
three diamonds, you can kiss 
the hand goodbye. So, after 
another round of trumps, you 
cash the ace of diamonds, enter 
dummy with a trump and lead 
a diamond. Regardless of what 
East plays, you duck.

As it happens, West must 
win with the king, and you 
wind up making the contract.

(c) 2018 King Features 
Synd., Inc.

Resisting temptation
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Wild About Texas
Michael Price

(254) 947-0027 | (800) 724-0027

Historic Bed and Breakfast ~Weddings ~ Receptions  ~ Meetings

Inn at Salado

North Main & Pace Park Dr.  inn-at-salado.com                   

Western Massasauga

Many people are astound-
ed when they learn that 
Texas has 10 races of rat-
tlesnake that call this state 
home, and many more are 
surprised to find out that 
we have one of the smallest 
varieties, albeit one with a 
funny name.  	

The Western Massa-
sauga (Sistrurus cate-
natus tergeminus) has a 
wide-ranging, but excep-
tionally localized distri-
bution. It naturally occurs 
from the extreme southeast 
corner of Nebraska east-
ward through northwest-
ern Missouri southward to 
central Texas. Although it 
bears the common name of 

“Western Massasauga”, this 
diminutive species would 
be better suited with the no-
menclature of “Prairie Mas-
sasauga” due to the habitats 
that this grassland-dwell-
ing species prefers. In fact, 
recent DNA studies have 
shown that this race may in 
fact be a separate species al-
together, and that common 
name may actually change 
in the near future. 

Compared to some of the 
more commonly observed 
and well-known rattle-
snakes, the Western Massa-
sauga is a true dwarf race. 
Most adults encountered 
are less than 20 inches in 
total length, including rat-
tle, and although the record 
size was an individual that 
was just under 3 feet, this 
“giant” was more the excep-
tion than the rule.  As such, 
this species of rattlesnake is 
one of the smallest that can 
be found within the con-
fines of this state. 

Western Massasaugas 
are not extravagantly col-
ored animals to say the 
least. The background col-
oration varies from a light 
gray to a light tan, and 
along the spine are large, 
darker brown blotches that 
are clearly defined with an 
outline of white.  Directly 

below these blotches are 
similarly colored spots that 
are right above the belly 
scales. More often not there 
is a brown “smudge” on the 
sides that is in between the 
dorsal blotches and the side 
blotches. It also has a broad, 
dark line that extends from 
the eye to the corner of the 
mouth. 

Like other rattlesnakes, 
the head of this species is 
distinctly wider than the 
neck, giving this animal the 
famous “diamond-shaped” 
head. The pupils are ellip-
tical, and the rattle is quite 
tiny and is hard to hear un-
less one is fairly close to a 
specimen.

Generally speaking, this 
species of venomous ser-
pent is surface-active only 
for a few weeks annually. 
The first emergence from 
brumation (not hibernation 
as the animal does not sleep 
through the winter, but rath-
er just slows its heart rate 
and metabolism) usually 
takes place in late March 
to early April, depending 
on the temperatures and 
the rainfall amounts. It is 
during this time that it can 
be found diurnally, par-
ticularly in the mornings 
and late afternoons. Breed-
ing ordinarily takes place 

during this spring-time 
surface activity. Western 
Massasaugas are oviparous, 
which means they give birth 
to living young, and the 5 
inch-long neonates (which 
number from 4 to 6) are 
typically born in late sum-
mer. Other than having a 
“button” on the end of the 
tail, they are exact replicas 
of the adults, and are ful-
ly capable of fending for 
themselves, including hav-
ing fully functional fangs 
and venom apparatus’. The 
only difference in the col-
oration between adults and 
juveniles is the young are 
adorned with a bright yel-
low tail. 

The second activity peri-
od is during the late sum-
mer early fall when it is 
more nocturnal in its hab-
its. Interestingly enough, 
this species is much less 
heat-tolerant than other 
rattlesnakes, and during 
the heat of the summer 
months, individuals will of-
ten remain underground for 
weeks at a time. 	

Like other pit-vipers, the 
Western Massasauga uses 
its venom to obtain its prey, 
which is primarily made up 
of lizards of various sizes. 
Adults will occasionally 
add small rodents and even 
toads to its diet.  

Generally, Western Mas-
sasaugas appear to be more 
high-strung and tempera-
mental than the more com-
mon Western Diamondback 
Rattler. However, I am 
aware of only a handful of 
envenomations, and none of 
these were life-threatening. 
That does not dilute the ur-
gency of seeking medical 
attention if one is bitten of 
course. 

Due to its limited sur-
face activity, the risk of 
encountering a Western 
Massasauga is remarkably 
slim. If such an encounter 
occurs, remember that this 
animal, despite its harmful 
capability, is more afraid of 
you than you are of it and 
it would prefer to be left 
alone. The best course of 
action is to walk, don’t run, 
in the opposite direction.

The Western Massasauga is the smallest 
of the rattlesnakes

The Baines House 
Inn & Gallery

316 Royal Street
(254) 947-5260 | baineshouse.com

The Baines House 
Inn & Gallery

316 Royal Street
(254) 947-5260 | baineshouse.com

The Baines House 
Inn & Gallery

316 Royal Street
(254) 947-5260 | baineshouse.com

Stay in the Historic 1860’s Home of 
George Washington Baines

Comfort & Serenity 
with Nearby Shopping & Dining
Extensive Art | Fine  Antiques

JD's Travel Center

15881 South IH 35 , Salado                  (254)  947-5228

Take I35 Exit South 283 or North 282

PARDON 
OUR 

MESS

Still serving our customers....but

Facility upgrades happening now

21 North Main in the Salado Square

(254) 947-3688

Breakfast & Lunch
Sandwich • Soup • Salad 

Gourmet Coffee • Espresso • Smoothies
Homemade Breads & Bagels

WED - SAT   9 - 4 
SUN 10 - 4

MON   9 - 4 
closed Tuesday

LIVELY
COFFEE
HOUSE
& 
BISTRO

21 North Main in the Salado Square
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SUN 10 - 4    MON   9 - 4 

closed Tuesday

LIVELY
COFFEE
HOUSE
& 
BISTRO

21 North Main in the Salado Square
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Breakfast & Lunch
Sandwich • Soup • Salad 
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Homemade Breads & Bagels

WED - SAT   9 - 4 
SUN 10 - 4

MON   9 - 4 
closed Tuesday

LIVELY
COFFEE
HOUSE
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21 North Main in the Salado Square

(254) 947-3688

Breakfast & Lunch
Sandwich • Soup • Salad 

Gourmet Coffee • Espresso • Smoothies
Homemade Breads & Bagels

WED - SAT   9 - 4 
SUN 10 - 4

MON   9 - 4 
closed Tuesday

 1109 W. Village Rd, Salado (behind Sonic)                            

Monday thru Saturday         10 a.m. to 9 p.m.

Liquor Store

(254) 947-7117

Salado’s Finest Selection of Domestic, 
Import, Commercial & Craft Beers

THURS - SAT 10 - 5 SUN 12 - 5 MON 10 - 5
CLOSED TUES & WED       947-3355

751 Stagecoach Road  I-35 frontage road North
Clean Restrooms

SALADO ANTIQUE MALL
and Bee’s Antiques

Thousands of Antiques, Collectibles and Primitives in a unique and inviting atmosphere

The Original Salado Market Days
9-5 on the 2nd weekend - Don’t miss April 14 - 15 

Follow us on FaceBookSaladoAntique Mall.com

642 N. Main St.     (254) 947-8848 

sta mpsal adotex as.com

Rubber Stamps
Scrapbooking

ribbons
Great Classes

Salado Grown and Salado Made
Your Hometown Winery

841 N. Main St

Salado Grown and Salado Made
Your Hometown Winery

(254) 947-8011

106 North Main Street
(next to Ambrosia Tea Room)  

(254) 855-5538 Private Showings
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860 N. Main
Salado, Tx

254.947.5050
www.C21BB.com

20071 Vilas Rd., Holland
4 BR, 3 BA on 10 ac.

16202 Brazos Ct., Temple
3 BR, 2 BA

248 Van Bibber, Salado
1.5 ac., beautiful setting, downtown Salado

$165,000

10841 Stinnett Mill, Salado
6 BR, 3.5 BA

$629,921

1324 Walker Circle, Salado
4 BR, 4.5 BA 

$495,721

1824 Mission Tr., Salado
4 BR, 3.5 BA on 8+ acres

$644,721

10951 Stinnett Mill Rd., Salado
5 BR, 3.5 BA

$629,921

10915 Stinett Mill, Salado
4 BR, 3.5 BA

$539,921

9652 Stinnett Mill Rd., Salado
3 BR, 2 BA on 10+ ac.

$489,000

• 1.5 ac. in downtown Salado. Perfect setting for a homesite.
• 3.7 to 6.4 ac. homesites, ready for horses or cattle & your custom home in Holland ISD
• 18 or 40 ac. native pasture with hillside views. Seller financing available. 
• 58 ac. in Holland ISD, convenient to Temple/Belton. Homesite, farming/ranching, or 
   recreation! U/C
•  110 +/- ac., Beautiful hilltop acreage between Salado and Holland. Lots of possibilites. 

Area Land Listings

1515 Royal St., Salado
3 BR, 3 BA w/guest cottage on 17 acs.

10879 Stinnett Mill Rd., Salado
4 BR, 4.5 BA

$619,921

12830 Stonegate Trail, Belton
4 BR, 2 BA
$214,921

SOLD

SOLD

SOLD

Free
Free boxes available 12-6 
daily at Salado Winery. Most are 
used wine shipping boxes which are 
great for storing/moving ornaments, 
collectibles, or bottles.
Child Care
The Play Yard: 6 weeks 
to 12 years with age appropriate 
curriculum, drop of and pick up from 
Salado schools, 254-947-1153.  tfnb

Church
Parents Day Out at Salado 

United Methodist Church is now 
enrolling for Fall 2018. Our Christ 
centered curriculum and activities 
are chosen to lay, a foundation 
for understanding God, Jesus, 
the Bible, church, family, self and 
others. Tuesdays/Thursdays 8:30-
2:30p Email: ttepera@saladoumc.
org for more information. 

Cleaning
Clear Vision Cleaning 
- Residential and commercial 
cleaning service. (254)314-5050.
Clear View Window 

Cleaning: Windows, gutters, 
powerwashing, ceiling fan cleaning. 
(254)931-6172.
Window Washing Won-
ders: Professional window clean-
ing. Residential and Commercial. 
(254)231-3289.

Dry Cleaners
Salado Cleaners: Laundry, 
dry cleaning, alterations, leather, 
suede, 1209 N. Stagecoach, 254-
947-7299. tfnd
Mill Creek Cleaners, 
quality dry cleaning, laundry, alter-

ations, 213 Mill Creek Dr. Suite 200, 
254-947-0100. tfnd

Dirt/Stone Work
Lone Star Grading, com-
mercial, residential, industrial exca-
vation, grading, paving, pads, 
driveways, roads, 254-947-0149 or 
254-933-7900
CBS Construction: septic 
tanks, house pads, driveways, lot 
clearing, top soil, 254-718-1752.  
tfnd

Shane LaCanne

3+ bed/2+ bath homes available under $300,000 
3+ bed/2+ bath/1+ acre homes available under $430,000

1+ acre lots available under $79,900
(254) 654-4066
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We have investors looking 
for homes and land
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2018 Cadillac XT5 
ULTRA LOW MILEAGE LEASES FOR WELL-QUALIFIED BUYERS

$399 / 39 / $399
PER MONTH* MONTHS

__________________________________

DUE AT SIGNING 
AFTER ALL OFFERS

No security deposit required. Tax, title, license extra. Mileage charge of $.25 per mile over 30,000 miles.

* Payments are for a 2018  Cadillac XT5 with an MSRP of $41,190 monthly payments total $15,561. Option to purchase 
at lease end for an amount of $21,830.70 . GM Financial must approve lease. Take delivery by 01/31/18. Mileage charge 
of $.25/mile over 30,000 miles. Lessee pays for maintenance, excess wear and a disposition fee of $595 or less at end 

of lease. Not available with some other offers

Garlyn Shelton 
Cadillac 

Garlyn Shelton Cadillac 
5625 S. General Bruce Dr 
Temple, TX 76502 

254-771-0128 
GarlynSheltonCadillac.com

Employment 
Opportunities
Johnny’s Steaks & BBQ 
now hiring all positions- 
Experienced kitchen staff, com-
petitive pay. Apply in person, 301 
Thomas Arnold Rd. 254-493-4651.
Small local Church is 
seeking to hire a part 
time secretary. Basic 
computer knowledge required. 
Experience with PowerChurch 
software and payroll is a plus but 
not required as training can be pro-
vided if needed. Compensation will 
be based on experience level. All 
applicants will require a background 
check and interview.  Please email 
your resume to heritagecountry-
church@gmail.com. 3/8-3/29b

Now hiring all positions 
JD’s Travel Center. Apply in person 
(254) 947-5228

Farm
Pine Meadow Farm- 
Riding instruction, Reg Morgan 
Horse sale and miniature donkey 
sales. Featuring this week: Cute 
2018 Foals, ready to play with. 
254-444-1988. 3/8tfn

Financial
Troy L Smith Financial: 
Personal investment solutions. 254-
947-0376, Troylsmith.com.
Alton D. Thiele PC: Certi-
fied Public Accountant, tax returns, 
business accounting, auditing, 
consulting, 254-939-0701. tfnd
Bruce A. Bolick, CPA: 

Payroll, Individual and Business 
Taxes.  By appointment, (254) 
718-7299. SaladoCPA@aol.com.           
tfnd
The Personal Wealth 
Coach®: SEC registered invest-
ment advisor, highly personalized 
portfolio design and management, 
254-947-1111.

Real Estate 
Services 
Investment Realty: Resi-
dential, Commercial and Investment 
Property. Serving Salado and Cen-
tral Texas. (512) 633-1558.
First Community Title, 
branches in Salado, Temple, Killeen 
and Gatesville. 40 N. Main Street, 
Salado 254-947-8480.               tfnd

Insurance
Rita Zbranek, Farmers Insur-
ance, auto, home, life, commercial, 
254-947-0995.
Finney Insurance, home, 
auto, life, commercial, liability, farm, 
ranch, 254-947-3599.

Florist
Brookshire Brothers full 
service florist. Blooming plants. 
254-947-8922.

For Sale
Antiques at Salado 
Antique Mall and Bee’s 
Antiques -  Antiques, vintage 
and collectibles, many vendors at 
one location 751 Stagecoach Road, 
North I-35 frontage road (directly 
behind Dee’s Antiques on Main) 
947-3355. Salado Market Days 
second weekend of each month.  tfn

Garage, Auctions, 
Estate Sale
Big Garage sale, Friday, 
March 23, 8:00 A.M. Lots of Bar-
gains. 4159 West Amity Rd. Salado
Salado Boutiques Dump 
Sale 10am-5pm Sat. and 12-4pm 
Sun. No Early Birds. 120 Royal St., 
555 Pace Park Rd., 110 N. Main St., 
8 Rock Creek Rd.,  602 Old Town 
Rd., 642 N. Main St. 680 N. Main St.

Garbage
Clawson Disposal: Com-
petitive pricing for great garbage 
service; containers, too. 512-746-
2000.

Health and Fitness
First Eye Care Salado; 
eye exams, eye disease manage-
ment, designer eyewear and con-
tact lens service. (254) 947-3783 
Angelic Herbs: Profes-
sional Wellness, Lifestyle, 
weight loss and stress management 
solutions. C J Harbuz, CNHP 947-
1909, 560 N. Main Suite 10.
Crain Chiropractic & 
Wellness- chiropractic care, 
massage therapy, acupuncture 
and holistic care. 418 N. Main St. 
#5.,947-2225.
Integrity:  Rehab & 
Home Health. Physical ther-
apy, speech therapy, occupational 
therapy, in-home skilled nursing. 
integrityrehab.net, 254-699-3933.
Family Dentistry: Lumi-
neers for straighter, whiter teeth. 
Douglas B. Willingham, DDS, 254-
947-5242.

Heat & Air
American Electric Com-
mercial, Residential, AC and Heat-
ing with over 30 years experience. 
Free estimates, licensed, bonded 
and insured. Locally owned and 
operated (254) 289-0566
Britt Heating & Air: Instal-
lation and repairs, 254-760-1004, 
254-947-5263, TACL #B006640
Bell Air Conditioning: 
All brands repairs, free estimates, 
100% financing available, 254-939-
1141. TACLA002113C

Jewelers
Salado Creek Jewelers 
by Kiki Creations:  106 
North Main St. 254-855-5538, 
private showings.

 

ANNA LOU RANEY, Broker/Realtor 254-913-1215
DANIEL RANEY, Realtor 254-760-2591

MLS
MULTIPLE LISTING SERVICETemple/Belton 

Board of Realtors

List your home with the 
Raney Real Estate Team

RaneyRealEstate.net

LAND LISTINGS
HERITAGE SUBDIVISION

  Only two lots left!
Lot 6/7      4.28 acres $80,000

Lot 111.493 acres $52,000

KEVLIN TRAIL 
Only 1 lot left! Premier half-acre, 

underground utilities ready for building. 
$59,900

128 ROCK CREEK DRIVE
Amazing, one-of-a-kind home on a cul-de-sac. Se-
rene wooded setting adjacent to Salado Creek with 
views highlighted by ceiling to floor windows and 4 
sets of French doors. 4 bedroom, charming great 
room with fireplace. Beaded board and beamed 
ceilings, batten-board walls throughout. 

$595,000

716 DEGRUMMOND WAY
Impressive custom built home that is a Southern Liv-
ing Idea Home. A fabulous drive-up that features 5 
bedrooms, 5.5 baths, with master and guest suite 
downstairs. Must see all the extras. Located on a 
tranquil tree lined street in the heart of beautiful 
Salado. 

$575,000

702 DEGRUMMOND WAY
Custom home on 1.53 acres. Gorgeous trees, 3 bed-
rooms, 2.5 baths, great room with WBFP, custom 
mantle, cozy sitting room open to kitchen w/break-
fast bar, bay window, dining room and enclosed sun 
porch. 2017 Renovations include: painting, kitchen & 
master bath upgrades, Vacuflow central vac system 
etc. Spectacular and serene wooded setting, impos-
sible to re-create. 

$454,185

700 COLLEGE HILL DRIVE
Lovely custom built home, privately located on 3.4 
acres with huge live oak trees. Historic district close 
to dining and shopping. 3 bedrooms, 2 baths, large 
open living area with stone fireplace opening into 
breakfast room, curved breakfast bar and kitchen. 
Spacious laundry room w/sink. Spacious covered 
patio, 30.3 X 24.4 metal building, generator and large 
propane tank.

$430,000

ANN CARROLL, Realtor 254-760-0101
GEORGE ROMFH, Realtor 254-718-6845

Classified ads due by 
Monday noon

15 words for $7 (.25 per word after) 
prepaid

classifieds@saladovillagevoice.com
(254) 947-5321

Lastovica Jewelers: 
in-store jewelry repairs, diamond 
sales, setting and appraisal, custom 
design, watch repair, 254-773-5772.
Devereaux’s Jewelers: 
Quality crafted custom work, jewelry 
repair, appraisals, watch repair, 
stone setting, diamond sales, photo 
design. 254-771-1260.

Landscaping

Lawnwork & Tree
Keith Ace Hardware has 
all your home and garden needs. 
213 Mill Creek Drive, Suite 106. 
(254) 947-4008.
Trees, Shrubs & Land-
scaping,  Pruning, www.victor-
mareklandscaping.com. 1-512-818-
3822, Removal and Hauling. Flower 
beds, yard work, top soil.  Serving 
Salado 35 years. 0724tfn 

Personal Services
Hairitage Barber Shop: 
Full service Barber Shop, call 254-
947-3309 for appointments. 
Salado’s Hair Shop, full 
service salon, walk-ins accepted. 
213 Mill Creek Dr. Suite 160. 
(254)421-5173. 

Pest Control
Ace Pest Control: Cus-
tomer satisfaction guaranteed, free 
estimates, TPCL #12512; David 
Preston. 254-947-4222

Plumbing
Moffat & Daughters 
Plumbing: Service, repair, 
remodeling, 254-289-5986 Master 
LIC # M017002
Salado Plumbing. In-home 
repairs, 254-947-5800. Master LIC 
M 16892
Yount Sewer & Drain: 
septic tank & grease trap pumping, 
254-947-5036

Rental/Lease

Commercial
Private office space 
within a suite of 4 offices in the 
Stagestop Building, 560 No. Main 
St., directly opposite Salado Civic 
Center. Reception area. Meeting 
area. Restroom within suite. Ample 
parking. $385/month plus electricity 
share. Contact Ann at 254-563-
3675. 4/5-5/31p
For Lease: 2,200 sq ft office 
and warehouse Call 254-760-
4440  tfn
2500 sf space available 
in Stagestop Building at 560 N. 
Main St in Salado. I35 and Main 
Street frontages. Single story. 
Ample parking. Great retail or office 
location. $3000/month. Contact Ann 
at 254-563-3675. 4/5-5/31p

Rental/Lease 
Residential
Custom home on 1.53 
acres. Gorgeous trees, 3 bed-
rooms, 2.5 baths, great room with 
WBFP, custom mantle, cozy sitting 
room open to kitchen w/breakfast 
bar, bay window, dining room 
and enclosed sun porch. 2017 
Renovations include: painting, 
kitchen & master bath upgrades, 
Vacuflow central vac system etc. 
Spectacular and serene wooded 

setting, impossible to re-create. 
702 DeGrummond Way $454,185.
Call Raney and Associates: (254) 
913-1215.
Salado Townhouse 
updated, 2,375 sq. ft. 3 BR, 
2 1/2 BA. Washer/Dryer, fridge. 
Jetted Tub, fireplace. large private 
backyard with deck. 2 car garage. 
One block from Mill Creek Golf 
Clubhouse. No smoking, $1,700 
month, plus deposit. 1-916-502-
4403. 3/8-3/29b
Lovely custom built 
home, privately located on 3.4 
acres with huge live oak trees. 
Historic district close to dining and 
shopping. 3 bedrooms, 2 baths, 
large open living area with stone 
fireplace opening into breakfast 
room, curved breakfast bar and 
kitchen. Spacious laundry room w/
sink. Spacious covered patio, 30.3 
X 24.4 metal building, generator and 
large propane tank. 700 College Hill 
Drive $430,000. Call Raney and 
Associates: (254) 913-1215.
9809 Southshore Dr. 
Salado-Rare find in Salado! 
Clean rental property located just 
outside of town. Great kitchen, 
fireplace, spacious master, and 
large fenced backyard. 3bed/2bath 
with flex room. Includes washer and 
dryer! $1375/month. First Texas 
Brokerage and the office number 
at 254-947-5577
600 W Village Rd-Great 
rental property in the heart of 
Salado! 3 bed/2 bath with newly 
installed vinyl flooring. Beautiful 
mature trees on site make this the 
perfect place for indoor and outdoor 
living! $1500/month. First Texas 
Brokerage and the office number 
at 254-947-5577
Charming, spacious, 
2/2/1 townhome for 
rent. Clean!! 6 closets, vaulted 
ceiling, w/d closet inside. Walk 
to shopping center. Lawn care 
provided. 254-913-9813, www.
saladorentals.com.
0/2tfnb
For Rent clean 2 BR, 2 
B duplex, $700 mo. call 760-
4440. 0918tfnb

Residential Sales
This 4 BR, 3.5 BA home 
can be your own private getaway 
on 8.27 wooded acres.    Open floor 
plan.  The sun room can be used for 
a 2nd living area, workout room or 
home office.  The 30’x40’ shop is 
perfect for the outdoor enthusiast or 
artisan.  Enjoy the country life, just 
minutes away from Salado.  1824 
Mission Trail, Salado.  $644,721. 
Century 21 Bill Bartlett  947-5050.
4 BR, 4.5 BA home in 
Mill Creek on the golf 
course.  Custom kitchen with 
butler’s pantry allows for easy & 
comfortable entertaining.  Two 
living, two dining, office, 3 BR & 3 
BA downstairs.  Game room, BR/
office & BA upstairs.  Master suite 
is separate from other bedrooms & 
includes walk-in shower, soaking 
tub & wonderful walk-in closet.  
Family room has a fireplace with 
view of the golf course.  Back yard 
is completely fenced with wrought 
iron fencing & offers fantastic views 
of the golf course.  Upstairs game 
room has built-in cabinet with BA & 
BR/office.  Second story deck has 
a magnificent view of the fairway.  
$495,721.  1324 Walker Circle, 
Salado.  2/2tfnf
Impressive custom 
built home that is a Southern 
Living Idea Home. A fabulous 
drive-up that features 5 bedrooms, 
5 .5 baths, with master and guest 
suite downstairs. Must see all the 
extras. Located on a tranquil tree 
lined street in the heart of beautiful 
Salado. 716 DeGrummond Way 
$575,000. Call Raney and Associ-
ates: (254) 913-1215.
Amazing, one-of-a-kind 
home on a cul-de-sac. Serene 
wooded setting adjacent to Salado 
Creek with views highlighted by 
ceiling to floor windows and 4 
sets of French doors. 4 bedroom, 
charming great room with fireplace. 
Beaded board and beamed ceilings, 
batten-board walls throughout. 
128 Rock Creek Drive $595,000 
Call Raney and Associates: (254) 
913-1215.
Perfect home overlook-
ing the Texas Hill Coun-
try. Hill country flavored home 
on 5 gorgeous acres with barn 
for horses $429,900. More info at 
www.1349hiddensprings.com Call 
First Texas Brokerage 947-5577
This gorgeous custom 
home boasts 4 BR, 3 BA, an 
office & a bonus/game room.  Grand 
front view with large, mature trees, 
a beautiful steel front door, warm 
hardwood floors, and an open 

Johnny’s Steaks & BBQ 
now hiring all positions

• Experienced kitchen 
staff, competitive pay

Apply in person, 301 Thomas Arnold Rd. 254-493-4651



BapBap’s
 Shredding
  Service
 (512) 415-1528

joseph_vaughn@msn.com          www.bapbaps.com

Joe Vaughn
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Britt Heating & 
Air Conditioning

 Installations • Repairs
 Office 947-5263
 Mobile 760-1004
 Serving Salado for 25 years 
 TACL #B006640

Al Clawson Disposal, Inc. 
(512) 930-5490    •    www.ClawsonDisposal.com

ASK US ABOUT OUR SERVICES
Waste Pickup    •    Recycling    •    Roll-Off Containers

Yount Sewer & Drain
Septic Service, L.C.

Septic tank 
& grease trap 

pumping

254 947-5036

Salado Plumbing

947-5800

“We are ready”
In home repairs

 

Master LIC M 16892

Moffatt & Daughters
Plumbing Co. 

Service • Repair • Remodeling

Riannai authorized service provider
George (Bubba) Moffatt

254 289-5986 (local)

Master Plumber
Lic M017002

Let the light shine through

Windows | Gutters
Powerwashing

Ceiling Fan Cleaning

(254) 931-6172
ClearViewWindows_Belton@yahoo.com

Clear View Window Cleaning

kitchen/living/dining concept.  The 
kitchen features a large rounded 
island, double ovens, & large 
walk-in pantry.  Beautiful wood 
beam detail on the ceiling!  Traver-
tine tile in the bathrooms.  A covered 
patio with outdoor grill is perfect 
for entertaining, and the back yard 
with mature trees backs up to an 
unimproved ranch property.  A true 
beauty!  3084 Rolling Meadow Dr.,  
Salado.  $569,921.   Century 21 Bill 
Bartlett 947-5050  2/2tfnf
Escape to your own 
resort all on 5 pristine acres. As 
you walk into this home you will be 
taken by the grand great room with 
high ceilings, custom wood beams 
and large windows overlooking the 
swimming pool. $599,875. Call 
Ryan 541-2255. First Texas Bro-
kerage 254-947-5577 9/8tfn
Old world Charm and 
Custom craftsmanship 
can be seen throughout this Texas 
Hill Country Farm House on 4.9 
tree-covered acre estate. Features 
include: Spray foam insulation. 2 
tankless water heaters. 2-16 seer 
AC/Heating units $549,900. Call 
Ryan  541-2255. First Texas Bro-
kerage 947-5577 9/8tfn
Elegant Austin Stone 
Home on tree-covered 
lot. Large covered back patio 
overlooking the tropical landscaping 
and swimming pool. Granite count-

$20  a 
week 

Put your ad 
here and get 

a free 
classified 

each week.
advertising@sal-
adovillagevoice.

com 
or call

(254) 947-5321

Classifieds 
ers, stainless steel appliances. 
$499,900 Call First Texas Broker-
age 947-5577.
This incredible home 
nestled amongst the trees in Salado 
Mills features spray foam insu-
lation, granite counter tops in all 
wet areas, interior stone features, 
beautiful steel front door, 6 BR, 
(or 4 BR plus a downstairs office & 
large upstairs bonus room), 3 car 
garage, irrigated & sodded yard, 
security system pre-wiring & much 
more!  Subdivision will include a 
community pool & golf cart access 
to Mill Creek.  Enjoy the amenities 
of Salado without being in the city 
limits.  10841 Stinnett Mill Rd., 
Salado.  $629,921. Century 21 Bill 
Bartlett  947-5050.
Hor se  proper ty  in 
Salado!  Pamper your horses 
& yourself with this 3 BR, 2 BA 
custom home on 10.1 acres.  Roof 
replaced in 2014, CH&A, windows 
& doors all replaced in 2016.  Fire-
place in living room plus gas heater 
in kitchen.  Brick floors in much of 
the home.  Enclosed back porch 
w/ heat & air, new covered back 
patio.  Horse barn features Ritchie 
watering system in stalls & in back 
pasture.  4 custom stalls plus large 
foaling stall with attached pen.  Two 
additional smaller turnouts.  Wash 
bay with hot & cold water & heat 
lamps.  Heat insulation in entire 
barn.  Property is fenced & cross 

from, 2D
fenced.  Covered trailer parking, 
and much more!  9652 Stinnett Mill 
Rd., Salado.  $489,000.Century 21 
Bill Bartlett  947-5050.

Property For Sale
16+ acres in salado  
196,500 build hunt enjoy Shane 
Lacanne Entire 254-654-4066. 
Bell County Land -69+- 
ac. – w/ 3 BR ranch home; 20 ac. 
w/ frontage on Hwy. 95, Academy 
ISD; 18 ac. native pasture, seller 
financing available; 1.5 ac. in down-
town Salado, perfect for a homesite.  
Century 21 Bill Bartlett, Salado.  
www.c21bb.com  254-947-5050. 
11/10 tfnf
Kevlin Trail - Only 1 
lot left! Premier half-acre lot, 
underground utilities ready for 
building. $59,900. Call Raney and 
Associates: 254-913-1215. tfn08/02
Homesites in Heritage 
subdivision, 1+ acres, 
Salado schools, call Raney and 
Associates: 254-913-1215. tfn08/20

Services
Salado Service Co. - 
Handyman Services, Landscaping, 
Live Animal Trapping, Haul Offs, 
Remodels, A/C Repairs, Painting, 
Tree Service, Pressure Washing, 
Decks, Fencing, Rock Driveways, 
Stone Work. (254) 780-5795. 1/25-
The Shade Shop: Ceiling 

fans, light fixtures, home decor and 
window treatments at 230 North 
Main. (254) 290-7000. 
Lone Star EBikes- Tours, 
rentals, sales. (254)947-3969, 560 
N. Main St. LoneStarEBikes.com

Storage
StowAway Storage 
Household - Commercial 10X10 - 
10x20 - 22x40 Clean, lighted, fenced, 
Key punch entry. 947-5502 or 721-
1807              tfnb
Storage space in Salado 
8X12, 16X24 and up. Some have 
drive-in doors. Stagecoach Storage 
254-778-6779.

Upholstery
Custom upholstery, res-
idential, commercial, Kasmir fabric 
gallery, free pickup and delivery, 
Recovery Room, 254-699-6105.

Vets, Pets & 
Livestock
Animal Medical- Full ser-
vice veterinary hospital, (254)947-
8800.
Salado Veterinary Hos-
pital- Small animal & exotic, 24 
Hr. Emergency. Monday-Friday, 
www.saladoveterinaryhospital.com 
- Like us on Facebook.

Subscribe Today

digital and print editions
available

(254) 947-5321

April 27 and 28, 2018
Featuring: Shiner, Goliad, Bells, Revolver, 

Seguin Brewing, Blue Moon and more.
Tickets on sale now!

It’s coming!

For more information and level of
sponsorship, please contact event
organizer and Gonzales Inquirer

publisher Terry Fitzwater at
830-672-2861 / 517-930-1368

or email publisher@gonzalesinquirer.com

The Gonzales Inquirer in conjunction with Gonzales Main Street
presents theprepresensents ts thethethe

Come & Taste It

CRAFT BEER, WINE & ART FESTIVAL
APRIL 27 & 28, 2018

treet

II
reet

tt
ThT

A/C
Repair

 ALL BRANDS
Free Estimates &  Second Opinions

100% Financing Available

Senior Citizens Discount on service

939-1141
Toll Free 877-422-5500  • www.bellaircond.com

310 E. Central Ave. • Belton
SERVING CENTRAL TEXAS FOR OVER 53 YEARS

TACLA002113C

Earn more with Quality!
30 YEARS OF SERVICE

Looking for CDL A or B drivers to deliver
new trucks all over the US and Canada.

Experience preferred. Must have DOT physical and be
willing to keep logs. No DUIs in last 10 years, cleanMVR.

Apply Online at
www.qualitydriveaway.com
or call 574-642-2023

7th Grade Girls
	 Salado 7th Grade Girls 
placed third with 105 points 
in the Cougar JH Relays 
March 23. Jarrell Blue won 
the meet with 172 points.
	 100 Meter Dash: Ca-
mille Brown, second, 14.00; 
Erynn Hacker, sixth, 15.00.
	 200 Meter Dash: Alex 
Dworaczyk, fourth, 31.99.
	 400 Meter Dash: Ellie 
Mescher, fourth, 1:10.04.
	 1600 Meter Run: Ashlyn 
Williams, second, 6:35.13; 
Kate Neas, fourth, 6:46.25.
	 2400 Meter Run: Ashlyn 
Williams, fourth, 10:26.65; 
Kate Neas, sixth, 10:46.
	 100 Meter Hurdles: 
Katie Bartek, first, 18.18; 
Makayla Bush, fourth, 
21.08; Brooke Ellithorp, 
sixth, 21.58.
	 300 Meter Hurdles: 
Makayla Bush, fifth, 
1:00.16.
	 400 Meter Relay: Jordan 
Dawson, Alex Dworaczyk, 
Ellie Mescher and Katie 
Bartek, second, 56.28.
	 1600 Meter Relay: Alex 
Dworaczyk, Haleigh Wilk, 
Makayla Bush and Ellie 
Mescher, third, 4:56.31.
	 Long Jump: Jordan 
Dawson, second, 13’-4 
1/4”; Haley Piatak, fifth, 
12’-7 1/2”.
	 Shot Put: Alyssa Good-
win, sixth, 24’-1”.
	 Discus: Katie Bartek, 
third, 69’-2 3/4”.
	 High Jump: Alex 
Dworaczyk, second, 4’-4”; 
Liz Katz, fifth, 3’-8”. 

8th Grade Girls
	 Salado 8th Grade Girls 
placed first with 188 points 
in the Cougar JH Relay 
March 23. LR Academy 
placed second with 120 
points.
	 100 Meter Dash: Tom-
mie Knox, sixth, 14.82.
	 400 Meter Dash: Jayden 
Goodnight, fourth, 1:13.17.
	 800 Meter Run: Jayden 
Goodnight, fifth, 3:10.45.
	 1600 Meter Run: Anna 
Lesley, first, 6:30.84; Anne 
Marie Gilmore, second, 
6:52.46; Charley Thomas, 
fifth, 7:11.40.
	 2400 Meter Run: Anna 
Lesley, first, 10:18.70; 
Anne Marie Gilmore, third, 
11:26.12; Caley Aycock, 
sixth, 11:57.62.
	 100 Meter Hurdles: 
Darci Pryor, second, 18.29; 
Caelan Teer, fourth, 19.24; 
Haleigh Gieck, sixth, 20.04.
	 300 Meter Hurdles: Av-

SJH Track Results
ery Fossum, first, 53.40; 
Darci Pryor, third, 57.16; 
Caelan Teer, fifth, 1:00.59.
	 400 Meter Relay: Av-
ery Fossum, Mia Saulter, 
Raleigh Meraz and Eishen 
Young, first, 54.09.
	 800 Meter Relay: Ra-
leigh Meraz, Lily Hildeb-
rand, Mia Saulter and Eish-
en Young, first, 2:01.47.
	 1600 Meter Relay: Eish-
en Young, Darci Pryor, Mia 
Saulter and Avery Fossum, 
first, 4:55.44.
	 Long Jump: Eishen 
Young, third, 15’-7 1/2”; 
Raleigh Meraz, sixth, 14’-5 
1/2”.
	 Discus: Emory Crad-
dick, fifth, 72’-9”.
	 Triple Jump Kenslee 
Konarik, third, 29’-1”; Mia 
Saulter, 29’-0”.
	 High Jump: Lily Hildeb-
rand, second, 4’-2”; Savan-
nah Oyler, third, 4’-0”.
	 Pole Vault: Jenna 
Hanscom, first, 7’-0”; Jas-
mine Hanscom, second, 6’-

7th Grade Boys
	 Salado 7th Grade Boys 
Track team placed first with 
169 points in the Cougar JH 
Relays March 23. Jarrell 
Blue placed second with 
157 points.
	 100 Meter Dash: Drew 
Bird, third, 13.26; Tanner 
Agee, fourth, 13.37.
	 200 Meter Dash: Cade 
Strickland, fourth, 28.75; 
Adam Benavides, sixth, 
29.35
	 400 Meter Dash: Noah 
Self, fifth, 1:04.91.
	 800 Meter Run: Logan 
White, sixth, 2:58.
	 1600 Meter Run: Ryan 
Novotny, fourth, 6:04.96; 
Brooks Dabney, sixth, 
6:15.94.
	 2400 Meter Run: Ryan 
Novotny, second, 9:29.78; 
Brooks Dabney, third, 
10:06.33; Jake Rechfertig, 
fifth, 10:15.11.
	 110 Meter Hurdles: Ki 
Hayes, first, 20.45; Jake 
Day, fourth, 21.47.
	 300 Meter Hurdles: Jes-
se Maskunas, first, 51.94; Ki 
Hayes, second, 54.96.
	 400 Meter Relay: Seth 
Reavis, Nathan Hanscom, 
Drew Bird and Darius Wil-
son, second, 53.88.
	 800 Meter Relay: Seth 
Reavis, Darius Wilson, Ca-
den Strickland and Nathan 
Hanscom, third, 1:57.42.
	 1600 Meter Relay: Drew 
Bird, Darius Wilson, Adam 
Benavides and Noah Self, 

third, 4:35.50.
	 Long Jump: Seth Reavis, 
second, 15’-5 1/2”; Drew 
Bird, fourth, 14’-7 3/4”.
	 Shot Put: Aiden Mc-
Cann, sixth, 27’-9”.
	 Discus: Jaxon Leiskau, 
first, 99’-11 1/”; Owen 
Crisp, fourth, 77’-6 1/2”; 
Aiden McCann, fifth, 77’-
6”.
	 Triple Jump: Adam Be-
navides, second, 31’-7”; 
Caden Strickland, fourth, 
30’-8”.
	 High Jump: Noah Self, 
third, 4’-8”; Darius Wilson, 
sixth, 4’-4”.
	 Pole Vault: Ki Hayes, 
first, 6’-6”.

8th Grade Boys
	 Salado 8th Grade Boys 
Track tea placed third with 
102 points in the Cougar 
JH Relays March 23. LR 
Academy won the meet with 
159.5 points.
	 400 Meter Dash: Toby 
Rios, first, 58.63; Ethan 
Bagley, fourth, 1:01.86.
	 800 Meter Run: Adan 
Giral, sixth, 2:41.43.
	 1600 Meter Run: Adan 
Giral, fifth, 6:13.94.
	 2400 Meter Run: Ben 
Raines, sixth, 9:57.54.
	 110 Meter Hurdles: No-
lan Williams, third, 18.12; 
Boden Savage, fourth, 
18.51.
	 300 Meter Hurdles: 
Boden Savage, fourth, 
50.02.
	 400 Meter Relay: Nolan 
Williams, Brady Wilson, 
Max Markham and Toby 

Rios, fifth, 54.36.
	 800 Meter Relay: 
Brayden Sumners, Chase 
Joiner, Alan Medina and 
Alex Pierce, fifth, 1:53.44.
	 1600 Meter Relay: No-
lan Williams, Ethan Bagley, 
Brayden Sumners and Toby 
Rias, second, 4:07.90.
	 Long Jump: Nolan Wil-
liams, fourth, 16’-10 3/4”; 
Toby Rios, fifth, 16’-6 1/2”.
	 Shot Put: Hunter Foster, 
third, 34’- 0”; Zack Dunlap, 
fourth, 32’- 4”.
	 Discus: Beau Sandor, 
first, 101’-2”; Beau Hill, 
sixth, 89’- 3 1/2”.
	 High Jump: Nolan Wil-
liams, first, 5’-6”.
	 Pole Vault: Boden Sav-
age, second, 8’-0”; Abel Ca-
denas, sixth, 6’-6”.
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D O N ’ T  J U S T  T H I N K  A H E A D .
S A V E  A H E A D  W I T H  H O R I Z O N  B A N K .
Horizon’s FDIC-insured CDs allow you to focus on the
future with the guarantee of fixed interest rates. 

D O N ’ T  M I S S  O U T .  
1 5  M O N T H S  A T  

2 . 0 5 %  A P Y .

Annual Percentage Yield (APY) is accurate as of 03/05/2018 and applies to the initial term of a new CD. CD has a 15-month 
term. The minimum balance required to earn CD rate is $50,000. We may limit the amount you deposit in one or more CDs to 
a total of $1,000,000. Alternative terms are not allowed. Fees could reduce earnings on the account. A penalty may be 
imposed for early withdrawal. Rates are subject to change. Additional restrictions may apply. Offer ends 04/30/2018.

Stop by. We’d love to meet you.
815 North Stagecoach Rd
Salado, Texas 76571
HorizonBankTexas.com

	 A new traveling exhib-
it at the Temple Railroad 
and Heritage Museum cel-
ebrates the perennial signs 
of summer: the smell of hot 
dogs on the grill, the sound 
of a mower on a Saturday 
afternoon, pool parties and 
get-togethers on the patio. 
The Smithsonian exhibit 
“Patios, Pools, & the Inven-
tion of the American Back-
yard” explores the historic 
shift from enjoying the out-
doors on the front porch to 
creating an outdoor living 
space in the backyard. The 
new traveling exhibition 
will be on view in Temple 
through May 26.
 	 Through rare photo-
graphs, historic drawings 
and period advertisements, 
“Patios, Pools, & the In-
vention of the American 
Backyard” explores the 
mid-century backyard of 
the 1950s from the rise of 
the suburbs and tract hous-
es and the beauty of post-
war garden design to the 
birth of the environmen-
tal movement. Drawing 
from the collections and 
research of the Smithso-
nian Gardens’ Archives 
of American Gardens, the 
exhibition is organized for 
travel by the Smithsonian 
Institution Traveling Exhi-
bition Service (SITES).
 	 In the 1950s, Amer-
ica was a nation emerg-
ing from the shadow of 
World War II, searching 
for ways to enjoy its new-
found peace and prosperity. 
Postwar trends such as the 

baby boom, a growing mid-
dle class, the do-it-yourself 
concept and a dramatic rise 
in home ownership remade 
much of the U.S. and con-
tributed to the development 
of the suburban backyard. 
The mid-century backyard 
became an extension of the 
house, a room designed for 
relaxing, recreation and en-
tertaining. Private backyard 
pools were an affordable 
luxury for many, and the pa-
tio became the perfect place 
for a backyard grill and pa-
tio furniture made with new 
materials like plastic and 
aluminum.
 	 Companies produced an 
increasing number of prod-
ucts designed to lessen the 
burden of yard work. Im-
ported and hybrid grasses, 
herbicides and pesticides, 
automated sprinkler sys-
tems, chemical sprayers 
and newly affordable lawn 
mowers began to appear in 
sheds and garages around 
the nation. Many contem-
porary backyards still boast 
the pristine lawn, low-main-
tenance plantings, patios, 
outdoor furniture, grills and 

play equipment that first 
emerged after World War 
II.
 	 “Patios, Pools, & the 
Invention of the American 
Backyard” can be viewed 
with regular admission to 
the museum, Tuesday – Sat-
urday, 10:00 a.m. – 4:00 
p.m. and is part of the reg-
ular schedule of changing 
exhibits at the museum. The 
Temple Railroad and Heri-
tage Museum is located at 
315 W. Avenue B in down-
town Temple. For more in-
formation about the exhibit 
or the museum, please visit 
TempleRRHM.org or call 
254-298-5172.
 	 About SITES:
SITES has been sharing 
the wealth of Smithsonian 
collections and research 
programs with millions of 
people outside Washington, 
D.C., for 65 years. SITES 
connects Americans to their 
cultural heritage through a 
wide range of exhibitions 
about art, science and histo-
ry, which are shown wher-
ever people live, work and 
play.
 

The Invention of the American Backyard 
Smithsonian Traveling Exhibit coming to Railroad and Heritage Museum

Home from the war or a factory job, postwar men and women adopted a “can-do” at-
titude toward home improvement. “Doing-it-yourself” was advertised as an enjoyable 
and affordable way for families to individualize their suburban homes. 
Cover of Popular Mechanics, October 1955. Courtesy of Popular Mechanics

WE BUY OIL, GAS, & 
MINERAL RIGHTS

Both non-producing and producing 
including Non-Participating Royalty Interest (NPRI)
Provide us your desired price for an offer evaluation.

CALL TODAY: 806.620.1422    
LOBO MINERALS, LLC
PO Box 1800 • Lubbock, TX 79408-1800
LoboMineralsLLC@gmail.com
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LONE STAR GRADING
& MATERIALS

COMMERCIAL  H  RESIDENTIAL
INDUSTRIAL

EXCAVATION • GRADING • SITE PREPARATION
YARDS • LOT CLEARING • PADS • ROADS

DRIVEWAYS • PARKING LOTS
ALL TYPES DIRT WORK • MATERIALS & HAULING

***FREE ESTIMATES***

(254) 947-0149 or (254) 933-7900
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213 Mill Creek Dr. Ste. #100, Salado
(254) 947-4008

Monday - Saturday 8 a.m. - 6 p.m.
Sunday 10 a.m. - 4 p.m.

Salado’s Authorized Dealer

SPRING PLANTS 
arriving NOW!

675 W. Hwy 190 • Belton • 254.939.6464 
www.surfacesource.net

Flooring • Cabinets    
Countertops
Remodeling Services
and so much more 

TexSCAN Week of 
March 18, 2018

ACREAGE
20.2 acres, Duval County, south Texas brush country. 
Deer, hogs, and quail. $4,035 down, $668/mo. (9.9%, 
30 years), larger tracts available. 866-286-0199. www.
texasbrushcountry.com.

AUCTION
Karnes City – Annual Long Live Cowboys 
Special Female Replacement Sale, Sat., March 24 
at noon. 400+ females. Karnes City Auction, Inc., 
830-623-2855, 1918 Hwy. 80, Karnes City, TX, 
www.karnescityauction.com.

ADOPTION
Happy couple wish to adopt – endless love, laughter 
and opportunity. Call or text anytime. Expenses Paid. 
Heather and Matt 732-397-3117.

CAREER TRAINING
Airline Mechanic Training – Get FAA certification. 
Approved for military benefits. Financial Aid if quali-
fied. Job placement assistance. Call Aviation Institute 
of Maintenance, 800-475-4102.

FINANCE
Receiving payments from real estate you 
sold? Get cash now! Call Steve: 888-870-2243. 
www.SteveCashesNotes.com.

EVENT
Ingleside – Round Up Days, March 23-24, N.O. 
Simmons Park, Ingleside, TX. Rides, games, food, live 
entertainment, $6 Admission. Presented by Ingleside 
Chamber of Commerce. 

OIL AND GAS RIGHTS
We buy oil, gas & mineral rights. Both non- producing 
and producing including non-Participating Royalty 
Interest (NPRI). Provide us your desired price for an 
offer evaluation. 806-620-1422, LoboMineralsLLC@
gmail.com. Lobo Minerals, LLC, PO Box 1800, 
Lubbock, TX 79408-1800.

TRUCK DRIVERS
Be Your Own Boss! Get Paid to see the Country! Quality 
Drive-Away is looking for CDL Drivers to Deliver 
Trucks! Apply Online at www.qualitydriveaway.com 
or call 574-642-2023.

Drivers Wanted: Owner Ops & Company. Home 
daily. Excellent money & benefits. Great bonuses. 
Newer fleet. Call now for opportunities in your area! 
888-549-1882. PAM Transport.

SAWMILLS
Sawmills from only $4,397.00 – Make & Save 
Money with your own bandmill – Cut lumber any 
dimension. In stock ready to ship! Free info/DVD: 
www.NorwoodSawmills.com. 800-567-0404, 
Ext.300N.

TV/INTERNET
DISH TV $59.99 For 190 Channels $14.95 High 
Speed Internet. Free Installation, Smart HD DVR 
Included, Free Voice Remote. Some restrictions apply. 
Call 877-625-4980.

WANTED
FREON R12 WANTED: Certified buyer will PAY 
CA$H for R12 cylinders or cases of cans. (312) 291-
9169,  www.refrigerantfinders.com.

Texas Press Statewide Classified Network 
251 Participating Texas Newspapers • Regional Ads

Start At $250 • Email ads@texaspress.com
NOTICE: While most advertisers are reputable, we cannot guarantee products or services advertised. We 
urge readers to use caution and when in doubt, contact the Texas Attorney General at 800-621-0508 or the 
Federal Trade Commission at 877-FTC-HELP. The FTC web site is www.ftc.gov/bizop.

Call Salado Village Voice  (254) 947-5321, to order today

CBS Construction

Gravel Driveways | Parking Lots
Septic Tanks | House Pads
Lot Clearing | Demolition

Chet Sutton, owner-operator

254 718-1752

Finney Insurance Agency

(254) 939-5751

Home  |  Auto   |  Life  |  Liability   |  Commercial  |  Farm  |  Ranch

Agent Allison Finney

820 S. Main Street, Belton
Allison@finneyinsurance.com

DALLAS — A Texas 
A&M AgriLife Research 
water conservation hor-
ticulturist said home and 
business owners should re-
pair and maintain sprinkler 
systems to save money and 
time while reducing wasted 
water resources.
	 “A lot of water-saving 
advice focuses on the in-
doors, but we know more 
water, especially in warm-
er months, can be saved by 
maintaining irrigation sys-
tems outside,” said Patrick 
Dickinson of Texas A&M 
AgriLife’s urban water pro-
gram, known as Water Uni-
versity, in Dallas.
	 The message comes as 
part of Water University’s 
participation in the U.S. 
Environmental Protec-
tion Agency’s national Fix 
a Leak Week campaign, 
Dickinson said. The cam-
paign encourages people 
to fix leaks as part of the 
EPA’s WaterSense initiative 
to label products, homes 
and programs that meet 
specific water efficiency 
standards.
	 Household leaks account 
for about 1 trillion gallons 
of potable water wasted 
each year, according to the 
EPA.
	 “We also know that in 
the warmer months, as 
much as 60 percent of all 
drinkable water used by a 
household is spent outside 
on lawns and landscapes,” 
Dickinson said. “So it’s 
critical to make sure those 
systems are free from leaks 
and running as efficiently 

as possible.”
	 He recommended in-
specting lawns for unex-
pected wet spots when the 
weather is dry.
	 “Look for water bub-
bling up from the ground 
or pooling and running over 
concrete,” he said. “Re-
pair underground leaks by 
simply turning off your ir-
rigation system controller, 
digging around the leaking 
section of pipe, cutting out 
the punctured section and 
joining the remaining ends 
with a cheap compression 
coupling from any hard-
ware store.”
	 A new instruction-
al video featuring Dick-
inson, Sprinkler Quick 
Fixes, available at https://
w w w . y o u t u b e . c o m /
watch?v=_9WMPyZetGI, 
instructs viewers on three 
sprinkler system repairs 
for efficient irrigation. Tips 
include replacing a broken 

sprinkler head, clearing 
clogged nozzles that lead 
to inefficient irrigation and 
adjusting spray streams to 
avoid watering sidewalks 
and other non-plant struc-
tures.
	 Dickinson also recom-
mended ensuring all irriga-
tion pipe and connections 
remain properly sealed 
and tightened according to 
manufacturer recommenda-
tions.
	 “It’s not hard to keep an 
irrigation system running 
efficiently,” he said. “But 
it does require a little time 
and attention. Luckily we 
have a whole week dedicat-
ed to just that.”
	 Click the irrigation tab 
at https://wateruniversi-
ty.tamu.edu for more tips 
on efficient irrigation and 
“quick fixes” for repairing 
and maintaining irrigation 
systems.

	 March 27, 2018 – The 
Cultural Activities Center 
(CAC) invites everyone to 
the 22nd Annual ArtWorks 
exhibit opening of student 
art on April 9 at 5:30-7pm. 
Subway is graciously pro-
viding cookies for refresh-
ments, and the Suzuki gui-
tar ensemble led by Bert 
Harbison from Academie 
Musique will provide music 
for the evening.
	 With nearly 2,800 works 
of art on display from stu-
dents in all grade levels, 
pre-K through high school, 
ArtWorks celebrates the ar-
tistic talent of area school-
children. Art made from all 

types of media will be dis-
played including paintings, 
drawings, mixed media, and 
sculptural works.
	 “It’s wonderful to see art 
from kids of all ages cover-
ing the walls in our galler-
ies, floor to ceiling,” said 
Kristen Reichert, visual arts 
director at the CAC. “The 
level of talent from even 
the youngest students is re-
markable.”
	 Beginning as a joint 
effort with Temple ISD 
teachers in 1996, ArtWorks 
showcases works from 
private, public, and home 
schools in the area, includ-
ing Academy High School, 

Central Texas Christian 
School, Holy Trinity High 
School, St. Mary’s Catho-
lic School, and Providence 
Preparatory School. Open 
Minds Homeschool Co-op 
and A+ Learning Academy 
will be joining ArtWorks 
for the first time this year. 
All Temple ISD schools 
will also display art, with 
Cater Elementary returning 
after a few years without an 
art instructor.

22nd Annual ArtWorks Student 
Exhibit at the CAC

Save money, time, water with irrigation repairs

Patrick Dickinson of Water University 
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colonialrealestate.com
Conditions and limitations apply; including but not limited to: seller and house must meet specific qualifications, and purchase price will be determined solely by ERA Franchise 

Systems LLC, based upon a discount of the home’s appraised value. Additionally, a second home must be purchasedthrough a broker within 6 months of the close date of the SSP 
property designated by ERA Franchise Systems LLC. Call your localparticipating ERA professional to review details. Not available in all areas.

The ERA Sellers Security PlanSM is designed for the seller who is on the move, and if 
qualified and accepted into the plan, you’ll get peace of mind knowing your property 
will be taken care of in a finite sales period. Contact us today to find out if you qualify.

WE WILL SELL YOUR HOUSE OR 
ERA REAL ESTATE WILL BUY IT! PUERTO CORTES, Honduras (March 12, 2018) Lt. j.g. Grace Romasko, of Killeen, 

Texas, laughs with a 4-year old Honduran girl while she waits for her hernia surgery in 
the expeditionary medical unit in Puerto Cortes, Honduras during Continuing Promise 
2018. U.S. Naval Forces Southern Command/U.S. 4th Fleet has deployed a force to 
execute Continuing Promise to conduct civil-military operations including humanitari-
an assistance, training engagements, and medical, dental, and veterinary support in 
an effort to show U.S. support and commitment to Central and South America. 
(U.S. Navy photo by Mass Communication Specialist 1st Class Mike DiMestico)


